
Bid 86-2021 Addendum 1

printLEX llc

catbird business printing dba printlex llc

Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 86-2021 Addendum 1
Title: Printing Services for Environmental Services
Type: Competitive Bid
Issue Date: 8/23/2021
Deadline: 9/10/2021 02:00 PM (ET)
Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS

SOLICITATION. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE LINE
ITEMS TAB ONLY. PRICING WITHIN SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE
ACCEPTED AND MAY MAKE YOUR BID NON-RESPONSIVE.
For questions regarding these specifications or the bidding process,
p l e a s e  p o s t  t o  t h e  p u b l i s h e d  b i d  o n  I o n W a v e  –
https://lexingtonky.ionwave.net.   Phone ca l ls  o r  emai ls  a re  not
accepted.
 

Contact Information

Contact: Conni Hayes
Address: Central Purchasing

Government Center Building
Room 338
200 East Main Street
Lexington, KY 40507

Phone: (859) 2583320
Fax: (859) 2583322
Email: chayes@lexingtonky.gov
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printLEX llc Information

Address: 331 east short
unit 2
lexington, KY 40507

Phone: (859) 272-7014
Web Address: www.printlex.com

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED! By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent
and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached
bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

lynn david wiseman lynn@printlex.com
Signature Email

Submitted at 9/10/2021 7:05:52 AM

Response Attachments

20210909130053.pdf

affidavit

20210909130129.pdf

workforce analysis

20210909130201.pdf

mb...participation form

20210910063835.pdf

addendum #1

Bid Lines

1 8.5 X 11 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.28 Total: $0.28

2 8.5 X 11 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

1,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.28 Total: $0.28

3 8.5 X 11 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

2,500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.28 Total: $0.28

4 8.5 X 11 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

5,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid
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5 8.5 X 11 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

10,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

6 8.5 X 11 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

50,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

7 8.5 X 11 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

100,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

8 1/2 Fold up to 500 pieces - per piece price

Item #1 - 8.5 X 11 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

 

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.10 Total: $0.10

9 1/2 fold 501 to 1,000 per piece price

Item #1 - 8.5 X 11 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

 

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.10 Total: $0.10

1
0

8.5 X 14 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.29 Total: $0.29

1
1

8.5 X 14 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

1,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.29 Total: $0.29

1
2

8.5 x 14 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

2,500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.29 Total: $0.29

1
3

8.5 X 14 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

5,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid
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1
4

60# or 70# Uncoated Text Single Sheet Flyers

500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.27 Total: $0.27

1
5

60# or 70# Uncoated Text Single Sheet Flyers

1,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.27 Total: $0.27

1
6

60# or 70# Uncoated Text Single Sheet Flyers

2,500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.20 Total: $0.20

1
7

1/2 Fold up to 500 pieces - per piece price

Item #14 - 60# or 70# Uncoated Text Single Sheet Flyers

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.10 Total: $0.10

1
8

1/2 Fold up to 501 to 1,000 pieces - per piece price

Item #14 - 60# or 70# Uncoated Text Single Sheet Flyers

 

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.10 Total: $0.10

1
9

Postcards

500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.16 Total: $0.16

2
0

Postcards

1,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.16 Total: $0.16

2
1

Postcards

2,500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.16 Total: $0.16

2
2

Postcards

5,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.16 Total: $0.16
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2
3

Postcards

10,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

2
4

Postcards

50,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

2
5

Postcards

100,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

2
6

Individually addressed postcards

500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.28 Total: $0.28

2
7

Individually addressed postcards

1,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.28 Total: $0.28

2
8

Individually addressed postcards

2,500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.28 Total: $0.28

2
9

Individually addressed postcards

5,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.28 Total: $0.28

3
0

Individually addressed postcards

10,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

3
1

Individually addressed postcards

50,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

3
2

Individually addressed postcards

100,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid
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3
3

100# Gloss Text 311 Alerts/LexCall card

1,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.15 Total: $0.15

3
4

100# Gloss Text 311 Alerts/LexCall card

2,500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.15 Total: $0.15

3
5

100# Gloss Text 311 Alerts/LexCall card

5,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.15 Total: $0.15

3
6

Pop-Up cards

500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.17 Total: $0.17

3
7

Pop-Up cards

1,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.17 Total: $0.17

3
8

Pop-Up cards

2,500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.17 Total: $0.17

3
9

Door hangers

Up to 499 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.20 Total: $0.20

4
0

Door hangers

500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.20 Total: $0.20

4
1

Door hangers

1.000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.20 Total: $0.20

4
2

Door hangers

2,500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.20 Total: $0.20
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4
3

Tri-fold brochures

500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.29 Total: $0.29

4
4

Tri-fold brochures

1,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.29 Total: $0.29

4
5

Tri-fold brochures

2,500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.29 Total: $0.29

4
6

Bookmarks

500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.07 Total: $0.07

4
7

Bookmarks

1,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.07 Total: $0.07

4
8

Bookmarks

2,500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.07 Total: $0.07

4
9

Bookmarks

5,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.07 Total: $0.07

5
0

Tag along cards - Hole Version

1,000 copies - Per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.12 Total: $0.12

5
1

Tag along cards - Hole Version

2,500 copies - Per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.12 Total: $0.12

5
2

Tag along cards - Hole Version

5,000 copies - Per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.12 Total: $0.12
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5
3

Tag Along Card - Non-Hole Version

500 Copies - per piece pricing

Quantity: 1  Price: $0.12 Total: $0.12

5
4

Tag Along Card - Non-Hole Version

1,000 Copies - per piece pricing

Quantity: 1  Price: $0.12 Total: $0.12

5
5

Tag Along Card - Non-Hole Version

2,500 Copies - per piece pricing

Quantity: 1  Price: $0.12 Total: $0.12

5
6

Tag Along Card - Non-Hole Version

5,000 Copies - per piece pricing

Quantity: 1  No Bid

5
7

Thank You Cards and envelopes

Bundle of 500 cards and 500 envelopes

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.49 Total: $0.49

5
8

Thank You Cards and envelopes

For bundle of 1,000 cards and 1,000 envelopes

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.49 Total: $0.49

Response Total: $9.22
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