
Bid 104-2020 Addendum 1

ValetPress, LLC

Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 104-2020 Addendum 1
Title: Uniforms for Waste Management
Type: Competitive Bid
Issue Date: 9/22/2020
Deadline: 10/6/2020 02:00 PM (ET)
Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS

SOLICITATION. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE LINE
ITEMS TAB ONLY. PRICING WITHIN SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE
ACCEPTED AND MAY MAKE YOUR BID NON-RESPONSIVE.

Contact Information

Contact: Conni Hayes
Address: Central Purchasing

Government Center Building
Room 338
200 East Main Street
Lexington, KY 40507

Phone: (859) 2583320
Fax: (859) 2583322
Email: chayes@lexingtonky.gov
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ValetPress, LLC Information

Contact: Jaymes Pimentel
Address: 1320 Willow Pass Road

Suite 612
Concord, CA 94520

Phone: (925) 334-2937
Toll Free: (888) 248-3003
Email: jaymes@valetpress.com

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED! By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent
and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached
bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

Jaymes Pimentel jaymes@valetpress.com
Signature Email

Submitted at 10/6/2020 11:16:55 AM

Response Attachments

WORKFORCE_ANALYSIS_FORM.pdf

Workforce analysis form

LFUCG_MWDBE_PARTICIPATION_FORMS.pdf

Participation forms

2020-10-06_091448 affidavit.pdf

Affidavit

Bid Attributes

1 Adherence to specifications

Do you meet all stated specifications? Please list any exceptions to specifications. 

Yes

2 Average Delivery Time

What is the average delivery time of uniforms? Please give a time-frame and any exceptions. 

7-14 Days

3 Average Delivery Time for "non-stock" items

Please give average delivery time for “non-stock” items. If embroidery is required, average delivery time should also
be noted.

30 Days

4 Fittings - Bullet Point #6

Can you meet this specification? Please list any exceptions.

Yes, finalizing deal with drycleaners, to offer tailoring and fittings
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5 Location - bullet point #7

Identify the location of your facility, hours facility is open for business, availability of personnel for fittings. 

1320 Willow Pass Road #600, Concord CA 94520. 8am-5pm for hours and fittings.

6 Tailoring

Do you have a tailoring department? 

Yes

Bid Lines

1 Men's & Women's LS Industrial Work Shirt S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $14.24 Total: $14.24

2 Men's & Women's LS Industrial Work Shirt 2X-3X

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $14.24 Total: $14.24

3 Men's & Women's LS Industrial Work Shirt 4X-6X

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $14.78 Total: $14.78

Supplier Notes: No stock on 5xl and 6xl

4 Price for embroidery LS Industrial Work Shirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

5 Men’s and Women’s SS Industrial Work Shirt S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $11.77 Total: $11.77

6 Men’s and Women’s SS Industrial Work Shirt 2X-3X

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $11.77 Total: $11.77

7 Men’s and Women’s SS Industrial Work Shirt 4X-6X

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $11.77 Total: $11.77

Supplier Notes: No stock on 5xl and 6xl

8 Price for embroidery SS Industrial Work Shirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

9 Ladies LS Polo Shirt, no pocket S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $11.22 Total: $11.22

1
0

Ladies LS Polo Shirt, no pocket 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $12.55 Total: $12.55

1
1

Ladies LS Polo Shirt, no pocket 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $15.20 Total: $15.20
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1
2

Ladies LS Polo Shirt, no pocket 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $15.52 Total: $15.52

1
3

Price for embroidery Ladies LS Polo Shirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

1
4

Polo Shirt, Solid Color Knit with Pocket S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $21.84 Total: $21.84

1
5

Polo Shirt, Solid Color Knit with Pocket 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $21.84 Total: $21.84

1
6

Polo Shirt, Solid Color Knit with Pocket 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $22.68 Total: $22.68

1
7

Polo Shirt, Solid Color Knit with Pocket 4Xl

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $22.68 Total: $22.68

1
8

price for embroidery Polo solid knit w/pocket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

1
9

Women’s Blended Soft Knit Polo Shirt, no pocket S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $15.08 Total: $15.08

2
0

Women’s Blended Soft Knit Polo Shirt, no pocket 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $15.08 Total: $15.08

2
1

Women’s Blended Soft Knit Polo Shirt, no pocket 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $15.66 Total: $15.66

2
2

Women’s Blended Soft Knit Polo Shirt, no pocket 4XL-5XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
3

price for embroidery Women's Blended Polo with No Pocket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

2
4

Women’s Blended Soft Knit Polo Shirt, no pocket S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $11.22 Total: $11.22

2
5

Women’s Blended Soft Knit Polo Shirt, no pocket 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $12.55 Total: $12.55

2
6

Women’s Blended Soft Knit Polo Shirt, no pocket 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $15.20 Total: $15.20
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2
7

Women’s Blended Soft Knit Polo Shirt, no pocket 4XL-5XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $16.52 Total: $16.52

Supplier Notes: No 6xl

2
8

price for embroidery Women's Blended Polo with No Pocket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

2
9

Men's & Women's Long Sleeve Pique Golf Shirt S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $16.89 Total: $16.89

3
0

Men's & Women's Long Sleeve Pique Golf Shirt 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $18.19 Total: $18.19

3
1

Men's & Women's Long Sleeve Pique Golf Shirt 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $20.79 Total: $20.79

3
2

Men's & Women's Long Sleeve Pique Golf Shirt 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $25.99 Total: $25.99

3
3

price for embroidery Men's & Women's Long Sleeve Pique Golf Shirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

3
4

Men's & Women's Short Sleeve Pique Golf Shirt S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $12.34 Total: $12.34

3
5

Men's & Women's Short Sleeve Pique Golf Shirt 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $13.64 Total: $13.64

3
6

Men's & Women's Short Sleeve Pique Golf Shirt 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $16.24 Total: $16.24

3
7

Men's & Women's Short Sleeve Pique Golf Shirt 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $21.43 Total: $21.43

3
8

price for embroidery Men's & Women's Short Sleeve Pique Golf Shirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

3
9

Men's Industrial Pique Polo, S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $19.49 Total: $19.49

4
0

Men's Industrial Pique Polo, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $20.79 Total: $20.79

4
1

Men's Industrial Pique Polo, 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $16.24 Total: $16.24
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4
2

Men's Industrial Pique Polo, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $21.44 Total: $21.44

4
3

price for embroidery Men's Industrial Pique Polo Shirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

4
4

Men's Golf Shirt S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $16.89 Total: $16.89

4
5

Men's Golf Shirt 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $18.19 Total: $18.19

4
6

Men's Golf Shirt 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $20.79 Total: $20.79

4
7

Men's Golf Shirt 4X-6X

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $28.59 Total: $28.59

4
8

price for embroidery Men's Golf Shirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

4
9

Men's Snag-Proof SS Tactical Polo, no pocket S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $25.99 Total: $25.99

5
0

Men's Snag-Proof SS Tactical Polo, no pocket 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $27.29 Total: $27.29

5
1

Men's Snag-Proof SS Tactical Polo, no pocket 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $29.89 Total: $29.89

5
2

Men's Snag-Proof SS Tactical Polo, no pocket 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $31.19 Total: $31.19

5
3

price for embroidery Men's Snag-Proof SS Tactical Polo Shirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

5
4

Men's Snag-Proof LS Tactical Polo, no pocket S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $29.89 Total: $29.89

5
5

Men's Snag-Proof LS Tactical Polo, no pocket 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $31.19 Total: $31.19

5
6

Men's Snag-Proof LS Tactical Polo, no pocket 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $33.78 Total: $33.78

5
7

Men's Snag-Proof LS Tactical Polo, no pocket 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $35.10 Total: $35.10
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5
8

price for embroidery Men's Snag-Proof LS Tactical Polo Shirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

5
9

Women's Snag-Proof SS Tactical Polo, no pocket S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $19.49 Total: $19.49

6
0

Women's Snag-Proof SS Tactical Polo, no pocket 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $20.79 Total: $20.79

6
1

Women's Snag-Proof SS Tactical Polo, no pocket 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $23.39 Total: $23.39

6
2

Women's Snag-Proof SS Tactical Polo, no pocket 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $24.69 Total: $24.69

6
3

price for embroidery Women's Snag-Proof SS Tactical Polo Shirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

6
4

Ladies Industrial Pique Polo, S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $24.77 Total: $24.77

6
5

Ladies Industrial Pique Polo, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $24.77 Total: $24.77

6
6

Ladies Industrial Pique Polo, 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $25.72 Total: $25.72

6
7

Ladies Industrial Pique Polo, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $25.72 Total: $25.72

6
8

price for embroidery Ladies Industrial Pique Polo Shirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

6
9

Men's Golf Shirt, no pocket S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $15.08 Total: $15.08

7
0

Men's Golf Shirt, no pocket 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $15.08 Total: $15.08

7
1

Men's Golf Shirt, no pocket 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $15.66 Total: $15.66

7
2

Men's Golf Shirt, no pocket 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $15.66 Total: $15.66

7
3

price for embroidery Men's Golf Shirt, no pocket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00
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7
4

Men's Easy Care SS Shirt/Button Down, S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $16.89 Total: $16.89

7
5

Men's Easy Care SS Shirt/Button Down, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $18.18 Total: $18.18

7
6

Men's Easy Care SS Shirt/Button Down, 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $19.19 Total: $19.19

7
7

Men's Easy Care SS Shirt/Button Down, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $25.99 Total: $25.99

7
8

price for embroidery Men's Easy Care SS Shirt/Button Down

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

7
9

Men's Easy Care LS Shirt/Button Down, S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $18.18 Total: $18.18

8
0

Men's Easy Care LS Shirt/Button Down, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $19.49 Total: $19.49

8
1

Men's Easy Care LS Shirt/Button Down, 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $22.10 Total: $22.10

8
2

Men's Easy Care LS Shirt/Button Down, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $27.29 Total: $27.29

8
3

price for embroidery Men's Easy Care LS Shirt/Button Down

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

8
4

Ladies Easy Care SS Shirt/Button Down, S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $16.89 Total: $16.89

8
5

Ladies Easy Care SS Shirt/Button Down, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $18.18 Total: $18.18

8
6

Ladies Easy Care SS Shirt/Button Down, 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $20.79 Total: $20.79

8
7

Ladies Easy Care SS Shirt/Button Down, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $25.99 Total: $25.99

8
8

price for embroidery Ladies Easy Care SS Shirt/Button Down

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

8
9

Ladies Easy Care LS Shirt/Button Down, S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $18.19 Total: $18.19
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9
0

Ladies Easy Care LS Shirt/Button Down, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $19.49 Total: $19.49

9
1

Ladies Easy Care LS Shirt/Button Down, 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $22.10 Total: $22.10

9
2

Ladies Easy Care LS Shirt/Button Down, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $27.29 Total: $27.29

9
3

price for embroidery Ladies Easy Care LS Shirt/Button Down

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

9
4

Tshirt w/pocket SS, S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $6.83 Total: $6.83

9
5

Tshirt w/pocket SS, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $9.06 Total: $9.06

9
6

Tshirt w/pocket SS, 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $9.20 Total: $9.20

9
7

Tshirt w/pocket SS, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

9
8

price for embroidery Tshirt w/pocket SS

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

9
9

Tshirt no pocket LS, S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $7.66 Total: $7.66

1
0
0

Tshirt no pocket LS, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $9.36 Total: $9.36

1
0
1

Tshirt no pocket LS, 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $9.53 Total: $9.53

1
0
2

Tshirt no pocket LS, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $9.88 Total: $9.88

Supplier Notes: no 5xl or 6xl

1
0
3

price for embroidery Tshirt no pocket LS

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

1
0
4

Heavyweight Tshirt w/pocket 90/10 SS, S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $6.89 Total: $6.89
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1
0
5

Heavyweight Tshirt w/pocket 90/10 SS, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $9.02 Total: $9.02

1
0
6

Heavyweight Tshirt w/pocket 90/10 SS, 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $9.24 Total: $9.24

1
0
7

Heavyweight Tshirt w/pocket 90/10 SS, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $9.96 Total: $9.96

1
0
8

price for embroidery Heavyweight Tshirt w/pocket 90/10 SS

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

1
0
9

Fit Tshirt w/pocket 60/40 SS, S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.25 Total: $5.25

Alternate 1

Port and Company Core Blend Tee. SanMar

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.25 Total: $5.25

Manufacturer: SanMar

Manufacturer #: PC55

1
1
0

Fit Tshirt w/pocket 60/40 SS, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $7.36 Total: $7.36

Alternate 1

Port and Company Core Blend Tee. SanMar

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $7.36 Total: $7.36

Manufacturer: SanMar

Manufacturer #: PC55

1
1
1

Fit Tshirt w/pocket 60/40 SS, 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $7.85 Total: $7.85

Alternate 1

Port and Company Core Blend Tee. SanMar

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $7.85 Total: $7.85

Manufacturer: SanMar

Manufacturer #: PC55

1
1
2

Fit Tshirt w/pocket 60/40 SS, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $8.31 Total: $8.31
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Alternate 1

Port and Company Core Blend Tee. SanMar

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $8.31 Total: $8.31

Manufacturer: SanMar

Manufacturer #: PC55

1
1
3

Price for embroidery Fit Tshirt w/pocket 60/40 SS

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

1
1
4

LS Crewneck Tshirt, w/pocket, S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
1
5

LS Crewneck Tshirt, w/pocket, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
1
6

LS Crewneck Tshirt, w/pocket, 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
1
7

LS Crewneck Tshirt, w/pocket, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
1
8

price for embroidery LS Crewneck Tshirt, w/pocket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

1
1
9

Men's Value Fleece Jacket. S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $23.39 Total: $23.39

1
2
0

Men's Value Fleece Jacket. 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $24.69 Total: $24.69

1
2
1

Men's Value Fleece Jacket. 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $27.29 Total: $27.29

1
2
2

Men's Value Fleece Jacket. 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $32.49 Total: $32.49

1
2
3

price for embroidery Men's Value Fleece Jacket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

1
2
4

Ladies Value Fleece Jacket. S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $23.39 Total: $23.39
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1
2
5

Ladies Value Fleece Jacket. 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $24.69 Total: $24.69

1
2
6

Ladies Value Fleece Jacket. 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $27.29 Total: $27.29

1
2
7

Ladies Value Fleece Jacket. 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $32.49 Total: $32.49

1
2
8

price for embroidery Ladies Value Fleece Jacket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

1
2
9

Crewneck Sweatshirt, S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $9.70 Total: $9.70

1
3
0

Crewneck Sweatshirt, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $11.47 Total: $11.47

1
3
1

Crewneck Sweatshirt, 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $12.09 Total: $12.09

1
3
2

Crewneck Sweatshirt, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $12.22 Total: $12.22

1
3
3

price for embroidery Crewneck Sweatshirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

1
3
4

Heavy Blend Hooded Sweatshirt S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $17.23 Total: $17.23

1
3
5

Heavy Blend Hooded Sweatshirt 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $19.84 Total: $19.84

1
3
6

Heavy Blend Hooded Sweatshirt 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $20.10 Total: $20.10

1
3
7

Heavy Blend Hooded Sweatshirt 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $20.75 Total: $20.75

Supplier Notes: no 6xl

1
3
8

price for embroidery Heavy Blend Hooded Sweatshirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

1
3
9

Zipped Hooded Sweatshirt S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $25.43 Total: $25.43
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1
4
0

Zipped Hooded Sweatshirt 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $28.65 Total: $28.65

1
4
1

Zipped Hooded Sweatshirt 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $29.29 Total: $29.29

1
4
2

Zipped Hooded Sweatshirt 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $31.59 Total: $31.59

Supplier Notes: no 6x

1
4
3

price for embroidery Zipped Hooded Sweatshirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

1
4
4

Unisex V-Neck Sweater Vest, S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $39.00 Total: $39.00

Alternate 1

all cotton vest

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $39.00 Total: $39.00

Manufacturer: edwards garments

Manufacturer #: 4701

1
4
5

Unisex V-Neck Sweater Vest, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $39.00 Total: $39.00

Alternate 1

all cotton vest

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $39.00 Total: $39.00

Manufacturer: edwards garments

Manufacturer #: 4701

1
4
6

Unisex V-Neck Sweater Vest, 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $39.00 Total: $39.00

Alternate 1

all cotton vest

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $39.00 Total: $39.00

Manufacturer: edwards garments

Manufacturer #: 4701

1
4
7

Unisex V-Neck Sweater Vest, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $39.00 Total: $39.00
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Alternate 1

all cotton vest

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $39.00 Total: $39.00

Manufacturer: edawards garments

Manufacturer #: 4701

1
4
8

price for embroidery Unisex V-Neck Sweater Vest

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

1
4
9

Unisex Microfiber Windshirt, S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $19.49 Total: $19.49

Alternate 1

spor-tek v-neck raglan wind shirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $19.49 Total: $19.49

Manufacturer: Sanmar

Manufacturer #: jst72

1
5
0

Unisex Microfiber Windshirt, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $20.79 Total: $20.79

Alternate 1

spor-tek v-neck raglan wind shirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $20.79 Total: $20.79

Manufacturer: sanmar

Manufacturer #: jst72

1
5
1

Unisex Microfiber Windshirt, 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $23.39 Total: $23.39

Alternate 1

spor-tek v-neck raglan wind shirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $23.39 Total: $23.39

Manufacturer: sanmar

Manufacturer #: jst72

1
5
2

Unisex Microfiber Windshirt, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $28.59 Total: $28.59
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Alternate 1

spor-tek v-neck raglan wind shirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $28.59 Total: $28.59

Manufacturer: sanmar

Manufacturer #: jst72

1
5
3

Fleece-Lined Nylon Jacket, S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $38.99 Total: $38.99

Alternate 1

port authority challenger jacket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $38.99 Total: $38.99

Manufacturer: sanmar

Manufacturer #: j754

1
5
4

Fleece-Lined Nylon Jacket, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $40.29 Total: $40.29

Alternate 1

port authority challenger jacket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $40.29 Total: $40.29

Manufacturer: sanmar

Manufacturer #: j754

1
5
5

Fleece-Lined Nylon Jacket, 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $42.89 Total: $42.89

Alternate 1

port authority challenger jacket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $42.89 Total: $42.89

Manufacturer: sanmar

Manufacturer #: j574

1
5
6

Fleece-Lined Nylon Jacket, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $48.09 Total: $48.09
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Alternate 1

port authority challenger jacket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $48.09 Total: $48.09

Manufacturer: sanmar

Manufacturer #: j574

1
5
7

price for embroidery Fleece-Lined Nylon Jacket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

1
5
8

3 in 1 Jacket, S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $70.19 Total: $70.19

1
5
9

3 in 1 Jacket, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $71.49 Total: $71.49

1
6
0

3 in 1 Jacket, 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $74.09 Total: $74.09

1
6
1

3 in 1 Jacket, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $75.39 Total: $75.39

1
6
2

price for embroidery 3 in 1 Jacket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

1
6
3

Leather Garrison Belt, 28-40

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6
4

Leather Garrison Belt, 42-50

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6
5

Leather Garrison Belt, 52-60

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6
6

Tactical Duty Belt, 28-30

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6
7

Tactical Duty Belt, 32-40

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6
8

Tactical Duty Belt, 42-50

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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1
6
9

Tactical Duty Belt, 52-58

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
7
0

Clip Suspenders, OSFM

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
7
1

Ball cap mesh

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.54 Total: $4.54

1
7
2

price for embroidery mesh ball cap

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

1
7
3

Ball cap flex fit

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $10.39 Total: $10.39

1
7
4

price for embroidery ball cap flex fit

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

1
7
5

Fleece Lined Knit Cap, OSFM

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.07 Total: $5.07

1
7
6

price for embroidery fleece lined knit cap

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

1
7
7

Fleece UnLined Knit Cap, OSFM

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.45 Total: $3.45

1
7
8

price for embroidery fleece unlined knit cap

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

1
7
9

Men's Work Pants 28-42

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $17.36 Total: $17.36

1
8
0

Men's Work Pants 44-50

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $17.36 Total: $17.36

1
8
1

Men's Work Pants 52+

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $17.36 Total: $17.36

1
8
2

Women's Work Pants 4-22

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $14.30 Total: $14.30

1
8
3

Women's Work Pants 24-28

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $14.30 Total: $14.30
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1
8
4

Women's Work Pants 30+

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $14.30 Total: $14.30

1
8
5

Men’s Elastic Insert Work Pants 28-42

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $19.37 Total: $19.37

1
8
6

Men’s Elastic Insert Work Pants 44-50

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $19.37 Total: $19.37

1
8
7

Men’s Elastic Insert Work Pants 52+

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $19.37 Total: $19.37

1
8
8

Women's Elastic Insert Work Pants 4-22

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $19.37 Total: $19.37

1
8
9

Women's Elastic Insert Work Pants 24-28

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $19.37 Total: $19.37

1
9
0

Women's Elastic Insert Work Pants 30+

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $19.37 Total: $19.37

1
9
1

Mens' Twill Pants 28-42

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
9
2

Mens' Twill Pants 44-50

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
9
3

Mens' Twill Pants 52+

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
9
4

Men's Lightweight Tactical Pant, 28-40

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
9
5

Men's Lightweight Tactical Pant, 42-56

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
9
6

Men;s Heavyweight Tactical Pant, 28-40

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
9
7

Men's Heavyweight Tactical Pant, 42-56

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
9
8

Women's Lightweight Tactical Pant, 4W-22W

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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1
9
9

Women's Lightweight Tactical Pant, 24W-28W

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
0
0

Women's Lightweight Tactical Pant, 30W+

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
0
1

Women's Heavyweight Tactical Pant, 4W-22W

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
0
2

Women's Heavyweight Tactical Pant, 24W-28W

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
0
3

Women'sHeavyweight Tactical Pant, 30W+

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
0
4

Coach Nylon Windbreaker, S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $25.05 Total: $25.05

Alternate 1

SPORT-TEK sideline jacket jst71

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $25.05 Total: $25.05

Manufacturer: sanmar

Manufacturer #: jst71

2
0
5

Coach Nylon Windbreaker, 2XL-3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $26.33 Total: $26.33

Alternate 1

SPORT-TEK sideline jacket jst71

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $26.33 Total: $26.33

Manufacturer: sanmar

Manufacturer #: jst71

2
0
6

Coach Nylon Windbreaker, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $30.28 Total: $30.28

Alternate 1

SPORT-TEK sideline jacket jst71

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $30.28 Total: $30.28

Manufacturer: sanmar

Manufacturer #: jst71
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2
0
7

price for embroidery Coach Nylon Windbreaker

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

2
0
8

Perma-Lined Jacket S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $36.40 Total: $36.40

2
0
9

Perma-Lined Jacket 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $36.40 Total: $36.40

2
1
0

Perma-Lined Jacket 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $36.40 Total: $36.40

2
1
1

Perma-Lined Jacket 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $36.40 Total: $36.40

2
1
2

Perma-Lined Jacket S-XL Long/Tall

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $39.20 Total: $39.20

2
1
3

Perma-Lined Jacket 2XL Long/Tall

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $39.20 Total: $39.20

2
1
4

Perma-Lined Jacket 3XL Long/Tall

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $39.20 Total: $39.20

2
1
5

Perma-Lined Jacket 4XL-6XL Long/Tall

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $39.20 Total: $39.20

2
1
6

price for embroidery Perma-Lined Jacket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

2
1
7

Action Back Coveralls 34R-50R (CT10, 30, 40)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $62.14 Total: $62.14

2
1
8

Action Back Coveralls 52R-60R (CT10, 30, 40)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $66.92 Total: $66.92

2
1
9

Action Back Coveralls 34L-50L (CT10, 30, 40)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $62.14 Total: $62.14

2
2
0

Action Back Coveralls 52L-60L (CT10, 30, 40)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $66.92 Total: $66.92

2
2
1

price for embroidery for Action Back Coveralls (CT10, 30, 40)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00
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2
2
2

Men’s Heavyweight Parka (HiVis) S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $117.98 Total: $117.98

2
2
3

Men’s Heavyweight Parka (HiVis) 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $119.28 Total: $119.28

2
2
4

Men’s Heavyweight Parka (HiVis) 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $121.88 Total: $121.88

2
2
5

Men’s Heavyweight Parka (HiVis) 4Xl-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $123.18 Total: $123.18

2
2
6

price for embroidery Men's Heavyweight Parka (HiVis)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

2
2
7

Ansi 3 Hi Vis Waterproof Breathable Parka S-6X

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $71.50 Total: $71.50

Supplier Notes: no 5xl or 6xl

2
2
8

Price for embroidery

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

2
2
9

Ansi 3 Hi Vis Water Resistant 3 Season Jacket S-6X

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $63.69 Total: $63.69

2
3
0

Price for embroidery

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

2
3
1

Ansi 3 Hi Vis Hooded Zip Sweatshirt M-5X

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
3
2

Price for embroidery

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

2
3
3

Ansi 3 Hi Vis T-Shirt S-5X

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $22.79 Total: $22.79

2
3
4

Price for embroidery

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

2
3
5

Ansi 3 Hi Vis Windbreaker S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $41.59 Total: $41.59

2
3
6

Ansi 3 Hi Vis Windbreaker 2X-5X

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $46.79 Total: $46.79
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2
3
7

Ansi 3 Hi Vis Windbreaker 6X

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
3
8

Price for embroidery

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.00 Total: $5.00

Response Total: $4,582.38
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