¥ LEXINGTON

Bid 108-2020 Addendum 1
City Towing Service, INC
Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 108-2020 Addendum 1

Title: Towing of LFUCG Owned Vehicles
Type: Competitive Bid

Issue Date: 9/22/2020

Deadline:  10/15/2020 02:00 PM (ET)

Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS
SOLICITATION. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE LINE
ITEMS TAB ONLY. PRICING WITHIN SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE
ACCEPTED AND MAY MAKE YOUR BID NON-RESPONSIVE.

Contact Information

Contact: Conni Hayes

Address: Central Purchasing
Government Center Building
Room 338
200 East Main Street
Lexington, KY 40507

Phone:  (859) 2583320

Fax: (859) 2583322

Email: chayes@Ilexingtonky.gov
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City Towing Service, INC Information

Address: 1004 W New Circle Road

LEXINGTON, KY 40511

Phone:  (859) 278-9999

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED! By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent

and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached

bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

Dana Winchester

ctstowing99@gmail.com

Signature Email
Submitted at 10/9/2020 11:40:36 AM
Response Attachments
LFUCG Affidavit.pdf
Affidavit
Workforce Analysis Form.pdf
Workforce Analysis Form
MWDBE Completed Forms.pdf
MWDBE Forms
Bid Lines
1 | Automobiles and Pickups
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $50.00 | Total: | $50.00
Item Notes: |. Light Equipment Towing within Fayette County
2 | Half Ton & Three Quarter Ton Vans
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $55.00 | Total: | $55.00 |
Item Notes: I. Light Equipment Towing within Fayette County
3 [ One Ton Vans and Trucks
Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $55.00| Total: | $55.00
Item Notes: I. Light Equipment Towing within Fayette County
4 | Emergency Medical Units & Paddy Wagons
Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $75.00 | Total: | $75.00
Item Notes: I. Light Equipment Towing within Fayette County
S | Rate per Hour for wrecker services other than towing; for example, disconnect drive shaft in order to tow,
cleaning up broken glass after accident
Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Unit Price: $25.00 | Total: | $25.00
Item Notes: I. Light Equipment Towing within Fayette County
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6 | Automobiles and Pickups

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $50.00| Total:| $50.00|

Item Notes: II. Light Equipment Towing for Kentucky Counties contiguous to Fayette County
Supplier Notes: |$2.50/mile |

7 | Half Ton & Three Quarter Ton Vans

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $55.00| Total:l $55.00|
Item Notes: [I. Light Equipment Towing for Kentucky Counties contiguous to Fayette County
Supplier Notes: |$2.50/mi|e l

8 [ One Ton Vans and Trucks

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $55.00| Total: | $55.00 |
Item Notes: [I. Light Equipment Towing for Kentucky Counties contiguous to Fayette County
Supplier Notes: |$2.50/mile |

9 | Rate per Hour for wrecker service other than towing; for example, disconnect drive shaft in order to tow, cleaning
up broken glass after accident

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Unit Price: $25.00| Total: | $25.00 |

Item Notes: Il. Light Equipment Towing for Kentucky Counties contiguous to Fayette County

1 | Automobiles and Pickups

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $50.00 | Total: | $50.00 |

Item Notes: . Light Equipment Towing form Kentucky Counties non-contiguous to Fayette County and including
out of State

Supplier Notes: [$3.00/mile |

1 | Half Ton & Three Quarter Ton Vans

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: $55.00| Total:| $55.00|

Item Notes: . Light Equipment Towing form Kentucky Counties non-contiguous to Fayette County and including
out of State

Supplier Notes: |$3.00/mile |

1 | One Ton Vans and Trucks

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $55.00| Total: | $55.00 |

Item Notes: . Light Equipment Towing form Kentucky Counties non-contiguous to Fayette County and including
out of State

Supplier Notes: |$3.00/mile |

1 | Rate per Hour for wrecker service other than towing; for example, disconnect drive shaft in order to tow, cleaning
3 up broken glass after accident

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Unit Price: $50.00| Total: | $50.00 |
Item Notes: Ill. Light Equipment Towing form Kentucky Counties non-contiguous to Fayette County and including out
of State
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FN

Single Axle Dump Trucks
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA
Item Notes: IV. Heavy Equipment Towing within Fayette County

No Bid

Tandem Axle Dump Trucks
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Item Notes: IV. Heavy Equipment Towing within Fayette County

No Bid

Front, Side & Rear Loading Refuse Trucks
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Item Notes: IV. Heavy Equipment Towing within Fayette County

No Bid

12,000 - 20,000 GVW Fire Trucks
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Item Notes: IV. Heavy Equipment Towing within Fayette County

No Bid

21,000 - 30,000 GVW Fire Trucks

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA
Item Notes: IV. Heavy Equipment Towing within Fayette County

No Bid

31,000 - 50,000 GVW Fire Trucks
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Item Notes: IV. Heavy Equipment Towing within Fayette County

No Bid

51,000 GVW and above Fire Trucks

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA
Item Notes: IV. Heavy Equipment Towing within Fayette County

No Bid

Rate per Hour for wrecker service other than towing; for example, disconnect drive shaft in order to tow, cleaning

up broken glass after accident

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR
Item Notes: IV. Heavy Equipment Towing within Fayette County

No Bid

Rate for hauling large vehicles via trailer or truck which cannot be towed otherwise

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Item Notes: IV. Heavy Equipment Towing within Fayette County

No Bid

Inflate Tire

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$25.00| Total: |

Item Notes: V. Light Equipment Service Calls within Fayette County

$25.00

Change Tire (vehicle spare tire)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$25.00 | Total: |

Item Notes: V. Light Equipment Service Calls within Fayette County

$25.00 |
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2 | Jump Start
Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $25.00| Total:| $25.00

Item Notes: V. Light Equipment Service Calls within Fayette County

2 | Other service calls (unlock locked vehicle, etc.)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $25.00| Total:l $25.00

Item Notes: V. Light Equipment Service Calls within Fayette County

2 | Inflate Tire

7
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $25.00 | Total: | $25.00 |
Item Notes: VI. Light Equipment Service Calls from Kentucky Counties contiguous to Fayette County

Supplier Notes: [$2.00/mile en route |

2 | Change Tire (vehicle spare tire)

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: $25.00 | Total: | $25.00 |
Item Notes: VI. Light Equipment Service Calls from Kentucky Counties contiguous to Fayette County

Supplier Notes: |$2.00/mile en route |

2 [ Jump Start
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $25.00| Total: | $25.00 |

Item Notes: VI. Light Equipment Service Calls from Kentucky Counties contiguous to Fayette County
Supplier Notes: [$2.00/mile en route |

3 | Other service calls (unlock locked vehicle, etc.)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $25.00| Total: | $25.00 |
Item Notes: VI. Light Equipment Service Calls from Kentucky Counties contiguous to Fayette County
Supplier Notes: |$2.00/mi|e en route |

Response Total: $855.00
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