
Bid 79-2020

Hayes Pipe Supply

Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 79-2020
Title: Sanitary Sewer Repair Material
Type: Competitive Bid
Issue Date: 8/12/2020
Deadline: 9/2/2020 02:00 PM (ET)

Contact Information

Contact: Brian Marcum
Address: Central Purchasing

Government Center Building
Room 338
200 East Main Street
Lexington, KY 40507

Phone: (859) 2583320
Fax: (859) 2583322
Email: brianm@lexingtonky.gov
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Hayes Pipe Supply Information

Contact: George Novak
Address: 1300 Cahill Drive

Lexington, KY 40504
Phone: (859) 231-8323
Email: gnovak@hayespipe.com

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED! By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent
and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached
bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

George Novak gnovak@hayespipe.com
Signature Email

Submitted at 9/2/2020 10:38:51 AM

Bid Lines

1 4 inch SDR 35

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Supplier Notes: Please call for pricing

2 6 inch SDR 35

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Supplier Notes: Please call for pricing

3 8 inch SDR 35

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Supplier Notes: Please call for pricing

4 4 inch SDR 21

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Supplier Notes: Please call for pricing

5 6 inch SDR 21

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Supplier Notes: Please call for pricing

6 8 inch SDR 21

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Supplier Notes: Please call for pricing

7 4 inch Sch. 40 PVC

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Supplier Notes: Please call for pricing
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8 6 inch Sch. 40 PVC

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Supplier Notes: Please call for pricing

9 4 inch clay to 4 inch PVC Fernco Strong Back

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $32.71 Total: $32.71

1
0

6 inch clay to 6 inch PVC Fernco Strong Back

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $55.48 Total: $55.48

1
1

8 inch clay to 8 inch PVC Fernco Strong Back

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $63.10 Total: $63.10

1
2

4 inch PVC to 4 inch PVC Rigid Repair Coupling

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $7.90 Total: $7.90

1
3

6 inch PVC to 6 inch PVC Rigid Repair Coupling

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $15.80 Total: $15.80

1
4

8 inch PVC to 8 inch PVC Rigid Repair Coupling

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $23.85 Total: $23.85

1
5

6 inch PVC to 4 inch PVC Fernco Strong Back

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $55.00 Total: $55.00

1
6

8 inch concrete to 8 inch PVC Fernco Strong Back

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $92.05 Total: $92.05

1
7

4 inch 45 degree turn, SDR 35

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $6.25 Total: $6.25

1
8

4 inch 22 1/2 degree turn, SDR 35

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $6.25 Total: $6.25

1
9

4 inch double sweep T, glue type SDR 35

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $19.55 Total: $19.55

2
0

6 inch double sweep T, glue type SDR 35

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $112.40 Total: $112.40

2
1

4 inch double sweep T, rubber gasket type SDR 35

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $25.40 Total: $25.40

2
2

6 inch double sweep T, rubber gasket type SDR 35

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $119.95 Total: $119.95
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2
3

8 X 4 T, SDR 35

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $27.40 Total: $27.40

2
4

8 X 6 T, SDR 35

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $33.90 Total: $33.90

2
5

4 inch PVC cap w/adapter SDR 35

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.01 Total: $3.01

2
6

6 inch PVC cap w/adapter SDR 35

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $14.20 Total: $14.20

2
7

4 inch PVC c/o top SDR 35

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.82 Total: $1.82

2
8

6 inch PVC c/o top SDR 35

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $9.15 Total: $9.15

2
9

6 inch brass c/o top

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $19.40 Total: $19.40

3
0

4 inch brass c/o top

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $6.85 Total: $6.85

3
1

4 inch extendable btv

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $163.60 Total: $163.60

3
2

6 inch extendable btv

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $323.80 Total: $323.80

3
3

4 inch CL/pvc x 4 inch cl/pvc Strongback Coupling

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $24.90 Total: $24.90

3
4

6 inch cl/pvc x 6 inch cl/pvc Strongback Coupling

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $47.45 Total: $47.45

3
5

8 inch cl/pvc x 8 inch cl/pvc Strongback Coupling

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $68.95 Total: $68.95

3
6

8 inch cl/pvc x 6 inch cl/pvc Strongback coupling

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $171.10 Total: $171.10

3
7

8 inchClay x 6 inch cl/pvc Strongback Coupling

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $56.35 Total: $56.35

3
8

6 inch Clay x 4 inch cl/pvc Strongback Coupling

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $81.40 Total: $81.40
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3
9

Quart Can Pipe Lubricant

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2.65 Total: $2.65

4
0

Quart Purple Primer

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $11.50 Total: $11.50

4
1

Quart Heavy Duty PVC Cleaner

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $10.75 Total: $10.75

4
2

36 inch Manhole Lift Hook

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $33.50 Total: $33.50

4
3

Cast Iron Cleanout Casting and Lid

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $40.90 Total: $40.90

4
4

4 inch 90 degree turn SDR35

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $8.05 Total: $8.05

Response Total: $1,796.32
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