
Bid 106-2019 Addendum 2

Finley Fire Equipment

Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 106-2019 Addendum 2
Title: Emergency Equipment for LFD
Type: Competitive Bid
Issue Date: 9/30/2019
Deadline: 10/17/2019 02:00 PM (ET)
Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS SOLICITATION

. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE LINE ITEMS TAB ONL
Y. PRICING WITHIN SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED AND M
AY MAKE YOUR BID NON-RESPONSIVE.

Contact Information

Contact: Jessica Allinder
Address: Central Purchasing

Government Center Building
Room 338
200 East Main Street
Lexington, KY 40507

Fax: (859) 2583322
Email: jallinder@lexingtonky.gov
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Finley Fire Equipment Information

Address: 780 Enterprise Dr
Lexington, KY 40510

Phone: (859) 233-0807

By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent and bind your company and that you agree
to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

APRIL HYAMS APRIL.HYAMS@BLUEGRASSFIRE.COM
Signature Email

Submitted at 10/17/2019 11:07:59 AM

Response Attachments

Addendum 2.pdf

addendum2

addendum1.pdf

addendum1

MBE letter for Lexington bid.docx

mbe letter

CCE_000408.pdf

CCE

Lexingtonpaperwork102019.pdf

affidavit/workforce analysis

mwdbe form.pdf

mwdbe

Shipping charges, Lexington FD bid.docx

Shipping charges

Bid Lines

1 Talon Fire Sprinkler Tools

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: Quickstop

2 Sprinkler Shutoffs (Recess Head Screw Type)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $21.00 Total: $21.00

Manufacturer: Telelite

3 Sprinkler Shutguns

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: Technicraft Product Design Inc
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4 14'x18' Salvage Covers (22 oz. Red)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $224.00 Total: $224.00

Manufacturer: Fold-A-Tank

Manufacturer #: SC14x18

5 3'x15' Floor Runners (18 oz. Yellow)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $52.00 Total: $52.00

Manufacturer: Husky or Fol-Da-Tank

Manufacturer #: HR 3 X 12

6 Water Can Harnesses

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $29.00 Total: $29.00

Supplier Notes: Line 2 design model WCH-1

Alternate 1

CH312

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $47.00 Total: $47.00

7 ABC Extinguisher (20 lb)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $114.00 Total: $114.00

Manufacturer: Amerex

Manufacturer #: A411

8 CO2 Extinguisher (20 lb)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $269.00 Total: $269.00

Manufacturer: Amerex

Manufacturer #: 332

9 Class D Met LX Red Line Cartridge Extinguisher (30 lb)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: Ansel

Manufacturer #: MX-1-30-6-1

1
0

Class D Sodium Chloride Fire Extinguisher (30 lb)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $433.00 Total: $433.00

Manufacturer: Amerex

Manufacturer #: B570

1
1

2.5 Gallon Pressurized Water Extinguisher or Badger Model WP-61; NO PLASTIC BASE

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: Kidde

Manufacturer #: PRO 2.5W
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1
2

10 lb. Sledge Hammer

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $42.00 Total: $42.00

Supplier Notes: brand LEATHERHEAD

1
3

48" Pry Bar

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $41.00 Total: $41.00

Supplier Notes: BRAND COUNCIL

1
4

36" Bolt Cutter

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $77.00 Total: $77.00

Supplier Notes: BRAND FIRE HOOKS UNLIMITED

1
5

K-Tool W/Pouch and Accessories

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $126.00 Total: $126.00

1
6

Rex Tool

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $149.00 Total: $149.00

1
7

Rabbit Tool

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $1,850.00 Total: $1,850.00

Supplier Notes: BRAND HURST MODEL 362R266

Alternate 1

FIRE HOOKS HYDRA RAM

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $1,840.00 Total: $1,840.00

1
8

6 lb. Pick Head Axe w/ Fiberglass Handle

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $42.00 Total: $42.00

Supplier Notes: BRAND LEATHERHEAD

1
9

8 lb. Flat Head Axe w/ Fiberglass Handle

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $90.00 Total: $90.00

Supplier Notes: BRAND LEATHERHEAD

2
0

60" Pinch Point Pry Bar

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $45.00 Total: $45.00

Supplier Notes: BRAND COUNCIL TOOL

2
1

30" Pro Bar Halligan

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $207.00 Total: $207.00

Manufacturer: FHU
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2
2

8 lb. Sledge Hammer w/ Fiberglass Handle & Halligan Loop

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $70.00 Total: $70.00

Manufacturer: FHU

2
3

8 lb. Sledge Hammer w/ Fiberglass Handle w/out Halligan Loop

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $65.00 Total: $65.00

2
4

Pulaski Axe

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $55.00 Total: $55.00

Manufacturer: Akron (or equiv)

Manufacturer #: WPL -4

Supplier Notes: BRAND COUNCIL, AKRON NO LONGER SELLS THIS ITEM

2
5

Fire Rake w/ 60" Wooden Handle

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $55.00 Total: $55.00

Manufacturer: Council Tool (or equiv)

2
6

Fire Swatter w/ 60" Wooden Handle

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $52.00 Total: $52.00

Manufacturer: Council Tool (or equiv)

2
7

5 Gallon Collapsable Backpack Pump

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $140.00 Total: $140.00

Manufacturer: PECO (or equiv)

Manufacturer #: 85130

Supplier Notes: MANUF INDIAN PUMP MODEL FSV500

2
8

2,000 gallon self supporting tank - 4.5" flanges

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $1,513.00 Total: $1,513.00

Manufacturer: Husky

Supplier Notes: BASING THIS ON TANKS YOU'VE ORDERED IN THE PAST, THIS IS 3 PART NUMBER LS-2000V22
28 $1043.00, HM-4.5” NH MALE FLANGE $165.00 AND MFKNH-4.5” MALE X FEMALE KIT 305.00
I ADDED THE 3 TO GET THE PRICE.

2
9

Ground cover for 2,000 gallon self supporting tank

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $92.00 Total: $92.00

Manufacturer: Husky

3
0

5" x 10' hard suction, 4.5" NST couplings (female long handle)

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $287.00 Total: $287.00

Manufacturer: Kochek

Manufacturer #: 2P501
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3
1

Carbon Monoxide Detector w/CO, O2, HCN, LEL

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

Manufacturer: RAE Systems MicroRae

Manufacturer #: M03-1111-300

3
2

Piercing Nozzle

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $750.00 Total: $750.00

Supplier Notes: this is the TFT PA1 Piercing Nozzle

3
3

Blitzfire high elevation monitor comb. package includes monitor, storage bracket, md12a auto nozzle, 3 stacked t
ip nozzle

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $2,975.00 Total: $2,975.00

Manufacturer: TFT

Manufacturer #: XXC-52-HE

3
4

Storage Bracket, MD12A auto-nozzle, 3 stacked tip nozzle

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $0.00 Total: $0.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Supplier Notes: I THINK THIS IS A MISTAKE LINE ITEM, THESE ITEMS ARE IN INCLUDED IN THE TFT MONITOR A
BOVE

3
5

Self educting master stream foam nozzle

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $1,909.00 Total: $1,909.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: SM-1000-HF

3
6

Break apart nozzle with 15/16" smoothbore

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $320.00 Total: $320.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Supplier Notes: PART NUMBER 0033XD06 XD SHUTOFF WITH 15/16” TIP BASED ON PREVIOUS ORDERS

3
7

Chief XD 250 gpm @ 50 psi fog tip

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $445.00 Total: $445.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 4000-24

Supplier Notes: THIS PART NUMBER HAS BEEN REPLACED WITH THE XD NOZZLE, MODEL 04XD0251

3
8

2.5" pistol grip shutoff with 1.25" integral smooth bore

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $438.00 Total: $438.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: DB375GAT

Supplier Notes: THIS PART NUMBER HAS BEEN REPLACED WITH THE XD NOZZLE, MODEL 0069XD07
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3
9

1 1/2" distributor nozzle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $433.00 Total: $433.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 193-6

4
0

2 1/2" bresnan distributor nozzle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $553.00 Total: $553.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 193-6

4
1

foam tube

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $222.00 Total: $222.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 246S

4
2

1 1/2" foam eductor, 95 gpm, .1-6% with chrome pick up tube

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $594.00 Total: $594.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 241-95

Supplier Notes: THIS IS 2 SEPARATE PART NUMBERS, THE 241-95 IS $515.00 THE 81001005 CHROME PICK U
P TUBE IS AND ADDITIONAL $79.00. I PUT THAT TOTAL PRICE IN THE UNIT PRICE.

4
3

Chief XD 175 gmp at 50 psi nozzle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $366.00 Total: $366.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Supplier Notes: THIS IS FOR THE NOZZLE TIP ONLY PART NUMBER 04XD0172, IF YOU ARE WANTING THE CO
MPLETE NOZZLE WITH A PISTOL GRIP SHUTOFF THE PRICE WILL BE $585.00

4
4

Ram XD

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,832.00 Total: $1,832.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart

4
5

R.A.N. Nozzle - 500 6pm

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $419.00 Total: $419.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 3896

4
6

Triple Stack Tip - 1.25", 1.125", 1.5"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $268.00 Total: $268.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: ST-197-A
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4
7

Mini Stream Shaper

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $134.00 Total: $134.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 282-A Mini

4
8

Stinger 2.0 w/ Portable Base (4.5" Inlet w. NST)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2,678.00 Total: $2,678.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 8297

4
9

Stream Shaper

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $151.00 Total: $151.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 282-A

Supplier Notes: THE STREAM SHAPER IS INCLUDED IN THE STINGER PRICE ABOVE, BUT IF YOU NEED TO O
RDER ADDITIONAL I PRICED IT FOR YOU.

5
0

Stacked Tip - 2", 1.75", 1.5", 1.125"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $413.00 Total: $413.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Supplier Notes: THE STACKED TIPS ARE INCLUDED IN THE STINGER PRICE ABOVE, BUT IF YOU NEED TO OR
DER ADDITIONAL I PRICED IT FOR YOU. ALSO NOTE, THE SIZES ON THESE TIPS ARE AS FOL
LOWS This is 2”, 1.75”, 1.5” 1.375”.

5
1

Jumbo low profile ball intake valve, 6 (F) SW in X 4.5 (M) out

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,402.00 Total: $1,402.00

Manufacturer: TFT

Supplier Notes: PART NUMBER ON THIS ITEM BASED ON PREVIOUS ORDERS AXD8-NR-NX-F

5
2

In-line valve with top mount parallel shaft drive, 4.5 (F) sw in X 4.5 out

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,207.00 Total: $1,207.00

Manufacturer: TFT

Supplier Notes: PART NUMBER BASED ON PREVIOUS ORDERS AN5R7R02

5
3

Gated wye, 4.5 (F) SW in x 2 2.5 (M) out

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $899.00 Total: $899.00

Manufacturer: TFT

Manufacturer #: AY5NR-NJ

5
4

2.5" double female adapter

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $29.00 Total: $29.00

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: 35
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5
5

2.5" double male adapter

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $17.00 Total: $17.00

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: 36

5
6

4.5"double male adapter

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $90.00 Total: $90.00

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: 36

5
7

4.5" double female adapter

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $92.00 Total: $92.00

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: 35

5
8

1.5" double female adapter

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $19.00 Total: $19.00

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: 35

5
9

1.5" double male adapter

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $12.00 Total: $12.00

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: 36

6
0

2.5" female x 1.5" male reducer

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $18.00 Total: $18.00

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: 37

6
1

2.5" NG rocker lug female (Rigid) x 4.5 " NH Rocker lug male

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $65.00 Total: $65.00

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: 37

6
2

2.5" female x 3/4" male garden hose reducer

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $25.00 Total: $25.00

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: 37

Page 9 of 19 pages Vendor: Finley Fire Equipment Bid 106-2019 Addendum 2



6
3

2.5" female NST swivel x 4.5" female NST swivel

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $119.00 Total: $119.00

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: 35

6
4

2.5" female NST swivel x 4.5" male NST rigid

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $125.00 Total: $125.00

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: 54

6
5

LDH manifold 4.5" female NST swivel inlet, one 4.5" NST gated outlet, two 2.5" NST gated outlet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,507.00 Total: $1,507.00

Manufacturer: Red Head (NOT Kockek)

Supplier Notes: Harrington model 301, part number H301-45NH-45NH-25NH

6
6

Leather 2.5" hose jacket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $55.00 Total: $55.00

Manufacturer: Boston Leath

Manufacturer #: SKU9200

6
7

4.5" NST barrel strainers, aluminum

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $124.00 Total: $124.00

Manufacturer: Kochek

Manufacturer #: BS45

6
8

Low level strainer w/ 1.5" water transfer fitting

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $676.00 Total: $676.00

Manufacturer: Fold-A-Tank

Manufacturer #: LSF 4.5

6
9

Hose clamp with 285-mb mounting bracket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $525.00 Total: $525.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 285

7
0

2.5" x 1/5" gated wye

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $242.00 Total: $242.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: B-100A

7
1

3.5" x 2.5" reducer

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $41.00 Total: $41.00
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7
2

5"F x 4.5"M Intake Valve

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $1,296.00 Total: $1,296.00

Supplier Notes: TFT BALL INTAKE VALVE PART NUMBER AB7NR-NT

7
3

Drain Elbow

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $215.00 Total: $215.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 105A

7
4

Inline Pressure Gauge (2.5")

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $268.00 Total: $268.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 228A

7
5

Gate Valve

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $384.00 Total: $384.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: X-86A

7
6

Revolution Valve 7982 6" FNST x 4.5 M NST

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,338.00 Total: $1,338.00

Manufacturer: Akron

7
7

Revolution Valve 7982 5" FNST x 4.5 M NST

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,338.00 Total: $1,338.00

Manufacturer: Akron

7
8

Ironlok

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $206.00 Total: $206.00

Manufacturer: PAC

Manufacturer #: K5003

7
9

Toollok

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $27.00 Total: $27.00

Manufacturer: PAC

Manufacturer #: 1003

8
0

Jumbolok

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $53.00 Total: $53.00

Manufacturer: PAC

Manufacturer #: 1070
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8
1

Handlelok

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $33.00 Total: $33.00

Manufacturer: PAC

Manufacturer #: 1004

8
2

Flexmount

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $33.00 Total: $33.00

Manufacturer: PAC

Manufacturer #: 1002-2

8
3

Hooklok

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $27.00 Total: $27.00

Manufacturer: PAC

Manufacturer #: 1001

8
4

Pinch Point Pry Bar Mount

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $35.00 Total: $35.00

Manufacturer: Akron (or equiv)

Manufacturer #: PPBH

Supplier Notes: AKRON DOES NOT MAKE THESE, WE'VE PRICED SOUTHPARK

8
5

Axe Blade Bracket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $22.00 Total: $22.00

Manufacturer: Akron (or equiv)

Manufacturer #: AS-510

Supplier Notes: AKRON DOES NOT MAKE THESE, WE'VE PRICED SOUTHPARK

8
6

Axe Handle Bracket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $18.00 Total: $18.00

Manufacturer: Akron (or equiv)

Manufacturer #: AS-520

Supplier Notes: AKRON DOES NOT MAKE THESE, WE'VE PRICED SOUTHPARK

8
7

1.5" Threaded Mounting Bracket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $14.00 Total: $14.00

Manufacturer: 36.85

Manufacturer #: RMP4604AC

8
8

2.5" Threaded Mounting Bracket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $24.00 Total: $24.00

Manufacturer: PAC (or equiv)

Manufacturer #: RMP4906AC
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8
9

4.5" Threaded Mounting Bracket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $93.00 Total: $93.00

Manufacturer: PAC (or equiv)

Manufacturer #: RMP4912AC

9
0

1% x 3% AR-AFFF (265 gallon tote)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $9,389.00 Total: $9,389.00

Manufacturer: ChemGuard

Supplier Notes: part number 704190

9
1

1% x 3% AR-AFFF (5 gallon bucket)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $186.00 Total: $186.00

Manufacturer: ChemGuard

Supplier Notes: part number 704184

9
2

Class A Foam (265 gallon tote)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4,462.00 Total: $4,462.00

Manufacturer: National Responder

Supplier Notes: part number 2170-0725-6

9
3

Class A Foam (5 gallon bucket)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $85.00 Total: $85.00

Manufacturer: National Responder

Supplier Notes: part number 2170-0340-6

9
4

Foam 3% / 6% AR-AFFF

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $89.00 Total: $89.00

Manufacturer: National Centurion

Supplier Notes: part number 2130-9340-4

9
5

2-Fly 35' Extension Ladder

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $843.00 Total: $843.00

Manufacturer: DUO-Safety

Manufacturer #: 1200-A

9
6

3-Fly 35' Extension Ladder

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $899.00 Total: $899.00

Manufacturer: DUO-Safety

Manufacturer #: 1225-A

Page 13 of 19 pages Vendor: Finley Fire Equipment Bid 106-2019 Addendum 2



9
7

2-Fly 28' Extension Ladder

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $664.00 Total: $664.00

Manufacturer: DUO-Safety

Manufacturer #: 1200-A

9
8

16' Roof Ladders

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $299.00 Total: $299.00

Manufacturer: DUO-Safety

Manufacturer #: 875-A

9
9

10' Folding Attic Ladder

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $181.00 Total: $181.00

Manufacturer: DUO-Safety

Manufacturer #: 585-A

1
0
0

12' FRESNO Extension Ladder w/ safety shoes

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $359.00 Total: $359.00

Manufacturer: DUO-Safety

Manufacturer #: 12-701

1
0
1

10' Parapet Ladder w/ Double Hooks

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $297.00 Total: $297.00

Manufacturer: DUO-Safety

Manufacturer #: 725-AR

Supplier Notes: We called Duo Safety- they said they don't have this part number. They suggested their 775-DR 
double ended roof ladder, 10', so that's what we've priced.

1
0
2

12' Pike Poles "I" Beam Pole

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $77.00 Total: $77.00

Manufacturer: Fire Hooks Unlimited

Supplier Notes: FIRE HOOKS DOESN'T MAKE A I BEAM PIKE POLE, REPLACED IT WITH A LEATHERHEAD BRAN
D

1
0
3

10' Pike Poles "I" Beam Pole

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $65.00 Total: $65.00

Manufacturer: Fire Hooks Unlimited

Supplier Notes: FIRE HOOKS DOESN'T MAKE A I BEAM PIKE POLE, REPLACED IT WITH A LEATHERHEAD BRAN
D

1
0
4

8' Pike Poles "I" Beam Pole

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $60.00 Total: $60.00

Manufacturer: Fire Hooks Unlimited

Supplier Notes: FIRE HOOKS DOESN'T MAKE A I BEAM PIKE POLE, REPLACED IT WITH A LEATHERHEAD BRAN
D
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1
0
5

6' New York Hook w/ Boston Rake

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $132.00 Total: $132.00

Manufacturer: Fire Hooks Unlimited

Supplier Notes: 6'TRISTATE HOOK

1
0
6

6' New York Hooks w/ Prying Ends

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $108.00 Total: $108.00

Manufacturer: Fire Hooks Unlimited

Supplier Notes: PART NUMBER NRH-6

1
0
7

6' LA Trash Hook (Arson Trash Hook / D Handle)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $114.00 Total: $114.00

Manufacturer: Fire Hooks Unlimited

Supplier Notes: PART NUMBER TRH-6

1
0
8

3' D-Handle Closet Hook (National Hook / D Handle)

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $89.00 Total: $89.00

Supplier Notes: PART NUMBER NHF-3-W-D

Alternate 1

LEATHERHEAD CLOSET HOOKS

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $57.00 Total: $57.00

1
0
9

16" Smoke Ejector (Electric)

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $1,615.00 Total: $1,615.00

Manufacturer: Tempest

Manufacturer #: EBS-16-EP

Supplier Notes: NEW PART NUMBER 910-1201

1
1
0

Smoke Ejector Hanger

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $239.00 Total: $239.00

Manufacturer: Tempest

Supplier Notes: PART NUMBER 300-141

1
1
1

Smoke Ejector Hooks

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $34.00 Total: $34.00

Manufacturer: Tempest

Supplier Notes: PART NUMBER 300-142
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1
1
2

Smoke Ejector Ventilation Tube Adapter

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $81.00 Total: $81.00

Manufacturer: Tempest

Manufacturer #: 725-042

1
1
3

Smoke Ejector Ventilation Tube (15' duct)

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $285.00 Total: $285.00

Manufacturer: Tempest

Manufacturer #: 725-029

1
1
4

Electric PPV Fan (Variable Speed Drive)

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $2,260.00 Total: $2,260.00

Manufacturer: Tempest

Manufacturer #: 700-452B

Supplier Notes: NEW PART NUMBER 910-1720

1
1
5

Gas PPV Fan

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $1,873.00 Total: $1,873.00

Manufacturer: Tempest

Manufacturer #: 700-021

Supplier Notes: NEW PART NUMBER 910-1040

1
1
6

Res Q Jack Struts

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

Manufacturer: RES-Q-JACK

Manufacturer #: STX-4PTX

1
1
7

Res Q Jack jack stands

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

Manufacturer: RES-Q-JACK

Manufacturer #: RJ3-JKST

1
1
8

5.4 T Airbag

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $618.00 Total: $618.00

Manufacturer: Paratech

Manufacturer #: KPI-5 MaxForce 10"x10"

Supplier Notes: CURRENTLY PARATECH HAS LONG LEAD TIMES ON THESE BAGS 4-5 MONTHS
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1
1
9

25.6 T Airbag

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $1,075.00 Total: $1,075.00

Manufacturer: Paratech

Manufacturer #: KPI-22 MaxForce 20"x20"

Supplier Notes: CURRENTLY PARATECH HAS LONG LEAD TIMES ON THESE BAGS 4-5 MONTHS

1
2
0

38.0 T Airbag

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $1,203.00 Total: $1,203.00

Manufacturer: Paratech

Manufacturer #: KPI-32 MaxForce 24"x25"

Supplier Notes: CURRENTLY PARATECH HAS LONG LEAD TIMES ON THESE BAGS 4-5 MONTHS

1
2
1

Airbag Controller Kit

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $1,448.00 Total: $1,448.00

Manufacturer: Paratech

Manufacturer #: 22-890351G2-150

1
2
2

Air Chisel Kit

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $1,279.00 Total: $1,279.00

Manufacturer: Ajax Tools

Manufacturer #: 811RK

1
2
3

Battery Powered Windshield Cutter

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $610.00 Total: $610.00

Manufacturer: Rhino

Manufacturer #: RWC-2-SOFT

1
2
4

Portable Floodlights (20k lumen 220 watts)

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $969.00 Total: $969.00

Manufacturer: Akron

Manufacturer #: ELSS-XLAC

1
2
5

Live Cord Reels (200' 12/3)

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $579.00 Total: $579.00

Manufacturer: Akron

Manufacturer #: ECRP-15

Supplier Notes: AKRON WILL BE DISCONTINUING THIS ITEM IN 2020, SO THIS PRICE IS ONLY GOOD UNTIL TH
E END OF 2019.

1
2
6

Junction Boxes

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $370.00 Total: $370.00

Manufacturer: Akron

Manufacturer #: EJBX

Page 17 of 19 pages Vendor: Finley Fire Equipment Bid 106-2019 Addendum 2



1
2
7

Junction Box (w/ 5.15 pigtail)

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $370.00 Total: $370.00

Manufacturer: Akron

Manufacturer #: EJBX

1
2
8

Large Ladder Belts (blue w/ lanyard)

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $144.00 Total: $144.00

Manufacturer: Pac-Mule

Manufacturer #: QL4107FB-18-L

1
2
9

XL Ladder Belts (yellow w/ lanyard)

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $144.00 Total: $144.00

Manufacturer: Pac-Mule

Manufacturer #: QL4107FB-18-XL

1
3
0

XXL Ladder Belts (red w/ lanyard)

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $147.00 Total: $147.00

Manufacturer: Pac-Mule

Manufacturer #: QL4107FB-18-XXL

1
3
1

100' x 1/2" static kernmantle Utility Rope

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $182.00 Total: $182.00

Manufacturer: Bluewater

Manufacturer #: 534820 YEBL

1
3
2

200' x 1/2" static kernmantle Life Safety Rope (red in color)

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $182.00 Total: $182.00

Manufacturer: Bluewater

Manufacturer #: 534820 RDYE

1
3
3

200' x 1/2" static kernmantle Life Safety Rope (blue in color)

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $182.00 Total: $182.00

Manufacturer: Bluewater

Manufacturer #: 534820 BLYE

1
3
4

100' x 6.8mm Heat Resistant Aramid Rope

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $104.00 Total: $104.00

Supplier Notes: STERLING RIT 900 ROPE

1
3
5

75' x 3/8" Polypropolene Water Rescue Rope

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $35.00 Total: $35.00

Supplier Notes: STERLING WATERLINE ROPE
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1
3
6

Rescue Harness

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $385.00 Total: $385.00

Manufacturer: Petzl

Manufacturer #: C71CFA AVAO BOD

Supplier Notes: THIS HARNESS HAS BEEN CHANGED TO THE ASTRO BOD FAST HARNESS - PART NUMBER 
C083BA01

1
3
7

Rescue Harness

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $320.00 Total: $320.00

Manufacturer: Yates

Supplier Notes: NO MODEL NUMBER WAS GIVEN, THIS PRICE IS FOR THE 384 TECHNICAL RESCUE II HARNES
S

Response Total: $68,884.00
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