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Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government (Purchasing)
Supplier Response

Bid Information Contact Information Ship to Information

Bid Creator Jessica Allinder Buyer Address 200 East Main Street Address
Email jallinder@lexingtonky.gov
Phone (859) 2583320 x Lexington, KY 40507
Fax (859) 2583322 x Contact Jessica Allinder Contact

Bid Number Bid 53-2018 Addendum 2 Department Department
Title Janitorial Chemical & Building Building

Supplies
Bid Type Bid Floor/Room Floor/Room
Issue Date 4/11/2018 10:00 AM (ET) Telephone Telephone
Close Date 4/26/2018 02:00:00 PM (ET) Fax Fax

Email Email
jallinder@lexingtonky.gov

Supplier Information

Company Staples Business Advantage
Address 1650 Lyndon Farm Ct

Suite 100
Louisville, KY 40223

Contact
Department
Building
Floor/Room
Telephone (877) 609-7770
Fax
Email sasupport@staples.com
Submitted 4/26/2018 12:56:45 PM (ET)
Total $960.93

By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent and bind your company and that you
agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

Signature Bob Svec Email Bob.Svec@Staples.com

Supplier Notes

We look forward to working with you through the selection process. Please feel free to contact me regarding our proposed
solution.
Thank you!
Bob Svec

Bid Notes

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS SOLICITATION.

Bid Activities

Bid Messages
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Bid Attributes
Please review the following and respond where necessary
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Line Items

# Qty UOM Description Response

1 1 EA Floor wax, 5 gallon pails, "One Wax” or equal $65.31

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: BPR511005-B-CC; DIAMOND FLOOR FINISH 5 GL PAIL; EA

2 1 EA Floor wax, 4-1 gallon, “One Wax” or equal Unit Price

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes:

Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: BPR511005-B-CC; DIAMOND FLOOR FINISH 5 GL PAIL; EA 65.31

Alt Manufacturer: Midlab, Inc. Alt Manufacturer #: BPR511005-B-CC

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes:

3 1 EA Floor Stripper, 5 pail "Bare Bones" or equal $50.23

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: SEB820005-B-CC; STRIPPER FLOOR SE #82 5GAL; EA

4 1 EA Floor Stripper, 4-1 gallon,"Bare Bones" or equal $10.92

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: SEB820001-B-CC; STRIPPER FLOOR SE #82; 4CT $43.66

5 1 EA Snapback, Johnson, 4-1 gallon jugs or equal $3.49

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: BPR585032-B-CT; SPRAY GLOSS SPRAY BUFFING SOL; 12CT $41.92

6 1 EA Stride Neutral Cleaner, Johnson, 4-1 gallon jugs or equal $13.92

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: SEB640001-C-CT; SE64 NEUTRAL CLEANER 4CT; $55.66

7 1 EA Spray Buff, 1 gallon jugs, 4/cs $3.49

Item Notes: Green Certified
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Supplier Notes: BPR585032-B-CT; SPRAY GLOSS SPRAY BUFFING SOL; 12CT; $41.92

8 1 EA Furniture Polish, Lemon oil, 17 oz. can, 12/cs $2.14

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 136A19-ACT; LEMON FURNITURE POLISH; 12CT; $25.63

9 1 EA Glass Cleaner, quart, Ready to Use, “Windex” or equal $2.97

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: SEB61032RTU-CC; GLASS CLEANER 32 OZ; EA; $2.97

10 1 EA Liquid cleanser, “Comet” or equal, 32 oz. Bottles, 9/cs $2.97

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: BPR305032-B-CC SANI CLEANSE 32OZ; EA; $2.97

11 1 EA Pine scented cleaner/degreaser, gallon, ready-to-use $7.11

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: SEB641001-A-CC; MULTI-USE CLNR 1 GAL REFILL; EA; $7.11

12 1 EA 6/1 gallon/cs, “Chlorox” or equal $2.35

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: KIK BLEACH3 BLEACH PUR BRIGHT 1 GL 3CT; $7.06

13 1 EA Disinfectant liquid, (H.I.V. & virus), quart, “Acid Free”, “Clorox” or equal gallon $2.21

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: BPR490032-A-CC DISINF CLNR VIRUSTAT TBQ1QT; EA; $2.21

14 1 EA Hydrogen Peroxide Multi Purpose Cleaner, 1/2 gallon jug, per case 442125 $34.68

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 95613252 CLEANR GENL PURP HYPRX2.5L 2CT; $69.36

15 1 EA Stainless steel cleaner, 1/2 gallon jugs, per case $36.05

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: SHE4EA POLISH SHEILA SHINE 1GL; EA; $36.05
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16 1 EA EPA Hospital Grade, Neutral PH, Disinfectant Cleaner $8.63

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: BPR045001-A-CC DISINFECTANT CLEANER LEMON GAL; $8.63

17 1 EA Liquid hand soap, “Dial” or equal, gallon, 4/cs $5.81

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 18499CT ANTIBACTERIAL HAND SOAP 4CT; $23.22

18 1 EA Pink lotion hand soap, “Kimberly-Clark sanifresh”, or equal, 4.gal/cs $4.18

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 18497CT PINK LOTION HAND SOAP 4CT; $16.73

19 1 EA "E-Z Paks" or equal All Purpose Cleaner Water Soluble 0.5 oz Packets, 180/cs $0.28

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 990651 ALL PURPOSE CLEANER/ DEODORIZ; CT180; 50.35

20 1 EA Purell Instant Hand Sanitizer, 4 oz. portable bottle, #559275 or equal $1.92

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 9651-24 SANITIZER HANDPUREL 4 OZ.; CT24; $46.13

21 1 EA DC Pine Cleaner, gallon jugs, ready to use $10.99

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 35418 PINE SOL CLEANER PINE 144OZ; EA; 10.99

22 1 EA Air Freshener $2.74

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 239A7-ACT SUMMER BREEZE METERED AIRFRSH; CT12; $32.85

23 1 EA Dishwasher Detergent, Powdered, 10 lb bucket $4.12

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: BPR900050-B-CC LAUNDRY DETRGNT PWDR 50LB BX; $20.58
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24 1 EA Dishwasher Detergent, Dawn, 8-38 oz bottles $5.16

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 45112CT P&G DAWN DISHWASH LIQ 38OZ 8CT; $41.30

25 1 EA Foaming Disinfectant Cleaner, "Herricane" or equal 19.5 oz can No Bid

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes:

26 1 EA Sanitizing Wipes, Lysol or equal, per pack $2.72

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 50713 DISNFCT WIPES FRESH SCNT 75/PK; $2.72

27 1 EA Laundry Detergent, Powder, with scoop/ 50 lb box (no staples in box) $20.58

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: BPR900050-B-CC LAUNDRY DETRGNT PWDR 50LB BX; $20.58

28 1 EA Pin-Sol Lemon Fresh Cleaner/3-144 oz. bottles $9.43

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: COX35419CT LEMON FRESH PINE SOL 144 OZ; CT3; $28.29

29 1 EA Can Liners - 43 x 48 black, roll, 22 micron, 150/cs, part # 563057 or equivalent $0.17

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: Z8048WKER01 LINER WSTE 40X48 SUP HVY BK; CT150; $25.67

30 1 EA Can Liners - Large, 43 x 48 clear, roll, minimum 14 micron, 200/cs $0.13

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: Z8648VNER01 LINER WASTE 43X48 XHD RL 1; CT200; $26.68

31 1 EA Can Liners - Medium, 30 x 37, clear, 25 per roll, minimum 10 micron, 500/cs $0.05

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: Z6037MNER01 LINER WASTE 30X37 REG RL 1; CT500; $23.33
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32 1 EA Can Liners - 38 x 58 barrel type, black, minimum 1.0 mil, 60 gal 100/cs, Biodegradable $0.22

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: H7658TKE LINER WASTE 38X58 XHD BK; CT100; $21.82

33 1 EA Can Liners - 33 x 39, 33 gal, .70 mil, 200/cs, Biodegradable $0.12

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: H6639TCE LINER LLDPE 33X39 .5ML CLR 150; CT150; $18.46

34 1 EA Can Liners - Steel Sak, 43 x 48, minimum 2 mil, grey, 50/cs No Bid

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes:

35 1 EA Mophead, 32 oz. nylon looped; 124 Nylon $6.36

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 3486284 CUT-END MOP RAYON WH 32#; EA; $6.36

36 1 EA Mophead, 24 oz. cotton layflat screwtip $2.80

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 3486267 CUT-END MOP COTTON WH 24#; EA; $2.80

37 1 EA Mophead, 5" med tuf/blend "blue" washable mop heads 12/cs $12.33

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: FGD55306WH00 FINISH MOP LG WH/BL 5IN BAND; EA1; $12.33

38 1 EA Mophead frame only, 48 x 5 $4.48

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: F485 METAL DUST MOP FRAME 48X5; EA; $4.48

39 1 EA Swivel snap dustmop handle $6.19

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: H600 CLIP WOOD DUST MOP HANDLE; EA; $6.19
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40 1 EA Angle broom, 13",no metal, wire or nylon rope, “Zepher #34068” or equal $6.11

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: F11601M LARGE YELLOW ANGLE BROOM; EA; $6.11

41 1 EA Push broom, 24” stiff garage bristle, “Palmyra” or equal $8.94

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: P10003 BROOM PSH PALMYRA 24 INCH; EA; $8.94

42 1 EA Metal tip push broom screw-in handle $2.96

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 0160/BRU136 HANDLE BROOM THREADED METAL TI; EA; $2.96

43 1 EA Sprayers & bottles, 32 oz. complete (bottles must be clear) $1.18

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 5032WG24 BOTTLE PLASTIC 32OZ NATURAL; EA $.57
490624 SPRAYER TRIGGER 9.5 FOR USE W; EA $.61

44 1 EA 20” buffer pads, standard, black, 5/cs $3.60

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: BPR22979-CC STRIPPING FLOOD PAD BLK 20IN; CT5; $17.98

45 1 EA 20” buffer pads, standard, white, 5/cs $2.92

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: BPR22986-CC POLISHING FLOOR PAD WHITE 20IN; CT5; $14.59

46 1 EA 20” buffer pads, standard, red, 5/cs $2.92

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: BPR22984-CC BUFFING FLOOR PAD RED 20 IN; CT5; $14.59

47 1 EA 13” black stripper pad, standard, 5/cs $5.45

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: MCO 08375 PAD STRIPPER 13IN BK; CT5; $27.25
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48 1 EA 13” red stripper pad, standard, 5/cs $3.09

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 510013 3M RED BUFFER PAD 5100 13IN; CT5; $15.45

49 1 EA 13” white stripper pad, standard, 5/cs $5.25

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 410013 3M WTE POLISH PAD 4100 13IN; CT5; $26.26

50 1 EA Maxi-pads, Vend Pack #4-147 $0.14

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 25130973 NAPKIN SANITARY STAYFREE; CT250; $35.07

51 1 EA Urinal screens w/block, scented, 12/ctn $1.19

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: BPR28610 URINAL SCREEN N/PARA BERRY12BX; $14.24

52 1 EA Urinal Blocks, Deoderant, per doz. $0.57

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: BPR28633 URINAL BLOCK N/PARA BERRY 12BX; $6.87

53 1 EA Toilet bowl 14” mops $0.79

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 2042591 MOP DURALON BOWL; EA; $0.79

54 1 EA 44 gallon Brute garbage containers w/lids, “Rubbermaid” or equal $52.28

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: FG264360GRAY RECEPTACLE WASTE BRUTE ROUND V; EA; $52.28

55 1 EA Lids for 44 gal. Brute garbage containers, “Rubbermaid” or equal $20.56

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: FG264560BLA LID FOR 44-GALLON CAN; EA; $20.56
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56 1 EA Dust pan, 12” without handle, “Rubbermaid #2005” or equal $1.81

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 710 VALUE PLUS DUST PAN BLK; EA; $1.81

57 1 EA Scrubbing Sponge, Light, White/Yellow, 20/cs (needs to be individually wrapped) No Bid

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes:

58 1 EA Scrubbing Sponge, Medium, Green/Yellow, 20/cs $3.04

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: MMM74X MEDIUM DUTY SCRUB SPONGE 20/CT; $60.79

59 1 EA Dust Mop Covers, 5" x 36" $19.38

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: FGJ25500BL00 MOP DUST TWISTED LOOP 36X5; EA; $19.38

60 1 EA Dust Mop Frames, 5" x 36" $3.39

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: F365 METAL DUST MOP FRAME 36X5; EA: $3.39

61 1 EA 60"Dust Mop Handle/ Clamp on $11.24

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: FGH216000000 GRIPPER CLAMP WET MOP 60IN; EA; $11.24

62 1 EA Soap,3/4 oz bars No Bid

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes:

63 1 EA 10" Shower/Floor Scrub Brush, Rubbermaid or equivalent $3.23

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: BRU331 10IN DECK BRUSH CREAM POLYPRO; EA1; $3.23
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64 1 EA 6" Iron Handle Scrub Brush, Rubbermaid or equivalent $1.88

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: HS-IS6 6IN IRON HANDLE SCRUB BRUSH; EA; $1.88

65 1 EA Toilet seat covers, half fold, 250 per pk., 20 sleeves of 250 covers ea, “Reliable” or equal $0.01
(No staples in sleeves)

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: BPR24775 BP HALFFOLD TOILET SEAT COVERS; ct5000; $31.44

66 1 EA Rubbermaid Heavy-Duty Dust Pan (Must be all plastic) $4.51

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: FG200500CHAR RUBBERMAID DUSTPAN 8IN; EA1; $4.51

67 1 EA Rubbermaid 15" White Roundhead Toilet Bowl Brush (all Plastic) $3.27

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: FG630100YEL BRUSHTOLIET BOWLYL; EA; $3.27

68 1 EA Blue Rubbermaid Floor Scrub Brush (Must be all plastic) $6.87

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: DSSB DUAL SURFACE DECK SCRUB BRUSH; EA; $6.87

69 1 EA Rubbermaid 6" Round Handle Scrub Brush (Must be all plastic) $1.88

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: HS-IS6 6IN IRON HANDLE SCRUB BRUSH; EA; $1.88

70 1 EA Regency Drain Maintainer $157.94

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 5640023 SUMA DRAIN MAINTAINER 5 GAL; EA; $157.94

71 1 EA Paper towels, 2-ply roll, kitchen type, “Bounty” or equal, 30 rls/cs $0.69

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 21810CT BP PAPER TWL 85SHT/RL; CT30; $20.83
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72 1 EA Toilet Tissue, Single 2 ply, 550 sheet $0.38

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: BPR26212/410019 BRIGHTON PROF BT 96 RL; CT96; $36.36

73 1 EA Toilet Tissue, 2 ply, 1000 ft. Jumbo Junior rolls $1.77

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: BPR26215/410310 BRIGHTON PROF JRT 2PLY; CT12; $21.19

74 1 EA Multi fold paper towels, Brown, 9.5x9.125, 16 sleeves/ case $1.02

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 410179/61912 BP NAT MULTI FOLD 16/250PK; $16.31

75 1 EA Paper towels, Natural multi-fold, 20 sleeves/ case $1.02

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 410179/61912 BP NAT MULTI FOLD 16/250PK; $16.31

76 1 EA Paper towels, single ply roll, kitchen type, 30 rls/cs $0.69

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 21810CT BP PAPER TWL 85SHT/RL; CT30; $20.83

77 1 EA Facial tissue, 30/100/cs $0.78

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 21826/33603 BP FACIAL TISSUE FLAT CASE; CT48/$37.24

78 1 EA Plastic forks, heavy wt., 1M/cs $0.03

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: ADMBSXHFW MERIT FORK XHD PS WHT BULK; CT1000; $29.66

79 1 EA Plastic knives, heavy wt., 1 M/cs $0.03

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: ADMBSXHKW MERIT KNIFE XHD PS WHT BULK; CT1000; $29.66
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80 1 EA 18” x 2000’ roll film $33.65

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: BWK 7204 FILM CUTTER BX 18X2000; RL1; $33.65

81 1 EA Foam bowls, white, 12 oz., 1M/cs $0.04

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 12BWWCR/FSB1 BOWL FOAM BASIX 12OZ WE; CT1000; $40.49

82 1 EA Plates, 9”, 3 comp, 500/cs $0.17

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 9CPWF DART WHT 3 SECT PLSTC PLTE 9; CT500; $84.82

83 1 EA Gloves, disposal, food service grade, latex, powder free, Small, 100/bx, per case $0.03

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: LSM5201 LATEX DISP GLOVE PF SM 1M/CT; $32.28

84 1 EA Gloves, disposal, food service grade, latex, powder free, med, 100/bx, per case $0.03

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: LMD5201 LATEX DISP GLOVE PF MD 1M/CT; $32.28

85 1 EA Gloves, disposal, food service grade, latex, powder free, large, 100/bx, per case $0.03

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: LLG5201 LATEX DISP GLOVE PF LG 1M/CT; $32.28

86 1 EA Gloves, Nitrile, S-XL, 100 bx $0.04

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: NXL5201 NITRL DISP GLOVE PF XL 1000/CT; $37.72

87 1 EA Aluminum foil, 18” x 500’rl $25.87

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: BWK 7114 FOIL 18INX500FT XSTD SLV; EA; $25.87
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88 1 EA Baking sheets (pan liners, full) 1M/cs $0.04

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: GEN PANLINER PAN LINER 24.375X16.375; CT1000; $43.66

89 1 EA Paper bags,brown, 6# weight,500/pack No Bid

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes:

90 1 EA Paper bags,brown, 76# weight, 400/bundle, No Bid

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes:

91 1 EA Paper bags,brown, 25# weight, 500/pack No Bid

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes:

92 1 EA 32 oz. Clear Bottles w/sprayer $1.18

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 5032WG24 BOTTLE PLASTIC 32OZ NATURAL; EA; $0.57
490624 SPRAYER TRIGGER 9.5 FOR USE W; EA; $0.61

93 1 EA Trigger Sprayer for 32 oz. Bottles $0.61

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes: 490624 SPRAYER TRIGGER 9.5 FOR USE W; EA; $0.61

94 1 EA 15" Windshield Washers No Bid

Item Notes: Green Certified

Supplier Notes:

95 1 EA Floor wax, 5 gallon pails, "One Wax” or equal $65.31

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes: BPR511005-B-CC DIAMOND FLOOR FINISH 5 GL PAIL; EA; $65.31
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96 1 EA Floor wax, 4-1 gallon, “One Wax” or equal $65.31

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes: BPR511005-B-CC DIAMOND FLOOR FINISH 5 GL PAIL; EA; $65.31

97 1 EA Floor Stripper, 5 pail "Bare Bones" or equal $50.23

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes: SEB820005-B-CC STRIPPER FLOOR SE #82 5GAL; $50.23

98 1 EA Floor Stripper, 4-1 gallon,"Bare Bones" or equal $10.92

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes: SEB820001-B-CC STRIPPER FLOOR SE #82; CT4; $43.66

99 1 EA Snapback, Johnson, 4-1 gallon jugs or equal $3.49

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes: BPR585032-B-CT SPRAY GLOSS SPRAY BUFFING SOL; CT12; $41.92

100 1 EA Stride Neutral Cleaner, Johnson, 4-1 gallon jugs or equal $13.92

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes: SEB640001-C-CT SE64 NEUTRAL CLEANER 4CT; $55.66

101 1 EA Spray Buff, 1 gallon jugs, 4/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

102 1 EA Furniture Polish, Lemon oil, 17 oz. can, 12/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

103 1 EA Glass Cleaner, quart, Ready to Use, “Windex” or equal Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:
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104 1 EA Liquid cleanser, “Comet” or equal, 32 oz. Bottles, 9/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

105 1 EA Pine scented cleaner/degreaser, gallon, ready-to-use Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

106 1 EA 6/1 gallon/cs, “Chlorox” or equal Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

107 1 EA Disinfectant liquid, (H.I.V. & virus), quart, “Acid Free”, “Clorox” or equal gallon Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

108 1 EA Hydrogen Peroxide Multi Purpose Cleaner, 1/2 gallon jug, per case 442125 Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

109 1 EA Stainless steel cleaner, 1/2 gallon jugs, per case Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

110 1 EA EPA Hospital Grade, Neutral PH, Disinfectant Cleaner Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

111 1 EA Liquid hand soap, “Dial” or equal, gallon, 4/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:



Bid 53-2018 Addendum 2 - Staples Business Advantage - Page 17 of 26

112 1 EA Pink lotion hand soap, “Kimberly-Clark sanifresh”, or equal, 4.gal/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

113 1 EA "E-Z Paks" or equal All Purpose Cleaner Water Soluble 0.5 oz Packets, 180/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

114 1 EA Purell Instant Hand Sanitizer, 4 oz. portable bottle, #559275 or equal Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

115 1 EA DC Pine Cleaner, gallon jugs, ready to use Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

116 1 EA Air Freshener Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

117 1 EA Dishwasher Detergent, Powdered, 10 lb bucket Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

118 1 EA Dishwasher Detergent, Dawn, 8-38 oz bottles Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

119 1 EA Foaming Disinfectant Cleaner, "Herricane" or equal 19.5 oz can Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:
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120 1 EA Sanitizing Wipes, Lysol or equal, per pack Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

121 1 EA Laundry Detergent, Powder, with scoop/ 50 lb box (no staples in box) Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

122 1 EA Pin-Sol Lemon Fresh Cleaner/3-144 oz. bottles Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

123 1 EA Can Liners - 43 x 48 black, roll, 22 micron, 150/cs, part # 563057 or equivalent Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

124 1 EA Can Liners - Large, 43 x 48 clear, roll, minimum 14 micron, 200/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

125 1 EA Can Liners - Medium, 30 x 37, clear, 25 per roll, minimum 10 micron, 500/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

126 1 EA Can Liners - 38 x 58 barrel type, black, minimum 1.0 mil, 60 gal 100/cs, Biodegradable Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

127 1 EA Can Liners - 33 x 39, 33 gal, .70 mil, 200/cs, Biodegradable Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:
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128 1 EA Can Liners - Steel Sak, 43 x 48, minimum 2 mil, grey, 50/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

129 1 EA Mophead, 32 oz. nylon looped; 124 Nylon Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

130 1 EA Mophead, 24 oz. cotton layflat screwtip Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

131 1 EA Mophead, 5" med tuf/blend "blue" washable mop heads 12/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

132 1 EA Mophead frame only, 48 x 5 Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

133 1 EA Swivel snap dustmop handle Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

134 1 EA Angle broom, 13",no metal, wire or nylon rope, “Zepher #34068” or equal Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

135 1 EA Push broom, 24” stiff garage bristle, “Palmyra” or equal Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:
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136 1 EA Metal tip push broom screw-in handle Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

137 1 EA Sprayers & bottles, 32 oz. complete (bottles must be clear) Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

138 1 EA 20” buffer pads, standard, black, 5/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

139 1 EA 20” buffer pads, standard, white, 5/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

140 1 EA 20” buffer pads, standard, red, 5/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

141 1 EA 13” black stripper pad, standard, 5/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

142 1 EA 13” red stripper pad, standard, 5/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

143 1 EA 13” white stripper pad, standard, 5/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:
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144 1 EA Maxi-pads, Vend Pack #4-147 Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

145 1 EA Urinal screens w/block, scented, 12/ctn Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

146 1 EA Urinal Blocks, Deoderant, per doz. Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

147 1 EA Toilet bowl 14” mops Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

148 1 EA 44 gallon Brute garbage containers w/lids, “Rubbermaid” or equal Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

149 1 EA Lids for 44 gal. Brute garbage containers, “Rubbermaid” or equal Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

150 1 EA Dust pan, 12” without handle, “Rubbermaid #2005” or equal Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

151 1 EA Scrubbing Sponge, Light, White/Yellow, 20/cs (needs to be individually wrapped) Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:
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152 1 EA Scrubbing Sponge, Medium, Green/Yellow, 20/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

153 1 EA Dust Mop Covers, 5" x 36" Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

154 1 EA Dust Mop Frames, 5" x 36" Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

155 1 EA 60"Dust Mop Handle/ Clamp on Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

156 1 EA Soap,3/4 oz bars Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

157 1 EA 10" Shower/Floor Scrub Brush, Rubbermaid or equivalent Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

158 1 EA 6" Iron Handle Scrub Brush, Rubbermaid or equivalent Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

159 1 EA Toilet seat covers, half fold, 250 per pk., 20 sleeves of 250 covers ea, “Reliable” or equal Unit Price
(No staples in sleeves)

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:
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160 1 EA Rubbermaid Heavy-Duty Dust Pan (Must be all plastic) Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

161 1 EA Rubbermaid 15" White Roundhead Toilet Bowl Brush (all Plastic) Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

162 1 EA Blue Rubbermaid Floor Scrub Brush (Must be all plastic) Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

163 1 EA Rubbermaid 6" Round Handle Scrub Brush (Must be all plastic) Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

164 1 EA Regency Drain Maintainer Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

165 1 EA Paper towels, 2-ply roll, kitchen type, “Bounty” or equal, 30 rls/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

166 1 EA Toilet Tissue, Single 2 ply, 550 sheet Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

167 1 EA Toilet Tissue, 2 ply, 1000 ft. Jumbo Junior rolls Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:
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168 1 EA Multi fold paper towels, Brown, 9.5x9.125, 16 sleeves/ case Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

169 1 EA Paper towels, Natural multi-fold, 20 sleeves/ case Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

170 1 EA Paper towels, single ply roll, kitchen type, 30 rls/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

171 1 EA Facial tissue, 30/100/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

172 1 EA Plastic forks, heavy wt., 1M/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

173 1 EA Plastic knives, heavy wt., 1 M/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

174 1 EA 18” x 2000’ roll film Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

175 1 EA Foam bowls, white, 12 oz., 1M/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:
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176 1 EA Plates, 9”, 3 comp, 500/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

177 1 EA Gloves, disposal, food service grade, latex, powder free, Small, 100/bx, per case Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

178 1 EA Gloves, disposal, food service grade, latex, powder free, med, 100/bx, per case Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

179 1 EA Gloves, disposal, food service grade, latex, powder free, large, 100/bx, per case Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

180 1 EA Gloves, Nitrile, S-XL, 100 bx Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

181 1 EA Aluminum foil, 18” x 500’rl Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

182 1 EA Baking sheets (pan liners, full) 1M/cs Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

183 1 EA Paper bags,brown, 6# weight,500/pack Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:
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184 1 EA Paper bags,brown, 76# weight, 400/bundle, Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

185 1 EA Paper bags,brown, 25# weight, 500/pack Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

186 1 EA 32 oz. Clear Bottles w/sprayer Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

187 1 EA Trigger Sprayer for 32 oz. Bottles Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

188 1 EA 15" Windshield Washers Unit Price

Item Notes: Non-green certified

Supplier Notes:

Response Total: $960.93


