Submitted by:	G+ & Parmy + Const. Inc
	3136 Bracktown Rd.
	Address
	Lexington 40511 City, State & Zip
Bid must be signed:	Marin E. Halisto - President
(original signature)	Signature of Authorized Company Representative - Title
	Marvm E GatesKill - President Representative/s Name (Typed or Printed)
	859-255-6029 859-233-2365 Area Code - Phone - Extension Fax #
	GG Paring a MW. TWCBL. COM
	E-Mail Address

OFFICIAL ADDRESS:

3/36 Brack town Rd

Lexing for Ky 40511

(Seal if Bid is by Corporation)

By signing this form you agree to ALL terms, conditions, and associated forms in this bid package

#### PART III

# Invitation to Bid No. 12-2016

# Construction Unit Price Contract for Parks & Recreation

### FORM OF PROPOSAL

1. <u>FOR</u>	IN OF PROPOSAL
	Place: Lexington, Kentucky  Date: 3/15/2016
The followin	g Form of Proposal shall be followed exactly in submitting a proposal for this Work
This Proposa	1 Submitted by G+G Paring + Cont. Inc
	1 Submitted by G+G Paring + Cont. Inc  3134 Brackton Rd Lexington Ky 405%  (Name and Address of Bidding Contractor)
(Hereinaster	called "Bidder"), organized and existing under the laws of the State of doing business as the faving of the State of "a corporation," "a partnership", or an "individual" as applicable.
To:	Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government (Hereinafter called "OWNER") Office of the Director of Purchasing 200 East Main Street, 3rd Floor Lexington, KY 40507
Gentlemen:	

The Bidder, in compliance with your Invitation for Bids for Construction Unit Price Contract for Parks & Recreation having examined the Plans and Specifications with related documents, having examined the site for proposed Work, and being familiar with all of the conditions surrounding the construction of the proposed Project, including the availability of materials and labor, hereby proposes to furnish all labor, materials, and supplies, and to construct the Project in accordance with the Contract Documents, within the time set forth therein, and at the lump sum and/or unit prices stated hereinafter. These prices are to cover all expenses incurred in performing the Work required under the Contract Documents, of which this proposal is a part. The OWNER will issue work orders for work to be performed under this Contract.

BIDDER hereby agrees to commence work under this contract on or before a date to be specified in the Notice to Proceed and to fully complete the project within the time provided in the Purchase Order or Work Orders issued by the OWNER. BIDDER further agrees to pay liquidated damages, the sum of \$100.00 for each consecutive calendar day thereafter.

The Bidder hereby acknowledges receipt of the following addenda:

Addendum No.	Date
	Date
Addendum No.	

Insert above the number and the date of any Addendum issued and received. If none has been issued and received, the word "NONE" should be inserted.

2.	LEGAL STATUS OF BIDDER
Bidder	G+6 Paing +Const. Dr. 3/15/2016
Date _	3/15/2016
* 1.	A corporation duly organized and doing business under the laws of the State of the
* 2.	A Partnership, all of the members of which, with addresses are: (Designate general partners as such)
* 3.	An individual, whose signature is affixed to this Bid/Proposal (please print name)  Marvin E Gafes Kill
	*(The Bidder shall fill out the appropriate form and strike out the other two.)

### 3. <u>BIDDERS AFFIDAVIT</u>

Come	es the Affiant, Marm E GateMill, and after being first duly sworn, states
1.	His/her name is Marin E Gakell and he/she is the individual submitting the bid or is the authorized representative of G & G facing & Const. Die
	referred to as "Bidder").
2.	Bidder will pay all taxes and fees, which are owed to the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government at the time the bid is submitted, prior to award of the contract and will maintain a "current" status in regard to those taxes and fees during the life of the contract.
3.	Bidder will obtain a Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government business license, if applicable, prior to award of the contract.
4.	Bidder has authorized the Division of Central Purchasing to verify the above-mentioned information with the Division of Revenue and to disclose to the Urban County Council that taxes and/or fees are delinquent or that a business license has not been obtained.
5.	Bidder has not knowingly violated any provision of the campaign finance laws of the Commonwealth of Kentucky within the past five (5) years and the award of a contract to the Bidder will not violate any provision of the campaign finance laws of the Commonwealth.
6.	Bidder has not knowingly violated any provision of Chapter 25 of the Lexington- Fayette Urban County Government Code of Ordinances, known as the "Ethics Act."
7.	Bidder acknowledges that "knowingly" for purposes of this Affidavit means, with respect to conduct or to circumstances described by a statute or ordinance defining an offense, that a person is aware or should have been aware that his conduct is of that nature or that the circumstance exists.  Further, Affiant sayeth naught.
	Marin & Halishillo (Affiant)
STATE OF	Amant)
COUNTY OF	- Langette
The foregoing	instrument was subscribed, sworn to and acknowledged before me by
Marxi	DE Gateskill on this the 15th day of March, 20 16.
My Commissi	on expires: 9/15/19
	MOTARY PUBLIC STATE ATLARGE TO# 541263

#### 4. <u>BID SCHEDULE - SCHEDULE OF VALUES</u>

The Bidder agrees to perform all the Work described in the Specifications and shown on future Plans for the following proposed unit prices, if applicable, which shall include the furnishing of all labor, materials, supplies, equipment and/or vehicle usage, services, all items of cost, overhead, taxes (federal, state, local), and profit for the Contractor and any Subcontractor involved, within the time set forth herein. If unit prices are applicable, Bidder must make the extensions and additions showing the total amount of bid.

In addition to completing the following schedule of values, bidders shall enter their unit prices on the attached Excel spreadsheet (Available through the LFUCG Economic Engine Marketplace), titled *Construction Unit Price Contract P&R Bid Schedule.xls*, and submit it with their bid on a CD or flash drive. Any discrepancies between entries in the table below and the electronic spreadsheet will defer to the unit price as written in the schedule below.

The Bidder is not required to bid on every item listed in the bid schedule. In instances where the Bidder chooses not to bid on a specific item, the Bidder shall enter the phrase "No Bid" in the unit price column for that respective item. However, Bidders are cautioned that failure to submit a unit bid price on an item will disqualify the Bidder from any project requiring that item, even if they have submitted unit bid prices for all other work items pertaining to that particular project.

Form of proposal must include unit bid prices written in words and unit price written in numbers per line item OR bid may be considered non-responsive. In case of price discrepancy, unit bid price written in words will prevail followed by unit price written in numbers per line item.

If the unit price and the item total are illegible or are omitted, the bid may be determined nonresponsive.

For a unit price based bid, the sum of the item totals is the bid amount the Division uses for bid comparison.

The LFUCG's decision on the bid amount is final.

Item No.	Description w/Unit Bid Price Written in Words	Unit	Unit Price
1.	Bituminous pavement for athletic courts - Base  Eighty Five Dollars  Cents	TN	\$ 85,00
2.	Bituminous pavement for athletic courts – Surface  ONC Hondred Dollars  Cents	TN	\$ 100,00
3.	Bituminous pavement reinforced with aramid fibers for athletic courts – Base  Dinety Five Dollars  Cents	TN	\$ 95.00
4.	Bituminous pavement reinforced with aramid fibers for athletic courts – Surface  ONE Howkred TEO Dollars  Cents	TN	s 110,00

Item			
No.	Description w/Unit Bid Price Written in Words	Unit	Unit Price
5.	Bituminous pavement milling for athletic courts  Dollars  Cents	TN	\$50.00
6.	Dense Grade aggregate placed Base    Liverty Time   Dollars	TN	s 22.00
7.	Bituminous pavement Crack repair  Dollars  Cents	LF	\$ 2.00
8.	Bituminous pavement Crack filler  Dollars  Fifty Cents	LF	\$_,50_
9.	Court color coating Dollars Cents	SY	\$ 12.00
10.	Court striping  OV 2  Dollars  Exacts Twenty File Cents	LF	s 1.85
11.	Athletic court fencing coated 8'  Dollars  Cents	LF	s NO Bid
12.	Athletic court fencing coated 10' Dollars Cents	LF	s No Bid
13.	Athletic court fencing coated 12'  Dollars Cents	LF	\$ No Bd
14.	Athletic court fencing galvanized 8'  Dollars  Cents	LF	s No Bid
15.	Athletic court fencing galvanized 10'  Dollars  Cents	LF	\$ 100 Bid
16.	Athletic court fencing galvanized 12'	LF	\$ 100 Bid

T4			
Item No.	Description w/Unit Bid Price Written in Words	Unit	Unit Price
17.	Asphalt sealing  ONE  Dollars  Twenty Five  Cents	SY	s_1,25
18.	Parking lot striping  Dollars  Cents	LF	s_,50
19.	Concrete Sidewalk  Foorty Five Dollars Cents	SY	\$ 45.00
20.	Finished concrete  Thyree Hundred Dollars Cents	CY	\$360.00
21.	Excavation Dollars Cents	CY	s 1 <b>2</b> ,00
22.	Embankment  Fourtern  Dollars  Cents	CY	s 14.00
23.	Finish grading Dollars Cents	CY	\$ 15.00
24.	Laser grading .  Eighteen Dollars Cents	CY	\$ 18.00
25.	Environmental Fencing  FOUR  Dollars  Tiventy Five Cents	LF	s <u>4.25</u>
26.	Seeding and protection  Three Dollars  Cents	SY	s 3.00
27.	Topsoil  Fifteen  Dollars  Cents	CY	\$ 15,00

Payment and Performance Bond Cost for Projects over \$50,000.  Percent of Total Project Cost*  *See Special Conditions, Section 4, Payment for Cost of P&P Bond	3 %
Unspecified Incidental Materials at Cost Plus 15% - Check if Interested	
Unspecified Incidental Labor at Direct Wages Plus Certified Overhead Plus 15% - Check if interested	Ø
Minimum Total Project Cost for Consideration (See Special Conditions, Section 2) – Enter dollar amount	\$ 2,500,00

Mobilization, Traffic Control, Construction Staking, and E&S Permitting will be paid on a s sliding percentage scale for increments of the final price for Work, per the table below.

For example, if the final total of Bid Item Prices for the Work is \$24,000, Mobilization would be (\$10,000 X 15%) plus (\$10,000 X 10%) plus (\$4,000 X 5%) = \$2,700).

No additional compensation will be paid beyond a contract price of \$100,000. For example, the mobilization cost for a \$100,000 price of Work will be identical to that for a \$110,000 price of Work.

Applicability of Traffic Control, Construction Staking, and E&S Permitting will be agreed upon individually for each Purchase Order.

Table of Incremental Costs for Mobilization and Additional Services

Increment Price for Work	(a) Mobilization Cost %	(b) Traffic Control Cost %	(c) Construction Staking Cost %	(d) SWPP Etc. Cost %
\$0 - \$10,000	15.0	7.5	7.5	5.0
\$10,000 - \$20,000	10.0	4.5	4.5	0.5
\$20,000 - \$30,000	5.0	3.0	3.0	.05
\$30,000 - \$50,000	5.0	2.5	2.5	0.5
\$50,000 - \$75,000	5.0	2.5	2.5	0.5
\$75,000 - \$100,000	4.0	2.0	2.0	0.5

## 5. STATEMENT OF BIDDER'S QUALIFICATIONS

The fo	ollowing statement of the Bidder's qualifications is required to be filled in, executed, and submitted the Proposal:
1.	Name of Bidder: G+6 Parmy + Construction Anc
2.	Permanent Place of Business: 3/3 6 Brackfrom Rd
3.	When Organized: 1986
4.	Where Incorporated: Lex nofon Ky
5.	Construction Plant and Equipment Available for this Project:
	All Equipmed Needed
	(Attach Separate Sheet If Necessary)
6.	Financial Condition:
	If specifically requested by the OWNER, the apparent low Bidder is required to submit its latest thr (3) years audited financial statements to the OWNER'S Division of Central Purchasing within sev (7) calendar days following the bid opening.
7.	In the event the Contract is awarded to the undersigned, surety bonds will be furnished by:
	State Anto (Surety)
	Signed:(Representative of Surety)

NAME	<b>LOCATION</b>	<b>CONTRACT SUM</b>
	· <u></u> _	
he Bidder has now under	contract and bonded the following p	rojects:
NAME		
IVANILE	<u>LOCATION</u>	CONTRACT SUM
ist Key Bidder Personnel	who will work on this Project.	
		NO. OF YEARS
<u>NAME</u>	POSITION DESCRIPTION	WITH BIDDER

DBE I articipation on current bonded projects under contract:						
SUBCONTRACTOR (LIST)	RS PROJECT (SPECIFIC TYPE)	<u>DBE</u>	% of WORK			
	<u> </u>					
<del></del>	<del></del>					
·	<del></del>					
-						
<del>-</del>	<u> </u>					

11.

#### (USE ADDITIONAL SHEETS IF NECESSARY)

12. We acknowledge that, if we are the apparent low Bidder, we may be required to submit to the OWNER within 7 calendar days following the Bid Opening, a sworn statement regarding all current work on hand and under contract, and a statement on the OWNER'S form of the experience of our officers, office management and field management personnel. Additionally, if requested by the OWNER, we will within 7 days following the request submit audited financial statements and loss history for insurance claims for the 3 most recent years (or a lesser period stipulated by the OWNER).

# PROJECT: Construction Unit Price Contract for Parks & RecrLFUCG Bid No. 12-2016 BIDDER: Enter Bidder's Name Here

#	Item	Unit	Spec Sec.	Unit Price
1	Bituminous pavement for athletic courts Base	TN		\$85.00
2	Bituminous pavement for athletic courts Surface	TN		\$ 100.00
3	Bituminous pavement reinforced with aramid fibers for ath	TN	***********	\$ 95.00
4	Bituminous pavement reinforced with aramid fibers for ath	TN		\$ 110,00
5	Bituminous pavement milling athletic courts	TN		\$50,00
6	Dense grade aggregate placed Base	TN		\$ 22.00
7	Bituminous pavement Crack repair	LF		\$ 2,00
8	Bituminous pavement Crack filler	LF		£ ,50
9	Court color coating	SY		\$ 1Z,00
10	Court striping	LF		41.25
11	Athletic court fencing coated 8'	LF		NO Bid
12	Athletic court fencing coated 10'	LF		NO Bd
13	Athletic court fencing coated 12'	LF	••••	No Bid
14	Athletic court fencing galvanized 8'	LF :		No Bid
15	Athletic court fencing galvanized 10'	LF	1	No 8id
16	Athletic court fencing galvanized 12'	LF	1	No Bid
17	Asphalt sealing	SY		\$ 1.25
18	Parking lot striping	LF		4.50
19	Concrete sidewalk	SY		\$ 45.00
20	Finished concrete	CY	, ,	\$ 300,00
21	Excavation	CY		\$ 12,00.
22	Embankment	CY	1	\$ 14.00
23	Finish grading	CY	, ,	\$ 15,00
24	Laser grading	CY		\$ 18,00
25	Environmental fencing	LF		\$ H.25
26	Seeding and protection	SY		\$3,00
27	Topsoil	CY		\$ 15,00

,	
Payment and Performance Bond Cost for Projects over \$50,000 (See Specia	
Conditions, Section 6) - Enter % of Total Project Cost	3/0

# PROJECT: Construction Unit Price Contract for Parks & Recr LFUCG Bid No. 12-2016 BIDDER: Enter Bidder's Name Here

#	Item	Unit	Spec Sec.	Unit Price
Unspecified Incidental Materials at Cost Plus 15% - Check if Interested			<b></b>	
Unspecified Incidental Labor at Direct Wages Plus Certified Overhead Plus 15% - Check if Interested				₽∕
Mini - <b>En</b>	mum Total Project for Consideration (See Special Condition ter dollar amount	\$ 7,500.00		