
Bid 8-2024

McCord Emergency Lighting

William McCord

Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 8-2024
Title: Emergency Lighting and Equipment
Type: Competitive Bid
Issue Date: 1/11/2024
Deadline: 1/25/2024 02:00 PM (ET)
Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS

SOLICITATION. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE LINE
ITEMS TAB ONLY. PRICING WITHIN SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE
ACCEPTED AND MAY MAKE YOUR BID NON-RESPONSIVE.
 
Once you have completed and uploaded your bid package, you will
need to click "yes" on the attributes tab.

Contact Information

Contact: Jessica Allinder
Address: Procurement

Government Center Building
200 East Main Street
Lexington 40507

Email: jallinder@lexingtonky.gov
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McCord Emergency Lighting Information

Contact: William MCCORD III
Address: 27 Hawkview Trl

Lancaster, KY 40444
Phone: (859) 229-5293
Fax: (859) 273-1511
Email: firemedic7@aol.com
Web Address: www.mccordemergency.com

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED! By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent
and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached
bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

William Michael McCord III firemedic7@aol.com
Signature Email

Submitted at 1/25/2024 11:33:18 AM (ET)

Response Attachments

Signed Notorized McCord Bid 802024 Emergency Lighting & Equipment 1-25-24.pdf

Signed Bid McCord Lighting

McCORD EMERGENCY EXCEPTIONS LIST BID #8-2024 Emergency Lighting & Equipment.docx

Exception clarification lisy McCord

Bid Attributes

1 Bid package

Have you completed and attached your bid package?  This is a contractual agreement and required for all bids.

 YES 

Bid Lines

1 PAR28D* 3.5" EXTEND LED DRIVE/WARNING ADVISE LED COLOR

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

2 PAR32HD1 ADAPTER KIT FOR PAR28D*

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

3 RBKTHD9 H-D REAR CRASH BAR MT FOR LINZ

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

4 SA350MH SA-350MH SIREN SPEAKER

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

5 SA350MB1 SA350M MOUNTING KIT

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid
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6 MCRNSC* SURFACE MT MICRON CHROME ADVISE LED COLOR

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

7 LINZ6* LINZ6 LED HORIZ SYNC ADVISE LED COLOR

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

8 RBKTHD7 LINZ6 90 DEG UNDER TURN SIGNAL MT

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

9 M4B6R MOTORCYCLE BOX 6-M4 RIGHT OPEN

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

1
0

M1BATT MOTORCYCLE GEL BATTERY

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

1
1

MBADPT14 MB4/6 ADAPTER PLATE 14 HARLEY

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

1
2

M4B6CHRG M4B6 BATTERY CHARGER RIGHT

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

1
3

M4BSEP M4B OPTIONAL SEPARATION PLATE

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

1
4

M08T "T" ION WINDSHIELD ARRAY BRBRB. Electra Glide

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

1
5

WPA112 Replacement siren amplifier for WS-321

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

1
6

WPA112B WPA112 siren amplifier bracket

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

1
7

IONBKT7 Tahoe Grill Mount for (4) ION series Lights

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

1
8

IONBKT9 Tahoe Grill Mount for Ion series lights

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

1
9

CEM8 8 Output expansion module

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

2
0

WIONB Blue Wide angle ION series LED light

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

2
1

WIONR Red Wide angle ION series LED light

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid
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2
2

TLIR Red "T" ION series LED light

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

2
3

CEM16 16 Output expansion module

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

2
4

TLIB Blue "T" ION series LED light

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

2
5

TLMIC White Mini "T" ION series LED light

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

2
6

TIONMFC Chrome flange for TLMIC light

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

2
7

SSFPOSI6 Headlight/Taillight flasher for Tahoe

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

2
8

IONPEDB Black pedestal housing for ION series LED light

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

2
9

TIONBKT7 Tahoe Running board bracket

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

3
0

LEXTAHMARK, as per specifications

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

3
1

LEXTAHUNMARK, as per specifications

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

3
2

IONGROM Whelen Grommet Mount

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

3
3

WIONC Whelen ION Series Universal Mount Super-LED Lightheads Clear

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

3
4

WIONJ Whelen ION Series Universal Mount Super-LED Lightheads Red/Blue

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

3
5

LINZ6* Whelen LINZ6 Series Linear Super-LED Lightheads advise LED color

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

3
6

IW34UFX / IW38UFX Whelen Inner Edge XLP WeCan DUO+ for Interceptor Utility/Sedan

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

3
7

CANWCT3 Whelen Cantrol Siren System w/CC5K* cable & CANCTL2 Push Button Control Head

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid
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3
8

GB2SP3J Whelen Legacy Lightbar 54" Lexington Spec with mount brackets

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

3
9

GB8SP3J Whelen Legacy Lightbar 48" Lexington Spec with mount brackets

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

4
0

VTX609* Whelen Vertex Hide Away LED advise LED color

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

4
1

SA315P SAK58 Whelen SA315P Siren Speaker w/SAK58 Bracket

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

4
2

SA315P SAK51 Whelen SA315P Siren speaker w/ SAK51 Bracket

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

4
3

SA315P SAK70 Whelen SA315P Siren speaker w/ SAK70 Bracket

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

4
4

SA315P SAK63D Whelen SA315P Speaker w/SAK63 Bracket (Chevy Tahoe)

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

4
5

HHS-4200 Whelen Hand Held Siren System

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

4
6

ISFW*Z w/ 6--ISSD & 6--ISDE Whelen Front Inner Edge DUO. Advise vehicle make, model, & year

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

4
7

ITRAYW8 w/ 4--ISDK & 4--ISDM Whelen Rear Inner Edge DUO. Advise vehicle make, model, & year

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

4
8

MCRNT* Whelen Micron Lighthead Surface/Stud Mount Black/Chrome Solid/Split Color Red/Blue/Clear.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

4
9

M4J M4 LED FLASHER BLUE/RED

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

5
0

M4FC M4 SERIES FLANGE CHROME

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

5
1

MCRNSCJ SURFACE MT MICRON R/B CHROME

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

5
2

PELCC PERIMETER ENHANCEMENT LT CHRM

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

5
3

SPT5D BUMPER MT SPEAKER DRVR TRANSIT

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid

Vendor: McCord Emergency Lighting Bid 8-2024Page 5 of 7 pages



5
4

Percentage off all other Whelen catalog items
(Line excluded from response total)

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off No Bid

5
5

C-VSW-1005-TAH-PM Filler Plates to be included with console.
 
Tahoe Console
C-EB35-T91S-1P Tait self contained radio bracket
C-EB40-CCS-1P Whelen Core control head bracket
C-FP-15 1.5" filler panel

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $625.00 Total: $625.00

Supplier Notes: Price will include 1 ea C-EB35-T91S-1P, 1 ea C-EB40-CCS-1P, and 1 ea C-FP-15 with each
console.

5
6

C-CUP-2-I Internal Cupholder

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $43.00 Total: $43.00

Supplier Notes: Havis has discontinued the C-CUP2-I------we are bidding the C-CUP2-1001 in place of this line
item​

5
7

CUP2-1001 Internal Cupholder

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $43.00 Total: $43.00

5
8

C-HDM-204 Side Mounted Pole

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $144.00 Total: $144.00

5
9

C-MD-112 Tilt Swivel Device

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $229.00 Total: $229.00

6
0

C-ARM-105 Arm Rest

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $156.00 Total: $156.00

Supplier Notes: Havis has discontinued the C-ARM-105 and it has been replaced by the C-ARM-108

6
1

K9-C26 Standard White K-9 transport system

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $3,105.00 Total: $3,105.00

6
2

K9-A-201 K9 Hot-N-Pop electronic system

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $1,962.00 Total: $1,962.00

6
3

K9-A-306 K9 transport Engine Stall Sensor

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $178.00 Total: $178.00

6
4

K9-A-102 K9 Air Circulation Fan

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $137.00 Total: $137.00

6
5

DS-PAN-432-2 Docking Station with Dual Pass-Through Antennas connections and power supply for Panasonic
Tough Book 54 and 55

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $910.00 Total: $910.00
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6
6

Percentage off all other Havis catalog items
(Line excluded from response total)

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 37.5%

Supplier Notes: The discount for LFUCG on this bid is MSRP less 37.5% ---shipping is not included on any item---
SEE exception list submitted

Response Total: $7,532.00
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McCORD EMERGENCY LIGHTING 
Sales & Service of Police, Fire, & EMS Equipment 

859-229-5293 
 

 
INVITATION TO BID #8-2024 Emergency Lighting & Equipment 

 
Bid Opening Date: January 25, 2024 Bid Opening Time: 2:00 PM 

 
Type of Bid: Price Contract 

 
Sealed bids will ONLY be received online at https://lexingtonky.ionwave.net/ until 2:00 PM, prevailing local time on 

1/25/2024. Bids must be submitted/uploaded by the above-mentioned date and time. 
 

 
 

REFERENCE TO SHIPPING COST 
 

Bid stated as listed here; 
 
Bids are to include all shipping, handling and associated fees to the point of delivery (unless otherwise specified in 
the bid documents below) located at: Lexington, KY (SHIPPING WILL NOT BE INCLUDED –MUST BE LINE 
ITEM) 
 
Check One                  __XXX____Bid Specifications Met 

                           
__XXX___ Exceptions to Bid Specifications. Exceptions shall be itemized and attached to bid proposal 

submitted. 
 
 

 
As per phone conversation with J. Allinder, (LFUCG Purchasing), in regards to the 
line item for this bid, Shipping costs was left off of this Bid. She advised that we 
list an exception to the Bid, as marked above, and advise that all items purchased 
from this will have an estimated shipping cost quoted at time of PO issued. This is 
due to the massive differences in the line items of the bid and their differences in 
shipping cost based on quantity, weight, and type of shipping (road truck, UPS, 
FEDEX). 
 
As far as the items that we bid on, they all MEET SPECIFICATION as to part 
numbers and manufacturers. 
 



Page 2 Bid 8-2024 
 
 
The following part numbers listed in the Bid are DISCONTINUED ITEMS : 
 
Havis part # C-CUP2-I      is replaced by C-CUP2-1001 
Havis part # C-ARM-105  is replaced by C-ARM-108 
 
 
Mike Mccord 
McCord Emergency Lighting 
859-229-5293 
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