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PROJECT: Upper Cane Run WWS
JUSTIFICATION FOR CHANGE CONTRACT NO. 243-2020
CHANGE ORDER: 3 (Final)

Necessity for change: Adjustment in contract amount due to final adjustment of
installed quantities.

Is proposed change an alternate bid? ___Yes _X No
Will proposed change alter the physical size of the project? ___Yes X _No

If "Yes", explain.

Effect of this change on other prime contractors: N/A

Has consent of surety been obtained? ___ Yes _X__ Not Necessary

Will this change affect expiration or extent of insurance coverage? Yes X No
If "Yes", will the policies be extended? _ Yes ___ No

Effect on operation and maintenance costs: N/A

Mayor Date , /




Baker, Rhonda

From: Zehnder, Kurt

Sent: Monday, October 31, 2022 4:14 PM

To: John Whalen Ii

Cc: Robert Peterson; John Martin (jmartin@grwinc.com), Nathan Robinson
Subject: RE: UCR WWS - spoils at WH WWTP

John W.,

DWQ will accept the offered credit of $2,265.00 to the UCR WWS project. Please use the spoils for backfilling the tank
on WH WWTP WWS Phase 2.

Thanks,

Kurt A. Zehnder, PE

Associate | Hazen and Sawyer
230 Lexington Green Circle, Suite 520, Lexington, KY 40503
859 219-1126 (main) | 859 286-1265 (direct) | 859 317-1424 (cell)

kzehnder@hazenandsawyer.com | hazenandsawyer.com

From: John Whalen Il <jwhalenii@judycc.com>

Sent: Friday, October 28, 2022 8:42 AM

To: Zehnder, Kurt <KZehnder@hazenandsawyer.com>

Cc: Robert Peterson <rpeterson@lexingtonky.gov>; John Martin (jmartin@grwinc.com) <jmartin@grwinc.com>; Nathan
Robinson <nrobinson@judycc.com>

Subject: RE: UCR WWS - spoils at WH WWTP

Hey Kurt,

Good morning... | knew you needed to run to another meeting yesterday, so | didn’t bring it up at the end of our
meeting. We can move it anytime, but | wanted to see if you’d rather just leave it there. After speaking with Nathan, he
said what we hauled to WH was mostly good dirt and would be useful when we start backfilling and grading the

site. I've attached a recent invoice for trucking, this would be about what it would cost to haul off the material. Would
you rather leave it and take a credit or haul it out of there? | know we have the WH meeting Tuesday so we can discuss
it then as well if needed, just let me know. We could credit either project, but I’d probably rather just take care of it
with UCR since we are almost complete.

Thank you,

John Whalen

Judy Construction Company
859.234.6900
859.588.3680 mobile

From: Zehnder, Kurt <KZehnder@hazenandsawyer.com>

Sent: Friday, October 28, 2022 8:16 AM

To: John Whalen Il <jwhalenii@judycc.com>

Cc: Robert Peterson <rpeterson@lexingtonky.gov>; John Martin (imartin@grwinc.com) <jmartin@grwinc.com>; Nathan
Robinson <nrobinson@judycc.com>

Subject: RE: UCR WWS - spoils at WH WWTP




Crase Group LLC.

Excavation Services Invoice
608 Mount Tabor Road i ol —
Lexington, Ky. 40517-4229 i DATE | __INVOICE®
(859) 983-7508  toe2 | 1596 .
o Bt
Judy Construction Company I
P.O. Box 457

Cynthiana, Ky. 41031

| DUEDATE !
122 |
, ITEM [ DESCRIPTION | Qv | RATE | AMOUNT i
o —— i  Bacm ey— S N — — — — L g — | SO ———tin e
' |
' Tri- Axel Dump | 9-13 CL-23 8 hours haul 6 loads to our dump and haul 4 8 125.00 | 1,000.00
* Truck loads on site f := !
| Tri- Axel Dump I 9-13 CL-14 7 hours haul 7 loads to our dump 7 125.00 | 875.00
' Truck : . ;
Supplies dump fee 13 loads 5 13| 30.00 | 390.00
|
|
| E
i _
| | E
! J i 4 |
i i
i
] ! |
l' i
Subtotal 2,265.00
0.06% Tax

: Total 2.265.00 |



