

# Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government (Purchasing) Supplier Response

Bid Information		Contact Information		Ship to Information
Bid Creator	Jessica Allinder Buyer	Address	200 East Main Street	Address
Email	jallinder@lexingtonky.gov		Lexington, KY 40507	
Phone	(859) 2583320 x	Contact	Jessica Allinder	Contact
Fax	(859) 2583322 x			
Bid Number	Bid 53-2018 Addendum 2	Department		Department
Title	Janitorial Chemical & Supplies	Building		Building
Bid Type	Bid	Floor/Room		Floor/Room
Issue Date	4/11/2018 10:00 AM (ET)	Telephone		Telephone
Close Date	4/26/2018 02:00:00 PM (ET)	Fax		Fax
		Email	jallinder@lexingtonky.gov	Email

## Supplier Information

Company Kenway Distributors  
 Address PO Box 9347  
 Louisville, KY 40209  
 Contact Ashley Mitchell  
 Department  
 Building  
 Floor/Room  
 Telephone (502) 367-2201  
 Fax  
 Email amitchell@kenway.net  
 Submitted 4/24/2018 03:10:06 PM (ET)  
 Total \$1,986.52

By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

Signature Ashley C. Mitchell

Email AMitchell@kenway.net

## Supplier Notes

## Bid Notes

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS SOLICITATION.

## Bid Activities

## Bid Messages

---

**Bid Attributes**

Please review the following and respond where necessary

---

## Line Items

#	Qty	UOM	Description	Response
1	1	EA	Floor wax, 5 gallon pails, "One Wax" or equal	\$87.34
			Item Notes: Green Certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Legacy Eco-Logo Metal-Free Finish 5 Gal	
2	1	EA	Floor wax, 4-1 gallon, "One Wax" or equal	\$69.89
			Item Notes: Green Certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Legacy Eco-Logo Metal-Free Finish 4 x 1 Gal	
3	1	EA	Floor Stripper, 5 pail "Bare Bones" or equal	\$62.81
			Item Notes: Green Certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Take Down Eco-Logo Low Odor Stripper 5 Gal	
4	1	EA	Floor Stripper, 4-1 gallon, "Bare Bones" or equal	\$53.77
			Item Notes: Green Certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Take Down Eco-Logo Low Odor Stripper 4 x 1 Gal	
5	1	EA	Snapback, Johnson, 4-1 gallon jugs or equal	\$75.76
			Item Notes: Green Certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Recharge Gloss Restorer Eco-Logo 4 x 1 Gal	
6	1	EA	Stride Neutral Cleaner, Johnson, 4-1 gallon jugs or equal	\$40.79
			Item Notes: Green Certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Savannah Eco-Logo Neutral Floor Cleaner 4 x 1 Gal	
7	1	EA	Spray Buff, 1 gallon jugs, 4/cs	No Bid
			Item Notes: Green Certified	
			Supplier Notes:	
8	1	EA	Furniture Polish, Lemon oil, 17 oz. can, 12/cs	No Bid
			Item Notes: Green Certified	
			Supplier Notes:	

9	1	EA	Glass Cleaner, quart, Ready to Use, "Windex" or equal	\$2.76
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes: SSS Sunray Eco-Logo Glass Cleaner CS 12 Qt Priced per QT				
10	1	EA	Liquid cleanser, "Comet" or equal, 32 oz. Bottles, 9/cs	\$2.97
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes: SSS Green Wave Eco-Logo HD Restroom Cleaner CS 12 QT Priced per QT				
11	1	EA	Pine scented cleaner/degreaser, gallon, ready-to-use	\$11.89
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes: SSS Maverick Eco-Logo Super Duty Degreaser CS 4 x 1 gal Jugs Priced per GAL				
12	1	EA	6/1 gallon/cs, "Chlorox" or equal	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
13	1	EA	Disinfectant liquid, (H.I.V. & virus), quart, "Acid Free", "Clorox" or equal gallon	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
14	1	EA	Hydrogen Peroxide Multi Purpose Cleaner, 1/2 gallon jug, per case 442125	\$30.18
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes: Envirox 117 H2Organge2 Peroxide Cleaner Priced per GAL				
15	1	EA	Stainless steel cleaner, 1/2 gallon jugs, per case	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
16	1	EA	EPA Hospital Grade, Neutral PH, Disinfectant Cleaner	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				

17	1	EA	Liquid hand soap, "Dial" or equal, gallon, 4/cs	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
18	1	EA	Pink lotion hand soap, "Kimberly-Clark sanifresh", or equal, 4.gal/cs	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
19	1	EA	"E-Z Paks" or equal All Purpose Cleaner Water Soluble 0.5 oz Packets, 180/cs	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
20	1	EA	Purell Instant Hand Sanitizer, 4 oz. portable bottle, #559275 or equal	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
21	1	EA	DC Pine Cleaner, gallon jugs, ready to use	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
22	1	EA	Air Freshener	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
23	1	EA	Dishwasher Detergent, Powdered, 10 lb bucket	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
24	1	EA	Dishwasher Detergent, Dawn, 8-38 oz bottles	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				

25	1	EA	Foaming Disinfectant Cleaner, "Herricane" or equal 19.5 oz can	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
26	1	EA	Sanitizing Wipes, Lysol or equal, per pack	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
27	1	EA	Laundry Detergent, Powder, with scoop/ 50 lb box (no staples in box)	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
28	1	EA	Pin-Sol Lemon Fresh Cleaner/3-144 oz. bottles	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
29	1	EA	Can Liners - 43 x 48 black, roll, 22 micron, 150/cs, part # 563057 or equivalent	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
30	1	EA	Can Liners - Large, 43 x 48 clear, roll, minimum 14 micron, 200/cs	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
31	1	EA	Can Liners - Medium, 30 x 37, clear, 25 per roll, minimum 10 micron, 500/cs	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
32	1	EA	Can Liners - 38 x 58 barrel type, black, minimum 1.0 mil, 60 gal 100/cs, Biodegradable	\$19.75
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes: CS 100 SSS 38x58 Black Terra Renew Liners 60 Gal SSS EarthCare - Meets or exceeds EPA Guidelines for Post-Consumer Waste Content				

33	1	EA	Can Liners - 33 x 39, 33 gal, .70 mil, 200/cs, Biodegradable	\$24.20
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes: CS 250 SSS 33x40 Magnum Blue Super Hexene Liners 33 Gal SSS EarthCare - Meets or exceeds EPA Guidelines for Post-Consumer Waste Content				
34	1	EA	Can Liners - Steel Sak, 43 x 48, minimum 2 mil, grey, 50/cs	\$35.96
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes: CS 100 SSS 43x48 Black Terra Renew Liners 56 Gal SSS EarthCare - Meets or exceeds EPA Guidelines for Post-Consumer Waste Content				
35	1	EA	Mophead, 32 oz. nylon looped; 124 Nylon	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
36	1	EA	Mophead, 24 oz. cotton layflat screwtip	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
37	1	EA	Mophead, 5" med tuf/blend "blue" washable mop heads 12/cs	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
38	1	EA	Mophead frame only, 48 x 5	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
39	1	EA	Swivel snap dustmop handle	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
40	1	EA	Angle broom, 13",no metal, wire or nylon rope, "Zepher #34068" or equal	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				

41	1	EA	Push broom, 24" stiff garage bristle, "Palmyra" or equal	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
42	1	EA	Metal tip push broom screw-in handle	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
43	1	EA	Sprayers & bottles, 32 oz. complete (bottles must be clear)	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
44	1	EA	20" buffer pads, standard, black, 5/cs	\$15.17
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes: CS 5 SSS 20" Black Pads SSS EarthCare - Full Cycle™ Technology - Pads made from 100% recycled PET plastic				
45	1	EA	20" buffer pads, standard, white, 5/cs	\$15.17
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes: CS 5 SSS 20" White Pads SSS EarthCare - Full Cycle™ Technology - Pads made from 100% recycled PET plastic				
46	1	EA	20" buffer pads, standard, red, 5/cs	\$15.17
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes: CS 5 SSS 20" Red Pads SSS EarthCare - Full Cycle™ Technology - Pads made from 100% recycled PET plastic				
47	1	EA	13" black stripper pad, standard, 5/cs	\$7.97
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes: CS 5 SSS 13" Black Pads SSS EarthCare - Full Cycle™ Technology - Pads made from 100% recycled PET plastic				
48	1	EA	13" red stripper pad, standard, 5/cs	\$7.97
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes: CS 5 SSS 13" Red Pads SSS EarthCare - Full Cycle™ Technology - Pads made from 100% recycled PET plastic				



49	1	EA	13" white stripper pad, standard, 5/cs	\$7.97
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes: CS 5 SSS 13" White Pads SSS EarthCare - Full Cycle™ Technology - Pads made from 100% recycled PET plastic				
50	1	EA	Maxi-pads, Vend Pack #4-147	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
51	1	EA	Urinal screens w/block, scented, 12/ctn	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
52	1	EA	Urinal Blocks, Deoderant, per doz.	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
53	1	EA	Toilet bowl 14" mops	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
54	1	EA	44 gallon Brute garbage containers w/lids, "Rubbermaid" or equal	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
55	1	EA	Lids for 44 gal. Brute garbage containers, "Rubbermaid" or equal	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
56	1	EA	Dust pan, 12" without handle, "Rubbermaid #2005" or equal	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				

57	1	EA	Scrubbing Sponge, Light, White/Yellow, 20/cs (needs to be individually wrapped)	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
58	1	EA	Scrubbing Sponge, Medium, Green/Yellow, 20/cs	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
59	1	EA	Dust Mop Covers, 5" x 36"	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
60	1	EA	Dust Mop Frames, 5" x 36"	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
61	1	EA	60"Dust Mop Handle/ Clamp on	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
62	1	EA	Soap,3/4 oz bars	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
63	1	EA	10" Shower/Floor Scrub Brush, Rubbermaid or equivalent	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
64	1	EA	6" Iron Handle Scrub Brush, Rubbermaid or equivalent	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				

65	1	EA	Toilet seat covers, half fold, 250 per pk., 20 sleeves of 250 covers ea, "Reliable" or equal (No staples in sleeves)	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
66	1	EA	Rubbermaid Heavy-Duty Dust Pan (Must be all plastic)	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
67	1	EA	Rubbermaid 15" White Roundhead Toilet Bowl Brush (all Plastic)	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
68	1	EA	Blue Rubbermaid Floor Scrub Brush (Must be all plastic)	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
69	1	EA	Rubbermaid 6" Round Handle Scrub Brush (Must be all plastic)	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
70	1	EA	Regency Drain Maintainer	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
71	1	EA	Paper towels, 2-ply roll, kitchen type, "Bounty" or equal, 30 rls/cs	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
72	1	EA	Toilet Tissue, Single 2 ply, 550 sheet	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				

73	1	EA	Toilet Tissue, 2 ply, 1000 ft. Jumbo Junior rolls	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
74	1	EA	Multi fold paper towels, Brown, 9.5x9.125, 16 sleeves/ case	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
75	1	EA	Paper towels, Natural multi-fold, 20 sleeves/ case	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
76	1	EA	Paper towels, single ply roll, kitchen type, 30 rls/cs	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
77	1	EA	Facial tissue, 30/100/cs	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
78	1	EA	Plastic forks, heavy wt., 1M/cs	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
79	1	EA	Plastic knives, heavy wt., 1 M/cs	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
80	1	EA	18" x 2000' roll film	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				

81	1	EA	Foam bowls, white, 12 oz., 1M/cs	No Bid
			Item Notes: Green Certified	
			Supplier Notes:	
82	1	EA	Plates, 9", 3 comp, 500/cs	No Bid
			Item Notes: Green Certified	
			Supplier Notes:	
83	1	EA	Gloves, disposal, food service grade, latex, powder free, Small, 100/bx, per case	No Bid
			Item Notes: Green Certified	
			Supplier Notes:	
84	1	EA	Gloves, disposal, food service grade, latex, powder free, med, 100/bx, per case	No Bid
			Item Notes: Green Certified	
			Supplier Notes:	
85	1	EA	Gloves, disposal, food service grade, latex, powder free, large, 100/bx, per case	No Bid
			Item Notes: Green Certified	
			Supplier Notes:	
86	1	EA	Gloves, Nitrile, S-XL, 100 bx	No Bid
			Item Notes: Green Certified	
			Supplier Notes:	
87	1	EA	Aluminum foil, 18" x 500'rl	No Bid
			Item Notes: Green Certified	
			Supplier Notes:	
88	1	EA	Baking sheets (pan liners, full) 1M/cs	No Bid
			Item Notes: Green Certified	
			Supplier Notes:	

89	1	EA	Paper bags,brown, 6# weight,500/pack	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
90	1	EA	Paper bags,brown, 76# weight, 400/bundle,	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
91	1	EA	Paper bags,brown, 25# weight, 500/pack	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
92	1	EA	32 oz. Clear Bottles w/sprayer	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
93	1	EA	Trigger Sprayer for 32 oz. Bottles	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
94	1	EA	15" Windshield Washers	No Bid
Item Notes: Green Certified				
Supplier Notes:				
95	1	EA	Floor wax, 5 gallon pails, "One Wax" or equal	\$58.97
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: SSS Turn 4 5 gal Pail				
96	1	EA	Floor wax, 4-1 gallon, "One Wax" or equal	\$55.43
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: SSS Alpha 17 4 x 1 gal Jugs				

97	1	EA	Floor Stripper, 5 pail "Bare Bones" or equal	\$37.06
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Pit Stop 2 x 2.5 gal Jugs	
98	1	EA	Floor Stripper, 4-1 gallon, "Bare Bones" or equal	\$59.09
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Lazer Edge 4 x 1 gal Jugs	
99	1	EA	Snapback, Johnson, 4-1 gallon jugs or equal	\$42.51
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Meteor 4 x 1 gal Jugs	
100	1	EA	Stride Neutral Cleaner, Johnson, 4-1 gallon jugs or equal	\$20.00
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Steadfast AP Neutral Cleaner 4 x 1 gal Jugs	
101	1	EA	Spray Buff, 1 gallon jugs, 4/cs	\$46.36
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Turnaround Spray Buff 12 x QT	
102	1	EA	Furniture Polish, Lemon oil, 17 oz. can, 12/cs	\$3.51
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Lemon Oil Furniture Polish 12 x 19 oz Priced per Can	
103	1	EA	Glass Cleaner, quart, Ready to Use, "Windex" or equal	\$1.97
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Blue Glass Cleaner CS/12 QT Priced Per QT	
104	1	EA	Liquid cleanser, "Comet" or equal, 32 oz. Bottles, 9/cs	\$2.97
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Green Wave Eco-Logo HD Restroom Cleaner CS 12 QT Priced per QT	

105	1	EA	Pine scented cleaner/degreaser, gallon, ready-to-use	\$9.13
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS DC Pine 4 x 1 gal Jugs Priced per GAL	
106	1	EA	6/1 gallon/cs, "Chlorox" or equal	\$2.33
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: Kik Pure Brite Germicidal Bleach CS 6 GL Priced per GL	
107	1	EA	Disinfectant liquid, (H.I.V. & virus), quart, "Acid Free", "Clorox" or equal gallon	\$8.46
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS DC Gold 4 x 1 gal Jugs Priced per GL	
108	1	EA	Hydrogen Peroxide Multi Purpose Cleaner, 1/2 gallon jug, per case 442125	\$16.99
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Hyper Speed 4 x 1 gal Jugs Priced per GL	
109	1	EA	Stainless steel cleaner, 1/2 gallon jugs, per case	\$5.68
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Extra Point Stainless Steel Cleaner CS 12 QT Priced per QT	
110	1	EA	EPA Hospital Grade, Neutral PH, Disinfectant Cleaner	\$10.02
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Ace 256 4 x 1 gal Jugs Priced per GL	
111	1	EA	Liquid hand soap, "Dial" or equal, gallon, 4/cs	\$6.00
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Steadfast Pink Hand Cleaner Priced Per GL	



112	1	EA	Pink lotion hand soap, "Kimberly-Clark sanifresh", or equal, 4.gal/cs	\$6.00
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Steadfast Pink Hand Cleaner Priced Per GL	
113	1	EA	"E-Z Paks" or equal All Purpose Cleaner Water Soluble 0.5 oz Packets, 180/cs	\$48.89
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: Easy Paks General Purpose Cleaner	
114	1	EA	Purell Instant Hand Sanitizer, 4 oz. portable bottle, #559275 or equal	\$1.55
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: Kutol 4 oz. Hand Sanitizer CS 24 Priced EA	
115	1	EA	DC Pine Cleaner, gallon jugs, ready to use	\$9.13
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS DC Pine 4 x 1 gal Jugs Priced per GL	
116	1	EA	Air Freshener	\$3.61
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Lavendar Fields Air Freshener CS 12 10 oz. Priced EA	
117	1	EA	Dishwasher Detergent, Powdered, 10 lb bucket	No Bid
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes:	
118	1	EA	Dishwasher Detergent, Dawn, 8-38 oz bottles	\$10.52
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: US Chemical QuickLine Inception CS 6 32 oz. Priced EA 32 oz	
119	1	EA	Foaming Disinfectant Cleaner, "Herricane" or equal 19.5 oz can	\$36.46
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Foaming Disinfectant Cleaner CS 12 19 oz	

120	1	EA	Sanitizing Wipes, Lysol or equal, per pack	\$31.49
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: Clorox Fresh Scent Wipes CS 6 75 Ct				
121	1	EA	Laundry Detergent, Powder, with scoop/ 50 lb box (no staples in box)	\$57.30
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: US Chemical Powdered Laundry Detergent 50 lb				
122	1	EA	Pin-Sol Lemon Fresh Cleaner/3-144 oz. bottles	\$30.24
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: Lemon Pine-Sol All Purpose CS 3 144 oz				
123	1	EA	Can Liners - 43 x 48 black, roll, 22 micron, 150/cs, part # 563057 or equivalent	\$20.33
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: CS 150 SSS 42x47 Black HD Liners 56 Gal				
124	1	EA	Can Liners - Large, 43 x 48 clear, roll, minimum 14 micron, 200/cs	\$17.21
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: CS 200 SSS 42x47 Clear HD Liners 56 Gal				
125	1	EA	Can Liners - Medium, 30 x 37, clear, 25 per roll, minimum 10 micron, 500/cs	\$15.45
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: CS 500 SSS 30x36 Clear HD Liners 20-30 Gal				
126	1	EA	Can Liners - 38 x 58 barrel type, black, minimum 1.0 mil, 60 gal 100/cs, Biodegradable	\$16.63
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: CS 100 SSS 38x57 Black LD Liners 60 Gal				
127	1	EA	Can Liners - 33 x 39, 33 gal, .70 mil, 200/cs, Biodegradable	\$12.13
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: CS 100 SSS 33x39 Black LD Liners 33 Gal				

128	1	EA	Can Liners - Steel Sak, 43 x 48, minimum 2 mil, grey, 50/cs	\$28.75
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: CS 100 SSS 43x47 Black LD Liners 56 Gal	
129	1	EA	Mophead, 32 oz. nylon looped; 124 Nylon	\$8.53
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Large Looped End Finish Mop EA	
130	1	EA	Mophead, 24 oz. cotton layflat screwtip	\$4.09
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS 24 oz Cotton Sta-Flat Wet Mop EA	
131	1	EA	Mophead, 5" med tuf/blend "blue" washable mop heads 12/cs	\$9.30
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Medium Super Sorb Blue Wet Mop 5" EA	
132	1	EA	Mophead frame only, 48 x 5	\$4.53
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS 5" x 48" Quick Change Dust Mop Frame EA	
133	1	EA	Swivel snap dustmop handle	\$7.24
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS 60" Quick Change Dust Mop Handle EA	
134	1	EA	Angle broom, 13",no metal, wire or nylon rope, "Zepher #34068" or equal	\$4.10
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: Golden Star Flagged Angle Broom EA	
135	1	EA	Push broom, 24" stiff garage bristle, "Palmyra" or equal	\$18.01
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: MD 24" Speed Sweep Push Broom Rough Surface	

136	1	EA	Metal tip push broom screw-in handle	\$10.23
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes:	
137	1	EA	Sprayers & bottles, 32 oz. complete (bottles must be clear)	\$1.60
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Plastic 32 oz Bottle and Trigger Sprayer EA	
138	1	EA	20" buffer pads, standard, black, 5/cs	\$15.39
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS 20" Black Pads CS 5	
139	1	EA	20" buffer pads, standard, white, 5/cs	\$15.39
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS 20" White Pads CS 5	
140	1	EA	20" buffer pads, standard, red, 5/cs	\$15.39
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS 20" Red Pads CS 5	
141	1	EA	13" black stripper pad, standard, 5/cs	\$8.09
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS 13" Black Pads CS 5	
142	1	EA	13" red stripper pad, standard, 5/cs	\$8.09
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS 13" Red Pads CS 5	
143	1	EA	13" white stripper pad, standard, 5/cs	\$8.09
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS 13" White Pads CS 5	

144	1	EA	Maxi-pads, Vend Pack #4-147	\$61.37
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: RMC Maxi Ultra Thin Pads #8 CS 250	
145	1	EA	Urinal screens w/block, scented, 12/ctn	\$15.97
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Urinal Screen with 4 oz Block CS 12	
146	1	EA	Urinal Blocks, Deoderant, per doz.	\$9.17
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS 4 oz Urinal Block Cherry CS 12	
147	1	EA	Toilet bowl 14" mops	\$0.73
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS Acrylic Bowl Mop White Handle EA	
148	1	EA	44 gallon Brute garbage containers w/lids, "Rubbermaid" or equal	\$31.09
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: RM 44 Gal Brute 2643 Gray EA	
149	1	EA	Lids for 44 gal. Brute garbage containers, "Rubbermaid" or equal	\$10.67
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: RM Brute Lid 264560 Gray EA	
150	1	EA	Dust pan, 12" without handle, "Rubbermaid #2005" or equal	\$3.53
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS 700 Dust Pan EA	
151	1	EA	Scrubbing Sponge, Light, White/Yellow, 20/cs (needs to be individually wrapped)	\$44.39
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: 3M #63 Light Duty Sponge CS 20	

152	1	EA	Scrubbing Sponge, Medium, Green/Yellow, 20/cs	\$43.57
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: 3M #74 Medium Duty Sponge CS 20	
153	1	EA	Dust Mop Covers, 5" x 36"	\$10.11
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS 5" x 36" Dust Mop EA	
154	1	EA	Dust Mop Frames, 5" x 36"	\$2.97
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS 5" x 36" Dust Mop Frame EA	
155	1	EA	60"Dust Mop Handle/ Clamp on	\$2.97
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS 60" Quick Change Dust Mop Handle EA	
156	1	EA	Soap,3/4 oz bars	No Bid
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes:	
157	1	EA	10" Shower/Floor Scrub Brush, Rubbermaid or equivalent	\$11.60
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS 10" Multi-Level Scrub Brush EA	
158	1	EA	6" Iron Handle Scrub Brush, Rubbermaid or equivalent	\$2.10
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: SSS 6" Iron Handle Style Brush EA	
159	1	EA	Toilet seat covers, half fold, 250 per pk., 20 sleeves of 250 covers ea, "Reliable" or equal (No staples in sleeves)	\$79.91
			Item Notes: Non-green certified	
			Supplier Notes: RMC 1/2 Fold Seat Cover CS 5000 (20/250)	

160	1	EA	Rubbermaid Heavy-Duty Dust Pan (Must be all plastic)	\$1.80
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: RM Heavy Duty Dust Pan CS 12				
161	1	EA	Rubbermaid 15" White Roundhead Toilet Bowl Brush (all Plastic)	\$3.00
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: RM 6310 Toilet Bowl Brush EA				
162	1	EA	Blue Rubbermaid Floor Scrub Brush (Must be all plastic)	\$7.71
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: RM 6337 Floor Scrub Plastic Block				
163	1	EA	Rubbermaid 6" Round Handle Scrub Brush (Must be all plastic)	No Bid
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes:				
164	1	EA	Regency Drain Maintainer	\$3.89
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: SSS Drain-Zyme Maintainer CS 12 QT Priced per QT				
165	1	EA	Paper towels, 2-ply roll, kitchen type, "Bounty" or equal, 30 rls/cs	\$25.14
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: VD 4100 Preserve Household Roll Towels CS 30 RL				
166	1	EA	Toilet Tissue, Single 2 ply, 550 sheet	\$35.71
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: VD B50096 Baseline 500 Sheet 2-ply CS 96 RL				
167	1	EA	Toilet Tissue, 2 ply, 1000 ft. Jumbo Junior rolls	\$21.14
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: VD 1208-8 Preserve Jumbo Jr Tissue CS 8 RL				

168	1	EA	Multi fold paper towels, Brown, 9.5x9.125, 16 sleeves/ case	\$17.29
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: VD B925N Baseline Brown MF 9.25 x 9.5 CS 4000 (CS 16/250)				
169	1	EA	Paper towels, Natural multi-fold, 20 sleeves/ case	\$17.29
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: VD B925N Baseline Brown MF 9.25 x 9.5 CS 4000 (CS 16/250)				
170	1	EA	Paper towels, single ply roll, kitchen type, 30 rls/cs	\$25.14
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: VD 4100Preserve Household Roll Towels CS 30 RL				
171	1	EA	Facial tissue, 30/100/cs	\$22.71
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: VD 8575 Precious Facial Tissue CS 30 BX 100				
172	1	EA	Plastic forks, heavy wt., 1M/cs	No Bid
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes:				
173	1	EA	Plastic knives, heavy wt., 1 M/cs	No Bid
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes:				
174	1	EA	18" x 2000' roll film	No Bid
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes:				
175	1	EA	Foam bowls, white, 12 oz., 1M/cs	No Bid
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes:				



176	1	EA	Plates, 9", 3 comp, 500/cs	No Bid
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes:				
177	1	EA	Gloves, disposal, food service grade, latex, powder free, Small, 100/bx, per case	\$3.83
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: Ambitex Latex Powder-Free Small CS 10 Bx/100				
178	1	EA	Gloves, disposal, food service grade, latex, powder free, med, 100/bx, per case	\$3.83
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: Ambitex Latex Powder-Free Medium CS 10 Bx/100				
179	1	EA	Gloves, disposal, food service grade, latex, powder free, large, 100/bx, per case	\$3.83
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: Ambitex Latex Powder-Free Large CS 10 Bx/100				
180	1	EA	Gloves, Nitrile, S-XL, 100 bx	\$3.97
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: Ambitex Nitrile Powder-Free S-XL CS 10 Bx/100				
181	1	EA	Aluminum foil, 18" x 500'rl	No Bid
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes:				
182	1	EA	Baking sheets (pan liners, full) 1M/cs	No Bid
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes:				
183	1	EA	Paper bags,brown, 6# weight,500/pack	No Bid
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes:				

184	1	EA	Paper bags,brown, 76# weight, 400/bundle,	No Bid
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes:				
185	1	EA	Paper bags,brown, 25# weight, 500/pack	No Bid
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes:				
186	1	EA	32 oz. Clear Bottles w/sprayer	\$1.60
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: SSS 32 oz Graduated Bottle and Trigger Sprayer EA				
187	1	EA	Trigger Sprayer for 32 oz. Bottles	\$0.76
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes: SSS Trigger Sprayer for 32 oz Bottle EA				
188	1	EA	15" Windshield Washers	No Bid
Item Notes: Non-green certified				
Supplier Notes:				
Response Total:				\$1,986.52