From: Jessica Bowman

To: Celia Moore
Cc: Chad Traylor; Gary Harris
Subject: FW: Kentucky American Water Firefighting Support Grant Winner
Date: Tuesday, October 5, 2021 3:19:10 PM
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Hi Celia,

See below awards notification and attached blue sheet to accept the funds. Please let me know if
you need anything else.

BC Harris, Can you provide Celia with the accounting string you want the funds deposited in?

Respectfully,,

Captain Jessica Bowman
Public Information Office
Lexington Fire Department

859.231.5662 office
502.295.1311 cell

lexingtonky.gov

"¥ LExiNGTON

From: JASON G. WELLS <WELLSIG@lexingtonky.gov>

Sent: Friday, October 1, 2021 11:22 AM

To: LFD-Executive Staff <LFD-ExecutiveStaff@lexingtonky.gov>

Cc: Jordan Saas <SAAS]@lexingtonky.gov>; Jessica Bowman <RASH]@lexingtonky.gov>
Subject: FW: Kentucky American Water Firefighting Support Grant Winner

Jason G. Wells
Chief
Lexington Fire Department

Office 859.231.5660
Cell 859.619.7378
lexingtonky.gov

"¥ LexinGTON

From: Kentucky American Water <kentuckyamericanwater@amwater.com>
Sent: Friday, October 1, 2021 9:44 AM
Subject: Kentucky American Water Firefighting Support Grant Winner



mailto:RASHJ@lexingtonky.gov
mailto:cmoore@lexingtonky.gov
mailto:TRAYLORC@lexingtonky.gov
mailto:HARRISG@lexingtonky.gov
https://gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fnext.lexingtonky.gov%2F&data=04%7C01%7Ccmoore%40lexingtonky.gov%7C067fcca75936434f1df808d98834f808%7Cdbc9f5ac2e804290a5b6f86036082a04%7C0%7C0%7C637690583502035803%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=BI4VdoB1C63CWngU0q3aVoOoOcvdHY%2FxUpSKnzIJ%2FJY%3D&reserved=0
mailto:kentuckyamericanwater@amwater.com
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MAYOR LINDA GORTON 			JASON G. WELLS

				FIRE CHIEF 

			LEXINGTON FIRE DEPT.











TO:		LINDA GORTON, MAYOR

		URBAN COUNTY COUNCIL

FROM:	CHARLIE LANTER, DIRECTOR

		DIVISION OF GRANTS AND SPECIAL PROGRAMS

DATE:	October 5, 2021

SUBJECT:	Kentucky American Water’s 2021 Firefighting Support Grant



Request:

Request Council Authorization to accept grant award from Kentucky American Water in the amount of $500 for the Fire Fighting Support Grant to support the purchase of Personal Protective Equipment for the Division of Fire and Emergency Services.



Why are you requesting?

The Division of Fire and Emergency Services has received $500 in funding from Kentucky American Water for the purchase of fire resistant hoods. A hood is a required component of the firefighting Personal Protective Equipment (PPE) ensemble. The hoods will be put into the PPE Quartermaster System to replace damaged or old PPE hoods declared Out of Service (OOS). Most firefighters carry two hoods while on duty due to the risk of damage. 



What is the cost in this budget year and future budget years?   No matching funds are required. No funds are budgeted for future years.



Are the funds budgeted?  A budget amendment is in process.



File Number: 



[bookmark: _GoBack]Director/Commissioner:  Wells/Armstrong
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You don't often get email from kentuckyamericanwater@amwater.com. Learn why this is important

[EXTERNAL] Use caution before clicking links and/or opening attachments.

Congratulations! Your organization has been selected to receive a 2021 Kentucky American Water
Firefighting Support Grant. We will be sending a check in the amount of $S500 or contacting you to
present a check in person, to be used in the manner described in your grant application. We will be
announcing the recipients of the grants with a news release and social media postings during Fire
Prevention Week (October 3-9, 2021).

Kentucky American Water appreciates your organization’s efforts throughout the year to make our
communities safer places to live and work, and we are pleased to support fire protection efforts by
providing quality, reliable water service to your community and lending our support to your
organization through this grant program.

If any additional information is needed to process payment, we will be in touch.

Congrats, again!

Ellen Williams, External Affairs Specialist

Kentucky American Water | 2300 Richmond Road | Lexington, KY 40502
O: (859) 268-6364 M: (859) 490-9380

ellen.williams@amwater.com
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This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed.
If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender. Please note that any views or opinions presented in this email are solely those of
the author and do not necessarily represent those of American Water Works Company Inc. or its affiliates. The recipient should check this email and
any attachments for the presence of viruses. American Water accepts no liability for any damages caused by any virus transmitted by this email.
American Water Works Company Inc., 1 Water Street, Camden, NJ 08102 www.amwater.com
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