Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government
Lexington, Kentucky
Horse Capital of the World

Division of Central Purchasing Date of Issue: January 12, 2017
INVITATION TO BID #4-2017
Fiber Optic Cable & Control Equipment
Bid Opening Date: January 26, 2017 Bid Opening Time: 2:00 PM
Address; 200 East Main Street, 3™ Floor, Room 338, Lexdngton, Kentucky 40507
Type of Bid: Price Contract
Pre Bid Meeting:  N/A Pre Bid Time: N/A
Address: N/A

Sealed bids wil be recelved In the office of the Division of Central Purchasing, 200 East Maln Street, Lexington, Kentucky, unt! 2:00 PM,
prevalling local time on 1/26/2017. Bidsmtstbemwmeabove-menumedthteandﬂme. Mailad bids shoufd be sent n:

Division of Central Purchasing
200 East Main Street, Room 338
Lexington, KY 40507, (858) 258-3320

The Lexington-Fayette Urban CoumyGov&mnentasurnsna responsibility for bids that are not addressed and delivered as indicated
above. Hdsmatamnotdeﬁveredbﬂwlﬁvislonofmulmrchasing bvthastatedthneanddatewillberejected.mlblds
mtstbesfgnedandhavememmpanynameandaddr&,bfdhvnaﬁmnumba-,andthenameofmebsdmmewudeafmeenvelope.

Bids are to Indude all shipping costs to the point of dellvery located at: 1515 Old Frankfort Pile, Lexington KY
Bld Security Required: —Yes _X No Csshier Chek, Certified Check, wmmmmmmmmwm}
Performance Bond Required: __ Yes _X No

XX __Bid Specifications Met Exceptions to Bid Specifications. Scceptions shafl be femived and days after
alisched to bid proposal submitted, acceptance of bid;

Procuremeant Card Usage—The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government may be using Prcﬁrement Carts to purchase goods
and services and also to make payments. Wil you aaept Procurement Cards? Yes No

Submitted by: Path Master, Inc.
Firm Name
1960 Midway Drive
Address
Twinsburg, CH 44087
City, State & Zip

Bid must be signed: %M&\g\\(ixﬁu)\ , Vice President
(original signatura) Signature of Authorized Company Representative — Title

Representative’s Name (Typed or printed)
(330) 4254994, ext. 116 (330) 4259333
Area Code - Phone ~ Extension Fax #
sshanley@athmasterine. com
E-Mall Address

The Affidavit in this bid must be mmmmmummrmmafmm
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AFFIDAVIT

Comes the Afflant, __ Stacia L. Shanley , and after being first duly swom under penaty of
perjury as follows:
1. Hisfher name fs Stacia L. Shanley and he/she Is the individual submitting the bid or Is the
authorized representative of Path Master, Inc.

ﬂ)eenﬁtym“iﬂingﬂlebfd(herelnaﬂerrEfaredmas"BHdel")

Blddeiwlllpayalltaxsandfes,whldraremedhotheLedngtnn—FavetteUrbanCountywvemrrmtatthetimeU\e
bldfssubnﬂmed,priortnawa;dofmeoonh-actandwmmalmafn"ament"stamsln regard o those taxes and fees

during the life of the contract,

- Bidder will obtain a Lexington-Fayette Urban County Govemment business license, if applicable, prior to award of the
aontract.

. Bldder has authorized the Division ofCentralPurdlaslngtnverirymeabove-mentloned Information with the Divislon of
Revenue and to disdose to the Urban County Coundl that taxes and/or fees are definquent or that a business license has
not been oblained,

. BuderhasthOWIng!yviolahedanypmvislonofmecampaign ﬂnameiawsoftheCmnmnwaaltrmeenmd:ywmm
the past five (5) years and the award of a contract to the Bidder will notvblabeanypmvmonofmecammign finance
taws of the Commonwealth.

- Bldder has not knowingly violated any provision of Chapter 25 of the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Govemment Code
of Ordinances, known as “Ethics Act."

. Bldder acknowledges that “knowingly” for purposes of this Affidavit means, with respect to conduct or to circumstances
described by a statute or ordinance defining an offense, that a person is aware or should have been aware that his
conduct is of that nature or that the circumstance exists,

Further, Affiant sayeth naught. N/A SO MMJ(

U
STATE OF Ohrio
COUNTY OF Sunmmit
The foregoing lnstrumentwassubsdbed,momtoandadmowledgedbeforem
Stama L. Shanley on this the 24th day

January , 2017.

My G lssion expires: February 15, 2022
NHH gy, & /, /
y ::u\‘“‘ AL ’rt,«,’l ’\a‘/ //;V'X A’/__._ .
JodyL Keamison  NOTARY PUBLIC,"iI\ny AT LARGE
Resident Summit County / :
U* prior to completing his form,

S o Notarygublc, oh ..
Wm plrm:arymm’"sf

d
4 T
!
——

1)
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I. GREEN PROCUREMENT
A. ENERGY

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government is comimitted to protecting our environment and being fiscally
responsible to our citizens.

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government mandates the use of Energy Star compiiant products if they
are avallable In the marketplace (go to www.Energystar.gov). If these products are available, but not
submitted in your pricing, your bid will be rejected as non-compiliant.

ENERGY STAR s a govemment program that offers businesses and consumers energy-effident solutions,
making it easy to save money while protecting the environment for future generations.

Key Benefits

These products use 25 to 50% less energy

Reduced energy costs without compromising quality or performance
Reduced alr poilution because fewer fossil fuels are burned
Significant retum on (nvestment

Extended product life and decreased malntenance

B. GREEN SEAL CERTIFIED PRODUCTS

Go to www,Greenseal.org to find availabie certified products. These products will have a reduced impact on
the environment and on human health. The products to be used must be pre-approved by the LFUCG prior to
commencement of any work In any LFUCG fadility. If a Green Seal product is not avallable, the LFUCG must
provide a signed waiver to use an alternate product. Please provide Information on the Green Seal products

being used with your bid response.
C. GREEN COMMUNITY

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government (LFUCG) serves as a principal, along with the
University of Kentucky and Fayette County Public Schosls, In the Bluegrass Partnership for a Green
Community. The Purchasing Team component of the Partnership collaborates on economy of scale
purchasing that promotes and enhances environmental Initiatives, Specifically, when applicable,
each principal is interested In obtaining best value products and/or services which promote
environment initiatives via solicitations and awards from the other principals.

If your company Is the successful bidder on this Invitation For Bid, do you agree to extend the
same product/service pricing to the other prindpals of the Bluegrass Partnership for a Green
Community (i.e. University of Kentucky and Fayette County Schools) If requested?

Yes _ X No_____
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II.

Bid Conditions

Nobldrnaybewﬂhdrawnforaperbdofsixty(ﬁﬂ)daysafberthedateandtlmesetforopming.

Nobfdmaybealmradaﬂnrmedateandﬁmesetforopmlng. Inﬂmecaseofobvlwsenurs,tl':eDiv'sionof
CenhalPurdIasingmypermrtﬂ\eMﬂadrawalofabld. ﬂmedﬁonastowhemerabidmaybewfmdrawn

shall be that of the Division of Centrai Purchasing.
Acceptance of this proposal shall be enadment of an Ordinance by the Urban County Coundl.

'l'hebidderag:eesmattheUrbanCountyGovemmentleservesﬁleﬂghtU:rejectmandLﬂbldsforeiﬂter
fiscal or technical reasons, andtoawardeadnpaltofmebfdsepalatelyoraﬂpaﬂshomvendor.

Manufacturer’s catalogue numbers, trade names, efc, where shown herein are for descriptive purposes and are
to guide the bidder in interpreting the standard of quality, design, and performance desired, and shall not be

Unsigned bids will not be consldered.

Bids must be submitted prior to the date and time indlcated for opening. Bids submitted after this time will not
be considered.

All bids malled must be marked on the face of the envelope:
“Bid on #4-

and addressed to: Division of Central Purchasing
200 East Main Street, Room 338

Lexington, Kentucky 40507

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Govemment assumes no responsibility for bids that are not
addressed and delivered as Indicated above, Bids that are not delivered to the Divislon of Central
Purchasing by the stated time and date will be rejected,

LAD{e & COontrol

AcertiﬁedcheckorﬂidBondlnﬁreamowtof_ﬂ_pawrtofmeb!dpﬂoemm;tbeaﬂadtedhemm. This
check must be made payable to the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government, and will be retumed when
the material and/or services spedified herein have been defivered In accordance with specifications. In the event
offaﬂu:etoperfcnnwiﬂrlnmeﬂmepaiodsetfthmlst,ltlsagreedﬂ\eoerﬁﬁeddmedcmaybecashed
and the funds retained by the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Govemment as iiquidated damages. Checks of
mmmﬁdbﬂderswﬂlberetumed%enhﬁdhasbeenawatded.

ﬂeddivwdatsspaiﬂedeMdamybeaﬁdorInmedaennmaﬂonofmemmsﬁﬂbuder.

N. - Tabulations of bids received may be malled to bidders, Bldders requesting tabulations must endose 3 stamped,

self-addressed envelope with the bid.

The Lexington-Fayette UtbanCouruyGovanmentlsexemptfmmKentud(ySalsTaxand Federal Excise Tax on
materials purchased from this bid Invitation, Materials purchased by the bidder for construction projects are not

tax exempt and are the sole responsibility of the bidder.

All material fumnished hereunder must be in ful compliance with OSHA regulations,
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Q. If more than one bid Is offered by one party, orbyanypersonorpersomrepmentingaparty,allsudmbids
shall be rejected.

R. S!gnatureonmefaceofmisMdbymeﬂiddewhisaumomdmpresemaﬂvesmnbemnsmedasameptame
of and compllance with all terms and conditions contained :

because of race, mlor, creed, national origln, sex or age, and to promote equal employment through a positive,
continuing program from Rself and each of its sub-contracting agents. This program of equal employment
opportunity shall ammwmdmmmtmam practioes,

T. The Kentucky Equal Employment Opportunity Act of 1978 (KRS 45.560-45,640) requires that any county, dty,
town, school district, water district, hospital district, or other political subdivision of the state shall include in
directly or indirectly publidy funded contracts for supplies, materials, services, or equipment hereinafter entered
into the foliowing provisions:

During the petformance of this contract, the contractor agrees as follows;
(1) The contractor will not discriminate against any employee or applicant for employment because of race,
color, religion, sex, age or national orgin;

(2) The contractor wil state In all solictations oradwm&emenafbrempb}esp{smdby or on behalf of the
contractors that alf qualified applicants wif receive consideration for employment without regard ip race,
color; refigion, sex, age or national origin;

(3) The contractor will post notices in conspicuous pidces, avallable to employees and appliants for
employment; setting forth the provisions of the non-discrimination aauses nequired by this section; and

The Act further provides;
KRS 45.610. Hiring minorities - Information required

(1) For the length of the contradt, each contractor shall hire rminorites from other sources within the drawing
ares, should the unjon with which he has collective bargaining agreements be unwilling to supply
sunficient minonities lo satisfy the agreed ypon gosls and timetable, '
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(i) The equal employment provisions of KRS 45.560 to 45.640 may be met in part by a conbractor by
Subcontracting to & minority contractor or subcontracior. For the provisions of KRS 45.560 to 45.640, a
minofly contractor or subcontractor shall mesn 3 business that /s owned and controlied by one or more
persons dissdvantaged by radial or ethnic droumstances.

KRS 45.630 Termination of existing employee not required, when

Any provision afms45.560m4564ommmm no anlractor shall be required to terminste an
extdngenplo;eeqmnprmfﬁattﬁatempbyee was employed prior to the date of the contract:

KRS 45.640 Mintmum skills

Nothing in KRS 45.560 to 45.640 shall require & contractor to hire anyone who falls to demonstrate the
minimurm skills required to perform a particular job.

Itisreoomnmdedﬂ'aatallofmepmvﬁonsawvequotadmbeindudedasmmnmnglneada
contract. In the case of a contract exceeding $250,000,ﬂmec0ntradnrisrequlredtofumisheﬂdencedﬁthis

Any party, firm or Individual submitting a proposal pursuant to this Invitation must be In compliance with the
requirements of the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government regarding taxes and fees before they an be
considered for award of this invitation and must maintain a “current” status with regard to those taxes and

Code of Ordinances of the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government. The contractor must be In
compliance with Ordinance 35-2000 pursuant to contractor registration with the Division of Building

Inspection. If applicable, sald business must have a Fayette County business license.
Pursuant to KRS 45A.343 and KRS 45A,345, the contractor shali

(1) Reveal any final determination of & violation by the contractor within the previous five year period
pursuant o KRS Chapters 136 (corporation and utility Laxes), 139 (ssles and use taxes), 141 (income
taxes), 337 (wages and hours), 338 (occupational safety and heaith of empioyees), 341 {unemployment
and compensation) and 342 (Iabor and human rights) that apply to the contractor; and

(2)  Be in continuous compliance with the above-mentioned KRS Provisions that apply to the contractor for
the duration of the contract.

A contractor's failure to reveal the above or to comply with such provisions for the duration of the contract shall
be grounds for cancellation of the contract and disqualification of the contractor from eligibility for future

contracts for a period of two (2) years.

Vendors who respond to this Invitation have the right to file a notice of contentlon assodated with the bid
process or to file a notice of appeal of the recommendation made by the Director of Central Purchasing

resulting from this Invitation.

Notice of contention with the bid process must be filed within 3 business days of the bid/proposal opening
by (1) sending a written notice, including suffident documentation to suppart contention, to the Director of
the Divislon of Central Purchasing or (2) submitting a written request for a meeting with the Director of
Central Purchasing to explain histher contention with the bid process. After consulting with the
Commissloner of Finance the Chief Administrative Officer and reviewing the documentation and/or hearing
the vendor, the Director of Central Purchasing shall prompty respond in writing findings as to the
compllance with bid processes. If, based on this review, 2 bid process Iregularity is deemed to have
occurred the Director of Central Purchasing will consult with the Commissioner of Finance, the Chief
Administrative Officer and the Department of Law as to the appropriate remedy.

Notice of appeal of a bid recommendation must be fiied within 3 business days of the bld recommendation
by (1) sending a written notice, including sufficient documentation to support appeal, to the Director,
Division of Central Purchasing or (2) submitting a written request for a meeting with the Director of Central
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B.

Purchasing to explain his appeal. After reviewing the documentation andfor hearing the vendor and
consulting with the Commissioner of Finance and the Chief Administrative Officer, the Director of Central
Purchasing shall in writing, affirm or withdraw the recommendation.

The terms of this agreement shall be for_1_year(s) from the date of acceptance of this contract by the
Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government. This agreement may be automatically extended for an additional
1 year(s) renewal. This contract may be canceled by either party thirty (30) days after delivery by cancellng
party of written notice of Intent to cancel to the other contracting party.

Price Changes (Space Checked Applies)

(X0} 1. Prices quoted In response tomeIthauonshallbeﬁrmpﬁosforﬂaeﬁrst%daysofﬂmehomrunent

Contract. After 90 days, prices may be subject to revision and such changes shall be based on general
Industry changes. Revision may be elther increases or decreases and may be requested by either party.
There will be no more than one (1) price adjustment per quarter. Requests for price changes shall be
recelved in writing at least twenty (20) days prior to the effective date and are subject to written
acceptance before becoming effective. Proof of the validity of a request for revislon shall be
responsibility of the requesting party, The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government shall recelve the
benefit of any dedine that the seller shall offer his other accounts,

() 2. No provision for price change is made herein. Prices are to be firm for the term of this contract.

() 3. Procurement Level Contract

If any contract ftem ks not available from the vendor, the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Govemment, at its
option, may permit the item to be back-ordered or may procure the tem on the open market.

All invoices must bear reference to the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government Purchasing document
numbers which are being billed.

This contract may be canceled by the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government if it is determined that the
Bidder has falled to perform under the terms of this agreement, such cancellation to be effective upon receipt
of written notice of cancellation by the Bidder. ‘

No substitutions for articles specifiad herein may be made without prier approval of the Division of Central
Purchasing.
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EQUAL OPPORTUNITY AGREEMENT

The Law

Title VII of the Civil Rights Act of 1964 (amended 1972) states that it is unkawful for an employer to discriminate In
employment because of race, color, religlon, sex, age (40-70 years) or national origin,

Executive Order No. 11246 on Nondisaimination under Federal contract prohibits employment discrimination by
contractor and sub-contractor doing business with the Federal Government or reciplents of Federal funds, This order
was later amended by Executive Order No. 11375 to prohibit discrimination on the basis of sex,

Section 503 of the Rehabilitation Act of 1973 states:

The Contractor will not discriminate against any empioyee or applicant for employment
bexause of physical or mental disabiiily,

Section 2012 of the Vietnam Era Veterans Readjustment Act of 1973 requires Affinmative Action on behalf of disabled
veterans and veterans of the Vietnam Era by contractors having Federal contrads, _

Section 206(A) of Executive Order 12086, Consolidation of Contract Compliance Functions for Equal Employment
Opportunity, states:

The Secretary of Labor may investigate the empioyment practices of any Government
contractor or sub-contractor to determine whether or not the contractual provisions
specified in Section 202 of this order have been violated,

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government practioes Equal Opportunity in recrutting, hiring and promoting. 1t is the
Government's intent to affimatively provide employment opportunities for those Individuals who have previously not been
allowed to enter into the mainstream of society, Because of its Importance to the ol Government, this policy carries the
full endorsement of the Mayor, Commissioners, Directors and ail supervisory personnel, In following this commitment to
Equal Employment Opportunity and because the Government s the benefactor of the Federal funds, It is both agalnst the
Urban County Government policy and lllegal for the Government to let contracts to companles which knowingly or
unknowingly practice discrimiration in thelr employment practices, Violation of the above mentioned ordinances may cause a
contract to be canceled and the contractors may be dedlared ineligible for future considi .

Please sign this statement in the appropriate space acknowledging that you have read and understand the provisions
contained hereln. Retum this document as part of your application packet.

Bidders

IWe agree to comply with the Gvif Rights Laws fisted above that govern employment rights of minoritles, women, veteran
status, disabilty and age.

Stoeaec Sheen Dy Path Master, Inc.

Signature U Name of Business
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GENERAL PROVISIONS OF BID CONTRACT

By signing the below, bidder acknowledges that It understands and agrees with the following provisions related to its bid
response and the provision of any goods or services to LFUCG upon selection by LFUCG pursuant to the bid request;

1. Bidder shall comply with ail Federal, State & Local regulations concerning this type of service or good.
2. Failure to submit ALL forms and information required by LFUCG may be grounds for disqualification.

3. Addenda: All addenda, If any, must be considered by the bidder in making its response, and such addenda shall
be made a part of the requirements of the bid contract. Before submitting a bid response, It Is Incumbent upon
bidder to be informed as to whether any addenda have been issued, and the fallure of the bidder to cover any
such addenda may result in disqualification of that response,

4. Bid Reservations: LFUCG reserves the right to reject any or alil bid responses, to award in whole or part, and to
walve minor immaterial defects in proposals. LFUQG may consider any altemnative proposal that meets its basic

needs.
5. Liability: LRUCG is not responsible for any cost incurred by bldder in the preparation of Its response.

6. Changes/Alterations: Bidder may change or withdraw a proposal at any time prior to the opening; however, no
oral modifications will be allowed. Only letters, or other formal written requests for modifications or cormections of
a previously submitted proposal which Is addressed in the same manner as the bid response, and received by
LFUCG prior to the scheduled closing time for receipt of bids, will be accepted. The bid response when opened,
will then be comected in accordance with such written request(s), provided that the written request Is contained in
a sealed envelope which Is plainly marked “modifications of bid response”,

7. Clarification of Submittal: LFUCG reserves the right to obtain dlarification of any point in a bid or to obtain
additional information from any bidder,

8. Bribery Clause: By his/her signature on its response, bidder certifies that no employee of his/hers, any affiliate or
subcontractor, has bribed or attempted to bribe an officer or employee of the LAICG.

9, Additional Information: While not necessary, the bidder may Indude any product brochures, software
documentation, sample reports, or other documentation that may assist LFUCG in better understanding and
evaluating the bid response. Additional documentzation shall not serve as a substitute for other documentation
which is required by the LFUCG to be submitted with the bid response.

10.  Ambiguity, Conflict or other Errors: If a bldder discovers any ambiguity, conflict, discrepancy, omission or other
emor in the bid request of LFUCG, it shall Immediately notify LFUCG of such error In writing and request
modification or darification of the document if allowable by the LRUCG.

11.  Agreement to Bid Terms: In submitting Its bld response, the bidder agrees that it has carefully examined the
spedifications and all provisions relating to LFUCG's bid request, including but not limited to the bid contract, By
submission of its bid response, bidder states that it understands the meaning, Intent and requirements of LFUCG's
bid request and agrees to the same. The successful bidder shall warrant that & is familiar with and understands all
provisions herein and shail warrant that it can comply with them. No additional compensation to bidder shall be
authorized for services, expenses, or goods reascnably covered under these provisions that the bidder omits from

its bid response.

12.  Cancellation: LFUCG may unliaterally terminate the bid contract with the selected bidder(s) at any time, with or
without cause, by providing at least thirty (30) days advance written notice unless a different advance written
notice period Is negotiated prior to contract approval. Payment for services or goods received prior to termination
shall be made by the LFUCG provided these goods or services were provided in a manner acceptable to the
LARUCG. Payment for those goods and services shall not be unreasonably withheld,
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13,

14,

15,

16.

17.

18,

19,

No Waiver: No failure or delay by LFUCG In exercising any right, remedy, power or privilege hereunder, nor any
single or partial exerdse thereof, nor the exercise of any other right, remedy, power or privilege shall operate as a
waiver hereof or thereof. No fallure or delay by LFUCG In exerdsing any right, remedy, power or privilege under or
in respect of this bid proposal or bid contract shall affect the rights, remedies, powers or privileges of LFUCG
hereunder or shall operate as a waiver thereof,

Authority to do Business: Fach bldder must be authorized to do business under the laws of the Commonwealth of

Kentucky and must be in good standing and have full legal capadty to provide the goods o services specified In
the bid proposal, Each bidder must have all necessary right and lawful authority to submit the bid response and

Ability to Meet Obligations: Bidder affirmatively states that there are no actions, suits or proceedings of any kind
pending agalnst bidder or, to the knowledge of the bidder, threatened against the bidder before or by any court,
govemmental body or agency or other tribunal or authority which would, i adversely determined, have a
materially adverse effect on the authorlty or ability of bidder to perform its obligations under this bid response or
bid contract, or which question the legality, valldity or enforceabliity hereof or thereof.

N
Bidder understands and agrees that Its employees, agents, o subcontractors are not employees of LFUCG for any
purpose whatsoever. Bldder s an independent contractor at all imes related to the bid response or bid contract,

If any term or provislon of this bid contract shall be found to be llega! or unenforceable, the remainder of the
contract shall remaln in full force and such term or provision shall be deemed stricken,

“STC1w wd Janvary 24, 2017

Signature Date
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FIBER-OPTIC CABLE AND CONTROL EQUIPMENT

We propose to deliver to the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government, Division of Traffic
Engineering loading dock at 1515 Old Frankfort Pike, Lexington, Kentucky, 40504, the following
equipment conforming to all specifications within Thirty (30) days of receipt of purchase
authorization:

Pricing for the following shall be good for 365 days from acceptance of bid with the option to
renew.

Special Requirement: (Fiber-Optic Cable Bids)
e All Fiber-Optic cable shall have a 10-year warranty on the Fiber & Cable.
 All price quotes for Fiber-Optic cable shall be per linear foot.
» All fiber-optic cable shipments shall be on Wooden Reel (coils will not be accepted).

Item # Description

| Junction Box (PD Style) wiLid (Stackable)

Box: Hubbell Part # PD1730BB18 (or Equivalent)
Lid: Hubbell Part# PG1730HH0021 (or Equivalent)

2 Junction Box (PG Stvle) wiLid

Box: Hubble Part #PG1730BA12 (or Equivalent)
Lid: Hubble Part #PG1730HHG021 (or Equivalent)

3 24-port SM LC Piptailed Splice Cassette

Coming Part# CCH-CS24-A9-POORE (No Substitute)

4 12-port SM SC Pigtailed Splice Casseite

Coming Part# CCR-CS12-59-POORE (No Substitute)

5 2-Rack Unit Closet Connector Housinp

Comimg # CCH-02-U Closet Housing (No Substitute)

6 5 it Closet C
Coming#CCH-03-U Closet Housing (No Substitute)

7 it Closet Connector Housin
Coming #CCH-04-U Closet Housing, (No Substitute)

8 Low Count Fiber Splice Closure Kit

Each kit shall include:
. Preformed Line Products Coyote LCC # COYLCC-F004
. Strand mount # 8003832 (No Substitnie)

Wall Mount Enclosure, 12/24-Port
Corning #WIC-02P (No Substitute)




Item # Description
10 Fusjon Splicer, Fuiikura 708

Fujikura 705 Evolution Fusion Splicer shall inciude:
Standard Package, Fiber Holder #FH-60-250(coating dia. 250um) 1-pair, Fiber Holder #FH-60-900
(coaling dia. 900um) 1-pair, 1-year Jimited warranty (No Substitute)

11

Splice Protectors for Fusion Splices

Corning 2806031-0! Fusion Splice Protector 60MM heat-shrink sleeve & stainless steel rod (or Equiv;ﬂent)

12 ~inch, Direct Bury, Orange
Carlon #ASC9N1JNNBS500 {or Equivalent)
13 - i
Carlon #AI3CIN1INNB2500 (or Equivalent)
14 Cable Tie, Bo
Panduit PLT3H-TL-100 (or Equivalent)
15 (3
Joslyn J1075, (or Equivalent)
16 Eye Bolt, 16-inch
Joslyn I9416, (or Equivalent)
17 Messenper Cable. 1/4-inch, Galvanized
2,000-ft. on a wooden reel
18 essenper Cable, 1/4-inch, Galvanized
5,000-ft. on & wooden ree|
19 ble i olt, 24-inch
Joslyn #J8874 (or Equivalent)
20 Pole Bolt, 18-inch
Joslyn #J8818 (or Equivalent)
21 Eve Bolt. 18-inch
Joslyn #9418 (or Equivalent)
22 Oval Eve Nut
Joslyn #1092 (or Equivalenl)
23 C
#PA296X (or Equivalent)
24 ise, 1/4-
Reliable 5150 (No Substitute)
25 | Stond Link, 1/4-inch
Reliable 5000 (No Substitute)
26 "

ZC" Ceble Jasher
GMP #P/N 71420 (No Substitute)




Item # Description
27 Lasher/Overlasher w/chest
GMP 70400 Apollo (No Substitute)
28 nless S
GMP #'II 530 (or Equlvalent)
29 "D* i
GMP #07886 (No Substitute) _
30 OTDR, Micro
Noyes M200-K-Quad {No Substitute)
k)| Cable Puller, Fiber-Optic Package, Condux Intemnatiogal (No Substitute)
. Hydraulic Cable Puller
. Foot control/hydraulic control assembly
. Hoses and cords to connect o the puller
. Portable hydraulic power pack, gas 9-hp
. Remote Mounting Stand
32 Cable P gtan, Fi i pnal ( ‘
. Capsmn qhall be 30-mch dmmeter 4—mches wide
33 i it aster Splice Cabi uhstitu
Kit shall include:
. (1) Comning CSH-05u 19-inch Rack Mount Housing
. (22) Corning M67-112 Type 28 Trays, for 24 Fusion splices per Tray
. Each kit shall have all items listed shipped in one box, per bid ilem number
3 Attenuator #1. 10 db
SC Male-5C Female 10db SM 131071550 Atten UPC,
Fiber Instrument Sales Inc Part Number: F18731A10 (or Equivalent)
35 Atlenuator #2, 5 db
SC Male-SC Femele 5db SM 1310/1550 Atten UPC,
Fiber Instrument Sales Inc. Part Number; F18731A05 (or Equivalent)
36 Blank
37 Blank
38 Blank
39 Blank
ious counts, non-gel), #'s 40 thru 48
Cominp Altos #xxxEU4-T470 ID20  (No Substitutes)  where xxx=fiber couni
40 6-Fiber Cable
4] 12-Fi e
42 | 24Fiber Cable
43 | 36Fiber Cable




Item #

Description

48-Fiber Cable

45

72-Fiber Cable

9¢-Fiber Cable

47

144-Fiber Cable

48

8- e

49

Detectable 5/16-inch Duct Rod with Cart and Accessories

Duct rod with cart shall be DCD 5/16-inch with the following accessories:

Splice Connector, Flexible Guide Head, Pulling Eye, Swivel Rod End (attached), Female Rod End (anached),
Roller Guide, Clevis End, Glue, Rod Gripper, and accessory Pouch.

DCD Designs part #53700-400 (or Equivalent)

50

ble Fiber-Optic Cable Pulling Tape, 3.000-foot 1
Pulling tape shail be Tensile Strength: 1,800-pounds, Width: 5/8-inch, Construction: Woven, Pre-Lubrication:
Yes, Foot-Markings: Yes, priced in 3,000-foot lengths. Detectable Fiber-Optic Cable Pulling Tape.
Herculine part #P1800T (or Equivalent)

51

Spo Shoe, 16-inch w/Tap

Multlink part # 2116-SSPTB (or Equivalent)

52

Stackable Cable Spacer

Panduit # SACS 50-T100 (No Substitute)

33

iber-Optic lex Jumper, 3-meter, SC g §C
Fiber Instrument Sales #VDX9YYS3FIS (or Equivalent)

Fiber Termination Kit (Controller Cabinet)

Each kit shall contain the following:
v One (1) Velero wrap, Black, (1" x 8") w/screw mount cut out, Part #CT3108
. Four (4) Duplex SC to SC 3-meler jumpers, single-mode cable
One (1) #313351 Coming-C, SPH-O1P, )2-F, Wall Mount Enclosure Single Pane] Housing (No
Substitute)
. One (1) #180699, Coming-C, CCH-CP06-59, 6-port panel SC SM loaded {No Substitute)
’ Each kit shall have all items listed shipped in one box, per bid ilem number

35

Each kit shall contain the following:

. One (1) indoor/outdoor 6-fiber single-mode cable, SC connector to pigtail, 100-meter/l meter breakou.
. One (1) Velero wrap, Black, (1" x B”) w/screw mount cut out, Pan #CT3108

. Four (2) Duplex SC to SC 3-meter jumpers, single-mode cable

. One (1) #313351 Coming-C, SPH-01P, 12-F, Wall Mount Enclosure Single Panel Housing (No
Substitute}

- One (1) #180699, Corning-C, CCH-CP06-59, 6-port panel SC SM Joaded (No Substitute)

. Each kit shall have all itemns listed shipped in one box, per.bid item number




Item # Description
56 tarfight i ¢ Splice Closure Kit Configuration Summary: 4048-B-2-A-3-0 MuliLink

Kit shall conmin:

. One (1} 4048D Starfighter dome splice closure (No Substitute)

. One (1) 4000/4048D Starfighter Aerial Hanger Kit (No Substitute)

. Two (2) 4048-SSTP splice tray 24 single/4R ribbon splice capacity (No Substitute)

- Each kit shall have all items listed shipped in one box, per bid item number

57 40000 Dome Kit for 288 Tata] Splices, Configuration Summary: 4000-C-7-A-3-0 MultiLink (No Substitutes)
Kit shall contain
0 One (1) (4000d Dome w/] tray)
. Seven (7) Splice Trays (36 cl trays)
. Three (3) (Cable Addition Kits)
. One (1) {Aerial Hanging Bracke()
. All itemns in kit shall be shipped in one {1) box.
58 iEj i r
Fitel #8323 (or Equivalent)
59 Eiber-Optic Shackle
Equivalent 1o GMP #70045 (or Equivalent)
60 Lic uit Chec
Equivalent to DCD Design #08500-200 (or Equivalent)
61 Fi i c Guide, 2-i
DCD Design #32500-200 (or Equivaleni)
62 i ic Duct Entry Guide, 4-inch
DCD Design #32500-400 (or Equivalent)
63 Fiber-Optic Spocl Frame
DCD Design #58540-010 (or Equivalent)
64 -Optic drant, Black
GMP Tools #15316 (or Equivalent)
65 Fiber-Optic Ree] Trailer :
Roose Mlg. Roose Reeler RR135 w/HPD-510 Hydraulic Power Reel Drive (or Equivaient)
66 P ope, 1/2- 1200-feet
IDEAL #31-851 (or Equivalent)
67 Opticgl Fiber Access Tog]
for midspan buffer splits, Coming-C #OFT-000 (No Substitutes)
68 i i it
DCD Design #35100-000 (or Equivalent)
69
DCD Design #35000-050 (or Equivalent)
70 Aeria| Cable Puller
Condux #18108000 (No Substitute)




Item # Description
71 -fool ic
Condux #18143621 (No Substitute)
7 = o
Condux #18110812 (No Substitute)
3 Cab
Condux #18110834 (No Substitute)
74 Cable Block Pusher
Condux #18109240 (No Substitute)
75 Cable Block
Condux #18001270 (No Substitute)
76 ial e Pull
Condux #18308000 (No Substitute)
” Jumpez Clamip
N/5 Electric M EM 0800 (or Equivalent)
78 Rugped Switch RS900G (10)
Siemens, (RuggedComm #RS900G-24-P-25C1 0) (No Substitute)
79 Rupged Switch RS900G (25)
Siemens, (RugpedComm #RS900G-24-P-25C25) (No Substitute)
80 Conduit Inspection Camera
General Pipe Cleaners Gen-Eye SD Part #CMSDC with standard color camera and 200-ft. rod {No Substitute)
81 Nop-Metallic Pole Riser
Extra Heavy Duty Schedule 80 Carlon PV Mold #5941 |N (or Equivalen()
§2 \lic Pole Riser Adaptor
2-inch - 4-inch adaptor for Carlon PV Mold Carlon #E939JN (or Equivalent)
&3 er-Oplic lex Jumper, 3-meter, SC to ST
Fiber-Optic Jumpers shall be Duplex SM 9/125, SC to ST, 3-meters long,
Fiber Instrument Sales #D38YSIFISC {(or Equivalent)
B4 Corrugated I -inch Black Innerduct, 5,.000-ft reel
Core Data Comm Parl #2001005710 (or Equivalent)
85 i able (18/4 AWG), 1,000 fi-ree)
Belden 8439 (or Equivalent)
86 ab

Part #CATSE, CMOO424ICAT5E-2003, CS-UNIPRIS 2003 GRAY REEL, 244P UTP
INDSTRL ETHRNT HI NS MD FLEX (or Equivalent)

-CMR SOL BC PE/PVC,
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Fiber-Oplic Cable and
Control Equip. Bld Tab

2017 Fiber-Optic Cable and Control Equipment vendor bid tab
Bid Invitation _4-2017Price Contract #_N/A

Expliration Date: _ ] =
Num jitem i ’ |1|...|r| - i Unit — |~ Bid
.—1_[Junction Box (PD Style) wiLid (Stackable) N L _EA___ NoBid ~
2 |Junction Box (PG Style) w/Lid ) R EA No Bid .
3 |24-port SM LC Pigtailed Splice Cassette — B . EA No Bid
—4__12-port SM SC Piglailed Splice Cassette o EA No Bid
5 _{2-Rack Unit Closet Connector. Housing - _ ) EA No Bid
6__I3-Rack Unit Closet Connector Housing B i [ EA No Bid ]
7__|4 Reck Unit Closet Connector Housing . : ;m. EA No Bid i
. 8__|Low Count Fiber Splice Closure Kit e ' EA No Bid
_9_|Wall Mount Enclosure, 12/24-Port . [ EA | NoBid _
| 10 |Fujikura 70S Fusion Splicer i EA No Bid _
11 ] .iSplice Protectors for Fusion Splices _ ) o | EA _ No Bid
13) Q_Em_d.nmﬁ _1-inch, Direct Bury, Orange . i FT _NoBid ]
| 13 L:.anacs 2-inch. Direct Bury. Orange . ﬁ FT | __No Bid
14 _|Cable Tie, box of 250 o EA No Bid
15 |Pole Washer . o EA _ No Bid
.16 |Eye Bolt. 16-inch m o { EA No Bid
17_\Messenger Cable, 1/4-inch, Galvanized, 2,000-fi. on a wooden reel | _EA_ | NoBid |
_ 18 {Messenger Cable, 1/4-inch, Galvanized, 5 ,000-ft. on a wooden reel . _EA No Bid
b %@InruacEm Arming Bolt. 24-inch : EA No Bid
20 _|Pole Boilt. 18-inch ~ EA 1 NoBid )
.21 _|Eye Bolt. 18-inch __ o EA [ No Bid
| 22 |Oval Eye Nut EA | NoBid
.23 |Suspension Clamp — _ { EA | NoBid ~
24_|Suand Vise, |/4-inch, Reliable 5150 N ' Ea * NoBid
25 _|Strand Link, 1/4-inch. Reliable 5000 T e T N Bid
26 _|"C" Cable Lasher . [T EA v. No Bid
27 _|Lasher/Overiasher w/chest, GMP 70400 Apollo - | EA” 7 NoRid
28 _|Lash Wire, .045 Stainless Steel, 6 x 1200-8 per box ) | EA 7 NoBid




Fiber-Optic Cable and
Conirol Equip. Bid Tab

29 i"D" Lashing Clamp ] ] EA No Bid
30 _|OTDR, Micro ] B EA No Bid
. 31_|Condux Fiber-Optic Cable Puller. pkg, 1 EA No Bid
. 32 _;Condux Fiber-Optic Cable Puller Capstan B m> L...nl No Bid
23 Closet Splice Housing Kit for Master Splice Cabinet - _EA No Bid
. 34_|Auenuator #1, 10 db _ ] .. EAT T RoBid T
35 _|Attenuator #2, 5 dby . o ... EA | "NoBd ]
36 |Blank _ ) _ N | MNoBid
37_[Blank ] ] o __No Bid
38 |Blank ] B No Bid
39 (Blank _ e : No Bid
_ 40 |6-FiberCable o FT __No Bid
4 _|12-Fiber Cable _ FT No Bid
42 _|24-Fiber Cable. ) ) FT " NoBid
43 _|36-Fiber Cable B i . FT L NoBid
44 |48-Fiber Cable ) FT “No Bid
45 _|72-Fiber Cable L _ i _ FT No Bid
|46 [96-Fiber Cable B FT No Bid
47 _|144-Fiber Cable B FT No Bid
48 _|288-Fiber Cable . i FT_~ | NoBid
49 _|Detectable 5/16-inch Duct Rod with Cart and Accessories LEA |l NoBd
50 _|Detectable Fiber-Optic Cable Pulling Tape, 3.000-foot lengths __EA No Bid _
51 |Mulilink 16-inch Sno Shoe with Tap e EA $24.00
. 52 _|Stackable Cabie Spacer = ) ] | EA X No Bid
33_IFiber-Optic Duplex Jumper, 3-meter. SCto SC j o . __EA No Bid
54 _[Fiber Termination Kit (Controller Cabinet) L 1 EA No Bid
|55 _|Fiber Installation Kit (Navice) o EA No Bid
.38 _Starfighter Fiber-Optic Dome Splice Closure Ki . __Ea $256.00
57_14000D Dome Kit for 268 Total Splices . UEA ] g3 T
58 _[Precision Optical Fiber Cleaver _EA No Bid
-39 _|Fiber-Optic Shackle - - i EA No Bid
60 _|Fiber-Oplic Conduit Checker s B B T T TTERAT T mo lw.;...a
61 _|Fiber-Optic Duct Entry Guide, 2-inch | EA™| MoBid




Fiber-Oplic Cable and
Cantrol Equip. Bld Tab

.62 Fiber-Optic Duct Entry Guide, 4-inch ) L | EA No Bid
|63 _IFiber-Optic Spool Frame . I__EA [ TNoBd
. 64 _IFiber-Optic Quadrant, Black T " EA " " No Bid
(65 |Fiber-Optic Reel Trailer . T TTEA T NeEd |
66 _|Pull Rope, 1/2-inch x 1200-feet ] __ TTTEA " NoBid |
|67 Optical Fiber Access Tool . EA No Bid
_ 68 |Fiber Lube Applicator Kit . i ) 1 ~EA No ww.al i
69_ |Fiber Lube, 5-gallon — _ ) . ] EA 0 No Bid
.70 |Aerial Cable Puller _ . _ EA i No Bid
71_{21-foot Lay Up Stick ey . e ——_ | EA . _NoBid
72 |Wire Raising Tool _ ) EA i No Bid
73 |Cable Block Lifter B — EA ___ _NoBid
. 74__|Cable Block Pusher L EA ‘No Bid
_ 75 _|CableBlock - _ [ EA ~ No Bid
76 _)|Overlash Aerial Cable Puller . e EA No Bid
.77 _|Jumper Clamp - L EA No Bid
78 _|Rugged Switch RS900G _(RuggedComm #RS900G-24-P-25C10) e el EA _$1,750.00
79 |Rupged Switch RS900G (RuggedComm H#RS900G-24-P-28C25) o “ EA $1,995.00
80 |Conduit Inspection Camera . EA No Bid
|81 _|Non-Metallic Pole Riser . . . EA No Bid
.82 _|Non-Mellic Pole Riser Adaptor ] _ LLEA No Bid
.83 _|Fiber-Optic Duplex Jumper. SmsmSCwsT 0000 i EA i No mEll N
.84 |Comugated L-inch Black lnmerduct, 5,000-fireel .. EA No Bid
{~83_ISignal Cable (18/4 AWG). 1,000 Rreel _ B SSNNE No Bid __
86 _|CATS Cable, 1,000-f ree] | EA No Bid




