
Bid 109-2020 Addendum 8

JUDY CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 109-2020 Addendum 8
Title: Upper Cane Run Wet Weather Storage
Type: Competitive Bid
Issue Date: 10/2/2020
Deadline: 11/10/2020 02:00 PM (ET)

Contact Information

Contact: Brian Marcum
Address: Central Purchasing

Government Center Building
Room 338
200 East Main Street
Lexington, KY 40507

Phone: (859) 2583320
Fax: (859) 2583322
Email: brianm@lexingtonky.gov
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JUDY CONSTRUCTION COMPANY Information

Address: PO BOX 457
CYNTHIANA, KY 41031

Phone: (859) 234-6900
Fax: (859) 234-3480

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED! By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent
and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached
bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

James K Cowley jcowley@judyconstructionco.com
Signature Email

Submitted at 11/10/2020 12:59:01 PM

Response Attachments

1JudyConstruction_IONWAVE UPLOAD.pdf

Judy Construction Company

Bid Lines

1 Base Bid – For General Construction of Upper

Cane Run Wet Weather Storage

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum Price: $5,600,500.00 Total: $5,600,500.00

2 4-Inch Water Line from Newtown Pike to

Storage Tank Entrance Drive - enter unit price per linear foot

Quantity: 1000 UOM: Linear Feet Price: $41.00 Total: $41,000.00

3 Allowance: Miscellaneous Site Improvements

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum Price: $300,000.00 Total: $300,000.00

4 Allowance: System Programming Service

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum Price: $150,000.00 Total: $150,000.00

5 Allowance: Electrical Service

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum Price: $75,000.00 Total: $75,000.00

6 Allowance: Lean Concrete under Storage

Tank

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum Price: $100,000.00 Total: $100,000.00

7 Allowance: KY American Connection

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum Price: $25,000.00 Total: $25,000.00
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8 Allowance: Mechanical Screen

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum Price: $188,000.00 Total: $188,000.00

9 2-Inch Mill and Surface Overlay of Nandino Drive (enter price for one (1) square yard)

Quantity: 5500 UOM: Square Yard Price: $13.00 Total: $71,500.00

1
0

(1)Prestressed Concrete

Tank Manufacturer

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum No Bid

Manufacturer: The Crom Corporation Preload, Inc. Precon Corporation

1
1

(2)Mechanical Screen

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum No Bid

Manufacturer: Westech ROMAG

1
2

(3)Submersible Pumps

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum No Bid

Manufacturer: Sulzer-ABS KSB

1
3

(4)Check Valves

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum No Bid

Manufacturer: Golden Anderson

1
4

(5)Plug Valves

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum No Bid

Manufacturer: Dezurik

1
5

(6)Combination Air

Release Valve

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum No Bid

Manufacturer: ARI

1
6

(7)Area-Velocity Flow

Meter

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum No Bid

Manufacturer: Hach Flo-Dar Isco Laser Flow

1
7

(8)Electromagnetic Flow

Meter

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum No Bid

Manufacturer: Endress + Hauser Sparling Krohne

Page 3 of 4 pages Vendor: JUDY CONSTRUCTION COMPANY Bid 109-2020 Addendum 8



1
8

(9)Access Hatches

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum No Bid

Manufacturer: Bilco Company Babcock-Davis MIlcor

1
9

(10)Slide Gates

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum No Bid

Manufacturer: Waco Whipps

2
0

(11)Valve and Gate

Actuators

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum No Bid

Manufacturer: Limitorque

2
1

(12)Level Transmitters

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum No Bid

Manufacturer: MJK

2
2

(14)Motor Control Center

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum No Bid

Manufacturer: Allen Bradley Schneider (Square D) Eaton (Cutler Hammer)

2
3

(15)VFD with Front End Filter

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum No Bid

Manufacturer: Allen Bradley Schneider (Square D) Eaton (Cutler Hammer)

2
4

(16)Generator Set

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum No Bid

Manufacturer: Kohler Caterpillar Cummins/Onan MTU

2
5

(17)Gas Detection System

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum No Bid

Manufacturer: Sierra Monitor Corporation

2
6

(18)Division 17 Control

Panels

Quantity: 1 UOM: Lump Sum No Bid

Manufacturer: ADGO

Response Total: $6,551,000.00
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