¥ LEXINGTON

Bid 61-2022 Addendum 1
Tom Chesnut Excavation & Construction, LLC
Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 61-2022 Addendum 1

Title: Parks Construction UPC

Type: Competitive Bid

Issue Date: 6/6/2022

Deadline: 6/22/2022 02:00 PM (ET)

Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS
SOLICITATION.

Contact Information

Contact: Kristie Thomas

Address: Central Purchasing
Government Center Building
Room 338
200 East Main Street
Lexington, KY 40507

Phone:  (859) 2583320

Fax: (859) 2583322

Email: kthomas@Iexingtonky.gov
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Tom Chesnut Excavation & Construction, LLC Information

Address: 220 Industry Parkway
Nicholasville, KY 40356

Phone:  (859) 333-8080

Fax: (859) 881-8983

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED! By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent
and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached
bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

Melinda Chesnut tcconstruction@windstream.net

Signature Emalil
Submitted at 6/16/2022 9:49:16 AM

Response Attachments

TOM CHESNUT 61-2022_UPC_BID_SCHEDULE_ELECTRONIC_FORM.xIsx

BID 61-2022 EXCEL UNIT PRICES
TOM CHESNUT EXC. & CONST. 61-2022 PARKS CONST UPC FORMS.pdf

TOM CHESNUT EXCAVATION & CONSTRUCTION, LLC<br/>61-2022 PARK CONSTRUCTION UPC FORMS
PARKS CONST. UPC BID ADDENDUM1.pdf

Tom Chesnut Excavation & Construction, LLC<br/>ADDENDUM 1 BID: 61-2022 PARKS CONST. UPC
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Project:

Parks Construction UPC Bid# 61-2022

Bid Date: 6/21/2022
Contractor: Tom Chesnut Excavation & Construction, LLC

# Item Unit Unit Price

1 Bituminous pavement for athletic courts: Base TN NO BID

2 Bituminous pavement for athletic courts: Surface TN NO BID

3 Bituminous pavement for athletic courts reinforced with aramid fibers: Base TN NO BID

4 Bituminous pavement for athletic courts reinforced with aramid fibers: Surface [TN NO BID

5 Bituminous pavement milling for athletic courts TN NO BID

6 Bituminous pavement crack filler LF NO BID

7 Bituminous pavement full depth crack repair LF NO BID

8 Athletic court color coating SY NO BID

9 Athletic court patch and level surface SY NO BID

10 Athletic court striping LF NO BID

11 Asphalt sealing SY NO BID

12 Parking lot striping LF NO BID

13 Chain link fencing; galvanized; 6 ft. LF NO BID

14 Chain link fencing; galvanized: 8 ft. LF NO BID

15 Chain link fencing; galvanized: 10 ft. LF NO BID

16 Chain link fencing;; galvanized: 12 ft. LF NO BID

17 Chain link fencing; vinyl coated: 6 ft. LF NO BID

18 Chain link fencing; vinyl coated: 8 ft. LF NO BID

19 Chain link fencing; vinyl coated: 10 ft. LF NO BID

20 Chain link fencing; vinyl coated: 12 ft. LF NO BID

21 4 board wood fence LF NO BID

22 Security fence LF NO BID

23 Dense grade aggregate placed base TN $ 50.00
24 No. 2 stone TN $ 50.00
25 No. 9 stone TN $ 50.00
26 No. 57 stone TN $ 50.00
27 Concrete sidewalk SY $ 81.00
28 Finished Concrete CY $ 600.00
29 Concrete pavement; 4 in. depth SY $ 81.00
30 Concrete pavement; 6 in. depth SY $ 108.00
31 Concrete pavement; 8 in. depth SY $ 110.00
32 Playground header curb installation LF $ 50.00
33 Topsoil CY $ 40.00
34 Excavation CY $ 35.00
35 Embankment CY $ 35.00
36 Finish grading CcY $ 35.00
37 Laser grading CY NO BID

38 Standard staked silt fence-installed LF $ 8.00
39 Wire back silt fence-installed LF $ 15.00
40 Tree protection fence LF NO BID

41 Seeding & protection; General (standard seed mix) SY $ 4.00
42 Seeding & protection: Athletic Field (special seed mix) SY $ 8.00
43 Sod: provide & installation SY $ 3.00
44 Site amenity install; trash/recylcing receptacle EA $ 250.00
45 Site amenity install; standard bench EA $ 400.00
46 Site amenity install: covered single bench EA $ 500.00
47 Site amenity install: covered double bench EA $ 800.00
48 Site amenity install: square picnic table EA $ 500.00
49 Site amenity install: covered square picnic table EA $ 1,800.00
50 Site amenity installation: 6 ft. rectangle picnic table EA $ 600.00
51 Site amenity installation: 8 ft. rectangle handicap picnic table EA $ 600.00
52 Site amenity installation: covered 6 ft. rectangle picnic table EA $ 1,500.00
53 Single block masonry retention wall SF NO BID

54 Supply and install ADA parking sign EA $ 300.00




55 Solid drain pipe LF $ 12.00
56 4 in. HDPE perforated pipe LF $ 12.00
57 6 in. HDPE perforated pipe LF $ 14.00
58 Jackhammer with operator HR $ 125.00
59 Skid steer loader with operator HR $ 100.00
60 Backhoe (small) with operator HR $ 100.00
61 Roller/compactor with operator HR $ 100.00
62 Grader with operator HR $ 200.00
63 Dump truck (single axle) with driver HR $ 100.00
64 Dump truck (tri-axle) with driver HR $ 105.00

Payment and Performance Bond Cost for Projects over $50,000 (See Special Conditions, Section 6) - Up to

0,
5% allowance for total construction cost 5% Max Allowance

Unspecified Incidental Materials at Cost Plus 15% - Check if Interested
Unspecified Incidental Labor at Direct Wages Plus Certified Overhead Plus 15% - Check if
Interested

Minimum Total Project for Consideration (See Special Conditions, Section 3) - Enter dollar amount| $ 3,500.00
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