¥ LEXINGTON

Bid 7-2020 Addendum 3
Cortelco LED Lighting
Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 7-2020 Addendum 3
Title: LED Lighting Fixtures
Type: Competitive Bid

Issue Date: 1/7/2020

Deadline: 1/21/2020 02:00 PM (ET)

Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS SOLICITATION
. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE LINE ITEMS TAB ONL
Y. PRICING WITHIN SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED AND M
AY MAKE YOUR BID NON-RESPONSIVE.

Contact Information

Contact: Conni Hayes

Address: Central Purchasing
Government Center Building
Room 338
200 East Main Street
Lexington, KY 40507

Phone:  (859) 2583320

Fax: (859) 2583322

Email: chayes@Ilexingtonky.gov
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Cortelco LED Lighting Information

Contact: Robert Schnabl

Address: 1703 Sawyer Road
Corinth, MS 38834

Phone: (662) 287-5281 x306

Fax: (662) 287-3889
Toll Free: (800) 288-3132
Email: bschnabl@cortelco.com

By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent and bind your company and that you agree
to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

Paul Stacy pstacy@cortelco.com

Signature Email
Submitted at 1/16/2020 1:43:02 PM

Response Attachments

Lexington_7_2020.pdf

Affidavit Workforce analysis form and other LFUCG forms
LexDataSheets.pdf

Data sheets for alternate parts proposed in the bid

Bid Lines

1| 11" ROUND FLUSH MOUNT, 1000LM, 100LPW, 3500-4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, 120VAC, WH, FR, DIM, N/A
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | TOPAZ |
Manufacturer #: | FLUSH MOUNT SERIES |
Item Notes: N/A

2 | 14" ROUND FLUSH MOUNT, 1500LM, 100LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, 120VAC, WH, FR, DIM, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | SYLVANIA |
Manufacturer #: |SURFACER SERIES |

Item Notes: N/A

3 | 1' UNDERCOUNTER, 400LM, 80LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, 120VAC, WH, FR, N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: |FOREST LIGHTING |

Manufacturer #: |T5/T8 INTEGRATED LAMP SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED
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4 | 2' UNDERCOUNTER, 900LM, 80LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, 120VAC, WH, FR, N/A, N/A
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: |FOREST LIGHTING |

Manufacturer #: |T5/T8 INTEGRATED LAMP SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED

5 | 3' UNDERCOUNTER, 1100LM, 80LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, 120VAC, WH, FR, N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |FOREST LIGHTING |

Manufacturer #: |T5/T8 INTEGRATED LAMP SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED

6 | 4 UNDERCOUNTER, 1600LM, 80LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, 120VAC, WH, FR, N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer:  |FOREST LIGHTING |

Manufacturer #: |T5/T8 INTEGRATED LAMP SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED

7 | 2 HO UNDERCOUNTER, 1200LM, 100LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, 120VAC, WH, FR, N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |FOREST LIGHTING |

Manufacturer #: |T5/T8 INTEGRATED LAMP SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED

8 | 4 HO UNDERCOUNTER, 1900LM, 100LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, 120VAC, WH, FR, N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: |FOREST LIGHTING |

Manufacturer #: |T5/T8 INTEGRATED LAMP SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED

9 | 2 ECONOMY WRAP STYLE, 1600LM, 80LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, 120VAC, WH, FR, N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | SATCO/NUVO |

Manufacturer #: |65/10XX WRAP SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED WITH KNOCKOUT

1 [ 2' ECONOMY WRAP STYLE, 3200LM, 80LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, 120VAC, WH, FR, N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | SATCO/NUVO |
Manufacturer #: |65/10XX WRAP SERIES |

Item Notes: DAMP RATED WITH KNOCKOUT
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% 2' STRIP NARROW DISTRIBUTION, 2500LN, 115LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, 0-1
OV DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | LITHONIA |

Manufacturer #: |Z SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED WITH KNOCKOUT

% 4' STRIP NARROW DISTRIBUTION, 5000LM, 115LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, 0-1
OV DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | LITHONIA |

Manufacturer #: |Z SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED WITH KNOCKOUT

% 8' STRIP NARROW DISTRIBUTION, 10000LM, 115LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, O-
10V DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | LITHONIA |

Manufacturer #: |Z SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED WITH KNOCKOUT

411 2' STRIP WIDE DISTRIBUTION, 2500LN, 115LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V DI
M, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | LITHONIA |

Manufacturer #: |Z SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED WITH KNOCKOUT

% 4' STRIP WIDE DISTRIBUTION, 5000LM, 115LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V D
IM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | LITHONIA |

Manufacturer #: |Z SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED WITH KNOCKOUT

f15 8' STRIP WIDE DISTRIBUTION, 10000LM, 115LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V
DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | LITHONIA |

Manufacturer #: |Z SERIES |
Iltem Notes: DAMP RATED WITH KNOCKOUT
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% 2' STRIP NARROW DISTRIBUTION, 2500LN, 115LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, 0-1
OV DIM, EM

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | LITHONIA |

Manufacturer #: |Z SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED WITH KNOCKOUT

% 4' STRIP NARROW DISTRIBUTION, 5000LM, 115LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, 0-1
OV DIM, EM

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | LITHONIA |

Manufacturer #: |Z SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED WITH KNOCKOUT

% 8' STRIP NARROW DISTRIBUTION, 10000LM, 115LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, O-
10V DIM, EM

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | LITHONIA |

Manufacturer #: |Z SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED WITH KNOCKOUT

% 2' STRIP WIDE DISTRIBUTION, 2500LN, 115LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V DI
M, EM

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | LITHONIA |

Manufacturer #: |Z SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED WITH KNOCKOUT

2 | 4 STRIP WIDE DISTRIBUTION, 5000LM, 115LPW, 4000K, 8OCRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V D
1|imEM
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | LITHONIA |

Manufacturer #: |Z SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED WITH KNOCKOUT

% 8' STRIP WIDE DISTRIBUTION, 10000LM, 115LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V
DIM, EM

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | LITHONIA |

Manufacturer #: |Z SERIES |
Iltem Notes: DAMP RATED WITH KNOCKOUT
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24" VAPORTIGHT STRIP, 2800LM, 110LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 75000 L70, UNV 120-277V, GR, FR, 0-10V DIM, N/A
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | SYLVANIA |

Manufacturer #: | LEDVANCE VAPOR2B SERIES |
Item Notes: IP65 RATED

BN

48" VAPORTIGHT STRIP, 4500LM, 115LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 75000 L70, UNV 120-277V, GR, FR, 0-10V DIM, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | SYLVANIA |
Manufacturer #: | LEDVANCE VAPOR2B SERIES |

Item Notes: IP65 RATED

96" VAPORTIGHT STRIP, 8400LM, 130LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 75000 L70, UNV 120-277V, GR, FR, 0-10V DIM, N/A
Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | SYLVANIA |

Manufacturer #: | LEDVANCE VAPOR2B SERIES |
Item Notes: IP65 RATED

24" VAPORTIGHT STRIP W/OCC. & PHOTO SENSOR, 2800LM, 110LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 75000 L70, UNV 120
-277V, GR, FR, 0-10V DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | SYLVANIA |
Manufacturer #: |LEDVANCE VAPORZ2B SERIES |

Item Notes: IP65 RATED

48" VAPORTIGHT STRIP W/OCC. & PHOTO SENSOR, 4500LM, 115LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 75000 L70, UNV 120
-277V, GR, FR, 0-10V DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | SYLVANIA |

Manufacturer #: | LEDVANCE VAPOR2B SERIES |
Item Notes: IP65 RATED

96" VAPORTIGHT STRIP W/OCC. & PHOTO SENSOR, 8400LM, 130LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 75000 L70, UNV 120
-277V, GR, FR, 0-10V DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | SYLVANIA |
Manufacturer #: |LEDVANCE VAPORZ2B SERIES |

Item Notes: IP65 RATED

48" VAPORTIGHT STRIP, 4500LM, 115LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 75000 L70, UNV 120-277V, GR, FR, 0-10V DIM, EM
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | SYLVANIA |

Manufacturer #: | LEDVANCE VAPOR2B SERIES |
Item Notes: IP65 RATED
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3 [ 48" VAPORTIGHT STRIP W/OCC. & PHOTO SENSOR, 4500LM, 115LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 75000 L70, UNV 120
0| -277v, GR, FR, 0-10V DIM, EM

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | SYLVANIA |
Manufacturer #: | LEDVANCE VAPOR2B SERIES |

Item Notes: IP65 RATED

% 1'X4' FLATPANEL TROFFER , 2400LM, 120LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V DIM
, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: No responsel Total:| No response|

Manufacturer: | MULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: ||V|ULT|PLE |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED

Alternate 1

1'X4' FLATPANEL TROFFER, 4680LM, 130LPW, 4000K 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V. WH, FR, 0-10V DIM,
N/A

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.00 | Total: | $4.00 |
Manufacturer:  |Cortelco LED |
Manufacturer #: |DMP71436W4OKAE |

3 | 1'X4' FLATPANEL TROFFER HIGH OUTPUT, 3700LM, 120LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH,
2 | FR, 0-10V DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: $37.89| Total:| $37.89|
Manufacturer: ||\/|ULTIPLE |

Manufacturer # |[MULTIPLE |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED

Alternate 1

1'X4' FLATPANEL TROFFER, 4680LM, 130LPW, 4000K 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V DIM,
NA

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $37.89| Total:l $37.89|

Manufacturer: |C0rtelco LED |
Manufacturer #: |DMP71436W40KAE |

% 2'X2' FLATPANEL TROFFER , 3200LM, 115LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V DIM
, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $37.20| Total:l $37.20|

Manufacturer: | MULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |MULTIPLE |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED
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Alternate 1

2'X2' FLATPANEL TROFFER, 4680LM, 130LPW, 4000K 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V DIM,

NA

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $37.20| Total:l $37.20

Manufacturer: |C0rtelco LED

Manufacturer #: | DMP72236WA40KAE

AW

2'X2' FLATPANEL TROFFER HIGH OUTPUT, 5000LM, 120LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH,
FR, 0-10V DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE

Manufacturer #: |MULTIPLE

Item Notes: DAMP RATED

2'X4' FLATPANEL TROFFER , 4200LM, 115LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V DIM
, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $57.00| Total: | $57.00

Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE

Manufacturer #: | MULTIPLE

Item Notes: DAMP RATED

Alternate 1

2'X4' FLATPANEL TROFFER, 5280LM, 130LPW, 4000K 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V DIM,

NA

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: $57.00| Total:| $57.00

Manufacturer:  |Cortelco LED

Manufacturer #: | DMP72440W40KAE

2'X4' FLATPANEL TROFFER HIGH OUTPUT, 5000LM, 120LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH,
FR, 0-10V DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: $57.00| Total:| $57.00

Manufacturer: ||\/|ULTIPLE

Manufacturer #: | MULTIPLE

Item Notes: DAMP RATED

Alternate 1

2'X4' FLATPANEL TROFFER, 5280LM, 130LPW, 4000K 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V DIM,

NA

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $57.00| Total: | $57.00 |

Manufacturer: |C0rtelco LED

Manufacturer #: | DMP72440WA40KAE
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2'X2' FLATPANEL TROFFER , 3200LM, 115LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V DIM
, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $100.20| Total:l $100.20

Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE

Manufacturer #: |MULTIPLE

Item Notes: DAMP RATED

Alternate 1

2'X2' FLATPANEL TROFFER, 4680LM, 130LPW, 4000K 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V DIM,

N/A + 90 Minute Battery Backup

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA Unit Price: $100.20| Total:l $100.20

Manufacturer: | Cortelco LED

Manufacturer #: |DMP72236WA40KAE + DMPEBC6W

2'X2' FLATPANEL TROFFER HIGH OUTPUT, 5000LM, 120LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH,
FR, 0-10V DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer:  |MULTIPLE

Manufacturer #: |MULTIPLE

Item Notes: DAMP RATED

2'X4' FLATPANEL TROFFER , 4200LM, 115LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V DIM
, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $120.00| Total:| $120.00

Manufacturer: ||\/|ULTIPLE

Manufacturer #: | MULTIPLE

Item Notes: DAMP RATED

Alternate 1

2'X4' FLATPANEL TROFFER, 5280LM, 130LPW, 4000K 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V DIM,

N/A + 90 Minute Battery Backup

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $120.00| Total:l $120.00

Manufacturer: |C0rtelco LED

Manufacturer #: |DMP7244OW4OKAE + DMPEBC6W

oh

2'X4' FLATPANEL TROFFER HIGH OUTPUT, 5000LM, 120LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH,
FR, 0-10V DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $120.00| Total:l $120.00

Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE

Manufacturer #: |MULTIPLE

Item Notes: DAMP RATED
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Alternate 1

2'X4' FLATPANEL TROFFER, 5280LM, 130LPW, 4000K 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V DIM,

N/A + 90 Minute Battery Backup

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $120.00| Total: | $120.00 |

Manufacturer: |C0rtelco LED |
Manufacturer #: |DMP72440W40KAE + DMPEBC6W |

EYN

1'X4' CENTERBASKET STYLE TROFFER, 4000LM, 125LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 75000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, F
R, 0-10V DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |CREE |

Manufacturer #: |ZR SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED

NS

2'X2' CENTERBASKET STYLE TROFFER, 3200LM, 125LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 75000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, F
R, 0-10V DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer:  |CREE |

Manufacturer #: |ZR SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED

2'X2' CENTERBASKET STYLE TROFFER HIGH OUTPUT, 4000LM, 125LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 75000 L70, UNV 1
20-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |CREE |

Manufacturer #: |ZR SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED

BENEN

2'X4' CENTERBASKET STYLE TROFFER, 4000LM, 125LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 75000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, F
R, 0-10V DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: |CREE |

Manufacturer #: |ZR SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED

(G2 [F-N

2'X4' CENTERBASKET STYLE TROFFER HIGH OUTPUT, 5000LM, 125LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 75000 L70, UNV 1
20-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |CREE |

Manufacturer #: |ZR SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED
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o

2'X2' CENTERBASKET STYLE TROFFER, 3200LM, 125LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 75000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, F
R, 0-10V DIM, EM
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |CREE |
Manufacturer #: |ZR SERIES |

Item Notes: DAMP RATED

4 | 2'X2' CENTERBASKET STYLE TROFFER HIGH OUTPUT, 4000LM, 125LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 75000 L70, UNV 1

7 20-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V DIM, EM
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer:  |CREE |
Manufacturer #: |ZR SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED

4 | 2'X4' CENTERBASKET STYLE TROFFER, 4000LM, 125LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 75000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH, F

8 | R, 0-10V DIM, EM
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: |CREE |
Manufacturer #: |ZR SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED

4 | 2'’X4' CENTERBASKET STYLE TROFFER HIGH OUTPUT, 5000LM, 125LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 75000 L70, UNV 1

9 20-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V DIM, EM
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: |CREE |
Manufacturer #: |ZR SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED

8 1'X4' SURFACE MOUNT FRAME/KIT FOR TROFFER, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, WH, N/A, N/A, N/A
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | MULTIPLE |
Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Iltem Notes: N/A

? 2'X2' SURFACE MOUNT FRAME/KIT FOR TROFFER, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, WH, N/A, N/A, N/A
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer:  |MULTIPLE |
Manufacturer #: |VAR|ES |
Item Notes: N/A

g 2'X4' SURFACE MOUNT FRAME/KIT FOR TROFFER, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, WH, N/A, N/A, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $22.39| Total:| $22.39 |
Manufacturer: ||V|ULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |VAR|E5 |
Iltem Notes: N/A
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Alternate 1

2'X4' SURFACE MOUNT FRAME/KIT FOR TROFFER

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $22.39| Total:| $22.39

Manufacturer: | Cortelco LED

Manufacturer #: | DMFP24FK

5 | 14,000LM CLASS LINEAR LOW/HIGHBAY, 14000LM, 125LPW, 4000K, 8OCRI, 100000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH,
3 [ FR, 0-10V DIM, N/A

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |E|KO

Manufacturer #: |LLH SERIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED

21,000LM CLASS LINEAR LOW/HIGHBAY, 21000LM, 125LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 100000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH,
FR, 0-10V DIM, N/A

~O1

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |E|KO

Manufacturer #: | LLH SERIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED

5 | 29,000LM CLASS LINEAR LOW/HIGHBAY, 29000LM, 125LPW, 4000K, 8OCRI, 100000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH,
S [ FR, 0-10V DIM, N/A

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |E|KO

Manufacturer #: |LLH SERIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED

5 | 40,000LM CLASS LINEAR LOW/HIGHBAY, 40000LM, 125LPW, 4000K, 8OCRI, 100000 L70, UNV 120-277V, WH,
6 | FR, 0-10V DIM, N/A

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer:  |EIKO

Manufacturer #: | LLH SERIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED

5 [ 14,000LM CLASS LINEAR LOW/HIGHBAY W/SENSOR, 14000LM, 125LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 100000 L70, UNV 1
7 | 20-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V DIM, N/A

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |E|KO

Manufacturer #: |LLH SERIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED
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5 [ 21,000LM CLASS LINEAR LOW/HIGHBAY W/SENSOR, 21000LM, 125LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 100000 L70, UNV 1
8 | 20-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |E|KO |

Manufacturer #: |LLH SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED

S [ 29,000LM CLASS LINEAR LOW/HIGHBAY W/SENSOR, 29000LM, 125LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 100000 L70, UNV 1
9 [ 20-277V, WH, FR, 0-10V DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: |EIKO |

Manufacturer #: |LLH SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED

6 | 40,000LM CLASS LINEAR LOW/HIGHBAY W/SENSOR, 40000LM, 125LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 100000 L70, UNV 1
0 | 20-277v, WH, FR, 0-10V DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |E|KO |

Manufacturer #: |LLH SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED

6 | EXIT LIGHT FULL SIZE , N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, UNV 120-277V, WH, RED, N/A, EM
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer:  |LITHONIA |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: NFPA & OSHA COMPLAINT 1 YEAR WARRANTY

6 | EXIT LIGHT FULL SIZE - REMOTE CAPABLE, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, UNV 120-277V, WH, RED, N/A, EM
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | LITHONIA |

Manufacturer #: |VAR|ES |
Item Notes: NFPA & OSHA COMPLAINT 1 YEAR WARRANTY

6 | EXIT LIGHT COMPACT, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, UNV 120-277V, WH, RED, N/A, EM
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |L|THON|/-\ |
Manufacturer #: |CONTRACTOR SELECT SERIES |

Item Notes: NFPA & OSHA COMPLAINT 1 YEAR WARRANTY

6 | EXIT LIGHT COMBO FULL SIZE, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, UNV 120-277V, WH, RED, N/A, EM
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | LITHONIA |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Iltem Notes: NFPA & OSHA COMPLAINT 1 YEAR WARRANTY
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g EXIT LIGHT COMBO FULL SIZE - REMOTE CAPABLE, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, UNV 120-277V, WH, RED, N/A,
EM
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | LITHONIA |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
ltem Notes: NFPA & OSHA COMPLAINT 1 YEAR WARRANTY

6 | EXIT LIGHT COMBO COMPACT, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, UNV 120-277V, WH, RED, N/A, EM
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |L|THON|A |
Manufacturer #: |CONTRACTOR SELECT SERIES |

Item Notes: NFPA & OSHA COMPLAINT 1 YEAR WARRANTY

6 | EMERGENCY LIGHT FULL SIZE, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, UNV 120-277V, WH, N/A, N/A, EM
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | LITHONIA |

Manufacturer #: |VAR|E5 |
Item Notes: NFPA & OSHA COMPLAINT 1 YEAR WARRANTY

563 EMERGENCY LIGHT FULL SIZE - REMOTE CAPABLE, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, UNV 120-277V, WH, N/A, N/A, E
M
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer:  |LITHONIA |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: NFPA & OSHA COMPLAINT 1 YEAR WARRANTY

6 | EMERGENCY LIGHT COMPACT, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, UNV 120-277V, WH, N/A, N/A, EM
Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | LITHONIA |

Manufacturer #: |CONTRACTOR SELECT SERIES |
Item Notes: NFPA & OSHA COMPLAINT 1 YEAR WARRANTY

(7) EMERGENCY LIGHT REMOTE HEAD SINGLE, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, UNV 120-277V, WH OR GR, N/A, N/A, E
M
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | LITHONIA |

Manufacturer #: |VAR|ES |
Item Notes: NFPA & OSHA COMPLAINT 1 YEAR WARRANTY

7 | SMALL/MINI WALLPACK , 1700LM, 100LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, 120VAC, BZ, CL OR FR, N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |TOPAZ |
Manufacturer #: |WPS SERIES |

Item Notes: OUTDOOR/WET RATED
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Z SMALL/MINI WALLPACK W/PHOTO, 1700LM, 100LPW, 5000K, 70CRI, 50000 L70, 120VAC, BZ, CL OR FR, N/A
, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: |TOPAZ |
Manufacturer #: |WPS SERIES |

Item Notes: OUTDOOR/WET RATED

7 | SMALL/MINI WALLPACK , 1700LM, 100LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ, CL OR FR, N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | SYLVANIA |

Manufacturer #: | SMWLPAK SERIES |
Item Notes: OUTDOOR/WET RATED

Z SMALL/MINI WALLPACK W/PHOTO, 1700LM, 100LPW, 5000K, 70CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ, CLOR F
R, N/A, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | SYLVANIA |

Manufacturer #: |SMWLPAK SERIES |
Item Notes: OUTDOOR/WET RATED

7 | 3300LM WALLPACK, 3300LM, 110LPW, 5000K, 70CRI, 100000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ, CL OR FR, N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | SYLVANIA |
Manufacturer #: | NON-CUTOFF SERIES WALPAK |

Item Notes: OUTDOOR/WET RATED

g 3300LM WALLPACK W/PHOTOCELL, 3300LM, 110LPW, 5000K, 70CRI, 100000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ, CL O
R FR, N/A, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | SYLVANIA |

Manufacturer #: | NON-CUTOFF SERIES WALPAK |
Item Notes: OUTDOOR/WET RATED

7 | 5300LM WALLPACK , 5300LM, 110LPW, 5000K, 70CRI, 100000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ, CL OR FR, N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |SYLVANIA |
Manufacturer #: |NON-CUTOFF SERIES WALPAK |

Item Notes: OUTDOOR/WET RATED
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g 5300LM WALLPACK W/PHOTOCELL, 5300LM, 110LPW, 5000K, 70CRI, 100000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ, CL O
R FR, N/A, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | SYLVANIA |
Manufacturer #: | NON-CUTOFF SERIES WALPAK |

Item Notes: OUTDOOR/WET RATED

7 | 8600LM WALLPACK, 8600LM, 110LPW, 5000K, 70CRI, 100000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ, CL OR FR, N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | SYLVANIA |

Manufacturer #: | NON-CUTOFF SERIES WALPAK |
Item Notes: OUTDOOR/WET RATED

8 8600LM WALLPACK W/PHOTOCELL, 8600LM, 110LPW, 5000K, 70CRI, 100000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ, CL O
R FR, N/A, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | SYLVANIA |

Manufacturer #: | NON-CUTOFF SERIES WALPAK |
Item Notes: OUTDOOR/WET RATED

8 | TWO HEAD SPOT/FLOOD W/PHOTO , 1700LM, 90LPW, 4000K, 70CRI, 25000 L70, 120VAC, BZ OR WH, CL
1| ORFR, N/A, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer:  |MULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: DLC NOT REQ. 1 YR WARRANTY

8 | TWO HEAD SPOT/FLOOD W/PHOTO & MOTION SENSOR, 1700LM, 90LPW, 4000K, 70CRI, 25000 L70, 120
2 [ VAC, BZ OR WH, CL OR FR, N/A, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: ||\/|ULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |VAR|ES |
Item Notes: DLC NOT REQ. 1 YR WARRANTY

8 | SMALL FLOOD 1/2" NPT KNUCKLE MOUNT, 1500LM, 110LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ,
3 [CLORFR, N/A, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $21.00| Total: | $21.00 |
Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: IP65 RATED
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Alternate 1

SMALL FLOOD 1/2" NPT KNUCKLE MOUNT, 1500LM, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ, CL OR FR

N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $21.00| Total:l $21.00|

Manufacturer: |C0rtelco LED |
Manufacturer #: |FD15W27V50KBDB77KN |

OO

SMALL FLOOD YOKE OR TRUNION MOUNT, 1500LM, 110LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ,
CL OR FR, N/A, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $21.00| Total:l $21.00|

Manufacturer: | MULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: IP65 RATED

Alternate 1

SMALL FLOOD 1/2" NPT TRUNNION MOUNT, 1500LM, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V,BZ, CL OR F

R, N/A. N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $21.00| Total:l $21.00|

Manufacturer: | Cortelco LED |
Manufacturer #: |FD15W27V50KBDB77TR |

SMALL FLOOD 1/2" NPT KNUCKLE MOUNT, 3200LM, 110LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ,
CL OR FR, N/A, N/A
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer:  |MULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: IP65 RATED

SMALL FLOOD YOKE OR TRUNION MOUNT, 3200LM, 110LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ,
CL OR FR, N/A, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: ||V|ULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |VAR|ES |
Item Notes: IP65 RATED

SMALL FLOOD 1/2" NPT KNUCKLE MOUNT, 6000LM, 110LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ,
CL OR FR, N/A, N/A
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer:  |MULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: | VARIES |
Item Notes: IP65 RATED
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8 | SMALL FLOOD YOKE OR TRUNION MOUNT, 6000LM, 110LPW, 5000K, 8OCRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ,
8 [ CLORFR, N/A, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | MULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: IP65 RATED

8 | MEDIUM FLOOD KNUCKLE MOUNT, 8000LM, 110LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ, CL OR
9 [ FR, DIM, N/A
Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | MULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: IP65 RATED

8 MEDIUM FLOOD YOKE OR TRUNION, 8000LM, 110LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ, CL O
R FR, DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | MULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: IP65 RATED

% MEDIUM FLOOD 2 3/8" SLIPFITTER, 8000LM, 110LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ, CL OR
FR, DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: IP65 RATED

g MEDIUM FLOOD KNUCKLE MOUNT, 12000LM, 110LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ, CL OR
FR, DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | MULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: IP65 RATED

g MEDIUM FLOOD YOKE OR TRUNION, 12000LM, 110LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ, CL O
R FR, DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: IP65 RATED
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~O

MEDIUM FLOOD 2 3/8" SLIPFITTER, 12000LM, 110LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ, CL OR
FR, DIM, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | MULTIPLE |
Manufacturer #: |VARIES |

Item Notes: IP65 RATED
9 | LARGE FLOOD KNUCKLE MOUNT, 17900LM, 110LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ, CL OR
S | FR, N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE |
Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: IP65 RATED
9 | LARGE FLOOD YOKE OR TRUNION, 17900LM, 110LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ, CL O
6 |RFR, N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE |
Manufacturer #: | VARIES |
Item Notes: IP65 RATED
9 | LARGE FLOOD 2 3/8" SLIPFITTER, 17900LM, 110LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, BZ, CL OR
7| FR, N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE |
Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: IP65 RATED
9 | TYPE 3 AREA LIGHT W/PHOTO AND BRACKET, 14000LM, 140LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V
8|, Bz, CLORFR, N/A, N/A
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE |
Manufacturer #: | VARIES |
Item Notes: SHOEBOX REPLACEMENT
9 | TYPE 3 AREA LIGHT W/PHOTO AND 2 3/8" SLIPFITTER MOUNT, 14000LM, 140LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L7
9 0, UNV 120-277V, BZ, CL OR FR, N/A, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Iltem Notes: SHOEBOX REPLACEMENT
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TYPE 3 AREA LIGHT W/PHOTO AND BRACKET, 20000LM, 140LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V
, BZ, CL OR FR, N/A, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | MULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
ltem Notes: SHOEBOX REPLACEMENT

ROR

TYPE 3 AREA LIGHT W/PHOTO AND 2 3/8" SLIPFITTER MOUNT, 20000LM, 140LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L7
0, UNV 120-277V, BZ, CL OR FR, N/A, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | MULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: SHOEBOX REPLACEMENT

NOPRF

TYPE 3 AREA LIGHT W/PHOTO AND BRACKET, 26000LM, 140LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V
, BZ, CL OR FR, N/A, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | MULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
ltem Notes: SHOEBOX REPLACEMENT

WOor

TYPE 3 AREA LIGHT W/PHOTO AND 2 3/8" SLIPFITTER MOUNT, 26000LM, 140LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L7
0, UNV 120-277V, BZ, CL OR FR, N/A, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: ||V|ULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: SHOEBOX REPLACEMENT

~OPF

TYPE 3 AREA LIGHT W/PHOTO AND BRACKET, 14000LM, 140LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, 480VAC, BZ,
CL OR FR, N/A, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | MULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
ltem Notes: SHOEBOX REPLACEMENT

U010k

TYPE 3 AREA LIGHT W/PHOTO AND 2 3/8" SLIPFITTER MOUNT, 14000LM, 140LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L7
0, 480VAC, BZ, CL OR FR, N/A, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: ||V|ULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Iltem Notes: SHOEBOX REPLACEMENT
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OO

TYPE 3 AREA LIGHT W/PHOTO AND BRACKET, 20000LM, 140LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, 480VAC, BZ,
CL OR FR, N/A, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE

Manufacturer #: |VARIES

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Iltem Notes: SHOEBOX REPLACEMENT

1 [ TYPE 3 AREA LIGHT W/PHOTO AND 2 3/8" SLIPFITTER MOUNT, 20000LM, 140LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L7

9 0, 480VAC, BZ, CL OR FR, N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: ||V|ULTIPLE |
Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: SHOEBOX REPLACEMENT

1 | TYPE 3 AREA LIGHT W/PHOTO AND BRACKET, 26000LM, 140LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, 480VAC, BZ,

g CL ORFR, N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer:  |MULTIPLE |
Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Iltem Notes: SHOEBOX REPLACEMENT

1 [ TYPE 3 AREA LIGHT W/PHOTO AND 2 3/8" SLIPFITTER MOUNT, 26000LM, 140LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L7

8 0, 480VAC, BZ, CL OR FR, N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: ||V|ULTIPLE |
Manufacturer #: |VAR|ES |
Item Notes: SHOEBOX REPLACEMENT

1 | 6" RECESSED DOWNLIGHT RETROFIT , 700LM, 70LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, 120VAC, WH, FR, DIM,

% N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | SYLVANIA |
Manufacturer #: |RT 5/6 SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED

1 [ 6" RECESSED DOWNLIGHT RETROFIT HIGH OUTPUT, 900LM, 70LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, 120VAC,

% WH, FR, DIM, N/A

Manufacturer: | SYLVANIA

Manufacturer #: |RT 5/6 SERIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED
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N

6" RECESSED DOWNLIGHT RETROFIT GIMBALL, 700LM, 70LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, 120VAC, WH, F
R, DIM, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |SYLVANIA |
Manufacturer #: |RT 5/6 SERIES |

Item Notes: N/A

1 [ 6" RECESSED DOWNLIGHT RETROFIT HIGH OUTPUT GIMBALL, 900LM, 70LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70,

% 120VAC, WH, FR, DIM, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | SYLVANIA |
Manufacturer #: |RT 5/6 SERIES |
Item Notes: N/A

1 [ 10' GRIPPLE Y FIT HANGER PAIR/2PACK, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A

}1 Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | MULTIPLE |
Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: 100# WORKING LOAD RATED

1 [ PHOTOCELL 1/2" CONDUIT MOUNTING, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, 120VAC, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A

% Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | TORK |
Manufacturer #: |2000/2001 SERIES |
Item Notes: N/A

1 | PHOTOCELL 1/2" CONDUIT MOUNTING SWIVEL, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, 120VAC, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A

(15 Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | TORK |
Manufacturer #: |2000/2001 SERIES |
Item Notes: N/A

1 | MOTION AND PHOTO SENSOR INDOOR - LINE VOLTAGE, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, UNV 120-277V, WH, N/A, O

% -10V DIM, N/A
Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer:  |ACUITY |
Manufacturer #: |LSXR SERIES |
Item Notes: MULTI - LENS PACK INCLUDED

1 [ SINGLE POLE PIR OCC/VAC SENSOR SWITCH 2A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, 120VAC, IV, N/A, N/A, N/A

% Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |LUTRON |
Manufacturer #: |MAESTRO SERIES MS-OPS2 |
ltem Notes: INCD, CFL, LED, FLOURESCENT

Page 22 of 30 pages Vendor: Cortelco LED Lighting Bid 7-2020 Addendum 3




©ORrF

SINGLE POLE PIR OCC/VAC SENSOR 3-WAY SWITCH 5A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, 120VAC, IV, N/A, N/A, N/A

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | LUTRON |
Manufacturer #: ||\/|AESTRO SERIES MS-OPS5 |

Item Notes: INCD, CFL, LED, FLOURESCENT

1 [ SINGLE POLE PIR OCC/VAC SENSOR 3-WAY SWITCH 6A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, UNV 120-277V, IV, N/A, N/A

(2) , N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: |LUTRON |
Manufacturer #: |MAESTRO SERIES MS-OPS6M |
Item Notes: INCD, CFL, LED, FLOURESCENT

1 [ SINGLE POLE PIR OCC/VAC SENSOR 3-WAY SWITCH 6A W/NEUTRAL, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, UNV 120-27

% 7V, IV, NIA, N/A, N/A
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: |LUTRON |
Manufacturer #: ||\/|AESTRO SERIES MS-OPS6M2 |
Item Notes: INCD, CFL, LED, FLOURESCENT

1 [ SINGLE POLE DIMMER 3-WAY SWITCH 8A W/NEUTRAL, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, UNV 120-277V, IV, N/A, DIM,

% N/A
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: |LUTRON |
Manufacturer #: |MAESTRO SERIES DVSTV |
Item Notes: INCD, CFL, LED, FLOURESCENT

1 | SINGLE POLE DIMMER 3-WAY SWITCH 150-600W, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, 120VAC, IV, N/A, DIM, N/A

% Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | LUTRON |
Manufacturer #: | MAESTRO/DIVA SERIES MACL-153M/DVCL-153P |
Item Notes: INCD, CFL, LED, FLOURESCENT

% SINGLE POLE PIR OCC/VAC 3-WAY SWITCH 8A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, UNV 120-277V, IV, N/A, 0-10V DIM, N/
A

4

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | LUTRON |
Manufacturer #: | MAESTRO SERIES MS-Z101 |

Item Notes: INCD, CFL, LED, FLOURESCENT
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OINEF~

12'5" SQUARE ALLUMINUM LIGHT POLE 0.188 MIN. THICKNESS, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, BZ OR BK, N/A
, N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | MULTIPLE |
Manufacturer #: |VARIES |

Item Notes: TOP CAP AND HAND HOLE COVER INCLUDED
1(16'5" SQUARE ALLUMINUM LIGHT POLE 0.188 MIN. THICKNESS, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, BZ OR BK, N/A
% , N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | MULTIPLE |
Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: TOP CAP AND HAND HOLE COVER INCLUDED
1| 20'5" SQUARE ALLUMINUM LIGHT POLE 0.188 MIN. THICKNESS, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A, BZ OR BK, N/A
% , N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | MULTIPLE |
Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: TOP CAP AND HAND HOLE COVER INCLUDED
1 [ CORNCOB MOGUL/ E39 NO BALLAST 125W EQUIVILENT , 3500LM, 130LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UN
523 V 120-277V, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | EIKO |
Manufacturer #: | LITESPANLED SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED - UNIVERSAL MOUNT POSITION
1 | CORNCOB MOGUL/ E39 NO BALLAST 150W EQUIVILENT , 4700LM, 130LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UN
s V 120-277V, NIA, N/TA, N/A, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: | EIKO |
Manufacturer #: | LITESPANLED SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED - UNIVERSAL MOUNT POSITION
1 [ CORNCOB MOGUL/ E39 NO BALLAST 175W EQUIVILENT , 5800LM, 130LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UN
8 V 120-277V, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer:  |EIKO |
Manufacturer #: | LITESPANLED SERIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED - UNIVERSAL MOUNT POSITION
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CORNCOB MOGUL/ E39 NO BALLAST 200W EQUIVILENT , 7000LM, 130LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UN
V 120-277V, NIA, N/A, N/A, N/A

PWE

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: No response| Total:l No response

Manufacturer:  |EIKO

Manufacturer #: | LITESPANLED SERIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED - UNIVERSAL MOUNT POSITION

Alternate 1

CORNLAMP E39 8600LM 4000K

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $60.11| Total:l $60.11

Manufacturer:  |Cortelco LED

Manufacturer #: |NSWLC60WO01

CORNCOB MOGUL/ E39 NO BALLAST 300-400W EQUIVILENT , 10000LM, 130LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L7
0, UNV 120-277V, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A

NWEF

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer:  |EIKO

Manufacturer #: | LITESPANLED SERIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED - UNIVERSAL MOUNT POSITION

CORNCOB MOGUL/ E39 NO BALLAST 300-400W EQUIVILENT , 13000LM, 130LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L7
0, UNV 120-277V, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A

wWwwrE

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |EIKO

Manufacturer #: | LITESPANLED SERIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED - UNIVERSAL MOUNT POSITION

CORNCOB MOGUL/ E39 NO BALLAST 600W EQUIVILENT , 15500LM, 130LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, U
NV 120-277V, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A

~rWE

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer:  |EIKO

Manufacturer #: | LITESPANLED SERIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED - UNIVERSAL MOUNT POSITION

CORNCOB MOGUL/ E39 NO BALLAST 125W EQUIVILENT , 3500LM, 130LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UN
V 120-277V, NIA, N/A, N/A, N/A

gwRE

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |EIKO

Manufacturer #: | LITESPANLED SERIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED - UNIVERSAL MOUNT POSITION
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CORNCOB MOGUL/ E39 NO BALLAST 150W EQUIVILENT , 4700LM, 130LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UN
V 120-277V, NIA, N/A, N/A, N/A

oW

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |EIKO

Manufacturer #: | LITESPANLED SERIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED - UNIVERSAL MOUNT POSITION

CORNCOB MOGUL/ E39 NO BALLAST 175W EQUIVILENT , 5800LM, 130LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UN
V 120-277V, NIA, N/A, N/A, N/A

~we

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |EIKO

Manufacturer #: | LITESPANLED SERIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED - UNIVERSAL MOUNT POSITION

CORNCOB MOGUL/ E39 NO BALLAST 200W EQUIVILENT , 7000LM, 130LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UN
V 120-277V, NIA, N/A, N/A, N/A

cowrR

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: No response| Total:l No response

Manufacturer:  |EIKO

Manufacturer #: | LITESPANLED SERIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED - UNIVERSAL MOUNT POSITION

Alternate 1

CORNLAMP E39 8600LM 5000K

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $60.11| Total:l $60.11

Manufacturer: | Cortelco LED

Manufacturer #: |NSWLC60WO01

CORNCOB MOGUL/ E39 NO BALLAST 300-400W EQUIVILENT , 10000LM, 130LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L7
0, UNV 120-277V, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A

Wk

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer:  |EIKO

Manufacturer #: | LITESPANLED SERIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED - UNIVERSAL MOUNT POSITION

CORNCOB MOGUL/ E39 NO BALLAST 300-400W EQUIVILENT , 13000LM, 130LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L7
0, UNV 120-277V, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A

onpP

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |EIKO

Manufacturer #: | LITESPANLED SERIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED - UNIVERSAL MOUNT POSITION
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N

CORNCOB MOGUL/ E39 NO BALLAST 600W EQUIVILENT , 15500LM, 130LPW, 5000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, U
NV 120-277V, N/A, N/A, N/A, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |EIKO

Manufacturer #: | LITESPANLED SERIES

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

ltem Notes: DAMP RATED - UNIVERSAL MOUNT POSITION

1 | A19 OR A21 MEDIUM/E26 60W EQUIVELANT, 800LM, 90LPW, 3000K, 80CRI, 15000 L70, 120VAC, N/A, CL OR

421 FR, DIM, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: ||V|ULTIPLE |
Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
ltem Notes: IN/OUTDOOR RATED ENERGYSTAR OR DLC

1 | A19 OR A21 MEDIUM/E26 75W EQUIVELANT, 1100LM, 90LPW, 3000K, 80CRI, 15000 L70, 120VAC, N/A, CL O

g R FR, DIM, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: ||\/|ULT|PLE |
Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
ltem Notes: IN/OUTDOOR RATED ENERGYSTAR OR DLC

1 | A19 OR A21 MEDIUM/E26 100W EQUIVELANT, 1600LM, 90LPW, 3000K, 80CRI, 15000 L70, 120VAC, N/A, CL

2 OR FR, DIM, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer:  |MULTIPLE |
Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
ltem Notes: IN/OUTDOOR RATED ENERGYSTAR OR DLC

1 | A19 OR A21 MEDIUM/E26 60W EQUIVELANT, 800LM, 90LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 15000 L70, 120VAC, N/A, CL OR

é’ FR, DIM, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2.50| Total: | $2.50 |
Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE |
Manufacturer #: |VAR|ES |
ltem Notes: IN/OUTDOOR RATED ENERGYSTAR OR DLC

1 | A19 OR A21 MEDIUM/E26 75W EQUIVELANT, 1100LM, 90LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 15000 L70, 120VAC, N/A, CL O

g R FR, DIM, N/A

Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE

Manufacturer #: |VAR|ES

Item Notes: IN/OUTDOOR RATED ENERGYSTAR OR DLC
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A19 OR A21 MEDIUM/E26 100W EQUIVELANT, 1600LM, 90LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 15000 L70, 120VAC, N/A, CL
OR FR, DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE

Manufacturer #: |VARIES

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Item Notes: IN/OUTDOOR RATED ENERGYSTAR OR DLC
1 [ CANDELABRA E12 40W EQUIVELANT FLAME OR ROUND TIP, 400LM, 100LPW, 2700-3000K, 80CRI, 15000 L
g 70, 120VAC, N/A, CL OR FR, DIM, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer:  |MULTIPLE |
Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: IN/OUTDOOR RATED ENERGYSTAR OR DLC
1 | BR30 MEDIUM/E26 65W EQUIVILENT, 850LM, 73LPW, 2700-3000K, 80CRI, 25000 L70, 120VAC, N/A, CLOR F
g R, DIM, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE |
Manufacturer #: | VARIES |
Item Notes: IN/OUTDOOR RATED ENERGYSTAR OR DLC
1 [ BR30 MEDIUM/E26 65W EQUIVILENT, 850LM, 73LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 25000 L70, 120VAC, N/A, CL OR FR, DI
8 M, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: ||V|ULTIPLE |
Manufacturer #: |VAR|ES |
Item Notes: IN/OUTDOOR RATED ENERGYSTAR OR DLC
1 | 48" Linear LED Tube - NO BALLAST , 2100LM, 120LPW, 3500K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, N/A, CL OR
? FR, DIM, N/A
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE |
Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED
1 196" Linear LED Tube - NO BALLAST , 4400LM, 120LPW, 3500K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, N/A, CL OR
g FR, DIM, N/A

Manufacturer: ||V|ULTIPLE

Manufacturer #: |VARIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED
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48" Linear LED Tube - NO BALLAST , 2100LM, 120LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, N/A, CL OR
FR, DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE

Manufacturer #: |VARIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED

I

96" Linear LED Tube - NO BALLAST , 4400LM, 120LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, N/A, CL OR
FR, DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE

Manufacturer #: |VARIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED

o101

48" Linear LED Tube - BALLAST COMPATIBLE , 2100LM, 120LPW, 3500K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, N
/A, CL OR FR, DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE

Manufacturer #: |VARIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED

o o1

96" Linear LED Tube - BALLAST COMPATIBLE , 4400LM, 120LPW, 3500K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, N
/A, CLOR FR, DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE

Manufacturer #: |VARIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED

~ o=

48" Linear LED Tube - BALLAST COMPATIBLE , 2100LM, 120LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, N
/A, CL OR FR, DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE

Manufacturer #: | VARIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED

(oclal )

96" Linear LED Tube - BALLAST COMPATIBLE , 4400LM, 120LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70, UNV 120-277V, N
/A, CLOR FR, DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: |MULTIPLE

Manufacturer #: |VARIES

Item Notes: DAMP RATED
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G23/GX23 PL LAMP 13W CFL EQUIVILENT BALLAST COMPATIBLE, 700LM, 95LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70
, UNV 120-277V, N/A, CL OR FR, DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | MULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED

(@lep)

G24/GX24 PL LAMP 26W CFL EQUIVILENT BALLAST COMPATIBLE, 900LM, 95LPW, 4000K, 80CRI, 50000 L70
, UNV 120-277V, N/A, CL OR FR, DIM, N/A

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: | MULTIPLE |

Manufacturer #: |VARIES |
Item Notes: DAMP RATED

Response Total: $596.18
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