
Bid 130-2023

Vogelpohl Fire Equipment

Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 130-2023
Title: Emergency Fire Equipment
Type: Competitive Bid
Issue Date: 10/25/2023
Deadline: 11/8/2023 02:00 PM (ET)
Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS

SOLICITATION. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE LINE
ITEMS TAB ONLY. PRICING WITHIN SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE
ACCEPTED AND MAY MAKE YOUR BID NON-RESPONSIVE. 
ONCE YOU HAVE COMPLETED AND UPLOADED YOUR BID
PACKAGE, YOU WILL NEED TO CLICK ON "YES" UNDER THE
ATTRIBUTES TAB.

Contact Information

Contact: Jessica Allinder
Address: Central Purchasing

Government Center Building
200 East Main Street
Lexington 40507

Email: jallinder@lexingtonky.gov
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Vogelpohl Fire Equipment Information

Address: 2770 Circleport Dr.
Erlanger, KY 41018

Phone: (859) 282-1000
Fax: (859) 282-1550

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED! By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent
and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached
bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

Kyle Leidy kylel@vogelpohlfire.com
Signature Email

Submitted at 11/8/2023 08:59:18 AM (ET)

Response Attachments

Lexington Equipment RFP.pdf

Completed RFP
Lexington Equipment Bid.pdf

Detailed Equipment Proposal

Bid Attributes

1 Bid package

Have you completed and attached your bid package?  This is a contractual agreement and required for all bids.
 YES 

Bid Lines

1 2-Fly 35' Extension Ladder

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,206.21 Total: $1,206.21

Manufacturer: DUO-Safety

Manufacturer #: 1200-A
Supplier Notes: *DOES NOT INCLUDE FREIGHT

2 3-Fly 35' Extension Ladder

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,287.00 Total: $1,287.00

Manufacturer: DUO-Safety

Manufacturer #: 1225-A
Supplier Notes: *DOES NOT INCLUDE FREIGHT
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3 2-Fly 28' Extension Ladder

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $951.67 Total: $951.67

Manufacturer: DUO-Safety

Manufacturer #: 1200-A
Supplier Notes: *DOES NOT INCLUDE FREIGHT

4 16' Roof Ladders

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $426.14 Total: $426.14

Manufacturer: DUO-Safety

Manufacturer #: 875-A
Supplier Notes: *DOES NOT INCLUDE FREIGHT

5 10' Folding Attic Ladder

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $258.83 Total: $258.83

Manufacturer: DUO-Safety

Manufacturer #: 585-A
Supplier Notes: *DOES NOT INCLUDE FREIGHT

6 12' FRESNO Extension Ladder w/ safety shoes

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $520.52 Total: $520.52

Manufacturer: DUO-Safety

Manufacturer #: 12-701
Supplier Notes: *DOES NOT INCLUDE FREIGHT

7 10' Parapet Ladder w/ Double Hooks

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $300.30 Total: $300.30

Manufacturer: DUO-Safety

Manufacturer #: 725-AR
Supplier Notes: *DOES NOT INCLUDE FREIGHT

8 12' Pike Poles "I" Beam Pole

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $90.77 Total: $90.77

Manufacturer: Fire Hooks Unlimited
Supplier Notes: LEATHERHEAD TOOLS

9 10' Pike Poles "I" Beam Pole

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $85.94 Total: $85.94

Manufacturer: Fire Hooks Unlimited
Supplier Notes: LEATHERHEAD TOOLS
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1
0

8' Pike Poles "I" Beam Pole

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $78.69 Total: $78.69

Manufacturer: Fire Hooks Unlimited
Supplier Notes: LEATHERHEAD TOOLS

1
1

6' New York Hook w/ Boston Rake

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $117.30 Total: $117.30

Manufacturer: Fire Hooks Unlimited

1
2

6' New York Hooks w/ Prying Ends

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $111.35 Total: $111.35

Manufacturer: Fire Hooks Unlimited
Supplier Notes: LEATHERHEAD TOOLS

1
3

6' LA Trash Hook (Arson Trash Hook / D Handle)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $131.10 Total: $131.10

Manufacturer: Fire Hooks Unlimited

1
4

3' D-Handle Closet Hook (National Hook/D Handle)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $89.62 Total: $89.62
Supplier Notes: They start at 4' in length. Quoted LEATHERHEAD TOOLS

1
5

6' LA Trash Hook (Arson Trash Hook / D Handle)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $131.10 Total: $131.10

Manufacturer: Nupla Hook

1
6

16" Smoke Ejector (Electric)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,531.63 Total: $1,531.63

Manufacturer: Tempest

Manufacturer #: EBS-16-EP

1
7

Smoke Ejector Hanger

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $311.71 Total: $311.71

Manufacturer: Tempest
Supplier Notes: TEMPEST #300-141 DOOR BAR HOLDER

1
8

Smoke Ejector Hooks

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $42.61 Total: $42.61

Manufacturer: Tempest
Supplier Notes: TEMPEST #300-142 HANGING BRACKET FOR SMOKE EJECTOR
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1
9

Smoke Ejector Ventilation Tube Adapter

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $128.57 Total: $128.57

Manufacturer: Tempest

Manufacturer #: 725-042
Supplier Notes: LOOKS LIKE PN CHANGED TO #727-177

2
0

Smoke Ejector Ventilation Tube (15' duct)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $33.64 Total: $33.64

Manufacturer: Tempest

Manufacturer #: 725-029
Supplier Notes: LOOKS LIKE PN CHANGED TO #725-004

2
1

Electric PPV Fan (Variable Speed Drive)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2,901.80 Total: $2,901.80

Manufacturer: Tempest

Manufacturer #: 700-452B
Supplier Notes: THEY NO LONGER OFFER THIS MODEL. QUOTED PN 910-1420 VS-18-R-2.0

2
2

Gas PPV Fan

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2,987.01 Total: $2,987.01

Manufacturer: Tempest

Manufacturer #: 700-021
Supplier Notes: THEY NO LONGER OFFER THIS MODEL. QUOTED PN 910-1040 BD-21-H-5.5

2
3

Electric PPV Fan-Battery 20"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4,125.00 Total: $4,125.00

Manufacturer: SuperVac

Manufacturer #: V20-BL-SP

2
4

Electric PPV Fan-Battery 18"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3,927.00 Total: $3,927.00

Manufacturer: SuperVac

Manufacturer #: V18-BL-SP

2
5

Res Q Jack Struts

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $13,628.36 Total: $13,628.36

Manufacturer: RES-Q-JACK

Manufacturer #: STX-4PTX
Supplier Notes: STX-4PTX IS THE STEEL X MODEL. THIS IS AN ANTIQUATED MODEL THAT IS RARELY SOLD.

QUOTED THE NEWER APEX MODEL. PN APX-4PTX
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2
6

Res Q Jack jack stands

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.00 Total: $0.00

Manufacturer: RES-Q-JACK

Manufacturer #: RJ3-JKST
Supplier Notes: THEY NO LONGER OFFER THE RJ3 SERIES EQUIPMENT. NO BID

2
7

5.4 T Airbag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: Paratech

Manufacturer #: KPI-5 MaxForce 10"x10"

2
8

25.6 T Airbag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: Paratech

Manufacturer #: KPI-22 MaxForce 20"x20"

2
9

38.0 T Airbag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: Paratech

Manufacturer #: KPI-32 MaxForce 24"x25"

3
0

Airbag Controller Kit

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: Paratech

Manufacturer #: 22-890351G2-150

3
1

Air Chisel Kit

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,722.72 Total: $1,722.72

Manufacturer: Ajax Tools

Manufacturer #: 811RK

3
2

Battery Powered Windshield Cutter

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $641.84 Total: $641.84

Manufacturer: Rhino

Manufacturer #: RWC-2-SOFT

3
3

Portable Floodlights (20k lumen 220 watts)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,227.74 Total: $1,227.74

Manufacturer: Akron

Manufacturer #: ELSS-XLAC
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3
4

Portable floodlight battery (15k lumen)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $934.08 Total: $934.08

Manufacturer: FRC

Manufacturer #: Spectra Mobile SPM710

3
5

Live Cord Reels (200' 12/3)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: Akron

Manufacturer #: ECRP-15

3
6

Junction Boxes

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: Akron

Manufacturer #: EJBX

3
7

Junction Box (w/ 5.15 pigtail)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: Akron

Manufacturer #: EJBX

3
8

Large Ladder Belts (blue w/ lanyard)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $251.99 Total: $251.99

Manufacturer: CMC

Manufacturer #: 202442
Supplier Notes: CMC LADDER BELTS ARE SIZES AS FOLLOWING: SM/MD, LG/XL, XXL AND ONLY COME IN

RED COLOR

3
9

XL Ladder Belts (yellow w/ lanyard)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $251.99 Total: $251.99

Manufacturer: CMC

Manufacturer #: 202444

4
0

XXL Ladder Belts (red w/ lanyard)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $251.99 Total: $251.99

Manufacturer: CMC

Manufacturer #: 202446

4
1

200' x 7/16" static kernmantle utility rope

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $224.25 Total: $224.25

Manufacturer: Bluewater

Manufacturer #: 534720 YEBL
Supplier Notes: QUOTED RESCUETECH
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4
2

300' x 7/16" static kernmantle Life Safety Rope (red in color)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $362.25 Total: $362.25

Manufacturer: Bluewater

Manufacturer #: 534730 RDYE
Supplier Notes: QUOTED RESCUETECH

4
3

300 x 7/16" static kernmantle Life Safety Rope (blue in color)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $362.25 Total: $362.25

Manufacturer: Bluewater

Manufacturer #: 534730 BLYE

4
4

100' x 6.8mm Heat Resistant Aramid Rope

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $144.00 Total: $144.00

4
5

75' x 3/8" Polypropolene Water Rescue Rope

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $25.20 Total: $25.20

4
6

Rescue Harness

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $465.70 Total: $465.70

Manufacturer: Petzel

Manufacturer #: C083BA ASTRO BOD FAST

4
7

Talon Fire Sprinkler tools

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: Quickstop

4
8

Sprinkler Shutoffs (recess head screw type)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $28.78 Total: $28.78

Manufacturer: Telelite

4
9

Sprinkler Shutguns

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: Technicraft Product Design Inc

5
0

14'x18' Salvage Covers (22 oz. Red)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $361.07 Total: $361.07

Manufacturer: Fol-Da-Tank

Manufacturer #: SC14x18

5
1

3'x15' Floor Runners (18 oz. Yellow)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $59.40 Total: $59.40

Manufacturer: Husky or Fol-Da-Tank

Manufacturer #: HR 3 X 12
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5
2

Water Can Harnesses

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

5
3

ABC Extinguisher (20 lb)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: Amerex

Manufacturer #: A411

5
4

CO2 Extinguisher (20 lb)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: Amerex

Manufacturer #: 332

5
5

Class D Met LX Red Line Cartridge Extinguisher (30 lb)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: Ansel

Manufacturer #: MX-1-30-6-1

5
6

Class D Sodium Chloride Fire Extinguisher (30lb)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: Amerex

Manufacturer #: B570

5
7

2.5 Gallon pressurized water extinguiser or badger model WP-61; NO PLASTIC BASE

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: Kidde

Manufacturer #: PRO 2.5W

5
8

10 lb Sledge Hammer

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $54.39 Total: $54.39

5
9

48" Pry Bar

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $79.38 Total: $79.38

6
0

36" Bolt Cutter

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $77.31 Total: $77.31

6
1

K-Tool w/pouch and accessories

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $180.00 Total: $180.00

6
2

Rex Tool

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $195.00 Total: $195.00

6
3

Rabbit Tool

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2,150.40 Total: $2,150.40
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6
4

6 lb. Pick Head Axe w/ Fiberglass Handle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $76.44 Total: $76.44

6
5

8 lb. Flat Head Axe w/ Fiberglass Handle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $130.56 Total: $130.56

6
6

60" Pinch Point Pry Bar

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $82.91 Total: $82.91

6
7

30" Pro Bar Halligan

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $271.32 Total: $271.32

Manufacturer: Fire Hooks Unlimited

6
8

8 lb. Sledge Hammer w/ Fiberglass Handle & Halligan Loop

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $100.80 Total: $100.80

Manufacturer: Fire Hooks Unlimited

6
9

8 lb. Sledge Hammer w/ Fiberglass Handle w/out Halligan Loop

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $92.40 Total: $92.40

7
0

Pulaski Axe

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $75.60 Total: $75.60

Manufacturer: Akron (or equiv)

Manufacturer #: WPL-4

7
1

Fire Rake w/ 60" Wooden Handle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $63.38 Total: $63.38

Manufacturer: Council Tool (or equiv)
Supplier Notes: QUOTED FLAMEFIGHTER

7
2

Fire Swatter w/ 60" Wooden Handle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $65.04 Total: $65.04

Manufacturer: Council Tool (or equiv)
Supplier Notes: QUOTED FLAMEFIGHTER

7
3

5 Gallon Collapsable Backpack Pump

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $183.30 Total: $183.30

Manufacturer: PECO (or equiv)

Manufacturer #: 85130
Supplier Notes: PN 8416BB002203 SMOKECHASER 5-GAL COLLAPSIBLE TANK PUMP; FEDCO
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7
4

2,000 gallon portable folding tank

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,966.12 Total: $1,966.12

Manufacturer: Husky
Supplier Notes: QUOTED WIHT 4.5'' FEMALE NST FLANGE; PER LEX

7
5

Ground cover for 2,000 gallon folding tank

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $197.89 Total: $197.89

Manufacturer: Husky

7
6

5" x 10' hard suction, 4.5" NST couplings (female long handle)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $519.11 Total: $519.11

Manufacturer: Kochek

Manufacturer #: 2P501

7
7

Carbon Monoxide Detector

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: RAE Systems MicroRae

Manufacturer #: M03-1111-300

7
8

Piercing Nozzle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $995.00 Total: $995.00

7
9

Blitzfire high elevation monitor comb. package includes monitor, storage bracket, md12a auto nozzle, 3 stacked
tip nozzle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3,936.62 Total: $3,936.62

Manufacturer: TFT

Manufacturer #: XXC-52-HE

8
0

Storage Bracket, MD12A auto-nozzle, 3 stacked tip nozzle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.00 Total: $0.00

Manufacturer: Elkhart
Supplier Notes: THE MD12A NOZZLE IS TFT, NOT ELKHART AS REQUESTED. THESE ITEMS ARE INCLUDED IN

LINE 79.

8
1

Self educting master stream foam nozzle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2,601.40 Total: $2,601.40

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: SM-1000-HF

8
2

Break apart nozzle with 15/16" smoothbore

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $441.56 Total: $441.56

Manufacturer: Elkhart
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8
3

Smooth Bore Tip 1 1/8"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $117.04 Total: $117.04

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 187-XD

8
4

Chief XD 250 gpm @ 50 psi fog tip

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $554.88 Total: $554.88

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 4000-24
Supplier Notes: 4000-24 IS AN OLD PN. QUOTED IS 04XD0251

8
5

2.5" pistol grip shutoff with 1.25" integral smooth bore

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $550.63 Total: $550.63

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: DB375GAT
Supplier Notes: DB375GAT IS AN OLD PN. QUOTED IS 0069XD08

8
6

1 1/2" distributor nozzle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $567.65 Total: $567.65

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 193-6

8
7

2 1/2" bresnan distributor nozzle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $725.12 Total: $725.12

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 193-6

8
8

foam tube

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $288.34 Total: $288.34

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 246S
Supplier Notes: 246S IS AN OLD PN. QUOTED IS FOR THE NEW XD NOZZLES WHICH HAVE BEEN QUOTED

ON THE PRIOR LINES

8
9

1 1/2" foam eductor, 95 gpm, .1-6% with chrome pick up tube

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $823.01 Total: $823.01

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 241-95
Supplier Notes: PN 241-95 IS FOR THE EDUCTOR. PN 81001005 IS FOR THE CHROME PICKUP TUBE. I HAVE

ADD BOTH COSTS TOGETER FOR THIS LINE ITEM.
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9
0

1 1/2" foam eductor, 95 gpm, .1-6%

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $663.60 Total: $663.60

Manufacturer: TFT

Manufacturer #: UE-095-NF

9
1

Chief XD 175 gmp at 50 psi nozzle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $449.01 Total: $449.01

Manufacturer: Elkhart

9
2

Ram XD

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2,338.15 Total: $2,338.15

Manufacturer: Elkhart

9
3

R.A.N. Nozzle - 500 Gpm

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $513.91 Total: $513.91

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 3896

9
4

Triple Stack Tip - 1.25", 1.375", 1.5"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $342.08 Total: $342.08

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: ST-197-A

9
5

Mini Stream Shaper

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $182.48 Total: $182.48

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 282-A Mini

9
6

Stinger 2.0 w/ Portable Base (4.5" Inlet w. NST)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3,415.98 Total: $3,415.98

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 8297

9
7

Stream Shaper

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $182.48 Total: $182.48

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 282-A

9
8

Stacked Tip - 2", 1.75", 1.5", 1.375"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $363.89 Total: $363.89

Manufacturer: Elkhart
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9
9

Akron Mercury Quick Attack w/Mounting Bracket, Style 4446 Nozzle, and Triple Stacked Tips

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2,687.73 Total: $2,687.73

Manufacturer: Akron

1
0
0

Jumbo low profile ball intake valve, 6 (F) SW in X 4.5 (M) out

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2,969.68 Total: $2,969.68

Manufacturer: TFT

1
0
1

In-line valve with top mount parallel shaft drive, 4.5 (F) sw in X 4.5 out

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,650.32 Total: $1,650.32

Manufacturer: TFT

1
0
2

Gated wye, 4.5 (F) SW in x 2 2.5 (M) out

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,258.32 Total: $1,258.32

Manufacturer: TFT

Manufacturer #: AY5NR-NJ

1
0
3

2.5" double female adapter

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $48.49 Total: $48.49

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: 35
Supplier Notes: QUOTED ACTION

1
0
4

2.5" double male adapter

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $28.38 Total: $28.38

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: 36
Supplier Notes: QUOTED ACTION

1
0
5

4.5"double male adapter

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $112.70 Total: $112.70

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: 36
Supplier Notes: QUOTED ACTION

1
0
6

4.5" NST to Storz adapter

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $217.92 Total: $217.92

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: S-36
Supplier Notes: QUOTED HARRINGTON
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1
0
7

4.5" NST to Storz adapter

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $188.16 Total: $188.16

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: S-37
Supplier Notes: QUOTED HARRINGTON

1
0
8

4.5" double female adapter

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $131.11 Total: $131.11

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: 35
Supplier Notes: QUOTED ACTION

1
0
9

1.5" double female adapter

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $34.80 Total: $34.80

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: 35
Supplier Notes: QUOTED ACTION

1
1
0

1.5" double male adapter

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $23.46 Total: $23.46

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: 36
Supplier Notes: QUOTED ACTION

1
1
1

2.5" female x 1.5" male reducer

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $30.09 Total: $30.09

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: 37
Supplier Notes: QUOTED ACTION

1
1
2

2.5" NG rocker lug female (Rigid) x 4.5 " NH Rocker lug male

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $122.44 Total: $122.44

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: 37
Supplier Notes: QUOTED ACTION

1
1
3

2.5" female x 3/4" male garden hose reducer

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $48.56 Total: $48.56

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: 37
Supplier Notes: QUOTED ACTION
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1
1
4

2.5" female NST swivel x 4.5" female NST swivel

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $130.30 Total: $130.30

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: 35
Supplier Notes: QUOTED ACTION

1
1
5

2.5" female NST swivel x 4.5" male NST rigid

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $163.98 Total: $163.98

Manufacturer: Red Head

Manufacturer #: 54
Supplier Notes: QUOTED ACTION

1
1
6

LDH manifold 4.5" female NST swivel inlet, one 4.5" NST gated outlet, two 2.5" NST gated outlet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,452.22 Total: $1,452.22

Manufacturer: Red Head (NOT Kockek)
Supplier Notes: QUOTED HARRINGTON

1
1
7

Leather 2.5" hose jacket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $65.28 Total: $65.28

Manufacturer: Boston Leath

Manufacturer #: SKU9200

1
1
8

4.5" NST barrel strainers, aluminum

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $220.97 Total: $220.97

Manufacturer: Kochek

Manufacturer #: BS45

1
1
9

Low level strainer w/ 1.5" water transfer fitting

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $913.10 Total: $913.10

Manufacturer: Fold-A-Tank

Manufacturer #: LFS 4.5

1
2
0

Hose clamp with 285-mb mounting bracket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $775.69 Total: $775.69

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 285

1
2
1

2.5" x 1/5" gated wye

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $305.25 Total: $305.25

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: B-100A
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1
2
2

3.5" x 2.5" reducer

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $82.81 Total: $82.81

1
2
3

5"F x 4.5"M Intake Valve

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,556.00 Total: $1,556.00

1
2
4

Drain Elbow

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $269.61 Total: $269.61

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 105A

1
2
5

Inline Pressure Gauge (2.5")

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $341.23 Total: $341.23

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: 228A

1
2
6

Gate Valve

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $487.81 Total: $487.81

Manufacturer: Elkhart

Manufacturer #: X-86A

1
2
7

Revolution Valve 7982 6" FNST x 4.5 M NST

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2,090.19 Total: $2,090.19

Manufacturer: Akron

1
2
8

Revolution Valve 7982 5" FNST x 4.5 M NST

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2,090.19 Total: $2,090.19

Manufacturer: Akron

1
2
9

Ironlok

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $224.58 Total: $224.58

Manufacturer: PAC

Manufacturer #: K5003

1
3
0

Toollok

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $29.11 Total: $29.11

Manufacturer: PAC

Manufacturer #: 1003

1
3
1

Jumbolok

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $59.99 Total: $59.99

Manufacturer: PAC

Manufacturer #: 1070
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1
3
2

Handlelok

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $38.99 Total: $38.99

Manufacturer: PAC

Manufacturer #: 1004

1
3
3

Flexmount

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $43.93 Total: $43.93

Manufacturer: PAC

Manufacturer #: 1002-2

1
3
4

Hooklok

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $34.01 Total: $34.01

Manufacturer: PAC

Manufacturer #: 1001

1
3
5

Pinch Point Pry Bar Mount

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $91.00 Total: $91.00

Manufacturer: Akron (or equiv)

Manufacturer #: PPBH

1
3
6

Axe Blade Bracket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $33.21 Total: $33.21

Manufacturer: Akron (or equiv)

Manufacturer #: AS-510

1
3
7

Axe Handle Bracket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $26.55 Total: $26.55

Manufacturer: Akron (or equiv)

Manufacturer #: AS-520

1
3
8

1.5" Threaded Mounting Bracket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $18.33 Total: $18.33

Manufacturer: 36.85

Manufacturer #: RMP4604AC

1
3
9

2.5" Threaded Mounting Bracket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $31.49 Total: $31.49

Manufacturer: PAC (or equiv)

Manufacturer #: RMP4906AC
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1
4
0

4.5" Threaded Mounting Bracket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $145.24 Total: $145.24

Manufacturer: PAC (or equiv)

Manufacturer #: RMP4912AC

1
4
1

1% x 3% AR-AFFF (265 gallon tote)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: ChemGuard

1
4
2

1% x 3% AR-AFFF (5 gallon bucket)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer: ChemGuard

1
4
3

Class A Foam (265 gallon tote)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5,053.49 Total: $5,053.49

Manufacturer: National Responder
Supplier Notes: 275 GALLON QUOTED. NOT 265

1
4
4

Class A Foam (5 gallon bucket)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $114.50 Total: $114.50

Manufacturer: National Responder

1
4
5

Foam 3% / 6% AR-AFFF

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $8,086.01 Total: $8,086.01

Manufacturer: National Centurion
Supplier Notes: 275 GALLON QUOTED

Response Total: $103,860.52
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QUOTE
Quote #: Q008633

Date: Nov 08, 2023
Expiration:

Contact: Kyle Leidy
Cell: 859-444-8632

Email: kylel@vogelpohlfire.com
2770 Circleport Drive  Erlanger, KY  41018
www.vogelpohlfire.com

ISSUED TO
Jason Wells
Lexington Fire Dept
219 East 3rd Street
Lexington KY 40508

Payment Terms Freight
Net Due in 15 Days Not Included

Qty Description Each Extended
1 Duo Safety #1200-A  2-Section 35' Extension Ladder $1,206.21 $1,206.21
1 Duo Safety #1225-A 3-Section 35' Extension Ladder $1,287.00 $1,287.00
1 Duo Safety #1200-A 2-Section 28' Extensaion ladder $951.67 $951.67
1 Duo Safety #875-A 16' Roof Ladder $426.14 $426.14
1 Duo Safety #585-A 10' Folding Attic Ladder $258.83 $258.83
1 Duo Safety #12-701 12' Fresno Extension Ladder with Safety Shoes $520.52 $520.52
1 Duo Safety #775-A 10' Roof Ladder with Hooks $300.30 $300.30
1 Leatherhead #DBY-12AH-B   12' American Hook (Pike Pole) 'I''-Beam $90.77 $90.77
1 Leatherhead #DBY-10AH-B   10' American Hook (Pike Pole) 'I''-Beam $85.94 $85.94
1 Leatherhead #DBY-8AH-B   8' American Hook (Pike Pole) 'I''-Beam $78.69 $78.69
1 Fire Hooks Unlimited #BRH-6   6' Boston Rake Hook $117.30 $117.30
1 Leatherhead #NYH-6  NY Roof Hook; Steel with Pry $111.35 $111.35
1 Leatherhead #DBY-4AH-D 4' American Hook with D Handle (3' not available) $89.62 $89.62

1 Fire Hooks Unlimited #TRH-6   6' Arson Trash Hook $131.10 $131.10
1 Tempest #911-1001   EB-16-S-03-EP   16'' Smoke Ejector w/ Hazardous 

Location Motor (Explosion Proof)
$1,531.63 $1,531.63

1 Tempest #300-142   Hanging Bracket Set for Smoke Ejector $42.61 $42.61
1 Tempest #300-141   Door Bar Holder for Smoke Ejector $311.71 $311.71
1 Tempest #725-177   Duct Hose Adapter; Clip On $128.57 $128.57
1 Tempest #725-004   Ducting for 16'' Smoke Ejector; 15' $33.64 $33.64
1 Tempest #910-1420   VS-18-R-2.0   18'' Electric Variable Speed PPV Fan; 12,

839cfm
$2,901.80 $2,901.80

1 Tempest #910-1040   BD-21-H-5.5   21'' Belt-Driven PPV Fan; Honda GX, 17,
743cfm

$2,987.01 $2,987.01

1 Supervac #V20-BL-SP  20'' Milwaukee M18 Battery Powered PPV Fan; 
Includes Shore Power Option (No batteries or chargers included)

$4,125.00 $4,125.00

1 Supervac #V18-BL-SP  18'' Milwaukee M18 Battery Powered PPV Fan; 
Includes Shore Power Option (No batteries or chargers included)

$3,927.00 $3,927.00

1 Res-Q-Jack #APX-4PTX Apex 4-Point Deluxe Kit $13,628.36 $13,628.36
1 Ajax #811-RK   Heavy Duty Air Chisel Set $1,722.72 $1,722.72
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1 We Cut The Glass #RWC-2.1-SOFT   Rhyno 14.4V Rhyno2 Windshield Cutter 

Kit Kit Includes: RHYNO2 Windshield Cutter Tool 14.4V Lithium-ion Batteries – 
Qty 2 14.4VAC, 1/2 Hour Smart Charger

$641.84 $641.84

1 Akron Brass #ELSS-XLAC   Extenda-Lite Light Head Only; 20,000 Lumens, 
220W@120VAC

$1,227.74 $1,227.74

1 FRC #SPMoption-NB Spectra Mobile LED Scene Light (light only) $934.08 $934.08
1 CMC #202442 Ladder Belt SM/MD $251.99 $251.99
1 CMC #202444 Ladder Belt LG/XL $251.99 $251.99
1 CMC #202446 Ladder Belt XXL $251.99 $251.99
1 RescueTech #5157300RD 7/16'' x 300' Static Kernmantle Life Safety Rope 

(Red)
$362.25 $362.25

1 RescueTech #5157300BL 7/16'' x 300' Static Kernmantle Life Safety Rope 
(Blue)

$362.25 $362.25

1 RescueTech #5147200WR 7/16'' x 200' Static Kernmantle Life Safety Rope 
(White)

$224.25 $224.25

1 RescueTech #52716100   100' Technora Heat Resistant Aramid RIT Rope 
(900 Degree F)

$144.00 $144.00

1 RescueTech #230327000   3/8'' x 75' Polypropylene Water Rescue Rope $25.20 $25.20
1 RescueTech #23540308310   Petzl ASTRO Bod Croll Full Body Harness with 

Ventral Rope Clamp
$465.70 $465.70

1 TeleLite Sprinkler Stop; Valve; 6-3/4'' $28.78 $28.78
1 Fol-Da-Tank #SC141822VR   14' x 18' Salvage Cover, Vinyl 22 oz Red $361.07 $361.07
1 Husky #HR3x12   18oz Yellow 3x12' Floor Runner $59.40 $59.40
1 Flamefighter #SH10   10lb Sledgehammer $54.39 $54.39
1 Flamefighter #WB48   48'' Pry Bar $79.38 $79.38
1 Flamefighter #BC36   36'' Bolt Cutters $77.31 $77.31
1 Fire Hooks Unlimited #KTKIT   K-Tool Kit; Includes: K-tool, leather pouch, two 

lock tool keys, shove knife
$180.00 $180.00

1 Fire Hooks Unlimited #REXT   Rex Tool $195.00 $195.00
1 Fire Hooks Unlimited #HR-1   Hydra Ram1; One Person, 11;bs Hydraulic 

Forcible Entry Tool - 4'' Opening, 10,000lbs Force
$2,150.40 $2,150.40

1 Fire Hooks Unlimited #FAP-6   6lb Pick Head Axe w/Fiberglass Handle $76.44 $76.44
1 Fire Hooks Unlimited #FA-8  8lb Flat Head Axe $130.56 $130.56
1 #3FE91   60'' Heat Treated Carbon Steel Pinch Point Bar $82.91 $82.91
1 Fire Hooks Unlimited #PB-30   30'' Halligan Pro Bar; Drop Forged $271.32 $271.32
1 Fire Hooks Unlimited #8-M28-B   8lb Sledge Hammer with Adz Bracket; 

Fiberglass Handle
$100.80 $100.80

1 Fire Hooks Unlimited #8-M28 8lb Sledge Hammer; Fiberglass Handle $92.40 $92.40
1 Fire Hooks Unlimited #PUL-AXE   Pulaski Axe $75.60 $75.60
1 Flamefighter #FRW 5' Fire Rake with Ash Handle $63.38 $63.38
1 Flamefighter #FFW 5' Fire Flapper with Ash Handle $65.04 $65.04
1 D.B. Smith #8416BB002203   5 Gallon Collapsible Tank Pump; Smokechaser, 

Vinyl Tank, w/ Fedco Pistol Grip Pump
$183.30 $183.30

1 Husky #LS-2000   Low-Side 2000 Gallon Self Supporting Tank; 30oz with 4.5'' 
Female NST Flange

$1,966.12 $1,966.12

1 Husky #GCLS-2000   Ground Cover for Low-Side Self Supporting Tank; 2000 
Gallon, 18oz

$197.89 $197.89

1 Kochek #2P451-10-A52   5'' x 10' Hard Suction, 4.5'' NST Couplings (Female 
Long Handle)

$519.11 $519.11

1 Task Force Tips #PA1   1.5'' Transformer Piercing Nozzle $995.00 $995.00
1 TFT #XXC-52-HENH1   Blitzfire Monitor Combination Package; High Elevation 

Monitor, Max-Series Nozzle, Stacked Tips, Storage Bracket
$3,936.62 $3,936.62

1 Elkhart Brass #SM-1000-HF   Self Educting Master Stream Foam Nozzle $2,601.40 $2,601.40
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1 Elkhart Brass #0033XD06   1.5'' Chief XD Shutoff with 15/16'' Integral Smooth 

Bore
$441.56 $441.56

1 Elkhart brass #66759007 XD Smooth Bore Tip; 1-1/8'' (Short Barrel) $117.04 $117.04
1 Elkhart Brass #04XD0251   1.5'' Chief XD Nozzle Tip; 250gpm @ 50psi $554.88 $554.88
1 Elkhart Brass #0069XD08   2.5'' Chief XD Shutoff with 1-1/4'' Integral Smooth 

Bore & Pistol Grip
$550.63 $550.63

1 Elkhart Brass #01269004   1.5'' Bresnan Distributor Nozzle; 140 GPM $567.65 $567.65
1 Elkhart Brass #01269104   2.5'' Bresnan Distributor Nozzle; 495 GPM $725.12 $725.12
1 Elkhart Brass #XD   Foam Expansion Tube; Short (Mid Range) $288.34 $288.34
1 Elkhart Brass #241-95   1.5'' Foam Eductor, 95 GPM, 0.1-6% $703.30 $703.30
1 Elkhart Brass #81001005 Chrome Pick Up Tube for 241-95 $119.71 $119.71
1 TFT #UE-095-NF 1.5'' Foam Eductor, 95 GPM, 0.1-6% $663.60 $663.60
1 Elkhart Brass #04XD0172   1.5'' Chief XD Mid-Range Tip; 175gpm @ 50psi $449.01 $449.01
1 Elkhart Brass #08296201   2.5'' RAM XD Attack Monitor $2,338.15 $2,338.15
1 Elkhart Brass #03896001   3896 Rapid Attack Nozzle for RAM XD $513.91 $513.91
1 Elkhart Brass #00638001   ST-197-A Triple Stack Tip; 1.25'', 1.125'', 1.5'' $342.08 $342.08
1 Elkhart Brass #03476201   282-A Mini Stream Shaper $182.48 $182.48
1 Elkhart Brass #8297-45   Stinger 2.0 Deckgun with 4.5'' FNH Inlet; 1250gpm $3,415.98 $3,415.98

1 Elkhart Brass #03476001   282-A 2.5'' Stream Shaper $182.48 $182.48
1 Elkhart Brass #00623001   ST-191-A   2.5'' Stacked tips; Discharge Sizes: 2'', 

1-3/4'', 1-1/5''
$363.89 $363.89

1 Akron Brass #3444 Mercury Quick Attack LE Monitor; Includes Storage 
Bracket and 4446 Nozzle

$2,687.73 $2,687.73

1 TFT #AXD8NRNXT   Jumbo Low Profile Intake Valve; 6'' Female NST Swivel 
x 4.5'' NH Male

$2,969.68 $2,969.68

1 TFT #AN3R7R02   In-Line Valve with Parallel Shaft Drive Gearbox; 4.5'' NST 
Female Swivel x 4.5'' NST Male

$1,650.32 $1,650.32

1 TFT #AY5HNR-NJ   Gated Wye; 4.5'' NST Swivel Female x (2) 2.5'' NST Male $1,258.32 $1,258.32

1 Action #AA135   2.5'' Double Female NST Swivel Rocker Lug Adapter $48.49 $48.49
1 Action #AA 136  2.5'' Double Male NST Rocker Lug Adapter $28.35 $28.35
1 Action #AA136   4.5'' Double Male NST Rocker Lug Adapter $112.70 $112.70
1 HSFS50-45NH: Harrington Adapter 5" Storz lock x 4.5" NH female swivel 

rocker lug anodized
$217.92 $217.92

1 HSFR50-45NH: Harrington Adapter 5" Storz lock x 4.5" NH female rigid rocker 
lug anodized

$191.52 $191.52

1 HSMR50-45NH: Harrington Adapter 5" Storz lock x 4.5" NH male rocker lug 
anodized

$188.16 $188.16

1 Action #AA135   4.5'' Double Female NST Swivel Rocker Lug Adapter $131.11 $131.11
1 Action #AA135   1.5'' Double Female NST Swivel Rocker Lug Adapter $34.80 $34.80
1 Action #AA136   1.5'' Double Male NST Rocker Lug Adapter $23.46 $23.46
1 Action #AA137   Reducer; 2.5'' Female NST Rigid x 1.5'' Male NST $30.09 $30.09
1 Action #AA137   Reducer; 2.5'' Female NST Rigid x 4.5'' Male NST $122.44 $122.44
1 Action #AA137   Reducer; 2.5'' Female NST Rigid x .75'' Male GHT $48.56 $48.56
1 Action #AA135 Reducer; 2.5'' Famle NST Swivel x 4.5'' NST Female Swivel $130.30 $130.30
1 Action #AA154RL   2.5'' Female NST Swivel x 4.5'' Male NST $163.98 $163.98
1 Harrington #H301-45NHF-45NHM-25NHM, 3-way ball valve 4.5" NH female 

swivel inlet x (1) 4.5" NH male outlet (2) 2.5" NH male outlets w/ 250-S RV 
(LDH Manifold)

$1,452.22 $1,452.22

1 Boston Leather #9200   Leather Hose Jacket $65.28 $65.28
1 Kockek #BS45-P09   4.5'' NST Barrel Strainer, Aluminum $220.97 $220.97
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1 Fol-Da-Tank #LFS4.5   Aluminum Low-Flow Strainer; 4.5'' w/1.5'' Water 

Transfer Fitting
$913.10 $913.10

1 Elkhart Brass #285 Hose Clamp; 1.5-3'' Hose $616.03 $616.03
1 Elkhart Brass #285-MB    Mounting Bracket for Hose Clamp $139.66 $139.66
1 Elkhart Brass #B-100A   2.5'' x 1.5'' Gated Wye; Elk-O-Lite with Long Handle $305.25 $305.25

1 Action #AA136   Double Male Reducer; 3.5'' NST x 2.5'' NST $82.81 $82.81
1 TFT #ABD8NR-NT   Ball Intake Valve; 4.5'' Male NST x 5'' Female NST $1,556.00 $1,556.00
1 Elkhart Brass #00465001   105A 2.5'' NST Elbow $269.61 $269.61
1 Elkhart Brass #00688201   228A 2.5'' NST Pressure Gauge $341.23 $341.23
1 Elkhart Brass #00381101   X-86-A 2.5'' NST Gate Valve $487.81 $487.81
1 Akron Brass #7982   Revolution Intake Valve; 4.5'' Male NST X 6'' Female NST $2,090.19 $2,090.19

1 Akron Brass #7982   Revolution Intake Valve; 4.5'' Male NST X 5'' Female NST $2,090.19 $2,090.19

1 PAC #K5003 IronsLok $224.58 $224.58
1 PAC #1003-HD   ToolLok - Heavy Duty $29.11 $29.11
1 PAC #1070   JumboLok $59.99 $59.99
1 PAC #1004   HandleLok $38.99 $38.99
1 PAC #1002S-HD   Flexmount HD Short Version $43.93 $43.93
1 PAC #1001   HookLocks (Pair) $34.01 $34.01
1 Fire Hooks Unlimited #CB-51   51'' Wedge Point Crow Bar $91.00 $91.00
1 South Park #ZAH5101C   Axe Blade Holder $33.21 $33.21
1 South Park #ZSMA5201C   Axe Handle Bracket, Side Mount $26.55 $26.55
1 South Park #RMP4904AC   1.5'' NST Male Chrome Raised Mounting Plate $18.33 $18.33
1 South Park #RMP4906AC   2.5'' NST Male Chrome Raised Mounting Plate $31.49 $31.49
1 South Park #RMP4912AC   4.5'' NST Male Chrome Raised Mounting Plate $145.24 $145.24
1 National Foam #2170-0726-6   Responder Class A Foam; 275-Gallon Tote $5,053.49 $5,053.49
1 National Foam #2170-0340-6   Responder Class A Foam; 5-Gallon Pail $114.50 $114.50
1 National Foam #2130-2725-4   Centurion 3% x 6% AR-AFFF C-6 Foam; 275-

Gallon Tote
$8,086.01 $8,086.01

Thank you for the opportunity to provide you with this proposal.
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