Bid 69-2023
EcoGro

Advanced Mulching Technologies, Inc. DBA

EcoGro
Supplier Response

Event Information

Number:
Title:

Type:

Issue Date:
Deadline:
Notes:

Bid 69-2023

Parks Construction UPC

Competitive Bid

5/30/2023

6/16/2023 02:00 PM (ET)

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED. PLEASE FILL

OUT THE BID DOCUMENTS AND ATTACH IN THE "RESPONSE
ATTACHMENTS" TAB. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE
EXCEL SPREADSHEET AND ATTACHED SEPARATELY AS AN
EXCEL FILE IN THE RESPONSE ATTACHEMENTS TAB. PRICING
WITHIN SUBMITTED BID DOCUMENTS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED
AND MAY MAKE YOUR BID NON-RESPONSIVE.

Contact Information

Contact: Kristie Thomas

Address: Central Purchasing
Government Center Building
200 East Main Street
Lexington, KY 40507

Phone:  (859) 2583320

Fax: (859) 2583322

Email: kthomas@lexingtonky.gov
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Vendor: EcoGro

Bid 69-2023



EcoGro Information

Address: po box 22273
lexington, KY 40522

Phone: (859) 231-0500

Fax: (866) 348-0528

Web Address: www.ecogro.net

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED! By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent
and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached
bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

james hanssen jim@ecogro.net

Signature Emall
Submitted at 6/16/2023 09:29:44 AM (ET)

Response Attachments

69-2023 UPC BID_SCHEDULE_ELECTRONIC_FORM 2023-6-16.xlsx
excel
2023 EcoGro business License.pdf
business license
Evidence of Insurability - Ecogro.pdf
insurability
notarized.pdf
notarized
Parks UPC submission.pdf
form of proposal
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Customer ID: 12723600

Division of Revenue
Location No: 1

200 East Main Street

Lexington, KY 40507 Date: April 17, 2023

BUSINESS OCCUPATIONAL LICENSE

Is issued for the period:

2023

ADVANCED MULCHING TECHNOLOGIES INC
PO BOX 22273
LEXINGTON KY 40522

This license is issued pursuant to Section 13-5 and 13-9, of the Code of Ordinance, Lexington-Fayette
Urban County Government (the "Code") and shall not be taken as permission to do business in Fayette
County without also having complied with all other requirements of the Code and other local ordinances
and regulations. This license is not transferable, and must be renewed annually with Form 228, Net
Profits License Fee Return, due April 15t or the 15th day of the 4th month following the close of the

licensee’s fiscal year.


















































































































13. EVIDENCE OF INSURABILITY

LEXINGTON-FAYETTE URBAN COUNTY GOVERNMENT CONSTRUCTION PROJECT
(Use separate form for each Agency or Brokerage agreeing to provide coverage)

Names Insured: ﬁc_?ﬁ& ES_%ME ..W.NQTDQ“DMWV_NW NH_\\.\R.\ g m&a Employee 1D:
Address: ,\?N.D IMWU.X %ﬂw h&\mﬁ&ﬁj .R‘{ %@% Phone:

Project to be insured:

In Tieu of obtaining certificates of insurance at this time, the undersigned agrees to provide the above Named Insured with the mintmum coverage listed below. These ate outlined in the Insurance
and Risk Management of Part V (Special Conditions), including all requirements, and conditions:

Section Minimum Limits and Limits Provided Name of A M. Best's
Ttems Coverage Policy Requirements To Insured Insurer Code Rating
SC-3, Section 2, Part 4.1 see provisions CGL $1,000,000 per occ. And 5 1,00,000 per 9 | Sty Shinte @&w&. O3 \@ -
$2,000,000 ageregate R3p%,000 aopy | INsuiaiice (pindhny Z
SC-3, Section 2, Part 4.1 — see provisions AUTO $1,000,000/per occ. 3 1,000,000 (Si Securo Tréumance O00HE % b\
Comparny
. i 51 500 Y AaC SUf _
SC-3, Section 2, Part 4.1 — see provisions WwC Statutory w /endorsement as o #\I &1 ~b\
: noted hr g INsurers ﬂﬂ.& 2\\&‘ N

Sectjon 2 inchides required provisions, statements regarding insurance requirements, and the .:haﬂ.mﬁn& agrees to abide by all provisiens for the coverage’s checked above unless stated otherwise
when subrnitting.

Al Torsiride Thsurance Agenc Mlisor, T. Johnson

Agency or Brokerage ' Name of Authorized Representative

243 Walore, Vwesidont

mmmwwgs L dosod Qo TS

City v State | Authorized Signgfre
§H - 323 - (21323
Telephone Nurmber Date

NOTE: Authorized signatures may be the agent's if agent has placed insurance through an agency agreement with the insurer. If insurance is brokered, authorized signature naust be that of
authorized representative of insurer.

IMPORTANT: Contract may not be awarded if a completed and signed copy of this form for all coverage’s listed above is not provided with the bid.

P-35




Project: Parks Construction UPC Bid# 69-2023
Bid Date: 6/16/2023

Contractor: EcoGro

# Item Unit Unit Price

1 Bituminous pavement for athletic courts: Base TN no bid

2 Bituminous pavement for athletic courts: Surface TN no bid

3 Bituminous pavement for athletic courts reinforced with aramid fibers: Base TN no bid

4 Bituminous pavement for athletic courts reinforced with aramid fibers: Surface |TN no bid

5 Bituminous pavement milling for athletic courts TN no bid

6 Bituminous pavement crack filler LF no bid

7 Bituminous pavement full depth crack repair LF no bid

8 Athletic court color coating SY no bid

9 Athletic court patch and level surface SY no bid

10 Athletic court striping LF no bid

11 Asphalt sealing SY no bid

12 Parking lot striping LF no bid

13 Security fence LF no bid

14 Dense grade aggregate placed base TN no bid

15 No. 2 stone TN $ 40.00
16 No. 9 stone TN $ 38.00
17 No. 57 stone TN $ 38.00
18 Concrete sidewalk SY no bid

19 Finished Concrete CY no bid

20 Concrete pavement; 4 in. depth SY no bid

21 Concrete pavement; 6 in. depth SY no bid

22 Concrete pavement; 8 in. depth SY no bid

23 Playground header curb installation LF no bid

24 Topsoil CY $ 44.00
25 Excavation CY $ 20.00
26 Embankment CcY $ 20.00
27 Finish grading CcY $ 24.00
28 Laser grading CY no bid

29 Standard staked silt fence-installed LF $ 7.00
30 Wire back silt fence-installed LF $ 20.00
31 Tree protection fence LF $ 6.00
32 Seeding & protection; General (standard seed mix) SY $ 5.00
33 Seeding & protection: Athletic Field (special seed mix) SY $ 8.00
34 Sod: provide & installation SY $ 20.00
35 Site amenity install; trash can EA no bid

36 Site amenity install; standard bench EA no bid

37 Site amenity install: covered single bench EA no bid

38 Site amenity install: covered double bench EA no bid

39 Site amenity install: square picnic table EA no bid

40 Site amenity install: covered square picnic table EA no bid

41 Site amenity installation: 6 ft. rectangle picnic table EA no bid

42 Site amenity installation: 8 ft. rectangle handicap picnic table EA no bid

43 Site amenity installation: covered 6 ft. rectangle picnic table EA no bid

44 Single block masonry retention wall SF no bid

45 Supply and install ADA parking sign EA no bid

46 Solid drain pipe LF $ 50.00
47 4 in. HDPE perforated pipe LF $ 25.00
48 6 in. HDPE perforated pipe LF $ 35.00
49 Jackhammer with operator HR $ 130.00
50 Skid steer loader with operator HR no bid

51 Backhoe (small) with operator HR no bid

52 Roller/compactor with operator HR no bid

53 Grader with operator HR no bid

54 Dump truck (single axle) with driver HR $ 90.00




55 Dump truck (tri-axle) with driver HR $ 140.00
56 Removal of Concrete Pavement, Sidewalk, Entrance Pavement SY $ 32.00
57 Removal of Curb and Gutter LF $ 15.00
58 Removal of Fence LF $ 7.50
59 Saw Cutting Walk, Curb, Pavement LF no bid
60 Bituminous Pavement Milling and Texturing TN no bid
Payment and Performance Bond Cost for Projects over $50,000 (See Special Conditions, Section 6) - Enter 30
% of total project cost 0
Minimum Total Project for Consideration (See Special Conditions, Section 3) - Enter dollar $ 2 500.00
amount T
o . . . [
Unspecified Incidental Materials at Cost Plus 15% - Check if Interested =
Unspecified Incidental Labor at Direct Wages Plus Certified Overhead Plus 15% - Check if “
Interested
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