 MAYOR LINDA GORTON 4 LEXl NGTON A TODD SLATIN
b DIRECTOR
CENTRAL PURCHASING

ADDENDUM #1
Bid Number: 129-2022 Date: October 13,2022

Subject: Traffic Signal & Control Equipment

Please address inquiries to: Jessica Allinder, Buyer
(859) 258-3320

" “TO.ALL PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS:
' ;'P:Ie‘a_s"e" be"a.dvised of the following clar‘ifica,tiohs to the above referenced bid:

1) Prices shall be firm for the first 60 days of the procurement contract. After that, we will
allow price revisions every 60 days, if necessary.
2) We are aware that some of the items on the proposed bid are going “end of life”
" shortly. We want these items until they-are no longer available. When they are no
longer available, we will determine alternate direction.

Tl S

Todd Slatin, Director
Division of Central Purchasing

All other terms and conditions of the Bid and specifications are unchanged. This letter should
be signed, attached to and become a part of your Bid.

COMPANY NAME:G CVIQ’GLQ‘ ﬁz“ﬁ%“% E‘@’&f{’/) VIerd C@"//O
bl /

200 East Main St., Lexington, KY 40507 / 869.258.3320 Phone 1'859.258.3322 Fax/ ]e’xirigtéhkygoy ]



LEXINGTON

Lexmgton Fayette Urban County Government

Lexington, Kentucky
Horse Capital of the World

Division of Central Purchasing

Date of Issue: October 5, 2022

INVITATION TO BID #129-2022 Traffic Signal & Control Equipment

Bid Opening Date: October 19, 2022 Bid Opening Time: 2:00 PM
Address: All bids must be submitted on line at https://lexingtonky.ionwave.net/
Type of Bid: Price Contract

Pre Bid Meeting: N/A
Address: N/A

Pre Bid Time: N/A

Sealed bids will ONLY be received online at htips: //lexingtonky.ionwave.net/ until 2:00 PM, prevailing local time on 10/19/2022. Bids must
be submitted/uploaded by the above-mentioned date and time.

Bids are o include all shipping, handling and associated fees to the point of delivery (unless otherwise specified in the bid documents below)

located at:  Lexington, KY

\.\f Bid Specifications Met
attached to bid proposal submitted.

Check One: Progosed Delivery:
Exceptions to Bid Specifications. Exceptions shall be itemized and £45  days after

acceptance of bid.

Procurement Card Usage—The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government may be %3 Procurement Cards to purchase goods and
services and also to make payments. Will you accept Procurement Cards?

) Yes No
Y

To expedite award, the forms in this document should be completed and uploaded with your bid.

Submitted by: C’? evjeral fradtic tq’pr/m rt LuﬁJ

Bid must be signed:

Firm Name
ISG (Groaelcisy
N
Address _\\
MNew thﬁ»g\zy@ MNieaor L/!( SRR
City, Sz‘az‘e &Zzp
/7 / ity @//  fresidect

S/%{?ture ofAuthor/z d Company Representative — Title

/‘{ s\/) )’}L Fi I(,L, QTL"LL#M/

Representat/ve ‘s Name ( Typed or printed)

SYSSG G o SYS SEG 15T
Area-Code - Phone — Extension Fax # N
FeyS € Gereal Ful ffle e DL
E- MalfAddressj v
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" 1. GREEN PROCUREMENT
A ENERGY

‘The’Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government is commmitted to protecting our environment and being fiscally
responsible to our citizens. o ’ ‘

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government mandates the use of Ehergy Star compliant products if they
are available in the marketplace (go to www.Energystar.gov). If these products are available, but not
submitted in your pricing, your bid will be rejected as non-compliant.

ENERGY STAR is a government program that offers businesses and consumers energy-efficient solutions, making
it easy to save money while protecting the environment for future generations.

Key Benefits

These products use 25 to 50% less energy

Reduced energy costs without compromising quality or performance
Reduced air pollution because fewer fossil fuels are burned
Significant return on investment

Extended product life and decreased maintenance

B. GREEN SEAL CERTIFIED PRODUCTS

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government is also committed to using other environmentally  friendly
products that do not negatively impact our environment. Green Seal is a non-profit organization devoted to
environmental standard setting, product certification, and public education.

Go to www.Greenseal.org to find available certified products. These products will have a reduced impact on
the environment and on human health. The products to be used must be pre-approved by the LFUCG prior to
commencement of any work in any LFUCG facility. If a Green Seal product is not available, the LFUCG must
provide a signed waiver to use an alternate product. Please provide information on the Green Seal products
being used with your bid response.

C. GREEN COMMUNITY

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government (LFUCG) serves as a principal, along with the
University of Kentucky and Fayette County Public Schools, in the Bluegrass Partnership for a Green
Community. The Purchasing Team component of the Partnership coliaborates on economy of scale
purchasing that promotes and enhances environmental initiatives. Specifically, when applicable,
each principal is interested in obtaining best value products and/or services which promote
environment initiatives via solicitations and awards from the other principals.

If your company is the successful bidder on this Invitation For Bid, do you agree to extend the same
product/service pricing to the other principals of the Bluegrass Partnership for a Green Community
(i.e. University of Kentucky and Fayette County Schools) if requested?

Yes N

II. Bid Conditions
A. No bid may be withdrawn for a petiod of sixty (60) days after the date and time set for opening.

B. No bid may be altered after the date and time set for opening. In the case of obvious errors, the Division of Central
Purchasing may permit the withdrawal of a bid. The decision as to whether a bid may be withdrawn shall be that
of the Division of Central Purchasing. :

C. Acceptance of this proposal.shall be enactment of an Ordinance by the Urban County Coundil.

D.. The bidder-agrees that the Urban County Government reserves the right to reject any and all bids for either fiscal
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or technical reasons, and to award each part of the bid separately, all parts to one vendor or all parts to multiple
vendors. : ‘ ’

Minor exceptions may not eliminate the bidder. The decision as to whether any exception is minor shall be entirely
that of the head of the requisitioning Department or Division and the Director of the Division of Central Purchasing.
The Urban County Government may waive technicalities and informalities where such waiver would best serve the
interests of the Urban County Government. ' ' :

Manufacturer's catalogue numbers, trade names, etc., where shown herein are for descriptive purposes and are
to guide the bidder in interpreting the standard of quality, design, and performance desired, and shall not be
construed to exclude proposals based on furnishing other types of materials and/or services. However, any
substitution or departure proposed by the bidder must be clearly noted and described; otherwise, it will be assumed
that the bidder intends to supply items specifically mentioned in this Invitation for Bids.

The Urban County Government may require demonstrations of the materials proposed herein prior to acceptance
of this proposal.

Bids must be submitted on this form and must be signed by the bidder or his authorized representative. Unsigned
bids will not be considered.

Bids must be submitted prior to the date and time indicated for opening. Bids submitted after this time will not be
considered.

All bids mailed must be submitted in the Ton Wave online portal at https://lexingtonky.ionwave.net/

Bidder is requested to show both unit prices and lot prices. In the event of error, the unit price shall prevail,

A certified check or Bid Bond in the amount of XX _ percent of the bid price must be attached hereto. This check
must be made payable to the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government, and will be returned when the material
and/or services specified herein have been delivered in accordance with specifications. In the event of failure to
perform within the time period set forth in this bid, it is agreed the certified check may be cashed and the funds
retained by the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government as liquidated damages. Checks of unsuccessful
bidders will be returned when the bid has been awarded.

The delivery dates specified by bidder may be a factor in the determination of the successful bidder.

Tabulations of bids received may be mailed to bidders. Bidders requesting tabulations must enclose a stamped,
self-addressed envelope with the bid.

The Lexington-Fayette Urban Counfy Government is exempt from Kentucky Sales Tax and ‘Federal Excise Tax on
materials purchased from this bid invitation. Materials purchased by the bidder for construction projects are not
tax exempt and are the sole responsibility of the bidder.

All material furnished hereunder must be in full compliance with OSHA regulations.

If more than one bid is offered by one party, or by any person or persons representing a party, alf such bids shall
be rejected.

Signature on the face of this bid by the Bidder or his authorized representative shall be construed as acceptance
of and compliance with all terms and conditions contained herein.

The Entity (regardiess of whether construction contractor, non-construction contractor or supplier) agrees to
provide equal opportunity in employment for all qualified persons, to prohibit discrimination in employment because
of race, color, religion, sex (including pregnancy, sexual orientation or gender identity), national origin, disability,
age, genetic information, political affiliation, or veteran status, and to promote equal employment through a
positive, continuing program from itself and each of its sub-contracting agents. This program of equal employment
opportunity shall apply to every aspect of its employment policies and practices.

The Kentucky Equal Employment Opportunity Act of 1978 (KRS 45.560-45.640) requires that any county, city,
town, school district; water district, hospital district, .or other political subdivision of the state shall include in directly
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or indirectly publicly funded contracts for supplies, materials, services, or equipment hereinafter entered into the
following provisions: o o

Durihg the performance of this contract, the contractor agreés as follows:

(1) The contractor will not discriminate against any employee or applicant for employment because of race,
color, religion, sex, age or national origin;

(2) The contractor will state in alf solicitations or advertisements for employees placed by or on behalf of the
contractors that all qualified applicants will receive cons ideration for employment without regard to race,
color, religion, sex, age or national origin;

(3) The contractor will post notices in conspicuous places, available to employees and applicants for
employment, setting forth the provisions of the non-discrimination clauses required by this section; and

(4) The contractor will send a notice to each labor union or representative of workers with which he has a
collective bargaining agreement or other contract or understanding aavising the Jabor union or workers'
representative of the contractor's commitments under the nondiscrimination clauses.

The Act further provides:

KRS 45.610. Hiring minorities - Information required

(1) For the length of the contract, each contractor shall hire minorities from other sources within the drawing
area, should the union with which he has collective bargaining agreements be unwilling to supply sufficient
minorities to satisfy the agreed upon goals and timetable.

(2) Each contractor shall, for the length of the contract, furnish such information as required by KRS 45.560 to

KRS 45.640 and by such rules, regulations and orders issued pursuant thereto and will permit access to all

books and records pertaining to his employment practices and work sites by the contracting agency and

the department for purposes of investigation to ascertain compliance with KRS 45. 560 to 45.640 and such
rules, regulations and orders issued pursuant thereto.

KRS 45.620. Action against contractor - Hiring of minority contractor or subcontractor

(1)  If any contractor is found by the department to have engaged in an unlawful practice under this chapter
during the course of performing under a contract or subcontract co vered under KRS 45.560 to 45.640, the
department shall so certify to the contracting agency and such certification shall be binding upon the
contracting agency unless It is reversed in the course of judicial review.

(2) “If the contractor is found to have committed an urilawful practice under KRS 45. 560 to 45.640, the
contracting agency may cancel or terminate the contract, conditioned upon a program for future compliance
approved by the contracting agency and the department. The contracting agency may declare such a
contractor ineligible to bid on further contracts with that agency until such time as the contractor complies
in full with the requirements of KRS 45.560 to 45.640.

(3) The equal employment provisions of KRS 45.560 to 45.640 may be met in part by a contractor by
subcontracting to a minority contractor or subcontractor. For the provisions of KRS 45.560 to 45.640, a
minority contractor or subcontractor shall mean a business that is owned and controfled by one or more
persons disadvantaged by racial or ethnic circumstances.

KRS 45.630 Termination of existing employee not required, when

Any provision of KRS 45. 560 to 45.640 notwithstanding, no contractor shall be required to terminate an existing
employee upon proof that that employee was employed prior to the date of the contract.

KRS 45.640 Minimum skills

Nothing in KRS 45.560 to 45. 640 shall require a contractor to hire anyone who fails to demonstrate the minimum
skills required to perform a. particular job.

It is recommended that all of the provisions above. quoted to be included as special conditions in each contract.
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In the case of a contract exceeding $250,000, the contractor is required to furnish evidence that his work-force
in Kentucky is representative of the available work-force in the area from which he draws employees, or to
supply an Affirmative Action plan which will achieve such representation during the life of the contract.

Any party, firm or individual submitting a proposal pursuant to this invitation must be in compliance with the
requirements of the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government regarding taxes and fees before they can be
considered for award of this invitation and must maintain a "current” status with regard to those taxes and fees
throughout the term of the contract. The contractor must be in compliance with Chapter 13 from the Code of
Ordinances of the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government. The contractor must be in compliance with
Ordinance 35-2000 pursuant to contractor registration with the Division of Building Inspection. If applicable,
said business must have a Fayette County business license.

Pursuant to KRS 45A.343 and KRS 45A.345, the contractor shall

(1) Reveal any final determination of a violation by the contractor within the previous five year period pursuant
to KRS Chapters 136 (corporation and utility taxes), 139 (sales and use taxes), 141 (income taxes), 337
(wages and hours), 338 (occupational safety and health of employees), 341 (unemployment and
compensation) and 342 (labor and human rights) that apply to the contractor; and

(2) Bein continuous compliance with the above-mentioned KRS provisions that apply to the contractor for
the duration of the contract.

A contractor's failure to reveal the above or to comply with such provisions. for the duration of the contract shall be
grounds for cancellation of the contract and disqualification of the contractor from eligibility for future contracts for
a period of two (2) years.

Vendors who respond to this invitation have the right to file a notice of contention associated with the bid
process or to file a notice of appeal of the recommendation made by the Director of Central Purchasing
resulting from this invitation.

Notice of contention with the bid process must be filed within 3 business days of the bid/proposal opening
by (1) sending a written notice, induding sufficient documentation to support contention, to the Director of
the Division of Central Purchasing or (2) submitting a written request for a meeting with the Director of
Central Purchasing to explain his/her contention with the bid process. After consulting with the Commissioner
of Finance the Chief Administrative Officer and reviewing the documentation and/or hearing the vendor, the
Director of Central Purchasing shall promptly respond in writing findings as to the compliance with bid
processes. If, based on this review, a bid process irregularity is deemed to have occurred the Director of
Central Purchasing will consuit with the Commissioner of Finance, the Chief Administrative Officer and the
Department of Law as to the appropriate remedy.

Notice of appeal of a bid recommendation must be filed within 3 business days of the bid recommendation
by (1) sending a written notice, including sufficient documentation to support appeal, to the Director, Division
of Central Purchasing or (2) submitting a written request for a meeting with the Director of Central Purchasing
to explain his appeal. After reviewing the documentation and/or hearing the vendor and consulting with the
Commissioner of Finance and the Chief Administrative Officer, the Director of Central Purchasing shall in
writing, affirm or withdraw the recommendation.
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IIL.

P

A

B.

rocurement Contract Bid _Co’nditions

The terms of this agreement shall be for 1. year(s) from the date of acceptance of this contract by the Lexington-
Fayette Urban County Government. This agreement may be automatically extended for an- additional (3)-1 -
year(s) renewal. This contract may be canceled by either party thirty (30) days after delivery by canceling party -

- of written notice of intent to cancel to the other contracting party.

' Price Changes (Space Checked Applies)

01, Prices quoted in response to the Invitation shall be firm prices for the first 365 days of the Procurement

Contract. After 365 days, prices may be subject to revision and such changes shall be based on general
industry changes. Revision may be either increases or decreases and may be requested by either party.
There will be no more than one (1) price adjustment per quarter. Requests for price changes shall be
received in writing at least twenty (20) days prior to the effective date and are subject to written acceptance
before becoming effective. Proof of the validity of a request for revision shall be responsibility of the
requesting party. The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government shall receive the benefit of any decline
that the seller shall offer his other accounts.

0O 2. No provision for price change is made herein. Prices are to be firm for the term of this contract.

0 3. See bid specifications.

If any contract item is not available from the vendor, the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government, at its
option, may permit the item to be back-ordered or may procure the item on the open market.

All invoices must bear reference to the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government Purchasing document
numbers which are being billed.

This contract may be canceled by the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government if it is determined that the
Bidder has failed to perform under the terms of this agreement, such cancellation to be effective upon receipt of
written notice of cancellation by the Bidder.

No substitutions for articles specified herein may be made without prior approval of the Division of Central
Purchasing.

Page 7 of 30



EQUAL OPPORTUNITY AGREEMENT

Standard Title VI Assurance

The Lexington Fayette-Urban County Government, (hereinafter referred to as the “Recipient”) hereby agrees that as a-condition
to receiving any Federal financial assistance fror the U.S. Department of Transportation, it will comply with Title VI of the Civil
Rights Act of 1964, 78Stat.252, 42 U.S.C. 2000d-4 (hereinafter referred to as the “Act”), and all requirements imposed by or
pursuant to Title 49, Code of Federal Regulations, U.S. Department of Transportation, Subtitle A, Office of the Secretary, (49
CFR, Part 21) Nondiscrimination in Federally Assisted Program of the Department of Transportation — Effectuation of Title VI of
the Civil Rights Act of 1964 (hereinafter referred to as the “Regulations”) and other pertinent directives, no person in the United
States shall, on the grounds of race, color, national origin, sex, age (over 40), religion, sexual orientation, gender identity,
veteran status, or disability be excluded from participation in, be denied the benefits of, or be otherwise subjected to
discrimination under any program or activity for which the Recipient receives Federal financial assistance from the U.S.
Department of Transportation, including the Federal Highway Administration, and hereby gives assurance that will promptly
take any necessary measures to effectuate this agreement. This assurance is required by subsection 21.7(a) (1) of the
Regulations.

The Law

Title VII of the Civil Rights Act of 1964 (amended 1972) states that it is unlawful for an employer to discriminate in
employment because of race, color, religion, sex, age (40-70 years) or national origin.

Executive Order No. 11246 on Nondiscrimination under Federal contract prohibits employment discrimination by contractor
and sub-contractor doing business with the Federal Government or recipients of Federal funds. This order was later
amended by Executive Order No. 11375 to prohibit discrimination on the basis of sex.

Section 503 of the Rehabilitation Act of 1973 states: The Contractor will not discriminate against any employee or applicant
for employment because of ph ysical or mental disability.

Section 2012 of the Vietnam Era Veterans Readjustment Act of 1973 requires Affirmative Action on behalf of disabled
veterans and veterans of the Vietnam Era by contractors having Federal contracts.

Section 206(A) of Executive Order 12086, Consolidation of Contract Compliance Functions for Equal Employment
Opportunity, states: The Secretary of Labor may investigate the employment practices of any Government contractor or
sub-contractor to determine whether or not the contractual provisions specified in Section 202 of this order have been
violated.

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government practices Equal Opportunity in recruiting, hiring and promoting. It is the
Government's intent to affirmatively provide employment opportunities for those individuals who have previously not been
allowed to enter into the mainstream of society. Because of its importance to the local Government, this policy carries the full
endorsement of the Mayor, Commissioners, Directors and ali supervisory personnel. In following this commitment to Equal
Employment Opportunity and because the Government is the benefactor of the Federal funds, it is both against the Urban
County Government policy and illegal for the Government to let contracts to companies which knowingly or unknowingly practice
discrimination in their employment practices. Violation of the above mentioned ordinances may cause a contract to be canceled
and the contractors may be declared ineligible for future consideration.

Please sign this statement in the appropriate space acknowledging that you have read and understand the provisions contained
herein. Return this document as part of your application packet.

Bidders

I/We agree to comply with the Givil Rights Laws listed above that govern employment rights of }ninoriz‘ies, women, veteran
status, disability and age.

VY Y O T Al Esrii et
/%ﬁ//{ gﬁﬁ// Al :C,,.c,vkm@ o tQumoT L’Q“u@

< sigriafure Name of Business -

I
ke
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GENERAL PROVISIONS OF BID CONTRACT '

By signing the below, bidder acknowledges that it understands and agrees with the following provisions related to its bid
response and the provision of any goods or services to LFUCG upon selection by LFUCG pursuant to the bid request:

1,

10.

11.

- 120
- - without cause, by providing at least thirty (30) days advance written notice unless a different advance written notice

Bidder shall comply with all Federal, State & Local regulations concerning this type of service or good. All applicabte
state laws, ordinances and resolutions (including but not limited to Section 2-33 (Discrimination due to sexual
orientation or gender identity) and Chapter 13 (Licenses and Regulations) of the Lexington-Fayette Urban County
Government Code of Ordinances, and Resolution No. 484-17 (Minority, Women, and Veteran-Owned Businesses))
and the regulations of ail authorities having jurisdiction over the project shall apply to the contract, and shall be
deemed to be incorporated herein by reference.

Failure to submit ALL forms and information required by LFUCG may be grounds for disqualification.

Addenda: All addenda and TonWave Q8A, if any, must be considered by the bidder in making its response, and
such addenda shall be made a part of the requirements of the bid contract. Before submitting a bid response, itis
incumbent upon bidder to be informed as to whether any addenda have been issued, and the failure of the bidder
to cover any such addenda may result in disqualification of that response.

Bid Reservations: LFUCG reserves the right to reject any or all bid responses, to award in whale or part, and to
waive minor immaterial defects in proposals. LFUCG may consider any alternative proposal that meets its basic
needs.

Liability: LFUCG is not responsible for any cost incurred by bidder in the preparation of its.response.

Changes/Alterations: Bidder may change or withdraw'a proposal at any time prior to the opening; however, no oral
modifications will be allowed. Only letters, or other formal written requests for modifications or corrections of a
previously submitted proposal which is addressed in the same manner as the bid response, and received by LFUCG
prior to the scheduled closing time for receipt of bids, will be accepted. The bid response when opened, will then
be corrected in accordance with such written request(s), provided that the written request is contained in a sealed
envelope which is plainly marked “modifications of bid response”.

Clarification of Submittal: LFUCG reserves the right to obtain clarification of any point in a bid or to obtain additional
information from any bidder.

Bribery Clause: By his/her signature on its response, bidder certifies that no employee of his/hers, any affiliate or
subcontractor, has bribed or attempted to bribe an officer or employee of the LFUCG.

Additional Information: While not necessary, the bidder may include any product brochures, software
documentation, sample reports, or other documentation that may assist LFUCG in better understanding and
evaluating the bid response. Additional documentation shall not serve as a substitute for other documentation
which is required by the LFUCG to be submitted with the bid response.

Ambiguity, Conflict or other Errors: If a bidder discovers any ambiguity, conflict, discrepancy, omission or other
error in the bid request of LFUCG, it shall immediately notify LFUCG of such error in writing and request modification
or clarification of the document if allowable by the LFUCG.

Agreement to Bid Terms: In submitting its bid response, the bidder agrees that it has carefully examined the
specifications and all provisions relating to LFUCG's bid request, including but not limited to the bid contract. By
submission of its bid response, bidder states that it understands the meaning, intent and requirements of LFUCG's
bid request and agrees to the same. The successful bidder shall warrant that it is familiar with and understands all
provisions herein and shall warrant that it can comply with them. No additional compensation to bidder shall be
authorized for services, expenses, OF goods reasonably covered under these provisions that the bidder omits from
its bid response.

Cancellation: LFUCG may unilaterally terminate the bid contract with the selected bidder(s) at any time, with or
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13.

14.

15.

16.-

17.

18.

19.

20.

21,

‘period is negotiated prior to.contract approval. Payment for services or goods received prior to termination shall be

made by the LFUCG provided these goods or services were provided in a manner acceptable to the LFUCG. Payment
for those goods and services.shall not be unreasonably withheld. '

Assignment of Contract: The selected bidder(s) shall not assign or subcontract any portion of the bid contract with
LFUCG without the express written consent of LFUCG. Any purported assignment or subcontract in violation hereof
shall be void. It is expressly acknowledged that LFUCG shall never be required or obligated to consent to.any request
for assignment or subcontract; and further that such refusal to consent can be for any or no reason; fully within the
sole discretion of LFUCG.

No Waiver: No failure or delay by LFUCG in exercising any right, remedy, power or privilege hereunder, nor any
single or partial exercise thereof, nor the exercise of any other right, remedy, power or privilege shall operate as a
waiver hereof or thereof. No failure or delay by LFUCG in exercising any right, remedy, power or privilege under or
in respect of this bid proposal or bid contract shall affect the rights, remedies, powers or privileges of LFUCG
hereunder or shall operate as a waiver thereof.

Authority to do Business: Each bidder must be authorized to do business under the laws of the Commonweaith of
Kentucky and must be in good standing and have full legal capadity to provide the goods or services specified in
the bid proposal. Each bidder must have all necessary right and lawful authority to submit the bid response and
enter into the bid contract for the full term hereof including any necessary corporate or other action authorizing the
bidder to submit the bid response and enter into this bid contract. If requested, the bidder will provide LFUCG with
a copy of a corporate resolution authorizing this action and/or a letter from an attorney confirming that the proposer
is authorized to do business in the Commonwealth of Kentucky. All bid responses must be signed by a duly
authorized officer, agent or employee of the bidder.

Governing Law: This bid request and bid contract shall be governed by and construed in accordance with the laws
of the Commonwealth of Kentucky. In the event of any proceedings regarding this matter, the bidder agrees that
the venue shall be the Fayette County Circuit Court or the U.S. District Court for the Eastern District of Kentucky,
Lexington Division and that the bidder expressly consents to personal jurisdiction and venue in such Court for the
limited and sole purpose of proceedings relating to these matters or any rights or obligations arising thereunder.

Ability to Meet Obligations: Bidder affirmatively states that there are no actions, suits or proceedings of any kind
pending against bidder or, to the knowledge of the bidder, threatened against the bidder before or by any court,
governmental body or agency or other tribunal or authority which would, if adversely determined, have a materially
adverse effect on the authority or ability of bidder to perform its obligations under this bid response or bid contract,
or which question the legality, validity or enforceability hereof or thereof.

Price Discrepancy: When applicable, in case of price discrépancy, unit bid price written in words will prevail followed
by unit price written in numbers then total amount bid per line item.

Bidder understands and agrees that its employees, agents, or subcontractors are not employees of LFUCG for any
purpose whatsoever. Bidder is an independent contractor at all times related to the bid response or bid contract.

Contractor [or Vendor or Vendor’s Employees] will not appropriate or make use of the Lexington-Fayette Urban
County Government (LFUCG) name or any of its trade or service marks or property (including but not limited to
any logo or seal), in any promotion, endorsement, advertisement, testimonial or similar use without the prior
written consent of the government. If such consent is granted LFUCG reserves the unilateral right, in its sole
discretion, to immediately terminate and revoke such use for any reason whatsoever. Contractor agrees that it
shall cease and desist from any unauthorized use immediately upon being notified by LFUCG.

If any term or provision of this bid contract shall be found to be illegal or unenforceable, the remainder of the
contract shall remain in full force and such term or provision shall be deemed stricken.

/%!ﬁ//;g//zﬁ J"L%»———fl’ (0351 39~

ignature Date
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WORKFORCE ANALYSIS FORM

e (/Zﬂ e Ak a”(,TF?l} J[A e {:?i;{’w 2GS £ (TF Y ,/’J/')
Name of Organization™_ " Pt ey e ,“;_.x.r\%_, EPY L d;~
- : 5 ,
Categories Total White Hispanic | Black or Native Asian American Two or Total
or African- | Hawaiian (Not Indian or | more races
_(NOt . Latino | American and Hispanic | Alaskan
Hispanic (Not Other or Native . (No.t
or Hispanic Pacific Latino (not Hlspa_nlc or
Latino) orLatino | Islander Hispanic Latino
(Not or Latino
Hispanic
. . _or Latino

MFMFMFMFMFMFM F |M|F

Administrators

Professionals

Superintendents

Supervisors

Foremen

Technicians

Protective Service

Para-Professionals

Office/Clerical

Skilled Craft
RervicelMa‘intenance

L Total:

/ﬂ o K2l ) ¥ s . - “’ - N
Prepared by: H\}( h’”?"i\\;‘}"'i{ﬁ./ e d‘fﬁv } / f/ i C&,(}L/W’ Date: [ O I‘)L SO d%//}\

(Name and Title) Revised 2015-Dec-15
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Bid 129-2022 Addendum 1
General Traffic Equipment Corp.
Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 129-2022 Addendum 1

Title: Traffic Signal and Control Equipment

Type: Competitive Bid

Issue Date: 10/5/2022

Deadline: 10/26/2022 02:00 PM (ET)

Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS
SOLICITATION. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE LINE
ITEMS TAB ONLY. PRICING WITHIN SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE
ACCEPTED AND MAY MAKE YOUR BID NON-RESPONSIVE.

PLEASE SCAN FORMS IN 1 FILE.

YOU MUST CLICK YES ON THE ATTRIBUTES TAB TO SUBMIT.

Contact Information

Contact: Jessica Allinder

Address: Central Purchasing
Government Center Building
Room 338
200 East Main Street
Lexington, KY 40507

Fax: (859) 2583322

Email: jallinder@lexingtonky.gov
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General Traffic EQuipment Corp. Information

Address: 259 Broadway
Newburgh, NY 12550

Phone:  (845) 569-9000

Fax: (845) 569-1800

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED! By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent
and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached
bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

Raymond Staffon rays@generaltrafficequip.com

Signature Email
Submitted at 10/26/2022 01:15:12 PM (ET)

Response Attachments

Lexington 129-2022.pdf
sign forms 129-2022
Lexington Addendum #1.pdf
Addendum#1

Bid Attributes

1 | Bid package
Have you completed and attached your bid package? This is a contractual agreement and required for all bids.
YES (YES)

Bid Lines

1 [ 2070L Complete with everything - Base Mount Cabinet #332
Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid

2 | Surge Protection Panel for 332 Controller Cabinet w/Lane Use Control
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3 | 2070L w/Intelight Maxtime Software Complete with everything - Base Mount Cabinet #332 with Lane Use Control
Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid

4 | 2070L w/Intelight Maxtime Software Complete with everything - Pole Mount Cabinet #336S
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

5 [ Traffic Control Cabinet #1
Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid

6 | Traffic Control Cabinet #2
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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Traffic Control Cabinet #3

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
8 | Traffic Control Cabinet - Pole Mount # 336S

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
9 [ 2070L 332 Base Mount Rack/Terminal Facility

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% 2070L 332 Base Mount Rack/Terminal Facility for Lane Use Control

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% 2070L Pole Mount (336S) Rack/Terminal Facility

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Flasher Cabinet #1

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
1 | Flasher cabinet with NEMA 3 flasher
3 _ :

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
3.1 Time of Day Controller Cabinet

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
% Time Clock #1

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Conflict Monitor: NEMA 12-channel, ENHANCED

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Conflict Monitor: Model EDI 2010 ECL, ENHANCED

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Conflict Monitor, EDI 2018 Kclip

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
% MonitorKey CMU Data Key Programming Tool (EDI 2018 Kclip)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
(2) Inductive loop vehicle detector

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
2 | DC isolator, 242L with fuse
1 _ :

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
2 | Switch pack, Model 200 with indicators
2 .

No Bid

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA
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2 | Flasher, NEMA 3, alternate circuit, model 204

3 :

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
i Automated Conflict Monitor Tester

Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $9,000.00| Total: | $9,000.00 |
% LED Countdown Pedestrian Signal w/Housing (ICC)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $252.00| Total: | $252.00 |
% LED Countdown Pedestrian Signal Module

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $118.00] Total: | $118.00 |
% LED Countdown Pedestrian Signal with Mounting Hardware Kit: International Legend

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:| $332.00| Total:| $332.00|
% LED Countdown Pedestrian signal, 1-Way

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
§2; LED Countdown Pedestrian signal, 2-way

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
3 | Pedestal pole
0 _ :

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
3 | Pedestal Base w/reinforced collar
1 .

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
3 [ Pedestal Pole, 10-foot, Painted Black
2 _ :

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g Pedestal Base anchor bolts, %-inch x 18-inch, set of four

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
2 Pedestal Base anchor bolts, %4-inch x 26-inch, set of four

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g Pedestrian signal top bracket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g Pedestal pole (2) way mounting brackets

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
f; Pedestal pole top bracket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
3 | Pedestrian Push Button Box
8 No Bid

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA
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Pedestrian Push Button, Rees

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g Pedestrian Push Button, Bulldog

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
4 | Pedestrian Push Button with Box
1 _ :

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g Pedestrian Push Button Assembly, 1-direction

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
:Agf Pedestrian Push Button Assembly, 2-direction

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
2 Pedestrian Push Button Sign with a Left Arrow

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
g Pedestrian Push Button Sign with a Right Arrow

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g Pedestal Pole Cap

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
% Pedestrian Signal (Single) Mounting Hardware Kit

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $85.00| Total: | $85.00|
g LED Vehicle signal with Back-plate, 12-12-12

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
g LED Left Turn Vehicle signal, 12-12-12 with Back-plate

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
8 LED 5-Section Vehicle signal with Back-plate

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
? LED 4-Section Vehicle signal with Back-plate

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
g LED 4-Section FYA Vehicle signal with Back-plate

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
g Vehicle Signal Lens, LED Retrofit: 12-inch, Green

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $30.00| Total: | $30.00 |
2 Vehicle Signal Lens, LED Retrofit: 12-inch, Yellow

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $30.00| Total: | $30.00 |
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5 [ Vehicle Signal Lens, LED Retrofit: 12-inch, Red
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $30.00| Total: | $30.00 |

5 | Vehicle Signal Lens, LED Retrofit: 12-inch, Left Turn Green
Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $32.50 | Total: | $32.50 |

5 | Vehicle Signal Lens, LED Retrofit: 12-inch, Left Turn Yellow
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $32.50 | Total: | $32.50 |

5 | Vehicle Signal Lens, LED Retrofit: 12-inch, Left Turn Red
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $32.50| Total: | $32.50 |

5 | LED Signal section (Red)
Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid

6 | LED Signal Section (Yellow)
Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid

6 | LED Signal Section (Green)
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

6 | Solar RRFB System (TAPCO) #1
Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid

6 | Solar RRFB System (TAPCO) #2
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

6 | Solar RRFB Bulldog Il Kit (TAPCO)
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

6 | Solar RRFB XAV2-LED Push Button
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

6 | Dual Red Mounting Hardware, Span Wire Mount
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

6 | Dual Red Mounting Hardware, Mast Arm Mount, Vertical
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

6 [ LED Dual Red Veh. signal w/Mtg. Hrdwre., Span Wire Mount, w/Back-plate
Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid

6 | LED Dual Red Veh. signal w/Mtg. Hrdwre., Mast Arm Mount, w/Back-plate
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

7 | Tri-Stud slip fitter assembly, for 2-way signal
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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LED Lane Use Control signal/sign, 24-inch x 24-inch

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Z LED Lane use control signal/sign, 36-inch x 36-inch #1

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
g LED Lane use control signal/Sign, 32-inch x 38-inch Tall #1

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Z LED Lane use control Message Sign, 30-inch x 39-inch

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g LED Lane use control Message Sign, 36-inch x 36-inch #2

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g LED Lane use control signal, 30-inch x 36-inch

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
; LED Lane use control signal, 32-inch x 38-inch Tall #2

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g Loop Lead-In, 2-pair (priced in lengths of 1000 feet)

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
g Loop Lead-In, 4-pair (priced in lengths of 5,000 feet)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
8 Signal Cable, IMSA 20-1, 7 conductor, (1000 ft. Wooden Reel)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
? Signal Cable, IMSA 20-1, 16 conductor, (1000 ft. Wooden Reel)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g Signal Cable, IMSA 19-1, 2-conductor w/o Shield (1000-ft)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g Messenger Cable, 8M High Strength, (500 ft. Wooden Reel only)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
2 Messenger Cable, 8M High Strength, (1000 ft. Wooden Reel only)

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
g Messenger Cable, 10M High Strength, (500 ft. Wooden Reel only)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g Messenger Cable, 10M High Strength, (1000 ft. Wooden Reel only)

No Bid

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA
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Metal Cabinet Filter for 332 Cabinet, 12" x 16" x 1”

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g Metal Cabinet Filter for 336S Cabinet, 6" x 16” x 1”

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
g Bi-Modal LED Traffic Signal Module, 12-inch, Yellow Arrow/Yellow Arrow

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
8 Traffic Bearing Junction Box wi/Lid

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
? Signal Tether Clamp, Tri-Stud, breakaway, 2-parts

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g Sign Tether Bracket, Equivalent to PELCO SE-5046-19

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
g Sign Tether Bracket, Equivalent to PELCO SE-5046-24

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
?1 Strand Vise, 3/8 inch (Reliable 5152), no substitute

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g Strand Vise, 5/16 inch (Reliable 5151), no substitute

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g Strand Vise, 1/4 inch (Reliable 5150), no substitute

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g Strand Link, 3/8 inch (Reliable 5002), no substitute

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g Strand Link, 5/16 inch (Reliable 5001), no substitute

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
8 Strand Link, 1/4 inch (Reliable 5000), no substitute

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Reducing Strand Link, 3/8 inch to 5/16 inch (Reliable #5022), no substitutes
0 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Construction and mounting hardware for four-way adjustable signal
1 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Construction and mounting hardware for three-way adjustable signal
2 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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% Construction and mounting hardware for two-way adjustable signal

3 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Tri-Bolt Span Wire Assembly

4 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% School Sign Assembly

5 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% School Sign Assembly with Time of Day Controller/Cabinet

6 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Aerial Cable Ties, Panduit PLT 3H TL100, per 1000

7 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Cable Ring, Copperweld, 2-inch, order = 500

8 [Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Cable Ring, 3.5-inch, Copperweld

9 [Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Signal Bracket, Mast Arm, Vertical Mount, 120” cable, Cluster Design

0 |Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: | $250.00] Total: | $250.00 |
% Signal Bracket, Mast Arm, Vertical Mount, 120” cable, for 12-12-12 signal

1 |Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $134.00| TotaI:| $134.00|
% Sign Bracket, Mast Arm, Vertical Mount, 24”, 120” cable

2 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Sign Bracket, Mast Arm, Vertical Mount, 30”7, 120” cable

3 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Signal Bkt., Mast Arm, Horizontal Mount, 120” cable, 12-12-12 Std. Signal

4 | Quantity: _ 1  UOM: EA Unit Price: $134.00| TotaI:| $134.00|
% Signal Bracket, Mast Arm, Free Swinging Mount, 120” Cable

5 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Power Supply, Solar Power: 200-watt, 12-VDC

6 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Iteris Vantage Universal Camera Mounting Bracket

7 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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% Mast Arm Mounting Assembly for Video Detection Cameras, 74” Tube
8 [Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Video Detection System (8-Phase)
9 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Video Detection System (4-Phase)
0 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Video Detection System (2-Phase)
1 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Video Detection System (3-Phase)
2 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
1 | Video Detection Processor
2 _ :
3 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
1 | Video Detection Extension Module
2 _ :
4 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Iteris LAM (Lens Adjustment Module)
5 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Iteris Versa Cam Package, Complete
6 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% PolyPhaser Surge Suppression Unit
7 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
1 | Iteris Video Detection Color Camera
2 _ :
8 [Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Video Detection/Power Composite Cable, #1, 500-ft on a wooden reel
9 [Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Video Detection/Power Composite Cable, #2, 1000-ft on a wooden reel
0 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Solar Powered School Speed Limit When Flashing Signal
1 |Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
1 | Solar Powered School Speed Limit When Flashing Signal, pole mount components, span wire mounted signals
g & sign

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Page 10 of 16 pages Vendor: General Traffic Equipment Corp. Bid 129-2022 Addendum 1




wWwE

Solar Powered School Speed Limit When Flashing Signal, pole mount components, mast arm mounted signals

& sign

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
% Surge Arrestor (Digital Radio)
4 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Accessible Pedestrian Detection System (8-Directions)
5 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Accessible Pedestrian Detection System (4-Directions)
6 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% iNavigator #iIN2 2-wire Push Button Station #1
7 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% iNavigator #iIN2 2-wire Push Button Station #2
8 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% iNavigator Ped Head Control Unit Assy
9 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
%{ ADA Push Button Adaptor, Polara #iN-9ODEGADPTR w/Black Powdercoat
0 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
:AL, Astro Bracket, Pelco #AS3009, 120” stainless steel cable
1 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
1 | Lock Key, Corbin #2
4 :
2 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
%{ Police Panel Key, Long Shank
3 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
%{ Manual Operation Police Pushbuttons
4 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
%{ 2070L Traffic Signal Controller with Software
5 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
%{ 1C CPU Module, #1 (for 2070L Traffic Signal Controller)
6 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
%{ 1C CPU Module, #2 (for 2070L Traffic Signal Controller)
7 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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2A C1 Field I/0 Module (for 2070L Traffic Signal Controller)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
}1 3B LCD Display Module (for 2070L Traffic Signal Controller)
9 [Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% 4A Power Supply (for 2070L Traffic Signal Controller)
0 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Solar Powered Crosswalk Lights, Active Beacon
1 |Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Solar Powered 24-hour Flashing Beacon
2 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% LED Street Name Sign, See specifications
3 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
1 | Tri-Stud Adaptor Kit
5 :
4 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Free Swinging Sign Hanger: 16-inch CTC, Pelco #SE-5117
5 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-CLK-112 2 Channel Contact Closure Rack Card (Matrix or Advance)
6 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-CLK-114 4 Channel Contact Closure Rack Card (Matrix or Advance)
7 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-CLK-201/202 24 VDC 2 A Power Supply
8 [Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-CLK-204 24 VDC 4 A Power Supply
9 [Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-CLK-210 Circuit Breaker 0.5 Amp
0 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-CLK-210-02, Circuit Breaker 2.0 Amp
1 |Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-CLK-222 Two Sensor Surge & Comm Module (Matrix & Advance)
2 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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WX-CLK-223 One Sensor Surge & Comm Module (Matrix or Advance)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-CLK-230 120 VAC Surge
4 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-CLK-301 Serial to Ethernet converter
5 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-CLK-304 RS 232 to RS 485 converter
6 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-SS-200V, SmartSensor Advance Sensor (SS200V)
7 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-SS-225, SmartSensor Matrix Stop Bar Sensor (SS225)
8 [Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-SS-611, Heavy Duty Sensor Mount - 6" - 2 axis aluminum bracket
9 [Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-SS-710, In Line Terminal strip junction box
0 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-SS-704-020, SmartSensor Power and Communication Cable w/ Connector - 20 feet
1 |Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-SS-704-040, SmartSensor Power and Communication Cable w/ Connector - 40 feet
2 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-SS-704-080, SmartSensor Power and Communication Cable w/ Connector - 80 feet
3 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-SS-705-500, Bulk Cable Spool 500'
4 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
1 | WX-100-0064 Din Rail 9"
7 _ .
5 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
1 | WX-100-0065 Din Rail 12"
7 _ .
6 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-100-0277, T-Bus Connector (Gray, Power only)
7 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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WX-100-0281 RS-485/USB Mini-Converter (connects laptop to Click!222 RS-485 bridge port

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-205-0000 T-Bus Connector (Green, Power & Comm)
9 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-310-0014 RJ-11, White, 60 inch Patch Cord
0 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-228-0020 T-Bus Left End Right Angle
1 |Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-CLK-200 System Surge Protector (for 1 HD Sensor)
2 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-SS-101-0415, SmartSensor HD Sensor, Dual Radar Side Fire Sensor
3 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-SS-701-020, SmartSensor HD Pigtail, Power/Comm. with Connector - 20 feet
4 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-SS-701-040, SmartSensor HD Pigtail, Power/Comm. with Connector - 40 feet
5 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-SS-706-500/707, HD SmartSensor 8-conductor Cable Spool, 500’
6 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% WX-102-0462, Wavetronix Click 650/656 Mounting Shelf
7 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Wavetronix Click!650 (item 102-0416)
8 [Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Wavetronix Click!656 (item 102-0451)
9 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Wavetronix SDLC Cable (item WX-SDLC-15/25)
0 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% UPS Battery Backup System (for 332D cabinet)
1 |Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Surge Panel (Camera):
2 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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% LED Light Strip for llluminated Street Name Sign

3 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Power Supply 24-volt for llluminated Street Name Sign

4 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Photocontrol for llluminated Street Name Sign

5 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% LED 4-section Dual Red Traffic Signal, Horizontal Mount w/Mtg Hrdwre & Backplate

6 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% 332 Riser Base

7 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
1 | Safetran 332D Control Cabinet

9 _ :
8 [Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% GGl Road and Traffic LED Quick Change Kit:

9 [Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Battery Backup System for 332 Cabinet (UPStealth 2):

0 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% UPStealth2 500-Watt Panel with all necessary cables

1 |Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Radar Speed Feedback Sign Assembly (see attached specification)

2 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Thermal (Flir) Detection System (8-Phase)

3 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Thermal (Flir) Detection System (4-Phase):

4 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Thermal (Flir) Detection System (2-Phase)

5 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Thermal (Flir) Detection Processor, TI BPL2 Edge B&SIU

6 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Thermal (Flir) Detection Sensor, TrafiSense 2

7 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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Thermal (Flir) SDLC or Special SDLC Cable

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Thermal (Flir) Detection Cable, 1000’ Reel
9 [Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Thermal (Flir) Sensor Power Supply Panel
0 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Econolite ATCC 352 Cabinet Assembly
1 |Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
2| 2070-7T GPS Module
1 :
2 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Response Total: $10,492.50
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