



LEXINGTON

**Bid 106-2019 Addendum 2
911 Fleet & Fire Equipment
Supplier Response**

Event Information

Number: Bid 106-2019 Addendum 2
Title: Emergency Equipment for LFD
Type: Competitive Bid
Issue Date: 9/30/2019
Deadline: 10/17/2019 02:00 PM (ET)
Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS SOLICITATION
. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE LINE ITEMS TAB ONLY.
PRICING WITHIN SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED AND MAY MAKE YOUR BID NON-RESPONSIVE.

Contact Information

Contact: Jessica Allinder
Address: Central Purchasing
Government Center Building
Room 338
200 East Main Street
Lexington, KY 40507
Fax: (859) 2583322
Email: jallinder@lexingtonky.gov

911 Fleet & Fire Equipment Information

Contact: Brian Lowry
Address: 11 Lendale Drive
Florence
Florence, KY 41042
Phone: (859) 271-0212
Toll Free: (877) 605-2378
Email: blowry@911fleet.com

By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

Chad Smith

Signature

Submitted at 10/15/2019 1:08:52 PM

chad.eng1@gmail.com

Email

Response Attachments

addendum 1.pdf

Addendum 1

addendum 2.pdf

addendum 2

affidavit.pdf

affidavit

mwebd forms.pdf

MWEBD

workforce analysis.pdf

Workforce Analysis

Bid Lines

1	Talon Fire Sprinkler Tools Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Quickstop"/>	No Bid
2	Sprinkler Shutoffs (Recess Head Screw Type) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Telelite"/>	No Bid
3	Sprinkler Shutguns Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Technicraft Product Design Inc"/>	No Bid

4	14'x18' Salvage Covers (22 oz. Red)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$380.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$380.00"/>	
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Fold-A-Tank"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="SC14x18"/>		
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>		
5	3'x15' Floor Runners (18 oz. Yellow)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$29.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$29.00"/>	
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Husky or Fol-Da-Tank"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="HR 3 X 12"/>		
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>		
6	Water Can Harnesses	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> Each </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$49.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$49.00"/>	
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>		
7	ABC Extinguisher (20 lb)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	No Bid
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Amerex"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="A411"/>		
8	CO2 Extinguisher (20 lb)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	No Bid
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Amerex"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="332"/>		
9	Class D Met LX Red Line Cartridge Extinguisher (30 lb)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	No Bid
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Ansel"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="MX-1-30-6-1"/>		
10	Class D Sodium Chloride Fire Extinguisher (30 lb)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	No Bid
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Amerex"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="B570"/>		
11	2.5 Gallon Pressurized Water Extinguisher or Badger Model WP-61; NO PLASTIC BASE	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	No Bid
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Kidde"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="PRO 2.5W"/>		

1 2	10 lb. Sledge Hammer Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>Each</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$40.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$40.00"/> Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping. FHU SHF-10"/>
1 3	48" Pry Bar Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>Each</u> No Bid
1 4	36" Bolt Cutter Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>Each</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$80.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$80.00"/> Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping. FHU BC-36"/>
1 5	K-Tool W/Pouch and Accessories Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>Each</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$129.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$129.00"/> Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping. FHU KTKIT"/>
1 6	Rex Tool Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>Each</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$155.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$155.00"/> Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping. FHU REXT"/>
1 7	Rabbit Tool Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>Each</u> No Bid
1 8	6 lb. Pick Head Axe w/ Fiberglass Handle Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>Each</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$59.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$59.00"/> Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping. FHU FAP-6"/>
1 9	8 lb. Flat Head Axe w/ Fiberglass Handle Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>Each</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$100.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$100.00"/> Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping. FHU FA-8"/>
2 0	60" Pinch Point Pry Bar Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>Each</u> No Bid
2 1	30" Pro Bar Halligan Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>Each</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$210.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$210.00"/> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="FHU"/> Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping. FHU PB-30"/>
2 2	8 lb. Sledge Hammer w/ Fiberglass Handle & Halligan Loop Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>Each</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$70.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$70.00"/> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="FHU"/> Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping. FHU 8-M28-B"/>

23	8 lb. Sledge Hammer w/ Fiberglass Handle w/out Halligan Loop	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> Each </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$65.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$65.00"/>	
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping. FHU 8-M28"/>		
24	Pulaski Axe	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> Each </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$55.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$55.00"/>	
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Akron (or equiv)"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="WPL -4"/>		
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping. FHU PUL-AXE"/>		
25	Fire Rake w/ 60" Wooden Handle	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> Each </u>	No Bid
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Council Tool (or equiv)"/>		
26	Fire Swatter w/ 60" Wooden Handle	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> Each </u>	No Bid
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Council Tool (or equiv)"/>		
27	5 Gallon Collapsible Backpack Pump	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> Each </u>	No Bid
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="PECO (or equiv)"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="85130"/>		
28	2,000 gallon self supporting tank - 4.5" flanges	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> Each </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$1,125.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$1,125.00"/>	
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Husky"/>		
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping. 30 oz."/>		
29	Ground cover for 2,000 gallon self supporting tank	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> Each </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$140.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$140.00"/>	
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Husky"/>		
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping. 18 oz."/>		
30	5" x 10' hard suction, 4.5" NST couplings (female long handle)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> Each </u>	No Bid
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Kochek"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="2P501"/>		
31	Carbon Monoxide Detector w/CO, O2, HCN, LEL	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> Each </u>	No Bid
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="RAE Systems MicroRae"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="M03-1111-300"/>		

3 2	Piercing Nozzle	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> Each </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$910.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$910.00"/>
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping. Akron 1088 6' Piercing"/>	
3 3	Blitzfire high elevation monitor comb. package includes monitor, storage bracket, md12a auto nozzle, 3 stacked tip nozzle	No Bid
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> Each </u>	
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="TFT"/>	
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="XXC-52-HE"/>	
3 4	Storage Bracket, MD12A auto-nozzle, 3 stacked tip nozzle	No Bid
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> Each </u>	
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Elkhart"/>	
3 5	Self educting master stream foam nozzle	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> Each </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$2,100.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$2,100.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Elkhart"/>	
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="SM-1000-HF"/>	
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>	
3 6	Break apart nozzle with 15/16" smoothbore	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> Each </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$365.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$365.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Elkhart"/>	
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>	
3 7	Chief XD 250 gpm @ 50 psi fog tip	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> Each </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$630.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$630.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Elkhart"/>	
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="4000-24"/>	
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>	
3 8	2.5" pistol grip shutoff with 1.25" integral smooth bore	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$485.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$485.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Elkhart"/>	
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="DB375GAT"/>	
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>	
3 9	1 1/2" distributor nozzle	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$475.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$475.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Elkhart"/>	
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="193-6"/>	
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>	

4 0	2 1/2" bresnan distributor nozzle		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$610.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$610.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Elkhart"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="193-6"/>		
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>		

4 1	foam tube		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$245.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$245.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Elkhart"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="246S"/>		
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>		

4 2	1 1/2" foam eductor, 95 gpm, .1-6% with chrome pick up tube		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$595.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$595.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Elkhart"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="241-95"/>		
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>		

4 3	Chief XD 175 gmp at 50 psi nozzle		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$625.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$625.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Elkhart"/>		
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>		

4 4	Ram XD		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$2,100.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$2,100.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Elkhart"/>		
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>		

4 5	R.A.N. Nozzle - 500 6pm		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$460.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$460.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Elkhart"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="3896"/>		
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>		

4 6	Triple Stack Tip - 1.25", 1.125", 1.5"		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$295.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$295.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Elkhart"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="ST-197-A"/>		
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>		

4 7	Mini Stream Shaper		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$145.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$145.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Elkhart"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="282-A Mini"/>		
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>		

4 8	Stinger 2.0 w/ Portable Base (4.5" Inlet w. NST)		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$3,000.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$3,000.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Elkhart"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="8297"/>		
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>		

4 9	Stream Shaper		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$165.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$165.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Elkhart"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="282-A"/>		
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>		

5 0	Stacked Tip - 2", 1.75", 1.5", 1.125"		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$460.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$460.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Elkhart"/>		
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping. ST194"/>		

5 1	Jumbo low profile ball intake valve, 6 (F) SW in X 4.5 (M) out		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	No Bid
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="TFT"/>		

5 2	In-line valve with top mount parallel shaft drive, 4.5 (F) sw in X 4.5 out		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	No Bid
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="TFT"/>		

5 3	Gated wye, 4.5 (F) SW in x 2 2.5 (M) out		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	No Bid
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="TFT"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="AY5NR-NJ"/>		

5 4	2.5" double female adapter		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	No Bid
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Red Head"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="35"/>		

55	2.5" double male adapter Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Red Head"/> Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="36"/>	No Bid
56	4.5" double male adapter Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Red Head"/> Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="36"/>	No Bid
57	4.5" double female adapter Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Red Head"/> Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="35"/>	No Bid
58	1.5" double female adapter Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Red Head"/> Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="35"/>	No Bid
59	1.5" double male adapter Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Red Head"/> Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="36"/>	No Bid
60	2.5" female x 1.5" male reducer Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Red Head"/> Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="37"/>	No Bid
61	2.5" NG rocker lug female (Rigid) x 4.5 " NH Rocker lug male Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Red Head"/> Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="37"/>	No Bid
62	2.5" female x 3/4" male garden hose reducer Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Red Head"/> Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="37"/>	No Bid

63	2.5" female NST swivel x 4.5" female NST swivel		No Bid
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Red Head"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="35"/>		

64	2.5" female NST swivel x 4.5" male NST rigid		No Bid
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Red Head"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="54"/>		

65	LDH manifold 4.5" female NST swivel inlet, one 4.5" NST gated outlet, two 2.5" NST gated outlet		No Bid
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Red Head (NOT Kockek)"/>		

66	Leather 2.5" hose jacket		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$60.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$60.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Boston Leath"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="SKU9200"/>		
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>		

67	4.5" NST barrel strainers, aluminum		No Bid
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Kockek"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="BS45"/>		

68	Low level strainer w/ 1.5" water transfer fitting		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$695.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$695.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Fold-A-Tank"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="LSF 4.5"/>		
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>		

69	Hose clamp with 285-mb mounting bracket		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$575.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$575.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Elkhart"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="285"/>		
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>		

70	2.5" x 1/5" gated wye		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$265.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$265.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Elkhart"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="B-100A"/>		
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>		

7 1	3.5" x 2.5" reducer Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> Each </u>				No Bid
7 2	5"F x 4.5"M Intake Valve Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> Each </u>				No Bid
7 3	Drain Elbow Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$230.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$230.00"/> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Elkhart"/> Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="105A"/> Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>				
7 4	Inline Pressure Gauge (2.5") Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$285.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$285.00"/> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Elkhart"/> Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="228A"/> Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>				
7 5	Gate Valve Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$420.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$420.00"/> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Elkhart"/> Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="X-86A"/> Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>				
7 6	Revolution Valve 7982 6" FNST x 4.5 M NST Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$1,695.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$1,695.00"/> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Akron"/> Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>				
7 7	Revolution Valve 7982 5" FNST x 4.5 M NST Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$1,695.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$1,695.00"/> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Akron"/> Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>				
7 8	Ironlok Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$210.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$210.00"/> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="PAC"/> Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="K5003"/> Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>				

7 9	Toollok		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$30.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$30.00"/>
	Manufacturer:	<input type="text" value="PAC"/>	
	Manufacturer #:	<input type="text" value="1003"/>	
	Supplier Notes:	<input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>	

8 0	Jumbolok		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$59.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$59.00"/>
	Manufacturer:	<input type="text" value="PAC"/>	
	Manufacturer #:	<input type="text" value="1070"/>	
	Supplier Notes:	<input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>	

8 1	Handlelok		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$37.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$37.00"/>
	Manufacturer:	<input type="text" value="PAC"/>	
	Manufacturer #:	<input type="text" value="1004"/>	
	Supplier Notes:	<input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>	

8 2	Flexmount		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$32.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$32.00"/>
	Manufacturer:	<input type="text" value="PAC"/>	
	Manufacturer #:	<input type="text" value="1002-2"/>	
	Supplier Notes:	<input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>	

8 3	Hooklok		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$29.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$29.00"/>
	Manufacturer:	<input type="text" value="PAC"/>	
	Manufacturer #:	<input type="text" value="1001"/>	
	Supplier Notes:	<input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>	

8 4	Pinch Point Pry Bar Mount		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	No Bid
	Manufacturer:	<input type="text" value="Akron (or equiv)"/>	
	Manufacturer #:	<input type="text" value="PPBH"/>	

8 5	Axe Blade Bracket		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	No Bid
	Manufacturer:	<input type="text" value="Akron (or equiv)"/>	
	Manufacturer #:	<input type="text" value="AS-510"/>	

86	Axe Handle Bracket Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Akron (or equiv)"/> Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="AS-520"/>	No Bid
87	1.5" Threaded Mounting Bracket Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="36.85"/> Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="RMP4604AC"/>	No Bid
88	2.5" Threaded Mounting Bracket Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="PAC (or equiv)"/> Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="RMP4906AC"/>	No Bid
89	4.5" Threaded Mounting Bracket Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="PAC (or equiv)"/> Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="RMP4912AC"/>	No Bid
90	1% x 3% AR-AFFF (265 gallon tote) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="ChemGuard"/>	No Bid
91	1% x 3% AR-AFFF (5 gallon bucket) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="ChemGuard"/>	No Bid
92	Class A Foam (265 gallon tote) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="National Responder"/>	No Bid
93	Class A Foam (5 gallon bucket) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="National Responder"/>	No Bid
94	Foam 3% / 6% AR-AFFF Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="National Centurion"/>	No Bid

95	2-Fly 35' Extension Ladder		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$860.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$860.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="DUO-Safety"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="1200-A"/>		
Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>			

96	3-Fly 35' Extension Ladder		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$910.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$910.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="DUO-Safety"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="1225-A"/>		
Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>			

97	2-Fly 28' Extension Ladder		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$680.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$680.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="DUO-Safety"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="1200-A"/>		
Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>			

98	16' Roof Ladders		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$310.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$310.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="DUO-Safety"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="875-A"/>		
Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>			

99	10' Folding Attic Ladder		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$190.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$190.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="DUO-Safety"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="585-A"/>		
Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>			

100	12' FRESNO Extension Ladder w/ safety shoes		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$399.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$399.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="DUO-Safety"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="12-701"/>		
Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>			

101	10' Parapet Ladder w/ Double Hooks		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> EA </u>	No Bid
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="DUO-Safety"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="725-AR"/>		

1 0 2	12' Pike Poles "I" Beam Pole Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Manufacturer: <u>Fire Hooks Unlimited</u>	No Bid
1 0 3	10' Pike Poles "I" Beam Pole Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Manufacturer: <u>Fire Hooks Unlimited</u>	No Bid
1 0 4	8' Pike Poles "I" Beam Pole Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Manufacturer: <u>Fire Hooks Unlimited</u>	No Bid
1 0 5	6' New York Hook w/ Boston Rake Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <u> \$139.00 </u> Total: <u> \$139.00 </u> Manufacturer: <u>Fire Hooks Unlimited</u> Supplier Notes: <u>Customer to pay actual shipping</u>	
1 0 6	6' New York Hooks w/ Prying Ends Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <u> \$115.00 </u> Total: <u> \$115.00 </u> Manufacturer: <u>Fire Hooks Unlimited</u> Supplier Notes: <u>Customer to pay actual shipping</u>	
1 0 7	6' LA Trash Hook (Arson Trash Hook / D Handle) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <u> \$120.00 </u> Total: <u> \$120.00 </u> Manufacturer: <u>Fire Hooks Unlimited</u> Supplier Notes: <u>Customer to pay actual shipping</u>	
1 0 8	3' D-Handle Closet Hook (National Hook / D Handle) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>Each</u>	No Bid
1 0 9	16" Smoke Ejector (Electric) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>Each</u> Unit Price: <u> \$1,325.00 </u> Total: <u> \$1,325.00 </u> Manufacturer: <u>Tempest</u> Manufacturer #: <u>EBS-16-EP</u> Supplier Notes: <u>Customer to pay actual shipping</u>	
1 1 0	Smoke Ejector Hanger Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>Each</u> Unit Price: <u> \$275.00 </u> Total: <u> \$275.00 </u> Manufacturer: <u>Tempest</u> Supplier Notes: <u>Customer to pay actual shipping</u>	

1 1 1	Smoke Ejector Hooks	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>Each</u>			No Bid
	Manufacturer:	Tempest			
1 1 2	Smoke Ejector Ventilation Tube Adapter	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>Each</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$105.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$105.00"/>	
	Manufacturer:	Tempest			
	Manufacturer #:	725-042			
	Supplier Notes:	Customer to pay actual shipping			
1 1 3	Smoke Ejector Ventilation Tube (15' duct)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>Each</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$315.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$315.00"/>	
	Manufacturer:	Tempest			
	Manufacturer #:	725-029			
	Supplier Notes:	Customer to pay actual shipping			
1 1 4	Electric PPV Fan (Variable Speed Drive)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>Each</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$2,510.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$2,510.00"/>	
	Manufacturer:	Tempest			
	Manufacturer #:	700-452B			
	Supplier Notes:	Customer to pay actual shipping. New Part number is 910-1720B			
1 1 5	Gas PPV Fan	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>Each</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$2,075.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$2,075.00"/>	
	Manufacturer:	Tempest			
	Manufacturer #:	700-021			
	Supplier Notes:	Customer to pay actual shipping. New part number is 910-1040			
1 1 6	Res Q Jack Struts	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>Each</u>			No Bid
	Manufacturer:	RES-Q-JACK			
	Manufacturer #:	STX-4PTX			
1 1 7	Res Q Jack jack stands	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>Each</u>			No Bid
	Manufacturer:	RES-Q-JACK			
	Manufacturer #:	RJ3-JKST			
1 1 8	5.4 T Airbag	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>Each</u>			No Bid
	Manufacturer:	Paratech			
	Manufacturer #:	KPI-5 MaxForce 10"x10"			

1 1 9	25.6 T Airbag			No Bid
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> Each </u>		
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Paratech"/>			
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="KPI-22 MaxForce 20" x20"=""/>			

1 2 0	38.0 T Airbag			No Bid
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> Each </u>		
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Paratech"/>			
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="KPI-32 MaxForce 24" x25"=""/>			

1 2 1	Airbag Controller Kit			No Bid
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> Each </u>		
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Paratech"/>			
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="22-890351G2-150"/>			

1 2 2	Air Chisel Kit			No Bid
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> Each </u>		
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Ajax Tools"/>			
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="811RK"/>			

1 2 3	Battery Powered Windshield Cutter			No Bid	
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> Each </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$672.06"/>		Total: <input type="text" value="\$672.06"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Rhino"/>				
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="RWC-2-SOFT"/>				
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>				

1 2 4	Portable Floodlights (20k lumen 220 watts)			No Bid
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> Each </u>		
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Akron"/>			
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="ELSS-XLAC"/>			

1 2 5	Live Cord Reels (200' 12/3)			No Bid	
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> Each </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$725.00"/>		Total: <input type="text" value="\$725.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Akron"/>				
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="ECRP-15"/>				
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>				

1 2 6	Junction Boxes			No Bid	
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> Each </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$475.00"/>		Total: <input type="text" value="\$475.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Akron"/>				
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="EJBX"/>				
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>				

1 2 7	Junction Box (w/ 5.15 pigtail)			No Bid
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> Each </u>		
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Akron"/>			
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="EJBX"/>			

1 2 8	Large Ladder Belts (blue w/ lanyard)			No Bid
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> Each </u>		
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Pac-Mule"/>			
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="QL4107FB-18-L"/>			

1 2 9	XL Ladder Belts (yellow w/ lanyard)			No Bid
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> Each </u>		
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Pac-Mule"/>			
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="QL4107FB-18-XL"/>			

1 3 0	XXL Ladder Belts (red w/ lanyard)			No Bid
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> Each </u>		
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Pac-Mule"/>			
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="QL4107FB-18-XXL"/>			

1 3 1	100' x 1/2" static kernmantle Utility Rope			No Bid	
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> Each </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$180.00"/>		Total: <input type="text" value="\$180.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Bluewater"/>				
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="534820 YEBL"/>				
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>				

1 3 2	200' x 1/2" static kernmantle Life Safety Rope (red in color)			No Bid	
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> Each </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$180.00"/>		Total: <input type="text" value="\$180.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Bluewater"/>				
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="534820 RDYE"/>				
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>				

1 3 3	200' x 1/2" static kernmantle Life Safety Rope (blue in color)			No Bid	
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> Each </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$180.00"/>		Total: <input type="text" value="\$180.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Bluewater"/>				
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="534820 BLYE"/>				
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>				

1 3 4	100' x 6.8mm Heat Resistant Aramid Rope			No Bid
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> Each </u>		

1 3 5	75' x 3/8" Polypropolene Water Rescue Rope		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> Each </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$48.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$48.00"/>
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping. Rescutech RT PRO Poly"/>		

1 3 6	Rescue Harness		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> Each </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$395.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$395.00"/>
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Petzl"/>		
	Manufacturer #: <input type="text" value="C71CFA AVAO BOD"/>		
Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Customer to pay actual shipping"/>			

1 3 7	Rescue Harness		
	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	UOM: <u> Each </u>	No Bid
	Manufacturer: <input type="text" value="Yates"/>		

Response Total: \$35,851.06