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Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government (Purchasing)
Supplier Response

Bid Information Contact Information Ship to Information

Bid Creator Mr. Todd Slatin Director Address 200 East Main Street Address Various LFUCG
Email tslatin@lexingtonky.gov Locations
Phone (859) 258-3320 Lexington, KY 40507
Fax (859) 258-3320 Contact Todd Slatin Lexington, KY 40507

Central Purchasing Contact Louis Weckerling
Bid Number Bid 144-2016 Addendum 3 Department Division of Facilities
Title LED Lighting Fixtures Building Government Center Department
Bid Type Bid Building Building
Issue Date 11/22/2016 09:00 AM (ET) Room 338
Close Date 12/20/2016 02:00:00 PM (ET) Floor/Room Floor/Room

Telephone (859) 2583320 Telephone (859) 3674940
Fax (859) 2583322 Fax
Email tslatin@lexingtonky.gov Email

Supplier Information

Company AIREY-THOMPSON
Address 5310 N. IRWINDALE AVE.

IRWINDALE, CA 91706
Contact
Department
Building
Floor/Room
Telephone (626) 960-3355 x155
Fax
Email
Submitted 12/19/2016 02:05:29 PM (ET)
Total $663.84

By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent and bind your company and that you
agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

Signature CASEY SETH Email PURCHASING@AIREYTHOMPSON.COM

Supplier Notes

Bid Notes

All questions concerning this procurement must be submitted to buyer via email at tslatin@lexingtonky.gov or preferably
through the questions tab of this bid. Documents MUST be submitted on line prior to the close date and time.

Bid Activities

Date Name Description

12/7/2016 10:30:00 AM Pre-Bid Meeting A pre-bid meeting will be held on December 7th, 2016 at 10:30 in the 3rd Floor Purchasing
(ET) Conference Room in the Government Center Building at 200 East Main Street Lexington,

KY 40507
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Bid Messages

Bid Attributes
Please review the following and respond where necessary
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Line Items

# Qty UOM Description Response

1 1 Each LED 2X2 DROP IN TROFFER, 4000K, 3200LM, 120-277 VAC, FROSTED LENS, No Bid
DIMMABLE,

Manufacturer: Cree Manufacturer #: ZR22-32L-40K-10V

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

2 1 Each LED 2X2 DROP IN TROFFER, 4000K, 3200LM, 120-277 VAC, FROSTED LENS, No Bid
DIMMABLE, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Cree Manufacturer #: ZR22-32L-40K-10V-EB14

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

3 1 Each LED 2X4 DROP IN TROFFER, 4000K, 4000LM, 120-277 VAC, FROSTED LENS, Price
DIMMABLE,

Manufacturer: Cree Manufacturer #: ZR24-40L-40K-10V

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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4 1 Each LED 2X4 DROP IN TROFFER, 4000K, 4000LM, 120-277 VAC, FROSTED LENS, Price
DIMMABLE, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Cree Manufacturer #: ZR24-40L-40K-10V - EB14

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

5 1 Each LED 2X2 DROP IN TROFFER, 4000K, 3000LM, 120-277 VAC, DIMMABLE, Price

Manufacturer: Metalux Manufacturer #: 22SR-LD1-29-C-UNV-L840-CD1-U

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

6 1 Each LED 2X2 DROP IN TROFFER, 4000K, 3000LM, 120-277 VAC, DIMMABLE, 90 MINUTE Price
BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Metalux Manufacturer #: 22SR-LD1-29-C-UNV-L840-CD1-U-EL14

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

7 1 Each LED 2X4 DROP IN TROFFER, 4000K, 4800LM, 120-277 VAC, DIMMABLE Price

Manufacturer: Metalux Manufacturer #: 24SR-LD1-29-C-UNV-L840-CD1-U

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:
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Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

8 1 Each LED 2X4 DROP IN TROFFER, 4000K, 4800LM, 120-277 VAC, DIMMABLE, 90 MINUTE Price
BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Metalux Manufacturer #: 24SR-LD1-29-C-UNV-L840-CD1-U-EL14

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

9 1 Each LED STRIP LIGHT 48 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, WHITE Price
FINISH, NARROW DISTRIBUTION

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: ZL1N-L48-5000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-WH

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 48 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 275.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH, NARROW DISTRIBUTION

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GU50K48-3-N

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5
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10 1 Each LED STRIP LIGHT 48 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, WHITE Price
FINISH, NARROW DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: ZL1N-L48-5000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-E7W-WH

Item Notes: 120 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 48 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 460.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH, NARROW DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GU50K48-3-N-EM

Item Notes: 120 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5

11 1 Each LED STRIP LIGHT 48 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, WHITE Price
FINISH, NARROW DISTRIBUTION

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: ZL1N-L48-7000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-WH

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 48 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 275.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH, NARROW DISTRIBUTION

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GC50K48-3-N

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5

12 1 Each LED STRIP LIGHT 48 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, WHITE Price
FINISH, NARROW DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: ZL1N-L48-7000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-E7W-WH

Item Notes: 120 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 48 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 475.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH, NARROW DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GC50K48-3-N-EM

Item Notes: 120 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5
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13 1 Each LED STRIP LIGHT 48 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, WHITE Price
FINISH, DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: ZL1D-L48-5000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-WH

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 48 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 275.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH, DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GU50K48-3-W

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5

14 1 Each LED STRIP LIGHT 48 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, WHITE Price
FINISH,DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: ZL1D-L48-5000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-E7W-WH

Item Notes: 120 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 48 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 475.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH,DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GU50K48-3-W-EM

Item Notes: 120 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5

15 1 Each LED STRIP LIGHT 48 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, WHITE Price
FINISH, DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: ZL1D-L48-7000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-WH

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 48 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 364.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH, DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GC50K48-3-W

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5
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16 1 Each LED STRIP LIGHT 48 10000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, Price
WHITE FINISH, DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION,90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: ZL1D-L48-10000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-E7W-WH

Item Notes: 120 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 48 10000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 564.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH, DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION,90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GC50K48-3-W-EM

Item Notes: 120 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5

17 1 Each LED STRIP LIGHT 96 10000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, Price
WHITE FINISH, DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: TZL1D-L96-10000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-WH

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 96 10000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 364.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH, DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GU50K96-3-W

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5

18 1 Each LED STRIP LIGHT 96 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, WHITE Price
FINISH, DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION,90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: TZL1D-L96-7000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-E7W-WH

Item Notes: 120 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 96 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 558.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH, DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION,90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GU50K96-3-W-EM

Item Notes: 120 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5
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19 1 Each LED TWO ADJUSTABLE LED LAMP HEADS EMERGENCY LIGHT, 90 MINUTE BATTERY Price
BACKUP, NFPA 101 & 70/OSHA/UL COMPLIANT

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: EU2 LED M12

Item Notes: MINIMUM 24 MONTH WARRANTY

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

20 1 Each LED EXIT/EMERGENCY LIGHT COMBO, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP, NFPA 101 & Price
70/OSHA/UL COMPLIANT

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: ECR LED HO M6

Item Notes: MINIMUM 24 MONTH WARRANTY

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

21 1 Each LED EXIT LIGHT, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP, NFPA 101 & 70/OSHA/UL Price
COMPLIANT

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: EXRLEDELM6

Item Notes: MINIMUM 24 MONTH WARRANTY

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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22 1 Each LED LOW/HIGH BAY 18000LM, 5000K, =>80CRI, 120-277 VAC, DIMMING, QUICK Price
RESTART, PIR OCCUPANCY SENSOR, SURFACE/PENDANT/J-BOX MOUNT
CONFIGURATION

Manufacturer: Cree Manufacturer #: CXB-A-UV-M-50K-8-UL-ML

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

23 1 Each LED LOW/HIGH BAY REFLECTOR (MANUFACTURER MATCHING) - CLEAR ACRYLIC Price

Manufacturer: Cree Manufacturer #: CXBP16

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

24 1 Each LED LOW/HIGH BAY REFLECTOR (MANUFACTURER MATCHING) - WHITE ACRYLIC Price

Manufacturer: Cree Manufacturer #: CXBW16

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

25 1 Each LED LOW/HIGH BAY REFLECTOR (MANUFACTURER MATCHING) - ALUMINUM Price

Manufacturer: Cree Manufacturer #: CXBA16N

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:
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Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

26 1 2-PACK 60 WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED LIGHT, 2700K, MEDIUM BASE/E26, A TYPE, Price
<=9W, DIMMABLE, >= 80 CRI, MIN L70 AT 25,000 HOURS, ROHS COMPLIANT, UL
LISTED

Manufacturer: Eiko Manufacturer #: LED9WA19/OMN/827K-DIM-G7

Item Notes: Submit one price for 2 LED lights

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

27 1 12-PACK 60 WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED LIGHT, 2700K, MEDIUM BASE/E26, A TYPE, Price
<=9W, DIMMABLE, >= 80 CRI, MIN L70 AT 25,000 HOURS, ROHS COMPLIANT, UL
LISTED

Manufacturer: Eiko Manufacturer #: LED9WA19/OMN/827K-DIM-G7

Item Notes: Submit one price for 12 LED lights

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

28 1 2-PACK 60 WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED LIGHT, 4000K, MEDIUM BASE/E26, A TYPE, Price
<=9W, DIMMABLE, >= 80 CRI, MIN L70 AT 25,000 HOURS, ROHS COMPLIANT, UL
LISTED

Manufacturer: Eiko Manufacturer #: LED9WA19/OMN/840K-DIM-G7

Item Notes: Submit one price for 2 LED lights

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days
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2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

29 1 12-PACK 60 WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED LIGHT, 4000K, MEDIUM BASE/E26, A TYPE, Price
<=9W, DIMMABLE, >= 80 CRI, MIN L70 AT 25,000 HOURS, ROHS COMPLIANT, UL
LISTED

Manufacturer: Eiko Manufacturer #: LED9WA19/OMN/840K-DIM-G7

Item Notes: Submit one price for 12 LED lights

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

30 1 2-PACK 100 WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED LIGHT, 2700K, MEDIUM BASE/E26, A TYPE, Price
<=15W, DIMMABLE, >= 80 CRI, MIN L70 AT 25,000 HOURS, ROHS COMPLIANT, UL
LISTED

Manufacturer: Eiko Manufacturer #: LED15WA21/OMN/827K-DIM-G7

Item Notes: Submit one price for 2 LED lights

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

31 1 12-PACK 100 WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED LIGHT, 2700K, MEDIUM BASE/E26, A TYPE, Price
<=15W, DIMMABLE, >= 80 CRI, MIN L70 AT 25,000 HOURS, ROHS COMPLIANT, UL
LISTED

Manufacturer: Eiko Manufacturer #: LED15WA21/OMN/827K-DIM-G7

Item Notes: Submit one price for 12 LED lights

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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32 1 2-PACK 100 WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED LIGHT, 4000K, MEDIUM BASE/E26, A TYPE, Price
<=15W, DIMMABLE, >= 80 CRI, MIN L70 AT 25,000 HOURS, ROHS COMPLIANT, UL
LISTED

Manufacturer: Eiko Manufacturer #: LED15WA21/OMN/840K-DIM-G7

Item Notes: Submit one price for 2 LED lights

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

33 1 12-PACK 100 WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED LIGHT, 4000K, MEDIUM BASE/E26, A TYPE, Price
<=15W, DIMMABLE, >= 80 CRI, MIN L70 AT 25,000 HOURS, ROHS COMPLIANT, UL
LISTED

Manufacturer: Eiko Manufacturer #: LED15WA21/OMN/840K-DIM-G7

Item Notes: Submit one price for 12 LED lights

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

34 1 Each 65WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED FLOOD LIGHT, 2700K, MEDIUM BASE/E26, BR30 Price
TYPE, <=12W, MIN 650 LUMEN, DIMMABLE, >= 80 CRI, MIN L70 AT 25,000 HOURS,
ROHS COMPLIANT, UL LISTED

Manufacturer: Eiko Manufacturer #: LED8WBR30/827K-DIM-G5

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years



Bid 144-2016 Addendum 3 - Page 17 of 42

35 1 24 PACK 65WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED FLOOD LIGHT, 2700K, MEDIUM BASE/E26, BR30 Price
TYPE, <=12W, MIN 650 LUMEN, DIMMABLE, >= 80 CRI, MIN L70 AT 25,000 HOURS,
ROHS COMPLIANT, UL LISTED

Manufacturer: Eiko Manufacturer #: LED8WBR30/827K-DIM-G5

Item Notes: Submit one price for 24 LED Floods

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

36 1 Each 65WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED FLOOD LIGHT, 4000K, MEDIUM BASE/E26, BR30 Price
TYPE, <=12W,MIN. 650 LUMEN, DIMMABLE, >= 80 CRI, MIN L70 AT 25,000 HOURS,
ROHS COMPLIANT, UL LISTED

Manufacturer: Eiko Manufacturer #: LED8WBR30/840K-DIM-G5

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

37 1 24 PACK 65WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED FLOOD LIGHT, 4000K, MEDIUM BASE/E26, BR30 Price
TYPE, <=12W,MIN. 650 LUMEN, DIMMABLE, >= 80 CRI, MIN L70 AT 25,000 HOURS,
ROHS COMPLIANT, UL LISTED

Manufacturer: Eiko Manufacturer #: LED8WBR30/840K-DIM-G5

Item Notes: Submit one price for 24 LED Floods

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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38 1 10-PACK 48 T8 32W FLOURESCENT BULB, 3000K, ROHS COMPLIANT,>= 80 CRI, No Bid

Manufacturer: Sylvania Manufacturer #: FO32/830/ECO

Item Notes: Submit one price for 10 bulbs

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

39 1 30-PACK 48 T8 32W FLOURESCENT BULB, 3000K, ROHS COMPLIANT,>= 80 CRI, $55.08

Manufacturer: Sylvania Manufacturer #: FO32/830/ECO

Item Notes: Submit one price for 30 bulbs

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 7

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 0

40 1 10-PACK 48 T8 32W FLOURESCENT BULB, 3500K, ROHS COMPLIANT,>= 90 CRI, No Bid

Manufacturer: Sylvania Manufacturer #: FO32/V35/ECO

Item Notes: Submit one price for 10 bulbs

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

41 1 30-PACK 48 T8 32W FLOURESCENT BULB, 3500K, ROHS COMPLIANT,>= 90 CRI, $42.84

Manufacturer: Sylvania Manufacturer #: FO32/V35/ECO

Item Notes: Submit one price for 30 bulbs

Supplier Notes:
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Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 7

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 0

42 1 10-PACK 48 T8 32W FLOURESCENT BULB, 4000K, ROHS COMPLIANT,>= 90 CRI, No Bid

Manufacturer: Sylvania Manufacturer #: FO32/V41/ECO

Item Notes: Submit one price for 10 bulbs

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

43 1 30-PACK 48 T8 32W FLOURESCENT BULB, 4000K, ROHS COMPLIANT,>= 90 CRI, $50.76

Manufacturer: Sylvania Manufacturer #: FO32/V41/ECO

Item Notes: Submit one price for 30 bulbs

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 7

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 0

44 1 10-PACK 48 T8 32W FLOURESCENT BULB, 5000K, ROHS COMPLIANT,>= 90 CRI, No Bid

Manufacturer: Sylvania Manufacturer #: FO32/V50/ECO

Item Notes: Submit one price for 10 bulbs

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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45 1 30-PACK 48 T8 32W FLOURESCENT BULB, 5000K, ROHS COMPLIANT,>= 90 CRI, $50.76

Manufacturer: Sylvania Manufacturer #: FO32/V50/ECO

Item Notes: Submit one price for 30 bulbs

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 7

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 0

46 1 10-PACK 48 T8 32W FLOURESCENT BULB, 6500K, ROHS COMPLIANT,>= 90 CRI, No Bid

Manufacturer: Sylvania Manufacturer #: FO32/V65/ECO

Item Notes: Submit one price for 10 bulbs

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

47 1 30-PACK 48 T8 32W FLOURESCENT BULB, 6500K, ROHS COMPLIANT,>= 90 CRI, $50.76

Manufacturer: Sylvania Manufacturer #: FO32/V65/ECO

Item Notes: Submit one price for 30 bulbs

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 7

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 0

48 1 10-PACK 48 T8 REDUCED WATTAGE <= 28W FLOURESCENT TUBE, 3000K,>= 80 CRI, MINIMUM No Bid
2200LM

Manufacturer: Sylvania Manufacturer #: FO32/25W/830

Item Notes: Submit one price for 10 tubes

Supplier Notes:
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Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

49 1 30-PACK 48 T8 REDUCED WATTAGE <= 28W FLOURESCENT TUBE, 3000K,>= 80 CRI, MINIMUM $137.88
2200LM

Manufacturer: Sylvania Manufacturer #: FO32/25W/830

Item Notes: Submit one price for 30 tubes

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 7

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 0

50 1 10-PACK 48 T8 REDUCED WATTAGE <= 28W FLOURESCENT TUBE, 4000K,>= 80 CRI, MINIMUM No Bid
2200LM

Manufacturer: Sylvania Manufacturer #: FO32/25W/840

Item Notes: Submit one price for 10 tubes

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

51 1 30-PACK 48 T8 REDUCED WATTAGE <= 28W FLOURESCENT TUBE, 4000K,>= 80 CRI, MINIMUM $137.88
2200LM

Manufacturer: Sylvania Manufacturer #: FO32/25W/840

Item Notes: Submit one price for 30 tubes

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 7

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 0
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52 1 10-PACK 48 T8 REDUCED WATTAGE <= 28W FLOURESCENT TUBE, 5000K,>= 80 CRI, MINIMUM No Bid
2200LM

Manufacturer: Sylvania Manufacturer #: FO32/25W/850

Item Notes: Submit one price for 10 tubes

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

53 1 30-PACK 48 T8 REDUCED WATTAGE <= 28W FLOURESCENT TUBE, 5000K,>= 80 CRI, MINIMUM $137.88
2200LM

Manufacturer: Sylvania Manufacturer #: FO32/25W/850

Item Notes: Submit one price for 30 tubes

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 7

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 0

54 1 Each 48" LINEAR LED COMPATIBLE WITH RAPID AND IS BALLAST, 3000K, >= 80 CRI, Price
MINIMUM 100 LPW, MIN L70 AT 50,000 HOURS, MINUMUM PF OF .9

Manufacturer: GE Manufacturer #: LED15ET8/G/4/830 OR LED15ET8/4/830

Item Notes: LED15ET8/G/4/830 OR LED15ET8/4/830 (G CODE IS FOR GLASS TUBE, BLANK IS FOR PLASTIC, EITHER
ACCEPTABLE)

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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55 1 Each 48" LINEAR LED COMPATIBLE WITH RAPID AND IS BALLAST, 4000/4100K, >= 80 CRI Price
MINIMUM 100 LPW, MIN L70 AT 50,000 HOURS, MINUMUM PF OF .9

Manufacturer: GE Manufacturer #: LED15ET8/G/4/840 OR LED15ET8/4/840

Item Notes: LED15ET8/G/4/840 OR LED15ET8/4/840 (G CODE IS FOR GLASS TUBE, BLANK IS FOR PLASTIC, EITHER
ACCEPTABLE)

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

56 1 Each 48" LINEAR LED COMPATIBLE WITH RAPID AND IS BALLAST, 5000K, >= 80 CRI, Price
MINIMUM 100 LPW, MIN L70 AT 50,000 HOURS, MINUMUM PF OF .9

Manufacturer: GE Manufacturer #: LED15ET8/G/4/850 OR LED15ET8/4/850

Item Notes: LED15ET8/G/4/850 OR LED15ET8/4/850 (G CODE IS FOR GLASS TUBE, BLANK IS FOR PLASTIC, EITHER
ACCEPTABLE)

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

57 1 Each OCCUPANCY SENSING SWITCH, 120V/277V, SINGLE POLE, UP TO 6 AMP, Price
MULTI/3-WAY SWITCHING, PIR 180 DEGREE FOV, WHITE

Manufacturer: Lutron Manufacturer #: LUT MS-OPS6M2-DV-WH

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: OCCUPANCY SENSING SWITCH, 120V/277V, SINGLE POLE, UP TO 6 AMP, 19.50
MULTI/3-WAY SWITCHING, PIR 180 DEGREE FOV, WHITE

Alt Manufacturer: LEVITON Alt Manufacturer #: 1PV02-1LI

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 7

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5

58 1 Each DIMMER SWITCH/CONTROL, LED/FLOURESCENT/HID COMPATIBLE, 0-10V, Price
120V/277V, SINGLE POLE, UP TO 8 AMP, MULTI/3-WAY SWITCHING, WHITE

Manufacturer: Lutron Manufacturer #: LUT DVSTV-WH DIVA 0-10 W/SWITCHING BOX-DVSTV-WH

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

59 1 Each OCCUPANCY SENSING SWITCH WITH DIMMER CONTROL, 120V/277V, SINGLE POLE, Price
UP TO 8 AMP, MULTI/3-WAY SWITCHING, PIR 180 DEGREE FOV, WHITE

Manufacturer: Lutron Manufacturer #: LUT MS-Z101-WH

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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60 1 Each DIMMER SWITCH/CONTROL WITH LOW LIMIT ADJUSTMENT, Price
INCANDESCENT/LED/CFL, 120V, SINGLE POLE, MULTI/3-WAY SWITCHING, WHITE

Manufacturer: Lutron Manufacturer #: LUT DVCL-153PH-WH

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

61 1 Each WIRELESS CONTROLED DIMMING MODULE FOR LED/FLOURESCENT, 0-10V, Price
120V/277V, MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH OCCUPANCY/PHOTO SENSOR

Manufacturer: Lutron Manufacturer #: LUT RMJ-5T-DV-B

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

62 1 Each WIRELESS OCCUPANCY AND PHOTO SENSOR - CEILING, 360 DEGREE FOV, WHITE, Price
MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH OFFERED WIRELESS MODULE.

Manufacturer: Lutron Manufacturer #: LUT LRF2-OCR2B-P-WH

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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63 1 Each LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR <=150W HPS/MH/HPS) 4800LM, 5000K, 120-277 Price
VAC,BRONZE

Manufacturer: Lumark Manufacturer #: XTOR5ARL

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

64 1 Each LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR <=150W HPS/MH/HPS) 4800LM, 5000K, 120-277 Price
VAC,BRONZE, PHOTOCONTROL

Manufacturer: Lumark Manufacturer #: XTOR5ARL (PC1/PC2/PB120/PB277)

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

65 1 Each LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR > 150W HPS/MH/HPS)7300LM, 5000K, 120-277 Price
VAC,BRONZE

Manufacturer: Lumark Manufacturer #: XTOR9ARL

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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66 1 Each LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR > 150W HPS/MH/HPS)7300LM, 5000K, 120-277 Price
VAC,BRONZE, PHOTOCONTROL

Manufacturer: Lumark Manufacturer #: XTOR9ARL (PC1/PC2/PB120/PB277)

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

67 1 Each LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR <= 100W HPS/MH/HPS)3300LM, 5000K, 120-277 Price
VAC,BRONZE

Manufacturer: Sylvania Manufacturer #: WALPAK1N/036UNV750/NC/BZ 74201

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

68 1 Each LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR <= 100W HPS/MH/HPS)3300LM, 5000K, 120-277 No Bid
VAC,BRONZE,PHOTOCONTROL

Manufacturer: Sylvania Manufacturer #: WALPAK1N/036UNV750/NC/BZ/P 74219

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years



Bid 144-2016 Addendum 3 - Page 28 of 42

69 1 Each LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR >= 100W <=175W HPS/MH/HPS)5300LM, 5000K, Price
120-277 VAC,BRONZE

Manufacturer: Sylvania Manufacturer #: WALPAK1N/050UNV750/NC/BZ 74202

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

70 1 Each LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR >= 100W <=175W HPS/MH/HPS)5300LM, 5000K, Price
120-277 VAC,BRONZE,PHOTOCONTROL

Manufacturer: Sylvania Manufacturer #: WALPAK1N/050UNV750/NC/BZ/P 74220

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

71 1 Each LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR > 175W HPS/MH/HPS)8600LM, 5000K, 120-277 Price
VAC,BRONZE

Manufacturer: Sylvania Manufacturer #: WALPAK1N/075UNV750/NC/BZ 74203

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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72 1 Each LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR > 175W HPS/MH/HPS) 8600LM, 5000K, 120-277 Price
VAC,BRONZE,PHOTOCONTROL

Manufacturer: Sylvania Manufacturer #: WALPAK1N/075UNV750/NC/BZ/P 74221

Item Notes:

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

73 1 Each STREETLIGHT - GRANVILLE II LED BY HOLOPHANE (GVD2), 80W, 3000K, 120-277 Unit Price
VAC, MODERN HOUSING, TYPE 3, PHOTOCONTROL *COMPLETE FIXTURE
REPLACEMENT*

Manufacturer: HOLOPHANE Manufacturer #: GVD2 P30 3K AS M RAL6009 3 R P G H PCS

Item Notes: No Substitution - Use Complete Fixture when replacing fixture with hinged top glass

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

74 1 Each STREETLIGHT - GRANVILLE II LED BY HOLOPHANE (GVDRETRO) RETROFIT KIT, Unit Price
80W, 3000K, 120-277 VAC, MODERN HOUSING, TYPE 5, PHOTOCONTROL *RETROFIT
KIT*

Manufacturer: HOLOPHANE Manufacturer #: GVDRETRO 80 3K AS M RAL6009 5 H PCS

Item Notes: No Substitution - Use Retrofit when updating a fixture that has solid glass that is not hinged

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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75 1 LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, No Bid
WHITE FINISH, NARROW DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: ZL1N-L48-5000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-E7W-WH

Item Notes: 208 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 475.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH, NARROW DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GU50K48-3-N-EM

Item Notes: 208 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5

76 1 LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, No Bid
WHITE FINISH, NARROW DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: ZL1N-L48-5000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-E7W-WH

Item Notes: 240 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 475.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH, NARROW DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GU50K48-3-N-EM

Item Notes: 240 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5

77 1 LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, No Bid
WHITE FINISH, NARROW DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: ZL1N-L48-5000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-E7W-WH

Item Notes: 277 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 475.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH, NARROW DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GU50K48-3-N-EM

Item Notes: 277 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5
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78 1 LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, No Bid
WHITE FINISH, NARROW DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: ZL1N-L48-7000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-E7W-WH

Item Notes: 208 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 475.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH, NARROW DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GC50K48-3-N-EM

Item Notes: 208 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5

79 1 Each LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, No Bid
WHITE FINISH, NARROW DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: ZL1N-L48-7000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-E7W-WH

Item Notes: 240 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 475.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH, NARROW DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GC50K48-3-N-EM

Item Notes: 240 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5

80 1 Each LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, No Bid
WHITE FINISH, NARROW DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: ZL1N-L48-7000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-E7W-WH

Item Notes: 277 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 475.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH, NARROW DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GC50K48-3-N-EM

Item Notes: 277 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19
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2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5

81 1 Each LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, No Bid
WHITE FINISH,DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: ZL1D-L48-5000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-E7W-WH

Item Notes: 208 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 468.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH,DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GU50K48-3-W-EM

Item Notes: 208 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5

82 1 Each LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, No Bid
WHITE FINISH,DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: ZL1D-L48-5000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-E7W-WH

Item Notes: 240 VOLT
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Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years

Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 468.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH,DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GU50K48-3-W-EM

Item Notes: 240 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5

83 1 Each LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, No Bid
WHITE FINISH,DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: ZL1D-L48-5000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-E7W-WH

Item Notes: 277 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 468.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH,DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GU50K48-3-W-EM

Item Notes: 277 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5

84 1 Each LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 10000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, Unit Price
WHITE FINISH, DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION,90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: ZL1D-L48-10000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-E7W-WH

Item Notes: 208 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 500.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH,DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GC50K48-3-W-EM

Item Notes: 208 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5

85 1 Each LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 10000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, Unit Price
WHITE FINISH, DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION,90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: ZL1D-L48-10000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-E7W-WH

Item Notes: 240 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 10000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 500.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH, DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION,90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GC50K48-3-W-EM

Item Notes: 240 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5

86 1 Each LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 10000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, Unit Price
WHITE FINISH, DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION,90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: ZL1D-L48-10000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-E7W-WH

Item Notes: 277 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 10000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 500.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH, DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION,90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GC50K48-3-W-EM

Item Notes: 277 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5

87 1 Each LED STRIP LIGHT 96" 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, Unit Price
WHITE FINISH, DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION,90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: TZL1D-L96-7000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-E7W-WH

Item Notes: 208 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 96” 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 600.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH, DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION,90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GU50K96-3-W-EM

Item Notes: 208 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5

88 1 Each LED STRIP LIGHT 96" 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, Unit Price
WHITE FINISH, DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION,90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: TZL1D-L96-7000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-E7W-WH

Item Notes: 240 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5
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Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 96” 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 600.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH, DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION,90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GU50K96-3-W-EM

Item Notes: 240 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5

89 1 Each LED STRIP LIGHT 96" 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 VAC, Unit Price
WHITE FINISH, DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION,90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Manufacturer: Lithonia Manufacturer #: TZL1D-L96-7000LM-FST-MVOLT-50K-80CRI-E7W-WH

Item Notes: 277 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years
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Alt 1 1 Alt Spec: LED STRIP LIGHT 96” 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= 80, FROSTED LENS, 120-277 600.00
VAC, WHITE FINISH, DIFFUSE OR WIDE DISTRIBUTION,90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKUP

Alt Manufacturer: AIREY-THOMPSON Alt Manufacturer #: 61GU50K96-3-W-EM

Item Notes: 277 VOLT

Supplier Notes:

Item Attributes: Please review the following and respond where necessary
# Name Note Response

1 Average Delivery Time in Working Days 19

2 Warranty Period For This Item in Years 5

Response Total: $663.84


