¥ LEXINGTON

RFP-6-2026
ClearPath Facility Services
ClearPath Facility Services LLC
Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: RFP-6-2026

Title: Storm and Disaster Response and Recovery Services and Equipment
Type: Request For Proposal

Issue Date: 2/23/2026

Deadline:  3/10/2026 02:00 PM (ET)

Contact Information

Contact: Todd Slatin

Address: Central Purchasing
Government Center Building
200 East Main Street
Lexington, KY 40507

Phone:  (859) 2583320

Fax: (859) 2583322

Email: tslatin@lexingtonky.gov
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ClearPath Facility Services Information

Contact: Levi Jett

Address: 940 Sagittarius Ave
Franklin, IN 46131-6900

Phone: (463) 222-7223

Toll Free: (888) 302-8350

Email: ljett@clearpathfacility.com

Web Address: www.clearpathfacility.com

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED! By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent

and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached

bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

Levi Jett

liett@clearpathfacility.com

Signature Email
Submitted at 3/9/2026 11:43:37 AM (ET)

Response Attachments

Storm Response Capability Statement .pdf

Bid Lines

This document demonstrates the natural fit between ClearPath and this project from the City of Lexington.

1

Motor Graders w/blade & escort/safety vehicle 125HP or less

Quantity: 1  UOM: HR No Bid
2 | Motor Graders w/blade & escort/safety vehicle 126HP - 175HP

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid
3 | Motor Graders w/blade & escort/safety vehicle 176HP - 250HP

Quantity: 1  UOM: HR No Bid
4 | Motor Graders w/blade & escort/safety vehicle 251HP or larger

Quantity: 1  UOM: HR No Bid
5 | Front-End Loader/Wheel Loader 40HP or less

Quantity: 1  UOM: HR No Bid
6 | Front-End Loader/Wheel Loader 41HP - 74HP

Quantity: 1  UOM: HR No Bid
7 | Front-End Loader/Wheel Loader 75HP - 109HP

Quantity: 1  UOM: HR No Bid
8 | Front-End Loader/Wheel Loader 110HP - 199HP

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: $600.00| Total: | $600.00 |
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9 [ Front-End Loader/Wheel Loader 200HP or larger

Quantity: _ 1  UOM: HR No Bid
% Front-End Loader - Other (i.e. Loader w/grapple, shaker, etc. please specify)

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: $0.00| Total: | $0.00 |

Supplier Notes: |Bucket, snow boxes, grapples, forks, price included in overall hourly price for loader |
1 | Combo Backhoe/Loader 40HP or less
1 .

Quantity: 1  UOM: HR No Bid
1 | Combo Backhoe/Loader 41HP -70HP
2 :

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid
1 | Combo Backhoe/Loader 71HP - 89HP
3 .

Quantity: 1  UOM: HR No Bid
i Combo Backhoe/Loader 90HP or larger

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $500.00| Total: | $500.00 |
% Combo Backhoe/Loader Other (i.e. Loader w/grapple, Hoe Ram etc. please specify)

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $0.00| Total: | $0.00 |

Supplier Notes: |Grapples available, included in backhoe price |
% Dump Truck with Snowplow Single Rear Axle W/out spreader (26,000 GVWR or larger)

Quantity: 1  UOM: HR No Bid
% Dump Truck with Snowplow Single Rear Axle WITH spreader (26,000 GVWR or larger)

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid
% Dump Truck with Snowplow Multiple-Rear Axle W/out spreader (26,000 GVWR or larger)

Quantity: 1  UOM: HR No Bid
% Dump Truck with Snowplow Multiple-Rear Axle WITH spreader (26,000 GVWR or larger)

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid
% Dump Truck for debris hauling capacity: Less than Ten (10) yards

Quantity: 1  UOM: HR No Bid
% Dump Truck for debris hauling capacity: 11 - 19 yards

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: $300.00| Total: | $300.00 |

Supplier Notes: | At least 5 available |
% Dump Truck for debris hauling capacity: 20 - 29 yards

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid
% Dump Truck for debris hauling capacity: 30 or more yards

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid
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Truck With Snowplow (7'min.) 4WD W/Salt Spreader (1.75yd min.) *Must have strobe lights

BN

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $335.00] Total: | $335.00 |

Supplier Notes: |25 available |
% Truck With Snowplow (7'min.) 4WD W/out Salt Spreader *Must have strobe lights

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: HR Price: | $235.00| Total: | $235.00|

Supplier Notes: |10 available |
% Track hoe/Excavator Less than 10 Ton (Mini-Excavator)

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid
2 | Track hoe/Excavator - 10 - 19 Ton
7 :

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid
2 | Track hoe/Excavator - 20 - 29 Ton
8 _ .

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid
2 | Track hoe/Excavator - 30 - 45 Ton
9 :

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid
3 | Track hoe/Excavator - Greater than 45 Ton
0 _ .

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid
% Transport truck witrailer (Flatbed/Lowboy/Open/Enclosed) less than 10 Ton

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $350.00] Total: | $350.00 |
g Transport truck w/trailer (Flatbed/Lowboy/Open/Enclosed) up to 24 Ton Capacity

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: HR Price:l $450.00| Total:| $450.00|
g Skid Steer/Skid Loader: Mini/Stand-up/Dingo

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $155.00| Total: | $155.00 |
3 Skid Steer/Skid Loader: Small Frame Under 50 HP

Quantity: 1  UOM: HR No Bid
g Skid Steer/Skid Loader: Medium Frame 50-69 HP

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $215.00| Total: | $215.00 |
g Skid Steer/Skid Loader: Large Frame 70 HP or larger

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $270.00] Total: | $270.00 |
% Sanding Truck (5CY)

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $300.00| Total: | $300.00 |
g Knuckle Boom

Quantity: 1  UOM: HR No Bid
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g Bucket Truck
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: HR Price: $400.00 | Total: | $400.00 |
4 | Mobile Crane: Less than 30 Ton Capacity
0 , No Bid
Quantity: 1 UOM: HR 0 Bl
4 | Mobile Crane: 31-60 Ton Capacity
1 No Bid

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR

Response Total: $4,110.00
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Storm and Disaster Response Capability Statement
ClearPath Facility Services

ClearPath Facility Services provides rapid-deployment operational support for
municipalities facing severe weather events, infrastructure disruption, and disaster
recovery needs. Our teams are built around experienced operators, coordinated
logistics, and command-level oversight to ensure municipalities receive immediate,
professional support when local capacity is exceeded.

Operational Focus

Our teams specialize in snow and ice management, emergency storm response, and
disaster recovery operations, with the ability to mobilize equipment and personnel
quickly across state lines.

Services include:

e Snow and ice removal for roads, facilities, and public infrastructure
* Emergency storm response and debris removal

 Disaster recovery and cleanup operations

e Equipment and operator deployment for municipal support

* Hauling, excavation, and site clearing operations

Snow and Ice Expertise
Snow and ice mitigation is a core competency of our organization.

Our leadership team includes industry professionals with specialized training in
winter operations and risk management. ClearPath leadership holds advanced snow
industry credentials and regularly consults with municipalities, facility managers, and
emergency response organizations on winter operations strategy.

Our crews are experienced in:

e Large-scale snow clearing operations

* Municipal roadway support

* Snow hauling and relocation

* [ce mitigation and material application strategies
e Multi-day storm event operations

When winter storms overwhelm local resources, ClearPath provides experienced
crews that integrate seamlessly into municipal operations.



Disaster Response and Recovery

Through partnerships with experienced heavy-equipment contractors, including
teams with extensive disaster cleanup and recovery experience, ClearPath can assist
municipalities with:

e Storm debris removal

* Downed tree and infrastructure clearing
* Heavy equipment support

e Emergency site stabilization

* Hauling and material transport

Our teams regularly mobilize for travel operations, supporting communities that
require immediate operational reinforcement following severe weather events.

Operational Structure
Travel response crews deploy with a structured operational framework that includes:

* Command and coordination leadership

* Experienced equipment operators

e Secured communication systems

* Equipment transport and logistics planning

The leadership team supporting these operations includes individuals with
backgrounds in fire service, law enforcement, and military police, bringing disciplined
incident management and operational coordination to each deployment.

Equipment Capability

Our network supports a wide range of heavy equipment typically required during
storm and disaster operations, including:

* Wheel loaders

* Excavators

* Dump trucks and debris hauling equipment

e Snowplow trucks with and without spreaders
 Skid steers and compact equipment

e Transport trucks and trailers for mobilization

This flexibility allows ClearPath to support municipalities during both winter weather
events and post-storm recovery operations.
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