
RFP-6-2026

Woodall Construction Co., Inc.

Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: RFP-6-2026
Title: Storm and Disaster Response and Recovery Services and Equipment
Type: Request For Proposal
Issue Date: 2/23/2026
Deadline: 3/10/2026 02:00 PM (ET)

Contact Information

Contact: Todd Slatin
Address: Central Purchasing

Government Center Building
200 East Main Street
Lexington, KY 40507

Phone: (859) 2583320
Fax: (859) 2583322
Email: tslatin@lexingtonky.gov
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Woodall Construction Co., Inc. Information

Contact: Scott Woodall
Address: 1332 Cahill Drive

Lexington, KY 40504
Phone: (859) 233-2909
Fax: (859) 281-6259
Email: swoodall@woodallconst.com
Web Address: www.woodallconst.com

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED! By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent
and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached
bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

Gary Caudill gcaudill@woodallconst.com
Signature Email

Submitted at 3/10/2026 10:40:01 AM (ET)

Response Attachments

LFUCG Proposal Storm & Disaster Recovery Services & Equipment RFP # 6 - 2026.pdf

Bid # RFP LFUCG Proposal Storm & Disaster Recovery Services & Equipment

LFUCG UNIT PRICE BID STORM RECOVERY 3 10 2026.xlsx

Unit Bid Prices for Bid # RFP # 6 Storm and Disaster Response and Recovery Services & Equipment

Bid Lines

1 Motor Graders w/blade & escort/safety vehicle 125HP or less

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: $675.00 Total: $675.00

2 Motor Graders w/blade & escort/safety vehicle 126HP - 175HP

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: $675.00 Total: $675.00

3 Motor Graders w/blade & escort/safety vehicle 176HP - 250HP

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

4 Motor Graders w/blade & escort/safety vehicle 251HP or larger

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

5 Front-End Loader/Wheel Loader 40HP or less

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

6 Front-End Loader/Wheel Loader 41HP - 74HP

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

7 Front-End Loader/Wheel Loader 75HP - 109HP

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: $575.00 Total: $575.00

Supplier Notes: 150 HP
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8 Front-End Loader/Wheel Loader 110HP - 199HP

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: $575.00 Total: $575.00

Supplier Notes: 350 HP

9 Front-End Loader/Wheel Loader 200HP or larger

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

1
0

Front-End Loader - Other (i.e. Loader w/grapple, shaker, etc. please specify)

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

1
1

Combo Backhoe/Loader 40HP or less

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

1
2

Combo Backhoe/Loader 41HP -70HP

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

1
3

Combo Backhoe/Loader 71HP - 89HP

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: $475.00 Total: $475.00

1
4

Combo Backhoe/Loader 90HP or larger

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

1
5

Combo Backhoe/Loader Other (i.e. Loader w/grapple, Hoe Ram etc. please specify)

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: $600.00 Total: $600.00

Supplier Notes: HOE RAM

1
6

Dump Truck with Snowplow Single Rear Axle W/out spreader (26,000 GVWR or larger)

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

1
7

Dump Truck with Snowplow Single Rear Axle WITH spreader (26,000 GVWR or larger)

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

1
8

Dump Truck with Snowplow Multiple-Rear Axle W/out spreader (26,000 GVWR or larger)

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

1
9

Dump Truck with Snowplow Multiple-Rear Axle WITH spreader (26,000 GVWR or larger)

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

2
0

Dump Truck for debris hauling capacity: Less than Ten (10) yards

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: $300.00 Total: $300.00

Supplier Notes: 6 YARDS

2
1

Dump Truck for debris hauling capacity: 11 - 19 yards

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: $300.00 Total: $300.00

2
2

Dump Truck for debris hauling capacity: 20 - 29 yards

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

Vendor: Woodall Construction Co., Inc. RFP-6-2026Page 3 of 5 pages



2
3

Dump Truck for debris hauling capacity: 30 or more yards

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

2
4

Truck With Snowplow (7'min.) 4WD W/Salt Spreader (1.75yd min.) *Must have strobe lights

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

2
5

Truck With Snowplow (7'min.) 4WD W/out Salt Spreader *Must have strobe lights

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

2
6

Track hoe/Excavator Less than 10 Ton (Mini-Excavator)

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: $500.00 Total: $500.00

Supplier Notes: Cat 308

2
7

Track hoe/Excavator - 10 - 19 Ton

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: $600.00 Total: $600.00

2
8

Track hoe/Excavator - 20 - 29 Ton

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: $600.00 Total: $600.00

Supplier Notes: Komatsu 220

2
9

Track hoe/Excavator - 30 - 45 Ton

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: $600.00 Total: $600.00

Supplier Notes: Link Belt 350

3
0

Track hoe/Excavator - Greater than 45 Ton

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

3
1

Transport truck w/trailer (Flatbed/Lowboy/Open/Enclosed) less than 10 Ton

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: $300.00 Total: $300.00

Supplier Notes: Roll Back

3
2

Transport truck w/trailer (Flatbed/Lowboy/Open/Enclosed) up to 24 Ton Capacity

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: $300.00 Total: $300.00

Supplier Notes: low boy

3
3

Skid Steer/Skid Loader: Mini/Stand-up/Dingo

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

3
4

Skid Steer/Skid Loader: Small Frame Under 50 HP

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

3
5

Skid Steer/Skid Loader: Medium Frame 50-69 HP

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: $385.00 Total: $385.00

3
6

Skid Steer/Skid Loader: Large Frame 70 HP or larger

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid
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3
7

Sanding Truck (5CY)

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

3
8

Knuckle Boom

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

3
9

Bucket Truck

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

4
0

Mobile Crane: Less than 30 Ton Capacity

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

4
1

Mobile Crane: 31-60 Ton Capacity

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid

Response Total: $7,460.00
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