Bid 146-2023 Addendum 1
National Workweatr, Inc.
NEW WAY BOOT SHOP

Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 146-2023 Addendum 1

Title: Uniforms for Waste Management

Type: Competitive Bid

Issue Date: 12/28/2023

Deadline: 1/11/2024 02:00 PM (ET)

Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS
SOLICITATION. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE LINE
ITEMS TAB ONLY. PRICING WITHIN SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE
ACCEPTED AND MAY MAKE YOUR BID NON-RESPONSIVE.
All mandatory forms must be filled out and posted in “Response
Attachments” tab on lonWave or your bid will be considered non-
responsive and not considered.

Contact Information

Contact: Conni Hayes

Address: Central Purchasing
Government Center Building
200 East Main Street
Lexington, KY 40507

Phone:  (859) 2583320

Fax: (859) 2583322

Email: chayes@Iexingtonky.gov

Page 1 of 26 pages Vendor: National Workwear, Inc. Bid 146-2023 Addendum 1



National Workwear, Inc. Information

Contact: Ed Clark

Address: 510 E. New Circle Road
LEXINGTON, KY 40505

Phone: (859) 381-9845

Fax: (859) 381-0384

Toll Free: (800) 566-4298

Email: accounting@nationalworkwear.com

Web Address: www.nationalworkwear.com

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED! By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent
and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached
bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

Jenny Romero

accounting@nationalworkwear.com

Signature Email
Submitted at 1/10/2024 03:27:19 PM (ET)

Response Attachments

LFUCG BID 146-2023 RESPONSE.pdf

Pages 1-30

LFUCG Waste Bid 146-2023 Catalog.pdf

Catalog

COl - Lexington Fayette Urban County Government (1).pdf

Certificate Of Insurance

Bid Lines

1

Men's & Women's LS Industrial Work Shirt S-XL
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $19.97 |

Total: |

$19.97

Gray and Navy

Supplier Notes: [Women's SP13 ONLY come in sizes S-3XL REG Men's SP14 sizes S-6XL REG ONLY come in color

2 [ Men's & Women's LS Industrial Work Shirt 2X-3X

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $20.97| Total:| $20.97|
3 [ Men's & Women's LS Industrial Work Shirt 4X-6X

Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $20.97| Total: | $20.97 |
4 | Price for embroidery LS Industrial Work Shirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $4.95 | Total: | $4.95 |
5 | Men’s and Women’s SS Industrial Work Shirt S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $16.97| Total:| $16.97|

Supplier Notes: |Women's SP23 ONLY come in sizes S-4XL REG Men's SP24
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Men’s and Women’s SS Industrial Work Shirt 2X-3X

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $18.97 | Total: $18.97 |
Men’s and Women’s SS Industrial Work Shirt 4X-6X

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $18.97 | Total: $18.97 |
Price for embroidery SS Industrial Work Shirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.95 | Total: $4.95 |
Ladies LS Polo Shirt, no pocket S-XL

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: $0.00 | Total: $0.00 |
Supplier Notes: | The 1540 Unisex LS shirt is Discontinued |
Alternate 1

Edwards Hi-Performance LS Unisex Polo

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $20.97 | Total: $20.97 |
Manufacturer:; |1578 |
Manufacturer #: |Edwards |
Ladies LS Polo Shirt, no pocket 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.00 | Total: $0.00 |
Supplier Notes: | The 1540 Unisex LS shirt is Discontinued |
Alternate 1

Edwards Hi-Performance LS Unisex Polo

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $23.97| Total: $23.97 |
Manufacturer:  |1578 |
Manufacturer #: |Edwards |
Ladies LS Polo Shirt, no pocket 3XL

Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.00| Total: $0.00 |
Supplier Notes: | The 1540 Unisex LS shirt is Discontinued |
Alternate 1

Edwards Hi-Performance LS Unisex Polo

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $25.97 | Total: $25.97 |
Manufacturer: 1578 |
Manufacturer #: |Edwards |
Ladies LS Polo Shirt, no pocket 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.00 | Total: $0.00 |

Supplier Notes: | The 1540 Unisex LS shirt is Discontinued
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Alternate 1

Edwards Hi-Performance Mesh LS Unisex Polo - Only comes in 4XL-6XL TALL
Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $29.97 | Total: | $29.97 |

Manufacturer: |1578 |

Manufacturer #: |Edwards |

1 | Price for embroidery Ladies LS Polo Shirt

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $4.95| Total:| $4.95|

Polo Shirt, Solid Color Knit with Pocket S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $29.97| Total: | $29.97 |

Supplier Notes: [ SK52 does not come in colors Grey, Red, or Royal Colors available are Moss Green/Navy,
Black/Charcoal, Burgundy/Black, and Navy/Med Blue

FN

1 | Polo Shirt, Solid Color Knit with Pocket 2XL
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $29.97| Total:l $29.97|

1 | Polo Shirt, Solid Color Knit with Pocket 3XL
Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price:l $30.97| Total:| $30.97|

1 | Polo Shirt, Solid Color Knit with Pocket 4XI
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $30.97| Total: | $30.97 |

1 | price for embroidery Polo solid knit w/pocket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:| $4.95| Total:l $4.95|

1 | Women’s Blended Soft Knit Polo Shirt, no pocket S-XL

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: | $0.00 | Total: | $0.00 |
Supplier Notes: | The SK11 Blended Soft Knit Shirt is Discontinued |

Alternate 1

Red Kap Women's Flex Series Core SS polo

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $20.97| Total:l $20.97|

Manufacturer: |SK97 |
Manufacturer #: |Red Kap |

2 [ Women'’s Blended Soft Knit Polo Shirt, no pocket 2XL
Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: $0.00 | Total: | $0.00 |

Supplier Notes: [ The SK11 Blended Soft Knit Shirt is Discontinued |
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Alternate 1

Red Kap Women's Flex Series Core SS polo

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $22.97 | Total: | $22.97 |

Manufacturer: |SK97 |

Manufacturer #: |Red Kap |
% Women’s Blended Soft Knit Polo Shirt, no pocket 3XL

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.00 | Total: | $0.00 |

Supplier Notes: | The SK11 Blended Soft Knit Shirt is Discontinued |

Alternate 1

Red Kap Women's Flex Series Core SS polo

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $22.97 | Total: | $22.97 |

Manufacturer: |SK97 |

Manufacturer #: |Red Kap |
% Women'’s Blended Soft Knit Polo Shirt, no pocket 4XL-5XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Supplier Notes: [The SK11 Blended Soft Knit Shirt is Discontinued |
% price for embroidery Women's Blended Polo with No Pocket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $4.95 | Total: | $4.95 |
Z Women'’s Blended Soft Knit Polo Shirt, no pocket S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $11.97| Total: | $11.97

Supplier Notes: [LKP155 |
% Women’s Blended Soft Knit Polo Shirt, no pocket 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $15.97 | Total | $15.97 |
% Women’s Blended Soft Knit Polo Shirt, no pocket 3XL

Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $15.97| Total: | $15.97 |
% Women'’s Blended Soft Knit Polo Shirt, no pocket 4XL-5XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $15.97] Total: | $15.97 |

Supplier Notes: [LKP155 Does NOT come in size 5XL |
223 price for embroidery Women's Blended Polo with No Pocket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.95 | Total: | $4.95 |
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Men's & Women's Long Sleeve Pique Golf Shirt S-XL

9

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $21.97 | Total: | $21.97

Supplier Notes: [Women's Style# L500LS ONLY come in sizes S-4XL REG - It also does not come in Grey color and

has low stock in Royal Men's Style# K500LS

8 Men's & Women's Long Sleeve Pique Golf Shirt 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $21.97| Total: $21.97 |
% Men's & Women's Long Sleeve Pique Golf Shirt 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $24.97| Total: $24.97 |
g Men's & Women's Long Sleeve Pique Golf Shirt 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: | $30.97 | Total: $30.97 |
g price for embroidery Men's & Women's Long Sleeve Pique Golf Shirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $4.95 | Total: $4.95 |
2 Men's & Women's Short Sleeve Pique Golf Shirt S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $16.97 | Total: $16.97 |

Supplier Notes: |Women's Style# L500 Men's Style# K500 |
g Men's & Women's Short Sleeve Pique Golf Shirt 2XL

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: | $16.97 | Total: $16.97 |
fg Men's & Women's Short Sleeve Pique Golf Shirt 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $20.97| Total: $20.97 |
; Men's & Women's Short Sleeve Pique Golf Shirt 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $25.97 | Total: $25.97 |
g price for embroidery Men's & Women's Short Sleeve Pique Golf Shirt

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: | $4.95 | Total: $4.95 |
8 Men's Industrial Pique Polo, S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $16.97 | Total: $16.97 |

Supplier Notes: | The CS402 is Discontinued - Replaced with CS4020 |
61 Men's Industrial Pique Polo, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $21.97 | Total: $21.97 |

Supplier Notes: | The CS402 is Discontinued - Replaced with CS4020 |
il Men's Industrial Pique Polo, 3XL

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: $21.97 | Total: $21.97 |

Supplier Notes: [The CS402 is Discontinued - Replaced with CS4020
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N~

Men's Industrial Pigue Polo, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $27.97| Total: $27.97|

Supplier Notes: | The CS402 is Discontinued - Replaced with CS4020 |
g price for embroidery Men's Industrial Pique Polo Shirt

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA UnitPrice:l $4.95| Total: $4.95|
j Men's Golf Shirt S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:| $33.97| Total: $33.97|

Supplier Notes: [DG150 |
é Men's Golf Shirt 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $38.97 | Total: $38.97 |
g Men's Golf Shirt 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $38.97| Total: $38.97 |
471 Men's Golf Shirt 4X-6X

Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $43.97| Total: $43.97 |
g price for embroidery Men's Golf Shirt

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA UnitPrice:l $4.95| Total: $4.95|
g Men's Snag-Proof SS Tactical Polo, no pocket S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $26.97| Total: $26.97 |

Supplier Notes: |cs410 |
8 Men's Snag-Proof SS Tactical Polo, no pocket 2XL

Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $31.97| Total: $31.97 |
? Men's Snag-Proof SS Tactical Polo, no pocket 3XL

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA UnitPrice:l $31.97| Total: $31.97|
g Men's Snag-Proof SS Tactical Polo, no pocket 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $37.97| Total: $37.97 |
g price for embroidery Men's Snag-Proof SS Tactical Polo Shirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $4.95| Total: $4.95 |
2 Men's Snag-Proof LS Tactical Polo, no pocket S-XL

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA UnitPrice:l $32.97| Total: $32.97|

Supplier Notes: [CS410LS |
g Men's Snag-Proof LS Tactical Polo, no pocket 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $32.97| Total: $32.97 |
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5 | Men's Snag-Proof LS Tactical Polo, no pocket 3XL
Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price:l $37.97| Total:| $37.97|

5 [ Men's Snag-Proof LS Tactical Polo, no pocket 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $37.97| Total: | $37.97
Supplier Notes: | CS410LS does not come in 5XL or 6XL |

S | price for embroidery Men's Snag-Proof LS Tactical Polo Shirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:| $4.95| Total:l $4.95|

5 | Women's Snag-Proof SS Tactical Polo, no pocket S-XL
Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price:l $23.97| Total:| $23.97|

Supplier Notes: [CS413 |

6 [ Women's Snag-Proof SS Tactical Polo, no pocket 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $23.97| Total: | $23.97 |

6 | Women's Snag-Proof SS Tactical Polo, no pocket 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $28.97] Total: | $28.97 |

6 [ Women's Snag-Proof SS Tactical Polo, no pocket 4XL-6XL
Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price:l $28.97| Total:| $28.97|

Supplier Notes: |CS413 does not come in 5XL or 6XL |

6 | price for embroidery Women's Snag-Proof SS Tactical Polo Shirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $4.95| Total:| $4.95|

Ladies Industrial Pique Polo, S-XL

~O

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $28.97] Total: | $28.97 |

Supplier Notes: [The CS403 is Discontinued - Replaced with CS411 The CS411 only comes in four colors Black,
Navy, Charcoal, Royal

6 | Ladies Industrial Pique Polo, 2XL
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $28.97| Total:l $28.97

Supplier Notes: [The CS403 is Discontinued - Replaced with CS411 The CS411 only comes in four colors Black,
Navy, Charcoal, Royal

6 | Ladies Industrial Pique Polo, 3XL

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: $32.97| Total:| $32.97

Supplier Notes: [The CS403 is Discontinued - Replaced with CS411 The CS411 only comes in four colors Black,
Navy, Charcoal, Royal

6 | Ladies Industrial Pique Polo, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $32.97| Total: | $32.97 |

Supplier Notes: | The CS403 is Discontinued - Replaced with CS411 The CS411 does not come in 5XL or 6XL The
CS411 only comes in four colors Black, Navy, Charcoal, Royal
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price for embroidery Ladies Industrial Pigue Polo Shirt

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price:l $4.95| Total:|

$4.95 |

Men's Golf Shirt, no pocket S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:l $0.00| Total:|

$0.00 |

Supplier Notes: |The 105 Tri Mountain brand went out of business - Replacing item with different brand.

Alternate 1

Men's Superblend SS polo

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $19.97| Total:|

$19.97 |

Manufacturer: |BG7204

Manufacturer #: |Blue Gen

Men's Golf Shirt, no pocket 2XL

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: $0.00| Total:|

$0.00 |

Supplier Notes: |The 105 Tri Mountain brand went out of business - Replacing item with different brand.

Alternate 1

Men's Superblend SS polo

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $19.97 | Total: |

$19.97 |

Manufacturer:  |BG7204

Manufacturer #: |Blue Gen

Men's Golf Shirt, no pocket 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.00| Total: |

$0.00 |

Supplier Notes: | The 105 Tri Mountain brand went out of business - Replacing item with different brand.

Alternate 1

Men's Superblend SS polo

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $23.97| Total:|

$23.97 |

Manufacturer:  |BG7204

Manufacturer #: |Blue Gen

Men's Golf Shirt, no pocket 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.00| Total:l

$0.00 |

Supplier Notes: | The 105 Tri Mountain brand went out of business - Replacing item with different brand.
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Alternate 1

Men's Superblend SS polo

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $25.97 | Total: $25.97 |

Manufacturer: |BG7204 |

Manufacturer #: |Blue Gen |
g price for embroidery Men's Golf Shirt, no pocket

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: | $4.95 | Total: $4.95 |
Z Men's Easy Care SS Shirt/Button Down, S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $21.97| Total: $21.97 |

Supplier Notes: |8508 |
g Men's Easy Care SS Shirt/Button Down, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $21.97 | Total: $21.97 |
g Men's Easy Care SS Shirt/Button Down, 3XL

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: | $26.97 | Total: $26.97 |
; Men's Easy Care SS Shirt/Button Down, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $30.97| Total: $30.97 |
273 price for embroidery Men's Easy Care SS Shirt/Button Down

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $4.95| Total: $4.95 |
g Men's Easy Care LS Shirt/Button Down, S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $23.97| Total: $23.97 |

Supplier Notes: |S608 |
8 Men's Easy Care LS Shirt/Button Down, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $23.97| Total: $23.97 |
? Men's Easy Care LS Shirt/Button Down, 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $26.97 | Total: $26.97 |
g Men's Easy Care LS Shirt/Button Down, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $32.97| Total: $32.97 |
g price for embroidery Men's Easy Care LS Shirt/Button Down

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $4.95 | Total: $4.95 |
EAB, Ladies Easy Care SS Shirt/Button Down, S-XL

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: | $21.97 | Total: $21.97 |

Supplier Notes: [L508
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Ladies Easy Care SS Shirt/Button Down, 2XL

5

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $21.97 | Total: $21.97 |
g Ladies Easy Care SS Shirt/Button Down, 3XL

Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $26.97| Total: $26.97 |
g Ladies Easy Care SS Shirt/Button Down, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $30.97 | Total: $30.97 |
g price for embroidery Ladies Easy Care SS Shirt/Button Down

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $4.95 | Total: $4.95 |
8 Ladies Easy Care LS Shirt/Button Down, S-XL

Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $23.97| Total: $23.97 |

Supplier Notes: [L608 |
8 Ladies Easy Care LS Shirt/Button Down, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $23.97| Total: $23.97 |
S{ Ladies Easy Care LS Shirt/Button Down, 3XL

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $26.97 | Total: $26.97 |
8 Ladies Easy Care LS Shirt/Button Down, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $32.97| Total: $32.97 |
g price for embroidery Ladies Easy Care LS Shirt/Button Down

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $4.95 | Total: $4.95 |
2 Tshirt w/pocket SS, S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $7.97 | Total: $7.97 |

Supplier Notes: |PC54P |
g Tshirt w/pocket SS, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $10.97 | Total: $10.97 |
g Tshirt w/pocket SS, 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $10.97 | Total: $10.97 |
g Tshirt w/pocket SS, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $10.97 | Total: $10.97 |

Supplier Notes: |The PC54P does not come in 5XL or 6XL |
g price for embroidery Tshirt w/pocket SS

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.95 | Total: $4.95 |
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8 Tshirt no pocket LS, S-XL
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $9.97| Total:| $9.97|
Supplier Notes: |pc54|_s |

% Tshirt no pocket LS, 2XL

0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:l $9.97| Total:| $9.97|

% Tshirt no pocket LS, 3XL

1|Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $12.97| Total: | $12.97 |

% Tshirt no pocket LS, 4XL-6XL

2 | Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: | $12.97| Total: | $12.97 |

% price for embroidery Tshirt no pocket LS

3 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:l $4.95| Total:| $4.95|

% Heavyweight Tshirt w/pocket 90/10 SS, S-XL

4 [Quantity: 1  UOM: EA UnitPrice:l $7.97| Total:| $7.97|
Supplier Notes: |PC55P |

% Heavyweight Tshirt w/pocket 90/10 SS, 2XL

5 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $11.97| Total: | $11.97 |

% Heavyweight Tshirt w/pocket 90/10 SS, 3XL

6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $11.97| Total: | $11.97 |

% Heavyweight Tshirt w/pocket 90/10 SS, 4XL-6XL

7 | Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: | $11.97| Total: | $11.97 |

% price for embroidery Heavyweight Tshirt w/pocket 90/10 SS

8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:l $4.95| Total:| $4.95|

% Fit Tshirt w/pocket 60/40 SS, S-XL

9 |Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $11.97| Total: | $11.97 |
Supplier Notes: |BSM38 (BSM76GY for Grey) |

% Fit Tshirt w/pocket 60/40 SS, 2XL

0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $11.97| Total:l $11.97|
Supplier Notes: |BSM38 (BSM76GY for Grey) |

% Fit Tshirt w/pocket 60/40 SS, 3XL

1|Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $13.97| Total: | $13.97 |
Supplier Notes: [BSM38 (BSM76GY for Grey) |
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N

Fit Tshirt w/pocket 60/40 SS, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $13.97 | Total: | $13.97 |
Supplier Notes: |BSM38 (BSM76GY for Grey) |

% Price for embroidery Fit Tshirt w/pocket 60/40 SS

3 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $4.95 | Total: | $4.95 |

% LS Crewneck Tshirt, w/pocket, S-XL

Z | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $13.97| Total: | $13.97 |
Supplier Notes: | Port & Company Essential Long Sleeve Tee PC61LSP |

1 [ LS Crewneck Tshirt, w/pocket, 2XL

1

5 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $13.97 | Total: | $13.97 |
Supplier Notes: | Port & Company Essential Long Sleeve Tee PC61LSP |

% LS Crewneck Tshirt, w/pocket, 3XL

6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $14.97 | Total: | $14.97 |
Supplier Notes: | Port & Company Essential Long Sleeve Tee PC61LSP |

% LS Crewneck Tshirt, w/pocket, 4XL-6XL

7 | Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: $14.97| Total:| $14.97 |
Supplier Notes: |Port & Company Essential Long Sleeve Tee PC61LSP PC61LSP does not come in 5XL or 6XL |

% price for embroidery LS Crewneck Tshirt, w/pocket

8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $4.95 | Total: | $4.95 |

% Men's Value Fleece Jacket. S-XL

9 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $27.97 | Total: | $27.97 |
Supplier Notes: [F217 |

% Men's Value Fleece Jacket. 2XL

0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $27.97 | Total: | $27.97 |

% Men's Value Fleece Jacket. 3XL

1 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $31.97 | Total: | $31.97 |

% Men's Value Fleece Jacket. 4XL-6XL

2 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $34.97 | Total: | $34.97 |

% price for embroidery Men's Value Fleece Jacket

3 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $4.95 | Total: | $4.95 |
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ANBR

Ladies Value Fleece Jacket. S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$27.97 |

Total:

$27.97 |

Supplier Notes: ||_217

OINEF

Ladies Value Fleece Jacket. 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$27.97 |

Total:

$27.97 |

DN~

Ladies Value Fleece Jacket. 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$31.97 |

Total:

$31.97 |

~N-

Ladies Value Fleece Jacket. 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$31.97 |

Total:

$31.97 |

Supplier Notes: {L217 Does not come in 5XL or 6XL

ONF-

price for embroidery Ladies Value Fleece Jacket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$4.95 |

Total:

$4.95 |

ONPF-

Crewneck Sweatshirt, S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$14.97 |

Total:

$14.97 |

Supplier Notes: [562M

(@)dv)

Crewneck Sweatshirt, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$16.97 |

Total:

$16.97 |

RPWe

Crewneck Sweatshirt, 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$19.97 |

Total:

$19.97 |

NWkF

Crewneck Sweatshirt, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$19.97 |

Total:

$19.97 |

Supplier Notes: |562M does not come in 5XL or 6XL

wWwrE

price for embroidery Crewneck Sweatshirt

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$4.95 |

Total:

$4.95 |

AWk

Heavy Blend Hooded Sweatshirt S-XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$22.97 |

Total:

$22.97 |

Supplier Notes: [18500

gIwrE

Heavy Blend Hooded Sweatshirt 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$22.97 |

Total:

$22.97 |

WK

Heavy Blend Hooded Sweatshirt 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$27.97 |

Total:

$27.97 |
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~w

Heavy Blend Hooded Sweatshirt 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $27.97| Total: $27.97|
Supplier Notes: |18500 Does not come in 6XL |

% price for embroidery Heavy Blend Hooded Sweatshirt

8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:l $4.95| Total: $4.95|

% Zipped Hooded Sweatshirt S-XL

9 |Quantity: 1 uOM: EA Unit Price: | $30.97| Total: $30.97 |
Supplier Notes: |18600 |

411 Zipped Hooded Sweatshirt 2XL

0 |Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: | $30.97| Total: $30.97 |

411 Zipped Hooded Sweatshirt 3XL

1 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:l $35.97| Total: $35.97|

411 Zipped Hooded Sweatshirt 4XL-6XL

2 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:l $35.97| Total: $35.97|
Supplier Notes: | The 18600 does not come in 6XL |

3.1 price for embroidery Zipped Hooded Sweatshirt

3 | Quantity: _1  UOM: EA Unit Price: | $4.95| Total: $4.95 |

3.1 Unisex V-Neck Sweater Vest, S-XL

4 |Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $30.97 | Total: $30.97 |
Supplier Notes: |D477 |

%{ Unisex V-Neck Sweater Vest, 2XL

5|Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $30.97 | Total: $30.97 |

%{ Unisex V-Neck Sweater Vest, 3XL

6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $36.97 | Total: $36.97 |

%{ Unisex V-Neck Sweater Vest, 4XL-6XL

7 |Quantity: 1 UoM: EA Unit Price: | $36.97 | Total: $36.97 |
Supplier Notes: | D477 does not come in 5XL or 6XL |

i price for embroidery Unisex V-Neck Sweater Vest

8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:l $4.95| Total: $4.95|

i Unisex Microfiber Windshirt, S-XL

9 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:l $0.00| Total: $0.00|

Supplier Notes: |M700 is Discontinued - Replaced it with 9944
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Alternate 1

Men's CRA Legend Windshirt

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $40.97 | Total: $40.97 |
Manufacturer: |9944 |
Manufacturer #: |Charles River |
% Unisex Microfiber Windshirt, 2XL
0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.00 | Total: $0.00 |
Supplier Notes: |M700 is Discontinued - Replaced it with 9944 |
Alternate 1
Men's CRA Legend Windshirt
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $43.97 | Total: $43.97 |
Manufacturer: ~ [9944 |
Manufacturer #: |Charles River |
% Unisex Microfiber Windshirt, 3XL
1| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.00 | Total: $0.00 |
Supplier Notes: [M700 is Discontinued - Replaced it with 9944 |
Alternate 1
Men's CRA Legend Windshirt
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $43.97 | Total: $43.97 |
Manufacturer: |9944 |
Manufacturer #: |Charles River |
% Unisex Microfiber Windshirt, 4XL-6XL
2 |Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: $0.00| Total: $0.00 |
Supplier Notes: [M700 is Discontinued - Replaced it with 9944 |
Alternate 1
Men's CRA Legend Windshirt - The 9944 does not come in 6XL
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $46.97 | Total: $46.97 |
Manufacturer: |9944 |
Manufacturer #: |Charles River |
% Fleece-Lined Nylon Jacket, S-XL
3 | Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: $0.00| Total: $0.00 |

Supplier Notes: [M740 has very low stock - Replacing with 9934

Page 16 of 26 pages Vendor: National Workwear, Inc.

Bid 146-2023 Addendum 1




Alternate 1

CRA Unisex Navigator Jacket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$55.97 |

Total:

$55.97 |

Manufacturer:  [9934

Manufacturer #: |Charles River

HOI

Fleece-Lined Nylon Jacket, 2XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$0.00 |

Total:

$0.00 |

Supplier Notes: [M740 has very low stock - Replacing with 9934

Alternate 1

CRA Unisex Navigator Jacket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$58.97 |

Total:

$58.97 |

Manufacturer: |9934

Manufacturer #: |Charles River

o101

Fleece-Lined Nylon Jacket, 3XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$0.00 |

Total:

$0.00 |

Supplier Notes: [M740 has very low stock - Replacing with 9934

Alternate 1

CRA Unisex Navigator Jacket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$58.97 |

Total:

$58.97 |

Manufacturer: | 9934

Manufacturer #: |Charles River

OO~

Fleece-Lined Nylon Jacket, 4XL-6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$0.00 |

Total:

$0.00 |

Supplier Notes: [M740 has very low stock - Replacing with 9934

Alternate 1

CRA Unisex Navigator Jacket 9934 does not come in 6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$61.97 |

Total:

$61.97 |

Manufacturer:  |9934

Manufacturer #: |Charles River

~ U1

price for embroidery Fleece-Lined Nylon Jacket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$4.95 |

Total:

$4.95 |
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coo1R

3in 1 Jacket, S-XL
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit Price:

$91.97 |

Total:

$91.97 |

Supplier Notes: [J777

o1~

3in 1 Jacket, 2XL
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit Price: |

$91.97 |

Total:

$91.97 |

oo

3in 1 Jacket, 3XL
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit Price: |

$96.97 |

Total:

$96.97 |

RO

3in 1 Jacket, 4XL-6XL
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit Price: |

$96.97 |

Total:

$96.97 |

Supplier Notes: {3777 does not come in 5XL or 6XL

NOF

price for embroidery 3 in 1 Jacket
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit Price: |

$4.95 |

Total:

$4.95 |

wWor

Leather Garrison Belt, 28-40
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit Price: |

$24.97 |

Total:

$24.97 |

Supplier Notes: | Style 6582 sizes 24-44

roR

Leather Garrison Belt, 42-50
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit Price:

$27.97 |

Total:

$27.97 |

Supplier Notes: | Style 6582 sizes 46-54

gio

Leather Garrison Belt, 52-60
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit Price:

$29.97 |

Total:

$29.97 |

Supplier Notes: | Style 6582 sizes 56-60

OO

Tactical Duty Belt, 28-30
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit Price:

$9.97 |

Total:

$9.97 |

Supplier Notes: |F5603-75

~Nor

Tactical Duty Belt, 32-40
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit Price: |

$9.97 |

Total:

$9.97 |

(ocep)

Tactical Duty Belt, 42-50
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit Price: |

$9.97 |

Total:

$9.97 |

[(elop) )

Tactical Duty Belt, 52-58
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit Price: |

$9.97 |

Total:

$9.97 |

o~k

Clip Suspenders, OSFM
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit Price: |

$0.00 |

Total:

$0.00 |
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Alternate 1

Carhartt Rugged FlexT Elastic Suspenders
Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $19.97 | Total: | $19.97 |

Manufacturer: |A0005523 |

Manufacturer #: |Carhartt |

Ball cap mesh

PN

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: $5.97| Total:| $5.97|
Supplier Notes: [C911 |

price for embroidery mesh ball cap

N~

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $4.95| Total:| $4.95|

Ball cap flex fit

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $9.97| Total:| $9.97|
Supplier Notes: [11-1167 (11-1170 discontinued) |

W~

price for embroidery ball cap flex fit

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:| $4.95| Total:| $4.95|

IO

Fleece Lined Knit Cap, OSFM

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:| $4.97| Total:| $4.97|
Supplier Notes: |cp90|_ |

U1~

price for embroidery fleece lined knit cap

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:| $4.95| Total:l $4.95|

o~

Fleece UnLined Knit Cap, OSFM
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $3.97| Total:l $3.97|

Supplier Notes: [CP90 |

~N~

price for embroidery fleece unlined knit cap

o~

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $4.95| Total:| $4.95|

Men's Work Pants 28-42

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price:l $22.97| Total:| $22.97|

Supplier Notes: | PT20 - Khaki and Black only comes in waist 28.54; Navy only comes in waist sizes 28-60 (even
waist sizes only)

©~F

Men's Work Pants 44-50

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $23.97| Total: | $23.97 |

Supplier Notes: [PT20 - Khaki and Black only comes in waist 28.54; Navy only comes in waist sizes 28-60 (even
waist sizes only)

(@)eo)
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% Men's Work Pants 52+
1| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $25.97| Total:| $25.97
Supplier Notes: [PT20 - Khaki and Black only comes in waist 28.54; Navy only comes in waist sizes 28-60 (even
waist sizes only)
% Women's Work Pants 4-22
2 | Quantity: 1 uoMm: EA Unit Price: $38.97| Total: | $38.97 |
Supplier Notes: |8567 is Discontinued - Replaced with 8540 |
% Women's Work Pants 24-28
3 |Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: $41.97| Total: | $41.97 |
Supplier Notes: 8567 is Discontinued - Replaced with 8540 |
% Women's Work Pants 30+
4| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $47.97 | Total: | $47.97 |
Supplier Notes: |8567 is Discontinued - Replaced with 8540 Style 8540 only comes up to size 32 waist |
% Men’s Elastic Insert Work Pants 28-42
5| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $24.97 | Total: | $24.97 |
Supplier Notes: [PT60 - Khaki only comes in waist sizes 30-46; Navy only comes in waist sizes 28-60; Black only
comes in sizes 30-50 (even waist sizes only)
% Men’s Elastic Insert Work Pants 44-50
6 | Quantty: 1 uOM: EA Unit Price: | $26.97 | Total: | $26.97
Supplier Notes: | PT60 - Khaki only comes in waist sizes 30-46; Navy only comes in waist sizes 28-60; Black only
comes in sizes 30-50 (even waist sizes only)
% Men’s Elastic Insert Work Pants 52+
7 | Quantty: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: | $26.97 | Total: | $26.97 |
Supplier Notes: [PT60 - Khaki only comes in waist sizes 30-46; Navy only comes in waist sizes 28-60; Black only
comes in sizes 30-50 (even waist sizes only)
% Women's Elastic Insert Work Pants 4-22
8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $24.97| Total: | $24.97
Supplier Notes: [PT61 -Khaki only comes in waist sizes 422; Navy only comes in waist sizes 4-28; Black only comes
in waist sizes 4-24 (even waist sizes only)
% Women's Elastic Insert Work Pants 24-28
9 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $26.97 | Total: | $26.97
Supplier Notes: | PT61 -Khaki only comes in waist sizes 422; Navy only comes in waist sizes 4-28; Black only comes
in waist sizes 4-24 (even waist sizes only)
1 | Women's Elastic Insert Work Pants 30+
9 _ .
0 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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RO

Mens' Twill Pants 28-42

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$27.97 |

Total:

$27.97 |

Supplier Notes: |874

NOPRF

Mens' Twill Pants 44-50

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$31.97 |

Total:

$31.97 |

WO

Mens' Twill Pants 52+

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$31.97 |

Total:

$31.97 |

Supplier Notes: {874 only goes up waist size 56

NI

Men's Lightweight Tactical Pant, 28-40

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$42.97 |

Total:

$42.97 |

Supplier Notes: ||:5252-50

g1

Men's Lightweight Tactical Pant, 42-56

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$42.97 |

Total:

$42.97 |

Supplier Notes: |F5252-50

OO

Men;s Heavyweight Tactical Pant, 28-40

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$42.97 |

Total:

$42.97 |

Supplier Notes: [F5252-82

~N©oR

Men's Heavyweight Tactical Pant, 42-56

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$42.97 |

Total:

$42.97 |

Supplier Notes: |F5252-82

0O

Women's Lightweight Tactical Pant, 4W-22W

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$42.97 |

Total:

$42.97 |

Supplier Notes: ||:5295-50

OO

Women's Lightweight Tactical Pant, 24W-28W

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$42.97 |

Total:

$42.97 |

Supplier Notes: [F5295-50 - only goes up to 24W waist

(@)e] V)

Women's Lightweight Tactical Pant, 30W+
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

—ON

Women's Heavyweight Tactical Pant, 4W-22W

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$54.97 |

Total:

$54.97 |

Supplier Notes: ||:5259-4x
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Women's Heavyweight Tactical Pant, 24W-28W

NON

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$54.97 |

Total:

$54.97 |

Supplier Notes: [F5259-4X - only goes up to 24W waist

Women'sHeavyweight Tactical Pant, 30W+
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

wWON

No Bid

Coach Nylon Windbreaker, S-XL

~ODN

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$0.00 |

Total:

$0.00 |

Supplier Notes: {1500 Tri-Mountain Out of Business- Replaced item with 76242

Alternate 1

Men's Snap Front Nylon Jacket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$37.97 |

Total:

$37.97 |

Manufacturer:  |76242

Manufacturer #: |Dickies

Coach Nylon Windbreaker, 2XL-3XL

g10N

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$0.00 |

Total:

$0.00 |

Supplier Notes: 1500 Tri-Mountain Out of Business- Replaced item with 76242

Alternate 1

Men's Snap Front Nylon Jacket

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$41.97 |

Total:

$41.97 |

Manufacturer:  |76242

Manufacturer #: |Dickies

Coach Nylon Windbreaker, 4XL-6XL

OODON

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$0.00 |

Total:

$0.00 |

Supplier Notes: {1500 Tri-Mountain Out of Business- Replaced item with 76242

Alternate 1

Men's Snap Front Nylon Jacket - 76242 does not come in 5XL or 6XL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$41.97 |

Total:

$41.97 |

Manufacturer: | 76242

Manufacturer #: |Dickies

price for embroidery Coach Nylon Windbreaker

~NOoN

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$4.95 |

Total:

$4.95 |
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% Perma-Lined Jacket S-XL
8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $47.97 | Total: | $47.97 |
Supplier Notes: |JT50 |
% Perma-Lined Jacket 2XL
9 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $49.97 | Total: | $49.97 |
% Perma-Lined Jacket 3XL
0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $49.97 | Total: | $49.97 |
% Perma-Lined Jacket 4XL-6XL
1|Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $49.97| Total: | $49.97 |
% Perma-Lined Jacket S-XL Long/Tall
2 | Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: | $47.97| Total: | $47.97 |
% Perma-Lined Jacket 2XL Long/Tall
3 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $49.97 | Total: | $49.97 |
% Perma-Lined Jacket 3XL Long/Tall
4 | Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: | $49.97| Total: | $49.97 |
% Perma-Lined Jacket 4XL-6XL Long/Tall
5 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $49.97 | Total: | $49.97 |
% price for embroidery Perma-Lined Jacket
6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $4.95 | Total: | $4.95 |
% Action Back Coveralls 34R-50R (CT10, 30, 40)
7 |Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: | $82.97| Total: | $82.97 |
Supplier Notes: |CT10 - 32-50 $40.97; 52-66 $42.97; 38-62Long $42.97 CP40 - S-XL $39.97; 2XL-4XL $40.97
CT30 - M-XL $82.97; 2XL-4XL $83.97
% Action Back Coveralls 52R-60R (CT10, 30, 40)
8 | Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: | $82.97| Total: | $82.97 |
Supplier Notes: |CT10 - 32-50 $40.97; 52-66 $42.97; 38-62Long $42.97 CP40 - S-XL $39.97; 2XL-4XL $40.97
CT30 - M-XL $82.97; 2XL-4XL $83.97
% Action Back Coveralls 34L-50L (CT10, 30, 40)
9 | Quantity: _ 1 uoM: EA Unit Price: | $83.97| Total: | $83.97
Supplier Notes: |CT10 - 32-50 $40.97; 52-66 $42.97; 38-62Long $42.97 CP40 - S-XL $39.97; 2XL-4XL $40.97
CT30 - M-XL $82.97; 2XL-4XL $83.97
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% Action Back Coveralls 52L-60L (CT10, 30, 40)

0 | Quantity: 1 uOM: EA Unit Price: | $83.97| Total: | $83.97
Supplier Notes: |CT10 - 32-50 $40.97; 52-66 $42.97; 38-62Long $42.97 CP40 - S-XL $39.97; 2XL-4XL $40.97

CT30 - M-XL $82.97; 2XL-4XL $83.97

% price for embroidery for Action Back Coveralls (CT10, 30, 40)

1|Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $4.95| Total: $4.95 |

% Men’s Heavyweight Parka (HiVis) S-XL

2 | Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: | $108.97 | Total: $108.97 |
Supplier Notes: |US427 only available in Yellow |

% Men’s Heavyweight Parka (HiVis) 2XL

3| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $108.97 | Total: $108.97 |
Supplier Notes: |US427 only available in Yellow |

% Men’s Heavyweight Parka (HiVis) 3XL

4 |Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $108.97 | Total: $108.97 |
Supplier Notes: [US427 only available in Yellow |

% Men’s Heavyweight Parka (HiVis) 4XI-6XL

5| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $108.97| Total: $108.97 |
Supplier Notes: [US427 only available in Yellow - Item only goes up to a 5XL |

% price for embroidery Men's Heavyweight Parka (HiVis)

6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $4.95 | Total: $4.95 |

% Ansi 3 Hi Vis Waterproof Breathable Parka S-6X

7 |Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: | $73.97| Total: $73.97 |
Supplier Notes: |UC465 - only comes in Yellow/Navy |

% Price for embroidery

8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $4.95 | Total: $4.95 |

% Ansi 3 Hi Vis Water Resistant 3 Season Jacket S-6X

9 | Quantity: 1 uOM: EA Unit Price: | $45.97 | Total: $45.97 |
Supplier Notes: |US466 - Only comes in Yellow/Black |

% Price for embroidery

0 | Quantity: 1 uOM: EA Unit Price: | $4.95] Total: $4.95 |

% Ansi 3 Hi Vis Hooded Zip Sweatshirt M-5X

1| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $47.97 | Total: $47.97 |
Supplier Notes: | 75-5325 Yellow; 75-5326 Orange |
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% Price for embroidery
2 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $4.95 | Total: | $4.95 |
% Ansi 3 Hi Vis T-Shirt S-5X
3 | Quantity: 1  UOM: EA Unit Price: | $16.97 | Total: | $16.97 |
Supplier Notes: [LUX-SSETP3B |
% Price for embroidery
4 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $4.95 | Total: | $4.95 |
% Ansi 3 Hi Vis Windbreaker S-XL
5| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $0.00| Total: | $0.00 |
Supplier Notes: | Tri-Mountain out of Business 8830 - Replaced with SRJ754 |
Alternate 1
Port Authority Enhanced Visibility Challenger Jacket with Reflective Taping
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $60.97 | Total | $60.97 |
Manufacturer:  |SRJ754 |
Manufacturer #: |Port Authority |
% Ansi 3 Hi Vis Windbreaker 2X-5X
6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.00| Total: | $0.00 |
Supplier Notes: | Tri-Mountain out of Business 8830 - Replaced with SRJ754 |
Alternate 1
Port Authority Enhanced Visibility Challenger Jacket with Reflective Taping
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $65.97 | Total: | $65.97 |
Manufacturer: | SRJI754 |
Manufacturer #: |Port Authority |
% Ansi 3 Hi Vis Windbreaker 6X
7 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.00 | Total: | $0.00 |
Supplier Notes: | Tri-Mountain out of Business 8830 - Replaced with SRJ754 |
Alternate 1
Port Authority Enhanced Visibility Challenger Jacket with Reflective Taping
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $69.97 | Total: | $69.97 |
Manufacturer: | SRI754 |
Manufacturer #: |Port Authority |
% Price for embroidery
8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.95 | Total: | $4.95 |
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Response Total: $5,461.86

Page 26 of 26 pages Vendor: National Workwear, Inc. Bid 146-2023 Addendum 1















































































































Client#: 802500 NATIOWORKW?2

ACORD. CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE Y omoon

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer any rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER GONIACT adonna M. Schmidt
Marsh & M.CLennan Agency LLC 5—\}78,'\‘[\'150, Ext): 859-244-7643 &\A/é No): 859-254-8020
360.E35t Vine Street, Ste 200 EMAL <. Ladonna.Schmidt@MarshMMA.com
Lexington, KY 40507 INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
INSURER A : West Bend Mutual Insurance Company 15350
INSURED INSURER B : Accident Fund Insurance Co. of America 10166
National Workwear, Inc
) INSURER C :
861 Corporate Drive, Ste. 200
) INSURER D :
Lexington, KY 40503
INSURER E :
INSURER F :
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

INSR ADDL|SUBR POLICY EFF | POLICY EXP
LTR TYPE OF INSURANCE INSR |WVD POLICY NUMBER (MM/DD/YYYY) | (MM/DD/YYYY) LIMITS
A | X| COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY B067175 05/13/2023|05/13/2024) EACH OCCURRENCE $1,000,000
DAMAGE TO RENTED
CLAIMS-MADE | X| occur PREMISES (Ea occurrence) | $500,000
MED EXP (Any one person) $ 10,000
PERSONAL & ADV INJURY | $1,000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE $2,000,000
PRO-
poOLICY JECT Loc PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG | $3,000,000
OTHER: $
A | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY B067175 05/13/2023 05/13/2024 Eaetideny =M™ 11,000,000
X| ANY AUTO BODILY INJURY (Per person) | $
OWNED SCHEDULED ’
AUTOS ONLY AUTOS BODILY INJURY (Per accident) | $
x| HIRED X | NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE s
AUTOS ONLY AUTOS ONLY (Per accident)
$
A | X|UMBRELLA LIAB X | occur B067175 05/13/2023|05/13/2024) EACH OCCURRENCE $3,000,000
EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $3,000,000
DED RETENTION $ $
WORKERS COMPENSATION PER OTH-
B | AND EMPLOYERS LIABILITY . AFWCP100049885 05/13/2023|05/13/2024 STATUTE ‘ ER
ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE E.L. EACH ACCIDENT $1,000,000
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED? l:| N/A
(Mandatory in NH) E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE| $1,000,000
If yes, describe under
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | $1,000,000

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE

Lexington Fayette Urban County THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN

Government ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.
200 E Main St
Lexington, KY 40507 AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

Ll ¥ Bundtt
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ACORD 25 (2016/03) 1 of1 The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD
#513666952/M13665785 JXAZS




Item # Description Sizes Price Price Colors
w/Embroidery
SP13 Red Kap Women's Long Sleeve Industrial Work Shirt S-XL REG $19.97 $24.92 Medium Blue
Poplin; 65% polyester/35% cotton 2XL-3XL REG $20.97 $25.92 Navy
Black
White
SP14 Red Kap Men's Long Sleeve Industrial Work Shirt S-XL REG $19.97 $24.92 Grey
Poplin; 65% polyester/35% cotton 2XL-6XLREG | $20.97 $25.92
M-3XL LONG $20.97 $25.92
S-XL REG $19.97 $24.92 Black
2XL - 4XL REG $20.97 $25.92 Burgundy
L-3XL LONG $20.97 $25.92 Spruce Green
S-XL REG $19.97 $24.92 Petrol Blue -MB
2XL-5XL REG $20.97 $25.92 Light Blue
M-5XL LONG $20.97 $25.92
S-XL REG $19.97 $24.92 Navy
2XL-6XL REG $20.97 $25.92
S-6XL LONG $20.97 $25.92
SP23 Red Kap Women's Short Sleeve Industrial Work Shirt S-XL REG $16.97 $19.47 Medium Blue
Poplin; 65% polyester/35% cotton 2XL-4XL REG $18.97 $21.47 Navy
Black
Light Blue
White
SP24 Red Kap Men's Short Sleeve Industrial Work Shirt S-XL REG $16.97 $21.92 Petrol Blue -MB
Poplin; 65% polyester/35% cotton IXL-6XL REG $18.97 $23.92 White
M-5XL LONG $18.97 $23.92
S-XL REG $16.97 $21.92 Black
2XL-6XL REG $18.97 $23.92 Grey
L-4XL LONG $18.97 $23.92 Light Blue
S-XL REG $16.97 $21.92 Navy
2XL-6XL REG $18.97 $23.92
M-6XL LONG $18.97 $23.92
L508 Port Authority Women's Short Sleeve Easy Care Shirt S-2XL REG $21.97 $26.92 Navy, Ultra Blue
Wrinkle resistant work shirt. 55/45 cotton/poly blend.
3XL REG $26.97 $31.92 Royal, Steel Grey
4XL-6XL REG $30.97 $35.92 Black, Light Blue
Burgundy, White
S508 Port Authority Men's Short Sleeve Easy Care Shirt S-2XL REG $21.97 $26.92 Navy, Ultra Blue
or w/pocket Wrinkle 3XL REG $26.97 $31.92 Royal, Steel Grey
TLS508 resistant work shirt. 55/45 cotton/poly blend. IXL-6XL REG $30.97 $35.92 Black, Light Blue
for tall sizes Burgundy, White
L-XL TALL $23.97 $28.92 Navy
2XL-3XL TALL $26.97 $31.92 Royal
4XL TALL $28.97 $33.92 Black
Steel Grey
L608 Port Authority Women's Long Sleeve Easy Care Shirt S-2XL REG $23.97 $28.92 Navy, Ultra Blue
Wrinkle resistant work shirt. 55/45 cotton/poly blend. 3XL REG $26.97 $31.92 Royal, Steel Grey
4XL-6XL REG $32.97 $37.92 Black, Light Blue

Burgundy, White




Item # Description Sizes Price Price Colors
w/Embroidery
S608 Port Authority Men's Long Sleeve Easy Care Shirt S-2XL REG $23.97 $28.92 Navy, Ultra Blue
or w/pocket Wrinkle resistant work shirt. 55/45 3XL REG $26.97 $31.92 Royal, Steel Grey
TLS608 cotton/poly blend. AXL-6XLREG | $32.97 $37.92  |Black, Light Blue
for tall sizes Burgundy, White
L-XL TALL $25.97 $30.92 Navy
2XL-3XL TALL | $28.97 $33.92 Royal
4XL TALL $29.97 $34.92 Black
Steel Grey
L500 Port Authority Women's Silk Touch Short Sleeve Polo, [S-2XL REG $16.97 $21.92 Navy
5-ounce, 65/35 poly/cotton pique 3XL REG $20.97 $25.92 Black
4XL-6XL REG $25.97 $30.92 Royal
White
K500 Port Authority Men's Short Sleeve Polo, no pocket S-2XL REG $16.97 $21.92 Navy
5-ounce, 65/35 poly/cotton pique 3XL REG $20.97 $25.92 Royal
4XL-6XL REG $25.97 $30.92 Burgundy
White
Maroon
SK97 Red Kap Women's Flex Series Core SS polo S-XL REG $ 2097]|S 25.92 | Black
100% Polyester 2XL-3XLREG |S$ 22.97|S 27.92 | Burgundy
4.50z Pique Knit Navy
SK11 is Discontinued - Replaced it with this item Royal
Charcoal
SK52 Red Kap Men's Performance Knit SS Twill Shirt, with S-2XL REG $ 29.971|S 34.92 | Moss Green/Navy
70z. twill weave knit; 50% polyester/50% cotton 3XL-4XLREG [$ 30.97 (S 35.92 | Black/Charcoal
Burgundy/Black
Navy/Med Blue
LKP155 Port & Com Ladies Core SS Pique Polo S-XL REG $ 11.97]|S 16.92 | Athletic Heather
6.5-ounce, 50/50 double pique knit cotton/poly 2XL-4XLREG |S$ 15.97|S 20.92 | Black
Deep Navy
Royal
Does not come in 5XL or 6XL
CS413 CornerStone Ladies SS Snag-Proof Polo S-2XL REG $ 2397]|S 28.92 | Royal
6.6-ounce snag-proof polyester 3XL-4XLREG |$ 2897|$ 33.92 | Black
Dark Navy
Red
Does not come in 5XL or 6XL Maroon
cs411 CornerStone Ladies SS Snag-Proof Tactical Polo S-2XL REG $ 28971|S 33.92 | Royal
6.6-ounce snag-proof polyester 3XL-4XLREG |$ 32.97|$ 37.92 | Black
CS403 is Discontinued- Replaced it with this item Dark Navy
Charcoal
CS4020 Corner Stone Men's SS Industria Pique Polo S-XL REG $ 1697 |$ 21.92 | Black
6.5-ounce snag-proof polyester pique 2XL-3XLREG | $ 2197 |$ 26.92 | Dark Green
CS402 is Discontinued- Replaced it with this item 4XL-6XLREG | $ 2797 | S 32.92 | Royal
No 6XL in Black Color
cs410 Corner Stone Men's SS Snag-Proof Tactical Polo S-XL REG $ 2697 |S 31.92 | Royal
6.6-ounce snag-proof polyester 2XL-3XLREG | $ 3197 |$ 36.92 | Dark Navy
4XL-6XLREG | $ 37.97 S 42.92 | White
Tan
Light Grey




Item # Description Sizes Price Price Colors
w/Embroidery
DG150 Devon & Jones Men's SS DRYTEC20 Performance Polo S-XL REG S 3397 |S 38.92 | Black
6.3 0z./yd2 / 215 gsm, 100% combed cotton pique with 2XL-3XLREG | S 38.97 |S 43.92 | French Blue
EZ Cool wicking technology
4XL-6XLREG | $ 43.97 [$ 48.92 | Graphite
Navy
Royal
BG7204 Men's Superblend SS polo S-2XL REG $ 1997 |$ 24.92 | Black
6.70z cotton (60%) and polyester (40%) 3XL REG S 2397 |S 28.92 | Royal
4XL-6XLREG | $ 25.97 | $ 30.92 | Navy
Tri-Mountain out of Business Burgundy
Replaced 105 with this item Graphite
L500LS Port Authority Women's Long Sleeve Polo, no pocket S-2XL REG $21.97 $26.92 Black
5-ounce, 65/35 poly/cotton pique 3XL REG $24.97 $29.92 Burgundy
4XL REG $30.97 $35.92 Navy
White
Dark Green
K500LS Port Authority Men's Long Sleeve Polo, no pocket S-2XL REG $21.97 $26.92 Navy
5-ounce, 65/35 poly/cotton pique 3XL REG $24.97 $29.92 Cool Grey
4XL-6XL REG $30.97 $35.92 Black
White
Cs4a10LS Corner Stone Men's Long Sleeve Snag-Proof Tactical S-2XL REG $32.97 $37.92 Charcoal
6.6-ounce snag-proof polyester 3XL -4XL REG $37.97 $42.92 Black
Dark Navy
Does not come in 5XL or 6XL Royal
1578 Edwards Hi-Performance LS Unisex Polo S-XL REG $20.97 $25.92 Navy
Replacement for 1540 which is discontinued 2XL REG $23.97 $28.92 Black
3XL REG $25.97 $30.92
4XL-6XLTALL | $29.97 $34.92
BSM38 Berne Men's Performance Short Sleeve Pocket T-Shirt  [S-2XL REG $11.97 $16.92 Black
4.2 0z 60% cotton 40% polyester jersey 3XL- 6XL REG $13.97 $18.92 Navy
Pine
Grey (BSM76GY)
BG7302 Men's Value Wicking Crew Neck SS Tee S-2XL REG $9.97 $14.92 Black
100% snag- and wrinkle-resistant polyester 3XL REG $12.97 $17.92 Navy
Tri-Mountain out of Business 4XL- 6XLREG | $15.97 $20.92 Graphite
Replaced KO20PCN with this item *Note this item was not on portal bid but was part of the
download packet
PC55P Port & Co. Short Sleeve Tee, with Pocket S-XL REG $7.97 $12.92 Navy
50/50 blend 2XL-3XLREG | $11.97 $16.92  |Athletic Heather
4XL-6XL REG $11.97 $16.92 Royal
Black
Safety Green
PC54P Port & Co. Short Sleeve Tee, with Pocket S-XL REG $7.97 $12.92 Ash
5.4-ounce, 100% cotton 2XL-4XL REG $10.97 $15.92 Athletic Heather
Royal
Black

Item does not come in 5XL or 6XL




Item # Description Sizes Price Price Colors
w/Embroidery
PC61LSP Port & Company Crewneck Long Sleeve T-shirt w/pocket| S-2XL REG S 13.97| S 18.92 |Ash
90/10 cotton/poly (Athletic Heather) 3XL-4XLRGE | $ 14.97| $ 19.92 [Royal
50/50 cotton/poly (S. Green, S. Orange) Safety Green
Item Line 114-117 List LS, but picture given shows Red
Item does not come in 5XL or 6XL
PC54LS Port and Co. Long Sleeve Tee, no pocket S-XL REG $9.97 $14.92 Navy
100% cotton, Tag-free label 2XL REG $9.97 $14.92 Athletic Heather
3XL-4XL REG $12.97 $17.92 Royal
Black, Yellow
Item does not come in 5XL or 6XL
562M Jerzees NuBlend Crewneck Sweatshirt S-XL REG $14.97 $19.92 Navy
50/50 Fleece, pre-shrunk 2XL REG $16.97 $21.92 Black
3XL-4XL REG $19.97 $24.92 Ash, True Red
Item does not come in 5XL or 6XL
PT20 Men's DuraKap Industrial Pant 7.502(28-42 S 2297 Black
65% Polyester / 35% Combed cotton
44-50 $ 23.97 Khaki
52-54 S 25.97 Navy
Inseam 24-34 (Waist: 28-54) Inseam 36 EVEN SIZES ONLY
(Waist 30-38)
8540 Utility Ladies EZ Fit Chino Flat Front Pant 00-22 $38.97 Black-010
65% Polyester/35% Cotton, 8.0 oz
8567 Replacement 24-28 $41.97 Navy-007
30-32 $47.97 Tan-005
Inseams 25,26,27,28,29,30,32,34 EVEN SIZES ONLY
PT60 Red Kap Men's Elastic Insert Work Pant 30-42 $24.97 Khaki
7.50z 65% Polyester / 35% Combed cotton 44-46 $26.97
WAIST 30-38: INSEAM 24,26,28,30,32,34,36;
AIST 40-46: INSEAM 24.26,28.30,32,34
28-42 $24.97 Navy
44-50 $26.97
52-60 $26.97
WAIST 30-38: INSEAM 24,26,28,30,32,34,36;
WAIST 28,40-60: INSEAM 24,26,28,30,32,34
30-42 $24.97 Black
44-50 $26.97
WAIST 30-38: INSEAM 24,26,28,30,32,34,36;
WAIST 40-50: INSEAM 24,26,28,30,32,34
PT61 Red Kap Women's Elastic Insert Work Pant 4-22 $24.97 Khaki
7.50z 65% Polyester / 35% Combed cotton 4-22 $24.97 Navy
24-28 $26.97
4-22 $24.97 Black
24 $26.97
INSEAM: 24,26,28,29,30,32
F5252-50 Propper Men's Lightweight Tactical Pants 28-56 $42.97 Khaki-250
6.4 0z 65% polyester / 35% cotton lightweight ripstop Navy-450
Olive-330
Black-001

EVEN INSEAMS ONLY




Item # Description Sizes Price Price Colors
w/Embroidery
F5252-82 Propper Men's Heavyweight Tactical Pants 28-56 $42.97 Khaki-250
8.5 0z 65% polyester / 35% cotton canvas Navy-450
Olive-330
Black-001
EVEN INSEAMS ONLY
F5295-50 Propper Women's Lightweight Tactical Pants 4W-22W $42.97 Khaki-250
Relaxed through hip and thigh; straight through the leg; side
elastic waistband. 65% polyester/35% cotton lightweight 24w 542'97 Navy-450
ripstop fabric w/teflon to repel stains & liquid; reinforced knee; Olive-330
slash side pockets; side cargo pockets w/flap.
Black-001
EVEN INSEAMS ONLY
F5259-4X Kinetic® Women's Tactical Pant 4W-22W $54.97 Khaki-250
6.5 0z 65% polyester / 32% cotton / 3% spandex 24W $54.97 Navy-450
NEXStretch® fabric
Teflon™ fabric protector repels stains and liquids Olive-330
Black-001
Propper no longer makes Women's Heavyweight Pants
EVEN INSEAMS ONLY
874 Dickies Original Fit Work Pant 28-42 $27.97 Khaki
Twill: 65% Polyester / 35% Combed cotton. 44-50 $31.97 Navy
Classic Rise, Original Fit, Sits at waist, Resists wrinkles, Easy care '
stain release, center crease, tunnel belt loops. 52-56 $31-97 Black
INSEAM | KH NV
28" 32-44 | 32-44
29" 32-44 | 32-44
30" 2858 | 2858
31" 32-38 | 32-38
32" 2858 | 2858
34" 30-46 30-44
36" 3438 | 3438
CT10 Red Kap Twill Action Back Coverall with chest pockets [32-50 REG $40.97 $45.92 Navy
7.50z 65% Polyester / 35% Combed cotton 52-66 REG $42.97 $47.92
38-62 LONG $42.97 $47.92
38-50 REG $40.97 $45.92 Orange
52-56 REG $42.97 $47.92
42-50 LONG $42.97 $47.92
CT30 Red Kap Insulated Twill Coverall M-L SHORT $82.97 $87.92 Navy
7.50z 65% Polyester / 35% Cotton S-XL REG $82.97 $87.92
2XL-4XL REG $83.97 $88.92
M-2XL LONG $83.97 $88.92
CP40 Red Kap Short Sleeve Speedsuit Coverall S-XL REG $39.97 $44.92 Navy
5.250z 65% Polyester / 35% Combed cotton 2XL-4XLREG | $40.97 $45.92
M-2XL LONG $40.97 $45.92
JT50 Red Kap Perma-lined Panel Jacket S-XL $47.97 $52.92 Navy
7.50z Shell: 65% Polyester / 35% Cotton 2XL-6XL $49.97 $54.92
Lining: 100% Polyester M-5XL LONG $49.97 $54.92
S-XL $47.97 $52.92 Black
2XL-6XL $49.97 $54.92
L-4XL LONG $49.97 $54.92
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Item # Description Sizes Price Price Colors
w/Embroidery
1777 Port Authority 3-in-1 Jacket S-2XL REG $91.97 $96.92 Black/Black
100% M-Tek™ nylon shell with 100% polyester lining 3XL-4XL REG $96.97 $101.92 Navy/Navy
Does not come in 5XL or 6XL
76242 Men's Snap Front Nylon Jacket S-XL REG $37.97 $42.92 Black
Shell: 100% Nylon w/ Polyurethane Coating Lining: 2XL-4XL REG $41.97 $46.92 Navy
100%Polyester
Tri-Mountain out of Business
Replaced 1500 with this item Does not come in 5XL or 6XL
9934 CRA Unisex Navigator Jacket S-XL REG $55.97 $60.92 Black-010
M740 has low stock on everything 2XL-3XL REG $58.97 $63.92 Forest-020
Replaced it with this item 4XL- 5XLREG | $61.97 $66.92 Navy-040
Does not come in 6XL
L217 Port Authority Ladies Fleece Jacket S-2XL REG $27.97 $32.92 True Navy
8.3-ounce, 100% polyester 3XL-4XL REG $31.97 $36.92 True Royal
True Red
Black
Does not come in 5XL or 6XL Iron Grey
F217 Port Authority Fleece Jacket S- 2XL REG $27.97 $32.92 True Navy
8.3-ounce, 100% polyester 3XL $31.97 $36.92 True Royal
4XL-6XL $34.97 $39.92 True Red
True Royal has no inventory in 6XL Black
True Navy has low* stock in 6XL Iron Grey
18500 Gildan Men's Heavy Blend Hooded Sweatshirt S-2XL REG $22.97 $27.92 Black
8-ounce, 50/50 cotton/poly 3XL-5XL REG $27.97 $32.92 Navy
Royal
Does not come in 6XL Sport Grey
Red
18600 Gildan Men's Heavy Blend Full-Zip Hooded Sweatshirt  [S-2XL REG $30.97 $35.92 Black
8-ounce, US 50/50 cotton/poly 3XL-5XL REG $35.97 $40.92 Navy
Royal
Does not come in 6XL Sport Grey
Red
D477 Devon & Jones Adult V-Neck Vest S-2XL REG $30.97 $35.92 Navy
8 0z., 100% airspun cotton, 12 gauge 3XL-4XL REG $36.97 $41.92 Black
Does not come in 5XL or 6XL
Low stock in size Large Navy
Low stock in size XL Black
9944 Men's CRA Legend Windshirt S-XL REG $40.97 $45.92 Black/LtKhaki
M700 is Discontinued - Replaced it w/ this item 2XL-3XL REG $43.97 $48.92 Navy/LtKhaki
4XL-5XL REG $46.97 $51.92 Navy/White

Does not come in 6XL




Item # Description Sizes Price Price Colors
w/Embroidery
us427 HI-Vis 7 in 1 Traffic Jacket S-5XL REG $108.97 $113.92 Yellow
Shell Fabric : 300D Breathable: 100% Polyester, 300D
Oxford Weave, Double PU Coated, Breathable, Stain
Resistant Finish 5.50z
Lining Fabric : 100% Polyester Mesh 20z
uca65 Hi-Vis Contrast Bomber Jacket M-6XL REG $73.97 $78.92 Yellow/Navy
Shell Fabric : 300D Industry: 100% Polyester, 300D Oxford
Weave with a stain resistant finish, PU Coated 5.50z
Lining Fabric : 100% Polyester 20z
Us466 Hi-Vis Contrast Traffic Jacket S-6XL REG $45.97 $50.92 Yellow/Black
Shell Fabric : 300D Industry: 100% Polyester, 300D Oxford
Weave with a stain resistant finish, PU Coated 5.50z
Lining Fabric : 100% Polyester 20z
75-5325 Hi-Vis Full-Zip Hooded Sweatshirt M-5XL REG $47.97 $52.92 Yellow
100% Polyester
ANSI/ISEA 107-2015 Type R, Class 3
75-5326 Hi-Vis Full-Zip Hooded Sweatshirt M-5XL REG $47.97 $52.92 Orange
100% Polyester
ANSI/ISEA 107-2015 Type R, Class 3
LUX- Classic Wicking Birdseye SS T-Shirt S-5XL REG $16.97 $21.92 Yellow
SSETP3B
Class 3, 2" Silver reflective tape 100% ANSI Wicking S-5XL REG $16.97 $21.92 Orange
Birdseye 3.8 oz. fabric weight Lightweight fabric provides
comfort Up to UPF 30 Protection Pocket: 1 Left Chest
SRJ754 Port Authority® Enhanced Visibility Challenger™ Jacket |S-XL REG $60.97 $65.92 Yellow
with Reflective Taping
9.3-ounce, 100% polyester fleece body lining 2XL-5XL REG $65.97 $70.92
Durable 100% polyester water resistant shell 6XL REG $69.97 $74.92
Tri-Mountain out of Business 8830 was
replaced with this item
6582 BLC Traditional 1 1/2" Off Duty Garrison Belt 24-44 $24.97 $24.97 Black
10-12 ounce, drum dyed full grain English Bridle leather |46-54 $27.97 $27.97 Brown
56-60 $29.97 $29.97
F5603-75 Tactical Duty Belt 28-58 $9.97 $9.97 Black-001
Coyote-362
Khaki-250
Olive-330
A0005523 Carhartt Rugged FlexT Elastic Suspenders OSFM $19.97 $19.97 Black-001
-Replaced the Perry Suspender with this item Khaki-201

Navy-401




Item # Description Sizes Price Price Colors
w/Embroidery
CP90 & Knit Cap / Fleece Lined Knit Cap CP90 UNLINED| $3.97 $8.92 Navy
CP90L One size fits most
CPOOL LINED $4.97 $9.92 Black
Neon Yellow
Athletic Oxford
c911 Adjustable Mesh Back Cap ONE SIZE $5.97 $10.92 Navy
100% cotton twill front panels; 100% polyester Black
mesh mid and back panels
11-1167 Otto Flex Fit Ball Cap S/M $9.97 $14.92 Navy
11-1170 is Discontinued - Replaced with item L/XL $9.97 $14.92 Black
Embroidery LFUCG LOGO $4.95
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