







































































9. STATEMENT OF EXPERIENCE
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15. DEBARMENT CERTIFICATION

All contractors/subcontractors shall complete the following certification and submit it with the bid
proposal.

The contractor/subcontractor certifies in accordance with Executive Order 12549 (Debarment and
Suspension 2/18/86) that to the best of its knowledge and belief, that it and its principals:

1) Are not presently debarred, suspended, proposed for debarment, declared negligible, or voluntarily
excluded from covered transactions or contract by any Federal department or agency for
noncompliance with the Federal Labor Standards, Title VI of the Civil Rights Act of 1964 as
amended, Executive Order 11246 as amended or any other Federal law;

a) Have not within athree year period preceding this proposal been convicted of or had a civil
judgment rendered against them for commission of fraud or a criminal offense in
connection with obtaining, attempting to obtain, or performing apublic (Federal, State or
local) transaction or contract under a public transaction; violation of Federal or State
antitrust statutes or commission of embezzlement, theft, forgery, bribery, falsification or
destruction of records, making false statements, or receiving stolen property;

b) Are not presently indicted for or otherwise criminally or civilly charged by a government
entity (Federal, State or local) with commission of any of the offenses enumerated in
paragraph (1)(a) of this certification; and

¢) Have not within a three year period preceding this bid has one or more public (Federal,
State or local) transactions or contracts terminated for cause or default.

2) Where the contractor is unable to certify to any of the statements in this certification, such prospective
contractors shall attach an explanation to this certification form.

Firm Name: KJ'A’M‘EQ WI sen/

Project: PA’L(/KC,' A pc 77 202S

Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative:  WUES WCQ{U p,,.:“{,.(
T

Signature: ( ._ B %\\//
Date: _é//;'éf

END OF SECTION

P-37



Project: Parks Construction Unit Price Contract Bid# 77-2025
Bid Date: 71212025

|Contractor & Signature: EcoGro

# Item Unit Unit Price

1 Bituminous pavement for athletic courts: Base TN No Bid

2 Bituminous pavement for athletic courts: Base Over 500 TN No Bid

3 Bituminous pavement for athletic courts: Surface TN No Bid

4 Bituminous pavement for athletic courts: Surface Over 500 TN No Bid

5 Bituminous pavement for athletic courts reinforced with aramid fibers: Base TN No Bid

6 Bituminous pavement for athletic courts reinforced with aramid fibers: Base Over 500 TN No Bid

7 Bituminous pavement for athletic courts reinforced with aramid fibers: Surface TN No Bid

8 Bituminous pavement for athletic courts reinforced with aramid fibers: Surface Over 500 TN No Bid

9 Bituminous pavement crack filler LF No Bid

10 Bituminous pavement full depth crack repair LF No Bid

11 Thermoplastic pavement striping-white or yellow LF No Bid

12 ADA parking spot EA No Bid

13 Asphalt sealing SY No Bid

14 Parking lot striping LF No Bid

15 Dense grade aggregate placed base TN $ 45.00
16 No. 2 stone TN $ 45.00
17 No. 9 Stone TN $ 45.00
18 No. 57 stone TN $ 45.00
19 Concrete sidewalk 4 1/2" SY No Bid

20 Concrete sidewalk 6" SY No Bid

21 Detectable Warning Surface Tile Imbedded SF No Bid

22 Detectable Warning Surface Tile Overlay SF No Bid

23 Playground Curb LF No Bid

24 Formed and finished class A concrete Less Than 10yd CY No Bid

25 Formed and finished class A concrete More Than 10yd CY No Bid

26 Geogrid Type 3 light duty SY No Bid

27 Geogrid Type 3 Heavy duty SY No Bid

28 Topsoil CY $ 55.00
29 Excavation CY $ 35.00
30 Embankment CY $ 35.00
31 Finish grading CY $ 40.00
32 Laser grading CY No Bid

33 Standard staked silt fence-installed LF $ 8.00
34 Wire back silt fence-installed LF $ 20.00
35 Construction fence/Tree Protection LF $ 8.00
36 Seeding & protection; General (standard seed mix) SY $ 6.00
37 Seeding & protection: Athletic Field (special seed mix) SY $ 10.00
38 Sod: provide & installation SY $ 25.00
39 Site amenity install; trash/recylcing receptacle EA No Bid

40 Site amenity install; standard bench EA No Bid

41 Site amenity install: covered single bench EA No Bid

42 Site amenity install: covered double bench EA No Bid

43 Site amenity install: square picnic table EA No Bid

44 Site amenity install: covered square picnic table EA No Bid

45 Site amenity installation: 6 ft. rectangle picnic table EA No Bid

46 Site amenity installation: 8 ft. rectangle handicap picnic table EA No Bid

47 Site amenity installation: covered 6 ft. rectangle picnic table EA No Bid

48 Single block masonry retention wall SF No Bid

49 Supply and install ADA parking sign EA No Bid

50 4 in. Polyethylene Perforated Pipe with incidental geotextile fabric LF $ 30.00
51 6 in. Polyethylene Perforated Pipe with incidental geotextile fabric LF $ 40.00
52 Jackhammer with operator HR $ 180.00
53 Skid steer loader with operator HR $ 135.00
54 Backhoe (small) with operator HR $ 145.00
55 Roller/compactor with operator HR No Bid

56 Grader with operator HR No Bid

57 Dump truck (single axle) with driver HR $ 95.00
58 Dump truck (tri-axle) with driver HR $ 160.00
59 Removal of Concrete Pavement, Sidewalk, Entrance Pavement SY $ 35.00
60 Removal of Curb and Gutter LF $ 30.00




61 Removal of fence under 10ft tall LF $ 15.00
62 Removal of Fence over 10ft tall LF $ 24.00
63 Saw Cutting Walk, Curb, Pavement LF No Bid
64 Bituminous Pavement Milling and Texturing TN No Bid
Payment and Performance Bond Cost for Projects over $50,000 (See Special Conditions, Section 4) - Enter % of total project cost 4%
Minimum Total Project for Consideration (See Special Conditions, Section 2) - Enter dollar amount $ 3,000.00
Unspecified Incidental Materials at Cost Plus 15% (See Special Conditions, Section 5) - Check if Interested -
Unspecified Incidental Labor at Direct Wages Plus Certified Overhead Plus 15% (See Special Conditions, Section 5) - =

Check if Interested
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