
Bid 73-2024

Allied Cleaning Solutions Inc

Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 73-2024
Title: Janitorial Chemicals & Supplies
Type: Competitive Bid
Issue Date: 4/30/2024
Deadline: 5/14/2024 02:00 PM (ET)
Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS

SOLICITATION. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE LINE
ITEMS TAB ONLY. PRICING WITHIN SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE
ACCEPTED AND MAY MAKE YOUR BID NON-RESPONSIVE.
 
PLEASE UPLOAD YOUR DOCUMENTS AS ONE FILE.

Contact Information

Contact: Jessica Allinder
Address: Procurement

Government Center Building
200 East Main Street
Lexington, KY 40507

Email: jallinder@lexingtonky.gov
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Allied Cleaning Solutions Inc Information

Contact: Bill Gray
Address: 11600 Commonwealth Drive

LOUISVILLE, KY 40299
Phone: (502) 261-1600
Email: bgray@alliedcleans.com
Web Address: www.alliedcleans.com

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED! By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent
and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached
bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

William Gray bgray@alliedcleans.com
Signature Email

Submitted at 5/13/2024 03:48:25 PM (ET)

Response Attachments

LFUCG BID DOCS.pdf

Bid Documents including notary

Bid Attributes

1 Bid package

Have you completed and attached your bid package?  This is a contractual agreement and required for all bids.

 YES 

Bid Lines

1 Maxi-pads, Vend Pack #4-147

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $45.60 Total: $45.60

2 Biohazard Bags, 10 gal., HDPE, Red, Infectious Waste, PK 200

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $22.98 Total: $22.98

Supplier Notes: 250/cs

3 Biohazard Bags, 45 gal., HDPE, Red, Infectious Waste, PK 200

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $25.50 Total: $25.50

Supplier Notes: 100/cs

4 TOWEL SURGICAL 16X25 BLUE RECYCLE 10 LB - 50 per box

Quantity: 1 UOM: BOX Unit Price: $25.00 Total: $25.00

5 9 gallon Sharps container

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $7.50 Total: $7.50
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6 Pine scented cleaner/degreaser, gallon, ready-to-use

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $13.00 Total: $13.00

7 Pink lotion hand soap, “Kimberly-Clark sanifresh”, or equal, 4.gal/cs

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $7.50 Total: $7.50

8 "E-Z Paks" or equal All Purpose Cleaner Water Soluble 0.5 oz Packets, 180/cs

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

9 Can Liners - Large, 43 x 48 clear, roll, minimum 14 micron, 200/cs

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $26.00 Total: $26.00

1
0

Can Liners - Medium, 30 x 37, clear, 25 per roll, minimum 10 micron, 500/cs

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $25.00 Total: $25.00

1
1

Can Liners, 33X40 cs 250 SSS Magnum Blue Super Hexene Liners 33 gal. .75mil - 250 per box

Quantity: 1 UOM: BOX Unit Price: $19.00 Total: $19.00

Supplier Notes: clear not blue

1
2

51” Yellow Fiberglass Handle Square cut

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
3

Dust Mop Loop End Tie Less 5" X 36"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
4

Dust Mop Frame All Plastic 5"X36"( Must be all plastic)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
5

Mophead, 5" med tuf/blend "blue" washable mop heads 12/cs

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $8.50 Total: $8.50

1
6

Mophead frame only, 48 x 5

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $14.50 Total: $14.50

1
7

Swivel snap dustmop handle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $10.00 Total: $10.00

1
8

Angle broom, 13",no metal, wire or nylon rope, “Zepher #34068” or equal

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $9.00 Total: $9.00

1
9

7” Stiff Bristle Lobby Broom Head Only (All Plastic)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $7.00 Total: $7.00

2
0

51” Yellow Fiberglass Threaded Handle with plastic ends

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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2
1

Dust pan, 12” without handle, “Rubbermaid #2005” or equal

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.95 Total: $4.95

2
2

Dust Mop Covers, 5" x 36"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $7.50 Total: $7.50

2
3

60"Dust Mop Handle/ Clamp on

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $10.00 Total: $10.00

2
4

Scrubbing Sponge, Medium, Green/Yellow, 20/cs

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $65.00 Total: $65.00

Supplier Notes: 40/cs

2
5

10" Shower/Floor Scrub Brush, Rubbermaid or equivalent

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $11.00 Total: $11.00

2
6

6" Iron Handle Scrub Brush, Rubbermaid or equivalent

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.00 Total: $4.00

2
7

Rubbermaid Heavy-Duty Dust Pan (Must be all plastic)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $7.00 Total: $7.00

2
8

Rubbermaid 15" White Roundhead Toilet Bowl Brush (all Plastic)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.50 Total: $3.50

2
9

Blue Rubbermaid Floor Scrub Brush (Must be all plastic)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $12.50 Total: $12.50

3
0

Rubbermaid 6" Round Handle Scrub Brush (Must be all plastic)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $12.00 Total: $12.00

3
1

Scrubbing Sponge, Light, White/Yellow, 20/cs (needs to be individually wrapped)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $34.00 Total: $34.00

Supplier Notes: 40/cs

3
2

Toilet seat covers, half fold, 250 per pk., 20 sleeves of 250 covers ea, “Reliable” or equal (No staples in sleeves)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $49.00 Total: $49.00

3
3

Toilet Tissue, Single 2 ply, 550 sheet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $44.00 Total: $44.00

Supplier Notes: 96 roll 500 sht 2 ply - green seal cert

3
4

Multi fold paper towels, Brown, 9.5x9.125, 16 sleeves/ case

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $18.25 Total: $18.25

Supplier Notes: green seal cert
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3
5

Paper towels, Natural multi-fold, 20 sleeves/ case

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
6

Paper bags,brown, 6# weight,500/pack

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $19.00 Total: $19.00

3
7

Paper bags,brown, 25# weight, 500/pack

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $45.00 Total: $45.00

3
8

Sprayers & bottles, 32 oz. complete (bottles must be clear)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.50 Total: $1.50

3
9

Gloves, 5 mm Medical Grade Nitrile, S-XL, 100 bx

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $43.00 Total: $43.00

4
0

75 lb Indigent grocery bag - 500 per pack

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

4
1

25 lb Indigent grocery bag - 500 per pack

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

4
2

6 lb Indigent grocery bag - 500 per pack

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

4
3

Rubbermaid -2025505 disposable mop - 24 per box

Quantity: 1 UOM: BOX No Bid

4
4

Mask respirator type N95 Eco RG Eco RG 20/BX/CS 3M 8210

Quantity: 1 UOM: BOX No Bid

4
5

Mask respirator type N95 Eco RG Eco RG 20/BX/CS 3M 8110

Quantity: 1 UOM: BOX No Bid

4
6

Spray bottles - each

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.75 Total: $0.75

4
7

Trigger sprayers - each

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.75 Total: $0.75

4
8

28" x 39" Water soluble bags - roll of 25

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $55.00 Total: $55.00

Supplier Notes: 4 rolls of 25/roll

Response Total: $713.78
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