
Bid 10-2024

NASHVILLE EMS SUPPLY

NASHVILLE MEDICAL & EMS PRODUCTS,
INC

Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 10-2024
Title: EMS Supplies
Type: Competitive Bid
Issue Date: 1/16/2024
Deadline: 1/30/2024 02:00 PM (ET)
Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS

SOLICITATION. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE LINE
ITEMS TAB ONLY. PRICING WITHIN SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE
ACCEPTED AND MAY MAKE YOUR BID NON-RESPONSIVE.
 
Once you have completed and uploaded your bid package, you will
need to click "yes" on the attributes tab.

Contact Information

Contact: Jessica Allinder
Address: Procurement

Government Center Building
200 East Main Street
Room 338
Lexington, KY 40507

Email: jallinder@lexingtonky.gov
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NASHVILLE EMS SUPPLY Information

Contact: NARI SADARANGANI
Address: PO BOX 64

SPRINGFIELD, TN 37172-0064
Phone: (615) 384-0573 x00
Fax: (615) 384-0574
Toll Free: (866) 385-0573 x00
Email: NASHVILLEEMS@GMAIL.COM
Web Address: WWW.NASHVILLEEMSSHOP.COM

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED! By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent
and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached
bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

NARI SADARANGANI NASHVILLEEMS@GMAIL.COM
Signature Email

Submitted at 1/29/2024 12:25:55 PM (ET)

Response Attachments

BID #10-2024.pdf

BID DOCUIMENTS FOLDER

Bid Attributes

1 Bid package

Have you completed and attached your bid package?  This is a contractual agreement and required for all bids.

 YES 

Bid Lines

1 Elastic wrap

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2 Isopropyl Alcohol bottle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3 Alcohol prep pad

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.0059 Total: $0.01

Supplier Notes: KENTRON #650-16, PACKED 200/BOX, LATEX FREE, STERILE

4 Ammonia inhalant

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

5 AED Plus/Pro adult pads

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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6 AED Plus/Pro pediatric pads

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

7 Flexible fabric bandage 1" x 3"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.0129 Total: $0.01

Supplier Notes: KENTRON #880113, FLEXIBLE FABRIC LATEX FREE BANDAGES PACKING 100/BOX AND 24
BOXES/CASE

8 Flexible fabric bandage 2" x 4.5"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.069 Total: $0.07

Supplier Notes: KENTRON #8801245, FLEXIBLE FABRIC LATEX FREE 2" X 4 1/2" BANDAGES, PACKED 50/BOX
AND 24 BOXES/CASE.

9 Flexible fabric bandage 3/4" x 3"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.01 Total: $0.01

Supplier Notes: KENTRON FABRIC ADHESIVE LATEX FREE BANDAGES, 100/BOX, 24 BOXES/CASE

1
0

Battery AA

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
1

Battery AAA

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
2

Battery C

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
3

Battery 9V

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
4

Blunt Fill w/filter needle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
5

Bougie Flex Tip

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6

Bougie Introducer, Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2.89 Total: $2.89

Supplier Notes: KENTRON BOUGIE INTRODUCER, LATEX FREE, MARKINGS UPTO 70CMS, SIZE 15 FRENCH,
10/BOX PACKING, #799915

1
7

Bougie Introducer, Ped.

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2.89 Total: $2.89

Supplier Notes: KENTRON BOUGIE INTRODUCER, LATEX FREE, SIZE 10 FRENCH, MARKINGS UPTO 70CMS,
10/BOX PACKING PRODUCT #799910
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1
8

Broselow tape

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $16.29 Total: $16.29

Supplier Notes: PEDIA TAPE LATEX FREE EXACTLY SAME AS BROSELOW TAPE.

1
9

Non-vented Buretrol Solution Set, 105in L, With 150mL Interlink Burette, 2 Interlink Injection Sites

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
0

Burn sheet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.39 Total: $1.39

Supplier Notes: KENTRON BURN SHEET, NON WOVEN AND CAN BE USED WET OR DRY DRESSING, LATEX
FREE, STERILE, PRODUCT #888111, 24/CASE

2
1

BAAM air flow monitor

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.95 Total: $5.95

Supplier Notes: BAAM AIR FLOW MONITOR, LATEX FREE, 10/CASE.

2
2

BP cuff adult (Manual)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.89 Total: $4.89

Supplier Notes: KENTRON ADULT MANOMETER WITH NYLON CUFF, LATEX FREE, PRODUCT #777701

2
3

BP cuff large adult (Manual)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.09 Total: $5.09

Supplier Notes: KENTRON LARGE ADULT MANOMETER WITH NYLON CUFF, LATEEX FREE. PRODUCT
#777702

2
4

BULB Syringe

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.39 Total: $0.39

Supplier Notes: KENTRON 2OZ BULB SYRINGE, LATEX FREE, PACKING 50/CASE, PRODUCT #350200

2
5

BVM Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $7.19 Total: $7.19

Supplier Notes: KENTRON ADULT BVM WITH INJECTION PORT, PEEP PORT, PRESSURE RELEASE VALVE,
MANOMETER ATTACHMENT, PRODUCT #779500

2
6

BVM Peds

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $7.69 Total: $7.69

Supplier Notes: KENTRON PEDIATRIC BVM WITH PRESSURE RELEASE VALVE, PEEP MONITERING PORT,
INJECTION PORT, MANOMETER ATTACHMENT, LATEX FREE. PRODUCT #779501

2
7

C-collar Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.19 Total: $4.19

Supplier Notes: ADJUSTABLE ADULT CERVICAL COLLAR, AMBU LATEX FREE, PACKING 50/CASE, PRODUCT
#000281000
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2
8

C-collar Peds

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.19 Total: $4.19

Supplier Notes: ADJUSTABLE PEDIATRIC COLLAR, AMBU LATEX FREE, PACKING 30/CASE, PRODUCT
#000281006

2
9

Nasal Cannula Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.239 Total: $0.24

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CURVED FLARE TIP NASAL CANNULA, LATEX FREE, PACKING 50/CASE, NON KINK
TUBE, PRODUCT #999108

3
0

Nasal Cannula Peds

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.239 Total: $0.24

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CURVED PEDIATRIC NASAL CANNULA, LATEX FREE, NON KINK TUBE, 50/CASE,
PRODUCT #999312

3
1

Cloth tape 1"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.569 Total: $0.57

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CLOTH TAPE SILK LIKE MATERIAL, 1" X 10 YARDS, PACKING 12/BOX, LATEX FREE.
12 BOXES/CASE.

3
2

Cloth tape 2"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.13 Total: $1.13

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CLOTH TAPE SILK LIKE MATERIAL LATEX FREE.2" X 10 YARDS, 6/BOX AND 12
BOXES/CASE

3
3

Self Adherent Wrap 2"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.69 Total: $0.69

Supplier Notes: 2" COHESIVE BANDAGE, LATEX FREE, 2" X 5 YARDS, LATEX FREE, PACKING 36/CASE.
KENTRON PRODUCT #690922, COMES IN MANY COLORS.

3
4

Instant Cold pack

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.69 Total: $0.69

Supplier Notes: KENTRON INSTANT COLD PACK, SIZE 6" X 9", PACKING 24/CASE.LATEX FREE

3
5

Colormetric CO2 detector Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
6

Colormetric CO2 detector Peds

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
7

CPAP large

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
8

CPAP medium

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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3
9

Decompression needle 10ga

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

4
0

Defib pads X series Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

4
1

Defib pads X series Peds

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

4
2

Disinfectant Microdot Bleach Wipes

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

4
3

Disinfectant Microdot Wipes

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

4
4

Disinfectant Spray (Steri-fab)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

4
5

E.T. Foam Tube Holder

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

4
6

Emergency Blanket (Mylar Heat Absorbing)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.39 Total: $0.39

Supplier Notes: KENTRON SILVER MYLAR BLANKET, LATEX FREE PRODUCT #886656

4
7

Emergency Blanket (Water Resist.)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.29 Total: $1.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON WATER PROOF EMERGENCY BLANKET, BRIGHT YELLOW, LATEX FREE, PACKING
50/CASE, PRODUCT #886657

4
8

Emesis basin

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

4
9

Emesis/belonging bag (12-pk)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: $0.39 Total: $0.39

Supplier Notes: KENTRON EMESIS BAG, WHITE PACKING 12/BAG, LATEX FREE, PRODUCT #404087

5
0

Endotrol Kit 6.0

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

5
1

Endotrol Kit 7.0

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

5
2

Endotrol Kit 8.0

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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5
3

Epistaxis Clamp

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

5
4

EC unit O2 bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

5
5

ECG electrodes (50-pk)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: $7.10 Total: $7.10

Supplier Notes: KENTRON WET GEL ELECTRODES LATEX FREE, 50/PACK PRODUCT BLUE SONIC KenTek
#222, 50/PACK AND 40 PACKS/CASE.

5
6

ET 2.5 w/stylets

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.02 Total: $1.02

Supplier Notes: KENTRON ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE, NON CUFFED, SIZE 2MM FR WITH STYLET, PACKING
10/BOX, LATEX FREE. PRODUCT #759925

5
7

ET 3.0 w/o stylets

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.62 Total: $0.62

Supplier Notes: KENTRON ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE CUFFED SIZE 3.0MM WITHOUT STYLET, 10/BOX, LATEX
FREE, PRODUCT #749930

5
8

ET 3.0 w/stylets

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.12 Total: $1.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE, SIZE 3.0MM CUFFED WITH STYLET, 10/BOX LATEX
FREE PRODUCT #769930

5
9

ET 3.5 w/o stylets

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.62 Total: $0.62

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITHOUT STYLET,SIZE 3.5MM LATEX FREE,
10/BOX, KENTRON PRODUCT #749935

6
0

ET 3.5 w/stylets

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.12 Total: $1.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITH STYLET, SIZE 3.5MM, LATEX FREE, 10/BOX,
KENTRON PRODUCT #769935

6
1

ET 4.0 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.62 Total: $0.62

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITHOUT STYLET SIZE 4.0MM, LATEX FREE,
10/BOX, PRODUCT #749940

6
2

ET 4.0 w/stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.12 Total: $1.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITH STYLET, 4.0MM SIZE, LATEX FREE, 10/BOX,
PRODUCT #769940
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6
3

ET 4.5 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.62 Total: $0.62

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE SIZE 4.5MM WITHOUT STYLET, LATEX FREE,
10/BOX, PRODUCT #749945

6
4

ET 4.5 w/stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.12 Total: $1.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITH STYLET SIZE 4.5MM, LATEX FREE,
PRODUCT #769945, 10/BOX

6
5

ET 5.0 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.62 Total: $0.62

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITHOUT STYLET SIZE 5.0MM, LATEX FREE,
10/BOX, PRODUCT #749950

6
6

ET 5.0 w/stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.12 Total: $1.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITH STYLET, SIZE 5.0MM, LATEX FREE, 10/BOX,
PRODUCT #769950

6
7

ET 5.5 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.62 Total: $0.62

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITHOUT STYLET, SIZE 5.5MM, LATEX FREE,
10/BOX, PRODUCT #749955

6
8

ET 5.5 w/stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.12 Total: $1.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITH STYLET, SIZE 5.5MM, LATEX FREE, 10/BOX,
PRODUCT #769955

6
9

ET 6.0 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.62 Total: $0.62

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITHOUT STYLET, SIZE 6.0MM, LATEX FREE,
10/BOX, PRODUCT #749960

7
0

ET 6.0 w/stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.12 Total: $1.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITH STYLET, SIZE 6.0MM, LATEX FREE,
PRODUCT #769960

7
1

ET 6.5 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.62 Total: $0.62

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITHOUT STYLET, SIZE 6.5MM, LATEX FREE,
PRODUCT #749965
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7
2

ET 6.5 w/stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.12 Total: $1.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITH STYLET, SIZER 6.5MM, LATEX FREE,
PRODUCT #769965

7
3

ET 7.0 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.62 Total: $0.62

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITHOUT STYLET, SIZE 7.0MM, LATEX FREE,
10/BOX, PRODUCT #749970

7
4

ET 7.0 w/stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.12 Total: $1.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITH STYLET, SIZE 7.0MM, LATEX FREE, 10/BOX,
PRODUCT #769970

7
5

ET 7.5 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.62 Total: $0.62

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITHOUT STYLET, SIZE 7.5MM, LATEX FREE,
10/BOX, PRODUCT #749975

7
6

ET 7.5 w/stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.12 Total: $1.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITH STYLET, SIZE 7.5MM, LATEX FREE, 10/BOX,
PRODUCT #769975

7
7

ET 8.0 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.62 Total: $0.62

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOITRACHEAL TUBE WITHOUT STYLET, SIZE 8.0MM, LATEX FREE,
10/BOX, PRODUCT #749980

7
8

ET 8.0 w/stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.12 Total: $1.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITH STYLET, SIZE 8.0MM, LATEX FREE, 10/BOX.
PRODUCT #769980

7
9

ET 9.0 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.62 Total: $0.62

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITHOUT STYLET, SIZE 9.0MM, LATEX FREE,
10/BOX, PRODUCT #749990

8
0

ET 9.0 w/stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.12 Total: $1.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CUFFED ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE WITH STYLET, SIZE 9.0MM, LATEX FREE,
PRODUCT #769990

8
1

ETCO2 Nasal Cannula (Peds.)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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8
2

ETC02 Filter line

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

8
3

ETC02 Nasal Cannula (Adult)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

8
4

EZIO 15mm (pink)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

8
5

EZIO 25mm (blue)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

8
6

EZIO 45mm (yellow)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

8
7

Normal Saline 0.9% Flushes 10ml box of 100

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

8
8

French Suction 06

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.12 Total: $0.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON SUCTION CATHETER WITH MARKINGS AND CHIMNEY VALVE LATEX FREE SIZE 6FR.
PRODUCT #393506

8
9

French Suction 08

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.12 Total: $0.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON SUCTION CATHER WITH MARKINGS AND CHIMNEY VALVE, LATEX FREE, SIOZE 8FR.
PRODUICT #393508

9
0

French Suction 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.12 Total: $0.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON SUCTION CATHETER WITH MARKINGS AND CHIMNEY VALVE, LATEX FREE,10FR,
PRODUCT #393510

9
1

French Suction 12

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.12 Total: $0.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON SUCTION CATHETER WITH MARKINGS AND CXHIMNEY VALVE, LATEX FREE, 12FR,
PRODUCT #393512

9
2

French Suction 14

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.12 Total: $0.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON SUCTION CATHETER WITH MARKINGS AND CHIMNEY VALVE, LATEX FREE 14FR.
PRODUCT #393514

9
3

French Suction 16

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.12 Total: $0.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON SUCTION CATHETER WITH MARKINGS AND CHIMNEY VALVE, LATEX FREE 16FR,
PRODUCT #393516
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9
4

French Suction 18

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.12 Total: $0.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON SUCTION CATHETER WITH MARKINGS AND CHIMNEY VALVE, LATEX FREE, 18FR,
PRODUCT #393518

9
5

Gauze 3x4 pad (non-adherent)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

9
6

Gauze 4x4 box of 20

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: No response Total: No response

Alternate 1

KENTRON NON STERILE SPONGES 4" X 4", 8PLY 200/PACK, LATEX FREE, PRODUCT #448111

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: $2.41 Total: $2.41

Manufacturer: KENTRON

Manufacturer #: 448111

9
7

Gauze 4x4 Sponges (Sterile)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.49 Total: $1.49

Supplier Notes: KENTRON 4" X 4" 8PLY STERILE SPONGES, 2/PK AND 25 PACKS/BOX, LATEX FREE, PRODUCT
#KS4480

9
8

Gauze 5x9 box of 20

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: $1.80 Total: $1.80

Supplier Notes: KENTRON ABDOMINAL PADS 5" X 9", 20/BOX, LATEX FREE, STERILE PRODUCT #777590

9
9

Gauze 8x10 box of 20

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: $3.12 Total: $3.12

Alternate 1

KENTRON STERILE ABDOMINAL PADS, SIZE 8" X 10", PACKING 24/BOX AND NOT 20 AS REQUESTED

Quantity: 1 UOM: 24/BOX Price: $3.12 Total: $3.12

Manufacturer: KENTRON

Manufacturer #: 777810

1
0
0

Nitrile Gloves Extra Large box of 100

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: $0.0429 Total: $0.04

Alternate 1

KENTRON NITRILE GLOVES EXTRA LARGE 90/BOX, BLACK IN COLOR

Quantity: 1 UOM: 90/BOX Price: $4.29 Total: $4.29

Manufacturer: KENTRON

Manufacturer #: N3024BK
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1
0
1

Nitrile Gloves Large box of 100

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: No response Total: No response

Alternate 1

KENTRON NITRILE GLOVES LARGE, POWDER FREE, LATEX FREE, 100/BOX, BLACK

Quantity: 1 UOM: 100/BOX Price: $4.29 Total: $4.29

Manufacturer: KENTRON

Manufacturer #: N3023BK

1
0
2

Nitrile Gloves Medium box of 100

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: No response Total: No response

Alternate 1

KENTRON NITRILE GLOVES MEDIUM POWDER FREE, LATEX FREE, 100/BOX, BLACK

Quantity: 1 UOM: 100/BOX Price: $4.29 Total: $4.29

Manufacturer: KENTRON

Manufacturer #: N3022BK

1
0
3

Nitrile Gloves Small box of 100

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: No response Total: No response

Alternate 1

KENTRON NITRILE GLOVES SMALL, POWDER FREE, LATEX FREE, BLACK 100/BOX

Quantity: 1 UOM: 100/BOX Price: $4.29 Total: $4.29

Manufacturer: KENTRON

Manufacturer #: N3021BK

1
0
4

Precision Glucometer

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
0
5

Precision Glucometer Battery

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
0
6

Precision Glucometer Control Solution

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
0
7

Precision Glucometer Test Strips

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
0
8

Hand sanitizer - 8 oz containers

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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1
0
9

Head Immobilizer Adult Foam roll

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.45 Total: $3.45

Supplier Notes: KENTRON FOAM HEAD IMMOBILIZER PRODUCT #846001

1
1
0

Head Immobilizer Child Foam roll

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
1
1

Hot pack

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
1
2

Hypodermic Needle 25 ga

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
1
3

HyFin chest seal

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
1
4

Igel #1

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $12.49 Total: $12.49

Supplier Notes: IGEL SIZE 1, PRODUCT #8201000, PACKING 10/BOX

1
1
5

Igel #1.5

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $12.49 Total: $12.49

Supplier Notes: IGEL SIZE 1.5 PRODUCT #8215000, PACKING 10/BOX

1
1
6

Igel #2

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $12.49 Total: $12.49

Supplier Notes: IGEL SIZE 2, PRODUCT #8202000, PACKING 10/BOX

1
1
7

Igel #3

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $12.49 Total: $12.49

Supplier Notes: IGEL SIZE 3, PRODUCT #8203000, PACKING 25/BOX

1
1
8

Igel #4

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $12.49 Total: $12.49

Supplier Notes: IGEL SIZE 4, PRODUCT #8204000, PACKING 25/BOX

1
1
9

Igel #5

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $12.49 Total: $12.49

Supplier Notes: IGEL SIZE 5, PRODUCT #8205000, PACKING 25/BOX.

1
2
0

Igel Foam Tube Holder

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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1
2
1

Conterra Intubation roll

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $23.69 Total: $23.69

Supplier Notes: BIDDING ON KENTRON INTUBATION ROLL KIT

1
2
2

Irrigation 1L Saline Bottle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
2
3

Introcan IV Cath box of 50 18ga

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
2
4

Introcan IV Cath box of 50 20ga

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
2
5

Introcan IV Cath box of 50 14ga

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
2
6

Introcan IV Cath box of 50 16ga

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
2
7

Introcan IV Cath box of 50 22ga

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
2
8

Introcan IV Cath box of 50 24ga

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
2
9

IV Set with Needle Free Y Site, 1 Luer Connector, 10 Drop, 83in L

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.95 Total: $0.95

Supplier Notes: KENTRON IV SET WITH NEEDLE FREE CONNECTOR 10 DROPS, PACKING 50/CASE. LATEX
FREE, PRODUCT #429010

1
3
0

IV Set with Needle Free Y Site, 1 Luer Connector, 60 Drop, 83in L

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.99 Total: $0.99

Supplier Notes: KENTRON IV SET WITH NEEDLE FREE CONNECTOR 60 DROPS, PACKING 50/CASE, LATEX
FREE.PRODUCT #429060

1
3
1

IV Extension Set (7")

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.77 Total: $0.77

Supplier Notes: KENTRON IV EXTENSION SET WITH NEEDLE FREE VALVE, 100/CASE, LATEX FREE, PRODUCT
#439008

1
3
2

IV Start Kit

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2.39 Total: $2.39

Supplier Notes: KENTRON IV START KIT, LATEX FREE, CONTENTS: ALCOHOL PADS, EXTENSION SET, IV
DRESSING, TAPE, TOURNIQUET. GAUZE SPONGES, SALINE FLUSH SYRINGE.
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1
3
3

Kling 2" (Non-sterile)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.09 Total: $0.09

Supplier Notes: KENTRON NON STERILE GAUZE ROLL 2", PACKING 12/BOX AND 8 BOXES/CASE, LATEX FREE,
PRODUCT #440002

1
3
4

Kling 4" (Non-sterile)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.11 Total: $0.11

Supplier Notes: KENTRON CONFORMING GAUZE, 4", NON STERILE, 12/BOX AND 96/CASE, LATEX FREE.
PRODUCT #440004

1
3
5

Kling 4" Bulk (Sterile)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.155 Total: $0.16

Supplier Notes: KENTRON STERILE CONFORMING GAUZE, 4", LATEX FREE, 12/BOX AND 8 BOXES/CASE,
PRODUCT #441004

1
3
6

Kling 6" (Non-sterile)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.17 Total: $0.17

Supplier Notes: KENTRON 6" CONFORMING GAUZE, NON STERILE, LATEX FREE, 6/BOX AND 8 BOXES/CASE.

1
3
7

Lactated Ringers 1L bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
3
8

Lactated Ringers 500cc bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
3
9

Lancets (box of 100)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
4
0

Laryngoscope Handle (disp.)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $6.89 Total: $6.89

Supplier Notes: KENTRON LARYNGOSCOPE HANDLE MEDIUM SIZE. PRODUCT # LH15000C

1
4
1

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mac 0

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.29 Total: $3.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON LED LARYNGOSCOPE BLADES SIZE MAC 0, LATEX FREE PRODUCT #MC35000LE

1
4
2

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mac 1

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.29 Total: $3.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON LED LARYNGOSCOPE BLADE SIZE MAC 1, LATEX FREE, PRODUCT #MC35001LE

1
4
3

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mac 2

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.29 Total: $3.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON LED LARYNGOSCOPE BLADE SIZE MAC 2, LATEX FREE, PRODUCT #MC35002LE
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1
4
4

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mac 3

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.29 Total: $3.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON LARYNGOSCOPE BLADE SIZE MAC 3, LATEX FREE, PRODUCT #MC35003LE

1
4
5

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mac 4

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.29 Total: $3.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON LED LARYNGOSCOPE BLADE SIZE MAC 4, LATEX FREE, PRODUCT #MC35004LE

1
4
6

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mac 5

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.29 Total: $3.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON LED LARYNGOSCOPE BLADE SIZE MAC 5, LATEX FREE, PRODUCT #MC35005LE

1
4
7

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mil 0

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.29 Total: $3.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON LED LARYNGOSCOPE BLADE SIZE MIL 0, LATEX FREE, PRODUCT #ML36000LE

1
4
8

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mil 1

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.29 Total: $3.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON LED LARYNGOSCOPE BLADE SIZE MILLER 1, LATEX FREE, PRODUCT #ML36001LE

1
4
9

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mil 2

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.29 Total: $3.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON LED LARYNGOSCOPPE BLADE SIZE MILLER 2, LATEX FREE. PRODUCT
#ML36002LE

1
5
0

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mil 3

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.29 Total: $3.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON LED LARYNGOSCOPE BLADE SIZE MILLER 3, LATEX FREE, PRODUCT #ML36003LE

1
5
1

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mil 4

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.29 Total: $3.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON LED LARYNGOSCOPE BLADE SIZE MILLER 4, LATEX FREE, PRODUCT #ML36004LE

1
5
2

Laryngoscope bulb large

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.95 Total: $0.95

Supplier Notes: KENTRON LARYNGOSCOPE BULB SIZE LARGE PRODUCT #LB1100

1
5
3

Laryngoscope bulb small

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.95 Total: $0.95

Supplier Notes: KENTRON LARYNGOSCOPE BULB SIZE SMALL PRODUCT #LB1000

1
5
4

Ligature

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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1
5
5

Lube packet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
5
6

McGrath Battery

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
5
7

McGrath Blade X3 (Diff. Airway)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
5
8

McGrath Blade 1

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
5
9

McGrath Blade 2

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6
0

McGrath Blade 3

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6
1

McGrath Blade 4

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6
2

Omni Pro X medic bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6
3

Versa Pro X medic bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6
4

Medication Infusion Labels

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6
5

Meds Adenosine 6mg/2ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6
6

Meds Albuterol 2.5mg/2ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6
7

Meds Amiodarone 150mg/3ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6
8

Meds Aspirin 81mg/ea

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6
9

Meds Atropine, 0.1mg/mL, 10mL Luer Jet Prefilled Syringe

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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1
7
0

Meds Calcium Chloride, 100mg/mL, 10mL Luer Jet Prefilled Syringe

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
7
1

Meds Dexamethasone 10mg/1ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
7
2

Meds Diltiazem, 100mg, Add-Vantage Vial

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
7
3

Meds Diltiazem 100cc bag for mix

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
7
4

Meds Diphenhydramine 50mg/1ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
7
5

Meds Dopamine Hydrochloride and 5% Dextrose, 400mg/250mL, 250mL Bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
7
6

Meds Dextrose 10%, 250mL Bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
7
7

Meds Epi 1:1 1mg/1ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
7
8

Meds Epi 1:10 1mg/10ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
7
9

Meds Ipratropium Bromide .5mg/2ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
8
0

Meds Lidocaine HCl, 4mg/mL, in 5% Dextrose, 500mL Bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
8
1

Meds Lidocaine 100mg/10ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
8
2

Meds Magnesium Sulfate 1G/2ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
8
3

Meds Narcan IV 2mg/1ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
8
4

Meds Narcan Nasal 2 sprayer pack 4mg

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Vendor: NASHVILLE EMS SUPPLY Bid 10-2024Page 18 of 29 pages



1
8
5

Meds Nitroglycerin Sublingual .4mg/tablet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
8
6

Meds Nitro-Paste Packet 1GM/48pack

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
8
7

Meds Oral Glucose (Individual) 15g

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
8
8

Meds Sodium bicarb 1meq/50ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
8
9

Meds Toradol 30mg/1ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
9
0

Meds TXA 1G/10ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
9
1

Meds Zofran IV 4mg/2ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
9
2

Meds Zofran Oral Disintegrating Tablet (0.4mg)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
9
3

Patient Transporter (1800 lbs)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
9
4

Medication Atomizer Device (MAD)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.89 Total: $4.89

Supplier Notes: TELEFLEX MAD300 ATOMIZER DEVICE, PACKING 25/BOX

1
9
5

Nail Polish Remover

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
9
6

Nebulizer Mask Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.67 Total: $0.67

Supplier Notes: KENTRON NEBULIZER MASK COMPLETE KIT, LATEX FREE, PRODUCT #333760

1
9
7

Nebulizer Mask Peds

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.67 Total: $0.67

Supplier Notes: KENTRON NEBULIZER MASK KIT FOR PEDIATRICS, LATEX FREE, PRODUCT #333761

1
9
8

Needle Cricothyrotomy Kit

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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1
9
9

Non-rebreather Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.63 Total: $0.63

Supplier Notes: KENTRON TOTAL NON REBREATHER MASK ADULT PRODUCT #999108, LATEX FREE

2
0
0

Non-rebreather Peds

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.63 Total: $0.63

Supplier Notes: KENTRON TOTAL NON REBRETHER MASK FOR PEDIATRICS.LATEX FREE PRODUCT #999109

2
0
1

Normal Saline 100cc bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
0
2

Normal Saline 050cc bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
0
3

Normal Saline 250cc bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
0
4

Normal Saline 500cc bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
0
5

NPA 12

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.29 Total: $1.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON PVC NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY WITH FLANGE, LATEX FREE SIZE 12FR,
PRODUCT #804412

2
0
6

NPA 14

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.29 Total: $1.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON PVC NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY WITH FLANGE, SIZE 14FR,LATEX FREE,
PRODUCT #804414

2
0
7

NPA 16

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.29 Total: $1.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON PVC NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY WITH FLANGE, SIZE 16FR, LATEX FREE,
PRODUCT #804416

2
0
8

NPA 18

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.29 Total: $1.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON PVC NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY WITH FLANGE, SIZE 18FR, LATEX FREE,
PRODUCT #804418

2
0
9

NPA 20

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.29 Total: $1.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON PVC NASOPPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY WITH FLANGE SIZE 20, LATEX FREE PRODUCT
#804420
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2
1
0

NPA 22

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.29 Total: $1.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON PVC NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY WITH FLANGE SIZE 22FR, LATEX FREE,
PRODUCT #804422

2
1
1

NPA 24

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.29 Total: $1.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON PVC NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY WITH FLANGE, SIZE 24FR, LATEX FREE.
PRODUCT #804424

2
1
2

NPA 26

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.29 Total: $1.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON PVC NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY WITH FLANGE, SIZE 26FR, LATEX FREE,
PRODUCT #804426

2
1
3

NPA 28

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.29 Total: $1.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY WITH FLANGE SIZE 28FR, LATEX FREE, PRODUCT
#804428

2
1
4

NPA 30

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.29 Total: $1.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON PVC NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY WITH FLANGE, SIZE 30FR. LATEX FREE,
PRODUCT #804430

2
1
5

NPA 32

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.29 Total: $1.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON PVC NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY WITH FLANGE, SIZE 32FR, LATEX FREE,
PRODUCT #804432

2
1
6

NPA 34

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.29 Total: $1.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON PVC NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY WITH FLANGE, SIZE 34FR, LATEX FREE,
PRODUCT #804434

2
1
7

OB kit

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.49 Total: $4.49

Supplier Notes: KENTRON EMERGENCY OB KIT LATEX FREE, PRODUCT #999700

2
1
8

OPA 040mm

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.12 Total: $0.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON COLOR CODED BERMAN ORAL AIRWAY SIZE 40MM PRODUCT #779940CC

2
1
9

OPA 050mm

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.12 Total: $0.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON COLOR CODED BERMAN ORAL AIRWAY SIZE 50MM, PRODUCT #779950CC
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2
2
0

OPA 060mm

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.12 Total: $0.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON COLOR CODED BERMAN AIRWAY, SIZE 60MM, PRODUCT #779960

2
2
1

OPA 070mm

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.12 Total: $0.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON COLOR CODED BERMAN AIRWAY SIZE 70MM, PRODUCT #779970CC

2
2
2

OPA 080mm

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.12 Total: $0.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON COLOR CODED BERMAN AIRWAY SIZE 80MM, PRODUCT #779980CC

2
2
3

OPA 090mm

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.12 Total: $0.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON COLOR CODED BERMAN AIRWAY SIZE 90MM, PRODUCT #779990CC

2
2
4

OPA 100mm

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.12 Total: $0.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON COLOR CODED BERMAN AIRWAY SIZE 100MM, PRODUCT #779100CC

2
2
5

OPA 110mm

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.12 Total: $0.12

Supplier Notes: KENTRON COLOR CODED BERMAN AIRWAY SIZE 110MM, PRODUCT #779110

2
2
6

O2 regulator

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $22.79 Total: $22.79

Supplier Notes: KENTRON OXYGEN REGULATOR WITH DISS CONNECTIONS AND BARB OUTLET 25
LITERS/MINUTE

2
2
7

Pen light

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.53 Total: $0.53

Supplier Notes: KENTRON DISP[OSABLE PEN LIGHT WITH PUPIL GAUGE , 6/PACK

2
2
8

Hydrogen Peroxide bottle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
2
9

PEEP Valve (Adult)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.69 Total: $3.69

Supplier Notes: KENTRON PEEP VALVES FROM 0-20CMS OF WATER ADJUSTABLE DISPOSABLE, PACKING
20/BOX

2
3
0

PEEP Valve (Peds.)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.69 Total: $3.69

Supplier Notes: KENTRON PEEP VALVE 0-20CMS OF WATER ADJUSTABLE, DISPOSABLE, LATEX FREE,
PACKING 20/BOX
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2
3
1

Disposable Razor

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.15 Total: $0.15

Supplier Notes: KENTRON DISPOSABLE RAZORS FINGER CONTROLLED, PACKING 50/BOX

2
3
2

Red IV start kit bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
3
3

Rigid Suction Catheters (Ducanto)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
3
4

Safety Needle 18ga

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
3
5

Safety Needle 22ga

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
3
6

Sam IO Driver

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
3
7

Sam IO 15 mm Needle (Pink)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
3
8

Sam IO 25 mm Needle (Blue)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
3
9

Sam IO 45 mm Needle (Yellow)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
4
0

Scoop Stretcher Straps

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.69 Total: $1.69

Supplier Notes: DISPOSABLE POLYPROPYLENE STRAPS WITH PLASTIC BUCKLE.

2
4
1

6.9 Qt. Sharps Container (Large)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $6.89 Total: $6.89

Supplier Notes: KENTRON SHARP CONTAINER 412207R, 7 LITER CONTAINER WITH FUNNEL ENTRY, RED.

2
4
2

1 Qt. Sharps Container (Med Bag)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.69 Total: $1.69

Supplier Notes: KENTRON 1 QUART SHARP CONTAINER RED, PACKING 60/CASE, PRODUCT #412276R

2
4
3

Spider straps

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $15.69 Total: $15.69

Supplier Notes: KENTRON SPIDER STRAPS MULTI COLOR.
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2
4
4

Spit Sock W/Hood

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.19 Total: $3.19

Supplier Notes: SPIT SOCK WITH HOOD, 50/PACK

2
4
5

Sterile Water 250 mL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
4
6

Stethoscope

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.29 Total: $3.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON DUAL HEAD STETHOSCOPE, LATEX FREE.

2
4
7

Stopcock 3 way

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
4
8

Stylets Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.89 Total: $0.89

Supplier Notes: KENTRON DISPOSABLE STYLET 14 FRENCH, 20/BOX PRODUCT #729914

2
4
9

Stylets Ped

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.89 Total: $0.89

Supplier Notes: KENTRON DISPOSABLE STYLET 10FR, 20/BOX, PRODUCT #729910

2
5
0

Suction Canister 800ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2.29 Total: $2.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON 800ML SUCTION CANISTER

2
5
1

Suction Canister Truck mounted

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
5
2

Suction Lid Buggy Portable

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
5
3

Suction Lid Truck mounted

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
5
4

Suction Manual Pump w/cannister 500ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $27.69 Total: $27.69

Supplier Notes: KENTRON MANUAL SUCTION PUMP PRODUCT #179900

2
5
5

Surgical masks (Box of 50)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: $29.40 Total: $29.40

Supplier Notes: KENTRON SURGICAL MASK ASTM LEVEL II WITH EAR LOOPS, LATEX FREE, BLUE COLOR,
50/BOX.
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2
5
6

Syringe 01cc w/ Luer Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
5
7

Syringe 01cc with needle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
5
8

Syringe 03cc w/ Luer Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
5
9

Syringe 03cc with needle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
6
0

Syringe 10cc w/Luer Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
6
1

Syringe 50cc w/Luer Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
6
2

Aluminum splint

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.19 Total: $3.19

Supplier Notes: KENTRON MALLEABLE ALUMINUM WITH FOAM COATED SPLINT, REUSABLE 4" X 36",
PRODUCT #887722

2
6
3

SSCOR suction canister (Engine)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
6
4

Transparent Film Dressing 2"x2.75"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.14 Total: $0.14

Supplier Notes: KENTRON TRANSPARENT DRESSING WITH WINDOW, LATEX FREE 100/BOX, SIZE 2" X 2.75"

2
6
5

Welch-Allyn Thermometer

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $247.69 Total: $247.69

Supplier Notes: WELCH ALLYN SURE TEMP PLUS THERMOMETER

2
6
6

Welch-Allyn Thermometer probe cover

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.048 Total: $0.05

Supplier Notes: WELCH ALLYN SURE TEMP PROBE COVERS 05031-750

2
6
7

Transpore tape 1" roll

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.53 Total: $0.53

Supplier Notes: KENTRON TRANSPARENT TAPE 1" X 10 YARDS, LATEX FREE, 12/BOX AND 12 BOXES/CASE.
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2
6
8

Trauma dressing 10"x30"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.69 Total: $0.69

Supplier Notes: KENTRON MULTI TRAUMA DRESSING 10" X 30", PACKED 50/CASE, LATEX FREE, PRODUCT
#771030

2
6
9

Trauma Shears (Black)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.64 Total: $0.64

Supplier Notes: KENTRON TRAUMA SHEARS BLACK PRODUCT #KI141-07

2
7
0

Trauma Shears (X-Shears)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
7
1

Triangular bandage

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.29 Total: $0.29

Supplier Notes: KENTRON TRIANGULAR BANDAGE MUSLIN CLOTH WITH 2 SAFETY PINS, LATEX FREE,
PACKING 12/BAG, SIZE 40" X 40" X 56"

2
7
2

Triple antibiotic ointment packet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
7
3

Tru-Cuff Bulb Inflator Syringe

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
7
4

Thomas Select Tube Holder Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2.69 Total: $2.69

Supplier Notes: KENTRON ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE HOLDER ADULT

2
7
5

Thomas Select Tube Holder Peds

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2.69 Total: $2.69

Supplier Notes: KENTRON ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE HOLDER PEDS

2
7
6

Window Punch

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.45 Total: $4.45

Supplier Notes: KENTRON WINDOW PUNCH PRODUCT #404061

2
7
7

Zoll paper roll 80mm

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
7
8

Zoll Adhesive Pulse Ox. (Ad./Neo)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
7
9

Zoll Adhesive Pulse Ox. (Pedi)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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2
8
0

Zoll BP Cuff, 07 Infant

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.69 Total: $3.69

Supplier Notes: KENTRON NYLON CUFF WITH TWO TUBES AND CONNECTORS FOR ZOLL, SIZE INFANT,
REUSABLE, NUMBER 7

2
8
1

Zoll BP Cuff, 09 Ped

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.89 Total: $4.89

Supplier Notes: KENTRON NYLON REUSABLE CUFF WITH TWO TUBES AND CONNECTORS FOR ZOLL, SIZE
PEDS, REUSABLE, NUMBER 9

2
8
2

Zoll BP Cuff, 10 Sm Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $6.89 Total: $6.89

Supplier Notes: KENTRON NYLON RESUABLE CUFF WITH DOUBLE TUBE AND CONNECTORS FOR ZOLL, SIZE
SMALL ADULT, NUM,BER 10

2
8
3

Zoll BP Cuff, 11 Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $8.89 Total: $8.89

Supplier Notes: KENTRON NYLON REUSABLE CUFF WITH DOUBLE TUBE AND CONNECTOIRS FOR ZOLL, SIZE
ADULT, NUMBER 11

2
8
4

Zoll BP Cuff, 12 Lg Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $12.79 Total: $12.79

Supplier Notes: KENTRON NYLON REUSABLE CUFF WITH DOUBLE TUBES AND CONNECTORS FOR ZOLL,
SIZE NUMBER 12

2
8
5

Zoll BP Cuff, 13 Thigh

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $16.99 Total: $16.99

Supplier Notes: KENTRON NYLON REUSABLE CUFF WITH DOUBLE TUBES AND ZOLL CONNECTORS, SIZE
NUMBER 13

2
8
6

Tactical Mechanical Tourniquet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $27.89 Total: $27.89

Supplier Notes: TMT BY SAFE GUARD MEDICAL, PRODUCT NUMBER 31-115

2
8
7

Fleece Blanket 60x90"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.89 Total: $4.89

Supplier Notes: KENTRON FLEECE BLANKET SIZE 60" X 90", NAVY BLUE OR MAROON COLORS.

2
8
8

15 gallon red biohazard bags

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
8
9

Armboard large 3x18

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.69 Total: $1.69

Supplier Notes: KENTRON ARM BOARD SIZE 3" X 18", LATEX FREE.
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2
9
0

Armboard medium 3x9

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.89 Total: $0.89

Supplier Notes: KENTRON PEDIATRIC ARM BOARD

2
9
1

Armboard small 1x4

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.69 Total: $0.69

Supplier Notes: KENTRON SMALL ARM BOARD SIZE 1" X 4", LATEX FREE.

2
9
2

Backboard 71x15.75x.85

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $89.00 Total: $89.00

Supplier Notes: KENTRON BACKBOARD, LATEX FREE.DIFFERENT COLORS

2
9
3

Disposable gown

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.89 Total: $0.89

Supplier Notes: KENTRON ISOLATION GOWN LEVEL 3

2
9
4

Cyanokit 5 gm hydroxycobalamin

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
9
5

Disposable shoe covers

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.06 Total: $0.06

Supplier Notes: KENTRON DISPOSABLE SHOE COVER WITH TRACTION. PRODUCT #900012

2
9
6

Faceshield with eyeguard

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.89 Total: $0.89

Supplier Notes: KENTRON FULL FACE SHIELD WITH HED BAND. PACKING 40/BOX

2
9
7

Ferno 65EXL Scoop Stretcher

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
9
8

Iron Duck folding backboard

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
9
9

Ketamine 500mg/5ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
0
0

Fentanyl 100mcg/2ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
0
1

Midazolam 5mg/5ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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3
0
2

Magill Forceps (Adult)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.35 Total: $3.35

Supplier Notes: KENTRON MAGILL FORCEPS ADULT PRODUCT #KI298

3
0
3

Magill Forceps (Peds.)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2.89 Total: $2.89

Supplier Notes: KENTRON MAGILL FORCEPS PEDS PRODUCT #KI297

3
0
4

Multi-cuff BP Kit

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $34.45 Total: $34.45

Supplier Notes: KENTRON MULTI CUFF BP KIT WITH 5 CUFFS AND MANOMETER.

3
0
5

Finger Tip Pulse Ox.

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $14.89 Total: $14.89

Supplier Notes: KENTRON FINGER PULSE OX PRODUCT NUMBER KT1000

3
0
6

Ringer Cutter

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $6.49 Total: $6.49

Supplier Notes: KENTRON RING CUTTER RC101

3
0
7

Slishman Traction Splint (Adult)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
0
8

Sager Traction Splint

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
0
9

SSCORT Jr. Suction Cannister

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
1
0

N95 mask with port

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
1
1

Spider Straps

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Response Total: $916.77
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