




































































Bid 43-2021 Addendum 1

On-Duty Depot

Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 43-2021 Addendum 1
Title: Partitions and Cargo Boxes
Type: Competitive Bid
Issue Date: 5/3/2021
Deadline: 5/24/2021 02:00 PM (ET)
Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS

SOLICITATION. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE LINE
ITEMS TAB ONLY. PRICING WITHIN SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE
ACCEPTED AND MAY MAKE YOUR BID NON-RESPONSIVE.

Contact Information

Contact: Jessica Allinder
Address: Central Purchasing

Government Center Building
Room 338
200 East Main Street
Room 338
Lexington, KY 40507

Fax: (859) 2583322
Email: jallinder@lexingtonky.gov
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On-Duty Depot Information

Contact: John Noblitt
Address: 1140 Moseley St.

Owensboro, KY 42303
Phone: (270) 685-6423
Fax: (270) 685-6379
Email: red@ondutydepot.com

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED! By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent
and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached
bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

John Wesley Noblitt red@ondutydepot.com
Signature Email

Submitted at 5/24/2021 11:07:13 AM

Response Attachments

Bid Package Partitions and Cargo Barriers.pdf

Bid Documents Completed

Bid Lines

1 SETINA BODYGUARD MODEL 10XL COATED POLY FRONT PARTITION

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $598.21 Total: $598.21

Manufacturer: SETINA

Manufacturer #: PK1156TAH21

Item Notes: NO SUBSTITUTIONS

2 SETINA BODYGUARD REAR CARGO PARTITION #12VS COATED POLY PARTITION

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $339.99 Total: $339.99

Manufacturer: SETINA

Manufacturer #: PK0123TAH212ND

Item Notes: NO SUBSTITUTIONS

3 SETINA CARGO SINGLE DECK STORAGE BOX

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,244.66 Total: $1,244.66

Manufacturer: SETINA

Item Notes: NO SUBSTITUTIONS

4 #5VS Fold-Down Window Coated Polycarbonate Flat Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $599.89 Total: $599.89

Manufacturer #: PK0318TAH21
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5 #5/8VS Fold-Down Window 1/2 Coated Polycarbonate and 1/2 Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Flat Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $613.65 Total: $613.65

Manufacturer #: PK0319TAH21

6 #6VS Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate Flat Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $448.89 Total: $448.89

Manufacturer #: PK0116TAH21

7 #6VS Stationary Window Uncoated Polycarbonate Flat Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $429.89 Total: $429.89

Manufacturer #: PK0115TAH21

8 #6/7VS 3-Piece Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate With Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Center Section
Flat Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $480.67 Total: $480.67

Manufacturer #: PK0326TAH21

9 #7VS Stationary Window Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Flat Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $448.98 Total: $448.98

Manufacturer #: PK0117TAH21

1
0

#8VS Stationary Window1/2 Coated Polycarbonate 1/2 Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Flat Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $461.67 Total: $461.67

Manufacturer #: PK0119TAH21

1
2

#8VS Stationary Window 1/2 Uncoated Polycarbonate 1/2 Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Flat Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $448.98 Total: $448.98

Manufacturer #: PK0118TAH21

1
3

#10VS Horizontal Sliding Window Coated Polycarbonate Flat Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $518.66 Total: $518.66

Manufacturer #: PK0121TAH21

1
4

#10VS Horizontal Sliding Window Uncoated Polycarbonate Flat Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $493.33 Total: $493.33

Manufacturer #: PK0120TAH21

1
5

#10VS C Horizontal Sliding Window Coated Polycarbonate With Expanded Metal Window Security Screen Flat
Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $543.99 Total: $543.99

Manufacturer #: PK0350TAH21
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1
6

#10VS C Horizontal Sliding Window Uncoated Polycarbonate With Expanded Metal Window Security Screen Flat
Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $518.66 Total: $518.66

Manufacturer #: PK0601TAH21

1
8

#10VS C2 Horizontal Sliding Window Coated Polycarbonate With Slotted Polycarbonate Window Security
Screen Flat Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $543.99 Total: $543.99

Manufacturer #: PK0226TAH21

1
9

#10VSC2 Horizontal Sliding Window Uncoated Polycarbonate With Slotted Polycarbonate Window Security
Screen Flat Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $518.67 Total: $518.67

Manufacturer #: PK0225TAH21

2
0

#6VS RP Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate Recessed Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $531.33 Total: $531.33

Manufacturer #: PK0374TAH21

2
1

#6VS RP Stationary Window Uncoated Polycarbonate Recessed Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $512.33 Total: $512.33

Manufacturer #: PK0373TAH21

2
2

#6/7VS RP 3-Piece Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate With Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Center Section
Recessed Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $562.99 Total: $562.99

Manufacturer #: PK0517TAH21

2
3

#7VS RP Stationary Window Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Recessed Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $531.33 Total: $531.33

Manufacturer #: PK0420TAH21

2
4

#8VS RP Stationary Window 1/2 Coated Polycarbonate 1/2 Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Recessed Panel
Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $543.99 Total: $543.99

Manufacturer #: PK0369TAH21

2
5

#8VS RP Stationary Window 1/2 Uncoated Polycarbonate 1/2 Vinyl Coated Expanded MetalRecessed Panel
Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $531.33 Total: $531.33

Manufacturer #: PK0398TAH21

2
6

#10VS RP Horizontal Sliding Window Coated Polycarbonate Recessed Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $599.89 Total: $599.89

Manufacturer #: PK0355TAH21

Page 4 of 17 pages Vendor: On-Duty Depot Bid 43-2021 Addendum 1



2
7

#10VS RP Horizontal Sliding Window Uncoated Polycarbonate Recessed Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $575.66 Total: $575.66

Manufacturer #: PK0439TAH21

2
8

#10VS C RP Horizontal Sliding Window Coated Polycarbonate With Expanded Metal Window Security Screen
Recessed Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $626.32 Total: $626.32

Manufacturer #: PK0419TAH21

2
9

#10VS C RP Horizontal Sliding Window Uncoated Polycarbonate With Expanded Metal Window Security Screen
Recessed Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $599.89 Total: $599.89

Manufacturer #: PK0602TAH21

3
0

#10VS C2 RP Horizontal Sliding Window Coated Polycarbonate With Slotted Poly Window Security Screen
Recessed Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $626.32 Total: $626.32

Manufacturer #: PK0228TAH21

3
1

#10VS C2 RP Horizontal Sliding Window Uncoated Polycarbonate With Slotted Poly Window Security Screen
Recessed Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $599.89 Total: $599.89

Manufacturer #: PK0227TAH21

3
2

#6XL Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate XL Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $531.33 Total: $531.33

Manufacturer #: PK1164TAH21

3
3

#6XL Stationary Window Uncoated Polycarbonate XL Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $512.33 Total: $512.33

Manufacturer #: PK1163TAH21

3
4

#6/7XL 3-Piece Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate With Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Center Section XL
Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $562.89 Total: $562.89

Manufacturer #: PK1170TAH21

3
5

#7XL Stationary Window Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Partition XL Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $531.33 Total: $531.33

Manufacturer #: PK1166TAH21

3
6

#8XL Stationary Window 1/2 Coated Polycarbonate 1/2 Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal XL Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $543.89 Total: $543.89

Manufacturer #: PK1160TAH21
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3
7

#8XL Stationary Window 1/2 Uncoated Polycarbonate 1/2 Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal XL Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $531.33 Total: $531.33

Manufacturer #: PK1157TAH21

3
8

#10XL Horizontal Sliding Window Coated Polycarbonate XL Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $575.66 Total: $575.66

Manufacturer #: PK1156TAH21

3
9

#10XL Horizontal Sliding Window Uncoated Polycarbonate XL Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $550.32 Total: $550.32

Manufacturer #: PK1155TAH21

4
0

#10XL C Horizontal Sliding Window Coated Polycarbonate With Expanded Metal Window Security Screen XL
Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $599.89 Total: $599.89

Manufacturer #: PK1152TAH21

4
1

#10XL C Horizontal Sliding Window Uncoated Polycarbonate With Expanded Metal Window Security Screen XL
Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $575.66 Total: $575.66

Manufacturer #: PK1151TAH21

4
2

#10XL C2 Horizontal Sliding Window Coated Polycarbonate With Slotted Polycarbonate Window Security
Screen XL Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $599.89 Total: $599.89

Manufacturer #: PK1188TAH21

4
3

#10XL C2 Horizontal Sliding Window Uncoated Polycarbonate With Slotted Polycarbonate Window Security
Screen XL Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $575.66 Total: $575.66

Manufacturer #: PK1187TAH21

4
4

Single Prisoner Transport Partition #6VS Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate *FOR USE WITH Stock Seat

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $708.65 Total: $708.65

Manufacturer #: 1K0574TAH21

4
5

Single Prisoner Transport Partition #6VS Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate *FOR USE WITH: Setina Full
COVER Transport Seat

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $708.65 Total: $708.65

Manufacturer #: 1K0574TAH21SS

4
6

Single Prisoner Transport Partition #6VS Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate *FOR USE WITH: Setina Full
REPLACEMENT Transport Seat

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $708.65 Total: $708.65

Manufacturer #: 1K0574TAH21FSR
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4
7

Single PRISONER Transport Partition #7VS Stationary Window Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal *FOR USE WITH:
Stock Seat

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $708.65 Total: $708.65

Manufacturer #: 1K0576TAH21

4
8

Single Prisoner Transport #7VS Stationary Window Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal *FOR USE WITH: Full COVER
Transport Seat

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $708.65 Total: $708.65

Manufacturer #: 1K0576TAH21SS

4
9

Single Prisoner Transport #7VS Stationary Window Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal *FOR USE WITH: Full
REPLACEMENT Transport Seat

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $708.65 Total: $708.65

Manufacturer #: 1K0576TAH21FSR

5
0

Cargo Area Partition For 2nd Row Seat #12VS Stationary Window Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $328.67 Total: $328.67

Manufacturer #: PK0123TAH212ND

5
1

Cargo Area Rear Partition For 2nd Row Seat #12VS Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $347.67 Total: $347.67

Manufacturer #: PK0316TAH212ND

5
2

Partition Transfer Kit Flat Panel Partition With Lower Extension Panel INCLUDED

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $202.02 Total: $202.02

Manufacturer #: PT0185TAH21

5
3

Partition Transfer Kit Recessed Panel Partition With 2 PC Lower Extension Panel & Recessed Panel Insert
INCLUDED

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $240.02 Total: $240.02

Manufacturer #: PT2185TAH21

5
4

Partition Transfer Kit XL Panel Partition With Lower Extension Panel & XL Recessed Insert INCLUDED

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $271.68 Total: $271.68

Manufacturer #: PT1176TAH21

5
5

PB100 12" Bumper Aluminum

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $315.89 Total: $315.89

Manufacturer #: TBD

5
6

PB100 12" Bumper Steel

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $315.89 Total: $315.89

Manufacturer #: TBD
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5
7

PB100 16" Bumper Aluminum

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $315.89 Total: $315.89

Manufacturer #: TBD

5
8

PB100 16" Bumper Steel

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $315.89 Total: $315.89

Manufacturer #: TBD

5
9

PB400 VS Bumper Full Bumper Aluminum

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $341.34 Total: $341.34

Manufacturer #: BK0534TAH21

6
0

PB400 VS Bumper Full Bumper Aluminum Winch-Ready *SPECIAL ORDER ITEM, NO RETURNS OR
CANCELLATIONS

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $436.33 Total: $436.33

Manufacturer #: BK0060TAH21

6
1

PB400 VS Bumper Steel Full Bumper

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $341.34 Total: $341.34

Manufacturer #: BK0535TAH21

6
2

PB450L2 With CODE 3 MR6

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $524.89 Total: $524.89

Manufacturer #: BK2100TAH21

6
3

PB450L2 With D&R ELECTRONICS GENESIS

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $524.89 Total: $524.89

Manufacturer #: BK0820TAH21

6
4

PB450L2 With FEDERAL SIGNAL IPX600

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $524.89 Total: $524.89

Manufacturer #: BK2025TAH21

6
5

PB450L2 With FENIEX FUSION

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $524.89 Total: $524.89

Manufacturer #: BK2124TAH21

6
6

PB450L2 With SOUNDOFF SIGNAL MPOWER

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $524.89 Total: $524.89

Manufacturer #: BK1328TAH21

6
7

PB450L2 With SOUNDOFF SIGNAL NFORCE

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $524.89 Total: $524.89

Manufacturer #: B2166TAH21
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6
8

PB450L2 With TOMAR RECT-14

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $524.89 Total: $524.89

Manufacturer #: BK2042TAH21

6
9

PB450L2 With WHELEN ION

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $524.89 Total: $524.89

Manufacturer #: BK2240TAH21

7
0

PB450L4 With CODE 3 MR6

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $657.89 Total: $657.89

Manufacturer #: BK2017TAH21

7
1

PB450L4 With D&R ELECTRONICS GENESIS

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $657.89 Total: $657.89

Manufacturer #: BK2102TAH21

7
2

PB450L4 With FEDERAL SIGNAL IPX600

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $657.89 Total: $657.89

Manufacturer #: BK0821TAH21

7
3

PB450L4 With FEDERAL SIGNAL MICROPULSE ULTRA

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $657.89 Total: $657.89

Manufacturer #: BK2027TAH21

7
4

PB450L4 With FENEIX FUSION

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $657.89 Total: $657.89

Manufacturer #: BK0802TAH21

7
5

PB450L4 With MPOWER

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $657.89 Total: $657.89

Manufacturer #: BK2046TAH21

7
6

PB450L4 With SOUNDOFF SIGNAL NFORCE

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $657.89 Total: $657.89

Manufacturer #: BK2168TAH21

7
7

PB450L4 With TOMAR 2 RECT-14LS & 2 i-LED

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $657.89 Total: $657.89

Manufacturer #: BK2044TAH21

7
8

PB450L4 With WHELEN ION

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $657.89 Total: $657.89

Manufacturer #: BK1275TAH21
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7
9

Push Bumper Transfer Kit PB100 With Mar-Resistant Horizontal Pad

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $163.89 Total: $163.89

Manufacturer #: BK2019TAH21

8
0

Push Bumper Transfer Kit PB400

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $163.89 Total: $163.89

Manufacturer #: TBD

8
1

PB5 Fender Wraps Aluminum PB300/400

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $341.34 Total: $341.34

Manufacturer #: BT0639TAH21

8
2

PB9A Fender Wraps Aluminum PB300/400

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $379.34 Total: $379.34

Manufacturer #: FK0400TAH21

8
3

PB6 Headlight Guard Steel With PB5 Wrap Aluminum

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $461.66 Total: $461.66

Manufacturer #: FK0402TAH21

8
4

PB8 Headlight Guard Steel Double Loop

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $246.35 Total: $246.35

Manufacturer #: HK0810TAH21

8
5

PB10 Headlight Guard Steel With PB9S Wrap Steel

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $410.89 Total: $410.89

Manufacturer #: HK0809TAH21

8
6

Window Barrier Polycarbonate *FOR USE WITH: Stock Door Panels -SETINA TPO Door Panels

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $195.68 Total: $195.68

Manufacturer #: HK2272TAH21

8
7

Window Barrier Polycarbonate Tinted *FOR USE WITH: Stock Door Panels-SETINA TPO Door Panels

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $220.89 Total: $220.89

Manufacturer #: WK0595TAH21

8
8

Window Barrier Steel Horizontal *FOR USE WITH: Stock Door Panels -SETINA TPO Door Panels

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $182.89 Total: $182.89

Manufacturer #: WK1491TAH21T

8
9

Window Barrier Rear Hatch Steel Horizontal Rear Cargo Compartment

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $144.89 Total: $144.89

Manufacturer #: WK0514TAH21H
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9
0

Window Barrier 3-Piece Set Steel Horizontal Rear Cargo Compartment *INCLUDES: 2 Side Window - Rear
Hatch

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $239.89 Total: $239.89

Manufacturer #: WK0041TAH21

9
1

Door Panel TPO Plastic Black Installs Over OEM Door Panels

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $182.89 Total: $182.89

Manufacturer #: WK0040TAH21

9
2

Door Panel Aluminum Replaces OEM Door Panels

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $125.89 Total: $125.89

Manufacturer #: DK0100TAH21

9
3

K9 Ultimate K9 Exit Points 2: Drivers Side & Cargo Hatch Prisoner Passenger Side Exit *REQUIRED: Recessed
Panel Front Partition NOT INCLUDED *INCLUDES: #12VS Cargo Area Rear Partition Panel Insert

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer #: DK0598TAH21

Supplier Notes: Setina does not offer Ultimate K9 for 2021 Tahoe.

9
4

K9 Ultimate K9 Exit Points 2: Drivers Side & Cargo Hatch Prisoner Passenger Side Exit *FOR USE WITH: 10"
Fan NOT INCLUDED *REQUIRED: Recessed Panel Front Partition NOT INCLUDED *INCLUDES: #12VS Cargo
Area Rear Partition Panel Insert

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer #: TBD

Supplier Notes: Setina does not offer Ultimate K9 for 2021 Tahoe.

9
5

K9 Ultimate K9 Exit Points 2: Drivers Side & Cargo Hatch Prisoner Passenger Side Exit *REQUIRED: XL Panel
Front Partition NOT INCLUDED *INCLUDES: #12VS Cargo Area Rear Partition Panel Insert

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer #: TBD

Supplier Notes: Setina does not offer Ultimate K9 for 2021 Tahoe.

9
6

K9 Ultimate K9 Exit Points 2: Drivers Side & Cargo Hatch Prisoner Passenger Side Exit *FOR USE WITH: 10"
Fan NOT INCLUDED *REQUIRED: XL Panel Front Partition NOT INCLUDED *INCLUDES: #12VS Cargo Area
Rear Partition Panel Insert

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer #: TBD

Supplier Notes: Setina does not offer Ultimate K9 for 2021 Tahoe.

9
7

T-Rail Mount Kit Free Standing

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $176.68 Total: $176.68

Manufacturer #: TBD
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9
8

Firearm Mount Transfer Kit Forward Facing Partition Mount Without Mount Plate *ONLY FOR USE WITH: SPT
Single Prisoner Transport Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $56.36 Total: $56.36

Manufacturer #: GF1092TAH21

9
9

Full COVER Transport Seat TPO Plastic With Center Pull Seat Belts *REQUIRED: #12VS Stationary Window
Cargo Area Rear Partition NOT INCLUDED *ONLY COMPATIBLE WITH: XL Panel Front Partitions - SPT Single
Prisoner Transports Partitions

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer #: GT0536TAH21

Supplier Notes: Not Yet Available.

1
0
0

Full COVER Transport Seat TPO Plastic With Center Pull Seat Belts *INCLUDES REQUIRED: #12VS
Stationary Window Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Cargo Partition *Seat Belt Retractors Pre-Installed to Save 30
Minutes of Install Time *ONLYCOMPATIBLE WITH: XL Panel Front Partitions-SPT Single Prisoner Transports
Partitions

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer #: TBD

Supplier Notes: Not Yet Available.

1
0
1

Full COVER Transport Seat TPO Plastic With Center Pull Seat Belts *INCLUDES REQUIRED: #12VS
Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate Cargo Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer #: TBD

Supplier Notes: Not Yet Available.

1
0
2

Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic With Center Pull Seat Belts

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $759.31 Total: $759.31

Manufacturer #: TBD

1
0
3

Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic With SETINA SMARTBELT SYSTEM

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $980.96 Total: $980.96

Manufacturer #: QK1374TAH21

1
0
4

Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic With Center Pull Seat Belts *INCLUDES REQUIRED: #12VS
Stationary Window Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Cargo Partition *Seat Belt Retractors Pre-Installed to Save 30
Minutes of Install Time

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,012.63 Total: $1,012.63

Manufacturer #: TBD

1
0
5

Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic With Center Pull Seat Belts *INCLUDES REQUIRED: #12VS
Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate Cargo Partition *Seat Belt Retractors Pre-Installed to Save 30 Minutes
of Install Time

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,037.89 Total: $1,037.89

Manufacturer #: QK2023TAH21
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1
0
6

Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic With SETINA SMARTBELT SYSTEM *INCLUDES
REQUIRED: #12VS Stationary Window Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Cargo Partition *Seat Belt Retractors Pre-
Installed to Save 30 Minutes of Install Time

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,272.28 Total: $1,272.28

Manufacturer #: QK2024TAH21

1
0
7

Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic Wth SETINA SMARTBELT SYSTEM *INCLUDES REQUIRED:
#12VS Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate Cargo Partition *Seat Belt Retractors Pre-Installed to Save 30
Minutes of Install Time

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer #: TBD

Supplier Notes: Not Yet Available.

1
0
8

Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic With Center Pull Seat Belts

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,037.96 Total: $1,037.96

Manufacturer #: TBD

1
0
9

Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic With SETINA SMARTBELT SYSTEM

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,272.28 Total: $1,272.28

Manufacturer #: QK0213TAH21

1
1
0

Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic With Center Pull Seat Belts *INCLUDES REQUIRED: #12VS
Stationary Window Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Cargo Partition *Seat Belt Retractors Pre-Installed to Save 30
Minutes of Install Time

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,012.63 Total: $1,012.63

Manufacturer #: QK0214TAH21

1
1
1

Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic With Center Pull Seat Belts *INCLUDES REQUIRED: #12VS
Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate Cargo Partition *Seat Belt Retractors Pre-Installed to Save 30 Minutes
of Install Time

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,037.96 Total: $1,037.96

Manufacturer #: QK0215TAH21

1
1
2

Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic With SETINA SMARTBELT SYSTEM *INCLUDES
REQUIRED: #12VS Stationary Window Vinyl Coated

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,272.28 Total: $1,272.28

Manufacturer #: QK0281TAH21

1
1
3

Expanded Metal Cargo Partition *Seat Belt Retractors Pre-Installed to Save 30 Minutes of Install Time

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer #: QK0217TAH21
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1
1
5

Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic Wth SETINA SMARTBELT SYSTEM *INCLUDES REQUIRED:
#12VS Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate Cargo Partition *Seat Belt Retractors Pre-Installed to Save 30
Minutes of Install Time

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer #: QK0308TAH21

Supplier Notes: Not Yet Available.

1
1
6

Child Restraint Retrofit Kit

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer #: QR1407TAH21

1
1
7

CARGO BOX TOA- Tray, Open Top With Anchor Points BSN- Base Sliding With No Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $638.89 Total: $638.89

Manufacturer #: TK0247TAH21

1
1
8

CARGO BOX TFN- Tray, Fixed With No Lock BSN- Base Sliding With No Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $588.33 Total: $588.33

Manufacturer #: TK0231TAH21

1
1
9

CARGO BOX LFK- Lift Top, Fixed Box With Key Lock BSN- Base Sliding With No Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $923.97 Total: $923.97

Manufacturer #: TK0232TAH21

1
2
0

CARGO BOX LFC- Lift Top, Fixed Box With Combination Lock BSN- Base Sliding With No Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $923.97 Total: $923.97

Manufacturer #: TK0230TAH21

1
2
1

CARGO BOX LFE- Lift Top, Fixed Box With Electric Key Pad Lock BSN- Base Sliding With No Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,094.89 Total: $1,094.89

Manufacturer #: TK0844TAH21

1
2
2

CARGO BOX LFR- Lift Top, Fixed Box With Electric RFID Lock BSN- Base Sliding With No Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,126.62 Total: $1,126.62

Manufacturer #: TK0843TAH21

1
2
3

CARGO BOX DSK- Drawer, Sliding With Key Lock BSN- Base Sliding With No Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $911.30 Total: $911.30

Manufacturer #: TK0233TAH21

1
2
4

CARGO BOX DSC- Drawer, Sliding With Combination Lock BSN- Base Sliding With No Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $911.30 Total: $911.30

Manufacturer #: TK0241TAH21
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1
2
5

CARGO BOX DSE- Drawer, Sliding With Electric Key Pad Lock BSN- Base Sliding With No Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,101.29 Total: $1,101.29

Manufacturer #: TK0841TAH21

1
2
6

CARGO BOX DSR- Drawer, Sliding With Electic RFID Lock BSN- Base Sliding With No Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,132.89 Total: $1,132.89

Manufacturer #: TK0842TAH21

1
2
7

CARGO BOX TOA- Tray, Open Top With Anchor Points BSC- Base Sliding With Combination Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $638.89 Total: $638.89

Manufacturer #: TK0236TAH21

1
2
8

CARGO BOX TOA- Tray, Open Top With Anchor Points BSE- Base Sliding With Electric Key Pad Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $721.31 Total: $721.31

Manufacturer #: TK0836TAH21

1
2
9

CARGO BOX TFN- Tray, Fixed With No Lock BSC- Base Sliding With Combination Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $670.65 Total: $670.65

Manufacturer #: TK0244TAH21

1
3
1

CARGO BOX LFK- Lift Top, Fixed Box With Key Lock BSC- Base Sliding With Combination Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,006.29 Total: $1,006.29

Manufacturer #: TK0245TAH21

1
3
2

CARGO BOX LFC- Lift Top, Fixed Box With Combination Lock BSC- Base Sliding With Combination Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,012.63 Total: $1,012.63

Manufacturer #: TK0243TAH21

1
3
3

CARGO BOX DSK- Drawer, Sliding With Key Lock BSC- Base Sliding With Combination Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $993.63 Total: $993.63

Manufacturer #: TK0246TAH21

1
3
4

CARGO BOX DSC- Drawer, Sliding With Combination Lock BSC- Base Sliding With Combination Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $993.63 Total: $993.63

Manufacturer #: TK0248TAH21

1
3
5

CARGO BOX TOA- Tray, Open Top With Anchor Points BSK- Base Sliding With Key Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $721.32 Total: $721.32

Manufacturer #: TK0254TAH21

1
3
6

CARGO BOX TFN- Tray, Fixed With No Lock BSK- Base Sliding With Key Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $670.65 Total: $670.65

Manufacturer #: TK0252TAH21

Page 15 of 17 pages Vendor: On-Duty Depot Bid 43-2021 Addendum 1



1
3
7

CARGO BOX LFK- Lift Top, Fixed Box With Key Lock BSK- Base Sliding With Key Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,006.28 Total: $1,006.28

Manufacturer #: TK0253TAH21

1
3
8

CARGO BOX LFC- Lift Top, Fixed Box With Combination Lock BSK- Base Sliding With Key Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,006.29 Total: $1,006.29

Manufacturer #: TK0251TAH21

1
3
9

CARGO BOX DSK- Drawer, Sliding With Key Lock BSK- Base Sliding With Key Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $993.63 Total: $993.63

Manufacturer #: TK0250TAH21

1
4
0

CARGO BOX DSC- Drawer, Sliding With Combination Lock BSK- Base Sliding With Key Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $993.63 Total: $993.63

Manufacturer #: TK0255TAH21

1
4
1

CARGO BOX TFN- Tray, Fixed With No Lock BSE- Base Sliding With Electric Key Pad Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $670.65 Total: $670.65

Manufacturer #: TK0839TAH21

1
4
2

CARGO BOX TOA- Tray, Open Top With Anchor Points BSR- Base Sliding With Electric RFID Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $873.30 Total: $873.30

Manufacturer #: TK0835TAH21

1
4
3

Cargo Rear Deck

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer #: TK1334TAH21

1
4
4

Cargo Radio Tray With No lock TRN

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $253.31 Total: $253.31

Manufacturer #: TPA9289

1
4
5

Cargo Tray Sliding White Board *NOT COMPATIBLE WITH: Cargo Radio Tray With No Lock TRN

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $322.34 Total: $322.34

Manufacturer #: TPA11080

1
4
6

Cargo Tray Top Sliding White Board *COMPATIBLE WITH: Cargo Radio Tray With No Lock TRN

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $258.89 Total: $258.89

Manufacturer #: TPA12419

1
4
7

Cargo Tray Lift Top Sliding White Board *COMPATIBLE WITH: Cargo Radio Tray With No Lock TRN

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $271.68 Total: $271.68

Manufacturer #: TPA12874
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1
4
8

Freestanding Cargo Box Bracket Kit

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $113.36 Total: $113.36

Manufacturer #: TBD

1
4
9

Cargo Scale Box *ACCOMODATES Up To 8 Scales

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,335.61 Total: $1,335.61

Manufacturer #: TK0888TAH21

1
5
0

Transfer Kit Cargo Box *REQUIRED: #12VS Cargo Area Rear Partition NOT INCLUDED *NOT COMPATIBLE
WITH: Lift Top Cargo Box

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $69.03 Total: $69.03

Manufacturer #: TT0242TAH21

Response Total: $80,268.94
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