"M LEXINGTON

Bid 86-2021 Addendum 1
Innovative Business Concepts, Inc.
Innovative Business Concepts
Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 86-2021 Addendum 1

Title: Printing Services for Environmental Services

Type: Competitive Bid

Issue Date: 8/23/2021

Deadline:  9/10/2021 02:00 PM (ET)

Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS
SOLICITATION. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE LINE
ITEMS TAB ONLY. PRICING WITHIN SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE
ACCEPTED AND MAY MAKE YOUR BID NON-RESPONSIVE.
For questions regarding these specifications or the bidding process,
please post to the published bid on lonWave -
https://lexingtonky.ionwave.net. Phone calls or emails are not
accepted.

Contact Information

Contact: Conni Hayes

Address: Central Purchasing
Government Center Building
Room 338
200 East Main Street
Lexington, KY 40507

Phone:  (859) 2583320

Fax: (859) 2583322

Email: chayes@lexingtonky.gov
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Innovative Business Concepts, Inc. Information

Contact: Jeannine Bennett

Address: 845 W Steve Wariner Drive
Russell Springs
Russell Springs, KY 42642

Phone: (270) 866-3434
Fax: (270) 866-3490
Email: jeannine@ibcprint.com

Web Address: www.ibcprint.com

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED! By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent
and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached

FP/RFQlQupte/Auc documents. . . '
< , 10 oo b (4 '\\DCDN\-\“\: Lo
e Emyail i

Bid Lines

1]8.5 X 11 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

500 copies - per piece price
Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.21 I Total: |7 $0.21 I

2 | 8.5 X 11 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

1,000 copies - per piece price
Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.19 I Total: |7 $0.M

3 | 8.5 X 11 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

2,500 copies - per piece price
Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: |__ $0.17] Total: | $0.17]

4 (8.5 X 11 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

5,000 copies - per piece price ‘
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.16 | Total: l $0.16 | |

5|8.5 X 11 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

10,000 copies - per piece price
Quantity: _ 1  UOM: Each No Bid

6 | 8.5 X 11 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

50,000 copies - per piece price
Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid
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8.5 X 11 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

100,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: __ 1 UOM: Each No Bid
8 [ 1/2 Fold up to 500 pieces - per piece price

Item #1 - 8.5 X 11 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.02 | Total: | $0.02 |

Supplier Notes: |folding cost only - no sheet cost |
9 [ 1/2 fold 501 to 1,000 per piece price

Item #1 - 8.5 X 11 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.01 | Total: | $0.01 |

Supplier Notes: |folding cost only - no sheet cost |
il) 8.5 X 14 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.30| Total: | $0.30 |
1 8.5 X 14 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

1,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.25| Total: | $0.25 |
; 8.5 x 14 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

2,500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.19| Total: | $0.19 |
?3 8.5 X 14 -- 100# Gloss Text Single Sheet Flyers

5,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.18 | Total: | $0.18 |
1 60# or 70# Uncoated Text Single Sheet Flyers

500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.17 | Total: | $0.17 |
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1=

60# or 70# Uncoated Text Single Sheet Flyers

1,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.15| Total: | $0.15 |
;ls 60# or 70# Uncoated Text Single Sheet Flyers

2,500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.14| Total: | $0.14 |
; 1/2 Fold up to 500 pieces - per piece price

Item #14 - 60# or 70# Uncoated Text Single Sheet Flyers

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.02 | Total: | $0.02 |

Supplier Notes: |folding cost only - no sheet cost |
;I; 1/2 Fold up to 501 to 1,000 pieces - per piece price

Item #14 - 60# or 70# Uncoated Text Single Sheet Flyers

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.01 | Total:| $0.01 |

Supplier Notes: [folding cost only - no sheet cost |
1 | Postcards
9

500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.23| Total: | $0.23 |
2 | Postcards
0

1,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.17| Total: | $0.17 |
% Postcards

2,500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.15 | Total: | $0.15 |
% Postcards

5,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.14 | Total: | $0.14 |
% Postcards

10,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.12 | Total: | $0.12 |
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Postcards

50,000 copies - per piece price
Quantity: 1 UOM: Each

No Bid

Postcards

100,000 copies - per piece price
Quantity: 1 UOM: Each

No Bid

Individually addressed postcards

500 copies - per piece price
Quantity: 1 UOM: Each

No Bid

Individually addressed postcards

1,000 copies - per piece price
Quantity: 1 UOM: Each

No Bid

Individually addressed postcards

2,500 copies - per piece price
Quantity: 1 UOM: Each

No Bid

Individually addressed postcards

5,000 copies - per piece price
Quantity: 1 UOM: Each

No Bid

Individually addressed postcards

10,000 copies - per piece price
Quantity: 1 UOM: Each

No Bid

=W

Individually addressed postcards

50,000 copies - per piece price
Quantity: 1 UOM: Each

No Bid

Individually addressed postcards

100,000 copies - per piece price
Quantity: 1 UOM: Each

No Bid

100# Gloss Text 311 Alerts/LexCall card

1,000 copies - per piece price
Quantity: 1 UOM: Each

Price:

$0.18| Total: |

$0.18 |
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3 | 100# Gloss Text 311 Alerts/LexCall card

4

2,500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.16| Total: | $0.16 |
g 100# Gloss Text 311 Alerts/LexCall card

5,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.14| Total: | $0.14 |
g Pop-Up cards

500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid
; Pop-Up cards

1,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid
g Pop-Up cards

2,500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid
g Door hangers

Up to 499 copies - per piece price

Quantity: __ 1 UOM: Each No Bid
3 Door hangers

500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid
flt Door hangers

1.000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid
421 Door hangers

2,500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: Each No Bid
g Tri-fold brochures

500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.40 | Total: | $0.40 |
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2 Tri-fold brochures

1,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.23 | Total: | $0.23 |
g Tri-fold brochures

2,500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.18 | Total: | $0.18 |
g Bookmarks

500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.25 | Total: | $0.25 |
471 Bookmarks

1,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.18 | Total: | $0.18 |
481 Bookmarks

2,500 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.14 | Total: | $0.14 |
g Bookmarks

5,000 copies - per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $0.10 | Total: | $0.10 |
g Tag along cards - Hole Version

1,000 copies - Per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid
? Tag along cards - Hole Version

2,500 copies - Per piece price

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each No Bid
g Tag along cards - Hole Version

5,000 copies - Per piece price

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: Each No Bid
g Tag Along Card - Non-Hole Version

500 Copies - per piece pricing

Quantity: __ 1 No Bid
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5 | Tag Along Card - Non-Hole Version

1,000 Copies - per piece pricing
Quantity: 1 No Bid

5 | Tag Along Card - Non-Hole Version

2,500 Copies - per piece pricing
Quantity: __ 1 No Bid

5 | Tag Along Card - Non-Hole Version

5,000 Copies - per piece pricing
Quantity: 1 No Bid

5 [ Thank You Cards and envelopes

Bundle of 500 cards and 500 envelopes
Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $237.00 | Total: | $237.00 |

Supplier Notes: |priced 4/4 |

5 [ Thank You Cards and envelopes

For bundle of 1,000 cards and 1,000 envelopes
Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Price: $390.00 | Total: | $390.00 |

Supplier Notes: |priced 4/4 |

Response Total: $631.94
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This Affidavit must be completed before your firm can be conslidered for award of this contract.

AFFIDAVIT

Comes the Affiant, ; E'P.gnq .'ﬂg St mmc;& , and after being first duly sworn under penalty of

perjury as follows:

—

1. His/her name is Con - and he/she is the individual submitting the bid or is the

authorized representative of Ibg DVo bll& &gi‘nﬂﬁ ss QZ} |AY4 QQ lﬁ Iﬂ & ,

the entity submitting the bid (hereinafter referred to as "Bidder")

2. Bidder will pay all taxes and fees, which are owed to the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government at the time the bid
is submitted, prior to award of the contract and will maintain a "current" status in regard to those taxes and fees during

the life of the contract.

3. Bidder will obtain a Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government business license, if applicable, prior to award of the
contract.

4, Bidder has authorized the Division of Central Purchasing to verify the above-mentioned information with the Division of
Revenue and to disclose to the Urban County Council that taxes and/or fees are delinquent or that a business license has
not been obtained.

5. Bidder has not knowingly violated any provision of the campaign finance laws of the Commonwealth of Kentucky within
the past five (5) years and the award of a contract to the Bidder will not violate any provision of the campaign finance
laws of the Commonwealth.

6. Bidder has not knowingly violated any provision of Chapter 25 of the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government Code
of Ordinances, known as "Ethics Act."

7. Bidder acknowledges that "knowingly" for purposes of this Affidavit means, with respect to conduct or to circumstances
described by a statute or ordinance defining an offense, that a person is aware or should have been aware that his
conduct is of that nature or that the circumstance exists.

Further, Affiant sayeth naught. %ﬁM‘LL % ML ,n_;Hg_/

STATE OF \(_en Xuc \){\f\J

COUNTY OF Ruf-,q e \\

The foregoing instrument was subscribed, sworn to and acknowledged before me

et
by~ Vlannine ,gem na onthisthe /¢ty day

of __Cepl. , 2021,

My Commission expires: __0) 2 —oU-2& i

_Z

NOTARY PUB TE AT LARGE

Please refer to Section II, Bid Conditions, Item “U" prior to completing this form.



WORKFORCE ANALYSIS FORM
Name of Organization: {amoVa v %\)\93\’\959 GU(\CD_(T{ 97 quC

| /Ig@

Categories Total White Hispanic Black or Native Asian American Two or Total
(Not or African- Hawaiian (Not Indian or more races
Hispanic Latino) American | and Other | Hispanic Alaskan (Not
or (Not Pacific or Native Hispanic or
Latino) Hispanic Islander Latino) (not Latino)
or Latino (Not Hispanic
Hispanic or Latino)
or Latino)
M| FI M|F M F M|(F I  M|F M F | M F M| F
Administrators , V |
Professionals
Superintendents
Supervisors
Foremen
Technicians
Protective Service
Para-Professionals
Office/Clerical | v (
Skilled Craft ] v |
Service/Maintenan l / i
Total:

Prepared by: 3{.&1\‘;\\1\1%\-\1«1}\\ QA&:M

(Name and Title)

Date: q / %/Z}

Revised 2015-Dec-15




"M LEXINGTON

LFUCG MWDBE PARTICIPATION FORM
Bid/RFP/Quote Reference # CB(O = UZJ

The MWDBE and/or veteran subcontractors listed have agreed to participate on this Bid/RFP/Quote. If any
substitution is made or the total value of the work is changed prior to or after the job is in progress, it is

understood that those substitutions must be submitted to Central Purchasing for approval immediately. Failure
to submit a completed form may cause rejection of the bid.

MWDBE Company, Name, MBE Work to be Performed Total Dollar % Value of Total
Address, Phone, Email WBE or Value of the Contract
DBE Work

L oy 0\‘\1‘\)9. %\\‘S\V‘GSS
Contaghs , e

Ru e | sxXwnas y \)\\1

Gus W.SNaR. Worder br

WBE

/Preri n%

Fo42Z

L

100%

27 Yauih,
"o Rl 243

%\ec\mi«\e@ o Qe L oM

The undersigned company representative submits the above list of MWDBE firms to be used in accomplishing the work
contained in this Bid/RFP/Quote. Any misrepresentation may result in the termination of the contract and/or be subject

to applicable Federal and State laws concerning false statements and false claims.

/
TanoloRg Rt \ oty Toc ;\Te.mu%weu

Company Representative

“Ras: doal

Company

Azl

Date

Title
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"N LEXINGTON

Bid/RFP/Quote Reference # 8(0 - Z 0Z ‘

The undersigned acknowledges that the minority and/or veteran subcontractors listed on this form did

MWDBE QUOTE SUMMARY FORM

submit a quote to participate on this project. Failure to submit this form may cause rejection of the bid.

Company Name

XD\ A UQ

Vusinsss QynaoD‘l;'.[m

Contact Person .
Jeannnd PJ! nﬂd~

Address/Phone/Email
Wormesr Dr Y3

RS Wh Sl

Russt\\ Seeinog | ¥

e e @ (o point. Lor)

Bid Package / Bid Date

@-«\-\\-“ﬁ @200 Mol

MWDBE J Contact Contact Date Services Method of Total dollars $$ | MBE * Veteran
Company Address Person Information| Contacted | to be Communication| Do Not Leave | AA
(work phone performed | (email, phone | Blank HA
Email, cell) meeting, ad, (Attach AS
event etc) Documentation)] NA
Female
R4S .S | Teonmee |210 800 ' jeonmne?  [$ 2
Dariae ©Ff | Beontd | 3934w C{/ o/ Qt‘m‘l‘ino\ Vo Qe Lo o+ MBE
N
Russell 20 Sbl
Sgeings, Ky 1 ke C 370 Bble 3B, %Ja
Y Alp q’a‘ _‘)t annin¥
Py o prind.tom 70,5k b2

(MBE designation / AA=African American / HA= Hispanic American/AS = Asian Ametican/Pacific Islander/
NA= Native American)

The undersigned acknowledges that all information is accurate. Any misrepresentation may result in termination of the
ontract and/or be subject to applicable Federal and State laws concerning false statements and claims.

c i i i
.
\
I

B o

Company

Y

~

Q[%l)

Date

Company Representative

Pt s dut\'

Teonrmint Rmneth

Title
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