



LEXINGTON

**Bid 100-2019 Addendum 1
Traffic Control Products
Supplier Response**

Event Information

Number: Bid 100-2019 Addendum 1
Title: Traffic Signal and Control Equipment
Type: Competitive Bid
Issue Date: 9/23/2019
Deadline: 10/10/2019 02:00 PM (ET)
Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS SOLICITATION
. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE LINE ITEMS TAB ONLY.
PRICING WITHIN SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED AND MAY MAKE YOUR BID NON-RESPONSIVE.

Contact Information

Contact: Jessica Allinder
Address: Central Purchasing
Government Center Building
Room 338
200 East Main Street
Lexington, KY 40507
Fax: (859) 2583322
Email: jallinder@lexingtonky.gov

Traffic Control Products Information

Address: 4565 Glenbrook Road
Willoughby, OH 44094
Phone: (440) 951-8929
Fax: (440) 951-8203

By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

Jacob Knights

Signature

Submitted at 10/10/2019 8:27:12 AM

sales@traffcon.com

Email

Response Attachments

Affidavit.pdf

Affidavit

Workforce Analysis.pdf

Workforce Analysis

Addendum #1.pdf

Addendum #1

MWDBE.pdf

MWDBE

Bid Lines

1	2070L Complete with everything - Base Mount Cabinet #332	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$14,100.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$14,100.00"/>
2	Surge Protection Panel w/Lane Use Control	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$745.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$745.00"/>
3	2070L w/Intelight Maxtime Software Complete with everything - Base Mount Cabinet #332 with Lane Use Control	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$785.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$785.00"/>
4	2070L w/Intelight Maxtime Software Complete with everything - Pole Mount Cabinet #336S	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$13,850.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$13,850.00"/>
5	Traffic Control Cabinet #1	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$11,100.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$11,100.00"/>
6	Traffic Control Cabinet #2	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$9,175.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$9,175.00"/>
7	Traffic Control Cabinet #3	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$10,225.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$10,225.00"/>

8	Traffic Control Cabinet - Pole Mount # 336S	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$10,850.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$10,850.00"/>
9	2070L 332 Base Mount Rack/Terminal Facility	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$5,050.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$5,050.00"/>
10	2070L 332 Base Mount Rack/Terminal Facility for Lane Use Control	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$6,150.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$6,150.00"/>
11	2070L Pole Mount (336S) Rack/Terminal Facility	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$4,800.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$4,800.00"/>
12	Flasher Cabinet #1	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$285.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$285.00"/>
13	Flasher cabinet #2	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$265.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$265.00"/>
14	Flasher cabinet with NEMA 3 flasher	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$480.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$480.00"/>
15	Time of Day Controller Cabinet	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$875.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$875.00"/>
16	Time Clock #1	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$380.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$380.00"/>
17	Time Clock #2	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>		No Bid
18	Time Clock #3	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>		No Bid
19	Conflict Monitor: NEMA 12-channel, ENHANCED	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$565.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$565.00"/>
20	Conflict Monitor: Model EDI 2010 ECL, ENHANCED	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$485.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$485.00"/>
21	Conflict Monitor, EDI 2018 Kclip	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$660.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$660.00"/>
22	MonitorKey CMU Data Key Programming Tool (EDI 2018 Kclip)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$360.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$360.00"/>
23	Inductive loop vehicle detector	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$165.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$165.00"/>

24	DC isolator, 242L with fuse Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$45.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$45.00"/>
25	Switch pack, Model 200 with indicators Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$25.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$25.00"/>
26	Flasher, NEMA 3, alternate circuit, model 204 Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$25.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$25.00"/>
27	Automated Conflict Monitor Tester Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> No Bid
28	LED Countdown Pedestrian Signal w/Housing (ICC) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$197.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$197.00"/>
29	LED Countdown Pedestrian Signal Module Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$90.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$90.00"/>
30	LED Countdown Pedestrian Signal with Mounting Hardware Kit Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$305.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$305.00"/>
31	LED Countdown Pedestrian signal, 1-Way Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$695.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$695.00"/>
32	LED Countdown Pedestrian signal, 2-way Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$990.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$990.00"/>
33	Pedestal pole Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$270.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$270.00"/>
34	Pedestal Base w/reinforced collar Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$190.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$190.00"/>
35	Pedestal Pole, 10-foot, Painted Black Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$245.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$245.00"/>
36	Pedestal Base anchor bolts, 3/4-inch x 18-inch, set of four Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$45.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$45.00"/>
37	Pedestal Base anchor bolts, 3/4-inch x 26-inch, set of four Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$60.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$60.00"/>
38	Pedestrian signal top bracket, Two-way Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$62.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$62.00"/>
39	Pedestal pole (2-way) mounting brackets Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$165.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$165.00"/>

40	Pedestal pole top bracket, One-way Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$58.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$58.00"/>
41	Pedestrian Push Button Box, 3/4-inch threaded opening Quantity: <u> 1 </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$24.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$24.00"/>
42	Pedestrian Push Button, Rees Quantity: <u> 1 </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$222.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$222.00"/>
43	Pedestrian Push Button, Bulldog Quantity: <u> 1 </u> No Bid
44	Pedestrian Push Button with Box Quantity: <u> 1 </u> No Bid
45	Pedestrian Push Button Assembly, 1-direction Quantity: <u> 1 </u> No Bid
46	Pedestrian Push Button Assembly, 2-direction Quantity: <u> 1 </u> No Bid
47	Pedestrian Push Button Sign with a Left Arrow: R10-3e, (9" X 15") Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$15.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$15.00"/>
48	Pedestrian Push Button Sign with a Right Arrow: R10-3e, (9" X 15") Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$15.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$15.00"/>
49	Pedestal Pole Cap Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$26.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$26.00"/>
50	Pedestrian Signal (Single) Mounting Hardware Kit Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$120.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$120.00"/>
51	LED Vehicle signal with Back-plate, 12-12-12 Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
52	LED Left Turn Vehicle signal, 12-12-12 with Back-plate Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
53	LED 5-Section Vehicle signal with Back-plate Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
54	LED 4-Section Vehicle signal with Back-plate Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
55	LED 4-Section FYA Vehicle signal with Back-plate Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>

56	Vehicle Signal Lens, LED Retrofit: 12-inch, Green Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
57	Vehicle Signal Lens, LED Retrofit: 12-inch, Yellow Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
58	Vehicle Signal Lens, LED Retrofit: 12-inch, Red Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
59	Vehicle Signal Lens, LED Retrofit: 12-inch, Left Turn Green Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
60	Vehicle Signal Lens, LED Retrofit: 12-inch, Left Turn Yellow Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
61	Vehicle Signal Lens, LED Retrofit: 12-inch, Left Turn Red Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
62	LED Signal section (Red), 12 inch Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
63	LED Signal Section (Yellow), 12 inch Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
64	LED Signal Section (Green), 12 inch Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
65	Solar RRFB System (TAPCO) #1 Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
66	Solar RRFB System (TAPCO) #2 Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
67	Solar RRFB Bulldog III Kit (TAPCO) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
68	Solar RRFB XAV2-LED Push Button Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
69	Dual Red Mounting Hardware, Span Wire Mount Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
70	Dual Red Mounting Hardware, Mast Arm Mount, Vertical Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
71	LED Dual Red Veh. signal w/Mtg. Hrdwre., Span Wire Mount, w/Back-plate Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>

7 2	LED Dual Red Veh. signal w/Mtg. Hrdwre., Mast Arm Mount, w/Back-plate Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
7 3	Tri-Stud slip fitter assembly, for 2-way signal Quantity: <u> 1 </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
7 4	LED Lane Use Control signal/sign, 24-inch x 24-inch Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
7 5	LED Lane use control signal/sign, 36-inch x 36-inch #1 Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
7 6	LED Lane use control signal/Sign, 32-inch x 38-inch Tall #1 Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
7 7	LED Lane use control Message Sign, 30-inch x 39-inch Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
7 8	LED Lane use control Message Sign, 36-inch x 36-inch #2 Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
7 9	LED Lane use control signal, 30-inch x 36-inch Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
8 0	LED Lane use control signal, 32-inch x 38-inch Tall #2 Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/> Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
8 1	Loop Lead-In, 2-pair (priced in lengths of 1000 feet) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> No Bid
8 2	Loop Lead-In, 4-pair (priced in lengths of 5,000 feet) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> No Bid
8 3	Signal Cable, IMSA 20-1, 7 conductor, (1000 ft. Wooden Reel) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> No Bid
8 4	Signal Cable, IMSA 20-1, 16 conductor, (1000 ft. Wooden Reel) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> No Bid
8 5	Signal Cable, IMSA 19-1, 2-conductor w/o Shield (1000-ft) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> No Bid
8 6	Messenger Cable, 8M High Strength, (500 ft. Wooden Reel only) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> No Bid
8 7	Messenger Cable, 8M High Strength, (1000 ft. Wooden Reel only) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> No Bid

88	Messenger Cable, 10M High Strength, (500 ft. Wooden Reel only) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>				No Bid
89	Messenger Cable, 10M High Strength, (1000 ft. Wooden Reel only) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>				No Bid
90	Metal Cabinet Filter for 332 Cabinet, 12" x 16" x 1" Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price:	<input type="text" value="\$39.00"/>	Total:	<input type="text" value="\$39.00"/>
91	Metal Cabinet Filter for 336S Cabinet, 6" x 16" x 1" Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price:	<input type="text" value="\$35.00"/>	Total:	<input type="text" value="\$35.00"/>
92	Bi-Modal LED Traffic Signal Module, 12-inch, Yellow Arrow/Yellow Arrow Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price:	<input type="text" value="\$91.50"/>	Total:	<input type="text" value="\$91.50"/>
93	Traffic Bearing Junction Box w/Lid Quantity: <u> 1 </u>				No Bid
94	Signal Tether Clamp, Tri-Stud, breakaway, 2-parts Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price:	<input type="text" value="\$48.00"/>	Total:	<input type="text" value="\$48.00"/>
95	Sign Tether Bracket, Equivalent to PELCO SE-5046-19 Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price:	<input type="text" value="\$70.00"/>	Total:	<input type="text" value="\$70.00"/>
96	Sign Tether Bracket, Equivalent to PELCO SE-5046-24 Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price:	<input type="text" value="\$71.00"/>	Total:	<input type="text" value="\$71.00"/>
97	Strand Vise, 3/8 inch (Reliable 5152), no substitute Quantity: <u> 1 </u>				No Bid
98	Strand Vise, 5/16 inch (Reliable 5151), no substitute Quantity: <u> 1 </u>				No Bid
99	Strand Vise, 1/4 inch (Reliable 5150), no substitute Quantity: <u> 1 </u>				No Bid
100	Strand Link, 3/8 inch (Reliable 5002), no substitute Quantity: <u> 1 </u>				No Bid
101	Strand Link, 5/16 inch (Reliable 5001), no substitute Quantity: <u> 1 </u>				No Bid
102	Strand Link, 1/4 inch (Reliable 5000), no substitute Quantity: <u> 1 </u>				No Bid
103	Reducing Strand Link, 3/8 inch to 5/16 inch (Reliable #5022), no substitutes Quantity: <u> 1 </u>				No Bid

104	Construction and mounting hardware for four-way adjustable signal Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$240.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$240.00"/>
105	Construction and mounting hardware for three-way adjustable signal Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$230.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$230.00"/>
106	Construction and mounting hardware for two-way adjustable signal Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$183.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$183.00"/>
107	Tri-Bolt Span Wire Assembly Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$110.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$110.00"/>
108	School Sign Assembly Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$505.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$505.00"/>
109	School Sign Assembly with Time of Day Controller/Cabinet Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$1,290.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$1,290.00"/>
110	Aerial Cable Ties, Panduit PLT 3H TL100, per 1000 Quantity: <u> 1 </u> No Bid
111	Cable Ring, Copperweld, 2-inch, order = 500 Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> No Bid
112	Cable Ring, 3.5-inch, Copperweld Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> No Bid
113	Signal Bracket, Mast Arm, Vertical Mount, 120" cable, Cluster Design Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$260.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$260.00"/>
114	Signal Bracket, Mast Arm, Vertical Mount, 120" cable, for 12-12-12 signal Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$160.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$160.00"/>
115	Sign Bracket, Mast Arm, Vertical Mount, 24", 120" cable Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$110.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$110.00"/>
116	Sign Bracket, Mast Arm, Vertical Mount, 30", 120" cable Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$115.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$115.00"/>
117	Signal Bkt., Mast Arm, Horizontal Mount, 120" cable, 12-12-12 Std. Signal Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$150.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$150.00"/>
118	Signal Bracket, Mast Arm, Free Swinging Mount, 120" Cable Quantity: <u> 1 </u> Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$97.00"/> Total: <input type="text" value="\$97.00"/>

1 1 9	Power Supply, Solar Power: 200-watt, 12-VDC Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$175.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$175.00"/>
1 2 0	Iteris Vantage Universal Camera Mounting Bracket Quantity: <u> 1 </u>		No Bid
1 2 1	Mast Arm Mounting Assembly for Video Detection Cameras, 74" Tube Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$175.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$175.00"/>
1 2 2	Video Detection System (8-Phase) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$13,500.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$13,500.00"/>
1 2 3	Video Detection System (4-Phase) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$6,650.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$6,650.00"/>
1 2 4	Video Detection System (2-Phase) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$3,450.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$3,450.00"/>
1 2 5	Video Detection System (3-Phase) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$3,725.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$3,725.00"/>
1 2 6	Video Detection Processor Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$3,100.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$3,100.00"/>
1 2 7	Video Detection Extension Module Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$430.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$430.00"/>
1 2 8	Iteris LAM (Lens Adjustment Module) Quantity: <u> 1 </u>		No Bid
1 2 9	Iteris Versa Cam Package, Complete Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>		No Bid
1 3 0	PolyPhaser Surge Suppression Unit Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>		No Bid
1 3 1	Iteris Video Detection Color Camera Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>		No Bid
1 3 2	Video Detection/Power Composite Cable, #1, 500-ft on a wooden reel Quantity: <u> 1 </u>		No Bid
1 3 3	Video Detection/Power Composite Cable, #2, 1000-ft on a wooden reel Quantity: <u> 1 </u>		No Bid

1 3 4	Solar Powered School Speed Limit When Flashing Signal, TAPCO	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$4,690.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$4,690.00"/>
1 3 5	Solar Powered School Speed Limit When Flashing Signal, pole mount components, span wire mounted signals & sign, TAPCO	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$4,200.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$4,200.00"/>
1 3 6	Solar Powered School Speed Limit When Flashing Signal, pole mount components, mast arm mounted signals & sign, TAPCO	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$4,450.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$4,450.00"/>
1 3 7	Surge Arrestor (Digital Radio)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$67.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$67.00"/>
1 3 8	Accessible Pedestrian Detection System (8-Directions)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$4,700.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$4,700.00"/>
1 3 9	Accessible Pedestrian Detection System (4-Directions)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$2,400.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$2,400.00"/>
1 4 0	iNavigator #iN2 2-wire Push Button Station #1	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>		No Bid
1 4 1	iNavigator #iN2 2-wire Push Button Station #2	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>		No Bid
1 4 2	iNavigator Ped Head Control Unit Assy	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>		No Bid
1 4 3	ADA Push Button Adaptor, Polara #iN-90DEGADPTR w/Black Powdercoat	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>		No Bid
1 4 4	Astro Bracket, Pelco #AS3009, 120" stainless steel cable	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$105.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$105.00"/>
1 4 5	Lock Key, Corbin #2	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$7.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$7.00"/>
1 4 6	Police Panel Key, Long Shank	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$7.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$7.00"/>
1 4 7	Manual Operation Police Pushbuttons	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$50.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$50.00"/>

1 4 8	2070L Traffic Signal Controller with Software	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$2,995.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$2,995.00"/>
1 4 9	1C CPU Module, #1 (for 2070L Traffic Signal Controller)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$1,795.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$1,795.00"/>
1 5 0	1C CPU Module, #2 (for 2070L Traffic Signal Controller)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$895.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$895.00"/>
1 5 1	2A C1 Field I/O Module (for 2070L Traffic Signal Controller)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$700.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$700.00"/>
1 5 2	3B LCD Display Module (for 2070L Traffic Signal Controller)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$450.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$450.00"/>
1 5 3	4A Power Supply (for 2070L Traffic Signal Controller)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$390.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$390.00"/>
1 5 4	Solar Powered Crosswalk Lights, Active Beacon	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>		No Bid
1 5 5	Solar Powered 24-hour Flashing Beacon	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>		No Bid
1 5 6	LED Street Name Sign, See specifications	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$265.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$265.00"/>
	Supplier Notes: <input type="text" value="Minimum sign size is 48\"/>			
1 5 7	Tri-Stud Adaptor Kit	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$23.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$23.00"/>
1 5 8	Free Swinging Sign Hanger: 16-inch CTC, Pelco #SE-5117	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$98.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$98.00"/>
1 5 9	WX-SS-BP-0006 SmartSensor Six Sensor Preassembled Backplate with AC Power	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 6 0	WX-SS-BP-0004 SmartSensor Four Sensor Preassembled Backplate w/AC Power	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 6 1	WX-SS-BP-0002 SmartSensor Two Sensor Preassembled Backplate w/AC Power	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 6 2	WX-CLK-112 2 Channel Contact Closure Rack Card (Matrix or Advance)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>

1 6 3	WX-CLK-114 4 Channel Contact Closure Rack Card (Matrix or Advance)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 6 4	WX-CLK-201/202 24 VDC 2 A Power Supply	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 6 5	WX-CLK-204 24 VDC 4 A Power Supply	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 6 6	WX-CLK-210 Circuit Breaker 0.5 Amp	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 6 7	WX-CLK-210-02, Circuit Breaker 2.0 Amp	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 6 8	WX-CLK-222 Two Sensor Surge & Comm Module (Matrix & Advance)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 6 9	WX-CLK-223 One Sensor Surge & Comm Module (Matrix or Advance)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 7 0	WX-CLK-230 120 VAC Surge	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 7 1	WX-CLK-301 Serial to Ethernet converter	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 7 2	WX-CLK-304 RS 232 to RS 485 converter	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 7 3	WX-SS-200V, SmartSensor Advance Sensor (SS200V)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 7 4	WX-SS-225, SmartSensor Matrix Stop Bar Sensor (SS225)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 7 5	WX-SS-611, Heavy Duty Sensor Mount - 6" - 2 axis aluminum bracket	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 7 6	WX-SS-710, In Line Terminal strip junction box	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 7 7	WX-SS-704-020, SmartSensor Power and Communication Cable w/ Connector - 20 feet	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>

1 7 8	WX-SS-704-040, SmartSensor Power and Communication Cable w/ Connector - 40 feet	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 7 9	WX-SS-704-080, SmartSensor Power and Communication Cable w/ Connector - 80 feet	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 8 0	WX-SS-705-500, Bulk Cable Spool 500'	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 8 1	WX-100-0064 Din Rail 9"	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 8 2	WX-100-0065 Din Rail 12"	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 8 3	WX-100-0277, T-Bus Connector (Gray, Power only)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 8 4	WX-100-0281 RS-485/USB Mini-Converter (connects to laptop to Click!222 RS-485 bridge port)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 8 5	WX-205-0000 T-Bus Connector (Green, Power & Comm)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 8 6	WX-228-0020 T-Bus Left End Right Angle	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 8 7	WX-310-0014 RJ-11, White, 60 inch Patch Cord	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 8 8	WX-CLK-200 System Surge Protector (for 1 HD Sensor)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 8 9	WX-SS-101-0415, SmartSensor HD Sensor, Dual Radar Side Fire Sensor	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 9 0	WX-SS-701-020, SmartSensor HD Pigtail, Power/Comm. with Connector - 20 feet	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 9 1	WX-SS-701-040, SmartSensor HD Pigtail, Power/Comm. with Connector - 40 feet	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 9 2	WX-SS-706-500/707, HD SmartSensor 8-conductor Cable Spool, 500'	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>

1 9 3	WX-102-0462, Wavetronix Click 650/656 Mounting Shelf	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 9 4	Wavetronix Click!650 (item 102-0416)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 9 5	Wavetronix Click!656 (item 102-0451)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 9 6	Wavetronix SDLC Cable (item WX-SDLC-15/25)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="No response"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="No response"/>
1 9 7	UPS Battery Backup System (for 332D cabinet)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$2,950.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$2,950.00"/>
1 9 8	2070L Traffic Signal Controller without Software	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$2,100.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$2,100.00"/>
1 9 9	Surge Panel (Camera)	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$250.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$250.00"/>
2 0 0	LED Light Strip for Illuminated Street Name Sign	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$165.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$165.00"/>
2 0 1	Power Supply 24-volt for Illuminated Street Name Sign	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$130.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$130.00"/>
2 0 2	Photocontrol for Illuminated Street Name Sign	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$65.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$65.00"/>
2 0 3	LED 4-section Dual Red Traffic Signal, Horizontal Mount w/Mtg Hrdwre & Backplate	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$490.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$490.00"/>
2 0 4	332 Riser Base	Quantity: <u> 1 </u>	Unit Price: <input type="text" value="\$440.00"/>	Total: <input type="text" value="\$440.00"/>
2 0 5	Safetran 332D Control Cabinet	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>		No Bid
2 0 6	Gridsmart 8-phase Detection System with one camera	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>		No Bid
2 0 7	Gridsmart 8-phase Detection System with two cameras	Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>		No Bid

208	Gridsmart #GS-3-TEN (1.9" to 4.5" Tenon Bracket) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	No Bid
209	Gridsmart #GS-3-A78 (78" 90-Degree Mounting Arm Pole) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	No Bid
210	Gridsmart #GS-3-CBL (84" Cable Bracket) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	No Bid
211	Gridsmart #GS-3-GS2 (Gridsmart GS2 Processor) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	No Bid
212	Gridsmart #GS-3-CAM (Gridsmart Bell Camera) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	No Bid
213	Gridsmart #GS2-TS2-OPT (GS2 Processor TS2 Module) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	No Bid
214	Gridsmart #GS-3-PFM+ (Performance+ Module) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	No Bid
215	Gridsmart #GS-3-SMCH (Smart Connect - Hybrid Box) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	No Bid
216	Gridsmart #GS-3-EPM (Ethernet Protection Module) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	No Bid
217	Gridsmart #SMK Ball (Camera Mount Ball) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	No Bid
218	Gridsmart #GS-3-JUN (Junction Box) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	No Bid
219	Gridsmart #GS-3-SMK-CAM (Smartmountkit Camera) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	No Bid
220	Gridsmart #GS-3-C12 2070 Controller C12 (SDLC Cable) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	No Bid
221	Gridsmart One (1) #GS-3-Cat5e (Burial Grade Cat5e) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	No Bid
222	GGI Road and Traffic LED Quick Change Kit Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u>EA</u>	No Bid

2 2 3	Battery Backup System for 332 Cabinet (UPStealth 2) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	No Bid
2 2 4	UPStealth2 500-Watt Panel with all necessary cables Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	No Bid
2 2 5	Radar Speed Feedback Sign Assembly (see attached specification) Quantity: <u> 1 </u> UOM: <u> EA </u>	No Bid

Response Total: \$165,125.50