Bid 10-2024
guadmed
Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 10-2024

Title: EMS Supplies

Type: Competitive Bid

Issue Date: 1/16/2024

Deadline:  1/30/2024 02:00 PM (ET)

Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS
SOLICITATION. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE LINE
ITEMS TAB ONLY. PRICING WITHIN SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE
ACCEPTED AND MAY MAKE YOUR BID NON-RESPONSIVE.

Once you have completed and uploaded your bid package, you will
need to click "yes" on the attributes tab.

Contact Information

Contact: Jessica Allinder
Address: Procurement
Government Center Building
200 East Main Street
Room 338
Lexington, KY 40507
Email: jallinder@lexingtonky.gov
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quadmed Information

Contact: Dale Van Pelt
Address: 11210-1 Phillips Industrial Blvd East

Jacksonville, FL 32256

Phone:  (904) 880-2323
Toll Free: (800) 933-7334
Email: bids@quadmed.com

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED! By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent
and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached
bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

DALE VAN PELT bids@quadmed.com

Signature Emalil
Submitted at 1/30/2024 11:02:33 AM (ET)

Response Attachments

10-2024 Bid Package Signed.pdf

RFP 10-2024 completed bid package

Bid Attributes

1 | Bid package
Have you completed and attached your bid package? This is a contractual agreement and required for all bids.
YES
Bid Lines
1 | Elastic wrap
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.073 | Total: | $1.07 |
Supplier Notes: |Dynarex 3666 Elastic Bandage, 6" x 4.5yds, Non-Sterile, 10/bx price per each |
2 | Isopropyl Alcohol bottle
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.84 | Total: | $1.84 |
Supplier Notes: |Medplususa HDX D0022 Isopropyl Rubbing Alcohol, 70%, USP, 160z Bottle or equal |
3 [ Alcohol prep pad
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $0.0063| Total: | $0.01 |
Supplier Notes: | Alcohol Prep Sterile,Medium, 200/Bx (1113) MedSource MS-17402 price per each |
4 | Ammonia inhalant
Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price:l $0.026| Total:| $0.03|
Supplier Notes: | Ammonia Inhalant Pads 10/Bx Safetec 62022 Price per each |
Page 2 of 29 pages Vendor: quadmed Bid 10-2024




AED Plus/Pro adult pads

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $44.41 | Total: | $44.41 |

Supplier Notes: [ZOLL Stat-Padz Il HVP, Multi-Function Adult Electrodes (8900-0802-01) Zoll 1/EA |
6 | AED Plus/Pro pediatric pads

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price:l $104.71| Total:| $104.71|

Supplier Notes: | ZOLL Pedi-Padz Il Multi-Function Electrodes (8900-0810-01) 1/EA |
7 | Flexible fabric bandage 1" x 3"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $0.0176| Total: | $0.02 |

Supplier Notes: |Fabric Adhesive Bandage, 1" X 3", 100/bx Dynarex 3612 Price per each |
8 | Flexible fabric bandage 2" x 4.5"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $0.0827 | Total: | $0.08 |

Supplier Notes: |Adhesive Fabric Bandages, Sterile, 2" x 4 1/2" (3614) Dynarex Price per each |
9 | Flexible fabric bandage 3/4" x 3"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $0.013 | Total: | $0.01 |

Supplier Notes: |Adh Band Cloth 3/4 X 3, 100/Bx (3611) Dynarex 3611 Price per each |
% Battery AA

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: | $0.37 | Total: | $0.37 |

Supplier Notes: | Battery, AA Alkaline Duracell PGD PC1500BKDCS 1/EA |
% Battery AAA

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.42| Total:| $O.42|

Supplier Notes: |Battery, AAA Alkaline Duracell PGD PC2400BKDCS 1/EA |
% Battery C

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $O.92| Total:l $O.92|

Supplier Notes: | Battery, C Duracell PGD PC1400CS 1/EA |
% Battery 9V

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $1.32| Total:| $1.32|

Supplier Notes: |Battery, 9V Duracell PGD PC1604BKDCS 1 EA |
i Blunt Fill w/filter needle

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price:l $O.2998| Total:| $O.30|

Supplier Notes: |Filter Straws 18G.X 1-1/2" 100/bx (11811022F) Medplususa 1/EA |
% Bougie Flex Tip

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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Bougie Introducer, Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $4.34| Total:| $4.34|

Supplier Notes: [ET Introducer, Bougie, Adult, 15FR (4583) Dynarex 36261 1/EA |

Bougie Introducer, Ped.

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: | $4.34 | Total: | $4.34 |
Supplier Notes: |ET Introducer, Bougie, Pedi, 10FR (4582) Dynarex 36220 1/EA |

Broselow tape

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $30.49 | Total: | $30.49 |
Supplier Notes: | Broselow Pedi Tape 1/EA |

Non-vented Buretrol Solution Set, 105in L, With 150mL Interlink Burette, 2 Interlink Injection Sites

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Burn sheet
Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: $2.71 | Total: | $2.71 |

Supplier Notes: |Burn Sheet, Sterile, 60" x 90" Medsource MS-BS0033 1/EA |

BAAM air flow monitor

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $7.83] Total: | $7.83 ]
Supplier Notes: | Baam Beck Airway Flow Monitor Great Plains Ballistics Inc BAAM 1/EA |

BP cuff adult (Manual)
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $7.77 | Total: | $7.77 |

Supplier Notes: |Blood Pressure Unit, Latex-Free, Adult, Nylon Cuff, w/ Case Medsource MS-BP100 1/EA |

BP cuff large adult (Manual)

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $8.33| Total:| $8.33|

Supplier Notes: [Blood Pressure Unit, Latex-Free, Lg Adult, Nylon Cuff, w/ Case Medsource MS-BP200 1/EA |

BULB Syringe
Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $0.5422 | Total: | $0.54 |
Supplier Notes: |Bulb Syringe 2 Ounce (Blue) Medline DYND70280 1/EA |

BVM Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $8.94| Total:| $8.94|
Supplier Notes: |va, Adult Smiths (8500)Smiths 8500 1/EA |

BVM Peds
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $12.44| Total | $12.44 |

Supplier Notes: |BVM, Pedi Mask, 2500cc/ml Bag Volume, 10" O2 Tubing (36003) Dynarex, 36.003 |

Page 4 of 29 pages Vendor: quadmed Bid 10-2024




% C-collar Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $5.52 | Total: $5.52 |

Supplier Notes: | Perfit ACE Adj Extrication Collar (000281000) AMBU 281000 1/EA |
% C-collar Peds

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: | $5.52 | Total: $5.52 |

Supplier Notes: | Mini Perfit ACE Adj Extrication Collar (000281106) AMBU 281106 1/EA |
6 Nasal Cannula Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $0.31| Total: $0.31 |

Supplier Notes: [Nasal Cannula, Adult, Std Tips, 7' Tubing Medsource MS-2400. 1/EA |
8 Nasal Cannula Peds

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.32 | Total: $0.32 |

Supplier Notes: |Nasal Cannula, Pedi, 7' Tubing Dynarex 33122 1/EA |
% Cloth tape 1"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.766 | Total: $0.77 |

Supplier Notes: |Cloth Tape 1" 12/Bx (3562) Dynarex 3562 1/RL |
g Cloth tape 2"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $1.5321| Total: $1.53 |

Supplier Notes: |Cloth Surgical Tape, 2" x 10yds, 6/bx (3563) Dynartex 3563 1/RL |
g Self Adherent Wrap 2"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $0.5504 | Total: $0.55 |

Supplier Notes: | Cohesive Bandage, 2" x 5yds, Tan, Non-Sterile, 36/bx Dukal 8025T 1/RL |
3 Instant Cold pack

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $0.5497 | Total: $0.55 |

Supplier Notes: [Instant Cold Pack, 5" x 9", 24/cs (4512) Dynarex 1/EA |
g Colormetric CO2 detector Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $9.22 | Total: $9.22 |

Supplier Notes: [Westmed Co2 Easy (562134) SunMed 562134 1/EA |
g Colormetric CO2 detector Peds

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $9.22 | Total: $9.22 |

Supplier Notes: |Westmed Pedi Co2 Easy SunMed 562135 1/EA |
% CPAP large

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $56.33| Total: | $56.33 |

Supplier Notes: |GO-PAP Disp CPAP w/ Neb & Neb-Connect, 10LPM, 30% FiO2, Adult Lg Mask (313-4603NC)

Pulmodyne 1/EA
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3 [ CPAP medium
Quantity: 1

Supplier Notes:

UOM: EA Unit Price: $56.33| Total: | $56.33 |

GO-PAP Disp CPAP w/ Neb & Neb-Connect, 10LPM, 30% FiO2, Adult Md Mask (313-4602NC)
Pulmodyne 1/EA

3 | Decompression needle 10ga

Quantity: 1

UoM: EA Unit Price: | $7.69 | Total: | $7.69 |

Supplier Notes: | Decompression Needle, 10G x 3.25" (MS-87010) Medsource 1/EA |

4 | Defib pads X series Adult

Quantity: 1

UOM: EA Unit Price: | $18.24| Total: | $18.24 |

Supplier Notes: [Padpro Zoll Ad/Ch > 10kg pr (2516 Z) CONMED 2516 Z 1/PK |

Quantity: 1

11 Defib pads X series Peds
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $17.06| Total: | $17.06 |
Supplier Notes: |Padpro Zoll Inf < 10kg pr (2603 Z) CONMWED 2603 Z 1/PK |
421 Disinfectant Microdot Bleach Wipes

UOM: EA Unit Price: | $11.88| Total: | $11.88 |

Supplier Notes: |Microdot Bleach Wipe 160/Tub (600-12) Cambridge 600-12 1/EA |

4 | Disinfectant Microdot Wipes

3
Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: | $7.50 | Total: | $7.50 |
Supplier Notes: | Microdot MINUTE Wipes, 160/tub (601-12) Cambridge 601-12 1/EA |
j Disinfectant Spray (Steri-fab)

Quantity: 1

UOM: EA Unit Price: | $13.01| Total:| $13.01 |

Supplier Notes: |Cavicide Surface Disinfectant, 240z Spray Bottle (13-1024) Medplususa MET 13-1024 |

4 | E.T. Foam Tube Holder

5
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $2.24 | Total: | $2.24 |
Supplier Notes: | Tracheostomy Tube Holder (4620) Dynarex 4620 1/EA |
g Emergency Blanket (Mylar Heat Absorbing)
Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $0.46| Total:| $O.46|
Supplier Notes: |Heat Reflective Survival Wrap / Space Blanket Dukal 721 1 EA |
% Emergency Blanket (Water Resist.)

Quantity: 1

UoM: EA Unit Price: $1.81| Total:| $1.81|

Supplier Notes: | Dyn Yellow Blanket 54X80 (3519)Dynarex 3519 1/EA |

4 | Emesis basin

Quantity: 1

UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.1928 | Total: | $0.19 |

Supplier Notes: |Emesis Basin 500Cc Medline DYND80327 1/EA |
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o

Emesis/belonging bag (12-pk)

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Price: | $0.1489 | Total: | $0.15 |

Supplier Notes: |Patient Belongings Bags 250/Cs (8010) Medplususa NWI DSPB2 |
8 Endotrol Kit 6.0

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
? Endotrol Kit 7.0

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g Endotrol Kit 8.0

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g Epistaxis Clamp

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:| $12.20| Total:l $12.20|

Supplier Notes: |Spirometer Nose Clips, Disp, 20/pk (3304) McKesson 3304/90273 |
5 | EC unit O2 bag
4 _ :

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g ECG electrodes (50-pk)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price:l $3.53| Total:| $3.53|

Supplier Notes: |Vermed ZBrand ECG Electrodes-Square, 50/pouch (Z35-50) Vermed |
g ET 2.5 w/stylets

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $1.17 | Total: | $1.17 |

Supplier Notes: |ET, Uncuffed, 2.5mm Medsource MS-23125 1/EA |
; ET 3.0 w/o stylets

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.90| Total:| $O.90|

Supplier Notes: |[ET 3.0mm Cuffed (100/100/030) Smiths 1/EA |
g ET 3.0 w/stylets

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $3.97 | Total: | $3.97 |

Supplier Notes: |3.0mm Cuffed ET Tube with Stylette (1-7343-30) Sunmed 1/Ea |
g ET 3.5 w/o stylets

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $0.90| Total:| $O.90|

Supplier Notes: |ET 3.5mm Cuffed (100/100/035) Smiths 1/EA |
8 ET 3.5 w/stylets

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $4.67| Total: | $4.67 |

Supplier Notes: |3.5mm Cuffed ET Tube with Stylette (1-7343-35) Sunmed 1/Ea |
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ET 4.0 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $0.90 | Total: $0.90 |

Supplier Notes: [ET, Cuffed, 4.0mm (4538) Smiths 1/EA |

ET 4.0 wistylet

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price:l $3.97| Total: $3.97|

Supplier Notes: |4.0mm E.T. Tube W/Stylette Cuf (1-7343-40) Sunmed 1/EA |

ET 4.5 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $0.90 | Total: $0.90 |

Supplier Notes: |ET, Cuffed, 4.5mm (4539) Smiths |

ET 4.5 wistylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:| $3.97| Total: $3.97|

Supplier Notes: [4.5mm E.T. Tube W/Stylette Cuf (1-7343-45) Sunmed 1/ea |

ET 5.0 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $0.90| Total: $O.90|

Supplier Notes: |ET, Cuffed, 5.0mm Smiths 1/EA |

ET 5.0 wistylet

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price:l $3.97| Total: $3.97|

Supplier Notes: |5.0mm E.T. Tube W/Stylette Cuf (038-976-050U) Sunmed 1/EA |

ET 5.5 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $0.90 | Total: $0.90 |

Supplier Notes: |Smiths AIRCARE Cuffed ET, 5.5mm (100/100/055) Smiths 1/EA |

ET 5.5 wistylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $3.97| Total: $3.97|

Supplier Notes: |5.5mm E.T. Tube W/Stylette Cuf (1-7343-55) sunmed 1/EA |

ET 6.0 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $0.90| Total: $O.90|

Supplier Notes: [ET, Cuffed, 6.0mm Smiths 1/EA |

ET 6.0 wistylet

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price:l $3.97| Total: $3.97|

Supplier Notes: |6.0mm E.T. Tube W/Stylette Cuf (1-7343-60) Sunmed 1/EA |

ET 6.5 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $0.90 | Total: $0.90 |

Supplier Notes: |ET, Cuffed, 6.5mm Smiths 1/EA |
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ET 6.5 wistylet

2

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.97 | Total: $3.97 |

Supplier Notes: [6.5mm E.T. Tube W/Stylette Cuf Sunmed 1/EA |
g ET 7.0 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: $0.90 | Total: $0.90 |

Supplier Notes: [ET, Cuffed, 7.0mm Smiths 1/EA |
Z ET 7.0 wistylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $3.97| Total: $3.97|

Supplier Notes: |7.0mm E.T. Tube W/Stylette Cuf (1-7343-70) Sunmed 1/EA |
g ET 7.5 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $0.90| Total: $O.90|
g ET 7.5 wistylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $0.90| Total: $0.90|

Supplier Notes: |7.5mm E.T. Tube W/Stylette Cuff Sunmed 1/EA |
; ET 8.0 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $3.97| Total: $3.97|

Supplier Notes: |Smiths AIRCARE Cuffed ET, 8.0mm (100/100/080)Smiths 1/EA |
g ET 8.0 wistylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $3.97 | Total: $3.97 |

Supplier Notes: [8.0mm E.T. Tube W/Stylette Cuf Sunmed 1/EA |
g ET 9.0 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.90 | Total: $0.90 |

Supplier Notes: |ET, Cuffed, 9.0mm Smiths 1/EA |
8 ET 9.0 wistylet

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price:l $3.97| Total: $3.97|

Supplier Notes: [9.0mm E.T. Tube W/Stylette Cuf (1-7343-90) Sunmed 1/Ea |
Eli ETCO2 Nasal Cannula (Peds.)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $5.64 | Total: | $5.64 |

Supplier Notes: |Medsource ETCO2/02 Oral/Nasal Cann W/O2, 7', Pedi (MS-35601P) MS-35601P |
g ETCO2 Filter line

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $5.64 | Total: | $5.64 |

Supplier Notes: |Medsource Inline ETCO2 Sampling Line, 7' W/T-Conn, (MS-35770) |
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8 | ETC02 Nasal Cannula (Adult)

3
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.08| Total:| $5.08|
Supplier Notes: |Medsource Capnography C0O2/02 Oral/Nasal Cannula,7' w/Ref Luer, (MS-35601A) |
8 | EZIO 15mm (pink)
4 _ .
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
8 | EZIO 25mm (blue)
5 _ :
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
8 | EZIO 45mm (yellow)
6 _ .
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g Normal Saline 0.9% Flushes 10ml box of 100
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: $70.59 | Total: | $70.59 |
Supplier Notes: |10mL USP Sodium Chloride in 10mL Prefilled Syringe 240/cs (IVF1010TM) Amsino |
g French Suction 06
Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $0.24| Total:| $O.24|
Supplier Notes: |Suction Cath 6FR, Whistle Tip, Thumb Control Dynarex 32000 1/EA |
8 French Suction 08
Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $0.24 | Total: | $0.24 |
Supplier Notes: |Suction Cath 8FR, Whistle Tip, Thumb Control Dynarex 32001 1/EA |
8 French Suction 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.24 | Total: | $0.24 |
Supplier Notes: [Suction Cath 10FR, Whistle Tip, Thumb Control Dynarex 32002 1/EA |
? French Suction 12
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.24| Total: | $0.24 |
Supplier Notes: |Suction Cath 12FR, Whistle Tip, Thumb Control Dynarex 32003 1/EA |
g French Suction 14
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.27| Total:| $O.27|
Supplier Notes: |Suction Cath 14FR, Whistle Tip, Thumb Control Dynarex 32004 1/EA |
g French Suction 16
Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $0.24 | Total: | $0.24 |
Supplier Notes: |Suction Cath 16FR, Whistle Tip, Thumb Control Dynarex 32005 1/EA |
2 French Suction 18
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.24 | Total: | $0.24 |
Supplier Notes: |Suction Cath 18FR, Whistle Tip, Thumb Control Dynarex 32006 1/EA |
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Gauze 3x4 pad (nhon-adherent)

5
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $9.23| Total: $9.23|
Supplier Notes: |Nonadh Telfa Pad, 3 X 4, 50Bx (1050) Medplususa KEN 1050 |
g Gauze 4x4 box of 20
Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Price:l $1.57| Total: $1.57|
Supplier Notes: |S 4X4, 8-Ply 2'S 25 Pk/Bx (3342)Dynarex 1/BX |
g Gauze 4x4 Sponges (Sterile)
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $2.17| Total: $2.17|
Supplier Notes: |S 4X4, 12-Ply 2'S, 25 Pk/Bx (MPR-60574) Dynarex 1/BX |
593 Gauze 5x9 box of 20
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price:| $2.29| Total: $2.29|
Supplier Notes: | St Dressing 5 X 9, 20/Bx (3501) Dynarex 1/BX |
8 Gauze 8x10 box of 20
Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Price: $1.52 | Total: $1.52 |
Supplier Notes: | St Dressing 8 X 10, 24/Bx (3503) Dynarex 1/EA |
% Nitrile Gloves Extra Large box of 100
0 |Quantity: 1 uom: EA Price: | $4.30| Total: $4.30 |
Supplier Notes: | Sempermed Semperforce Blue Nitrile, XI 100/bx 10/cs (BLNF105) |
% Nitrile Gloves Large box of 100
1|Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: | $4.30| Total: $4.30 |
Supplier Notes: |Sempermed Semperforce Blue Nitrile, Lg 100/bx 10/cs (BLNF104) |
% Nitrile Gloves Medium box of 100
2 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: | $4.30 | Total: $4.30 |
Supplier Notes: |Sempermed Semperforce Blue Nitrile, Md 100/bx 10/cs (BLNF103) |
% Nitrile Gloves Small box of 100
3 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: | $4.30| Total: $4.30 |
Supplier Notes: |Sempermed Semperforce Blue Nitrile, Sm 100/bx 10/cs (BLNF102) |
% Precision Glucometer
4 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $30.12] Total: $30.12
Supplier Notes: | Precision Xtra Meter Abbott |
% Precision Glucometer Battery
5 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $1.16 | Total: $1.16 |
Supplier Notes: |CR2032 Energizer 3V Lithium (LiMnO2) Coin Cell Battery |
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OO

Precision Glucometer Control Solution

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $9.67 | Total: | $9.67 |
Supplier Notes: | Precision Xtra / Optium EZ Blood Glucose High / Low Control Solution, 2/bx (80139-04) |

% Precision Glucometer Test Strips

7 | Quantty: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: | $64.09| Total: | $64.09 |
Supplier Notes: | Precision Xtra Blood Glucose Test Strips, 50/bx (9969565) |

% Hand sanitizer - 8 0z containers

8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $3.83 | Total: | $3.83 |
Supplier Notes: |Pure|| Hand Sani 8 Oz. Bottle GOJO !/EA |

% Head Immobilizer Adult Foam roll

9 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.07 | Total: | $5.07 |
Supplier Notes: |ltec Multi-Grip Head Immobilizer., Adult ITEC 1/EA |

% Head Immobilizer Child Foam roll

0 |Quantity: _1 uom: EA Unit Price: $5.07] Total: | $5.07 |
Supplier Notes: | Pedi. Multi-Grip Head Immob. ITEC 1/EA |

% Hot pack

1|Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $17.93| Total: | $17.93 |
Supplier Notes: |Heat Pack Instant, 24/cs (4516) Dynarex 1/CS |

% Hypodermic Needle 25 ga

2 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $8.06 | Total: | $8.06 |
Supplier Notes: |Hypo Needle 25G X 1" 100/bx (1188825100) Medplususa |

% HyFin chest seal

3 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $9.96 | Total: | $9.96 |
Supplier Notes: |Hyfin Chest Seal (10-0015) NAR |

% Igel #1

4 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $15.90 | Total: | $15.90 |
Supplier Notes: [i-gel Supraglottic Airway, Neonate, #1.0, 2-5kg, 5-11lbs (8201000) Intersurgical |

% Igel #1.5

5| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $15.90 | Total: | $15.90 |
Supplier Notes: |i—gel Supraglottic Airway, Infant, #1.5, 5-12kg, 11-25Ibs (8215000) Intersurgical |

% Igel #2

6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $15.90 | Total: | $15.90 |
Supplier Notes: |i-gel Supraglottic Airway, Sm Pedi, #2.0, 10-25kg, 22-55Ibs (8202000) Intersurgical |
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% Igel #3

7 |Quantity: _ 1 uom: EA Unit Price: $30.68] Total: | $30.68 |
Supplier Notes: |i-gel Supraglottic Airway, Sm Adult, #3.0, 30-60kg, 65-130Ibs (8203000) Intersurgical |

% Igel #4

8 | Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: $13.98| Total: | $13.98 |
Supplier Notes: |i-gel Supraglottic Airway, Md Adult, #4.0, 50-90kg, 110-200Ibs (8204000) Intersurgical |

% Igel #5

9 | Quantity: 1 uOM: EA Unit Price: $15.35| Total: | $15.35 |
Supplier Notes: |i-gel Supraglottic Airway, Lg Adult, #5.0, 90+kg, 200+Ibs (8205000) Intersurgical |

% Igel Foam Tube Holder

0| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $63.55| Total: | $63.55 |
Supplier Notes: |i-gel Airway Support Strap, 10/bx (8800000) Intersurgical |

% Conterra Intubation roll

1 |Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: | $57.84| Total: | $57.84 |
Supplier Notes: |Conterra King Airway Organizer (KAR1) 1/EA |

% Irrigation 1L Saline Bottle

2 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

% Introcan IV Cath box of 50 18ga

3 | Quantity: 1 uom: EA Price: | $83.82| Total: | $83.82 |
Supplier Notes: |Introcan IV Cath 18G 50/bx (4252560-02) NE Medical Supply 1/BX |

% Introcan IV Cath box of 50 20ga

4 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: | $83.82| Total: | $83.82 |
Supplier Notes: |Introcan IV Cath 20G 50/bx (4252535-02)NE Medical Supply 1/BX |

% Introcan IV Cath box of 50 14ga

5|Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: | $89.86 | Total: | $89.86 |
Supplier Notes: |Introcan IV Cath 14G X 1.25" 50/bx (4251890-02)NE Medical Supply 1/BX |

% Introcan IV Cath box of 50 16ga

6 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: | $116.18 | Total: | $116.18 |
Supplier Notes: [Introcan Safety IV Cath 16G x 1.25" FEP (4252586-02)NE Medical Supply 1/BX |

% Introcan IV Cath box of 50 22ga

7 |Quantity: 1 uom: EA Price: | $83.82| Total: | $83.82 |
Supplier Notes: |Introcan IV Cath 22G 50/bx (4252519-02)NE Medical Supply 1/BX |
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Introcan IV Cath box of 50 24ga

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: | $120.00| Total: | $120.00 |
Supplier Notes: [Introcan IV Cath 24G 50/bx (4252500-02)NE Medical Supply 1/BX |

% IV Set with Needle Free Y Site, 1 Luer Connector, 10 Drop, 83in L

9 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $1.11 | Total: | $1.11 |
Supplier Notes: [Amsino 10 Drop Needless 83" (108306) 1/EA |

% IV Set with Needle Free Y Site, 1 Luer Connector, 60 Drop, 83in L

0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $1.12 | Total: | $1.12 |
Supplier Notes: |Amsino 60 Drop Micndl 83" (608306) 1/EA |

% IV Extension Set (7")

1|Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $0.9412 | Total: | $0.94 |
Supplier Notes: |Amsino IV Ext Set, 8", Needle-Free Male LL Connector, Pinch Clamp, (AE3108) 1/EA |

% IV Start Kit

2 | Quantity: 1 uoMm: EA Unit Price: $2.31| Total: | $2.31 |
Supplier Notes: [IV Start Kit w/Tegaderm, 10mL PF Flush Syringe, Amsino Ext. Set, Sterile 1/EA QuadMed Assembly |

% Kling 2" (Non-sterile)

3 |Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: $1.83] Total: | $1.83 |
Supplier Notes: |Conforming Stretch Gauze, Basic Care, 2", Non-Sterile, 12/bag Dukal 8517 1/BG |

% Kling 4" (Non-sterile)

4 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.65 | Total: | $1.65 |
Supplier Notes: |Conforming Stretch Gauze, Basic Care, 4", Non-Sterile, 12/bag Dukal 8519 1/BG |

% Kling 4" Bulk (Sterile)

5 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.01 | Total: | $3.01 |
Supplier Notes: |Conforming Stretch Gauze, Basic Care, 4", Sterile, 12/bx Dukal 8515 1/BG |

% Kling 6" (Non-sterile)

6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.36| Total: | $1.36 |
Supplier Notes: | Conforming Stretch Gauze, Basic Care, 6", Non-Sterile, 6/bagDukal 85201/BG |

% Lactated Ringers 1L bag

7 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

% Lactated Ringers 500cc bag

8 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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Lancets (box of 100)

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Price: | $4.71 | Total: | $4.71 |
Supplier Notes: [Microdot Pro Lancet 23G x 2.2mm 100/bx (523-10) Cambridge |

i Laryngoscope Handle (disp.)

0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $8.73 | Total: | $8.73 |
Supplier Notes: |Rusch DispoLED Single-Use Fiber Optic Laryn. Handle, 20/case (77700) priced 1/EA |

411 Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mac 0

1 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.61 | Total: | $4.61 |
Supplier Notes: |Green System Laryngoscope Blade, MAC 0, Stainless, Disp (5060) 1/ea |

3.1 Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mac 1

2 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.61 | Total: | $4.61 |
Supplier Notes: |Green System Laryngoscope Blade, MAC 1, Stainless, Disp (5061) |

%{ Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mac 2

3| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.61| Total: | $4.61 |
Supplier Notes: |Green System Laryngoscope Blade, MAC 2, Stainless, Disp (5062) |

i Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mac 3

4 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.61| Total: | $4.61 |
Supplier Notes: |Green System Laryngoscope Blade, MAC 3, Stainless, Disp (5063) |

411 Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mac 4

5 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.61 | Total: | $4.61 |
Supplier Notes: |Green System Laryngoscope Blade, MAC 4, Stainless, Disp (5064) |

3.1 Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mac 5

6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $5.72| Total: | $5.72 |
Supplier Notes: |Rusch Polaris FO Laryngoscope Blade, Mac 5 (4150150) |

%{ Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mil 0

7 | Quantity: 1  UOM: EA Unit Price:l $4.61| Total:| $4.61|
Supplier Notes: |Green System Laryngoscope Blade, MIL 0, Stainless, Disp (6060) |

i Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mil 1

8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.61 | Total: | $4.61 |
Supplier Notes: |Green System Laryngoscope Blade, MIL 1, Stainless, Disp (6061) |

411 Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mil 2

9 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.61 | Total: | $4.61 |
Supplier Notes: |Green System Laryngoscope Blade, MIL 2, Stainless, Disp (6062) |
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Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mil 3
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.61|

Total:

$4.61 |

Supplier Notes: |Green System Laryngoscope Blade, MIL 3, Stainless, Disp (6063)

ROl

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mil 4

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: $4.61|

Total:

$4.61 |

Supplier Notes: |Green System Laryngoscope Blade, MIL 4, Stainless, Disp (6064)

N Ol

Laryngoscope bulb large

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $l.57|

Total:

$1.57 |

Supplier Notes: | Laryngoscope Bulb Large

WOl

Laryngoscope bulb small

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.57|

Total:

$1.57 |

Supplier Notes: | Laryngoscope Bulb Small

N3, TN

Ligature
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

o101

Lube packet
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.69|

Total:

$5.69 |

Supplier Notes: [Lubricating Jelly 3Gm 144/Bx (877) Dukal

OO~

McGrath Battery
Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $42.86|

Total:

$42.86 |

Supplier Notes: |Mcgrath Mac 3.6V Battery

~uie

McGrath Blade X3 (Diff. Airway)
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $12.25|

Total:

$12.25 |

Supplier Notes: | Mcgrath X3 (Diff. Airway)Disp Blade

OO

McGrath Blade 1
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $10.75|

Total:

$10.75 |

Supplier Notes: |Mcgrath #1 Mac Disp Blade

o1~

McGrath Blade 2
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $10.75|

Total:

$10.75 |

Supplier Notes: |Mcgrath #2 Mac Disp Blade

oo

McGrath Blade 3
Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $10.75|

Total:

$10.75 |

Supplier Notes: |Mcgrath #3 Mac Disp Blade
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McGrath Blade 4

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $10.75| Total: | $10.75 |
Supplier Notes: |Mcgrath #4 Mac Disp Blade |
% Omni Pro X medic bag
2 | Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: $287.44| Total: | $287.44 |
Supplier Notes: [OMNI PRO X Complete Infection Control BLS / ALS Total System, Red (M8101F) |
(15 Versa Pro X medic bag
3 | Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: $149.94| Total: | $149.94 |
Supplier Notes: |V.E.R.S.A. PRO X Complete Infection Control, High-Vis Yellow (M8127HV) |
1 | Medication Infusion Labels
6 :
4 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Adenosine 6mg/2ml
5 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Albuterol 2.5mg/2ml
6 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Amiodarone 150mg/3mi
7 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Aspirin 81mg/ea
8 [Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Atropine, 0.1mg/mL, 10mL Luer Jet Prefilled Syringe
9 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Calcium Chloride, 100mg/mL, 10mL Luer Jet Prefilled Syringe
0 [Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Dexamethasone 10mg/1ml
1 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Diltiazem, 100mg, Add-Vantage Vial
2 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Diltiazem 100cc bag for mix
3 [Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Diphenhydramine 50mg/1ml
4 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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% Meds Dopamine Hydrochloride and 5% Dextrose, 400mg/250mL, 250mL Bag

5 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Dextrose 10%, 250mL Bag

6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Epi 1:1 Img/iml

7 | Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Epi 1:10 1mg/10ml

8 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Ipratropium Bromide .5mg/2ml

9 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Lidocaine HCI, 4mg/mL, in 5% Dextrose, 500mL Bag

0 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Lidocaine 100mg/10ml

1 |Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Magnesium Sulfate 1G/2ml

2 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Narcan IV 2mg/1ml

3 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Narcan Nasal 2 sprayer pack 4mg

4 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Nitroglycerin Sublingual .4mg/tablet

5 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Nitro-Paste Packet 1GM/48pack

6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Oral Glucose (Individual) 159

7 | Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Sodium bicarb 1meqg/50ml

8 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Meds Toradol 30mg/1ml

9 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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% Meds TXA 1G/10ml

0 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

% Meds Zofran IV 4mg/2ml

1 |Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

% Meds Zofran Oral Disintegrating Tablet (0.4mg)

2 | Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid

% Patient Transporter (1800 Ibs)

3 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $15.24 | Total: | $15.24 |
Supplier Notes: |MedSource Advanced Patient Mover, 1800Ib Capacity, 14 Handles (MS-95202) |

% Medication Atomizer Device (MAD)

4 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $7.18 | Total: | $7.18 |
Supplier Notes: |MAD Nasal Intranasal Mucosal Atomization Device w/ 3mL Syringe (MAD100) Teleflex |

% Nail Polish Remover

5 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.43 | Total: | $1.43 |
Supplier Notes: |Nail Polish Remover Pad, 100/bx Dukal 862 |

% Nebulizer Mask Adult

6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.94 | Total: | $0.94 |
Supplier Notes: [Neb Kit, Adult, Aerosol Mask, 7' 02 Tubing Dynarex |

% Nebulizer Mask Peds

7 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $1.30 | Total: | $1.30 |
Supplier Notes: |Neb Kit, Pedi, Aerosol Mask, 7' O2 Tubing (5603/34122) Dynarez |

% Needle Cricothyrotomy Kit

8 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

% Non-rebreather Adult

9 |Quantity: 1 uOM: EA Unit Price: $0.86| Total: | $0.86 |
Supplier Notes: |Complete Non-Rebreather Mask, Adult, 7' Tubing Medsource MS-25060 |

% Non-rebreather Peds

0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.90 | Total: | $1.90 |
Supplier Notes: |Non-Rebreather Mask, Pedi, Elongated, 7' Tubing Medsource MS-2508 |

% Normal Saline 100cc bag

1 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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Normal Saline 050cc bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

% Normal Saline 250cc bag

3 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

% Normal Saline 500cc bag

4 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

% NPA 12

5| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $2.29| Total: $2.29|
Supplier Notes: [Rusch PVC Nasal Airway, 12Fr x 60mm (123312) |

% NPA 14

6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $2.29 | Total: $2.29 |
Supplier Notes: |Rusch PVC Nasal Airway, 14Fr x 72mm (123314) |

% NPA 16

7 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $2.29 | Total: $2.29 |
Supplier Notes: |Rusch PVC Nasal Airway, 16Fr x 85mm (123316) |

% NPA 18

8 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $2.29| Total: $2.29|
Supplier Notes: |Rusch PVC Nasal Airway, 18Fr x 105mm (123318) |

% NPA 20

9 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:l $2.29| Total: $2.29|
Supplier Notes: [Rusch PVC Nasal Airway, 20Fr x 115mm (123320) |

% NPA 22

0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $2.29 | Total: $2.29 |
Supplier Notes: |Rusch PVC Nasal Airway, 22Fr x 125mm (123322) |

% NPA 24

1 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $2.29 | Total: $2.29 |
Supplier Notes: |Rusch PVC Nasal Airway, 24Fr x 130mm (123324) |

% NPA 26

2 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $2.29 | Total: $2.29 |
Supplier Notes: |Rusch PVC Nasal Airway, 26Fr x 140mm (123326) |

% NPA 28

3 | Quantity: 1  UOM: EA Unit Price:l $2.29| Total: $2.29|
Supplier Notes: |Rusch PVC Nasal Airway, 28Fr x 155mm (123328) |
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% NPA 30

4 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $2.29| Total: | $2.29 |
Supplier Notes: |Rusch PVC Nasal Airway, 30Fr x 165mm (123330) |

% NPA 32

5| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $2.29 | Total: | $2.29 |
Supplier Notes: |Rusch PVC Nasal Airway, 32Fr x 170mm (123332) |

% NPA 34

6 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $2.29 | Total: | $2.29 |
Supplier Notes: |Rusch PVC Nasal Airway, 34Fr x 175mm (123334) |

% OB kit

7 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $10.07 | Total: | $10.07 |
Supplier Notes: |O.B. Kit Bag Assy W/Scissors QuadMed Assembly EFA-54001599 1/KT |

% OPA 040mm

8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.28| Total: | $0.28 |
Supplier Notes: |Berman Oral Airway, 40mm, Neonatal, Pink, Individually-Packaged |

% OPA 050mm

9 | Quantity: 1  UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.28 | Total: | $0.28 |
Supplier Notes: |Berman Oral Airway, 50mm, Infant, Light Green/Blue, Individually-Packaged |

% OPA 060mm

0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.28 | Total: | $0.28 |
Supplier Notes: |Berman Oral Airway, 60mm, Child, Black, Individually-Packaged |

% OPA 070mm

1| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.28 | Total: | $0.28 |
Supplier Notes: |Berman Oral Airway, 70mm, Large Child, White, Individually-Packaged |

% OPA 080mm

2 | Quantity: 1 uoMm: EA Unit Price: $0.28| Total: | $0.28 |
Supplier Notes: [Berman Oral Airway, 80mm, Small Adult, Green, Individually-Packaged |

% OPA 090mm

3 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.28 | Total: | $0.28 |
Supplier Notes: |Berman Oral Airway, 90mm, Medium Adult, Yellow, Individually-Packaged |

% OPA 100mm

4 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.28 | Total: | $0.28 |
Supplier Notes: |Berman Oral Airway, 100mm, Large Adult, Red, Individually-Packaged |
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% OPA 110mm

5|Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.28| Total: | $0.28 |
Supplier Notes: |Berman Oral Airway, 110mm, XLarge Adult, Orange, Individually-Packaged |

% 02 regulator

6 |Quantity: 1 uOM: EA Unit Price: | $38.40| Total: | $38.40 |
Supplier Notes: |[CGA870 Regulator, 0-25lpm, 1 Barb, 2 DISS, 50 PSI (AREG8725-B2D-BU) Meret |

% Pen light

7 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $5.00 | Total: | $5.00 |
Supplier Notes: | Disp Pen Lites 6/pk Dynarex 4781 |

% Hydrogen Peroxide bottle

8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.57 | Total: | $0.57 |
Supplier Notes: |Hydrogen Peroxide, 3%, 40z Bottle |

% PEEP Valve (Adult)

9 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.33| Total: | $3.33 |
Supplier Notes: |Peep Valve 30mm (199002020) AMBU |

% PEEP Valve (Peds.)

0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $3.33 | Total: | $3.33 |
Supplier Notes: |Peep Valve 20 w/ 22mm Adapter (199003020) AMBU |

% Disposable Razor

1 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $0.11 | Total: | $0.11 |
Supplier Notes: | Twin Blade Disp Prep Razor Dynarex 4250 price per EA |

2 | Red IV start kit bag

3 _ :

2 [ Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid

% Rigid Suction Catheters (Ducanto)

3 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $2.66 | Total: | $2.66 |
Supplier Notes: [SSCOR DuCanto Cath (200-00002C) |

% Safety Needle 18ga

4 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $14.24| Total:| $14.24 |
Supplier Notes: [Safety Needles 18G X 1" 50/bx (8881850810) |

% Safety Needle 22ga

5| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $14.24| Total: | $14.24 |
Supplier Notes: |Magellan Hypodermic Safety Needle, Black, 22G x 1", 50/bx (8881850210) |
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Sam |0 Driver

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $134.12| Total: $134.12|
Supplier Notes: [SAM |0 Driver (I0700-EN) |

% Sam |0 15 mm Needle (Pink)

7 |Quantty: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: | $66.76 | Total: $66.76 |
Supplier Notes: [SAM 10 15mm Needle (10705-1P-EN) |

% Sam 10 25 mm Needle (Blue)

8 | Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: | $66.76 | Total: $66.76 |
Supplier Notes: [SAM 10 25mm Needle (I0706-1P-EN) |

% Sam 10 45 mm Needle (Yellow)

9 |Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $66.76 | Total: $66.76 |
Supplier Notes: [SAM 10 45mm Needle, Yellow (10707-1P-EN) |

% Scoop Stretcher Straps

0 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

% 6.9 Qt. Sharps Container (Large)

1| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:l $9.22| Total: $9.22|
Supplier Notes: |BD Sharps Collector, 6.9 Qt, Medium, Red (305489) |

i 1 Qt. Sharps Container (Med Bag)

2 | Quantity: 1 uoMm: EA Unit Price: | $4.82| Total: $4.82 |
Supplier Notes: |Pro Tec Sharps Cont. 1 Qt. |

i Spider straps

3 |Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: | $82.64| Total: $82.64 |
Supplier Notes: | Spider Strap Nylon Multi-Color (EP-506) |

ézl Spit Sock W/Hood

4 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:| $2.70| Total: $2.70|
Supplier Notes: | Spit Sock Hoods |

% Sterile Water 250 mL

5 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

% Stethoscope

6 | Quantity: _1  UOM: EA Unit Price: $2.71| Total: $2.71|
Supplier Notes: | Dualhead Stethoscope, 22? ?Y? Tubing, Black |
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% Stopcock 3 way

7 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:l $0.81| Total: $O.81|
Supplier Notes: |3 Way Stopcock W/Swiv Male LL (MX5311L) |

i Stylets Adult

8 | Quantity: 1  UOM: EA UnitPrice:l $2.52| Total: $2.52|
Supplier Notes: |Rusch Flexi-Slip Stylette, 10Fr x 335mm, Tube 4.0-6.5 (502503) |

i Stylets Ped

9 |Quantity: 1 uOM: EA Unit Price: | $2.99| Total: $2.99 |
Supplier Notes: |Rusch Slick Stylette, Child, 8Fr x 420mm, Tube 4.0-6.5 (750) |

% Suction Canister 800ml

0 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $2.22| Total: $2.22 |

2 | Suction Canister Truck mounted

5 _ :

1 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid

% Suction Lid Buggy Portable

2 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2 | Suction Lid Truck mounted

5 _ :

3 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

% Suction Manual Pump w/cannister 500m|

4 |Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $24.10| Total: $24.10 |
Supplier Notes: |Manual Suction Pump (MS-001PMP) |

% Surgical masks (Box of 50)

5| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: | $2.56| Total: $2.56 |
Supplier Notes: |Procedure Mask, Earloops, 50/pk (91019P3) |

% Syringe 0lcc w/ Luer Lock

6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:l $14.49| Total: $14.49|
Supplier Notes: [1mL Syringe, LL, 100/bx |

% Syringe 01cc with needle

7 | Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: | $33.36| Total: $33.36 |
Supplier Notes: |Magellan Safety 1ML 23G x 1" 50/bx (8881811310) |

% Syringe 03cc w/ Luer Lock

8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $8.00| Total: $8.00 |
Supplier Notes: |3mL Syringe LL Tip 100/bx |
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Syringe 03cc with needle

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $14.79 | Total: | $14.79
Supplier Notes: | Magellan Hypodermic Safety Needle and Syringe Combination, Pink, 3mL, 18G x 1", 50/bx
(8881833810)

% Syringe 10cc w/Luer Lock

0 |Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: $10.59 | Total: | $10.59 |
Supplier Notes: |10mL Syringe, LL, 100/bx (6990) |

% Syringe 50cc w/Luer Lock

1 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $11.53 | Total: | $11.53 |
Supplier Notes: |60mL Syringe, LL, 25/bx (6993) |

% Aluminum splint

2 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2.91 | Total: | $2.91 |
Supplier Notes: |Padded Aluminum Splint, 36" x 4.25", Rolled, Orange |

% SSCOR suction canister (Engine)

3 | Quantity: 1  UOM: EA Unit Price: | $32.00 | Total: | $32.00 |
Supplier Notes: |Canister Replacement for Quickdraw - Barbed Tip (2488-20) |

% Transparent Film Dressing 2"x2.75"

4 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $23.50| Total:| $23.50 |
Supplier Notes: [Tegaderm 2-3/8" X 2-3/4 100/Bx |

% Welch-Allyn Thermometer

5 |Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $321.71| Total: | $321.71]
Supplier Notes: |Suretemp Plus Model 690 Electronic Thermometer, Oral Probe, Oral Probe Well (01690-200/410) |

% Welch-Allyn Thermometer probe cover

6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $10.95| Total: | $10.95 |
Supplier Notes: | SureTemp Disp Thermometer Probe Covers, 1 Sleeve of 250 Covers (05031-750) |

% Transpore tape 1" roll

7 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $10.24 | Total: | $10.24 |
Supplier Notes: |3M Transpore Surgical Tape, 1" x 10 Yds, 12/bx |

% Trauma dressing 10"x30"

8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.86 | Total: | $0.86 |
Supplier Notes: | Multi-Trauma Dressing, Sterile, 12" x 30" |

% Trauma Shears (Black)

9 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.83 | Total: | $0.83 |

Supplier Notes: [EMT Shears 7 1/4" Black |
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% Trauma Shears (X-Shears)

0|Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $95.93| Total: | $95.93 |
Supplier Notes: [Leatherman Raptor Trauma Shears (831741) |

% Triangular bandage

1|Quantity: 1 UoMm: EA Unit Price: | $4.82] Total: | $4.82 |
Supplier Notes: |Triangu|ar Bandage, Woven Cotton Muslin, 40" x 40" x 56", Non-Sterile, 12/pack |

% Triple antibiotic ointment packet

2 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $14.46 | Total: | $14.46 |
Supplier Notes: | Triple Antibiotic Pk 144/Bx |

% Tru-Cuff Bulb Inflator Syringe

3 | Quantity: 1 uOM: EA Unit Price: $134.11| Total: | $134.11 ]
Supplier Notes: | Ds66 Trigger Aner W/ Ad Cuff |

% Thomas Select Tube Holder Adult

4 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $3.59 | Total: | $3.59 |
Supplier Notes: [ Thomas Select Tube Holder (600-40000) |

% Thomas Select Tube Holder Peds

5| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $2.87 | Total: | $2.87 |
Supplier Notes: | Thomas ET Tube Holder, Pedi (600-20000) |

% Window Punch

6 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $5.00 | Total: | $5.00 |
Supplier Notes: |Window Punch 5 1/2" (Gold Brass) |

% Zoll paper roll 80mm

7 | Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: | $35.29| Total: | $35.29 |
Supplier Notes: |ZOLL X-Series Paper, 80mm, Red Grid, 6/pk (8000-0876-01) |

% Zoll Adhesive Pulse Ox. (Ad./Neo)

8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $14.71 | Total: | $14.71 |
Supplier Notes: [Masimo M-LNCS Infant Disp Sensor 3' (2513) |

% Zoll Adhesive Pulse Ox. (Pedi)

9 |Quantity: 1 uOM: EA Unit Price: | $13.53| Total: | $13.53
Supplier Notes: |Masimo M-LNCS Infant Disp Sensor 3' (2513) |

% Zoll BP Cuff, 07 Infant

0 |Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: | $21.40 | Total: | $21.40 |
Supplier Notes: |ZOLL X Series NIBP Cuff, Reusable, Locking Connector, 2-Tube, Infant (REUSE-07-2MQ) |
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—ooN

Zoll BP Cuff, 09 Ped
Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $24.27 | Total: | $24.27 |

Supplier Notes: [ZOLL X Series NIBP Cuff, Reusable, Locking Connector, 2-Tube, Child (REUSE-09-2MQ) |

g Zoll BP Cuff, 10 Sm Adult

2 | Quantity: 1 uoMm: EA Unit Price: $23.00| Total: | $23.00 |
Supplier Notes: |ZOLL X Series NIBP Cuff, Reusable, Locking Connector, 2-Tube, Small Adult (REUSE-10-2MQ) |

% Zoll BP Cuff, 11 Adult

3 |Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: $17.65| Total: | $17.65 |
Supplier Notes: |ZOLL X Series NIBP Cuff, Reusable, Locking Connector, 2-Tube, Adult (REUSE-11-2MQ) |

223 Zoll BP Cuff, 12 Lg Adult

4 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $26.99 | Total: | $26.99 |
Supplier Notes: [ZOLL X Series NIBP Cuff, Reusable, Locking Connector, 2-Tube, Large Adult (REUSE-12-2MQ) |

E23 Zoll BP Cuff, 13 Thigh

5| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $31.61 | Total: | $31.61 |
Supplier Notes: [ZOLL X Series NIBP Cuff, Reusable, Locking Connector, 2-Tube, Thigh (REUSE-13-2MQ) |

% Tactical Mechanical Tourniquet

6 | Quantty: 1 uOM: EA Unit Price: | $24.03| Total: | $24.03 |
Supplier Notes: |C.A.T. Tourniquet Tactic Black (30-0001) |

% Fleece Blanket 60x90"

7 | Quantty: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: | $8.21| Total: | $8.21 |
Supplier Notes: |Tay|or Light Weight Fleece Blanket, Navy, 60?7 x 807 (60-NFB6080) |

223 15 gallon red biohazard bags

8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $45.84| Total | $45.84 |
Supplier Notes: |Biohazard Waste Bag, Red, 24" x 32", 250/cs (45-54) |

E23 Armboard large 3x18

9 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $1.65 | Total: | $1.65 |
Supplier Notes: [IV Armboards 3" X 18" |

S Armboard medium 3x9

0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.47 | Total: | $0.47 |
Supplier Notes: [IV Armboards 3" X 9" |

6 Armboard small 1x4

1|oQuantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $39.43| Total: | $39.43 |

Supplier Notes: [IV Armboards 1" X 4" 50/cs |
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NON

Backboard 71x15.75x.85

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:l

$117.15| Total:

| $117.15 |

Supplier Notes: [MedSource Deluxe Backboard, Green (MS-93000)

WON

Disposable gown

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:l

$66.27 | Total:

| $66.27 |

Supplier Notes: | Impervious Gown Blue 50/Cs (303BL)

~ON

Cyanokit 5 gm hydroxycobalamin
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

U1ON

Disposable shoe covers

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$6.02 | Total:

| $6.02 |

Supplier Notes: | Spunbond Shoe Cover 50/Bx (2131)

DON

Faceshield with eyeguard

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$36.14 | Total:

| $36.14 |

Supplier Notes: |Face Shield 50/Box (2202)

~NON

Ferno 65EXL Scoop Stretcher

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:l

$1,474.02| Total:

| $1,474.02 |

Supplier Notes: [Ferno Scoop EXL Stretcher, Yellow (00065EXL)

QQON

Iron Duck folding backboard

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:l

$286.57 | Total:

| $286.57 |

Supplier Notes: |UItra Space Sav Backboard, Y (35940)

OON

Ketamine 500mg/5ml
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

oow

Fentanyl 100mcg/2ml
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

—ROWw

Midazolam 5mg/5m
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

NOW

Magill Forceps (Adult)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$4.39 | Total:

| $4.39 |

Supplier Notes: |Magi|| Forceps Adult

wWow

Magill Forceps (Peds.)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$4.39| Total:

| $4.39 |

Supplier Notes: |Magill Forceps - Ped 8"
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Multi-cuff BP Kit
Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price:l $69.41| Total:| $69.41|

Supplier Notes: |Blood Pressure Kit, 5 Cuffs, Orange (MS-MED50) |

8 Finger Tip Pulse Ox.

5| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $23.47| Total: | $23.47 |
Supplier Notes: |Finger Pulse Oximeter, Economy (YM101) |

8 Ringer Cutter

6 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA UnitPrice:l $6.08| Total:| $6.08|
Supplier Notes: |Ring Cutter |

8 Slishman Traction Splint (Adult)

7 |Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: | $194.44| Total: | $194.44 |
Supplier Notes: [Slishman Traction Splint (STS) GEN 2 (10-5000) |

8 Sager Traction Splint

8 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

8 SSCORT Jr. Suction Cannister

9 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: | $32.00| Total: | $32.00 |
Supplier Notes: |Canister Replacement for Quickdraw - Barbed Tip (2488-20) |

;f N95 mask with port

0 |Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: | $493.37| Total: | $493.37 |
Supplier Notes: |FLUIDSHEILD N95 Particulate Filter Respirator, Safety Seal Film, 35/bx, 6bx/case (46767) priced

1/CS

3 | Spider Straps

1 _ .

1 |Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Response Total: $6,773.34
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