
Bid 10-2024

THE PUBLIC SAFETY STORE, LLC

Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 10-2024
Title: EMS Supplies
Type: Competitive Bid
Issue Date: 1/16/2024
Deadline: 1/30/2024 02:00 PM (ET)
Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS

SOLICITATION. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE LINE
ITEMS TAB ONLY. PRICING WITHIN SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE
ACCEPTED AND MAY MAKE YOUR BID NON-RESPONSIVE.
 
Once you have completed and uploaded your bid package, you will
need to click "yes" on the attributes tab.

Contact Information

Contact: Jessica Allinder
Address: Procurement

Government Center Building
200 East Main Street
Room 338
Lexington, KY 40507

Email: jallinder@lexingtonky.gov
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THE PUBLIC SAFETY STORE, LLC Information

Contact: GREG COSS
Address: 2009 FAMILY CIR STE 3

LEXINGTON, KY 40505
Phone: (800) 646-1086
Fax: (877) 975-1064
Email: BIDS@THEPUBLICSAFETYSTORE.COM
Web Address: WWW.THEPUBLICSAFETYSTORE.COM

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED! By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent
and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached
bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

AMDANA LAWSON BIDS@THEPUBLICSAFETYSTORE.COM
Signature Email

Submitted at 1/29/2024 01:26:05 PM (ET)

Response Attachments

20240129scan.pdf

BID RESPONSE

Bid Attributes

1 Bid package

Have you completed and attached your bid package?  This is a contractual agreement and required for all bids.

 YES 

Bid Lines

1 Elastic wrap

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.60 Total: $0.60

2 Isopropyl Alcohol bottle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $4.25 Total: $4.25

3 Alcohol prep pad

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.04 Total: $0.04

4 Ammonia inhalant

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.95 Total: $0.95

5 AED Plus/Pro adult pads

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $130.00 Total: $130.00

6 AED Plus/Pro pediatric pads

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $130.00 Total: $130.00
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7 Flexible fabric bandage 1" x 3"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.20 Total: $0.20

8 Flexible fabric bandage 2" x 4.5"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.19 Total: $0.19

9 Flexible fabric bandage 3/4" x 3"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.24 Total: $0.24

1
0

Battery AA

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.75 Total: $0.75

1
1

Battery AAA

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.75 Total: $0.75

1
2

Battery C

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.80 Total: $0.80

1
3

Battery 9V

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.95 Total: $0.95

1
4

Blunt Fill w/filter needle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
5

Bougie Flex Tip

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $8.50 Total: $8.50

1
6

Bougie Introducer, Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $8.50 Total: $8.50

1
7

Bougie Introducer, Ped.

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $9.50 Total: $9.50

1
8

Broselow tape

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $35.00 Total: $35.00

1
9

Non-vented Buretrol Solution Set, 105in L, With 150mL Interlink Burette, 2 Interlink Injection Sites

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
0

Burn sheet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $7.00 Total: $7.00

2
1

BAAM air flow monitor

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
2

BP cuff adult (Manual)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $14.75 Total: $14.75
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2
3

BP cuff large adult (Manual)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $14.75 Total: $14.75

2
4

BULB Syringe

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.25 Total: $1.25

2
5

BVM Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $10.50 Total: $10.50

2
6

BVM Peds

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $15.00 Total: $15.00

2
7

C-collar Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $14.90 Total: $14.90

2
8

C-collar Peds

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $14.90 Total: $14.90

2
9

Nasal Cannula Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.75 Total: $0.75

3
0

Nasal Cannula Peds

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.75 Total: $0.75

3
1

Cloth tape 1"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.25 Total: $1.25

3
2

Cloth tape 2"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.30 Total: $1.30

3
3

Self Adherent Wrap 2"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.70 Total: $0.70

3
4

Instant Cold pack

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.75 Total: $0.75

3
5

Colormetric CO2 detector Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
6

Colormetric CO2 detector Peds

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
7

CPAP large

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
8

CPAP medium

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Vendor: THE PUBLIC SAFETY STORE, LLC Bid 10-2024Page 4 of 22 pages



3
9

Decompression needle 10ga

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

4
0

Defib pads X series Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $160.00 Total: $160.00

4
1

Defib pads X series Peds

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $160.00 Total: $160.00

4
2

Disinfectant Microdot Bleach Wipes

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $18.00 Total: $18.00

4
3

Disinfectant Microdot Wipes

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $18.00 Total: $18.00

4
4

Disinfectant Spray (Steri-fab)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $36.00 Total: $36.00

4
5

E.T. Foam Tube Holder

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

4
6

Emergency Blanket (Mylar Heat Absorbing)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $7.80 Total: $7.80

4
7

Emergency Blanket (Water Resist.)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $8.00 Total: $8.00

4
8

Emesis basin

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.35 Total: $0.35

4
9

Emesis/belonging bag (12-pk)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

5
0

Endotrol Kit 6.0

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

5
1

Endotrol Kit 7.0

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

5
2

Endotrol Kit 8.0

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

5
3

Epistaxis Clamp

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

5
4

EC unit O2 bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $75.00 Total: $75.00
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5
5

ECG electrodes (50-pk)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

5
6

ET 2.5 w/stylets

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

5
7

ET 3.0 w/o stylets

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

5
8

ET 3.0 w/stylets

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

5
9

ET 3.5 w/o stylets

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

6
0

ET 3.5 w/stylets

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

6
1

ET 4.0 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

6
2

ET 4.0 w/stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

6
3

ET 4.5 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

6
4

ET 4.5 w/stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

6
5

ET 5.0 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

6
6

ET 5.0 w/stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

6
7

ET 5.5 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

6
8

ET 5.5 w/stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

6
9

ET 6.0 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

7
0

ET 6.0 w/stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Vendor: THE PUBLIC SAFETY STORE, LLC Bid 10-2024Page 6 of 22 pages



7
1

ET 6.5 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

7
2

ET 6.5 w/stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

7
3

ET 7.0 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

7
4

ET 7.0 w/stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

7
5

ET 7.5 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

7
6

ET 7.5 w/stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

7
7

ET 8.0 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

7
8

ET 8.0 w/stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

7
9

ET 9.0 w/o stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

8
0

ET 9.0 w/stylet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

8
1

ETCO2 Nasal Cannula (Peds.)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.85 Total: $0.85

8
2

ETC02 Filter line

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

8
3

ETC02 Nasal Cannula (Adult)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

8
4

EZIO 15mm (pink)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

8
5

EZIO 25mm (blue)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

8
6

EZIO 45mm (yellow)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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8
7

Normal Saline 0.9% Flushes 10ml box of 100

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

8
8

French Suction 06

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

8
9

French Suction 08

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

9
0

French Suction 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

9
1

French Suction 12

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

9
2

French Suction 14

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

9
3

French Suction 16

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

9
4

French Suction 18

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

9
5

Gauze 3x4 pad (non-adherent)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2.60 Total: $2.60

9
6

Gauze 4x4 box of 20

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: $2.85 Total: $2.85

9
7

Gauze 4x4 Sponges (Sterile)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.75 Total: $1.75

9
8

Gauze 5x9 box of 20

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: $3.90 Total: $3.90

9
9

Gauze 8x10 box of 20

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: $2.50 Total: $2.50

1
0
0

Nitrile Gloves Extra Large box of 100

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: $6.25 Total: $6.25

1
0
1

Nitrile Gloves Large box of 100

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: $6.25 Total: $6.25

1
0
2

Nitrile Gloves Medium box of 100

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: $6.25 Total: $6.25
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1
0
3

Nitrile Gloves Small box of 100

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: $6.25 Total: $6.25

1
0
4

Precision Glucometer

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
0
5

Precision Glucometer Battery

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
0
6

Precision Glucometer Control Solution

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
0
7

Precision Glucometer Test Strips

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
0
8

Hand sanitizer - 8 oz containers

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $3.20 Total: $3.20

1
0
9

Head Immobilizer Adult Foam roll

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
1
0

Head Immobilizer Child Foam roll

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
1
1

Hot pack

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.00 Total: $1.00

1
1
2

Hypodermic Needle 25 ga

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
1
3

HyFin chest seal

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $10.15 Total: $10.15

1
1
4

Igel #1

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
1
5

Igel #1.5

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
1
6

Igel #2

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
1
7

Igel #3

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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1
1
8

Igel #4

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
1
9

Igel #5

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
2
0

Igel Foam Tube Holder

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
2
1

Conterra Intubation roll

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
2
2

Irrigation 1L Saline Bottle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
2
3

Introcan IV Cath box of 50 18ga

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
2
4

Introcan IV Cath box of 50 20ga

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
2
5

Introcan IV Cath box of 50 14ga

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
2
6

Introcan IV Cath box of 50 16ga

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
2
7

Introcan IV Cath box of 50 22ga

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
2
8

Introcan IV Cath box of 50 24ga

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
2
9

IV Set with Needle Free Y Site, 1 Luer Connector, 10 Drop, 83in L

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
3
0

IV Set with Needle Free Y Site, 1 Luer Connector, 60 Drop, 83in L

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
3
1

IV Extension Set (7")

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
3
2

IV Start Kit

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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1
3
3

Kling 2" (Non-sterile)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
3
4

Kling 4" (Non-sterile)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
3
5

Kling 4" Bulk (Sterile)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
3
6

Kling 6" (Non-sterile)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
3
7

Lactated Ringers 1L bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
3
8

Lactated Ringers 500cc bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
3
9

Lancets (box of 100)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
4
0

Laryngoscope Handle (disp.)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
4
1

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mac 0

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
4
2

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mac 1

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
4
3

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mac 2

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
4
4

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mac 3

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
4
5

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mac 4

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
4
6

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mac 5

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
4
7

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mil 0

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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1
4
8

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mil 1

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
4
9

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mil 2

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
5
0

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mil 3

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
5
1

Laryngoscope blade (disp.) Mil 4

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
5
2

Laryngoscope bulb large

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
5
3

Laryngoscope bulb small

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
5
4

Ligature

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
5
5

Lube packet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
5
6

McGrath Battery

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
5
7

McGrath Blade X3 (Diff. Airway)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
5
8

McGrath Blade 1

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
5
9

McGrath Blade 2

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6
0

McGrath Blade 3

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6
1

McGrath Blade 4

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6
2

Omni Pro X medic bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $325.00 Total: $325.00
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1
6
3

Versa Pro X medic bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $460.00 Total: $460.00

1
6
4

Medication Infusion Labels

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6
5

Meds Adenosine 6mg/2ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6
6

Meds Albuterol 2.5mg/2ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6
7

Meds Amiodarone 150mg/3ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
6
8

Meds Aspirin 81mg/ea

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2.25 Total: $2.25

1
6
9

Meds Atropine, 0.1mg/mL, 10mL Luer Jet Prefilled Syringe

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
7
0

Meds Calcium Chloride, 100mg/mL, 10mL Luer Jet Prefilled Syringe

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
7
1

Meds Dexamethasone 10mg/1ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
7
2

Meds Diltiazem, 100mg, Add-Vantage Vial

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
7
3

Meds Diltiazem 100cc bag for mix

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
7
4

Meds Diphenhydramine 50mg/1ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
7
5

Meds Dopamine Hydrochloride and 5% Dextrose, 400mg/250mL, 250mL Bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
7
6

Meds Dextrose 10%, 250mL Bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
7
7

Meds Epi 1:1 1mg/1ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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1
7
8

Meds Epi 1:10 1mg/10ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
7
9

Meds Ipratropium Bromide .5mg/2ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
8
0

Meds Lidocaine HCl, 4mg/mL, in 5% Dextrose, 500mL Bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
8
1

Meds Lidocaine 100mg/10ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
8
2

Meds Magnesium Sulfate 1G/2ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
8
3

Meds Narcan IV 2mg/1ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
8
4

Meds Narcan Nasal 2 sprayer pack 4mg

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
8
5

Meds Nitroglycerin Sublingual .4mg/tablet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
8
6

Meds Nitro-Paste Packet 1GM/48pack

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
8
7

Meds Oral Glucose (Individual) 15g

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
8
8

Meds Sodium bicarb 1meq/50ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
8
9

Meds Toradol 30mg/1ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
9
0

Meds TXA 1G/10ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
9
1

Meds Zofran IV 4mg/2ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
9
2

Meds Zofran Oral Disintegrating Tablet (0.4mg)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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1
9
3

Patient Transporter (1800 lbs)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $22.00 Total: $22.00

1
9
4

Medication Atomizer Device (MAD)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
9
5

Nail Polish Remover

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.08 Total: $0.08

1
9
6

Nebulizer Mask Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
9
7

Nebulizer Mask Peds

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
9
8

Needle Cricothyrotomy Kit

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

1
9
9

Non-rebreather Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.55 Total: $1.55

2
0
0

Non-rebreather Peds

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.60 Total: $1.60

2
0
1

Normal Saline 100cc bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
0
2

Normal Saline 050cc bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
0
3

Normal Saline 250cc bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
0
4

Normal Saline 500cc bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
0
5

NPA 12

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
0
6

NPA 14

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
0
7

NPA 16

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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2
0
8

NPA 18

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
0
9

NPA 20

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
1
0

NPA 22

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
1
1

NPA 24

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
1
2

NPA 26

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
1
3

NPA 28

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
1
4

NPA 30

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
1
5

NPA 32

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
1
6

NPA 34

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
1
7

OB kit

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
1
8

OPA 040mm

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
1
9

OPA 050mm

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
2
0

OPA 060mm

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
2
1

OPA 070mm

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
2
2

OPA 080mm

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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2
2
3

OPA 090mm

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
2
4

OPA 100mm

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
2
5

OPA 110mm

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
2
6

O2 regulator

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $12.00 Total: $12.00

2
2
7

Pen light

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $2.00 Total: $2.00

2
2
8

Hydrogen Peroxide bottle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.90 Total: $0.90

2
2
9

PEEP Valve (Adult)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
3
0

PEEP Valve (Peds.)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
3
1

Disposable Razor

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
3
2

Red IV start kit bag

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
3
3

Rigid Suction Catheters (Ducanto)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
3
4

Safety Needle 18ga

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
3
5

Safety Needle 22ga

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
3
6

Sam IO Driver

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
3
7

Sam IO 15 mm Needle (Pink)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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2
3
8

Sam IO 25 mm Needle (Blue)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
3
9

Sam IO 45 mm Needle (Yellow)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
4
0

Scoop Stretcher Straps

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
4
1

6.9 Qt. Sharps Container (Large)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
4
2

1 Qt. Sharps Container (Med Bag)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
4
3

Spider straps

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
4
4

Spit Sock W/Hood

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
4
5

Sterile Water 250 mL

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
4
6

Stethoscope

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
4
7

Stopcock 3 way

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
4
8

Stylets Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
4
9

Stylets Ped

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
5
0

Suction Canister 800ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
5
1

Suction Canister Truck mounted

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
5
2

Suction Lid Buggy Portable

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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2
5
3

Suction Lid Truck mounted

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
5
4

Suction Manual Pump w/cannister 500ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
5
5

Surgical masks (Box of 50)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Price: $0.25 Total: $0.25

2
5
6

Syringe 01cc w/ Luer Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
5
7

Syringe 01cc with needle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
5
8

Syringe 03cc w/ Luer Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
5
9

Syringe 03cc with needle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
6
0

Syringe 10cc w/Luer Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
6
1

Syringe 50cc w/Luer Lock

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
6
2

Aluminum splint

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
6
3

SSCOR suction canister (Engine)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
6
4

Transparent Film Dressing 2"x2.75"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
6
5

Welch-Allyn Thermometer

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
6
6

Welch-Allyn Thermometer probe cover

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
6
7

Transpore tape 1" roll

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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2
6
8

Trauma dressing 10"x30"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
6
9

Trauma Shears (Black)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
7
0

Trauma Shears (X-Shears)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $27.00 Total: $27.00

2
7
1

Triangular bandage

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
7
2

Triple antibiotic ointment packet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
7
3

Tru-Cuff Bulb Inflator Syringe

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
7
4

Thomas Select Tube Holder Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
7
5

Thomas Select Tube Holder Peds

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
7
6

Window Punch

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $5.50 Total: $5.50

2
7
7

Zoll paper roll 80mm

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
7
8

Zoll Adhesive Pulse Ox. (Ad./Neo)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
7
9

Zoll Adhesive Pulse Ox. (Pedi)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
8
0

Zoll BP Cuff, 07 Infant

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
8
1

Zoll BP Cuff, 09 Ped

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
8
2

Zoll BP Cuff, 10 Sm Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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2
8
3

Zoll BP Cuff, 11 Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
8
4

Zoll BP Cuff, 12 Lg Adult

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
8
5

Zoll BP Cuff, 13 Thigh

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
8
6

Tactical Mechanical Tourniquet

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $9.00 Total: $9.00

2
8
7

Fleece Blanket 60x90"

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
8
8

15 gallon red biohazard bags

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
8
9

Armboard large 3x18

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
9
0

Armboard medium 3x9

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
9
1

Armboard small 1x4

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
9
2

Backboard 71x15.75x.85

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
9
3

Disposable gown

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.75 Total: $0.75

2
9
4

Cyanokit 5 gm hydroxycobalamin

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
9
5

Disposable shoe covers

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.20 Total: $0.20

2
9
6

Faceshield with eyeguard

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $0.05 Total: $0.05

2
9
7

Ferno 65EXL Scoop Stretcher

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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2
9
8

Iron Duck folding backboard

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

2
9
9

Ketamine 500mg/5ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
0
0

Fentanyl 100mcg/2ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
0
1

Midazolam 5mg/5ml

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
0
2

Magill Forceps (Adult)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
0
3

Magill Forceps (Peds.)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
0
4

Multi-cuff BP Kit

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
0
5

Finger Tip Pulse Ox.

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
0
6

Ringer Cutter

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
0
7

Slishman Traction Splint (Adult)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
0
8

Sager Traction Splint

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
0
9

SSCORT Jr. Suction Cannister

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

3
1
0

N95 mask with port

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1.75 Total: $1.75

3
1
1

Spider Straps

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Response Total: $1,838.60
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