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Item # Qty UOM Item Description Additional Description AMK Southern Tait
Kenwood TK-5410K2 with KMC-41M lapel mic OR Motorola
APX6000Li 1.5 with PMNN4062A lapel mic OR Tait TP9155 with TPA- |10 year warranty and all required
[tem #1 400 EA AA-203 lapel mic accessories included No Bid $ 2,591.88 | $ 2.589.00
Kenwood TK-5410K3 with KMC-41M lapel mic OR Motorola APX6000
3.5 with PMNN4062A lapel mic OR Tait TP9160 with TPA-AA-203 10 year warranty and all required
ltem #2 150 EA lapel mic accessories included No Bid $ 2,719.75 | $ 2,685.00
ltem #3 N/A EA Keyloader for AES Encryption No Bid $ 393.75 [ $ 2,500.00
ltem #4 N/A EA Set of programming/maintenance software & cables No Bid $ 200.00 | $ 250.00
Kenwood TK-5910 with KCH-15M control head OR Motorola
APX6500Li with O5 standard control head OR Harris M7300 Scan OR |10 year warranty and all required
ltem # 5 250 EA Tait TM9155 accessories included No Bid $ 3,45453 | $ 3,000.00
Kenwood TK-5410K2 with KMC-41M lapel mic OR Motorola
APX6000Li 1.5 with PMNN4062A lapel mic OR Tait TP9155 with TPA- |standard warranty and all required
Item #6 400 EA AA-203 lapel mic accessories included No Bid $ 1,756.25 | $ 1,747.00
Kenwood TK-5410K3 with KMC-41M lapel mic OR Motorola APX6000
3.5 with PMNN4062A lapel mic OR Tait TP9160 with TPA-AA-203 standard warranty and all required
ltem #7 150 EA lapel mic accessories included No Bid $ 2,570.05 | $ 2.100.00
Kenwood TK-5910 with KCH-15M control head OR Motorola
APX6500Li with O5 standard control head OR Harris M7300 Scan OR |standard warranty and all required
ltem #8 250 EA Tait TM9155 accessories included No Bid $ 2,110.38 | $ 2,087.00
Percentage
Item #9 N/A Discount |Percentage Discount off of list price for all catalog portable accessories|Enter 10% as .10 No Bid No Bid 25%
Percentage
Item #10 N/A Discount |Percentage Discount off of list price for all catalog mobile accessories |Enter 10% as .10 No Bid No Bid 25%
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