¥ LEXINGTON

RFP-6-2026
Integrated Services Inc.
Integrated Services Inc. of KY
Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: RFP-6-2026

Title: Storm and Disaster Response and Recovery Services and Equipment
Type: Request For Proposal

Issue Date: 2/23/2026

Deadline:  3/10/2026 02:00 PM (ET)

Contact Information

Contact: Todd Slatin

Address: Central Purchasing
Government Center Building
200 East Main Street
Lexington, KY 40507

Phone:  (859) 2583320

Fax: (859) 2583322

Email: tslatin@lexingtonky.gov
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Integrated Services Inc. Information

Contact: Kevin Downs
Address: 13100 Rehl Road
Louisville, KY 40299
Phone: (502) 413-1729
Email: kevin.downsisi@ GMAIL.COM

Web Address: http://integratedservicesinc.us/

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED! By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent

and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached
bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

Kevin Downs kevin.downsisi@gmail.com

Signature Emalil
Submitted at 3/10/2026 12:13:14 PM (ET)

Response Attachments

Fayette Co Disaster Experience References.pdf
References

Fayette Co Disaster Bid Response.pdf
Bid Response

Bid Lines

1 | Motor Graders w/blade & escort/safety vehicle 125HP or less

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid
2 | Motor Graders w/blade & escort/safety vehicle 126HP - 175HP

Quantity: 1  UOM: HR No Bid
3 | Motor Graders w/blade & escort/safety vehicle 176HP - 250HP

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid
4 | Motor Graders w/blade & escort/safety vehicle 251HP or larger

Quantity: 1  UOM: HR No Bid
5 | Front-End Loader/Wheel Loader 40HP or less

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $125.00| Total: | $125.00 |
6 | Front-End Loader/Wheel Loader 41HP - 74HP

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $125.00| Total: | $125.00 |
7 | Front-End Loader/Wheel Loader 75HP - 109HP

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: HR Price:l $135.00| Total:| $135.00|
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Front-End Loader/Wheel Loader 110HP - 199HP

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: HR Price: | $275.00 | Total: $275.00 |
9 | Front-End Loader/Wheel Loader 200HP or larger

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $350.00| Total: $350.00 |
% Front-End Loader - Other (i.e. Loader w/grapple, shaker, etc. please specify)

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $285.00 | Total: $285.00 |

Supplier Notes: |Loader with grapple |
% Combo Backhoe/Loader 40HP or less

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: HR Price: | $125.00 | Total: $125.00 |
% Combo Backhoe/Loader 41HP -70HP

Quantity: 1 uUoM: HR Price: | $150.00 | Total: $150.00 |
% Combo Backhoe/Loader 71HP - 89HP

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $150.00 | Total: $150.00 |
%{ Combo Backhoe/Loader 90HP or larger

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: HR Price: | $150.00 | Total: $150.00 |
% Combo Backhoe/Loader Other (i.e. Loader w/grapple, Hoe Ram etc. please specify)

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $285.00| Total: $285.00 |

Supplier Notes: |Loader with grapple |
% Dump Truck with Snowplow Single Rear Axle W/out spreader (26,000 GVWR or larger)

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $150.00 | Total: $150.00 |
% Dump Truck with Snowplow Single Rear Axle WITH spreader (26,000 GVWR or larger)

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: HR Price: | $375.00 | Total: $375.00 |
% Dump Truck with Snowplow Multiple-Rear Axle W/out spreader (26,000 GVWR or larger)

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $150.00 | Total: $150.00 |
% Dump Truck with Snowplow Multiple-Rear Axle WITH spreader (26,000 GVWR or larger)

Quantity: 1  UOM: HR No Bid
% Dump Truck for debris hauling capacity: Less than Ten (10) yards

Quantity: 1 uUoM: HR Price: | $150.00 | Total: $150.00 |
% Dump Truck for debris hauling capacity: 11 - 19 yards

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $175.00| Total: $175.00 |
% Dump Truck for debris hauling capacity: 20 - 29 yards

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: HR Price: | $200.00 | Total: $200.00 |
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2 | Dump Truck for debris hauling capacity: 30 or more yards

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $200.00| Total: | $200.00 |
421 Truck With Snowplow (7'min.) 4WD W/Salt Spreader (1.75yd min.) *Must have strobe lights

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $185.00| Total: | $185.00 |
% Truck With Snowplow (7'min.) 4WD W/out Salt Spreader *Must have strobe lights

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: HR Price: | $85.00| Total: | $85.00 |
% Track hoe/Excavator Less than 10 Ton (Mini-Excavator)

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid
2 | Track hoe/Excavator - 10 - 19 Ton
7 :

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid
2 | Track hoe/Excavator - 20 - 29 Ton
8 _ .

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid
2 | Track hoe/Excavator - 30 - 45 Ton
9 :

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid
3 | Track hoe/Excavator - Greater than 45 Ton
0 _ .

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR No Bid
% Transport truck witrailer (Flatbed/Lowboy/Open/Enclosed) less than 10 Ton

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $200.00] Total: | $200.00 |
g Transport truck w/trailer (Flatbed/Lowboy/Open/Enclosed) up to 24 Ton Capacity

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: HR Price:l $200.00| Total:| $200.00|
g Skid Steer/Skid Loader: Mini/Stand-up/Dingo

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $65.00 | Total: | $65.00 |
3 Skid Steer/Skid Loader: Small Frame Under 50 HP

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $75.00| Total: | $75.00 |
g Skid Steer/Skid Loader: Medium Frame 50-69 HP

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: HR Price:l $85.00| Total:| $85.00|
g Skid Steer/Skid Loader: Large Frame 70 HP or larger

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $85.00 | Total: | $85.00 |
% Sanding Truck (5CY)

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: HR Price: | $350.00 | Total: | $350.00 |
g Knuckle Boom

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR Price: | $385.00 | Total: | $385.00 |
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g Bucket Truck
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: HR Price: $335.00 | Total: | $335.00 |
4 | Mobile Crane: Less than 30 Ton Capacity
0 , No Bid
Quantity: 1 UOM: HR 0 Bl
4 | Mobile Crane: 31-60 Ton Capacity
1 No Bid

Quantity: 1 UOM: HR

Response Total: $5,605.00
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AFFIDAVIT

Comes the Affiant, Ke,o i 'Downs , and after being first
duly sworn, states under penalty of perjury as follows:

1. Histher name is Kevin Downs and hefshe is the
individual  submitting the proposal or is the authorized representative
of__ Infegrnted Semwices Ine. . the entity

submitting the proposal (hereinafter referred to as "Proposer”).

2. Proposer wili pay all taxes and fees, which are owed to the Lexington-Fayette Urban
County Government at the time the proposal is submitted, prior to award of the contract and
will maintain a "current” status in regard to those taxes and fees during the life of the contract.

3. Proposer will obtain a Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government business license, if
applicable, prior to award of the contract.

4. Proposer has authorized the Division of Central Purchasing to verify the above-
mentioned information with the Division of Revenue and to disclose to the Urban County
Council that taxes and/or fees are delinquent or that a business license has not been
obtained.

5. Proposer has not knowingly violated any provision of the campaign finance laws of the
Commonwealth of Kentucky within the past five (5) years and the award of a contract to the

Proposer will not violate any provision of the campaign finance laws of the Commonwealth.

6. Proposer has not knowingly violated any provision of Chapter 25 of the
Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government Code of Ordinances, known as "Ethics Act.”

Continued on next page
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7. Proposer acknowledges that "knowingly" for purposes of this Affidavit means, with respect
to conduct or to circumstances described by a statute or ordinance defining an offense, that
a person is aware or should have been aware that his conduct is of that nature or that the
circumstance exists.

Further, Affiant sayeth naught.

%Z Ll ﬁ“t‘)i\(’q‘l’( A Se,f;{, LS s
STATE OF __ ¥ étwiiy
COUNTY OF __ JES{trid oy

The foregoing instrument was subscribed, sworn to and acknowledged before me

: : th
by e in P o on this the ] 0 day
of __ Marth , 202Le
JESSICA JONES
) Notary Public
My Commission expires: (1 1—7! 2021 Commission Nember KYRPTaY12

My Commission Expires Jul 17, 2027

W PWT LARGE
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EQUAL OPPORTUNITY AGREEMENT

Standard Title VI Assurance

The Lexington Fayette-Urban County Government, (hereinafter referred to as the “Recipient”) hereby agrees
that as a condition to receiving any Federal financial assistance from the U.S. Department of Transportation, it
will comply with Title VI of the Civil Rights Act of 1964, 78Stat.252, 42 U.S.C. 2000d-4 (hereinafter referred to
as the "Act"), and all requirements imposed by or pursuant to Title 49, Code of Federal Regulations, U.S.
Department of Transportation, Subtitle A, Office of the Secretary, (49 CFR, Part 21) Nondiscrimination in
Federally Assisted Program of the Department of Transportation — Effectuation of Title VI of the Civil Rights
Act of 1964 (hereinafter referred to as the “Regulations”) and other pertinent directives, no person in the United
States shall, on the grounds of race, color, national origin, sex, age (over 40), religion, sexual orientation,
gender identity, veteran status, or disability be excluded from participation in, be denied the benefits of, or be
otherwise subjected to discrimination under any program or activity for which the Recipient receives Federal
financial assistance from the U.S. Department of Transportation, including the Federal Highway Administration,
and hereby gives assurance that will promptly take any necessary measures to effectuate this agreement. This
assurance is required by subsection 21.7(a) (1) of the Regulations.

The Law

. Title VII of the Civil Rights Act of 1964 (amended 1972) states that it is unlawful for an employer to
discriminate in employment because of race, color, religion, sex, age (40-70 years) or national origin.

. Executive Order No. 11246 on Nondiscrimination under Federal contract prohibits employment
discrimination by confractor and sub-contractor doing business with the Federal Government or
recipients of Federal funds. This order was later amended by Executive Order No. 11375 to prohibit
discrimination on the basis of sex.

. Section 503 of the Rehabilitation Act of 1973 states:

The Contractor will not discriminate against any employee or applicant for employrment
because of physical or mental handicap.

. Section 2012 of the Vietnam Era Veterans Readjustment Act of 1973 requires Affirmative Action on
behalf of disabled veterans and veterans of the Vietnam Era by contractors having Federal contracts.

. Section 206(A) of Executive Order 12086, Consolidation of Contract Compliance Functions for Equal
Employment Opportunity, states:

The Secretary of Labor may investigate the employment practices of any Government
contractor or sub-contractor to determine whether or not the contractual provisions
specified in Section 202 of this order have been violated.

Ted g R dodric R dhededede ek dede de dededede e e ke

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government practices Equal Opportunity in recruiting, hiring and
promoting. It is the Government's intent to affirmatively provide employment opportunities for those individuals
who have previously not been allowed to enter into the mainstream of society. Because of its importance to
the local Government, this policy carries the full endorsement of the Mayor, Commissioners, Directors and all
supervisory personnel. In following this commitment to Equal Employment Opportunity and because the
Government is the benefactor of the Federal funds, it is both against the Urban County Government policy and
ilegal for the Government to let contracts to companies which knowingly or unknowingly practice discrimination
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in their employment practices. Violation of the above mentioned ordinances may cause a contract to be
canceled and the contractors may be declared ineligible for future consideration.

Please sign this statement in the appropriate space acknowledging that you have read and understand the
provisions contained herein. Retumn this document as part of your application packet.

Bidders

i/We agree to comply with the Civil Rights Laws listed above that govern employment rights of minorities,
woimen, 7nam veterans, handicapped and aged persons.

/ . 2/- Integrated Sewpices Ire.

ngnaﬁf'é “~ Name of Business .
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WORKFORCE ANALYSIS FORM

Name of Organization:

Tntegrailel Qersites Toc.

Categories Total | White Hispanic Black or Native | Asian (Not | American | Twoor | Total
(Not or Latino African- Hawaiian Hispanic Indian or more
Hispanic American | and Other | orLatino Alaskan races
or (Not Pacific Native (Not
Latino) Hispanic Islander {not Hispanic
or Latino (Not Hispanic | | atino
Hispanic or Latino
or Latino
M F M F M F M F M F M F M F M|F
Administrators /
Professionals
Superintendents /
Supervisors
Foremen {
Technicians [ | e
Protective Service
Para-Professionals
Office/Clerical { /
Skilled Craft
Service/Maintenance
Total:

Prepared by: K&Ul"’\ DOU-MS

,preSIoldh‘L

Date: 3 I IAN D‘?G

{Name and Titla)
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Firm Submitting Proposal: L nteqraled Seevices Inc,

Complete Address: _ 13700 Rehl Kol Lowisvide Wby 0299
Street City Zip

Contact Name: _g_m_)}mmi Title: (pgs;_ﬂ/p,ﬂ/

Telephone Number: 500 -</ 3 [789Fax Number:

Email address: K2U:n . Aseins 15 & 3Ma,}/ L20Mm.
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" LEXINGTON

LFUCG MWDBE PARTICIPATION FORM
Bid/RFP/Quote Reference # CFP # lp ~2030

The MWDBE and/or veteran subcontractors listed have agreed to participate on this
Bid/RFP/Quote. If any substitution is made or the total value of the work is changed prior to or
after the job is in progress, it is understood that those substitutions must be submitted to the
Division of Procurement for approval immediately. Failure to submit a completed form may
cause rejection of the bid.

MWBE Company, DBE/MEBE Wark to be Total Y% Value of
Name, Address, WBE/VOSB/SDVOSB Performed Dollar Total
Phone, Email Value of the Contract
Work
1.
2.
3.
4.

The undersigned company representative submits the above list of MDWBE and veteran firms to be used
in accomplishing the work contained in this Bid/RFP/Quote. Any misrepresentation may result in the
termination of the contract and/or be subject to applicable Federal and State laws concerning false
statements and false claims.

Trvegrated Sewvices Toc. Revin Downs

Company Company Representative
3 o foe Presidewt
Date Title
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"M LEXINGTON

LFUCG MWDBE SUBSTITUTIO
Bid/RFP/Quote Reference # [CFFP H { - 2036

FORM

The substituted MWDBE and/or veteran subcontractors listed below have agreed to participate on
this Bid/RFP/Quote. These substitutions were made prior to or after the job was in progress. These
substitutions were made for reasons stated below and are now being submitted to the Division of
Procurement for approval. By the authorized signaturc of a representative of our company, we
understand that this information will be entered into our file for this project. Note: Form required
if a subcontractor is being substituted on a contract.

Company Name,
Address, Phone, Email

Address, Phone, Email

SUBSTITUTED DBE/MBE/WBE/YOSB/SDVOSB Work to Be Reason for the | Totalt Dollar % Value of
DBE/MBE/WBE/VOSB Formally Contracted/ Name, Performed Substitution Value of the | ‘T'otal Contract
Work

1.

The undersigned acknowledges that any misrepresentation may result in termination of the contract
and/or be subject to applicable Federal and State laws concerning false statements and false claims.

Totegrated SepviesToe. _ Kevin  Dewns

Company Company Representative
CILIES Presidend .
Date Title
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ATTACHMENT A — SMALL AND DISADVANTAGED, MINORITY-,
WOMEN-, AND VETERAN-OWNED BUSINESS OUTREACH PLAN

Proposer Name: I 'f ke I g e T Pate:
Project Name: f\: ] am D I l;roject Number: /ZF"O#.G -G?C) Q:

Contact Name: K@UJ n Downs Telephone: S0N-¢ )R- 139
Email: kw"n‘domng}g"@gMﬁ;L Co An

The mission of the Minority Business Enterprise Program is to facilitate the full participation of
disadvantaged busincsscs, minority-, women-, veteran-, and service-disabled veteran-owned businesses
in the procurement process and to promote economic inclusion as a business imperative essential to the
long -term economic viability of Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government.

To that end, small and disadvantaged businesses, including minority-, woman-, veteran-, and service-
disabled veteran-owned businesses, must have an equal opportunity to be utilized in the performance
of contracts with public funds spent from certain discretionary agreements. By submitting its offer,
Bidder/Proposer certifies that it has taken, and if there are further opportunities will take, reasonable
steps to ensure that small and disadvantaged businesses, including minority-, woman-, veteran-, and
service-disabled veteran-owned businesses, are provided an equal opportunity to compete for and
participate in the performance of any subcontracts resulting from this procurement.

The information submitted in response to this clause will not be considered in any scored evaluation.
Failure to submit this form may cause the bid or proposal to be rejected.

Is the Bidder/ Proposer a certified firm? Yes IZ/ No U

If yes, indicate all certification type(s):
DBE O MBE O WBE O SBE M VOSB/SDVOSB [J

and supply a copy of the certificate and/or certification letter if not currently listed on the city’s Minority
Business Enterprise Program’s (MBEP) certified list.

1. Include a list of firms that Bidder/ Proposer has had a contractual relationship with within the
last two years that are minority-owned, woman-owned, veteran-owned or small businesses,
regardless of their certification status.

Click or tap here to enter text.

2. Does Bidder/Propo?resee any subcontracting opportunities for this procurement?

Yes I No
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If no, please explain why in the field below. Do not complete the rest of this form and submit this

first page with your bid and/or proposal. Click or tap here to enter texl.

If yes, please complete the following pages and submit all pages with your bid and/or proposal.

Describe the steps Bidder/Proposer took to solicit small and disadvantaged businesses, including
MBEs, WBEs, VOSBs, and SDVOSBEs, for subcontracting opportunities for this procurement.

3. Check the good faith and outreach efforts the Bidder/Proposer used to encourage the
participation of small and disadvantaged businesses including, MBEs, WBEs, VOSBs and

SDVOSBs:

00  Bidder placed advertisements in search of prospective small businesses, DBEs, MBEs,
WBEs, VOSBs and/or SDVOSBs for the solicitation.

[0 Bidder attended LFUCG Procurement Economic Inclusion Qutreach event(s) within the
past year.

[0 Bidder attended pre-bid and/or pre-proposal meetings for this solicitation.

Bidder sponsored an Economic Inclusion Qutreach event.
Bidder requested a list of certified small, DBE, MBE, WBE, VOSB and/or SDVOSB
subcontractors or suppliers from LFUCG.

O Bidder contacted organizations that work with small, DBE, MBE, WBE, VOSB and/or
SDVOSB companies.

] Bidder sent written notices to certified small, DBE, MBE, WBE, VOSB and SDVOSB
businesses.

0 Bidder followed up to initial solicitations with interested small, DBE, MBE, WBE, VOSB
and/or SDVOSB.

O Bidder provided small, DBE, MBE, WBE, VOSB and/or SDVOSB businesses interested in
performing the solicited work with prompt access to the plans, specifications, scope of work,
and requirements of the solicitation.

0 Bidder made efforts to segment portions of the work to be performed by small businesses,

DBEs, MBEs, WBEs, VOSBs and/or SDVOSBs, including dividing sub-bid/partnership
opportunities into economically feasible units/parcels, to facilitate participation.
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0 Bidder negotiated in good faith with interested small, DBE, MBE, WBE, VOSB and/or
SDVOSB businesses.

0 Bidder provided adequate rationale for rejecting any small business’, DBEs, MBEs, WBESs,
VOSBs or SDVOSBs for lack of qualifications.

[0 Bidder offered assistance in obtaining bonding, insurance, financial, equipment, or other
resources to small businesses, DBEs, MBEs, WBEs, VOSBs and/or SDV0OSBs, in an effort
to assist them in meeting project requirements.

[0 Bidder made efforts to expand the search for small businesses, DBEs MBEs, WBEs, VOSBs
and/or SDVOSBs beyond the usual geographic boundaries.

0 Bidder made other reasonable efforts to include small businesses, DBEs, MBEs, WBEs,
VOSBs and/or SDVOSBs participation.

4. Bidder/Proposer must include documentation, including the date each effort was made, the
medium through which each effort was made, and the outcome of each effort with this form,
regardless of the level of small, DBE, MBE, WBE, VOSB and/or SDVOSB participation.
Examples of required documentation include copies of email communications, copies of
newspaper advertisements, or copies of quotations received from interested small businesses,
DBEs, MBEs, WBEs, VOSBs or SDVOSBs.

Click or tap here to enter text.

For detailed information regarding outreach efforts that satisfy the MBE Program’s
requirements, please see “Documentation Required for Good Faith Efforts and Outreach Plans”

page.

Note: The Bidder/Proposer must be willing to report the identity of each snbcontractor and the
value of cach subcontract to MBEP if awarded a contract from this procurement.

Failure to submit the documentation requested may be cause for rejection of the bid. Bidders
may include any other documentation deemed relevant to this requirement, which is subject to
review by the MBE Liaison. Documentation of Good Faith and Outreach Efforts must be
submitted with the bid, regardless of the proposed level of SBEs, DBEs, MBEs, WBEs, VOSBs
and/or SDVOSBs participation in the procurement. If the Good Faith and Outreach Effort Form
and associated documentation is not submitted with the bid response, the bid may be rejected.
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The undersigned acknowledgcs that all information is accurate. Any misrepresentations may result in
termination of the contract and/or be subject to applicable Federal and State laws concerning false
statements and claims.

Inteqratd Serviees T, IKevin Oowns

Compan Company Representative
3 Jro Jis

res id

Date Title

4870-1925-6809, v. 1
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GENERAL PROVISIONS

Each Respondent shall comply with all Federai, State & Local regulations
concerning this type of service or good.

The Respondent agrees to comply with all statutes, rules, and regulations
governing safe and healthful working conditions, including the Occupational Health
and Safety Act of 1970, 29 U.S.C. 650 ef. seq., as amended, and KRS Chapter
338. The Respondent also agrees to notify the LFUCG in writing immediately upon
detection of any unsafe and/or unhealthful working conditions at the job site. The
Respondent agrees to indemnify, defend and hold the LFUCG harmless from all
penalties, fines or other expenses arising out of the alleged violation of said laws.

Failure to submit ALL forms and information required in this RFP may be grounds
for disqualification.

Addenda: All addenda and lonWave Q&A, if any, shall be considered in making
the proposal, and such addenda shall be made a part of this RFP. Before
submitting a proposal, it is incumbent upon each proposer to be informed as to
whether any addenda have been issued, and the failure to cover in the bid any
such addenda may resuit in disqualification of that proposal.

Proposal Reservations: LFUCG reserves the right to reject any or all proposals, to
award in whole or part, and to waive minor immaterial defects in proposals. LFUCG
may consider any alternative proposal that meets its basic needs.

Liability: LFUCG is not responsible for any cost incurred by a Respondent in the
preparation of proposals.

Changes/Alterations: Respondent may change or withdraw a proposal at any time
prior to the opening; however, no oral modifications wili be allowed. Only letters, or
other formal written requests for modifications or corrections of a previously
submitted proposal which is addressed in the same manner as the proposal, and
received by LFUCG prior to the scheduled closing time for receipt of proposals, will
be accepted. The proposal, when opened, will then be corrected in accordance
with such written request(s), provided that the written request is contained in a
sealed envelope which is plainly marked “modifications of proposal”.

Clarification of Submittal: LFUCG reserves the right to obtain clarification of any
point in a bid or to obtain additional information from a Respondent.

Bribery Clause: By his/her signature on the bid, Respondent certifies that no

employee of his/hers, any affiliate or Subcontractor, has bribed or attempted to
bribe an officer or employee of the LFUCG.
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10.

11.

12.

Additional Information: While not necessary, the Respondent may include any
product brochures, software documentation, sample reports, or other
documentation that may assist LFUCG in better understanding and evaluating the
Respondent’s response. Additional documentation shall not serve as a substitute
for other documentation which is required by this RFP to be submitted with the
proposal,

Ambiguity, Conflict or other Errors in RFP: If a Respondent discovers any
ambiguity, conflict, discrepancy, omission or other error in the RFP, it shall
immediately notify LFUCG of such error in writing and request maodification or
clarification of the document if allowable by the LFUCG.

Agreement to Bid Terms: In submitting this proposal, the Respondent agrees that
it has carefully examined the specifications and all provisions relating to the work
to be done attached hereto and made part of this proposal. By acceptance of a
Contract under this RFP, proposer states that it understands the meaning, intent
and requirements of the RFP and agrees to the same. The successful Respondent
shall warrant that it is familiar with and understands all provisions herein and shall
warrant that it can comply with them. No additional compensation to Respondent
shall be authorized for services or expenses reasonably covered under these
provisions that the proposer omits from its Proposal.

Cancellation: If the services to be performed hereunder by the Respondent are not
performed in an acceptable manner to the LFUCG, the LFUCG may cancel this
contract for cause by providing written notice to the proposer, giving at least thirty
(30) days notice of the proposed cancellation and the reasons for same. During
that time period, the proposer may seek to bring the performance of services
hereunder to a level that is acceptable to the LFUCG, and the LFUCG may rescind

the cancellation if such action is in its best interest.
A. Termination for Cause

(1) LFUCG may terminate a contract because of the contractor’s failure
to perform its contractual duties

(2)  If a contractor is determined to be in default, LFUCG shall notify the
contractor of the determination in writing, and may include a specified
date by which the contractor shall cure the identified deficiencies.
LFUCG may proceed with termination if the contractor fails to cure the
deficiencies within the specified time.

(3) A default in performance by a contractor for which a contract may be
terminated shall include, but shall not necessarily be limited to:
(a) Failure to perform the contract according to its terms, conditions
and specifications;
(b)  Failure to make delivery within the time specified or according
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13.

14.

15.

to a delivery schedule fixed by the contract;

(¢) Late payment or nonpayment of bills for labor, materials,
supplies, or equipment furnished in connection with a contract
for construction services as evidenced by mechanics’ liens filed
pursuant to the provisions of KRS Chapter 376, or letters of
indebtedness received from creditors by the purchasing
agency,

(d) Failure to diligently advance the work under a contract for
construction services,

(e) The filing of a bankruptcy petition by or against the contractor;
or

(f)  Actions that endanger the health, safely or welfare of the
LFUCG or its citizens.

B. At Will Termination

Notwithstanding the above provisions, the LFUCG may terminate this contract at
will in accordance with the law upon providing thirty (30) days written notice of that
intent, Payment for services or goods received prior to termination shall be made
by the LFUCG provided these goods or services were provided in a manner
acceptable to the LFUCG. Payment for those goods and services shall not be
unreasonably withheld.

Assignment of Contract: The contractor shall not assign or subcontract any portion
of the Contract without the express written consent of LFUCG. Any purported
assignment or subcontract in violation hereof shall be void. It is expressly
acknowledged that LFUCG shall never be required or obligated to consent to any
request for assignment or subcontract; and further that such refusal to consent can
be for any or no reason, fully within the sole discretion of LFUCG.

No Waiver: No failure or delay by LFUCG in exercising any right, remedy, power
or privilege hereunder, nor any single or partial exercise thereof, nor the exercise
of any other right, remedy. power or privilege shall operate as a waiver hereof or
thereof. No failure or delay by LFUCG in exercising any right, remedy, power or
privilege under or in respect of this Contract shall affect the rights, remedies,
powers or privileges of LFUCG hereunder or shall operate as a waiver thereof.

Authority to do Business: The Respondent must be a duly organized and
authorized to do business under the laws of Kentucky. Respondent must be in
good standing and have full legal capacity to provide the services specified under
this Contract. The Respondent must have all necessary right and lawful authority
to enter into this Contract for the full term hereof and that proper corporate or other
action has been duly taken authorizing the Respondent to enter into this Contract.
The Respondent will provide LFUCG with a copy of a corporate resolution
authorizing this action and a letter from an attorney confirming that the proposer is
authorized to do business in the State of Kentucky if requested. All proposals must
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16.

17.

18.

19.

20.

be signed by a duly authorized officer, agent or employee of the Respondent.

Governing Law: This Contract shalt be governed by and construed in accordance
with the laws of the Commonwealth of Kentucky. In the event of any proceedings
regarding this Contract, the Parties agree that the venue shall be the Fayette
County Circuit Court or the U.S. District Court for the Eastern District of Kentucky,
Lexington Division. All parties expressly consent to personal jurisdiction and venue
in such Court for the limited and sole purpose of proceedings relating to this
Contract or any rights or obligations arising thereunder. Service of process may be
accomplished by following the procedures prescribed by law.

Abiiity to Meet Obligations: Respondent affirmatively states that there are no
actions, suits or proceedings of any kind pending against Respondent or, to the
knowledge of the Respondent, threatened against the Respondent before or by
any court, governmental body or agency or other tribunal or authority which would,
if adversely determined, have a materially adverse effect on the authority or ability
of Respondent to perform its obligations under this Contract, or which question the
legality, validity or enforceability hereof or thereof.

Contractor understands and agrees that its employees, agents, or subcontractors
are not employees of LFUCG for any purpose whatsoever. Contractor is an
independent contractor at all times during the performance of the services
specified.

If any term or provision of this Contract shall be found to be illegal or unenforceable,
the remainder of the contract shall remain in full force and such term or provision
shall be deemed stricken.

Contractor [or Vendor or Vendor's Employees] will not appropriate or make use of
the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government (LFUCG) name or any of
its trade or service marks or property (including but not limited to any logo or seal),
in any promotion, endorsement, advertisement, testimonial or similar use without
the prior written consent of the government. If such consent is granted LFUCG
reserves the unilateral right, in its sole discretion, to immediately terminate and
revoke such use for any reason whatsoever. Contractor agrees that it shall cease
Z: sist from any unauthorized use immediately upon being notified by LFUCG.

3~ /OHQ@

Signature Date
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INTEGRATED

COMMERCIAL GROUNDS MAINTENANCE

Offeror’s Statement of Contract/Work and Performance

Name of your firm: Integrated Services Inc. of KY. Established in 2006
CAGE: 885R8 Unique Identifier JK35UTNX8DZ7

Point of Contact, Phone number and EMAIL address:

Kevin Downs, President

502-413-1729

Kevin.downsisi@gmail.com

Below is a list of current contracts that demonstrates Integrated Services experience, as a
prime contractor, successfully performing snow removal services and storm clean-up.
Integrated Services is also experienced with building maintenance, Janitorial and all aspects
of tree removal, planting & watering. ISI has large fleet of snow equipment for all sizes of
parking lots. ISl is currently providing services for multiple USACE Lakes, Multiple Louisville
Metro agencies including the Libraries, Zoo and the Forestry Department. ISl also has more
than a dozen contracts with the Commonwealth of KY providing various Grounds
Maintenance, janitorial and various facility maintenance services.

Project Name: DRP Services, LLP
Contract Number (if applicable):

Year Completed: 5+ years
POC: Sarah Palmer 502-424-2651 Cell, sarahp@drpservices.net

General Description of project: Integrated Services performs the snow and Ice
removal/treatment for 2 Commercial warehouses on Blankenbaker Parkway and at 6
Warehouse buildings on Grade Lane at the UPS hub.

On 4/3/2025 a tornado went through the 2 Warehouses at Blankenbaker. ISI responded
immediately providing Manpower and equipment to clean-up to substantial damages to both
buildings and surroundings. This included tree and large debris removal, flipping overturned
trailers in the lot and making the buildings and area safe.



Project Name: Louisville Metro Forestry Department
Year Completed: Currently in progress. Year 2 of 3

Prime Contractor
POC: Barry Edgar

General Description of project: ISI has 4 contracts with the Forestry Department including
Emergency Tree Removal, Tree Pruning, Tree Planting and Tree Watering.

ISl has removed hundreds of mature trees all over the city. Planted over 1000 trees for the
city.

Project Name: Commonwealth of Ky Capital buildings Snow Removal
Contract Number (if applicable):

Year Completed: Currently in progress. Year 2 of 3

POC: Ryan Hicks ryan.hix@ky.gov

General Description of project: ISl currently provides snow removal services for 14 buildings
in Frankfort including the State Capital. Services include keeping parking lots and sidewalks
free of ice and snow in inclement weather.

Project Name: US Army Corp of Engineers Grayson Lake
Contract Number (if applicable):

Year Completed: Currently in progress. Year 2 of 5
POC: Aaron Harmon Aaron.F.Harmon@usace.army.mil

General Description of project: Removal of 33 mature trees in various areas around the lake.
Integrated Services Inc. of KY

s a full-service grounds maintenance company focusing on Federal, State and Local
Government projects. ISl was established in 2006 and we have very a experienced staff.
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