Event Number Bid 144-2016 Addendum 3 Organization

Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government

Event Title LED Lighting Fixtures Workgroup Purchasing

Event Description All questions concerning this procurement | Event Owner Todd Slatin

Event Type Bid Email tslatin@lexingtonky.gov

Issue Date 11/22/2016 09:00:00 AM (ET) Phone (859) 258-3320

Close Date 12/20/2016 02:00:00 PM (ET) Fax (859) 258-3320

|Responding Supplier City State Response Submitted Lines Responded Response Total |
Reliable Products and Services ( Cincinnati OH 12/20/2016 11:11:28 AM (ET) 0 $0.00
Bluegrass Evergreen LLC lexington KY 12/16/2016 05:12:47 PM (ET) 5 $11.90
AIREY-THOMPSON IRWINDALE CA 12/19/2016 02:05:31 PM (ET) 34 $663.84
West-Lite Supply Co, Inc. Cerritos CA 12/20/2016 11:34:41 AM (ET) 22 $2,618.43
Rexel Inc. Lexington KY 12/20/2016 12:15:57 PM (ET) 88 $11,636.75

Please note: Lines Responded and Response Total only includes responses to specification. No alternate response data is included.

Bid 144-2016 Addendum 3 - Page 1



ces (Brinson D. Hobbs dba Relii  Bluegrass E
Total Price $0.00( Total Price
Line#  Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY |UOM Unit Extended Unit
1 LED 2X2 DROP IN TROFFER, 4000K, 3200LM, Cree ZR22-32L-4011 Each No Bid
2 LED 2X2 DROP IN TROFFER, 4000K, 3200LM, Cree ZR22-32L-4011 Each
3 LED 2X4 DROP IN TROFFER, 4000K, 4000LM, Cree ZR24-40L-4011 Each
4 LED 2X4 DROP IN TROFFER, 4000K, 4000LM, Cree ZR24-40L-4011 Each
5 LED 2X2 DROP IN TROFFER, 4000K, 3000LM, Metalux 225R-LD1-29 1 Each
6 LED 2X2 DROP IN TROFFER, 4000K, 3000LM, Metalux 22SR-LD1-291 Each
7 LED 2X4 DROP IN TROFFER, 4000K, 4800LM, Metalux 24SR-LD1-29 1 Each
8 LED 2X4 DROP IN TROFFER, 4000K, 4800LM, Metalux 24SR-LD1-29 1 Each
9 LED STRIP LIGHT 48 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= ¢ Lithonia ZL1N-L48-50(1 Each
9 ALT1 LED STRIP LIGHT 48 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= ¢ AIREY-THOM 61GU50K48-: 1 Each
10 LED STRIP LIGHT 48 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= ¢ Lithonia ZL1N-148-50(1 Each
10 ALT1 LED STRIP LIGHT 48 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= ¢ AIREY-THOM 61GU50K48-: 1 Each
11 LED STRIP LIGHT 48 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= ¢ Lithonia ZL1N-L48-70(1 Each
11 ALT1 LED STRIP LIGHT 48 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= ¢ AIREY-THOM 61GC50K48-: 1 Each
12 LED STRIP LIGHT 48 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= ¢ Lithonia ZL1N-148-70(1 Each
12 ALT1 LED STRIP LIGHT 48 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= ¢ AIREY-THOM 61GC50K48-:1 Each
13 LED STRIP LIGHT 48 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= ¢ Lithonia ZL1D-148-50(1 Each
13 ALT1 LED STRIP LIGHT 48 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= ¢ AIREY-THOM 61GU50K48-: 1 Each
14 LED STRIP LIGHT 48 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= ¢ Lithonia ZL1D-L48-50(1 Each
14 ALT1 LED STRIP LIGHT 48 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= ¢ AIREY-THOM 61GU50K48-: 1 Each
15 LED STRIP LIGHT 48 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= ¢ Lithonia ZL1D-148-70(1 Each
15 ALT1 LED STRIP LIGHT 48 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= ¢ AIREY-THOM 61GC50K48-: 1 Each
16 LED STRIP LIGHT 48 10000LM, 5000K, CRI >= Lithonia ZL1D-1L48-10(1 Each
16 ALT1 LED STRIP LIGHT 48 10000LM, 5000K, CRI >= AIREY-THOM 61GC50K48-:1 Each
17 LED STRIP LIGHT 96 10000LM, 5000K, CRI >= Lithonia TZL1D-L96-1(1 Each
17 ALT1 LED STRIP LIGHT 96 10000LM, 5000K, CRI >= AIREY-THOM 61GU50K96-: 1 Each
18 LED STRIP LIGHT 96 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= ¢ Lithonia TZL1D-196-7(1 Each
18 ALT1 LED STRIP LIGHT 96 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= ¢ AIREY-THOM 61GU50K96-: 1 Each
19 LED TWO ADJUSTABLE LED LAMP HEADS EM Lithonia EU2 LED M1:1 Each
20 LED EXIT/EMERGENCY LIGHT COMBO, 90 Ml Lithonia ECRLEDHOI1 Each
21  LED EXIT LIGHT, 90 MINUTE BATTERY BACKU Lithonia EXRLEDELME 1 Each
22 LED LOW/HIGH BAY 18000LM, 5000K, =>80( Cree CXB-A-UV-M- 1 Each
23 LED LOW/HIGH BAY REFLECTOR (MANUFACT Cree CXBP16 1 Each
24 LED LOW/HIGH BAY REFLECTOR (MANUFACI1 Cree CXBW16 1 Each
25 LED LOW/HIGH BAY REFLECTOR (MANUFACI Cree CXBA16N 1 Each Bid 144-2016 Addendum 3 - Page 2




26 60 WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED LIGHT, Eiko LED9WA19/(1 2-PACK
27 60 WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED LIGHT, Eiko LEDOWA19/(1 12-PACK
28 60 WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED LIGHT, - Eiko LED9WA19/(1 2-PACK
29 60 WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED LIGHT, - Eiko LED9WA19/(1 12-PACK
30 100 WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED LIGHT Eiko LED15WA21,1 2-PACK
31 100 WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED LIGHT Eiko LED1I5WA21,1 12-PACK
32 100 WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED LIGHT Eiko LED15WA21,1 2-PACK
33 100 WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED LIGHT Eiko LEDI5WA21,1 12-PACK
34  65WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED FLOOD | Eiko LEDS8WBR30, 1 Each

34 ALT1 :65WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED FLOOD | Bluegrass Eve BGLED-BR30! 1 Each
35  65WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED FLOOD | Eiko LED8WBR30, 1 24 PACK

35 ALT1 :65WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED FLOOD | Bluegrass Eve BGLED-BR30! 1 24 PACK
36  65WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED FLOOD | Eiko LED8WBR30,1 Each
37  65WATT EQUIVILENT SCREW IN LED FLOOD | Eiko LED8WBR30, 1 24 PACK
38 48 T8 32W FLOURESCENT BULB, 3000K, ROH Sylvania FO32/830/E(1 10-PACK
39  48T832W FLOURESCENT BULB, 3000K, ROH Sylvania FO32/830/E(1 30-PACK
40 48 T8 32W FLOURESCENT BULB, 3500K, ROH Sylvania FO32/V35/E(1 10-PACK
41 48 T8 32W FLOURESCENT BULB, 3500K, ROH Sylvania FO32/V35/E(1 30-PACK
42 48 T8 32W FLOURESCENT BULB, 4000K, ROH Sylvania FO32/V41/E(1 10-PACK
43 48T8 32W FLOURESCENT BULB, 4000K, ROH Sylvania FO32/V41/E(1 30-PACK
44 48 T8 32W FLOURESCENT BULB, 5000K, ROH Sylvania FO32/V50/E(1 10-PACK
45 48 T8 32W FLOURESCENT BULB, 5000K, ROH Sylvania FO32/V50/E(1 30-PACK
46 48 T8 32W FLOURESCENT BULB, 6500K, ROH Sylvania FO32/V65/E(1 10-PACK
47 48 T8 32W FLOURESCENT BULB, 6500K, ROH Sylvania FO32/V65/E(1 30-PACK
48 48 T8 REDUCED WATTAGE <= 28W FLOURES Sylvania FO32/25W/81 10-PACK
49 48 T8 REDUCED WATTAGE <= 28W FLOURES Sylvania FO32/25W/81 30-PACK
50 48 T8 REDUCED WATTAGE <= 28W FLOURES Sylvania FO32/25W/81 10-PACK
51 48 T8 REDUCED WATTAGE <= 28W FLOURES Sylvania FO32/25W/81 30-PACK
52 48 T8 REDUCED WATTAGE <= 28W FLOURES Sylvania FO32/25W/81 10-PACK
53 48 T8 REDUCED WATTAGE <= 28W FLOURES Sylvania FO32/25W/81 30-PACK
54 48" LINEAR LED COMPATIBLE WITH RAPID AIGE LED15ET8/G, 1 Each

54 ALT1 :48” LINEAR LED COMPATIBLE WITH RAPID A Sylvania Syl 75286 LE1 Each

54 ALT1 :48” LINEAR LED COMPATIBLE WITH RAPID A Bluegrass Eve BGL48T8DF1 1 Each
55 48" LINEAR LED COMPATIBLE WITH RAPID Al GE LED15ET8/G, 1 Each

55 ALT1 :48” LINEAR LED COMPATIBLE WITH RAPID A Sylvania Syl 75288 LE 1 Each

55 ALT1:48” LINEAR LED COMPATIBLE WITH RAPID A Bluegrass Eve BGLA8T8DF1 1 Each
56 48" LINEAR LED COMPATIBLE WITH RAPID AIGE LED15ET8/G, 1 Each

56 ALT1:48” LINEAR LED COMPATIBLE WITH RAPID A Sylvania Syl 75297 LE1 Each

56 ALT1:48” LINEAR LED COMPATIBLE WITH RAPID A Bluegrass Eve BGLAS8TSDF1 1 Each

$8.99

$213.00

$11.90

$11.90
$11.90
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57  OCCUPANCY SENSING SWITCH, 120V/277V, ! Lutron LUT MS-OPS¢ 1 Each
57 ALT1 %OCCUPANCY SENSING SWITCH, 120V/277V, | LEVITON 1PV0O2-1LI 1 Each
58  DIMMER SWITCH/CONTROL, LED/FLOURESC Lutron LUT DVSTV-V 1 Each
59  OCCUPANCY SENSING SWITCH WITH DIMME Lutron LUT MS-Z1011 Each
60 DIMMER SWITCH/CONTROL WITH LOW LIMI Lutron LUT DVCL-151 Each
61  WIRELESS CONTROLED DIMMING MODULE F Lutron LUT RMJ-5T-I1 Each
62  WIRELESS OCCUPANCY AND PHOTO SENSOR Lutron LUT LRF2-0OC 1 Each
63 LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR <=150W HP¢ Lumark XTOR5ARL 1 Each
63 ALT1 LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR <=150W HP$ LUMARK XTOR6BRL 1 Each
64  LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR <=150W HP¢ Lumark XTOR5ARL (P 1 Each
64 ALT1 LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR <=150W HP¢LUMARK XTOR6BRL-P(1 Each
65 LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR > 150W HPS Lumark XTORSARL 1 Each
65 ALT1 LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR > 150W HPS LUMARK XTOR8BRL 1 Each
66  LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR > 150W HPS Lumark XTOR9ARL (P 1 Each
66 ALT1 LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR > 150W HPS LUMARK XTOR8BRL-P(1 Each
67  LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR <= 100W HP Sylvania WALPAKIN/(1 Each
68  LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR <= 100W HP Sylvania WALPAKIN/(1 Each
69  LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR >= 100W <= Sylvania WALPAKIN/(1 Each
70  LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR >= 100W <= Sylvania WALPAKIN/(1 Each
71 LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR > 175W HPS Sylvania WALPAKIN/(1 Each
72 LED WALL PACK (RETROFIT FOR > 175W HPS Sylvania WALPAKIN/(1 Each
73  STREETLIGHT - GRANVILLE Il LED BY HOLOPH HOLOPHANE GVD2 P30 3K 1 Each
74  STREETLIGHT - GRANVILLE Il LED BY HOLOPHHOLOPHANE GVDRETRO 81 Each
75 LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= Lithonia ZL1N-L48-50(1
75 ALT1 LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= AIREY-THOM 61GU50K48-: 1
76  LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= Lithonia ZL1N-L48-50(1
76 ALT1 LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= AIREY-THOM 61GU50K48-:1
77  LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= Lithonia ZL1N-L48-50(1
77 ALT1 LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= AIREY-THOM 61GU50K48-: 1
78  LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= Lithonia ZL1N-L48-70(1
78 ALT1 LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= AIREY-THOM 61GC50K48-:1
79  LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= Lithonia ZL1N-L48-70(1 Each
79 ALT1 LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= AIREY-THOM 61GC50K48-:1 Each
80  LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= Lithonia ZL1N-L48-70(1 Each
80 ALT1 LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= AIREY-THOM 61GC50K48-:1 Each
81 LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= Lithonia ZL1D-148-50(1 Each
81 ALT1 LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= AIREY-THOM 61GU50K48-: 1 Each
82 LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= Lithonia ZL1D-148-50(1 Each
82 ALT1 LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= AIREY-THOM 61GU50K48-:1 Each
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83
83 ALT1
84
84 ALT1
85
85 ALT1
86

86 ALT1:

87
87 ALT1
88
88 ALT1
89

89 ALT1 -

LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= Lithonia ZL1D-L48-50(1

Each

'LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 5000LM, 5000K, CRI >= AIREY-THOM 61GU50K48-. 1

Each

LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 10000LM, 5000K, CRI >: Lithonia ZL1D-148-10(1

Each

LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= AIREY-THOM 61GC50K48-:1

Each

LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 10000LM, 5000K, CRI >: Lithonia ZL1D-L48-10(1

Each

"LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 10000LM, 5000K, CRI > AIREY-THOM 61GC50K48-: 1

Each

LED STRIP LIGHT 48" 10000LM, 5000K, CRI >: Lithonia ZL1D-148-10(1

Each

LED STRIP LIGHT 48” 10000LM, 5000K, CRI > AIREY-THOM 61GC50K48-:1

Each

LED STRIP LIGHT 96" 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= Lithonia TZL1D-196-7(1

Each

'LED STRIP LIGHT 96” 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= AIREY-THOM 61GU50K96-. 1

Each

LED STRIP LIGHT 96" 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= Lithonia TZL1D-L96-7(1

Each

LED STRIP LIGHT 96” 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= AIREY-THOM 61GU50K96-: 1

Each

LED STRIP LIGHT 96" 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= Lithonia TZL1D-196-7(1

Each

LED STRIP LIGHT 96” 7000LM, 5000K, CRI >= AIREY-THOM 61GU50K96-: 1

Each
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vergreen LLC AIREY-THOMPSON West-Lite Supply Co, Inc. Rexel Inc.
$11.90( Total Price $663.84| Total Price $2,618.43| Total Price $11,636.75
Line # Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 No Bid $99.95 $99.95

2 No Bid $285.00 $285.00

3 $117.95 $117.95

4 $303.00 $303.00

5 $90.95 $90.95

6 $289.00 $289.00

7 $122.50 $122.50

8 $316.50 $316.50

9 95.00 $95.00
9 ALT1 $275.00

10 $215.00 $215.00
10 ALT1 $460.00

11 $116.50 $116.50
11 ALT1 $275.00

12 $229.00 $229.00
12 ALT1 $475.00

13 $102.50 $102.50
13 ALT1 $275.00

14 $229.00 $229.00
14 ALT1 $475.00

15 $129.50 $129.50
15 ALT1 $364.00

16 $245.00 $245.00
16 ALT1 $564.00

17 $202.70 $202.70
17 ALT1 $364.00

18 $309.00 $309.00
18 ALT1 $558.00

19 $21.30 $21.30

20 $59.50 $59.50

21 20.05 $20.05

22 $395.00 $395.00

23 $49.50 $49.50

24 $60.00 $60.00

25 28.50 $28.50
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26
27
28
29
30
31
32
33
34

34 ALT1
35

35 ALT1
36
37
38
39
40
41
42
43
44
45
46
47
48
49
50
51
52
53
54

54 ALT1

54 ALT1
55

55 ALT1

55 ALT1
56

56 ALT1

56 ALT1

$11.90

No Bid

$55.08
No Bid

$42.84

No Bid
$50.76

No Bid
$50.76

No Bid
$50.76

No Bid
$137.88

No Bid
$137.88

No Bid
$137.88

$55.08

$42.84

$50.76

$50.76

$50.76

$137.88

$137.88

$137.88

$59.88

$59.88

$146.16

$146.16
$6.55

$157.20

$6.55
$157.20

$66.00

$49.50

$49.50

$49.50

$60.00

$133.80

$133.80

$133.80

$59.88

$59.88

$146.16

$146.16
$6.55

$157.20

$6.55
$157.20

$66.00

$49.50

$49.50

$49.50

$60.00

$133.80

$133.80

$133.80
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$5.20
$31.20
$5.20
$31.20
$14.80
$88.80
$14.80
$88.80
$4.75

$114.00

$4.75
$114.00
$17.00

$14.50
$43.50
$14.50
$43.50
$14.50
$43.50
$14.50
$43.50
$26.00
$78.00
$26.00
$78.00
$26.00
$78.00
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57
57 ALT1
58
59
60
61
62
63
63 ALT1
64
64 ALT1
65
65 ALT1
66
66 ALT1
67
68
69
70
71
72
73
74
75
75 ALT1
76
76 ALT1
77
77 ALT1
78
78 ALT1
79
79 ALT1
80
80 ALT1
81
81 ALT1
82
82 ALT1

$19.50

No Bid

No Bid
$475.00
No Bid
$475.00
No Bid
$475.00
No Bid
$475.00
No Bid
$475.00
No Bid
$475.00
No Bid
$468.00
No Bid
$468.00

$145.35
$157.35
$185.35
$199.95
$251.95
$263.00

$145.35
$157.35
$185.35
$199.95
$251.95
$263.00

$30.20

$55.00
$62.50
$22.75
$74.95
$49.50

$129.00
$140.00
$163.50
$176.00
$221.00
$232.95
$960.00
$434.00
$215.00

$215.00

$215.00

$215.00

$239.00

$239.00

$215.00

$215.00
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83
83 ALT1
84
84 ALT1
85
85 ALT1
86
86 ALT1
87
87 ALT1
88
88 ALT1
89
89 ALT1

No Bid
$468.00

$500.00

$500.00

$500.00

$600.00

$600.00

$600.00

239.0

239.0

239.0

325.0

325.0

HEL

325.0

$215.00

$239.00

$239.00

$239.00

$325.00

$325.00

$325.00
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Line Responding Supplier

1 Rexel Inc.

2 Rexel Inc.

56 Bluegrass Evergreen LLC
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Supplier Notes

Currently stocked
Currently stocked

3000K, 13W, 2000 Lumen
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Line #

Att # Attribute Name

Attribute Note

|Reliable Products 4Bluegrass Evergree AIREY-THOMPSON| West-Lite Supply C|

000 NNOoOO Ul Ul BB WWNDNR PR

Vo]

9 ALT1
9
9 ALT1
10
10 ALT1
10
10 ALT1
11
11 ALT1
11
11 ALT1
12
12 ALT1
12
12 ALT1
13
13 ALT1
13
13 ALT1
14

1

P NP P NMNDNEPRPREPNMNNEPRPRPNNPEPRERPNNPEPERPNENENENENENREDNENDN

Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in

19

19

19

19

19
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14 ALT1
14
14 ALT1
15
15 ALT1
15
15 ALT1
16
16 ALT1
16
16 ALT1
17
17 ALT1
17
17 ALT1
18
18 ALT1
18
18 ALT1
19
19
20
20
21
21
22
22
23
23
24
24
25
25
26
26
27
27
28
28

N P NP NEFEP NEPEP NP NEPEPNEPEPNEPEPENEPEPNEPEPENNRERPRPNMNNERPRNMNNRERRNNRERERNDNPRE

Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This

19

19

19

19

19
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29
29
30
30
31
31
32
32
33
33
34
34 ALT1
34
34 ALT1
35
35 ALT1
35
35 ALT1
36
36
37
37
38
38
39
39
40
40
41
41
42
42
43
43
44
44
45
45
46

P NP NP NRPNRPNRPNRPRPNRPRPNRPNRPRPNRPRPNNRPRRPRPNNRRPNRLPRNRNRNIERNLEPR

Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in

w U1 W U

5
3
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46
47
47
48
48
49
49
50
50
51
51
52
52
53
53
54
54 ALT1
54
54 ALT1
55
55 ALT1
55
55 ALT1
56
56 ALT1
56
56 ALT1
57
57 ALT1
57
57 ALT1
58
58
59
59
60
60
61
61

N P NP NEFEP NEPEPNNRPRPRPRPNMNNRPRPRPRPNMNNRERPRPRPNMNNRERPRPNENENRENRENRENRENREN

Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This

30
30

42
30

30
30

Bid 144-2016 Addendum 3 - Page 15



62
62
63
63 ALT1
63
63 ALT1
64
64 ALT1
64
64 ALT1
65
65 ALT1
65
65 ALT1
66
66 ALT1
66
66 ALT1
67
67
68
68
69
69
70
70
71
71
72
72
73
73
74
74
75
75 ALT1
75
75 ALT1
76

P NNBRPRPNRPNRPNRPRNPRPNRPRPNRPNRPRPNRPRPNNRPRRPRPNNRRPNNRREPENNIERPRERNLEPR

Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in

19

(G RNV RNC, RV, N, B T, |

[S2BNV, RV, NV, |

Bid 144-2016 Addendum 3 - Page 16



76 ALT1
76
76 ALT1
77
77 ALT1
77
77 ALT1
78
78 ALT1
78
78 ALT1
79
79 ALT1
79
79 ALT1
80
80 ALT1
80
80 ALT1
81
81ALT1
81
81ALT1
82
82 ALT1
82
82 ALT1
83
83 ALT1
83
83 ALT1
84
84 ALT1
84
84 ALT1
85
85 ALT1
85
85 ALT1

NN FRP P NNREPRPRPNMNNRPRPRPRPNMNNREPRPRPRPNMNNRERPRPRPNMNNRERPRPNMNNRERERERNNRERERERNNRERERERNDNPRE

Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This
Average Delivery Time in
Average Delivery Time in
Warranty Period For This
Warranty Period For This

19

19

19

19

19

19

19

19

19

19
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86 ALT1 1 Average Delivery Time in 19

86 ALT1 2  Warranty Period For This

87 ALT1 1 Average Delivery Time in 19

87 ALT1 2 Warranty Period For This

88 ALT1 1 Average Delivery Time in 19

88 ALT1 2 Warranty Period For This

89 ALT1 1 Average Delivery Timein 19

89 ALT1 2 Warranty Period For This 5
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Rexel Inc.
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|Responding Supplier

Signature Full Name

Signature Email

Reliable Products and Services ( Daniel Hobbs

Bluegrass Evergreen LLC
AIREY-THOMPSON
West-Lite Supply Co, Inc.
Rexel Inc.

Ying Juan Rogers
CASEY SETH
Denise Wiley
ROBERT MAHLE

dhobbs@rpsohio.com
yrogers@bglighting.com
PURCHASING@AIREYTHOMPSON.CON
denise.wiley@west-lite.com
ROBERT.MAHLE@REXELUSA.COM
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Supplier Notes
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