
Bid 130-2020 Addendum 2

FPF Concrete Service INC.

Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 130-2020 Addendum 2
Title: Parks Construction Unit Price Contract
Type: Competitive Bid
Issue Date: 12/10/2020
Deadline: 12/30/2020 02:00 PM (ET)
Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED.  ATTACH ALL

DOCUMENTS IN THE RESPONSE ATTACHMENTS TAB,
INCLUDING EXCEL SPREADSHEET WITH PRICING.

Contact Information

Contact: Kristie Thomas
Address: Central Purchasing

Government Center Building
Room 338
200 East Main Street
Lexington, KY 40507

Phone: (859) 2583320
Fax: (859) 2583322
Email: kthomas@lexingtonky.gov
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FPF Concrete Service INC. Information

Contact: Keri B Monroe
Address: 4088 Weber Way

Lexington
Lexington, KY 40514

Phone: (859) 221-6888
Email: fpfconcrete@gmail.com

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED! By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent
and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached
bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

FPF Concrete Service INC fpfconcrete@gmail.com
Signature Email

Submitted at 12/29/2020 11:30:44 AM

Response Attachments

PARKS 2020 130-2020_UPC_BID_SCHEDULE_ELECTRONIC_FORMrv12.22.2020.xlsx

Park price

Park contract.pdf

price contract

LFUCG Ins cerf.pdf

LFUCG Ins
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Project: Parks Construction Unit Price Contract Bid# 130-2020
Bid Date: 12/30/2020

Contractor: FPF Concrete Service INC.
 

 # Spec 
Sec. Item Unit Unit Price

1 1 Bituminous pavement for athletic courts: Base TN NO BID
2 1 Bituminous pavement for athletic courts: Surface TN NO BID
3 1 Bituminous pavement for athletic courts reinforced with aramid fibers: Base TN NO BID
4 1 Bituminous pavement for athletic courts reinforced with aramid fibers: Surface TN NO BID
5 1 Bituminous pavement milling for athletic courts TN NO BID
6 2 Bituminous pavement crack filler LF NO BID
7 2 Bituminous pavement full depth crack repair LF NO BID
8 2 Athletic court color coating SY NO BID
9 2 Athletic court patch and level surface SY NO BID
10 2 Athletic court striping LF NO BID
11 3 Asphalt sealing SY NO BID
12 3 Parking lot striping LF NO BID
13 5 Chain link fencing; galvanized; 6 ft. LF NO BID
14 5 Chain link fencing; galvanized: 8 ft. LF NO BID
15 5 Chain link fencing; galvanized: 10 ft. LF NO BID
16 5 Chain link fencing;; galvanized: 12 ft. LF NO BID
17 4 Chain link fencing; vinyl coated: 6 ft. LF NO BID
18 4 Chain link fencing; vinyl coated: 8 ft. LF NO BID
19 4 Chain link fencing; vinyl coated: 10 ft. LF NO BID
20 4 Chain link fencing; vinyl coated: 12 ft. LF NO BID
21 6 4 board wood fence LF NO BID
22 7 Dense grade aggregate placed base TN 45.00$                   
23 7 No. 2 stone TN 45.00$                   
24 7 No. 9 stone TN 45.00$                   
25 7 No. 57 stone TN 45.00$                   
26 8 Concrete sidewalk SY 55.00$                   
27 9 Finished Concrete CY 275.00$                 
28 9 Concrete pavement; 4 in. depth SY 55.00$                   
29 9 Concrete pavement; 6 in. depth SY 60.00$                   
30 9 Concrete pavement; 8 in. depth SY 62.50$                   
31 9 Playground header curb installation LF 20.00$                   
32 10 Topsoil CY 40.00$                   
33 11 Excavation CY NO BID
34 11 Embankment CY NO BID
35 12 Finish grading CY NO BID
36 13 Laser grading CY NO BID
37 14 Standard staked silt fence-installed LF 4.00$                     
38 14 Wire back silt fence-installed LF 5.00$                     
39 15 Seeding & protection; General (standard seed mix) SY 3.75$                     
40 15 Seeding & protection: Athletic Field (special seed mix) SY 6.00$                     
41 15 Sod: provide & installation SY 12.50$                   
42 16 Site amenity install; trash/recylcing receptacle EA 275.00$                 
43 16 Site amenity install; standard bench EA 325.00$                 
44 16 Site amenity install: covered single bench EA 325.00$                 
45 16 Site amenity install: covered double bench EA 550.00$                 
46 16 Site amenity install: square picnic table EA 375.00$                 
47 16 Site amenity install: covered square picnic table EA 425.00$                 
48 16 Site amenity installation: 6 ft. rectangle picnic table EA 435.00$                 
49 16 Site amenity installation: 8 ft. rectangle handicap picnic table EA 455.00$                 
50 16 Site amenity installation: covered 6 ft. rectangle picnic table EA 465.00$                 
51 17 Single block masonry retention wall SF NO BID
52 18 Supply and install ADA parking sign EA 225.00$                 
53 19 Solid drain pipe LF 35.00$                   
54 19 4 in. HDPE perforated pipe LF 25.00$                   
55 19 6 in. HDPE perforated pipe LF 28.00$                   



56 20 Jackhammer with operator HR 65.00$                   
57 20 Skid steer loader with operator HR 75.00$                   
58 20 Backhoe (small) with operator HR 75.00$                   
59 20 Roller/compactor with operator HR NO BID
60 20 Grader with operator HR NO BID
61 20 Dump truck (single axle) with driver HR 75.00$                   
62 20 Dump truck (tri-axle) with driver HR 125.00$                 

5% Max Allowance

YES

YES

1,500.00$           

Payment and Performance Bond Cost for Projects over $50,000 (See Special Conditions, Section 6) - Up to 5% 
allowance for total construction cost

Unspecified Incidental Materials at Cost Plus 15% -  Check if Interested

Unspecified Incidental Labor at Direct Wages Plus Certified Overhead Plus 15% - Check if Interested

Minimum Total Project for Consideration (See Special Conditions, Section 3) - Enter dollar amount



ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED?

INSR ADDL SUBR
LTR INSD WVD

PRODUCER
CONTACT
NAME:

FAXPHONE
(A/C, No):(A/C, No, Ext):

E-MAIL
ADDRESS:

INSURER A :

INSURED INSURER B :

INSURER C :

INSURER D :

INSURER E :

INSURER F :

POLICY NUMBER
POLICY EFF POLICY EXP

TYPE OF INSURANCE LIMITS(MM/DD/YYYY) (MM/DD/YYYY)

AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY

UMBRELLA LIAB

EXCESS LIAB

WORKERS COMPENSATION
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES  (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

EACH OCCURRENCE $
DAMAGE TO RENTEDCLAIMS-MADE OCCUR $PREMISES (Ea occurrence)

MED EXP (Any one person) $

PERSONAL & ADV INJURY $

GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE $

PRO-POLICY LOC PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGGJECT

OTHER: $
COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT

$(Ea accident)

ANY AUTO BODILY INJURY (Per person) $
OWNED SCHEDULED

BODILY INJURY (Per accident) $AUTOS ONLY AUTOS

HIRED NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE
$AUTOS ONLY AUTOS ONLY (Per accident)

$

OCCUR EACH OCCURRENCE

CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $

DED RETENTION $

PER OTH-
STATUTE ER

E.L. EACH ACCIDENT

E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE $
If yes, describe under

E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMITDESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #

COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY

Y / N

N / A
(Mandatory in NH)

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE

THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.

If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION.  All rights reserved.ACORD 25 (2016/03)

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE
DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)

$

$

$

$

$

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD

FPFCO-1 OP ID: RKN

01/20/2021

Robert Buchanan
Cambridge Insurance
2300 Regency Rd
Lexington, KY 40503
Robert Buchanan

859-252-0381 859-252-2153

Selective Insurance

FPF Concrete Service Inc
4088 Weber Way
Lexington, KY 40514

A X 1,000,000

X X S  2404732 09/20/2020 09/20/2021 500,000

15,000

1,000,000

3,000,000

3,000,000

1,000,000A

X X S  2404732 09/20/2020 09/20/2021

XA

WC 9070655 09/20/2020 09/20/2021 500,000

500,000

500,000

LFUCG is additional insured for general liability and automobile liability  

LFUCG-4

LFUCG
200 E Main St
Lexington, KY 40507

859-252-0381

12572
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