INVITATIONTO BID

Bid Invianon Number: #45.2014 Diate of lssuer 03/1172014

ER AN

%aag‘,f; bids will be received in the office of the Division of Central Purchasing, Z{E-f? '5"'?'51% M
Leximgron, Kentucky. unti] 2:00 PM. vrevailing Tocal time on 03/25/2014. Bids m
above-mentioned date and time. Mailed hids should be sent tor

Division of Central Purchasing
2060 East Main Street, Room 338
Lexington. KY 40807, (859) 258-3320

The Lexington-Fayette Urban ¢ ountfy Government assumss no responsibility for bids that are not

addressed and delivered as indicated above. Bids that are not defivered to the Division of Central
Purchasing by the stated thine and date will be ;:e}ezz%e{i

All bids must have the company name and address, bid invitation number, and the com modity/service on the
outside of the envelope.

Bids are to include all shipping costs to the point ofdelivery located atr See Specifications

B d ‘as.,mzs?;*y {ugk z;c:fi :’r’:;fé; ,“?{; "‘w zzf:iamszm, Bond Hequired: Yes X Mo

Faor e oveeptabiv).

Ouantity Commuodity/Service
Price Contract Janitorial Chemicals & Supplies 2014
Lhech One; Propesed Delivery:

Bid Specifications Met

e EXeEPUiODS t0 Bid Specifications. Exceprions shall 35 days after scceptance of bid.

be itemized gud attached 1o bid proposol submiiied.

Procurement Cavd Usage
\/“z’ s The L@m’xmm Fayette Urban County Govermment will be using Procurement Cards to
_No  purchase goads and services and also w make payments. Will vou accept Procurement Cards?
Subimitted by Cili nt Chemij cé‘l & Jani tor: al Suppl 1 es, Inc.
Fimn
P.0. Box 58028 -
Addrens

Iouz%valle, KY 40268-0028

State & Zf;z

Bid must be signed: /MM mM

{original signatire) Signature of Authorized Company Representative — Title
Michael Williams Vice- President

Representeative’s Mume {Topod or prinred,
(502)267-5367 . (502)267-4511

Arvag Cende - Phose - Extension FarH
saleg@clintchemicals.com




The Affidavit in this bid must be completed before your firm can be considered for mward of this contract,
i f { J . .

AFFIDAVIT

%

Comes the Afflant, . and after boing first duly sworn

under penalty of perjury ag llows:

I, Hisfhername s | ¢ ?CA’)M\ win,lmg

whividual submitting the bid or is the Lzri“é@nnﬁ representative o

__ Q/{h\fﬁr C"\'&%‘?CGJ\ % l@(\ﬂﬁ‘ﬁ‘{ %v@?m | )

the entily submitting the bid (hereinafter veferred to as "Bidder™.
2. Bidder will pay all taxes and fees, which are owed 10 the Lexington-Favetie Urban

County Government at the time the bid is submitted, prior 1o award of the contract and will maintaina
currem” status in regard 1o those taxes and fees during e life of the confract
3. Bidder will obtain a Lexington-Fayeite Urban County Government business license
fapplicable. prior to award of the contract,

- Budder has authorized the Division of Central Purchasing to verity the gbove-
mentioned éi amhaizfm with the Division of Revenue and to disclose to the Urban County Couneil that
taxes gud/or fees are delinguent or that a business license has not been obtained.

3. Bidder bas not knowingly viol ii,{i any provision of the campaign fnance Taws of
the Commonwealth of Kentucky within the past five (5) vears and the award Gz contract 1o the Bidder
will not mﬁi}m any provision of the campaign finance laws of the Commonwealth.

. Bidder has not knowingly violated any provision of (i 'izapzﬁr 25 of'the Lexington-
Fayette Urban {,mma* Government Code of {}mmaawm kmown as "Ethics Act”

. Bidder acknowledges that "knowingly” for purposes of this Affidavit means, with
‘fﬁ‘ig}izc‘i to conduct or to circumstances described by a statute or ordinance defining an offense, that 2

ersoi 15 aware or should bave been aware that his conduct is of that nature or that the circumstance

E:’m;aw,
Parther, Affiant saveth naught. _/y\[\ M W
STATE OF %J—

COUNTY OF @M{ 9/

The foregomy mai ment was subseribed, sworn to and acknowledged before m

/?}% s;?ff c’fiz,z/fi 5@? fiims fiis the m&fﬁféf day

sy
: ) Py
of f{}qﬁr{f?ﬁ/} , 24,

My Commission expires: t;// 22/ 7017

xfitszﬁ PUBLIC, STATE AT LARGE

Please refer to Section Il Bid Conditions, Item U7 prior to completing this form.
Faud
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1. GREEN PROCUREMENT

A. ENERGY

The Lexington-Fayetre Urban County Govermment is commitied o profecting our enviraument

and being fiscally responsible 1o our citizens.

The Lexington-Favette Urban County Government mandates the use of Energy Star compliam
products if they are available 1 the markeip] ce (g0 10 www. lnerevstar.goy), Hihes

3 %

are available, but not submitted in vour pricing, vour bid wilt be rejected as pon-com

£

ENERGY STAR is a government program that offers businesses and con
solutions, making 1t easy to vave money while protecting the environment for future generations.

These products use 25 o 50% less energy
Reduced energy costs withou! compromisin
Reduced air pollution because fewer foss
Stgnificant retum on investment

Extended product life and decreased maintenance

quality or performance
uels are bumed

B. GREEN SEAL CERTIFIED PRODUCTS

The Lexngton-Fayette Urban County  Government is alse  commitred to using oiher
environmentally  friendly products that do not negatively impact our environment. Green Seal
35 & pon-profit organization devoted to environmental standard setting, product certification, and
public education,

Go to www.Greensealorg to find available certified preducts. These products will have a
redhuced impact on the environswent and on hwman health, The products to be used must be pre-
approved by the LFUCG prior to commencement of any work i any LEUCG facilizy, 1¥2 Green
Seal product is not available, the LFUCG must provide a signed waiver 1o use an elternate
product. Please provide information on the Green Seal products heing used with your bid
TESPUTISE.

C. GREEN COMMUNITY

The Lexington-Fayetie Urban County Government (LYUCG) serves as a principal, along
with the University of Kentucky and Fayette County Public Schools, in the Bluegrass
Partnership for a Green Convmunity. The Purchasing Team component of the Partnership
collaborates on economy of seale purchasing that promotes and enhances environmental
Initiatives. Specifically. when applicable, each principal is interested in obtaining best
value products and/or services which promete environment initiatives via solicitations and
awards from the other principals.

If your company is the suceessful bidder on this Invitation For Bid, do vou agree to extend

the same product/service pricing to the other prinecipals of the Bluegrass Partnership for a
Green Community (Le. University of Kentucky and Fayette County Schools) if requested?

o



L.  Bid Conditions

!

Ty

L

v

St

No bid may be withdrawn fora §?é‘:2"§i§i§ ot sixty (607 davs after the date and tme set for opening.

late and time set for ag}s:“s w b case of obvious eprors, the
v permit the wit

g
hdrawal of 2 bid. The decision as 1o whether 2
1 be that of'the Division of Central Purchasing,

o bid may be altered
“gwazm of Central §
bid may he withdrawn shal

Acceptance of this proposal shall be enactiment of an Qedinance by the Urban County Council -
¢ bidde Urban County Governmes

Benara

e izgszfs; or %L?“imuh reasons, and o award each
sendor.

Minor ex ‘“iﬁ?‘i‘%c‘mﬁ may not eliminate the bidder. The decision as to whether any exception

minos shall be entirely that of the head of the requisitioning Department or Division and the
Dnrector of the éf}w:%mz of Central Purchasing. The Urban County Government may Wﬁé%—»‘c

technicalities and mitrmalities where such watver would best serve the interests of the Lirhans
County Govermment,

Manutachurers catzle
purposes and are to guide the bidder in interpreting the standard of quality

performance desired, and shall not be construed 1o exclude gm;‘:g uxaﬁi %}mm on f m@bénu ather
types of materials and/or services, However, any gi,zbs;‘z:;tiaémn i
must be clearly noted and {Eﬁ@;‘:i‘ibs—:{%‘ otherwise, it will be a
supply iems %pezséﬁcasiv mentioned m this Invitation for Eﬂéa

gue numbess. trade names. etc., where shown herem are for descriptive

,-4

fthe materials proposed herain

The Urban County é:‘eﬁw%*;’zsm may reguire demonstrations of
prior to acceptance of this proposal.

guthorized

Bids must be submitted on this *"a}rﬁ and must be signed by ¢
sg}z‘m&;&’;&ms Unsigned bids will not be considered.

Bids must be submitted prior to the date and time indicated for opening, Bids submitted after
tius time will not be considered.

All bids mailed must be marked on the face of the envelope:

“Bid on #45-2014 Janitorial Chensicals & Supnlies 20147

and addressed t Division of Central Purchasing
200 East Mam Strect, Boom 338
Lexingion, Kentucky 40507

The Lexingion-Fayette Urban County Government assumes 5o responsibility for bids

that are not addressed and delivered as indicated above. Bids that are pot delivered to
the Division of Central Purchasing by the stated finie and date will be rejected,

Bidder s reguested 1o show both unit prices and lof prices. In the event of error, the unit price
sizatl prevail,

N %
T s
L

A certified 7casl heck or Bid Bond in the amount of _N/A _ percent of the bid price must be
aftached hereto. This check must be made pavable to the Lexington-Favetie Eﬁ'zrha*‘z County
Govertenent. and will be returned when the material and/or services specified herein have been

i7

5‘1\
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P

e Hine

delivered in iii’i?is{%i}iﬁ W *i:f f j tos

perind set fortt Bis Bid, i1 is az?:fw{z the certifiod 7 cashier™ k may be cashed and fhe funds

med by the L s:}‘z“ftra*w% avette Urban { 0 ernment as Hguidated damages, oky of
swful bidd $ been awardod,

1 returned when the

uansuccessiu! bidders

I by mdder may be a factor in the determination

hidder,
Tabulations of bids recei &fed :*;;a* P;{: muiled o bidders. Bidders

enclose a stamped. seli-addre welope with the bid

ayette Urban County Government s exempt from Kentucky 5

Federal Excise Tax on materials purchased from his bid invitation. Material
oidder for construction projects are not (ax exempt and are the sole respon %’f“*é?

3

All material furnished hereunder must be in full compliance with OSHA re

I mare than one bid is offered by one party, or by any person or persons representing a party, all

zif be rejected.

such bids

o

Signature on the face of this bid ?}}’ he Brdder or his ﬁafﬂ ized :{:g} esentative shall be construed
us acceplance ﬁﬁ"aﬁd compliance with all terms and conditions contained berein,

The Entity (regardless of whether construction contractor. non-construction contractor or
supplier] agrees o gﬁ‘m e equal opportunity in employment for all qualified porsons, w prohibit
discrimination in emploviment because of race, color, creed, national origin, sex o age. and 1o
promote equal employment through a positive, continuing program from 1 mié; and each of ifs
%a‘zhmmmg“ﬂ%gzéﬁg agents.  This program of equal employment opporiuni apply 1o every
spect of sts emploviment policies and practices.

¢ Kentucky Equal Employvinent Opportusity Act of 1978 (KRS 4556045, 040} reguires that
any county, oity, town, school district water distrier, hospitai distriet, or other political
subdivision of the state shall include in directly or indirectly publicly funded contracts for
supplies, matenials, services, or equipment hereinafter entered into the foliowi g ProvIsions:

ijm’éng the performance of this contract. the contractor agrees as follows:

) The contractor swill not diserintimuate against any emplover or applicant for caplovinent
beeause of race, color, religion, sex. age or nasional origing

vees placed By or
7 Jor

(2) The contractor will state in all solicitations or advertisements for emplo
on behali of the contraciors that all qualified applicants will receive considerati
employment without regard to race, color, religion, sex, age or naticial origin:

(3} The contractor will post nutices in c()fzmzz"zz:;z;ﬁ places, available 1o emplovees and
applicants for emplovment, senting forth the provisions of the non-discrimination dlauses
requived by this section, and

133

(4) The corractor will send o notice 1o each Tubor union or representative of workers with
ai;ﬁ{‘ﬂ e has a collective bargair zf;f;;z HEFOPMIERD OF OIOr coulract or pnger
fe lobor anion or workers' *e;;_z”g»,?f}555;{‘;’;-’43 Gf the contracior’s comminments

mrder the ?‘E{HE,{SEE'C????E???{ff?(?}? plenses,

KRS 45.610. Hiing minorities - Information required

& of 14



(00 For the longil of the convact. eacl conmracior shall hive mbiorities from other sourecs
hin the drow ca. should the union with which he has

cient mlnoriios fo so

agroements be i

gt supplv st

andd thmctnble,

fre lenigth of the comract, firiish such inf

o by swch

PO oI

issied pursin

s

ihoreta and will permit aceess to all Books and recor
practices and work sites by 1/
pvesiigation lo wseerfain complionce with KRS 45560 1o 45 640
ol prrsuant thereio.

PP S P N
(SN L LGN IREHT

and such rudes,

KRS 45.620. Action against contractor - Hiring of minority contractor or subcontractor

(1) A any contracior is fowd By the deparnnent 10 have engaged in an onlawful practice
andar this chaprer diring the course of performing under ¢ coniract or subcorniract
covered pnder KRS 45361 16 43,640, the depariment shall so corif 1o the coHtracting

shall be binding upon the comtracting agency wnless it is

ageney and such certifivasion

reversed in the course of fudicial roview.

g

£

120 I the conracior is found 16 have committed an uniowful praciice under KRS 45.560) to
15,640, the contracting ageney may cancel or ferminaie the controer, conditioned upon o
pragram for futire complianee approved by the contracting agency and the department,

The contracting ageney mayv declare such o contracior incligible 1 bid on firther

B

contracts with that agencv wnnl such time as the contractor complies in full with the
reguiremenis of KRS 43 560 10 45 640,

13) The equal emplovment provisions of KBS 45560 1o 45640 may be met in part By g
contractor by subcontracting to a minerin contractor or subconiracior. For the
provisions of KRS 45,361 ro 45,640, o minorin: contractor or subcontractor shall mean o
business that is owned and cortrolled by one or more persons disadvaniaged by
ctfatic circumstances.

KRS 45630 Termination of existing employee not required. when

Ay provision of KRS 435.560 10 45.640 norwithstanding, ro contracior shall be required to
rermninate an existing ciplovee upon proof that that emplover was emploved priov io the date
sf the contraot,

KR 45640 Minimum skills

Nothing in KRS 45.560 to 45840 shall require a contractor to hire o vone who fails 1o

demonstrate the minimum skifls reguived 1o perform a particilar job.

8

It 1s recommended that all of the provisions above quoted to be included as special conditions
in each vontract. In the case of a contract exceeding $250,000, the contractor is required to
furnish evidence that his work-force in Kentucky is representative of the available work-force
in the area from which he draws employees, or to supply an Affirmative Action plan which
will achieve such representation during the life of the contract.

Any party. firm or individual submitting a proposal pursuant to fhis invitation must be in
compliance with the requirements of the Lexington-Favette Urban County Govermnent
regarding taxes and fees before they can be considered for award of this invitation and must
maintain @ “current” status with regard fo those taxes and fees throughout the term of the

Foot 14



contract. The coptractor must be in comphance with Chapter 1 22’{‘%5 1 the O{fiﬁ o Ohyeling

of the § Lesmy ion
with Ordime
Inspest

0 contractor

Pursyant to KRS 45A.343 and KRS 45A.345. the contractor shall

{ij  Reveal anv final determination of a viclgtion v the controciar
}gsz; pys?m pursiant to KRS Chapiers 136 {f*{p wration aind il
RO IXOS) 337 fwages wnd houry 338 foco

tr f?f mplovess), 341 tunemploveient wid compensation) and 342 flabor cnd biman

CHIXCS A 555}!:::@5{{ it

H

?Qiffif} 28}

5 ’fi”ﬁ‘ andd

5 thal appdy fo the contracior: and

i) e in continuons complionee with the above-mentionod KBS provisions that appiio thy

comiractor for e duration of the contracr,

stoms for the duration o
tion of the contractor

A vontracior's failure to reveal the above or o comply with such *}‘
contract shall be s for cancellation of the contract and disquali
eligibility for futive contracss for a period of two (2} vears,

‘.,
147
341

YVendors who respond to this invitation have the right to file a notice of contention associated
with the bid process or 1o file a notice of appeal of the recommendation made try the Director
of Central Purchasing resulting from this invitation.

“’\ég}iéae of contention with the bid process must be filed within 3 business davs of the
bid/proposal opening by (1) sending a writien notice, mchuding sufficien é{’ssvzﬁﬁééé”ﬁ‘?sfz 0

support contention, to the f};@mm;ﬁ of the Division of Ceniral Purchas sing o {2 subiniiting a
written request for a meeting with the Director of Central Purchasing to explain hi ;‘_xshi;(i

ontention with the bid ;m - After consulting with the Commissioner of Finance the
Chief Administrative Office é reviewing the documentation and/or hearing the vendor.
the Director of Central Pur ;.,h ASing %%’%&” ;}’mnp‘*;a respond in writing fndings as to the
compliance with bid processes. T, ‘?r}a n this review, a bid process irregularity 1s deemed

o have oceurred the Director of Cents :r,;,é PL&ELE}QSH}& witl consult with % 1 Commmssioner of
Fmance, the Chiel Administrative Officer and the D spartment of Law as to the appropriste
remedy.

Notice of appeal of 2 bid recommendation must be filed within 3 business days of the bid
recommendation by (1) sending & written notice, including sufficient documentiation to
?%i%}}?}(}!"f appesl, to the Director, Division of Central Purchasing or (2) submitimg a wriften

reguest for a meeting with the Director of Central Parchasing to explain his appesl. Afier
reviewing the documentation and/or hearing the vendor and co ufting with  the
Commissioner of §‘--‘;§12‘}C§f é?”ﬁfj the Chiel Administrative Officer. the Director of Central

Purchasing shall ip writing, affimn or withdraw the recornmendation.

8 of 14



Procurement Contract Bid Conditions

asﬁep‘amgi of th act by
% o - S S | ene
nont omay be extended for an

ang 'i f§-§€ i%ﬁ%i%‘“i{%%?ﬁ‘v%ﬂit}

A ’?"é*" terins of Ei 18 agreement shall be for 2 vears from the o is g
Jrban County Government.  This agrea
Wai upon the written agreement of the b
Urban ima;“ﬁ:g {;m«mzm;':z* . Said agrecment must be in writing an

Fexpirafion of the corren! agreement.

2. Prce Changes (Space Checkted Applies)

(XXX} 1. Prices quoted in response to the Invitation shall be firm prices for the first 90 davs of the
Procurement Contract. After the first 90 days, prices may be subjeet to revision and such
changes shall be based on general industry changes, Revision may be either increases or
lecreases and may be requested by either party, There m‘ be no more than one (1) price

i ot quarter. Requests for price changes shall be received in writing at lesst

%’fwﬁ% gwffi i& vs prior to the effective date and are S'imj{f tto written acceptance before

hecoming effective. Prm; 0*‘ i}e validity of a reguest tor revision shall be respousibibity
af the requesting party, Lex gt m-Favette Urban County Government shall receive
the benefit of any de etler shall offer bis other accounis.

{} 2. No provision for price change is made herein. Prices are 1o be firm for the term of thi
contract,

{12, Procurement Level Contract

s ot avatlable from the vendor, the Lexington-Favette Urban Cows

L i any COnEC i v
option, may permit the iteimn to be back-ordered or may procure the item on

e
Covermment, at s
the open EE‘?&E"K”‘*

D, Al invoices must bear reference w the ng © Government
Purchasing document numbers which are being hilled.

e

E.  This contract may b?: canceled by either party thirty (30) days after delivery by canceling party
of written notice of intent {0 cancel to the other contr acting party.

F. This contract may be canceled by the Lexington-Favette Urhan County Govermment if it is

determined that the Bidder has failed to perform under the tenms of this agreement, such
cancellation to be effective upon receipt of written notice of cancellation by the Bidder,

4. Mo aabamwmiﬁ for articles specified herein may be made withovt prior approval of the
9 1 of Central Purchasing,

FITVIRI



LFUCC Non-Appropriation Clause

or acknow! hat the LFUCG 18 2 poverpmental entity. and L% coriract val
the availability of public funding under the authority of its statutory m

{5} -

.,~

‘%‘*e? ormance of the LFUCG s

?zz the event that public funds are unavailable
Woiigat w:w zzﬁ{m this contract. then this g,,m‘s’::;' %Za
ays affer writien notice to Confracior a,f the unavailebi ﬁw aii a,i §"0u“:s§?}*§ ué, wation of o z;;iéz:

It is expressly agreed that the LFUCG shall not activate this non-appropriation provision for its
eriience or 1o circrvent the requirements of this contract, but only as an emergency fscal measure

izl fiseal crisis, which ts generally is governmental oporations.

authorily, e mi:a 12 and mandated B
3 f‘ét%' t
thout 1
{; §ie 525 au

the LFUCG s statutory
Hve or *G,i; datory action, which adversely atfects the LFE,Z{"{E".\; aut
nligations under this contract, then this confract shall automatic

G upon written notice 1o O m‘zi‘s‘;‘ic‘i{}f of such limitation or change

In the esvent
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GENERAL PROVISIONS OF BID CONTRACT

hat 1t understands and ;zg ees Wi i% the é";iis;m{mg ProvIsions

ction by

meerning this type of service or

ga’ma‘;.

ALL forms information required by LFUCG may be grounds for

Addenda: Al ad

aééﬁz&{i nééﬁ

ent z:ng*s:s" dder to m; ;;‘;mz ;ﬁeé as 10 whether
e g% z“sf:, bidder to cover any such addends may resul

11 ‘-%fﬁmiﬁ 0r

{10 1 jLCf any or all bid responses, to aw
roposals. LFUCG may consider any alternative

Bid Reservations: LEFUCG regerves the
part and to walve minor b i
propesn That meets its basico needs,

Liability: LFUCG 35 not responsible for any cost ineurred by bidder in the preparation of s
TESPONSE.

Changes/Alterations: Bidder may change or withdraw a proposal af any time prior to the opening:
however, no oral modifications will be allowed. Only letters. or other formal written reguests for
modifications or corrections of a prev subimitted *psm; witich s addressed in the same

manner as the bid response, and received by LFUCG priortot zs,, scheduled closing time for receipt
of bids. will be accepted. The bid response when opened. will then be comrected in accordance with
such written request(s), provided that the written request is wu?ainﬁé i a sealed envelope which is
plamly marked “modifications of bid response™

Clarification of Submittal: LFUCG reserves the right to obtain clarification of any v point by a bid oy
to obtain additional information from anv bidder.

Bribery Clause: By his signature on its response, bidder certifies that no emplovee of histhers,
,;at} af‘; Hiate or subcontractor. has bribed ¢r attempted o bribe an officer or cnploves of the

Additional Information: While nof nésé%gaz’m the udder may include any product brochures,
software documentation, sample reports, or other documentation that may assist LTUCS in better
undersianding and cvaluating il ¢ i e;§ response. Additional documentation shal]l not serve as a
substitute for other documentation whicl is required by the LFUCG to be submitted with the bid
TES[NSE.

Ambiguity, Conflict or other Fr‘{;rﬂ:‘ ta bidder discovers any ambiguity, conflict, discrepancy,
omission or other error in the bid request of LFUCG, it shall immediately notify LFUCG of such
error in wnting and request o a‘*fj? mam n or clarification of the document if aliowable by the
LFUCG.

e N

RENER o

e



1

et

fa—

ey
L

s
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Lo

A

~af

Y all ;ﬁ{‘?i‘
b eontract ;E% submIss
ing. ntent ’z%*éﬁ reguiremeants i‘? 5
bidder shall warrant that it is fam and understands §?§ provisions herem and shall warrant
that it can comply with them. No ;:z;%dimcznﬁi compensation w0 bhidder shall be authorized for
services, expenses, or goods reasonably covered under these provisions that the bidder omits from
its bid response,

Cancellatio % CG may unilaterally ¢
e, *%uﬂ; T

v advance writien o
ted prioy w wz%* Hef ApPTo 5
z‘m.»‘iéeé zéaﬁggﬁ fw

cuuse, by provid
ivance writlen notice period 18 nepo
- goods veceived prior 10 term ﬁw‘;,{% 1 shall be made b
or services were provided i 2 manner :mcz,l‘}*;mk. 1o the LFI
services shall not be unreasonably withl

The selected bidder{s} shall not assign or subcontract any portion of the

CGowithout the express written consent of LFUCG, Any purported
§ ¥

wnt or subcontract in violation hereof shall be void. It is expressly acknowledged that

25‘32,{;{} shall never be required or obligated w0 consent to any f*sausm for assignment or

subcontract: and further that such refusal fo consent can be for any or no reason, fully within the

sole diseretion of LFUCG,

o

No Waiver: ure or delay by LFUCG in exercising any right. remedy, power or privilege
hereunder, nor any amvh, or partizl exercise h:} eof. por the exercise of any other right, remedy,
power or privilege shall operate as a waiver hereof or thereof. No failure or delay by LFUCG in
ising any night. remedy, power or privilege under or in respect of this bid proposal or bid
contract shall atfect the rights, remedics, powers or privileges of LFUCG hereunder or shall

operate as 2 waiver thereof.

Authority to do Business: Each bidder must be authorized to do business under the laws of the
Commonwealth of Kentucky and must be in good standing and have full legal capacity to provide
the goods or services s{su‘wﬁ in the bid proposal. Each bidder must have all necessar v right and
tewful authority 1o submit the bid response and enter into the bid contract for iﬁi i1l e hereof
imcluding any necessary corporate or other action authorizing the bidder 1o submit the bid response
and enter info this bid contract, If requested, the bidder will provide LFUCG with 3 copy of 2
corporate resolution authorizing this action and/or a letrer from an attornev confirming that the
proposer 1s guthorized to do business in the Commenwealth of Kentucky, All bid responses must
be signed by a duly authovized officer, agent or emplovee of the bidder.

Governing Laws ¥ bid z\;qd{:m and bid contract shall be gmwz‘ﬁsé by and construed
accordance with the laws of the Commonwealth of Kentucky. In the event of any procesdings
regarding this matter, ’ihﬁ bidder agrees that the venue shall be the Faverte {, gunty Cireuit Court or
50 Distrct Court for the Eastern District of Kentucky, Lz:?tx;zﬁgtm Division and that the bidder
sty comsents {o personal jurisdiction and venue in such Court for the limited and sole
g‘u%“}i?%L of proceedings relating to these matters or any rights or obligations arising theresmder.

Ability 1o Mest Obligations: Bidder affinnatively states that there are no actions. suifs or
E

proceedings of any kind pending against bidder or, to the knowledge of the bidder, threatened
£

[ -1
N

£ A
or LE



it sibnal o
rmined. huve a materially adverse ¢ w guthority or
tv of bidder to perform its obligations under this bid response or bid contract, or which
questton e feg vail *;z or enforceabifity hercof or thereof,

zovernmental boc

Bidder understands and agrees that its
LEUCG for any purpose whatsoever
bid response or bid contract.

VeEs. Bgents, or subcontraciors are nol emplovees of
¢ 15 an independent contractor at all umes related o the

ract shall be found to be iHegal or unenforceable, the
vemain in full force and such term or provision shall be deemed

Mo, 9% 301y

Dats

12 of

ot
o



EQUAL OPPORTUNITY AGREEMENT

nded 19727 stares that i is unlawiid for an emplos

P Rights Act of 1964 (a :
1. sex. age (40-70 years) or national origin,

yate 1 ¢ :z“miz vivieni be

se o rave, oolor, rel

xecutive Order No. 11246 on Nondiscrimination under Pederal contract g’&ﬁ;éﬁ?:; employmesit
3’33%»&&'2&&&? fon by contractor gnd sub-contractor doing business with the Federal (e za«szmﬁeﬂi ut
ﬁpwzm of Federal funds. This order was later amended by Executive Order No,
mination on the basis of sex,

FREAEE e
10

Seeron 303 of the Rehabilitution Act of 1973 statey:

The Contractor will not discriminnte agginsy any emplovee or gpplicant for i“??ii},?fﬁﬂ'i'i??f?'?f
because of phvsical or mentad handicap,

112 of the Vietnam Era Veterans Readjustment Act of 1973 “z:z,ga,a;zu Affirmative Action on
1sabled veterans and veterans of the Vietnam Fra by contractors having Federal contracts.

vrichions {or

Section 206(AY of Excoutive Order 12086, Consolidation of Contract Coe
Equal Emplovinent Opportunity, states:

The Secretary of Labor may invesiisote the emplovment practices of anv Government

cantracior or sub-contracror vo determine whetlier or not the contractual provisions
of this order have been violated.

specified in Section 2

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Govermiment practices Equal Opportunity in recruiting, hiring and
promoting. It is the Govermmnent's intent to affirmatively provide emplovment opporfumities for those
individuals who have previously not %ﬁ@f:v allowed o enter info the mamstrearn of socicty, Because of s
wnporiance o the local Government, this policy carries the full endorsement of the Mayor. Commissioners.
Directors and all supervisory pereos mfl In following this commitment to Equal Eiployment Opportunity

¢ beeause the Government is the benefactor of the Federal funds, 1t is both against the Urban County
Government policy and illegal for the Government to Jet contracts fo companies which knowingly or

unknowingly practice discrimination in thelr employment practices,  Violation of the above mentioned
ordinances may cause 2 contract 1o be canceled and the contractors may be declared mmeligible for futwe
consideration.

Please sign this stat g.,muﬁ in the appropriste space acknowledging that 34}% have read and understand the
7 s document as part of your &zﬁgﬁﬁvaz 0 packet

é?éz‘igﬁ*v%ié%zﬁ;ﬂ& coiay

Bidders
WWe agree to vomphy with the Civil Eights Laws listed above that govern eng foveent rights of minorivics,

wamien, Vietnom veterans, havdicapped ond aged porsons.

B ATV CAClname) s Y ow, Sl
Signature Name of Business

-
Y



SAMITORIAL CHEMICALS & BUPPLIES 2014

Hem ICileaning Supplies - Section | _
Hem Desaription Brand Hame | Unit Green Garfified Mo - Gresn
Hems - Unit Price | Certified Boms -
Link Brice
Fioor way, § gelion pails, "One Way of soug! % £$55.44
1 WEPAK #06 WEPAK i &2
Figor wex, 4-1 galion, “One Wa or aoual % £44.35
v WEPAK #06 WEPAK o8 £5
Floor Stripper, 5 pall "Bare Bones™ o equs! ¥ g
ST 9 WEPAK . *41.86
Fieor S;r&;&er. 41 galion."Here Bones” ¢ k2 $32.86
4 WEAK #48 WEPAK &8 o5
Srapback, Johnson, 4-1 gaton Lo % g
5 WEPAK #08 WEPAK £s ggz‘?. 10
Sinde Neulrst Clganer, Jobrson. 401 godion fues of egual ] $21.38
g WEPAK #57 WEPAK &5 cs
Spray Buff, 1 galion ugs, dics 2 $19.58
i WEPAK #09 WEPAK £s os
Furntliers Pofish, Lemon ¥ oz can, 1Egs -3 3
s o5 cg NOQ BID
Glass Cleaner. quart. Resdy ©© Use. Wirdes™ or equa! g $ 22.95
¢ WEPAR #60 WEPAR cs es
Liquid dheanser, “Uomel or squal, 22 oz, Botias, 9os 3 $ 21,29
0 WEPAK #36 WEPAK o5 £s
Pine scented clsaner/dagreaser, galion, reaty-io-usa % $15.27
14 WEPAK #56 WEPAK o8 os
8/1 galloniss, "Chorox” or eousl % 2 9,90
42 KIK Bleach 6 e s
Digirteciant lowd, (MUY, & virusy quart "Acid Free Clotoy or enus 4 £19.00
<3 lssfon WEPAK #34 WEPAK cs ¢s
Hydrogan Peroxds Mull Purpose Cls jalinn g per oase 3 g
o wios WEDAK 4100 (dxrfirrrer MEPAK : $43.78
Staintess sleel cleaner, 172 gaiéﬁrs;aga, per sase % $
15 s s NO BID
EPA Hosplial Grade. Meudral Pri Disindectant Cleaner 3 £21.56
6 | WEPAR #13 WEPAK g o
Liguid hane shep, "Dial” or squal. galion, dios % &
o o5 2 NO BID
Fink lolion fend soap, "Kimberdy-Clark sanifresty’, or equal. 4 gatics % %
" & T .. NO BID
"E-Z Faks” o equsd Al Purpose Claener Water Souubls 0.5 nr Packe's, % kS
14 180/cs o8 «sNC BID
Fusell instant Hand Sanilizer, 4 pz. portabls botlle, 8558275 or equal 3 %
20 = esNO BID
L0 Pine Clasner, gsfion fugs, ready 1o use % ¥ NO BID
2] 959 LE
Air Frashosney % %
22 &8 s NO BID
Dishwasher Detergent. Powdersd, 10 b buoket § iNO BID
23 Dtpokst Beisiat
Distwasher 5,35:%&; sné Dawn. 8-28 oy bollles P g C & $34.10
24 PGC— 5 5 rg s
Fosming Disinfeciant Clesngr, "Haricang” or soual 12,5 o7 cen -4 £ NO BID
iz o5 o]
Sanitizing Wines Lysol or equal per park % $331.17
28 REC-81700 76ct. IYSOL £s cs
Laundry Detargent. Powdsr, with scasty 57 1b box {no siaples in box) % %
. ¢ g . ., NO BID
CEO-35419 CTorsx £ 524785
25 Fiz=Sol Lemon Frash Cleaner/3-144 oz, boitles bl bt
Bupplies - Section i




Mop heat!s must be composed of a1 least 30% nos! oonmmmer wasis and 879 post industrial waste and free from post recyeling dves, Please
provide g price for blo-degradeiie liners,

Besoription Beand Name | Uni Groen Lertifiad Hor - Green
ftems « Unit Price | Certifisd Hems -
Linit Price
Can Liners - 42 x 48 pisck. o, 22 micron, 1507cs. part & BB3057 of 5 g NUTELD
-5 e L%
Cars Lingrs - Lawge, 43 x 48 clear, 1o 11 1 minron. 2000y £ $ NO BID
3 zs
Cant Lingrg ~ Mediur, 30 x 37, clear. 25 per rol, mirdmur 10 micron £ S
a2t S00/es cz ¢« NO BID
T 3 g NO BID
3% Biod 0% oS
Oz Ihics, Biodegrasehis % ¥ NO BID
33 o o5
Can Diners - Blesl wn 2 mi, grey, Blies k3 3
34 o5 s NO BID
Wing soped: 124 Myion 3 5 NO BID
35 ] ea
Mophead, 24 oz, satlon lpyvilat screwip g ¥ NO BID
38 ea B
Ropheed, 57 med Witdend "nlue” washahie mop beads 12708 5 ]
37 25 «= NO BID
Mopheat frame anly, 48 4 5 $ 35.64
a8 UNS-1448 UNTSAN P 2z
Swévgiﬁfﬁgiégi&ﬁqﬁ pprdie UNTISAN H £ 9.71
G &3 35
Angle brom, 1300 melel, wie or nylon rope, “Zepher 234068 o equal % 3
43 . &5 NO BID
Fush broom, 247 sB garage prstie, "Paimyra” of sgusl Board-— % ¥ 10.27
43 BWK-20124 Walk w8 ga
Hetal i push broom screw-in handle Board- 3 5 3,31
- BWK-136 Walk ea =
SBopravars & botfss, 32 oz, complete fhollies must be clear) % ¥ NO BID
43 & &
26" buffer peds. slandarg, Back, Scs . & % 17.69
44 PAD4020BI A Premier es o
207 buffer pade. siandsrs. whils, Sice \ 5 §
e FAD4O 58 T Premier cs o2 1-83
207 bufler gadls, stendard, red, Sios . % %
45 PADAO 0L ED Premier - o 14.85
4
13 Black strinper pad, slandard. Blas £ ¥ 8.77
47 PADA0G13RLA Premier cs cs
13 rod siripper pad, sianoard. Bios % %
28 PAD4A40O13RED Premier o 2 B.67
13" wivite stripper pad, stendarg, Sics % %
45 PADAD]I 3WHT Premiern s s 8.67
Was-pags, Vend Pack 84.147 Hospital % ¥ 30.91
50 HOS-147A Speciallty o5 i
Uringt 2oreens wiblook, scenled, 12/cin A 311.97Z2
a4 KRY-NUS KRYSTAT st ot
Urnai Blocks, Deoderent, per doz. % $ 5.85/d=.
Toiel bow 14° mops - s L7
g2 UNS~-160 UNISAN o5 e >
44 gation Brute garbage conlginers wiids "Rubbermaid” or eousl R s 1 g
¥ 2 ubbermaid 43.34
G4 RCP-2643-GRA B2 ea
Ligks for 44 gal. Brute garbage conteiners, "Rubbermait” or squal % $16.90
55 RCP-2645-60BLA R =&
Dust pag, 127 withpi bandle “Bohbsrmaid 22068 or eousl . %
o | REPEPHOEEHA i Rubbermfid | ;4.32
Serubbing Spongs. Light. White/Yeliow, 20/es Ineeds 16 be individuadly % £17.65
&Y wigppst)  PAD 163-20 Premien £ 8




Hor - SGiraen

Description Hrand Mame Lt Green Dertifisg
ftams - Und Price Catifisd Hems -
Bhing Bange. Mediom, GreeniYelow, 20/cs g 44,19
53 MCO 20688 3M o5 £5
Dust Mop Covers, 7 x 38° 2 £ 10.50
aa UNS-1336 UNISAN e 8
Dhist Mop Framas, 372 387 % % 4.63
4] UNS- 1436 UNISAN 28 28
&4 Moz Handlg! Clamp on ¥ 3 9,72
51 UNS 1490 UNTSAN 43 B
Soan. 34 o bars 3 % NO BID
B2 ] o8
127 Shower/Fioor Sorub Brush, Rubbermaid or souivalent % %
- ea =2 NO BID
& tron Handls Serud Brush, Rubbermn $ 5 2.50
4 RCP-6482C0B Rubbermaid (& e
7 seal covess, holf i o ok 20 sigeves of 250 covers gy, _ % 2 32.45
£ “Fallable”  or suusl (e ¢ BWK5000 %g?id o5 i
Rubhermaid Heavy-Duly Dus! Pan (Must be all plasic) Rubbermaad & k2 4,32
B RCP 2005CHA ea a8
RCP- 6310WHI Rubbermaid 3 E 2.19
&7 Hunbermaid 15" White Hounchead Tolle! Bowt Brush (el Blastic &5 25
) Hiue Rubbsrmaid Floor Seruls Brush (Must ezl plastic) ¥ ]
&5 B 22 NG BID
Rubbemmaid §7 Hound Handie Sorub Brush Vst ba 28 plzstic) 4 k4 NO BID
B3 8 ez
Z %
i Ragency Drain Meinisiner 2a Bz NO BID

Panpr Produsts — Saelion i

Green Sesl Standards for Paper towels - 100 % recysled (recoverad afer papermaking process); minimum 40 % postoonsum
content; core in roll towels are made From 100 % recycied matarials. Green Seal Standards for Beth Yiesve - 100 % recycle

Bt WASIRPADEY

Paper iowels. Z-ply roll, Kifphen type, "Bounty” or equal, 30 #dg/ns 4 $ NO BID
7t (53 o5
Toliet Tesus, Singls 2 ply, 550 sheat % i
- o5 .= NO BID
Tottet Tisaue, 7 ply, 1000 & Jumbo Junior rolls % £
. cs - NO BID
Mudl fold paper owels. Brown, §.5x8.175. 18 sloaves! cass B L
74 o .z NO BID
Paper towels, Natural multhTold, 20 sieeves/ case % L2
75 5 8 NO BID
Hem Desoription Brand Name | Unit Green Certifind Moy - Green
itemns - Uit Price | Ceviified Bems -
Linit Price
Faper lowals, singla ply roll, kilohen vpe, 30 risles % k3
- o .= NO BID
Faom! issus 30/00As % %
7y o ¢s NO BID
Misciilanenys Hems — Sectinn 1Y
e Description Brand Mame | Unit Greon Cortifipd MNon - Gresn
Hems - Unit Price | Cerlified Hems -
Uikt Prics
Fizstic forks, noavy wi. 1M/cs % %
7E s s NO BID
Plastic krdves, heavy vt 1 bics & g
75 5 2 NO..BID
TR 20007 roli film -
i * " : * NO BID
Foam bowls, white, 120z Ihics S 5 NO BID
&1 (=3 ]
Plates, ¥ 2 comp, 800Fcs S ¥ NO BID
24 ot

el
B

)




Doseription Brand Mamie | Unit Gresn Dartified Mon » Grean
ftemsg - Unit Price Ceriifipd Homs -
grade, 1niex poweer fras, Smalh 100y % & NO BID
£3 CE o5
% g
B84 o = ¢« NO BID
) G $ ¥ no Bid
a5 on cs £g
Gloves, KL, 100 b ] g A
6 bz m NO Bild
Alurrirum fof, 36 7 5507 3 e
87 2 nNo Bid
Baking iz fpan ners. flY 1hcs 3 i No Bid
2s o8 ¢5
Barer hage brovn, 8 welgh? S0oack £ § NGO Bid
Bg pk ph
FPaper begs brown, 768 welnhl, 400hundie, % & R
B el wgp NO Bid
Pager hags.brown, 252 waighl, EQ0/pack k4 ¢ No Bid
a1 Pk B
32 oz Ciegr Botles wigpraver % 5
oz UNS-32 W/UNS-922-9 UNISAN os ba 1013
Trigger Sprayer for 32 o7, Boles
o NS~ 022-9 UNTSAN s f .60
18 Windshield Washers % ¥ No Bid
84 &5 4

Special Note fo Bidder:
Graen Seal Cerified Products wili be used whenover feasibly possible,

1. LFUCG may award this contract based upon the evaluzsiion and which jc of the hest interpst

2. Mext day defivery required if necessary,

3. Various Divisions of the government wifl be using various delfvery locations in Fayetts County.




