INVITATION TO BID

Bid Invitation Number: #101-2011 Date of Issue; 18/3/2011

Sealed bids will be received in the office of the Division of Central Purchasing, 200 East Main Street, Lexington,

Kentucky, until 2:00 PM, prevailing local time on 10/17/2011. Bids must be received by the above-mentioned
date and time. Mailed bids should be sent to:

Division of Central Purchasing
200 East Main Street, Rm 338
Lexington, KY 40507, (859) 258-3320

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government assumes no responsibility for bids that are not
addressed and delivered as indicated above. Bids that are not delivered to the Division of Central
Purchasing by the stated time and date will be rejected.

All bids must have the company name and address, bid invitation number, and the commodity/service on the
outside of the envelope.

Bids are to include all shipping costs to the point of delivery located at: See specifications

Bid Security Required: Yes XXX No Performance Bond Required:  Yes XXX No
Cashier Check, Certified Check, Bid Bond (Personal checks and company checks will not be acceptable).

Adaptive Traffic Signal & Control Equipment

See specifications

‘Proposed Delivery:

Submitted by: Signal Control Products, Inc
Firm

199 Evans Way
Address

H
Branchﬁ’{&rgs New Jersey 08876
CZ.I})’ S[Ci[eu(% Zf ey

Bid must be signed: Vice president
roinal si : VAT ——
(original signature) hY lgnatugfe?of’ Auhorized Company Representative — Title

“John B Bolt
Representative’s Name (Typed or printec)
908~-231-1133 ext 204 908-707-0333

Areq Code - Phone — Extension Fax#

john@signalcontrel,com
E-Mail Address

The Affidavit in this bid must be completed before your firm can be considered for award of this contract.
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AFFIDAVIT

Comes the Affiant, John H Bolt , and after being first duly sworn
under penalty of perjury as follows:

1. Hisfggname is John H Bolt and he/sheis the
individual submitting the bid or is the authorized representative of

Signal Control Products, Inc .

the entity submitting the bid (hereinafter referred to as "Bidder").

2. Bidder will pay all taxes and fees, which are owed to the Lexington-Fayette Urban
County Government at the time the bid is submuitted, prior to award of the contract and will maintain a
"current” status in regard to those taxes and fees during the life of the contract.

3. Bidder will obtain a Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government business license,
if applicable, prior to award of the contract.

4. Bidder has authorized the Division of Central Purchasing to verify the above-
mentioned information with the Division of Revenue and to disclose to the Urban County Council that
taxes and/or fees are delinquent or that a business license has not been obtained.

5. Bidder has not knowingly violated any provision of the campaign finance laws of
the Commonweaith of Kentucky within the past five (5) years and the award of a contract to the Bidder
will not violate any provision of the campaign finance laws of the Commonwealth.

6. Bidder has not knowingly violated any provision of Chapter 25 of the Lexington-
Fayette Urban County Government Code of Ordinances, known as "Ethics Act."

7. Bidder acknowledges that "knowingly" for purposes of this Affidavit means, with
respect to conduct or to circumstances described by a statute or ordinance defining an offense, that a
person is aware or should have been aware that his conduct is of that nature or that the circumstance
exists. )
j/’,-»":":;?.:

Further, Affiant sayeth naught.

STATE OF New Jersey

COUNTY OF Somerset

The foregoing instrument was subscribed, sworn to and acknowledged before me

by (.f% phe %ﬂ? Jﬁwé%a onthisthe 12th ‘day
B Fs
of October .l 2011.
My Commission expires: 5th March 2016
{;}J Ads 9}?\67/#%

NOTARY PUBLIC, STATE AT LARGE

Please refer to Section I1. Bid Conditions, Item "U" prior to completing this form.
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I. GREEN PROCUREMENT

A. ENERGY

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government is committed to protecting our environment
and being fiscally responsible to our citizens.

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government mandates the use of Energy Star compliant
products if they are available in the marketplace (go to www.Energystar.gov). If these products
are available, but not submitted in your pricing, your bid will be rejected as non-compliant.

ENERGY STAR 1s a government program that offers businesses and consumers energy-cfficient
solutions, making it easy to save money while protecting the environment for future generations.

Key Benefits

These products use 25 to 50% less energy

Reduced energy costs without compromising quality or performance
Reduced air pollution because fewer fossil fuels are burmed
Significant return on investment

Extended product life and decreased maintenance

B. GREEN SEAL CERTIFIED PRODUCTS

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government is also committed to using other
environmentally  friendly products that do not negatively impact our environment. Green Seal
is a non-profit organization devoted to environmental standard setting, product certification, and
public education.

Go to www.Greenseal.org to find available certified products. These products will have a
reduced impact on the environment and on human health. The products to be used must be pre-
approved by the LFUCG prior to commencement of any work in any LFUCG facility. If a Green
Seal product is not available, the LFUCG must provide a signed waiver to use an alternate
product. Please provide information on the Green Seal products being used with your bid
response.

C. GREEN COMMUNITY

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government (LFUCG) serves as a principal, along
with the University of Kentucky and Fayette County Public Schools, in the Bluegrass
Partnership for a Green Community. The Purchasing Team component of the Partnership
collaborates on economy of seale purchasing that promotes and enhances environmental
initiatives. Specifically, when applicable, each principal is interested in obtaining best
value products and/or services which promote environment initiatives via solicitations and
awards from the other principals.

If your company is the successful bidder on this Invitation For Bid, do vou agree to extend
the same product/service pricing to the other principals of the Bluegrass Partunership for a
Green Community (i.e. University of Kentucky and Fayette County Schools) if requested?

Yes XXX No



il

Bid Conditions

No bid may be withdrawn for a period of sixty (60) days after the date and time set for opening.

No bid may be altered after the date and time set for opening. In the case of obvious errors, the
Division of Central Purchasing may permit the withdrawal of a bid. The decision as to whether a
bid may be withdrawn shall be that of the Division of Central Purchasing,

Acceptance of this proposal shall be enactment of an Ordinance by the Urban County Council.

The bidder agrees that the Urban County Government reserves the right to reject any and all bids
for either fiscal or technical reasons, and to award cach part of the bid separately or all parts to
one vendor,

Minor exceptions may not eliminate the bidder. The decision as to whether any exception is
minor shall be entirely that of the head of the requisitioning Department or Division and the
Director of the Division of Central Purchasing. The Urban County Government may waive
technicalities and informalities where such waiver would best serve the interests of the Urban
County Government.

Manufacturer's catalogue numbers, trade names, etc., where shown herein are for descriptive
purposes and are to guide the bidder in interpreting the standard of quality, design, and
performance desired, and shall not be construed to exclude proposals based on furnishing other
types of materials and/or services. However, any substitution or departure proposed by the bidder
must be clearly noted and described; otherwise, it will be assumed that the bidder intends to
supply items specifically mentioned in this Invitation for Bids.

The Urban County Government may require demonstrations of the materials proposed herein
prior to acceptance of this proposal.

Bids must be submitted on this form and must be signed by the bidder or his authorized
representative. Unsigned bids will not be considered.

Bids must be submitted prior to the date and time indicated for opening. Bids submitted after
this time will not be considered.

All bids mailed must be marked on the face of the envelope:

“Bid on #101-2011 Adaptive Traffic Sienal & Control Equipment”

and addressed to: Division of Central Purchasing
200 East Main Street, Room 338
Lexington, Kentucky 40507

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government assumes no responsibility for bids
that are not addressed and delivered as indicated above. Bids that are not delivered to
the Division of Central Purchasing by the stated time and date will be rejected.

Bidder is requested to show both unit prices and lot prices. In the event of error, the unit price
shall prevail.

A certified check or Bid Bond in the amount of _ XX percent of the bid price must be attached
hereto. This check must be made payable to the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government,
and will be retarned when the material and/or services specified herein have been delivered in
accordance with specifications. In the event of failure to perform within the time period set forth

5 of 15



in this bid, it is agreed the certified check may be cashed and the funds retained by the
Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government as liquidated damages. Checks of unsuccessful
bidders will be returned when the bid has been awarded.

M. The delivery dates specified by bidder may be a factor in the determination of the successful

N.

0.

bidder.
Tabulations of bids received may be mailed to bidders. Bidders requesting tabulations must
enclose a stamped, self-addressed envelope with the bid.

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government is exempt from Kentucky Sales Tax and
Federal Excise Tax on materials purchased from this bid invitation. Materials purchased by the
bidder for construction projects are not tax exempt and are the sole responsibility of the bidder.

All material furnished hereunder must be in full compliance with OSHA regulations.

If more than one bid is offered by one party, or by any person or persons representing a party, all
such bids shail be rejected.

Signature on the face of this bid by the Bidder or his authorized representative shall be construed
as acceptance of and compliance with all terms and conditions contained herein.

The Entity (regardless of whether construction contractor, non-construction contractor or
supplier) agrees to provide equal opportunity in employment for all qualified persons, to prohibit
discrimination in employment because of race, color, creed, national origin, sex or age, and to
promote equal employment through a positive, continuing program from itself and each of its
sub-contracting agents. This program of equal employment opportunity shall apply to every
aspect of its employment policies and practices.

The Kentucky Equal Employment Opportunity Act of 1978 (KRS 45.560-45.640) requires that
any county, city, town, school district, water district, hospital district, or other political
subdivision of the state shall include in directly or indirectly publicly funded contracts for
supplies, materials, services, or equipment hereinafter entered into the following provisions:

During the performance of this contract, the contractor agrees as follows:

(1) The contractor will not discriminate against any employee or applicant for employment
because of race, color, religion, sex, age or national origin;

(2) The contractor will state in all solicitations or advertisements for employees placed by or
on behalf of the contractors that all qualified applicants will receive consideration for
employment without regard to race, color, veligion, sex, age or national origin;

(3) The contractor will post notices in conspicuous places, available to employees and
applicants for employment, setting forth the provisions of the non-discrimination clauses
required by this section, and

{(4) The contractor will send a notice to each labor union or representative of workers with
which he has a collective barguining agreement or other contract or understanding
advising the labor union or workers' representative of the contractor's commitments
under the nondiscrimination clauses.

The Act further provides:

KRS 45.610. Hiring minorities - Information required

(1) For the length of the contract, each contractor shall hire minorities from other sources
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within the drawing avea, should the union with which he has collective bargaining
agreements be unwilling fo supply sufficient minorities to satisfy the agreed upon goals
and timetable.

(2) Each contractor shall, for the length of the contract, furnish such information as required
by KRS 45.560 to KRS 45.640 and by such rules, regulations and orders issued pursuant
thereto and will permit access to all books and records pertaining to his employment
practices and work sites by the contracting agency and the department for purposes of
investigation to ascertain compliance with KRS 45560 to 45.640 and such rules,
regulations and orders issued pursuant thereto.

KRS 45.620. Action against contractor - Hiring of minority contractor or subcontractor

(1) If any contractor is found by the department to have engaged in an unlawful practice
under this chapter during the course of performing under a contract or subcontract
covered under KRS 43.560 to 45.640, the department shall so certify fo the contracting
agency and such ceriification shall be binding upon the contracting agency unless it is
reversed in the course of judicial review.

(2)  If the contractor is found to have committed an unlawful practice under KRS 45.560 to
45.640, the contracting agency may cancel or terminate the contract, conditioned upon a
program for future compliance approved by the contracting agency and the depariment.
The contracting agency may declare such a contractor ineligible to bid on further
contracts with that agency uniil such time as the contractor complies in full with the
requirements of KRS 45.560 to 45.640.

(3)  The equal employment provisions of KRS 45.560 to 45.640 may be met in part by a
contractor by subcontracting to a minority contractor or subcontractor., For the
provisions of KRS 45.560 to 45.640, a minority contractor or subcontractor shall mean a
business that is owned and controlled by one or more persons disadvantaged by racial or
ethnic circumstances,

KRS 45.630 Termination of existing employee not required, when

Any provision of KRS 45.560 to 45.640 notwithstanding, no contractor shall be required to
terminate an existing employee upon proof that that employee was employed prior to the date
of the contract.

KRS 45.640 Minimum skills

Nothing in KRS 45.560 to 45.640 shall require a contractor to hire anvone who fails to
demonstrate the minimum skills required to perform a particular job.

It is recommended that all of the provisions above quoted to be mcluded as special conditions
in each contract. In the case of a contract exceeding $250,000, the contractor is required to
furnish evidence that his work-force in Kentucky is representative of the available work-force
in the area from which he draws employees, or to supply an Affirmative Action plan which
will achieve such representation during the life of the contract.

Any party, firm or individual submitting a proposal pursuant to this invitation must be in
compliance with the requirements of the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government
regarding taxes and fees before they can be considered for award of this invitation and must
maintain a "current” status with regard to those taxes and fees throughout the term of the

contract. The contractor must be in compliance with Chapter 13 from the Code of Ordinances
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of the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government. The contractor must be in compliance
with Ordinance 35-2000 pursuant to contractor registration with the Division of Building
Inspection. If applicable, said business must have a Fayette County business license.

Pursuant to KRS 45A.343 and KRS 45A.345, the contractor shall

(1} Reveal any final determination of a violation by the contractor within the previous five
year period pursuant to KRS Chapters 136 {corporation and utility taxes), 139 (sales and
use taxes), 141 (income taxes), 337 (wages and hours), 338 (occupational safety and
health of emplovees), 341 (unemployment and compensation) and 342 (labor and human
rights) that apply to the contractor; and

{2)  Bein continuous compliance with the above-mentioned KRS provisions that apply to the
contractor for the duration of the contract.

A contractor's failure to reveal the above or to comply with such provisions for the duration of the
contract shall be grounds for cancellation of the contract and disqualification of the contractor from
eligibility for future contracts for a period of two (2) years.

V.

Vendors who respond to this invitation have the right to file a notice of contention associated
with the bid process or to file a notice of appeal of the recommendation made by the Director
of Central Purchasing resulting from this invitation.

Notice of contention with the bid process must be filed within 3 business days of the
bid/proposal opening by (1) sending a written notice, including sufficient documentation to
support contention, to the Director of the Division of Central Purchasing or {2) submitting a
written request for a meeting with the Director of Central Purchasing to explain his/her
contention with the bid process. After consulting with the Commissioner of Finance the
Chief Administrative Officer and reviewing the documentation and/or hearing the vendor,
the Director of Ceniral Purchasing shall promptly respond in writing findings as to the
compliance with bid processes. If, based on this review, a bid process irregularity is deemed
to have occurred the Director of Central Purchasing will consult with the Commissioner of
Finance, the Chief Administrative Officer and the Department of Law as to the appropriate
remedy.

Notice of appeal of a bid recommendation must be filed within 3 business days of the bid
recommendation by (1) sending a written notice, including sufficient documentation to
suppott appeal, to the Director, Division of Central Purchasing or (2) submitting a written
request for a meeting with the Director of Central Purchasing to explain his appeal. After
reviewing the documentation and/or hearing the vendor and consulting with the
Commissioner of Finance and the Chief Administrative Officer, the Director of Central
Purchasing shall in writing, affirm or withdraw the recommendation.
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Procurement Contract Bid Conditions

Al

B.

The terms of this agreement shall be for 1 year from the date of acceptance of this contract by
the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government. This agreement may be extended for an
additional 1 vyear renewal upon the written agreement of the bidder and the Lexington-Fayette
Urban County Government. Said agreement must be in writing and must be executed prior to
the exptration of the current agreement.

Price Changes (Space Checked Applies)

(XXX) 1. Prices quoted in response to the Invitation shall be firm prices for the first 90 days of the

0 2.

03.

Procurement Contract. After 90 days, prices may be subject to revision and such changes
shall be based on general industry changes. Revision may be either increases or decreases
and may be requested by either party. There will be no more than one (1) price
adjustment per quarter. Requests for price changes shall be received in writing at least
twenty (20) days prior to the effective date and are subject to written acceptance before
becoming effective. Proof of the validity of a request for revision shall be responsibility
of the requesting party. The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government shall receive
the benefit of any decline that the seller shall offer his other accounts.

No provision for price change is made herein. Prices are to be firm for the term of this
contract.

Procurement Level Contract
If any contract item is not available from the vendor, the Lexington-Fayette Urban County
Government, at its option, may permit the item to be back-ordered or may procure the item on

the open market.

All invoices must bear reference to the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government
Purchasing document numbers which are being billed.

This contract may be canceled by either party thirty (30) days after delivery by canceling party
of written notice of intent to cancel to the other contracting party.

This contract may be canceled by the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government if it is
determined that the Bidder has failed to perform under the terms of this agreement, such

cancellation to be effective upon receipt of written notice of cancellation by the Bidder.

No substitutions for articles specified herein may be made without prior approval of the
Division of Central Purchasing.
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EQUAL OPPORTUNITY AGREEMENT

The Law

Title VII of the Civil Rights Act of 1964 (amended 1972) states that it is unlawful for an employer to
discriminate in employment because of race, color, religion, sex, age (40-70 years) or national origin.

Executive Order No. 11246 on Nondiscrimination under Federal contract prohibits employment
discrimination by contractor and sub-contractor doing business with the Federal Government or
recipients of Federal funds. This order was later amended by Executive Order No. 11375 to prohibit
discrimination on the basts of sex.

Section 503 of the Rehabilitation Act of 1973 states:

The Contractor will not discriminate against any employee or applicant for employment
because of physical or mental handicap.

Section 2012 of the Vietnam Era Veterans Readjustment Act of 1973 requires Affirmative Action on
behalf of disabled veterans and veterans of the Vietnam Era by contractors having Federal contracts.

Section 206(A) of Executive Order 12086, Consolidation of Contract Compliance Functions for
Equal Employment Opportunity, states:

The Secretary of Labor may investigate the employment practices of any Government
contractor or sub-contractor to determine whether or not the contractual provisions
specified in Section 202 of this order have been violated,

FREHERELLALS AL S A AR SN R Ry

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government practices Equal Opportunity in recruiting, hiring and
promoting. It is the Government's intent to affirmatively provide employment opportunities for those
individuals who have previously not been allowed to enter into the mainstream of society. Because of its
importance to the local Government, this policy carries the full endorsement of the Mayor, Commissioners,
Directors and all supervisory personnel. In following this commitment to Equal Employment Opportunity
and because the Government is the benefactor of the Federal funds, it is both against the Urban County
Government policy and illegal for the Government to let contracts to companies which knowingly or
unknowingly practice discrimination in their employment practices. Violation of the above mentioned
ordinances may cause a contract to be canceled and the contractors may be declared ineligible for future
consideration.

Please sign this statement in the appropriate space acknowledging that you have read and understand the
provisions contained heremn. Return this document as part of your application packet.

Bidders

1I/We agree to comply with the Civil Rights Laws listed above that govern employment rights of minorities,

women, Vietnam veteransyharticapped and aged persons.
---- RO T
L f ;
S/

. %}gj@ Signal Control Products, Inc
Signatufe John i’;‘fBOlt - Vice president Name OfBusineSS
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ADAPTIVE TRAFFIC SIGNAL AND CONTROL EQUIPMENT

We propose fo deliver to the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government, Division of Traffic Engineering
loading dock at 1515 Old Frankfort Pike, Lexington, Kentucky, 40504, the following traffic signal and
control equipment conforming to all specifications used by the Commonwealth of Kentucky, Division of
Traffic, for like purpose within thirty (30) days of receipt of purchase authorization:

Pricing for the following shall be goed for 365 days from acceptancs of bid.

WAVETRONIX EQUIPMENT (No Substitutes)

Preassembled Backplates and Contact Closure Cards:

1. WX-8S-BP-0006 SmartSensor Six Sensor Preassembled Backplate w/AC Power (19" Rack)
Inciudes the following components;
WX-CLK-210 - 0.5 A Circuit Breaker

WX-CLK-230 - 120 VAC Surge
WX-CLK-204 - 24 VDC 4 A Power Suppiy
WX-CLK-202 - 24 VDC 2 A Power Supply
WX-CLK-222 - Three - 2 Sensor Surge & Comm Modules
$ _No Bid
2. WX-55-BP-0004 SmartSensor Four Sensor Preassembled Backplate w/AC Power (19" Rack)
fncludes the foilowing components;
WX-CLK-210 - 0.5 A Circuit Breaker
WX-CLK-230 - 120 VAC Surge
WX-CLK-204 - 24 VDC 4 A Power Supply
WX-CLK-222 - Two - 2 Sensor Surge & Comm Modules
g To Bid
3. WX-88-BP-0002 SmariSensor Two Sensor Preassembled Backpiate w/AC Power (19" Rack)
includes the following components;
WX-CLK-210 - 0.5 A Circuit Breaker
WX-CLK-230 - 120 VAC Surge
WX-CLK-202 - 24 VDC 2 A Power Supply ]
WX-CLK-222 - One - 2 Sensor Surge & Comm Module $ Mo Bid
4, WX-CLK-112 2 Channel Contact Closure Rack Card (Matrix or Advance) $  No Bid
5. WX-CLK-114 4 Channel Contact Closure Rack Card (Matrix or Advance) $ No Bid
Sensors, Mounting Brackets and Splice Boxes:
8. WX-85-200V SmartSensor Advance Sensor (S5200V) $  No Bid
7. WX-58-225 SmariSensor Matrix Stop Bar Sensor (S5225) $ No Bid
8. WX-88-125 SmartSensor MD Sensor, Dual Radar Side Fire Sensor (85125) § No Bid
9. WX-58-611 Heavy Duty Sensor Mount - 8" - 2 axis aluminum bracket §_ No Bid
10. WX-88-710 In Line Terminal strip junction box $__ No Bid
Sensor Pigtails and Bulk Cable: 8 pin connector .
11. WX-SS-704-020 SmartSensor Power and Communication Cable w/ Connector - 20 feet $ N0 Bid
12. WX-85-704-040 SmartSensor Power and Communication Cable w/ Connector - 40 feet § 10 pid

11 of 15



No Bid
13. WX-858-704-080 SmartSensor Power and Communication Cable w/ Connector - 80 feet § o s

14. WX-85-705-500 Bulk Cabie Spool 500° $ No Bid
Sensor Pigtails and Bulk Cable: 26 pin connector )

15. WX-85-701-020 SmartSensor Power and Communication Cabie w/ Connector - 20 feet $ No Bid

16. WX-85-701-040 SmartSensor Power and Communication Cable w/ Connector - 40 feet $ No Bid
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Clicki Modules - Spare Parts:

17. WX-CLK-200 System Surge Protector (for 1 HD Sensor)

18. WX-CLK-202 24 VDC 2 A Pawer Supply (Power Supply for 1 or 2 sensors)
19. WX-CLK-204 24 VDC 4 A Power Supply (Power Supply for 3 or 4 sensors)
20. WX-CLK-210 Circuit Breaker 0.5 Amp

21, WX-CLK-210-02 Circuit Breaker 2.0 Amp

22 WX-CLK-222 Two Sensor Surge & Comm Module (Matrix & Advance)
23 WX-CLK-223 One Sensor Surge & Comm Module {Matrix or Advance)
24, WX-CLK-230 120 VAC Surge

25. WX-CLK-301 Serigi to Ethernet converter

26. WX-CLK-304 RS 232 to RS 485 converter

Click! Accessories:

27. WX-100-0064 Din Rail 9"

28. WX-100-0065 Din Rait 12"

29. WX-100-0277 T-Bus Connector {Gray, Power only)

30. WX-100-0281 R5-485/USB Mini-Converter (Connects Laptop to Click!222 RS-485
Bridge Fort)

31, WX-205-0000 T-Bus Connector (Green, Power & Comm)

32. WX-228-0020 T-Bus Left End Right Angle

33. WX-310-0014 RJ-11, White, 80 inch Patch Cord

BLUETOOTH TRAVEL TIME EQUIPMENT, BlueTOAD (or equivalent)

34. EGMOD-0-00-04-025X BlueTOAD Cellular IP/Ethernet Detector Card with 25 cable —
no line amps

35. EGMOD-0-00-04-025A BlueTOAD Cellular IP/Ethernel Detector Card with 25’ cable —
with line amps

36. EGMOD-0-00-04-050A BlueTOAD Cellular IP/Ethernet Detector Card with 50’ cable —
with line amps

37. EGMOD-0-00-04-075A BlueTOAD Ceiluiar IP/Ethernet Detector Card with 75" cable —
with line amps

38. EGMOD-0-00-04-100A BlueTOAD Celluiar IP/Ethernet Detector Card with 100’ cable —
with line amps

39. ECMOD-1-30-04-002X-0-0-0 BlueTOAD Seli-Enclosed with 30 watt solar panet &
cellular 1P
40. MIMOD-2-00-068-000M-0-0-0 Mini-BlueTOAD non-real fime detector

41. Post-processing for 1 year for 1 device

UPS Batterv Backun System for Traffic Signal Controller Cabinet

$ No Rid
$ No Bid
$ No Bid
$ No Bid
$ No Bid
$ No Bid
§ No Bid
$ No Bid
¢ No Bid

¢ No Bid

$ No Bid

No Bid
Ho Bid

No Bid

£ A B B

No Bid

4,450,00

4,690.00
4,740.00

4,790.00
4,840.00
5,200.00
3,600.00

660,00

L - 2 DR < B == S = S =~ S ==

42. Equipment shall consist of a UPS Battery Backup System that can be mounted in a 332 170 signal cabinet
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rack with existing traffic control equipment inside. The unit must produce a pure sine wave for proper flashing
operation, no less than 850 watts output power, no less than a 2- 4 hour run time on fully charged batteries with all
LED signhal indications at the intersection, all AGM batteries included with initial purchase, 120v A.C. input and
output, automatic bypass system that converts from uiility company power to backup power and back. Battery
mounting rack included.
$_No Bid

UPS Battery Backup System

43. Equipment shall consist of a UPS Battery Backup System that can be mounted in a separate cabinet. The unit
must produce a pure sine wave for proper flashing operation, no  less than 850 watts output power, no less than
a 2-4 hour run time with all LED signal indications at the intersection, all AGM batteries included with initial
purchase, 120v A.C. input and output, automatic bypass system that converts from utility company power to backup
power and back.

$_No Bid
Automatic Power Transfer Switch
44, Device shall provide automatic power transfer from utility company provided A.C. to an isolated receptacle or
terminal strip that allows the connection of a standalone A.C. power source such as a power inverter,
generalor or UPS system. The device must automatically switch back to the utility power when power is
applied. tem must be compatible with all types and brands of equipment. The device must be abie to be
mounted in any orientation (vertical, horizontal, etc.).

§ No Bid
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ADAPTIVE TRAFFIC SIGNAL EQUIPMENT, (No Substitutes)

Network Camera Mounting Devices
Mast Arm Applications:
45. Pelco Astro-Brac Clamp p/n: AB-3009 (cable length: 967, 1207, 144™)
46. Pelco Astro-Brac Poles p/m: AB-2003 {pole length: 58", 74™)
47. Pelco Camera Bracket p/n: SH-0514

Luminaries Arm Applications:
48. Pelco Luminaries Mounting Bracket p/n: SH-0509 (with 12" extension)

49, Pelco Camera Bracket p/n: 8H-0514

50. Pelco Type 201 Stainless Stee! Banding p/n: US-8122-66, 100ft roll

51. Pelco Type 201 Stainless Steel Buckles p/n: US-8122-56, Package QT 100
52. Pelco Band Tool p/n: US-8120-01, Package QT 1

Span Wire/Signal Pole Applications:
The extension arm is manufactured by Utility Metals (www.utilitymetals.com).

53. Pelco “L-Bracket” Pole Mounting Bracket; Ext. Tilt & Pan, Vertical Mount, 1 piece p/n:

SH-0527 w/ 2" nipple
54. Astro-Brac Clamp p/n: AB-3009 (cable length: 967, 1207, 144™)

55. Gusseted Tubes p/n: AB-2003 (pole iength: 587)
56. Astro-Brac Clamp p/n: AB-3022
10ft Extension Arm with Luminaries Mounting Bracket
57. Uiility Metais 10# Extension Arm p/n: B200A100-4.0
Network Camera Specifications —

88. AXIS 221 Network Camera — Mfg# 0221-054 (no substitutes)

a. Quantity Each

b. Quantity of 10
59. AXIS Communications — Mfg# 5500-0681 CS Mount 3-8mm Day and Night Lens
60. for AXIS 221 (no substifutes)

61. VideoTec HOV Side Opening Aluminum Housing — HOV32KAG16 (no substitutes)
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$ No Bid
¢ No Bid

$ Neo Bid

$ Mo Bid
$ No Bid
$ No Bid
¢ No Bid

$ Iv Bli

$ Ko Bid

$ No Bid

$ No Bid

$ No Bid

$ No Bid
$_No Bid
$ No Bid

$ No Bid



