AFFIDAVIT

Comes the Affiant, AQQ e Z&ﬁt and after being first duly sworn under penalty of

perjury as follows:

His/her name is f( AAnlcE /ZOL and he/she is the individual submitting the bid or is the
authorized representative of L 4 W gf\’lo/rﬂ LN uj é&b)u/) PraehA

the entity submitting the bid (hereinafter referred to as “Bidder™)

Bidder will pay all taxes and fees, which are owed to the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government at the time the bid
is submitted, prior to award of the contract and will maintain a "current” status in regard to those taxes and fees during
the life of the contract.

Bidder will obtain a Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government business license, if applicable, prior to award of the
contract.

Bidder has authorized the Division of Central Purchasing to verify the above-mentioned information with the Division of
Revenue and to disclose to the Urban County Council that taxes and/or fees are delinguent or that a business license has
not been obtained.

Bidder has not knowingly violated any provision of the campaign finance laws of the Commonwealth of Kentucky within
the past five (5) years and the award of a contract fo the Bidder will not viclate any provision of the campaign finance
laws of the Commonwealth.

Bidder has not knowingly viclated any provision of Chapter 25 of the Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government Code
of Ordinances, known as "Ethics Act.”

Bidder acknowledges that "knowingly" for purposes of this Affidavit means, with respect to conduct or to circumstances
described by a statute or ordinance defining an offense, that a person is aware or should have been aware that his
conduct is of that nature or that the circumstance exists.

Further, Affiant sayeth naught.

STATE OF Ku\% (A C‘/V»Lj

COUNTY OF Q nd'Son

by

of

The foregoing instrument was subscribed, sworn to and acknowledged before me

LM‘ L. QDO/ on this the ) ]’Tb day

Mot) 207l T
My Commission expires: u } | 7T } 22’ —

ﬁ%a/&ﬂm (. Coptte

NOT/ARY PUBLIC, STATE AT LARGE N

FPlease refer fto Section II. Bid Conditions, Item “U” prior to completing this [form.
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EQUAL CPPORTUNITY AGREEMENT

Standard Titde VI Assurance

The Lexington Fayette-Urban County Government, (hereinafter referred to as the “Recipient”) hereby agrees that as a
condition to receiving any Federal financial assistance from the U.S. Department of Transportation, it wili comply with Title
VI of the Civil Rights Act of 1964, 78Stat.252, 42 U.S.C. 2000d-4 (hereinafter referred to as the “Act”), and all
requirements imposed by or pursuant to Title 49, Code of Federal Regulations, U.S. Department of Transportation, Subtitle
A, Office of the Secretary, (49 CFR, Part 21) Nondiscrimination in Federally Assisted Program of the Department of
Transportation — Effectuation of Title VI of the Civil Rights Act of 1964 (hereinafter referred to as the “Regulations”) and
other pertinent directives, no person in the United States shall, on the grounds of race, color, national origin, sex, age
(over 40), religion, sexual orientation, gender identity, veteran status, or disability be exduded from participation in, be
denied the benefits of, or be otherwise subjected to discrimination under any program or activity for which the Recipient
receives Federal financial assistance from the U.S. Department of Transporiation, including the Federal Highway
Administration, and hereby gives assurance that will promptly take any necessary measures fo effectuate this agreement.
This assurance is required by subsection 21.7(a) (1) of the Regulations.

The law

Title VII of the Civil Rights Act of 1964 (amended 1972) states that it is unlawful for an employer to discriminate in
employment because of race, color, religion, sex, age (40-70 years) or national origin.

Executive Order No. 11246 on Nondiscrimination under Federal contract prohibits employment discrimination by
contractor and sub-contractor doing business with the Federal Government or recipients of Federal funds. This order
was later amended by Executive Order No. 11375 to prohibit discrimination on the basis of sex.

Section 503 of the Rehabilitation Act of 1973 states: 7he Contractor will not discriminate against any employee or
applicant for employment because of physical or menital disability.

Section 2012 of the Vietnam Era Veterans Readjustrent Act of 1973 requires Affirmative Action on behalf of disabled
veterans and veterans of the Vietnam Era by contractors having Federal contracts.

Section 206(A) of Executive Order 12086, Consolidation of Contract Compliance Functions for Equal Employment
Opportunity, states: The Secretary of Labor may investigate the employment practices of any Government contractor
or sub-contractor to determine whether or not the contractual provisions specified in Section 202 of this order have
been violated.

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government practices Equal Opportunity in recruiting, hiring and promoting. It is the
Government's intent to affirmatively provide employment opportunities for those individuals who have previously not been
allowed to enter into the mainstream of society. Because of its importance to the local Government, this policy carries the
full endorsement of the Mayor, Commissioners, Directors and all supervisory personnel. In following this commitment to
Equal Employment Opportunity and because the Government is the benefactor of the Federal funds, it is both against the
Urban County Government policy and illegal for the Government to let contracts to companies which knowingly or
unknowingly practice discrimination in their employment practices. Violation of the above mentioned ordinances may
cause a contract to be canceled and the contractors may be dedared ineligible for future consideration.

Please sign this statement in the appropriate space acknowledging that you have read and understand the provisions
contained herein. Return this document as part of your application packet.

Bidders

I/We agree to comply with the Civil Rights Laws listed above that govern employment rights of minorities, women,
veteran status, disabillty and age.

o V/@ Le o 5;7707717?, éij

Signature Name of Business
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I. GREEN PROCUREMENT

A. ENERGY

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government is committed to protecting our environment and being
fiscally responsible to our citizens.

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government mandates the use of Energy Star compliant products if they
are available in the marketplace (go to www.Energystar.gov). If these products are available, but not
submitted in your pricing, your bid will be rejected as non-compliant.

ENERGY STAR is a government program that offers businesses and consumers energy-efficient solutions,
making it easy to save money while protecting the environment for future generations.

Key Benefits

These products use 25 to 50% less energy

Reduced energy costs without compromising quality or performance
Reduced air pollution because fewer fossil fuels are burned
Significant return on investment

Extended product life and decreased maintenance

B. GREEN SEAL CERTIFIED PRODUCTS

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government is also committed to using other environmentally  friendly
products that do not negatively impact our environment. Green Seal is a non-profit organization devoted to
environmental standard setting, product certification, and public education.

Go to www.Greenseal.org fo find available certified products. These products will have a reduced impact on
the environment and on human health. The products to be used must be pre-approved by the LFUCG prior to
commencement of any work in any LFUCG facility. If a Green Seal product is not available, the LFUCG must
provide a signed waiver to use an alternate product. Please provide information on the Green Seal products
being used with your bid response.

C. GREEN COMMUNITY

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government (LFUCG) serves as a principal, along with the
University of Kentucky and Fayette County Public Schools, in the Bluegrass Partnership for a
Green Community. The Purchasing Team component of the Parthership collaborates on economy
of scale purchasing that promotes and enhances environmental initiatives. Specifically, when
applicable, each principal is interested in obtaining best value products and/or services which
promote environment initiatives via solicitations and awards from the other principals.

If your company is the successful bidder on this Invitation For Bid, do you agree to extend the
same product/service pricing to the other principals of the Bluegrass Partnership for a Green
Community {i.e. University of Kentucky and Fayette County Schools) if requested?

Yas _y/ Mo
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LEXINGTON

Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government

Lexington, Kentucky
Horse Capital of the World

Division of Central Purchasing Date of Issue: May 3, 2021

INVITATION TO BID # 43-2021 Partitions & Cargo Boxes

Bid Opening Date: May 17, 2021 Bid Opening Time: 2:00 PM

Address: - 200 East Main Street, 3™ Floor, Room 338, Lexington, Kentucky 40507

Type of Bid: Price Contract

Pre Bid Meeting:  N/A  preBdTime: N/A
Address: NA

Sealed bids will be received via Ion Wave, until 2:00 PM, prevailing local time on 5/17/2021. Bids must be received by the above-
mentioned date and time. Bids should be submitted via:

Ion Wave
hitps://lexingtonky.ionwave.net

The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government assumes no responsibility for bids that are not delivered as indicated above. All bids must
be signed. Bids are to include all shipping, handling and associated fees to the point of delivery located at: Lexington, KY

Check One: Proposed Delivery:

\// Bid Specifications Met Exceptions to Bid Specifications. Exceptions shall be itermized and $  days after
| - ) - attached to bid proposal submitted. 3 acceptance of bid.
Procurement Card Usage—The Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government may be using Procurement Cards to purchase goods and
services and also to make payments. Will you accept Procurement Cards? Yes No
Submitted by: L e é’ *
Firm Name
250 £t Court St
Address

LAwrencebure, KY /0342

5 p— 7/
Citv, State & Zip #

Bid must be signed: ;—’7 & - 7>r¢ St J en—l’

(original signature) Signature of Authorized Company Representative ~ Title

AHI\ICc_ Ebn

Representative’'s Name (Typed or printed)

S02-839- 0324 S02-7239-5U/0
Area Code - Phone — Extension Fax #

Lonce @) LwoutEdders.com
F-Mail Address

The Affidavit in this bid must be completed before your firm can be considered for award of this contract.
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13.

14,

15.

16.

18.

19.

20.

21,

written notice period is negotiated prior to contract approval. Payment for services or goods received prior to
termination shall be made by the LFUCG provided these goods or services were provided in a manner
acceptable to the LFUCG. Payment for those goods and services shall not be unreasonably withheld.

Assignment of Contract: The selected bidder(s) shall not assign or subcontract any portion of the bid contract
with LFUCG without the express written consent of LFUCG. Any purported assignment or subcontract in
violation hereof shall be void. It is expressly acknowledged that LFUCG shall never be reguired or obligated to
consent to any request for assignment or subcontract; and further that such refusal to consent can be for any
or no reasan, fully within the sole discretion of LFUCG.

No Waiver: No failure or delay by LFUCG in exercising any right, remedy, power or privilege hereunder, nor
any single or partial exercise thereof, nor the exercise of any other right, remedy, power or privilege shall
operate as a waiver hereof or thereof. No failure or delay by LFUCG in exercising any right, remedy, power or
privilege under or in respect of this bid proposal or bid contract shall affect the rights, remedies, powers or
privileges of LFUCG hereunder or shall operate as a waiver thereof.

Authority to do Business: Each bidder must be authorized to do business under the laws of the
Commonwealth of Kentucky and must be in good standing and have full legal capacity to provide the goods
or services specified in the bid proposal. Each bidder must have all necessary right and lawful authority to
submit the bid response and enter into the bid contract for the full term hereof including any necessary
corporate or other action authorizing the bidder to submit the bid response and enter into this bid contract. If
requested, the bidder will provide LFUCG with a copy of a corporate resolution authorizing this action and/or
a letter from an attorney confirming that the proposer is authorized to do business in the Commonwealth of
Kentucky. All bid responses must be signed by a duly authorized officer, agent or employee of the bidder.

Governing Law: This bid request and bid contract shall be governed by and construed in accordance with the
laws of the Commonwealth of Kentucky. In the event of any proceedings regarding this matter, the bidder
agrees that the venue shall be the Fayette County Circuit Court or the U.S. District Court for the Eastern
District of Kentucky, Lexington Division and that the bidder expressly consents to personal jurisdiction and
venue in such Court for the limited and sole purpose of proceedings relating to these matters or any rights or
obligations arising thereunder.

Ability to Meet Obligations: Bidder affirmatively states that there are no actions, suits or proceedings of any
kind pending against bidder or, to the knowledge of the bidder, threatened against the bidder before or by
any court, governmental body or agency or other tribunal or autharity which would, if adversely determined,
have a materially adverse effect on the authority or ability of bidder to perform its obligations under this bid
response or bid contract, or which question the legality, validity or enforceability hereof or thereof.

Price Discrepancy: When applicable, in case of price discrepancy, unit bid price written in words will prevail
followed by unit price written in numbers then total amount bid per line item.

Bidder understands and agrees that its employees, agents, or subcontractors are not employees of LFUCG for
any purpose whatsoever. Bidder is an independent contractor at all times related to the bid response or bid
contract.

Contractor [or Vendor or Vendor's Employees] will not appropriate or make use of the Lexington-Fayette
Urban County Government (LFUCG) name or any of its trade or service marks or property (including but not
limited to any logo or seal), in any promotion, endorsement, advertisement, testimonial or similar use
without the prior written consent of the government. If such consent is granted LFUCG reserves the unilateral
right, in its sole discretion, to immediately terminate and revoke such use for any reason whatsoever.

Contractor agrees that it shall cease and desist from any unauthorized use immediately upon being notified
by LFUCG.

If any term or provision of this bid contract shall be found to be illegal or unenforceable, the remainder of the
contract shall remain in full force and such term or provision shall be deemed stricken.

;//l L.zwfm C/Eap»/'
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Signature

WORKFORCE ANALYSIS FORM

Name of Organization:

L a ) Emeragrncy Z;m'pnufﬂ'f
A f

Categories Total White Hispani Black or Native Asian American Two or Total
Not cor African- Hawaiian {Not Indian or | more races
H'( 0 e Latino | American and Hispani | Alaskan Not
=parie (Not Other cor Native i ( Oi
L - Hispanic Pacific Latino (not 'Sij_r‘f o
ating) ortatino | Islander Hispanic auno
{Not or Latino
Hispanic
or Latino
M| F M F | M F ] F M| F M| F M F M| F
Administrators 3 3
Professionals
Superintendents
Supervisors
Foremen
Technicians /0 | f /2

Protective Service

Para-Professionals

Office/Clerical

2.
Skilled Craft
Service/Maintenance
Total: ] S| 2

Prepared by:

Aﬁﬁco %

Date: 5 i

I 2/

(Name and Title)
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LEXINGTON

LFUCG MWDBE PARTICIPATION FORM
Bid/RFP/Quote Reference #___ & 3 - 291 Parh 'l‘loNS

The MWDBE and/or veteran subcontractors listed have agreed to participate on this Bid/RFP/Quote. If any

substitution 1s made or the total value of the work is changed prior to or after the job is in progress, it is
understood that those substitutions must be submitted to Central Purchasing for approval immediately. Failure

to submit a completed form may cause rejection of the bid.

MWDBE Company, Name, MBE Work to be Performed Total Dollar %s Value of Total
Address, Phone, Email WBE or Value of the Contract
DBE Work

1o

-
o

'J_\

e |

The undersigned company representative submits the above list of MWDBE firms to be used in accomplishing the work
conuined in this Bid/RFP/Quote. Any misrepresentadon may result in the termination of the contract and/or be subject

to applicable Federal and State laws concerning talse statements and false claims.

Sous Lance Pec

Company Representative

¢

Company
5_l|(]1! ?@St(j&b‘l"
Date Title
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LEXINGTON

LFUCG MWDBE PARTICIPATION FORM
Bid/RFP/Quote Reference # LI ¢- 20

The MWDBE and/or veteran subcontractors listed have agreed to participate on this Bid/RFP/Quote. If any

substitution is made or the total value of the work is changed prior to or after the job is in progress, it is

understood that those substitutions must be submitted to Central Purchasing for approval immediately. Failure
to submit a completed form may cause rejection of the bid.

MWDBE Company, Name, MBE Work to be Performed Total Dollar % Value of Total
Address, Phone, Email WBE or Value of the Contract
DBE Work
1.
2.
. /
% 7

(4

+

//

The undersigned company representative submits the above list of MWDBE firms to be used in accomplishing the work

conrained in this Bid/RFP/Quote. Any misrepresentation may result in the termination of the contract and/or be subject

to applicable Federal and State laws concerning false statements and false claims.

Le LJS&@A&’ gga;';gm/ﬂz'

Company

S'/H } Z1
Date

Lorvee ||

Company Representative

PeasJo+

Title
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LEXINGTON

LFUCG MWDBE SUBSTITUTION FORM
Bid/RFP/Quotc Reference #_U 3262 Pechidoman—

The substituted MWDBE and/or veteran subcontractors listed below have agreed to participate on this Bid/REFP/Quote.
These substitutions were made prior to or after the job was in progress. These substitutions were made for reasons stated
below and are now being submitted to Central Purchasing for approval. By the authorized signature of a representative of
our company, we understand that this information will be entered into our file for this project. Failure to submit this
form may cause rejection of the bid.

SUBSTITUTED MWDBE Formally Work to Be Reason for the Total Dollar %% Value of Total
MWDBE Company Contracted/ Name, Performed Substitution Value of the Contract
Natne, Address, Phone, Address, Phone, Work
Email Email

The undersigned acknowledges that any misrepresentadon may result in termination of the contract and/or be subject to
applicable Federal and State laws concerning false statements and false claims,

LoW tmayrncy fquiamt Lanjce Ree

Company Company Representative
f_/” ,'L( 'Pﬂ“(’l(j(“/ql—
Date Title
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LEXINGTON

MWDBE QUOTE SUMMARY FORM
Bid/RFP/Quote Reference # U5-2¢2( ?C(J'z (I'LW*L

The undersigned acknowledges that the minority and/or veteran subcontractors listed on this form did
submit a quote to participate on this project. Failure to submit this form may cause rejection of the bid.

Contact Person

LW Cmeyranm faunlbment Lance Pere

Company Name

Address/Phone/Email Lenw 6“&%}{:‘“\ K.cumBid Package / Bid Date

256 €. Cout St
LWNK‘&SW"]L Ky Jsz L/(Z— 2<2| PQ(.J‘«I——‘OM

SO L1-339 - 022y

MWDBE Contact Contact Date Services Method of Total dollars $$ | MBE * Veteran
Company Address Person Information| Contacted | to be Communication) Do Not Leave | AA
(work phong performed | (email, phone Blank HA
Email, cell) meeting, ad, (Attach AS
event etc) Documentation), NA
Female

(MBE designadon / AA=African American / HA= Hispanic American/AS = Asian American/Pacific Islander/
NA= Native American)

I'he undersigned acknowledges that all information is accurate. Any misrepresentation may result in termination of the

contract and/or be subject to applicable Federal and State laws concerning false statements and claims.

[a ) Emrymu;; Equfﬁmcn%

Company

S/l

Date

Ltnec 20—(/

Company Representative

(PILS«.(){A/L\L

Title
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LEXINGTON

LFUCG SUBCONTRACTOR MONTHLY PAYMENT REPORT

The ILFUCG has a 10% goal plan adopred by city council to increase the participation of minority and women owned
businesses in the procurement process. The LFUCG also has a 3% goal plan adopted by cited council to increase the
participation of veteran owned businesses in the procurement process. In order to measure that goal LFUCG will track
spending with MWDBE and Veteran contractors on a monthly basis. By the signature below of an authorized company
representative, you certify that the information is correct, and that each of the representations set forth below is true. Any
misrepresentarion may result in termination of the contract and/or prosecuton under applicable Federal and State laws
concerning false statements and false claims. Please submit this form monthly to the Division of Central Putchasing/ 200
Hast Main Street / Room 338 / Lexington, KY 40507,

Bid/RFP/Quotc #__ Y3 - 2021 Pechheng

Total Contract Amount Awarded to Prime Contractor for this Project

Project Name/ Contract # Work Period/ From: To:
UZ~202(  Pectidny
Company Name: Address:
Lo Emergeney Zqu g‘pmuﬁl 25® £. Comrt S, L—H‘Nnhbbjl_,g'? ry
Federal Tax ID: I Contact Person:
- 372 L5 RO Lanice (2o<

Subcontractor I Description Total % of Total Purchase Scheduled | Scheduled
Vendor ID of Work Subcontract | Total Amount Order number | Project Project
(name, address, Amount Contract Paid for for Start Date End Date
phone, email Awarded this Period | subcontractor

to Prime work

for this {please attach

Project PO)

By the signature below of an authorized company representative, you certify that the information is correct, and that cach

of the representations sct forth below is true. Any misrepresentations may result in the termination of the contract and/or

prosccution under applicable Federal and State laws cgncerning lesc statements gud false claims.
r ;

rnees Bnce
Company Company Representative
s/ Pesi)end

Date Title
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LFUCG STATEMENT OF GOOD FAITH EFFORTS
Bid/RFP/Quote # - 20 €

By the signature below of an authorized company representative, we certify that we have utilized the
following Good Faith Efforts to obtain the maximum participation by MWDBE and Veteran-
Owned business enterprises on the project and can supply the appropriate documentation.

Advertised opportunities to participate in the contract in at least two (2) publications of
general circulation media: trade and professional association publications; small and minority
business or trade publications; and publications or trades targeting minority, women and
disadvantaged businesses not less than fifteen (15) days prior to the deadline for submission of
bids to allow MWDBE firms and Veteran-Owned businesses to participate.

Included documentation of advertising in the above publications with the bidders good
faith efforts package

Attended LFUCG Central Purchasing Economic Inclusion Outreach event

Attended pre-bid meetings that were scheduled by LFUCG to inform MWDBEs and/or
Veteran-Owned Businesses of subcontracting opportunities

Sponsored Economic Inclusion event to provide networking opportunities for prime
contractors and MWDBE firms and Veteran-Owned businesses

Requested a list of MWDBE and/or Veteran subcontractors or suppliers from LFUCG and
showed evidence of contacting the companies on the list(s).

Contacted organizations that work with MWDBE companies for assistance in finding
certified MWBDE firms and Veteran-Owned businesses to work on this project. Those
contacted and their responses should be a part of the bidder’s good faith efforts documentation.

Sent written notices, by certified mail, email or facsimile, to qualified, certified MWDBESs
soliciting their participation in the contract not less than seven (7) days prior to the deadline for
submission of bids to allow them to participate effectively.

Followed up initial solicitations by contacting MWDBEs and Veteran-Owned businesses
to determine their level of interest.

Provided the interested MWBDE firm and/or Veteran-Owned business with adequate and
timely information about the plans, specifications, and requirements of the contract.

Selected portions of the work to be performed by MWDBE firms and/or Veteran-Owned
businesses in order to increase the likelihood of meeting the contract goals. This includes, where
appropriate, breaking out contract work items into economically feasible units to facilitate
MWDBE and Veteran participation, even when the prime contractor may otherwise perform
these work items with its own workforce

Negotiated in good faith with interested MWDBE firms and Veteran-Owned businesses
not rejecting them as unqualified without sound reasons based on a thorough investigation of
their capabilities. Any rejection should be so noted in writing with a description as to why an
agreement could not be reached.

Page 24 of 25



Included documentation of quotations received from interested MWDBE firms and
Veteran-Owned businesses which were not used due to uncompetitive pricing or were rejected as
unacceptable and/or copies of responses from firms indicating that they would not be submitting
a bid.

_ Bidder has to submit sound reasons why the quotations were considered unacceptable.
The fact that the bidder has the ability and/or desire to perform the contract work with its own
forces will not be considered a sound reason for rejecting a MWDBE and/or Veteran-Owned
business’s quote. Nothing in this provision shall be construed to require the bidder to accept
unreasonable quotes in order to satisfy MWDBE and Veteran goals.

Made an effort to offer assistance to or refer interested MWDBE firms and Veteran-
Owned businesses to obtain the necessary equipment, supplies, materials, insurance and/or
bonding to satisfy the work requirements of the bid proposal

Made efforts to expand the search for MWBE firms and Veteran-Owned businesses
beyond the usual geographic boundaries.

Other--any other evidence that the bidder submits which may show that the bidder has
made reasonable good faith efforts to include MWDBE and Veteran participation.

NOTE: Failure to submit any of the documentation requested in this section may be cause for
rejection of bid. Bidders may include any other decumentation deemed relevant to this
requirement which is subject to approval by the MBE Liaison. Documentation of Good Faith
Efforts must be submitted with the Bid, if the participation Goal is not met.

The undersigned acknowledges that all information is accurate. Any misrepresentations may result in termination of
the contract and/or be subject to applicable Federal and State laws concerning false statements and claims.

Le u/ém,crlth wey &’M{“PMM/' LF}I\/C(. ﬁ&c—

Company Company Representative
s/l Pes, Jewd
Date Title
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¥ LEXINGTON

Bid 43-2021 Addendum 1
L & W Emergency Equipment
Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 43-2021 Addendum 1

Title: Partitions and Cargo Boxes

Type: Competitive Bid

Issue Date: 5/3/2021

Deadline: 5/24/2021 02:00 PM (ET)

Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS
SOLICITATION. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE LINE
ITEMS TAB ONLY. PRICING WITHIN SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE
ACCEPTED AND MAY MAKE YOUR BID NON-RESPONSIVE.

Contact Information

Contact: Jessica Allinder

Address: Central Purchasing
Government Center Building
Room 338
200 East Main Street
Room 338
Lexington, KY 40507

Fax: (859) 2583322

Email: jallinder@lexingtonky.gov

Page 1 of 17 pages Vendor: L & W Emergency Equipment Bid 43-2021 Addendum 1



L & W Emergency Equipment Information

Contact: Lance Roe

Address: 250 East Court Street
Lawrenceburg, KY 40342

Phone: (502) 839-6334

Fax: (502) 839-5410

Email: Lance@Iwoultfitters.com

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED! By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent
and bind your company and that you agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached
bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

Lance Roe Lance@Ilwoultfitters.com

Signature Emalil
Submitted at 5/11/2021 9:53:06 AM

Response Attachments

AFFIDAVIT.pdf
Affidavit
EQUAL.pdf
Equal
GREEN.pdf
Green
Invitation to Bid.pdf
Invitation
PAGE 10.pdf
Page 10
PAGE 11.pdf
Page 11
PAGE 19.pdf
Page 19
PAGE 20.pdf
Page 20
PAGE 21.pdf
Page 21<br/>
PAGE 22.pdf
Page 22
PAGE 23.pdf
Page 23<br/>
PAGE 24.pdf
Page 24
PAGE 25.pdf
Page 25<br/>

Page 2 of 17 pages Vendor: L & W Emergency Equipment Bid 43-2021 Addendum 1



Bid Lines

1 | SETINA BODYGUARD MODEL 10XL COATED POLY FRONT PARTITION
Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: $615.00 | Total: | $615.00 |
Manufacturer: | SETINA |
Manufacturer #: |PK1156TAH21 |
Item Notes: NO SUBSTITUTIONS
2 | SETINA BODYGUARD REAR CARGO PARTITION #12VS COATED POLY PARTITION
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $342.00] Total: | $342.00 |
Manufacturer: |SET|NA |
Manufacturer #: [PKO123TAH212ND |
Item Notes: NO SUBSTITUTIONS
3 [ SETINA CARGO SINGLE DECK STORAGE BOX
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,329.00 | Total: | $1,329.00 |
Manufacturer: |SETINA |
Item Notes: NO SUBSTITUTIONS
4 | #5VS Fold-Down Window Coated Polycarbonate Flat Panel Partition
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $615.00 | Total: | $615.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PK0O318TAH21 |
5 | #5/8VS Fold-Down Window 1/2 Coated Polycarbonate and 1/2 Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Flat Panel Partition
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $629.00 | Total: | $629.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PKO319TAH21 |
6 [ #6VS Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate Flat Panel Partition
Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $468.30| Total: | $468.30 |
Manufacturer #: |PKO116TAH21 |
7 | #6VS Stationary Window Uncoated Polycarbonate Flat Panel Partition
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $447.00| Total: | $447.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PKO115TAH21 |
8 | #6/7VS 3-Piece Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate With Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Center Section
Flat Panel Partition
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $503.00| Total: | $503.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PKO326TAH21 |
9 | #7VS Stationary Window Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Flat Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $468.00| Total:l $468.00|

Manufacturer #: |PKO117TAH21
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#8VS Stationary Window1/2 Coated Polycarbonate 1/2 Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Flat Panel Partition

0
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $482.00 | Total: | $482.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PKO119TAH21 |
% #8VS Stationary Window 1/2 Uncoated Polycarbonate 1/2 Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Flat Panel Partition
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $468.00| Total: | $468.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PKO118TAH21 |
% #10VS Horizontal Sliding Window Coated Polycarbonate Flat Panel Partition
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $524.00 | Total: | $524.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PK0121TAH21 |
3.1 #10VS Horizontal Sliding Window Uncoated Polycarbonate Flat Panel Partition
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $496.00 | Total: | $496.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PK0120TAH21 |
1 [ #10VS C Horizontal Sliding Window Coated Polycarbonate With Expanded Metal Window Security Screen Flat
S | Panel Partition
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $552.00 | Total: | $552.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PKO350TAH21 |
1 [ #10VS C Horizontal Sliding Window Uncoated Polycarbonate With Expanded Metal Window Security Screen Flat
6 | Panel Partition
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $524.00 | Total: | $524.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PKO601TAH21 |
1 | #10VS C2 Horizontal Sliding Window Coated Polycarbonate With Slotted Polycarbonate Window Security
8 | Screen Flat Panel Partition
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $552.00 | Total: | $552.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PK0226TAH21 |
1 [ #10VSC2 Horizontal Sliding Window Uncoated Polycarbonate With Slotted Polycarbonate Window Security
9 | Screen Flat Panel Partition
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $524.00 | Total: | $524.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PK0225TAH21 |
% #6VS RP Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate Recessed Panel Partition
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $559.00 | Total: | $559.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PKO374TAH21 |
% #6VS RP Stationary Window Uncoated Polycarbonate Recessed Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $538.00 | Total: | $538.00 |

Manufacturer #: |PKO373TAH21 |
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2 | #6/7VS RP 3-Piece Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate With Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Center Section
2 | Recessed Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $594.00| Total:l $594.00|

Manufacturer #: |PKO517TAH21 |

2 | #7VS RP Stationary Window Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Recessed Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: $559.00| Total:| $559.00|
Manufacturer #: |PKO420TAH21 |

421 #8VS RP Stationary Window 1/2 Coated Polycarbonate 1/2 Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Recessed Panel
Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $573.00| Total: | $573.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PKO369TAH21 |

% #8VS RP Stationary Window 1/2 Uncoated Polycarbonate 1/2 Vinyl Coated Expanded MetalRecessed Panel
Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $559.00 | Total: | $559.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PKO398TAH21 |

2 | #10VS RP Horizontal Sliding Window Coated Polycarbonate Recessed Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $615.00| Total: | $615.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PKO355TAH21 |

2 | #10VS RP Horizontal Sliding Window Uncoated Polycarbonate Recessed Panel Partition
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $587.00| Total: | $587.00 |

Manufacturer #: |PKO439TAH21 |

2 | #10VS C RP Horizontal Sliding Window Coated Polycarbonate With Expanded Metal Window Security Screen
8 | Recessed Panel Partition

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $643.00| Total:| $643.00|

Manufacturer #: |PKO419TAH21 |

2 | #10VS C RP Horizontal Sliding Window Uncoated Polycarbonate With Expanded Metal Window Security Screen
9 | Recessed Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: $615.00| Total:| $615.00|
Manufacturer #: |PKO602TAH21 |

3 | #10VS C2 RP Horizontal Sliding Window Coated Polycarbonate With Slotted Poly Window Security Screen
0 | Recessed Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $587.00| Total: | $587.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PK0228TAH21 |

3 [ #10VS C2 RP Horizontal Sliding Window Uncoated Polycarbonate With Slotted Poly Window Security Screen
1 | Recessed Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $643.00| Total: | $643.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PK0227TAH21 |
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3 | #6XL Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate XL Panel Partition

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA Unit Price: $559.00| Total:l $559.00

Manufacturer #: |PK1164TAH21

3 | #6XL Stationary Window Uncoated Polycarbonate XL Panel Partition

3
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $538.00| Total: | $538.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PK1163TAH21 |
3 | #6/7XL 3-Piece Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate With Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Center Section XL
4 | Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $594.00| Total:| $594.00

Manufacturer #: |PK1170TAH21

3 | #7XL Stationary Window Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Partition XL Panel Partition

Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $559.00 | Total: | $559.00

Manufacturer #: | PK1166TAH21

3 | #8XL Stationary Window 1/2 Coated Polycarbonate 1/2 Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal XL Panel Partition

Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $573.00| Total: | $573.00

Manufacturer #: | PK1160TAH21

3 | #8XL Stationary Window 1/2 Uncoated Polycarbonate 1/2 Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal XL Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $559.00 | Total: | $559.00

Manufacturer #: |PK1157TAH21

3 | #10XL Horizontal Sliding Window Coated Polycarbonate XL Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $615.00| Total:| $615.00

Manufacturer #: |PK1156TAH21

3 | #10XL Horizontal Sliding Window Uncoated Polycarbonate XL Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $587.00| Total:| $587.00

Manufacturer #: | PK1155TAH21

4 | #10XL C Horizontal Sliding Window Coated Polycarbonate With Expanded Metal Window Security Screen XL
0 | Panel Partition

Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $643.00| Total: | $643.00

Manufacturer #: | PK1152TAH21

4 | #10XL C Horizontal Sliding Window Uncoated Polycarbonate With Expanded Metal Window Security Screen XL
1| Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $615.00| Total:| $615.00

Manufacturer #: | PK1151TAH21
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N~

#10XL C2 Horizontal Sliding Window Coated Polycarbonate With Slotted Polycarbonate Window Security
Screen XL Panel Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $643.00| Total:l $643.00|

Manufacturer #: |PK1188TAH21 |

4 | #10XL C2 Horizontal Sliding Window Uncoated Polycarbonate With Slotted Polycarbonate Window Security
3 | Screen XL Panel Partition
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $615.00 | Total: | $615.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PK1187TAH21 |
j Single Prisoner Transport Partition #6VS Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate *FOR USE WITH Stock Seat
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $755.00| Total: | $755.00 |
Manufacturer #: |1KO574TAH21 |
4 | Single Prisoner Transport Partition #6VS Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate *FOR USE WITH: Setina Full
S | COVER Transport Seat
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $755.00| Total: | $755.00 |
Manufacturer #: |1K0574TAH21SS |
4 | Single Prisoner Transport Partition #6VS Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate *FOR USE WITH: Setina Full
6 | REPLACEMENT Transport Seat
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $755.00| Total: | $755.00 |
Manufacturer #: |1KO574TAH21FSR |
4 | Single PRISONER Transport Partition #7VS Stationary Window Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal *FOR USE WITH:
7 | Stock Seat
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $75.00 | Total: | $75.00 |
Manufacturer #: |1KO576TAH21 |
4 | Single Prisoner Transport #7VS Stationary Window Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal *FOR USE WITH: Full COVER
8 | Transport Seat
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $755.00 | Total: | $755.00 |
Manufacturer #: |1KO576TAH21SS |
4 | Single Prisoner Transport #7VS Stationary Window Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal *FOR USE WITH: Full
9 | REPLACEMENT Transport Seat
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $755.00 | Total: | $755.00 |
Manufacturer #: |1K0576TAH21FSR |
8 Cargo Area Partition For 2nd Row Seat #12VS Stationary Window Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal
Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: $342.00 | Total: | $342.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PK0123TAH212ND |
? Cargo Area Rear Partition For 2nd Row Seat #12VS Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate Partition

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $363.00| Total: | $363.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PKO316TAH212ND |
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5 | Partition Transfer Kit Flat Panel Partition With Lower Extension Panel INCLUDED

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $195.00| Total: | $195.00 |
Manufacturer #: |PTO185TAH21 |

5 | Partition Transfer Kit Recessed Panel Partition With 2 PC Lower Extension Panel & Recessed Panel Insert
3 [ INCLUDED

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $223.00| Total: | $223.00 |

Manufacturer #: |PT2185TAH21 |

Partition Transfer Kit XL Panel Partition With Lower Extension Panel & XL Recessed Insert INCLUDED

~O1

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $251.00| Total: | $251.00 |

Manufacturer #: |PT1176TAH21 |

5 | PB100 12" Bumper Aluminum
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer #: |TBD |

S [ PB100 12" Bumper Steel
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer #: |TBD |

5 | PB100 16" Bumper Aluminum
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer #: |TBD |

5 | PB100 16" Bumper Steel
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer #: |TBD |

S [ PB400 VS Bumper Full Bumper Aluminum
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $349.00| Total: | $349.00 |

Manufacturer #: |BKO534TAH21 |

6 | PB400 VS Bumper Full Bumper Aluminum Winch-Ready *SPECIAL ORDER ITEM, NO RETURNS OR
O | CANCELLATIONS

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $447.00| Total: | $447.00 |

Manufacturer #: |BKOOBOTAH21 |

6 | PB400 VS Bumper Steel Full Bumper

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: $349.00| Total:| $349.00|
Manufacturer #: |BKO535TAH21 |

6 | PB450L2 With CODE 3 MR6

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $552.00| Total: | $552.00 |
Manufacturer #: |BK2100TAH21 |
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6 | PB450L2 With D&R ELECTRONICS GENESIS

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$552.00 |

Total:

$552.00 |

Manufacturer #: |BKO820TAH21

6 | PB450L2 With FEDERAL SIGNAL IPX600

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$552.00 |

Total:

$552.00 |

Manufacturer #: |BK2025TAH21

6 | PB450L2 With FENIEX FUSION

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$552.00 |

Total:

$552.00 |

Manufacturer #: |BK2124TAH21

6 | PB450L2 With SOUNDOFF SIGNAL MPOWER

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$552.00 |

Total:

$552.00 |

Manufacturer #: |BK1328TAH21

6 | PB450L2 With SOUNDOFF SIGNAL NFORCE

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$552.00 |

Total:

$552.00 |

Manufacturer #: |B2166TAH21

6 | PB450L2 With TOMAR RECT-14

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$552.00 |

Total:

$552.00 |

Manufacturer #: |BK2042TAH21

6 | PB450L2 With WHELEN ION

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$552.00 |

Total:

$552.00 |

Manufacturer #: |BK2240TAH21

{ | PB450L4 With CODE 3 MR6

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$699.30 |

Total:

$699.30 |

Manufacturer #: |BK2017TAH21

7 | PB450L4 With D&R ELECTRONICS GENESIS

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$699.30 |

Total:

$699.30 |

Manufacturer #: |BK2102TAH21

7 | PB450L4 With FEDERAL SIGNAL IPX600

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$699.30 |

Total:

$699.30 |

Manufacturer #: |BKO821TAH21

7 | PB450L4 With FEDERAL SIGNAL MICROPULSE ULTRA

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$699.30 |

Total:

$699.30 |

Manufacturer #: |BK2027TAH21
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A

PB450L4 With FENEIX FUSION

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$699.30 |

Total:

$699.30 |

Manufacturer #: |BKO802TAH21

PB450L4 With MPOWER

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$699.30 |

Total:

$699.30 |

Manufacturer #: |BK2046TAH21

PB450L4 With SOUNDOFF SIGNAL NFORCE

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$699.30 |

Total:

$699.30 |

Manufacturer #: |BK2168TAH21

PB450L4 With TOMAR 2 RECT-14LS & 2 i-LED

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$699.30 |

Total:

$699.30 |

Manufacturer #: |BK2044TAH21

PB450L4 With WHELEN ION

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$699.30 |

Total:

$699.30 |

Manufacturer #: |BK1275TAH21

Push Bumper Transfer Kit PB100 With Mar-Resistant Horizontal Pad

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$0.00 |

Total:

$0.00 |

Manufacturer #: |BK2019TAH21

Push Bumper Transfer Kit PB400

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$139.00 |

Total:

$139.00 |

Manufacturer #: |TBD

PB5 Fender Wraps Aluminum PB300/400

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$349.00 |

Total:

$349.00 |

Manufacturer #: |BTO639TAH21

PB9A Fender Wraps Aluminum PB300/400

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$412.00 |

Total:

$412.00 |

Manufacturer #: |FKO400TAH21

PB6 Headlight Guard Steel With PB5 Wrap Aluminum

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$419.00 |

Total:

$419.00 |

Manufacturer #: |FKO402TAH21

PB8 Headlight Guard Steel Double Loop

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price:

$482.00 |

Total:

$482.00 |

Manufacturer #: |HK0810TAH21
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8 | PB10 Headlight Guard Steel With PB9S Wrap Steel
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $258.00 | Total: | $258.00 |

Manufacturer #: |HKOB09TAH21 |

8 | Window Barrier Polycarbonate *FOR USE WITH: Stock Door Panels -SETINA TPO Door Panels

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $440.00| Total: | $440.00 |
Manufacturer #: |HK2272TAH21 |

8 | Window Barrier Polycarbonate Tinted *FOR USE WITH: Stock Door Panels-SETINA TPO Door Panels

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $202.00| Total: | $202.00 |
Manufacturer #: |WK0595TAH21 |

8 | Window Barrier Steel Horizontal *FOR USE WITH: Stock Door Panels -SETINA TPO Door Panels
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $216.00| Total: | $216.00 |

Manufacturer #: |WK1491TAH21T |

8 | Window Barrier Rear Hatch Steel Horizontal Rear Cargo Compartment

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $188.00 | Total: | $188.00 |

Manufacturer #: |WK0514TAH21H |

8 Window Barrier 3-Piece Set Steel Horizontal Rear Cargo Compartment *INCLUDES: 2 Side Window - Rear
Hatch

Quantity: 1 uUOoM: EA Unit Price: $153.00| Total:| $153.00|
Manufacturer #: |WK0041TAH21 |

9 | Door Panel TPO Plastic Black Installs Over OEM Door Panels

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $258.00| Total: | $258.00 |
Manufacturer #: | WK0040TAH21 |

9 | Door Panel Aluminum Replaces OEM Door Panels
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $188.00| Total: | $188.00 |

Manufacturer #: |DKO100TAH21 |

9 | K9 Ultimate K9 Exit Points 2: Drivers Side & Cargo Hatch Prisoner Passenger Side Exit * REQUIRED: Recessed
3 | Panel Front Partition NOT INCLUDED *INCLUDES: #12VS Cargo Area Rear Partition Panel Insert

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer #: |DK0598TAH21 |

9 [ K9 Ultimate K9 Exit Points 2: Drivers Side & Cargo Hatch Prisoner Passenger Side Exit *FOR USE WITH: 10"
4 | Fan NOT INCLUDED *REQUIRED: Recessed Panel Front Partition NOT INCLUDED *INCLUDES: #12VS Cargo
Area Rear Partition Panel Insert

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer #: |TBD |

Page 11 of 17 pages Vendor: L & W Emergency Equipment Bid 43-2021 Addendum 1




9 [ K9 Ultimate K9 Exit Points 2: Drivers Side & Cargo Hatch Prisoner Passenger Side Exit *REQUIRED: XL Panel
S | Front Partition NOT INCLUDED *INCLUDES: #12VS Cargo Area Rear Partition Panel Insert

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer #: |TBD

9 [ K9 Ultimate K9 Exit Points 2: Drivers Side & Cargo Hatch Prisoner Passenger Side Exit *FOR USE WITH: 10"
6 | Fan NOT INCLUDED *REQUIRED: XL Panel Front Partition NOT INCLUDED *INCLUDES: #12VS Cargo Area
Rear Partition Panel Insert

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer #: |TBD

9 | T-Rail Mount Kit Free Standing

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer #: |TBD

9 | Firearm Mount Transfer Kit Forward Facing Partition Mount Without Mount Plate *ONLY FOR USE WITH: SPT
8 | Single Prisoner Transport Partition

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer #: |GF1092TAH21

9 [ Full COVER Transport Seat TPO Plastic With Center Pull Seat Belts *REQUIRED: #12VS Stationary Window
9 | Cargo Area Rear Partition NOT INCLUDED *ONLY COMPATIBLE WITH: XL Panel Front Partitions - SPT Single
Prisoner Transports Partitions

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

Manufacturer #; |GT0536TAH21

1 | Full COVER Transport Seat TPO Plastic With Center Pull Seat Belts *INCLUDES REQUIRED: #12VS

0 Stationary Window Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Cargo Partition *Seat Belt Retractors Pre-Installed to Save 30

O | Minutes of Install Time *ONLYCOMPATIBLE WITH: XL Panel Front Partitions-SPT Single Prisoner Transports
Partitions
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer #: |TBD |

1 | Full COVER Transport Seat TPO Plastic With Center Pull Seat Belts *INCLUDES REQUIRED: #12VS

8 Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate Cargo Partition
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer #: |TBD |

% Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic With Center Pull Seat Belts

2 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer #: |TBD |

% Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic With SETINA SMARTBELT SYSTEM

3 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $839.00 | Total: | $839.00 |

Manufacturer #; |QK1374TAH21
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1 | Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic With Center Pull Seat Belts *INCLUDES REQUIRED: #12VS
0 | stationary Window Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Cargo Partition *Seat Belt Retractors Pre-Installed to Save 30
4 | Minutes of Install Time
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer #: |TBD |
1 | Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic With Center Pull Seat Belts *INCLUDES REQUIRED: #12VS
0 Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate Cargo Partition *Seat Belt Retractors Pre-Installed to Save 30 Minutes
S | of Install Time
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,119.00 | Total: | $1,119.00 |
Manufacturer #: |QK2023TAH21 |
1 | Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic With SETINA SMARTBELT SYSTEM *INCLUDES
0 REQUIRED: #12VS Stationary Window Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Cargo Partition *Seat Belt Retractors Pre-
6 | Installed to Save 30 Minutes of Install Time
Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,147.00| Total: | $1,147.00 |
Manufacturer #: |QK2024TAH21 |
1 | Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic Wth SETINA SMARTBELT SYSTEM *INCLUDES REQUIRED:
0 | #12vs Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate Cargo Partition *Seat Belt Retractors Pre-Installed to Save 30
7 | Minutes of Install Time
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer #: |TBD |
% Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic With Center Pull Seat Belts
8 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer #: |TBD |
% Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic With SETINA SMARTBELT SYSTEM
9 |Quantity: 1 uOM: EA Unit Price: $902.00] Total: | $902.00 |
Manufacturer #: |QK0213TAH21 |
1 | Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic With Center Pull Seat Belts *INCLUDES REQUIRED: #12VS
1 | stationary Window Vinyl Coated Expanded Metal Cargo Partition *Seat Belt Retractors Pre-Installed to Save 30
0 Minutes of Install Time
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,189.00| Total: | $1,189.00 |
Manufacturer #: |QK0214TAH21 |
1 | Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic With Center Pull Seat Belts *INCLUDES REQUIRED: #12VS
1 | stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate Cargo Partition *Seat Belt Retractors Pre-Installed to Save 30 Minutes
1| of Install Time
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,182.00| Total: | $1,182.00 |
Manufacturer #: |QK0215TAH21 |
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1 | Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic With SETINA SMARTBELT SYSTEM *INCLUDES

% REQUIRED: #12VS Stationary Window Vinyl Coated
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,273.00 | Total: | $1,273.00 |
Manufacturer #: |QK0281TAH21 |

% Expanded Metal Cargo Partition *Seat Belt Retractors Pre-Installed to Save 30 Minutes of Install Time

3 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,469.00 | Total: | $1,469.00 |
Manufacturer #: |QK0217TAH21 |

1 | Full REPLACEMENT Transport Seat TPO Plastic Wth SETINA SMARTBELT SYSTEM *INCLUDES REQUIRED:

1 | #12VS Stationary Window Coated Polycarbonate Cargo Partition *Seat Belt Retractors Pre-Installed to Save 30

S | Minutes of Install Time
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,560.00 | Total: | $1,560.00 |
Manufacturer #: |QKO308TAH21 |

% Child Restraint Retrofit Kit

6 | Quantity: 1 uOM: EA Unit Price: $69.00| Total: | $69.00 |
Manufacturer #: |QR1407TAH21 |

% CARGO BOX TOA- Tray, Open Top With Anchor Points BSN- Base Sliding With No Lock

7 | Quantty: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: $692.00] Total: | $692.00 |
Manufacturer #: | TKO247TAH21 |

% CARGO BOX TFN- Tray, Fixed With No Lock BSN- Base Sliding With No Lock

8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $636.00 | Total: | $636.00 |
Manufacturer #: | TKO231TAH21 |

% CARGO BOX LFK- Lift Top, Fixed Box With Key Lock BSN- Base Sliding With No Lock

9 | Quantity: _ 1  UOM: EA Unit Price: $993.00 | Total: | $993.00 |
Manufacturer #: | TKO232TAH21 |

% CARGO BOX LFC- Lift Top, Fixed Box With Combination Lock BSN- Base Sliding With No Lock

0 | Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: $993.00| Total: | $993.00 |
Manufacturer #: | TKO230TAH21 |

% CARGO BOX LFE- Lift Top, Fixed Box With Electric Key Pad Lock BSN- Base Sliding With No Lock

1|Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,189.00| Total: | $1,189.00 |
Manufacturer #: | TKO844TAH21 |

% CARGO BOX LFR- Lift Top, Fixed Box With Electric RFID Lock BSN- Base Sliding With No Lock

2 | Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: $1,124.00| Total: | $1,124.00 |
Manufacturer #: | TKO843TAH21 |

Page 14 of 17 pages Vendor: L & W Emergency Equipment Bid 43-2021 Addendum 1




% CARGO BOX DSK- Drawer, Sliding With Key Lock BSN- Base Sliding With No Lock

3 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $979.00 | Total: | $979.00 |
Manufacturer #: |TK0233TAH21 |

% CARGO BOX DSC- Drawer, Sliding With Combination Lock BSN- Base Sliding With No Lock

4 | Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $979.00| Total: | $979.00|
Manufacturer #: | TKO241TAH21 |

% CARGO BOX DSE- Drawer, Sliding With Electric Key Pad Lock BSN- Base Sliding With No Lock

5 | Quantity: 1 uOM: EA Unit Price: $1,175.00| Total: | $1,175.00 |
Manufacturer #: | TKO841TAH21 |

% CARGO BOX DSR- Drawer, Sliding With Electic RFID Lock BSN- Base Sliding With No Lock

6 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,210.00| Total: | $1,210.00 |
Manufacturer #: | TKO842TAH21 |

% CARGO BOX TOA- Tray, Open Top With Anchor Points BSC- Base Sliding With Combination Lock

7 | Quantity: __ 1 uom: EA Unit Price: $769.00| Total: | $769.00 |
Manufacturer #: |TK0236TAH21 |

% CARGO BOX TOA- Tray, Open Top With Anchor Points BSE- Base Sliding With Electric Key Pad Lock

8 | Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: $874.00| Total: | $874.00 |
Manufacturer #: | TKO836TAH21 |

% CARGO BOX TFN- Tray, Fixed With No Lock BSC- Base Sliding With Combination Lock

9 | Quantity: __ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $713.00| Total: | $713.00|
Manufacturer #: | TK0244TAH21 |

% CARGO BOX LFK- Lift Top, Fixed Box With Key Lock BSC- Base Sliding With Combination Lock

1|Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,070.00| Total: | $1,070.00 |
Manufacturer #: | TKO245TAH21 |

% CARGO BOX LFC- Lift Top, Fixed Box With Combination Lock BSC- Base Sliding With Combination Lock

2 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,070.00 | Total: | $1,070.00 |
Manufacturer #: |TK0243TAH21 |

% CARGO BOX DSK- Drawer, Sliding With Key Lock BSC- Base Sliding With Combination Lock

3 | Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: $1,056.00| Total: | $1,056.00 |
Manufacturer #: | TKO246TAH21 |

% CARGO BOX DSC- Drawer, Sliding With Combination Lock BSC- Base Sliding With Combination Lock

4 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,056.00| Total: | $1,056.00 |
Manufacturer #: | TK0248TAH21 |

Page 15 of 17 pages Vendor: L & W Emergency Equipment Bid 43-2021 Addendum 1




% CARGO BOX TOA- Tray, Open Top With Anchor Points BSK- Base Sliding With Key Lock

5| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $769.00 | Total: | $769.00 |
Manufacturer #: |TK0254TAH21 |

% CARGO BOX TFN- Tray, Fixed With No Lock BSK- Base Sliding With Key Lock

6 | Quantity: 1 uOM: EA Unit Price: $713.00| Total: | $713.00 |
Manufacturer #: | TK0252TAH21 |

% CARGO BOX LFK- Lift Top, Fixed Box With Key Lock BSK- Base Sliding With Key Lock

7 | Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: $1,070.00| Total: | $1,070.00 |
Manufacturer #: | TKO253TAH21 |

% CARGO BOX LFC- Lift Top, Fixed Box With Combination Lock BSK- Base Sliding With Key Lock

8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,070.00 | Total: | $1,070.00 |
Manufacturer #: | TKO251TAH21 |

% CARGO BOX DSK- Drawer, Sliding With Key Lock BSK- Base Sliding With Key Lock

9 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,056.00 | Total: | $1,056.00 |
Manufacturer #: |TK0250TAH21 |

i CARGO BOX DSC- Drawer, Sliding With Combination Lock BSK- Base Sliding With Key Lock

0| Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: $1,056.00| Total: | $1,056.00 |
Manufacturer #: | TKO255TAH21 |

}1 CARGO BOX TFN- Tray, Fixed With No Lock BSE- Base Sliding With Electric Key Pad Lock

1 |Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $818.00| Total: | $818.00 |
Manufacturer #: | TKO839TAH21 |

3.1 CARGO BOX TOA- Tray, Open Top With Anchor Points BSR- Base Sliding With Electric RFID Lock

2 | Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit Price: $902.00| Total: | $902.00 |
Manufacturer #: | TKO835TAH21 |

%{ Cargo Rear Deck

3 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $279.00 | Total: | $279.00 |
Manufacturer #: |TK1334TAH21 |

i Cargo Radio Tray With No lock TRN

4 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $272.00| Total: | $272.00 |
Manufacturer #: |TPA9289 |

}1 Cargo Tray Sliding White Board *NOT COMPATIBLE WITH: Cargo Radio Tray With No Lock TRN

5 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $251.00| Total: | $251.00 |
Manufacturer #: |TPA11080 |
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(RN )

Cargo Tray Top Sliding White Board *COMPATIBLE WITH: Cargo Radio Tray With No Lock TRN
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $279.00 | Total: | $279.00 |

Manufacturer # |TPA12419 |

i Cargo Tray Lift Top Sliding White Board *COMPATIBLE WITH: Cargo Radio Tray With No Lock TRN

7 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $293.00 | Total: | $293.00 |
Manufacturer #: |TPA12874 |

411 Freestanding Cargo Box Bracket Kit

8 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
Manufacturer #: |TBD |

i Cargo Scale Box *ACCOMODATES Up To 8 Scales

9 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit Price: $1,476.00 | Total: | $1,476.00 |
Manufacturer #: | TKO888TAH21 |

1 | Transfer Kit Cargo Box *REQUIRED: #12VS Cargo Area Rear Partition NOT INCLUDED *NOT COMPATIBLE

8 WITH: Lift Top Cargo Box

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit Price: $62.00| Total:| $62.00|

Manufacturer #: |TT0242TAH21 |

Response Total: $82,186.00
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