
Bid 115-2019 Addendum 1

Midstates Recreation aka Playworld Midstates

Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 115-2019 Addendum 1
Title: Outdoor Playground Equipment (Supplemental)
Type: Competitive Bid
Issue Date: 10/21/2019
Deadline: 11/5/2019 02:00 PM (ET)
Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS SOLICITATION

. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE LINE ITEMS TAB ONL
Y. PRICING WITHIN SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED AND M
AY MAKE YOUR BID NON-RESPONSIVE.

Contact Information

Contact: Conni Hayes
Address: Central Purchasing

Government Center Building
Room 338
200 East Main Street
Lexington, KY 40507

Phone: (859) 2583320
Fax: (859) 2583322
Email: chayes@lexingtonky.gov
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Midstates Recreation aka Playworld Midstates Information

Contact: Blake Hobson or Theresa Harn
Address: 5828 Zarley St Suite B

New Albany
New Albany, OH 43054

Phone: (614) 855-3790
Email: theresah@midstatesrecreation.com

By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent and bind your company and that you agree
to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

Vicki Cotsamire vickic@midstatesrecreation.com
Signature Email

Submitted at 11/1/2019 3:12:50 PM

Response Attachments

Coverworx Recreational Architecture 2019.pdf

Coverworx catalog

Berliner Landscape Architect Brochure.pdf

Berliner Catalog

Berliner 2019 US Pricing Comp RETAIL.pdf

Berliner 2019 Price List

Bison Retail Price List.pdf

Bison Retail Price List

Affidavit - Signed.pdf

Signed Affidavit

LFUCG_MWDBE_PARTICIPATION_FORMS - Signed.pdf

LFUCG_MWDBE_PARTICIPATION_FORMS

WORKFORCE_ANALYSIS_FORM.pdf

WORKFORCE_ANALYSIS_FORM

2019 Wabash Retail Price List.xlsx

2019 Wabash Retail Price List

Bid Lines

1 Demolition with heavy equipment of existing playground per man hour

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $120.00 Total: $120.00

2 Demolition with heavy equipment of existing playground per man hour

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $120.00 Total: $120.00
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3 Installation of your play equipment as per manufacturer’s specs - see note below.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 30%

Item Notes: Installation of your play equipment as per manufacturer’s specs: __________ % of cost of equipment (n
ot including edging or safety surface). The Contractor shall include accepting the freight on the project 
site or location of choosing, secure storage of the equipment for the duration of the project and disposa
l of all overburden and refuse off-site. For those shipments requested to be sent to Owner’s storage fac
ility at Masterson Station Park, 3051 Leestown Rd., Lexington, KY 40511, Vendor shall include cost of pi
cking up at this location and providing safe and proper storage during installation. Contractor shall use t
emporary plastic fencing; employ security, or other means to protect work until final inspection and acce
ptance by Owner. If proper precautions are not taken, Contractor will be responsible for re-installing equ
ipment properly at their cost. Contractor is also responsible for insuring that play does not occur on equ
ipment until final acceptance by Owner. Owner guarantees inspection within 2 business days of notice o
f completion. Contractor is responsible for any lost, stolen or damaged equipment during installation.

4 Edging: 6” x 6” pressure treated timbers, stacked 2 high (12”) with 24” #5 rebar into ground @ 4’ o.c.

Quantity: 1 UOM: LF Price: $22.00 Total: $22.00

5 Edging: 6” x 12” concrete header curb (set at elevation so that top of curb is flush with outside grade once backfill
ed and inside play area flush with top of wood chip safety surface) with 12 inch deep, integral-pour piers every 5 f
t. o.c. – BROOM finish.

Quantity: 1 UOM: LF Price: $50.00 Total: $50.00

6 Edging: 6” x 12” concrete header curb (set at elevation so that top of curb is flush with outside grade once backfill
ed and inside play area flush with top of wood chip safety surface) with 12 inch deep, integral-pour piers every 5 f
t. o.c. – STAMPED finish.

Quantity: 1 UOM: LF Price: $75.00 Total: $75.00

7 Spreading mulch safety surface evenly under equipment and throughout play area (engineered wood chip mulch 
provided on-site by LFUCG)

Quantity: 1 UOM: CY Price: $12.50 Total: $12.50

8 Grading/site leveling(balanced cut/fill)

Quantity: 1 UOM: CY Price: $45.00 Total: $45.00

9 Geotextile Fabric (provide and install)

Quantity: 1 UOM: SY Price: $3.72 Total: $3.72

1
0

¾” Schedule 80 PVC conduit (provide and install under concrete)

Quantity: 1 UOM: LF Price: $18.00 Total: $18.00

1
1

6” black corrugated drainage pipe in sock in a 12” x 12” trench backfilled with #57 stone (provide materials and in
stall)

Quantity: 1 UOM: LF Price: $15.00 Total: $15.00

1
2

Loading and hauling logs, soil, gravel or rock (30 minute max. haul)

Quantity: 1 UOM: CY Price: $17.50 Total: $17.50

1
3

Sidewalk 4 1/2” broom finish (4000 psi) concrete over 3” compacted #57 stone

Quantity: 1 UOM: SY Price: $90.00 Total: $90.00
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1
4

Sidewalk 4 1/2” broom finish (4000 psi) concrete over 3” compacted #57 stone with manufacturer’s standard col
or admixture

Quantity: 1 UOM: SY Price: $108.00 Total: $108.00

1
5

Sidewalk 4 1/2” broom finish (4000 psi) concrete over 3” compacted #57 stone with stamped texture applied

Quantity: 1 UOM: SY Price: $130.00 Total: $130.00

1
6

Poured in place rubber surface over 4” machine compacted dense grade aggregate (DGA) by vendor/installer (s
ee attached specification) INCLUDING securing site until product is fully cured

Quantity: 1 UOM: SF Price: $18.25 Total: $18.25

1
7

Poured in place rubber surface over 3” asphalt and 4” machine compacted DGA by vendor/installer (see attache
d specification) INCLUDING securing site until product is fully cured

Quantity: 1 UOM: SF Price: $16.90 Total: $16.90

1
8

Poured in place rubber surface over 4” concrete and 3” machine compacted #57 stone by vendor/installer (see a
ttached specification INCLUDING securing site until product is fully cured)

Quantity: 1 UOM: SF Price: $15.75 Total: $15.75

1
9

Pre-cast, modular block retaining wall or equal (price to include manufacturers recommended base/footers for u
p to max. height of 48” and matching top row capstone glued in place (see specification)

Quantity: 1 UOM: SF Price: $28.00 Total: $28.00

2
0

Construction entrance 20 ft. wide X 50 ft. long, excavated to depth of 6”, line with non-woven geotextile fabric and
backfill with 6” #2 stone. Include removal at conclusion of work, backfill with topsoil and seeding entire disturbed 
area (per Seeding specification)

Quantity: 1 UOM: SF Price: $8.20 Total: $8.20

2
1

Silt Fence provided, installed (as per figure 11-21, LFUCG Stormwater Manual, attached at end of specifications) 
and maintained for duration of project and removed after new turf is at 90% coverage

Quantity: 1 UOM: SF Price: $7.00 Total: $7.00

2
2

Seeding/Straw (see specification)

Quantity: 1 UOM: SF Price: $3.20 Total: $3.20

2
3

Sod, turf type fescue (provide and install)

Quantity: 1 UOM: SF Price: $1.56 Total: $1.56

2
4

Temporary, self-supporting, 8 ft. chain link fence sections, 6 ft. tall per 8 ft. section

Quantity: 1 UOM: Each Unit Price: $125.00 Total: $125.00

2
5

$0 - $5,000

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 10%

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

Supplier Notes: Playworld Systems Inc.
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2
6

$5,001 - $10,000

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 10%

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

Supplier Notes: Playworld Systems Inc.

2
7

$10,001 and above

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 15%

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

Supplier Notes: Playworld Systems Inc.

2
8

$0 - $5,000

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 5%

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

Supplier Notes: Berliner

2
9

$5001 - $10,000

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 5%

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

Supplier Notes: Berliner

3
0

$10,001 and above

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 7.5%

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

Supplier Notes: Berliner

3
1

$0 - $5,000

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 5%

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

Supplier Notes: Wabash Valley

3
2

$5001 - $10,000

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 5%

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

Supplier Notes: Wabash Valley

3
3

$10,001 and above

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 7.5%

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

Supplier Notes: Wabash Valley

3
4

$0 - $5,000

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 5%

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

Supplier Notes: Bison
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3
5

$5001 - $10,000

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 5%

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

Supplier Notes: Bison

3
6

$10,001 and above

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 10%

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

Supplier Notes: Bison

3
7

$0 - $5,000

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 5%

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

Supplier Notes: Coverworx

3
8

$5001 - $10,000

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 5%

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

Supplier Notes: Coverworx

3
9

$10,001 and above

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 10%

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

Supplier Notes: Coverworx

4
0

$0 - $5,000

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 0%

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

Supplier Notes: Yalp

4
1

$5001 - $10,000

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 0%

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

Supplier Notes: Yalp

4
2

$10,001 and above

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 10%

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

Supplier Notes: Yalp

4
3

$0 - $5,000

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 5%

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

Supplier Notes: Thomas Steele
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4
4

$5001 - $10,000

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 5%

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

Supplier Notes: Thomas Steele

4
5

$10,001 and above

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off Total: 10%

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

Supplier Notes: Thomas Steele

4
6

$0 - $5,000

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off No Bid

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

4
7

$5001 - $10,000

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off No Bid

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

4
8

$10,001 and above

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off No Bid

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

4
9

$0 - $5,000

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off No Bid

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

5
0

$5001 - $10,000

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off No Bid

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

5
1

$10,001 and above

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off No Bid

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

5
2

$0 - $5,000

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off No Bid

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

5
3

$5001 - $10,000

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off No Bid

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

5
4

$10,001 and above

Quantity: 1 UOM: Percent Off No Bid

Item Notes: Please list manufacturer

Response Total: $1,050.58
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