"¥ ) LEXINGTON

Bid 172-2018
Grogan's Healthcare Supply, Inc.
Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 172-2018

Title: Emergency Medical Supplies

Type: Competitive Bid

Issue Date: 12/20/2018

Deadline:  1/7/2019 02:00 PM (ET)

Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS
SOLICITATION. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE LINE
ITEMS TAB ONLY. PRICING WITHIN SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE
ACCEPTED AND MAY MAKE YOUR BID NON-RESPONSIVE.

Contact Information

Contact: Jessica Allinder

Address: 200 East Main Street
Central Purchasing
Government Center Building

Room 338

Lexington, KY 40507
Fax: (859) 2583322 x
Email: jallinder@lexingtonky.gov
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Grogan's Healthcare Supply, Inc. Information

Contact: Tom Hill

Address: 1016 South Broadway
Lexington, KY 40504

Phone: (859) 254-6661 x8378

Fax: (859) 254-6666
Toll Free: (800) 365-1020
Email: thill@grogans.com

By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent and bind your company and that you agree
to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

Tom Hill thill@grogans.com

Signature Email
Submitted at 1/4/2019 1:27:00 PM

Response Attachments

Ifucg 172-2018 workforce form 20190103135801021.pdf
WORKFORCE MWDBE FORM

172-2018 Ifucg MWDBE 20190103135923023.pdf
172-2018 MWDBE FORM

172-2018 affidavit 20190104130448629.pdf
172-2018 affidavit

Bid Lines

1 | 1" cloth tape - case of 144 rolls

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.6601| Total: | $0.6601 |
Supplier Notes: |$95.06 per 144 |

2 | 10cc pre-filled syringe flush - box of 100

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.4277| Total: | $0.4277 |
Supplier Notes: [$42.77 per 100 |

3 | 14ga 3.25 IV cath decompress - box of 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $16.46 | Total: | $16.46 |

Supplier Notes: |$164.59 per 10 |

4 | 2" cloth tape 2"x10 yard roll- case of 144 rolls

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $1.3203| TotaI:| $1.3203|

Supplier Notes: |$164.59 per 144 |
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2" kling 2"x 4.1 yard roll -case of 96 rolls

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.0784 |

Total:

$0.0784 |

Supplier Notes: |$7.53 per 96

4" Ace bandage 4"x4.5 yards - case of 50

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.5286 |

Total:

$0.5286 |

Supplier Notes: |$26.43 per 50

4" kling 4"x4.1 yards - case of 96

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.1042 |

Total:

$0.1042 |

Supplier Notes: [$10.01 per 96

4x4 gauze 12 ply 25 per box - case of 600

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.0535 |

Total:

$0.0535 |

Supplier Notes: |$32.08 per 600

5x9 pads 25 per tray - case of 400

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.0846 |

Total:

$0.0846 |

Supplier Notes: |$33.83 per 400

6" kling 6" x 4.1 yards - case of 48

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.2107 |

Total:

$0.2107 |

Supplier Notes: {$10.11 per 48

8x10 pads 20 per tray - case of 320

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.1318 |

Total:

$0.1318 |

Supplier Notes: |$42.19 per 320

activated charcoal 50 gm bottle - per bottle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unitprice:|

$22.52 |

Total:

$22.52 |

adenosine 6mg, 2 ml vial - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unitprice:|

$5.362 |

Total:

$5.362 |

Supplier Notes: |$53.62 per box of 10

NN

albuterol 2.5 mg, 3ml vial - 25 per box - case of 24 boxes

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.1824 |

Total:

$0.1824 |

Supplier Notes: |$4.56 per 25, $109.43 per 24 boxes of 25

amiodarone 150mg, 3 ml vial - pack of 25 vials

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$2.4947 |

Total:

$2.4947 |

Supplier Notes: |$62.37 per 25 vials
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1 | ammonia inhalant ampule 10/box - case of 10 boxes

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit price: $0.211 | Total: $0.211 |

Supplier Notes: [$2.11 per 10 ampules, $21.11 per 10 boxes |
% antibiotic ointment .9mg 25/ box, case of 72 boxes

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.1047 | Total: $0.1047 |

Supplier Notes: [$2.62 per 25, $188.44 per 1800 |
% armboard Large 3x18 - case of 100

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.7331] Total: $0.7331 |

Supplier Notes: [73.31 per 100 |
% armboard Medium 3x9 - case of 100

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.5509 | Total: $0.5509 |

Supplier Notes: |$55.09 per 100 |
(2) armboard Small 1x4 - case of 100

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.3528 | Total: $0.3528 |

Supplier Notes: |$35.28 per 100 |
% Asherman chest - 10 per box

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $9.8102 | Total: $9.8102 |

Supplier Notes: [$98.10 per 10 |
% aspirin 81mg chewable 36/bottle - case of 25 bottles

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.0307 | Total: $0.0307 |

Supplier Notes: [$1.10 per 36, $27.50 per 25 bottles |
% atropine 1mg prefilled, 10ml prefilled Luer - brick of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $16.848 | Total: $16.848 |

Supplier Notes: |$168.48 per brick of 10 |
ﬁ BP cuff L adult, 50 per case

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $7.8014 | Total: $7.8014 |

Supplier Notes: |$390.07 per 50 |
% BP cuff XL adult - 50 per case

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $8.3792 | Total: $8.3792 |

Supplier Notes: |$418.96 per 50 |
% BP cuff pediatric - 50 per case

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $8.5978 | Total: $8.5978 |

Supplier Notes: {$429.89 |
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bulb syringe sterile 2 oz - case of 50
Quantity: _ 1

UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.4838| Total: | $0.4838 |

Supplier Notes: [$24.19 per case of 50

burn sheet 60"x96" disposable, case of 24

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$5.4176 |

$5.4176 | Total: |

Supplier Notes: |$130.02 per 24

calcium chloride 1G prefilled, brick of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$8.7981 |

$8.7981| Total:|

Supplier Notes: |$87.98 per 10

instant cold pack - case of 24
Quantity: 1

UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.4585 |

$0.4585 | Total: |

Supplier Notes: [$11.00 per 24

conterra intubation kit 14"x3"7" - each

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

cyano kit 5gm hydroxocobalamin each

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

D50 25G prefilled syringe - brick of 10
Quantity: _ 1

UOM: EA Unit price:

$10.423| Total: | $10.423 |

Supplier Notes: [$104.23 per 10

diphenhydramine 50mg carpuject - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

dopamine vial 400 mg vial - box of 25

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

Ultra Soft Box Plus Trauma Bag 23x17x12 - each

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

electrodes - case of 15 boxes
Quantity: 1

UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.1684 | Total: | $0.1684 |

Supplier Notes: [$101.02 per 600

oh

endotrol ET tube 6.0 - box of 10
Quantity: _ 1

UOM: EA Unit price:

$9.475| Total: | $9.475 |

Supplier Notes: [94.75 per box of 10
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EYN

endotrol ET tube 7.0 - box of 10
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$9.475 |

Total:

$9.475 |

Supplier Notes: [94.75 per box of 10

epinephrine 1:1000 1mg amp - box of 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$12.277 |

Total:

$12.277 |

Supplier Notes: |$122.77 per 10

wh

epinephrine 1:10000 prefilled - brick of 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$7.0428 |

Total:

$7.0428 |

Supplier Notes: |70.43 per 10

Esophageal intubation detector - case of 20
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$2.249 |

Total:

$2.249 |

Supplier Notes: |$44.98 per 20

(G2 1FN

ET tube 3.0 cuffed - box of 10
Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA

Unit price:

$1.54 |

Total:

$1.54 |

Supplier Notes: [$15.40 per 10

o

ET tube 3.5 cuffed - box of 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$1.54 |

Total:

$1.54 |

Supplier Notes: [$15.40 per 10

~a

ET tube 4.0 cuffed - box of 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$1.54 |

Total:

$1.54 |

Supplier Notes: [$15.40 per 10

oo~

ET tube 4.5 cuffed - box of 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$1.54 |

Total:

$1.54 |

Supplier Notes: |15.40 per 10

ET tube 5.0 - box of 10
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$1.54 |

Total:

$1.54 |

Supplier Notes: [15.40 per 10

ET tube 5.5 - box of 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$1.54 |

Total:

$1.54 |

Supplier Notes: [$15.40 per 10

ET tube 6.0 - box of 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$1.54 |

Total:

$1.54 |

Supplier Notes: [$15.40 per 10
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5 [ ET tube 6.5 - box of 10

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$1.54 |

Total:

$1.54 |

Supplier Notes: [$15.40 per 10

5 [ ET tube 7.0 - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$1.54 |

Total:

$1.54 |

Supplier Notes: [$15.40 per 10

ET tube 7.5 - box of 10

H~O1

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$1.54 |

Total:

$1.54 |

Supplier Notes: [$15.40 per 10

5 [ ET tube 8.0 - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$1.54 |

Total:

$1.54 |

Supplier Notes: [$15.40 per 10

5 [ ET tube 8.5 - box of 10

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$1.54 |

Total:

$1.54 |

Supplier Notes: [$15.40 per 10

5 [ ET tube 9.0 - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$1.54 |

Total:

$1.54 |

Supplier Notes: [$15.40 per 10

5 | eye pads soft, oval, sterile, 2 5/8"x1 5/8" 50 pack - case of 600

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.0849 |

Total:

$0.0849 |

Supplier Notes: {$4.25 per 50, $50.94 per 600

5 | Ferno 65EXL scoop stretcher - each
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

6 | flexible fabric bandage 1"x3" - box of 24

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.0193 |

Total:

$0.0193 |

Supplier Notes: {$.46 per 24 each, $1.93 per 100

6 | flexible fabric bandage 2"x4.5" box of 50 - 24/case

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.0688 |

Total:

$0.0688 |

Supplier Notes: {$3.44 per 50, $82.60 per 1200

6 | furosemide 100mg/10ml vial - box of 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

6 | glucagon emergency kit - each

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$310.74 |

Total:

$319.74 |
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~O

instant hot pack - case of 24

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.4709 | Total: $0.4709 |

Supplier Notes: [$11.30 per 24 |
6 | illinois 10 sternal needle kit - each
5 _ .

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
g Teleflex Slick intubation stylette adult - box of 25

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $3.7352 | Total: $3.7352 |

Supplier Notes: [$93.38 PER 25 |
9 Teleflex Slick intubation stylette peds - box of 25

Quantity: _1  UOM: EA Unit price: $3.1562| Total $3.1562 |

Supplier Notes: [$78.91 per 25 |
g ipratropium bromide 0.02%, 2.5ml vial 25/box - case of 12 boxes

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.1876 | Total: $0.1876 |

Supplier Notes: |$4.69 per 25, $56.28 per 12 boxes of 25 |
8 Iron Duck folding backboard - each

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid
(7) lancets 2.4 mm, 21G needle 100/box - case of 10 boxes

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.0994 | Total: $0.0994 |

Supplier Notes: [$9.94 per 100, $99.40 per 1000 |
Z lidocaine 2%, 100mg prefilled - brick of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $4.656 | Total: $4.656 |

Supplier Notes: {$46.56 per brick of 10 |
Z lidocaine 2gm/Dextrose 5%, 500ml bag - case of 18 bags

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $7.29 | Total: $7.29 |

Supplier Notes: |$131.22 per 18 |
g mega mover 40"x80" - case of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $15.7584 | Total: $15.7584 |

Supplier Notes: |$157.58 per 10 |
Z multicuff BP kit child, sm adult, adult, Ig adult, thigh - each

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit price: | $111.94 | Total: $111.94 |
g naloxone 2mg, 1mg/ml prefilled

Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit price: | $34.691| Total: $34.691 |

Supplier Notes: |$346.91 per 10 |
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nasopharyngeal airway 12fr - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$3.05 |

Total:

$3.05 |

Supplier Notes: [$30.50 per box of 10

nasopharyngeal airway 16fr - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$3.05 |

Total:

$3.05 |

Supplier Notes: [$30.50 per 10

nasopharyngeal airway 20fr - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$3.05 |

Total:

$3.05 |

Supplier Notes: [$30.50 per 10

nasopharyngeal airway 22fr - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$3.05 |

Total:

$3.05 |

Supplier Notes: [$30.50 per 10

nasopharyngeal airway 26fr - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$3.05 |

Total:

$3.05 |

Supplier Notes: [$30.50 per 10

nasopharyngeal airway 30fr - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$3.05 |

Total:

$3.05 |

Supplier Notes: [$30.50 per 10

nasopharyngeal airway 32fr - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$3.05 |

Total:

$3.05 |

Supplier Notes: [$30.50 per 10

nitroglycerine 0.4mg sublingual tablets, 100/bottle - each

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.9414 |

Total:

$0.9414 |

Supplier Notes: [$94.14 per 100

non-adherent pads 3"x4" 100/bx - case of 24 boxes

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.0529 |

Total:

$0.0529 |

Supplier Notes: [$5.29 per 100, $126.96 per 2400

Iron Duck O2 bag 21x8.5x8.5 for D cyclinder - each
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

OB kits - case of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$6.124 |

Total:

$6.124 |

Supplier Notes: |$61.24 per 10
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oral glucose tube, 15 gm, 3 tubes/pack - case of 12 packs

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$5.0673 |

Total:

$5.0673 |

Supplier Notes: [$15.20 per pack of 3, $182.40 per 12 packs of 3

oral airway 110mm box of 50 - per box

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.228 |

Total:

$0.228 |

Supplier Notes: {$11.40 per 50

oral airway 90mm box of 50 - per box

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.228 |

Total:

$0.228 |

Supplier Notes: {$11.40 per 50

oral airway 70mm box of 50 - per box

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.228 |

Total:

$0.228 |

Supplier Notes: {$11.40 per 50

oral airway 50mm box of 50 - per box

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.228 |

Total:

$0.228 |

Supplier Notes: [$11.40 per 50

penlight - box of 300

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$1.025 |

Total:

$1.025 |

Supplier Notes: |$307.50 per 300

Ondansetron 4mg/2 ml vial 25/box - box of 25

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$1.1232 |

Total:

$1.1232 |

Supplier Notes: {$28.08 per 25

~O

ring cracker - 4 per pack
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

ring cutter - each

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$14.25 |

Total:

$14.25 |

S-Scort JR suction unit - each
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

S-Scort JR suction canister - case of 20
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

Sager traction splint peds - each
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

Sager traction splint adult - each
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid
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oo

Sam splint 36 inch - case of 60

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$4.9746 | Total: |

$4.9746 |

Supplier Notes: |$298.48 per 60

RO

sodium bicarbonate 8.4% 50mEq luer jet prefilled - brick of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$13.47 | Total: |

$13.47 |

Supplier Notes: |$134.70 per 10

NOPF

speedblock side replacements - 20 bags/case
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

WOor

speedblock starter set - case of 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

Y™

speedblock straps and pads set - case of 10 sets
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

010k

spider straps - each
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

(ele)

suction cath 10fr - case of 50

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.2874| Total:|

$0.2874 |

Supplier Notes: |$14.37 per 50

~orF

suction cath 12fr - case of 50

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.2874 | Total: |

$0.2874 |

Supplier Notes: [$14.37 per 50

cooRr

suction cath 18fr - case of 50

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.2874 | Total: |

$0.2874 |

Supplier Notes: [$14.37 per 50

o

suction cath 6fr - case of 50

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.2874 | Total: |

$0.2874 |

Supplier Notes: [$14.37 per 50

ork

suction cath 8fr - case of 50

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.2874| Total:|

$0.2874 |

Supplier Notes: |$14.37 per 50

PR

Lubricating jelly packets, 2.7gm box of 144 packets - case of 12 boxes

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$0.0821| Total: |

$0.0821 |

Supplier Notes: [$11.83 per 144, $141.96 per 1728
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NP

test strips (precision extra) - case of 600

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

% tetracaine eye drops 0.5% 15 ml bottle - each

3 |Quantity: 1 uoM: EA Unit price: | $48.47| Total: | $48.47 |

% Welch Allyn thermometer probe covers 25/box - case of 30 boxes

4 | Quantity: _ 1  UOM: EA Unit price: | $0.0354 | Total: | $0.0354 |
Supplier Notes: [$.88 per 25, $26.55 per 750 |

% thiamine 100mg/ml 2ml prefilled - pack of 25 vials

5 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

% Thomas tube tie velcro adult - 100 per case

6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

% Thomas tube tie velcro peds - 100 per case

7 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

% 3M transpore tape 1 inx10yard, 12 rolls/box - case of 10 boxes

8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.5778| Total: | $0.5778 |
Supplier Notes: [$6.93 per 12, $69.30 per 120 |

% multi-trauma sterile dressing 10x30 - case of 50

9 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $1.15 | Total: | $1.15 |
Supplier Notes: |$57.50 per 50 |

% trauma shears - box of 12

0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.9889 | Total: | $0.9889 |
Supplier Notes: {$11.87 per 12 |

% triangular bandage polypropylene 40x40x56 - case of 240

1 |Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: | $0.208 | Total: | $0.208 |
Supplier Notes: |$49.93 per 240 |

% vacuum splint set (leg, arm, wrist/ankle, case, pump) - each

2 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

% immobilization case (c-collar bag) 24x12.25x11 - each

3 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

% Yankauer suction tip w/ 6 foot tubing - case of 20

4 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $1.849 | Total: | $1.849 |
Supplier Notes: |$36.98 per 20 |
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~NNE

velcro splint set - each

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% Magill forceps child - each
8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: | $7.34 | Total: | $7.34 |
% Magill forceps adult - each
9 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: | $7.34 | Total: | $7.34 |
% laryngoscope blade #3 Miller - each
0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:l $9.49| TotaI:| $9.49|
% carpuject holder - each
2 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: | $0.74 | Total: | $0.74 |
% transpore 1"x 10 yds
4 | Quantity: _ 1  UOM: EA Unit price:l $0.5778| TotaI:| $0.5778|
% D10 250ml
5| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: | $2.34 | Total: | $2.34 |
Supplier Notes: [$56.16 per case of 24 |
% Adenosine 12mg 4ml vial
6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
1 | Precision Extra Glucometer - each
3 _ .
7 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
% laryngoscope bulb small - box of 25
8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $2.29 | Total: | $2.29 |
Supplier Notes: |$57.25 per 25 |
% laryngoscope bulb large - box of 25
9 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $2.29 | Total: | $2.29 |
Supplier Notes: |$57.25 per 25 |
1 | BAAM air flow monitor - case of 100
4 _ :
2 | Quantity: _ 1  UOM: EA No Bid
i backboard 71x15.75x.85 no pins - each
3 |Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid
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1000ml lactated ringers - case of 14 bags

N

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$2.505 |

Total:

$2.505 |

Supplier Notes: [$35.07 per 14

10cc saline flush - 8 box of 100/case

(GaF~N )

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$0.4277 |

Total:

$0.4277 |

Supplier Notes: {$42.77 per 100, $342.16 per 800

10cc syringe - box of 100

(XN

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$0.1042 |

Total:

$0.1042 |

Supplier Notes: [$10.42 per 100

15 gallon red biohazard bags - case of 250

~Nbhpe

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$0.1545 |

Total:

$0.1545 |

Supplier Notes: |$38.62 per 250

160z alcohol - case of 12

oA

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$1.3018 |

Total:

$1.3018 |

Supplier Notes: [$15.62 per 12

160z peroxide cae of 12

©OoAP

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$0.50 |

Total:

$0.50 |

Supplier Notes: |$6.00 per 12

18GA safety needle - box of 100
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

QUi

Unit price:

$0.2333 |

Total:

$0.2333 |

Supplier Notes: |$23.33 per 100

1cc syringe without needle - box of 100

ROl

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$0.0841 |

Total:

$0.0841 |

Supplier Notes: [$8.41 per 100

1cc syringe w/25ga needle - box of 100

N o1~

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$0.088 |

Total:

$0.088 |

Supplier Notes: [$8.80 per 100

250ml D5W - case of 36 bags
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

woipR

Unit price:

$3.8391 |

Total:

$3.8391 |

Supplier Notes: [$138.21 per 36

500ml normal saline - case of 24 bags

o101

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$2.2732 |

Total:

$2.2732 |

Supplier Notes: [$54.56 per 24
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(epXéal )

60cc syringe - box of 25

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.4008 | Total: $0.4008 |
Supplier Notes: [$10.02 per 25 |

% alcohol prep pads 200/box, 10 boxes/case - per case

8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.0057 | Total: $0.0057 |
Supplier Notes: [$1.14 per 200, $11.40 per 2000 |

% alcohol gel hand cleaner - 24 case

9 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.5365 | Total: $0.5365 |
Supplier Notes: |$12.88 per 24 |

% ambu adujstable C collar adult - case of 30

0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $4.062 | Total: $4.062 |
Supplier Notes: |$121.86 per 30 |

% ambu adjustable C collar peds - case of 30

1| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $4.062 | Total: $4.062 |
Supplier Notes: [$121.86 per 30 |

% Ambu adult valve mask - case of 12

2 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $8.8758 | Total: $8.8758 |
Supplier Notes: [$106.51 per 12 |

% Ambu peds valve mask - case of 12

3 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $13.34| Total: $13.34 |
Supplier Notes: |$160.04 per 12. Each item contains all 3 sizes of pediatric masks |

% digital thermometer welch allyn - each

4 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: | $199.50 | Total: $199.50 |

% disinfectant wipes 160 per tub, 12 tubs/case - per case

5| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: | $0.0336 | Total: $0.0336 |
Supplier Notes: [$5.37 per 160 wipes, $64.44 per 12 tubs |

% emesis basin 6 gt rectangular - case of 50

6 | Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.7104| Total: $0.7104 |
Supplier Notes: [$35.52 per 50 |

% disposable gown - case of 50

7 | Quantity: 1  UOM: EA Unit price: $0.45 | Total: $0.45 |
Supplier Notes: |$22.50 per 50 |
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disposable shoe covers - box of 100

oo~

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$0.0512 | Total: |

$0.0512 |

Supplier Notes: [$5.12 per 100

Ambu EZ cap CO2 detector adult - 12/case
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

oo

Unit price:

$7.9442 | Total: |

$7.9442 |

Supplier Notes: |$95.33 per 12

EZ cap CO2 detector peds - 12/case

o~k

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$7.9442| Total:|

$7.9442 |

Supplier Notes: {$95.33 per 12

R

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

electrodes diaphoretic 4/pack, 10 packs/box, 15 box/case - case of 600

Unit price:

$0.1684 | Total: |

$0.1684 |

Supplier Notes: [$101.02 per 600

emesis bags 6x15 1.35mil, 100/case - case of 100

N~

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$0.9824 | Total: |

$0.9824 |

Supplier Notes: |$98.24 per 100

I-gel size 1 case of 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

W~

No Bid

I-gel size 2 case of 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

FNONTEN

No Bid

I-gel size 3 case of 25
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

(S BN

No Bid

I-Gel size 4 case of 25
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

o~

No Bid

I-Gel size 5 case of 25
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

~N =~

No Bid

introcan 14ga IV cath - 4 box/case

o~

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$1.5543| Total: |

$1.5543 |

Supplier Notes: [$77.72 per 50, $310.87 per 200

introcan 16ga IV cath - 4 box/case

©~F

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$1.5537| Total:|

$1.5537 |

Supplier Notes: |$77.68 per 50, $310.73 per 200
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introcan 18ga IV cath - 4 box/case

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $1.5537| TotaI:| $1.5537|

Supplier Notes: [$77.68 per 50, $310.73 per 200 |

(@Xeo] ]

introcan 20ga IV cath - 4 box/case

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $1.5537| Total:| $1.5537|
Supplier Notes: |$77.68 per 50, $310.73 per 200 |

R oo

introcan 22ga IV cath - 4 box/case

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $1.5537 | Total: | $1.5537 |
Supplier Notes: {$77.68 per 50, $310.73 per 200 |

N

introcan 24ga IV cath - 4 box/case
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $1.5537 | Total: | $1.5537 |

Supplier Notes: [$77.68 per 50, $310.73 |

wWoor

irrigation saline 1000ml bottle - 12 bottles/case

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $2.145| TotaI:| $2.145|

Supplier Notes: [$25.74 per 12 |

~OOR

maxi drop IV set 10gtt - 48 per case
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $1.3534| Total: | $1.3534 |

Supplier Notes: |$64.96 per 48 |

(epYo el )

mini drop IV set 60gtt - 48 per case

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $1.4052 | Total: | $1.4052 |
Supplier Notes: |$67.45 per 48 |

~ oo

N95 mask with port - box of 20
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $3.6692 | Total: | $3.6692 |

Supplier Notes: |$73.38 per 20 |

coooF

nasal cannula adult - case of 50

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.4232| TotaI:| $0.4232|

Supplier Notes: [$21.16 per 50 |

((ofe el )

nasal cannula peds - case of 50

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $1.57| Total:| $1.57|
Supplier Notes: |$78.65 per 50 |

([@){e) )

nebulizer mask with tubing - case of 50

Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit price: $1.2074| Total: | $1.2074 |
Supplier Notes: |$60.37 per 50 |

RO

Page 17 of 19 pages Vendor: Grogan's Healthcare Supply, Inc. Bid 172-2018




% nitrile gloves XL 100/box, 10 boxes per case - price per case

2 | Quantity: 1  UOM: EA Unit price: $0.0649 | Total: $0.0649 |
Supplier Notes: [$6.49 per 100, $64.90 per 1000 |

% nitrile gloves L - case

3 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.0649 | Total: $0.0649 |
Supplier Notes: {$6.49 per 100, $64.90 per 1000 |

% nitrile gloves M - case

4 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.0649 | Total: $0.0649 |
Supplier Notes: |$6.49 per 100, $64.90 per 1000 |

% nitrile gloves S - per case

5| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: | $0.0649 | Total: $0.0649 |
Supplier Notes: [$6.49 per 100, $64.90 per 1000 (case) |

% non rebreather mask adult - case of 50

6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: | $1.1026 | Total: $1.1026 |
Supplier Notes: [$55.13 per 50 |

% non rebreather mask pediatric - case of 50

7 | Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit price: $1.8298| Total: $1.8298 |
Supplier Notes: [$91.49 per 50 |

% Nonin pulse ox - each

8 |Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit price: | $395.48| Total: $395.48 |

(2) PRN connector needleless saline lock - case of 100

0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: | $0.9003 | Total: $0.9003 |
Supplier Notes: |$90.03 per 100 |

(2) Sharps container Large 6.9 quart - box of 12

5 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $4.0896 | Total: $4.0896 |
Supplier Notes: {$49.08 per 12 |

(2) Sharps container flip top 1 quart - case of 20

7 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $3.29 | Total: $3.29 |
Supplier Notes: [$65.80 per 20 |

% stethoscope - each

O | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $3.23 | Total: $3.23 |
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suction canister hydrophobic 800cc w/lid - case of 100

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $2.4628| TotaI:| $2.4628|

Supplier Notes: |$246.28 per 100 |

PRN

Transparent window film dressing 6cmx7cm or equivalent - box of 100

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.2284| Total: | $0.2284 |
Supplier Notes: [$22.84 per 100 |

NN

thermometer probe covers for Welch Allyn thermometer - case of 1000

Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.0239 | Total: | $0.0239 |
Supplier Notes: [$23.86 per 1000 |

IV

tourniquet latex free disposable - box of 250
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.11 | Total: | $0.11 |

Supplier Notes: [$27.50 per 250 |

(621 ol \V]

Welch Allyn thermometer - each

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:| $199.50| TotaI:| $199.50|

(2] ol \]

Zoll M series monitor paper - case of 20

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:| $2.0885| TotaI:| $2.0885|

Supplier Notes: [$41.77 per 20 |

TSN

Zoll M series adult defibrillation pads - 10/case

QO N

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $26.20 | Total: | $26.20 |
Supplier Notes: {$262.00 per 10 pair |

Zoll M series peds pads - 10/case

OFN

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $27.00| Total: | $27.00 |
Supplier Notes: [$270.00 per 10 pair |

Zoll Stat Padz for AED Plus and Pro - pair
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $36.45 | Total: | $36.45 |

Supplier Notes: |36.45 per pair (set) |

ONN

Zoll Pedi Padz Il for AED Plus and Pro - pair
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $83.16 | Total: | $83.16 |

Supplier Notes: [$83.16 per pair |

PNN

face shield with eyeguard 25/box
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.8372 | Total: | $0.8372 |

Supplier Notes: [$20.93 per 25 |

NNN

Response Total: $1,918.6381
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