"¥ ) LEXINGTON

Bid 172-2018
Southeastern Emergency Equipment
Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: Bid 172-2018

Title: Emergency Medical Supplies

Type: Competitive Bid

Issue Date: 12/20/2018

Deadline:  1/7/2019 02:00 PM (ET)

Notes: ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS
SOLICITATION. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE LINE
ITEMS TAB ONLY. PRICING WITHIN SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE
ACCEPTED AND MAY MAKE YOUR BID NON-RESPONSIVE.

Contact Information

Contact: Jessica Allinder

Address: 200 East Main Street
Central Purchasing
Government Center Building

Room 338

Lexington, KY 40507
Fax: (859) 2583322 x
Email: jallinder@lexingtonky.gov
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Southeastern Emergency Equipment Information

Address: P.O. Box 1097
Youngsville, NC 27596

Phone:  (800) 334-6656

Fax: (888) 556-1048

By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent and bind your company and that you agree
to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.

Bradley G Smith brad.smith@seequip.com

Signature Email
Submitted at 1/4/2019 10:01:37 AM

Response Attachments

Lexington-Fayette Urban Bid Documents-Final.pdf
Legal Documentation for bid # 172-2018

Bid Lines

1| 1" cloth tape - case of 144 rolls
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $89.00| Total:l $89.00|

Supplier Notes: |D5041...12 ROLLS/BX....12 BX/CS = 144 ROLLS |

2 | 10cc pre-filled syringe flush - box of 100
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $32.00| Total: | $32.00 |

Supplier Notes: [38375.......... 100/bx |

3 | 14ga 3.25 IV cath decompress - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $7l.40| Total:| $71.40|
Supplier Notes: [NAZZ-0056 SOLD AS EACH....7.14 |

4 | 2" cloth tape 2"x10 yard roll- case of 144 rolls

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $178.00 | Total: | $178.00 |
Supplier Notes: |D5042 6 ROLLS/BX...12 BX/CS =72 ROLLS 72 ROLLS X 2 = 144 (OR 2 CASES) 89.00/CASE |

5 [ 2" kling 2"x 4.1 yard roll -case of 96 rolls
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $8.00 | Total: | $8.00 |

Supplier Notes: | D5300 12/BX...8 BX/CS = 96/CS |

6 | 4" Ace bandage 4"x4.5 yards - case of 50
Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit price: $25.50 | Total: | $25.50 |

Supplier Notes: |D5112 |
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4" kling 4"x4.1 yards - case of 96

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $10.96 | Total: $10.96 |

Supplier Notes: [D5302 12/BX.....8 BX/CS |
8 | 4x4 gauze 12 ply 25 per box - case of 600

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $40.32 | Total: $40.32 |

Supplier Notes: | D5557 BX/25 (2'S)....24 BX/CS...... 600/CS |
9 [ 5x9 pads 25 per tray - case of 400

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $31.80| Total: $31.80 |

Supplier Notes: | D5420 BX/20........20 BX/CS.......400/CS |
% 6" kling 6" x 4.1 yards - case of 48

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $9.84 | Total: $9.84 |

Supplier Notes: |D5303 |
% 8x10 pads 20 per tray - case of 320

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $32.48 | Total: $32.48 |

Supplier Notes: [ D5422 BX/20....16 BX/CS.............. 320/CS |
% activated charcoal 50 gm bottle - per bottle

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $33.34| Total: $33.34 |

Supplier Notes: |vP0202-08 |
% adenosine 6mg, 2 ml vial - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $288.15| Total: $288.15 |

Supplier Notes: | APP651-04 12MG/4ML VIAL 10/BX |
%{ albuterol 2.5 mg, 3ml vial - 25 per box - case of 24 boxes

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $94.08 | Total: $94.08 |

Supplier Notes: |WH147-2273C 25/BX....24 BX/CS |
% amiodarone 150mg, 3 ml vial - pack of 25 vials

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $46.25 | Total: $46.25 |

Supplier Notes: |0057-1o |
% ammonia inhalant ampule 10/box - case of 10 boxes

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $19.80 | Total: $19.80 |

Supplier Notes: |S3503 SOLD AS 10/BX = 1.98 BX 1.98 X 10 BOXES = 19.80 |
% antibiotic ointment .9mg 25/ box, case of 72 boxes

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $183.60| Total: $183.60 |

Supplier Notes: |PK18-125 SOLD AS 25/BX = 2.55 2.55 X 72 = 183.60 |
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1 | armboard Large 3x18 - case of 100

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $95.00 | Total: $95.00 |

Supplier Notes: 38070 |
% armboard Medium 3x9 - case of 100

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $100.00| Total: $100.00 |

Supplier Notes: |J8071 |
(2) armboard Small 1x4 - case of 100

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $79.00| Total: $79.00 |

Supplier Notes: | 38072 |
% Asherman chest - 10 per box

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $82.40 | Total: $82.40 |

Supplier Notes: |RU849100 |
% aspirin 81mg chewable 36/bottle - case of 25 bottles

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $14.70 | Total: $14.70 |

Supplier Notes: [18337 36/BTL.......24 BTL/CS |
% atropine 1mg prefilled, 20ml prefilled Luer - brick of 10

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $115.60 | Total: $115.60 |

Supplier Notes: [4911-34 Lifeshield PFS 11.56 each 115.60 pk/10 |
31 BP cuff L adult, 50 per case

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $416.50 | Total: $416.50 |

Supplier Notes: | VE02-1082 8.33 each |
% BP cuff XL adult - 50 per case

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $382.50 | Total: $382.50 |

Supplier Notes: | VE02-1085 THIGH 7.65 EACH |
% BP cuff pediatric - 50 per case

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $300.00| Total: $300.00 |

Supplier Notes: | VE02-1083 6.00 EACH |
% bulb syringe sterile 2 0z - case of 50

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $31.00 | Total: $31.00 |

Supplier Notes: [L5511 .62 EACH |
22; burn sheet 60"x96" disposable, case of 24

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $38.75| Total: $38.75 |

Supplier Notes: |[BS100 1.55 EACH 25/CS |
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calcium chloride 1G prefilled, brick of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $106.50| Total:

$106.50 |

Supplier Notes: | AB4928-34 10.65 EACH

instant cold pack - case of 24

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $8.90| Total:

$8.90 |

Supplier Notes: |S3521

conterra intubation kit 14"x3"7" - each

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $39.90| Total:

$39.90 |

Supplier Notes: | STPG36000RE STATPAK

cyano kit 5gm hydroxocobalamin each

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $l,123.90| Total:

$1,123.90 |

Supplier Notes: | WH550-02

D50 25G prefilled syringe - brick of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $102.40| Total:

$102.40 |

Supplier Notes: |AB4902-34 10.24 EACH

diphenhydramine 50mg carpuject - box of 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

Supplier Notes: |LONG TERM BACK ORDER

dopamine vial 400 mg vial - box of 25
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

No Bid

Supplier Notes: |Not available at this time

Ultra Soft Box Plus Trauma Bag 23x17x12 - each

Quantity: 1  UOM: EA Unitprice:| $197-50| Total:

$197.50 |

Supplier Notes: [ID32325-GR (choose color if not green)

electrodes - case of 15 boxes

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unitprice:| $155.10| Total:

$155.10 |

Supplier Notes: [KE533 3/PACKAGE...20 PACKAGES/BX = 10.34 bx 10.34 x 15 = 155.10

oh

endotrol ET tube 6.0 - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $82.85| Total:

$82.85 |

Supplier Notes: |[N7652

endotrol ET tube 7.0 - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $82.85| Total:

$82.85 |

Supplier Notes: |[N7653
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epinephrine 1:1000 1mg amp - box of 10
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$166.56 |

Total:

$166.56 |

Supplier Notes: |WH0103-10 bx/10

epinephrine 1:10000 prefilled - brick of 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$56.90 |

Total:

$56.90 |

Supplier Notes: |4921-34 Lifeshield bx/10

BENEEN

Esophageal intubation detector - case of 20
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$40.00 |

Total:

$40.00 |

Supplier Notes: [N7696 CS/20

ET tube 3.0 cuffed - box of 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$8.30 |

Total:

$8.30 |

Supplier Notes: | SM100100030

o

ET tube 3.5 cuffed - box of 10
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$8.30 |

Total:

$8.30 |

Supplier Notes: | SM100100035

~a

ET tube 4.0 cuffed - box of 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$8.30 |

Total:

$8.30 |

Supplier Notes: | SM100100040

ET tube 4.5 cuffed - box of 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$8.30 |

Total:

$8.30 |

Supplier Notes: | SM100100045

[(oJF N

ET tube 5.0 - box of 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$8.30 |

Total:

$8.30 |

Supplier Notes: | SM100100050

ET tube 5.5 - box of 10
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$8.30 |

Total:

$8.30 |

Supplier Notes: | SM100100055

ET tube 6.0 - box of 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$8.30 |

Total:

$8.30 |

Supplier Notes: | SM100100060

ET tube 6.5 - box of 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$8.30 |

Total:

$8.30 |

Supplier Notes: | SM100100065
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ET tube 7.0 - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $8.30 | Total: $8.30 |

Supplier Notes: | SM100100070 |

ET tube 7.5 - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $8.30 | Total: $8.30 |

Supplier Notes: | SM100100075 |

ET tube 8.0 - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $8.30 | Total: $8.30 |

Supplier Notes: | SM100100080 |

ET tube 8.5 - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $8.30 | Total: $8.30 |

Supplier Notes: | SM100100085 |

ET tube 9.0 - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $8.30 | Total: $8.30 |

Supplier Notes: | SM100100090 |

eye pads soft, oval, sterile, 2 5/8"x1 5/8" 50 pack - case of 600

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $46.80 | Total: $46.80 |

Supplier Notes: [D5320 BX/50 = 3.90 12 BX/CS = 600 |

Ferno 65EXL scoop stretcher - each

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $493.30| Total: $493.30 |

Supplier Notes: | ALTERNATE - JUNKIN SCOOP STRETCHER JSA-400 |

flexible fabric bandage 1"x3" - box of 24

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $39.84 | Total: $39.84 |

Supplier Notes: [DY3612 100/BX = 1.66.............. 24 BX/CS |

flexible fabric bandage 2"x4.5" box of 50 - 24/case

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $90.24 | Total: $90.24 |

Supplier Notes: [DY3614 50/BX = 3.76.............. 24 BXICS |

furosemide 100mg/10ml vial - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $62.50 | Total: $62.50 |

Supplier Notes: |AB6102-10 SOLD AS EACH...6.25 EACH OR BX/25 = 156.25 |

glucagon emergency kit - each

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $224.30| Total: $224.30 |

Supplier Notes: |ALT: GLUCAGEN KIT WH0593-03 |
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instant hot pack - case of 24

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $10.58| TotaI:| $10.58|

Supplier Notes: [S3527 |
g illinois 10 sternal needle kit - each

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $9.23 | Total: | $9.23 |

Supplier Notes: | CDDIN1515 |
g Teleflex Slick intubation stylette adult - box of 25

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $69.50 | Total: | $69.50 |

Supplier Notes: |RU1000 |
g Teleflex Slick intubation stylette peds - box of 25

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $63.25 | Total: | $63.25 |

Supplier Notes: |RU500 |
g ipratropium bromide 0.02%, 2.5ml vial 25/box - case of 12 boxes

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $51.00| TotaI:| $51.00|

Supplier Notes: [WH253-7918C SOLD AS 25/BX = 4.25 OR CASE OF 24 BX = 102.00........ 12 BX = 51.00 |
8 Iron Duck folding backboard - each

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $263.29| Total: | $263.29 |

Supplier Notes: |ID3594OBL |
S lancets 2.4 mm, 21G needle 100/box - case of 10 boxes

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $18.60| Total: | $18.60 |

Supplier Notes: |J8089 200/BX = 3.72........c...... 5 BX/200 = 18.60 = 1000 EACH |
Z lidocaine 2%, 100mg prefilled - brick of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $31.40 | Total: | $31.40 |

Supplier Notes: |A81323—05 ANSYR PREFILLED 3.14 EACH BX/10 = 31.40 |
Z lidocaine 2gm/Dextrose 5%, 500ml bag - case of 18 bags

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $115.20 | Total: | $115.20 |

Supplier Notes: | BA2B0973 LIDOCAINE .04% 2MG/D5W 500ML BAG |
g mega mover 40"x80" - case of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $189.00| Total: | $189.00 |

Supplier Notes: 51926 |
Z multicuff BP kit child, sm adult, adult, Ig adult, thigh - each

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $41.20 | Total: | $41.20 |

Supplier Notes: ||\/|S-MED5O |
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naloxone 2mg, 1mg/ml prefilled

5

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit price: $41.10 | Total: $41.10 |

Supplier Notes: ||MS3369 |
g nasopharyngeal airway 12fr - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $20.40| Total: $20.40 |

Supplier Notes: |RU123312 |
; nasopharyngeal airway 16fr - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $20.40| Total: $20.40 |

Supplier Notes: |RU123316 |
273 nasopharyngeal airway 20fr - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $17.20 | Total: $17.20 |

Supplier Notes: ||\/|s-2395o |
5 nasopharyngeal airway 22fr - box of 10

Quantity: 1 uUOM: EA Unit price: $17.20 | Total: $17.20 |

Supplier Notes: ||v|s-23952 |
8 nasopharyngeal airway 26fr - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $17.20| Total: $17.20 |

Supplier Notes: |MS-23956 |
? nasopharyngeal airway 30fr - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $17.20| Total: $17.20 |

Supplier Notes: |MS-23960 |
g nasopharyngeal airway 32fr - box of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $17.20 | Total: $17.20 |

Supplier Notes: | MS-23962 |
g nitroglycerine 0.4mg sublingual tablets, 100/bottle - each

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $76.55 | Total: $76.55 |

Supplier Notes: [WH0639-45C 25/BOTTLE - 4 BOTTLES/BX SOLS AS BOX/4 = 100 TABS |
2 non-adherent pads 3"x4" 100/bx - case of 24 boxes

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $145.20| Total: $145.20 |

Supplier Notes: [DY3434 100/BX = 6.05.......12 BX/CS = 72.60 72.60 X 2 = 152.90 |
g Iron Duck O2 bag 21x8.5x8.5 for D cyclinder - each

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $93.95| Total: $93.95 |

Supplier Notes: |ID36002D-GR |
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8 | OB kits - case of 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $42.10 | Total: | $42.10 |

Supplier Notes: [MO1721 |

8 | oral glucose tube, 15 gm, 3 tubes/pack - case of 12 packs

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $147.60| Total: | $147.60 |
Supplier Notes: [ICN0746-33 3 TUBES/PACK........24 PACKS/CS 12 PACKS = 12.30 X 12 = 147.60 |

8 | oral airway 110mm box of 50 - per box

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $8.00| Total:| $8.00|
Supplier Notes: |RU121806 |

8 | oral airway 90mm box of 50 - per box
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $8.00 | Total: | $8.00 |

Supplier Notes: |RU121804 |

9 | oral airway 70mm box of 50 - per box

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $8.00| TotaI:| $8.00|

Supplier Notes: [RU121870 |

9 | oral airway 50mm box of 50 - per box

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $8.00| Total:| $8.00|

Supplier Notes: |RU121850 |

9 [ penlight - box of 300

Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit price: $255.00| Total: | $255.00 |
Supplier Notes: | A4500 SOLD AS EACH..... .85 EACH |

9 [ Ondansetron 4mg/2 ml vial 25/box - box of 25
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $15.46 | Total: | $15.46 |

Supplier Notes: | WH6130-05C BX/25 |

9 | ring cracker - 4 per pack
Quantity: 1  UOM: EA No Bid

Supplier Notes: |NO BID |

9 | ring cutter - each

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $3.33| Total:| $3.33|
Supplier Notes: |A4510 |

9 | S-Scort JR suction unit - each

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $431.90| Total:| $431.90|
Supplier Notes: [SS2403 |
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S-Scort JR suction canister - case of 20

7
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $278.80 | Total: $278.80 |
Supplier Notes: | S52480-20 SOLD AS EACH ....13.94 13.94 X 20 = 278.80 |
g Sager traction splint peds - each
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $266.25 | Total: $266.25 |
Supplier Notes: |MN8300 |
8 Sager traction splint adult - each
Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $224.90| Total: $224.90 |
Supplier Notes: |MNS301 |
% Sam splint 36 inch - case of 60
0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $219.00 | Total: $219.00 |
Supplier Notes: |ALT: DYNAREX ACTISPLINT DY3528 3.65 EACH |
% sodium bicarbonate 8.4% 50mEq luer jet prefilled - brick of 10
1 |Quantity: _1 UOM: EA Unit price: $128.90| Total: $128.90]
Supplier Notes: |||v|53352 |
% speedblock side replacements - 20 bags/case
2 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $473.60| Total: $473.60 |
Supplier Notes: | LA983092 |
% speedblock starter set - case of 10
3 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $366.00 | Total: $366.00 |
Supplier Notes: [LA983090 CS/10 |
% speedblock straps and pads set - case of 10 sets
4 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $130.80 | Total: $130.80 |
Supplier Notes: |LA983097 CS/10 |
% spider straps - each
5 |Quantity: 1 uoM: EA Unit price: $30.25| Total: $30.25 |
Supplier Notes: [MO1280 Morrison Medical Best Strap |
% suction cath 10fr - case of 50
6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $9.00 | Total: $9.00 |
Supplier Notes: |Dy4810 |
% suction cath 12fr - case of 50
7 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $9.00 | Total: $9.00 |
Supplier Notes: |Dy4812 |
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suction cath 18fr - case of 50

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $9.00 | Total: | $9.00 |
Supplier Notes: |Dy4318 |

% suction cath 6fr - case of 50

9 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $9.00 | Total: | $9.00 |
Supplier Notes: |DY4806 |

% suction cath 8fr - case of 50

0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $9.00 | Total: | $9.00 |
Supplier Notes: |DY4808 |

% Lubricating jelly packets, 2.7gm box of 144 packets - case of 12 boxes

1| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $57.60 | Total: | $57.60 |
Supplier Notes: [S3716 |

% test strips (precision extra) - case of 600

2 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA No Bid

% tetracaine eye drops 0.5% 15 ml bottle - each

3 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $32.05 | Total: | $32.05 |
Supplier Notes: |WH113-5458 |

% Welch Allyn thermometer probe covers 25/box - case of 30 boxes

Z | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $26.10| Total: | $26.10 |
Supplier Notes: |WA05031-750 SOLD AS 250/BX = 8.70............. 8.70 X 3 =26.10 |

% thiamine 100mg/ml 2ml prefilled - pack of 25 vials

5 |Quantity: 1 uOM: EA Unit price: $323.75| Total: | $323.75 |
Supplier Notes: |WH1354 VIALS 25/BX |

% Thomas tube tie velcro adult - 100 per case

6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $255.00 | Total: | $255.00 |
Supplier Notes: | LA500 100/CS |

% Thomas tube tie velcro peds - 100 per case

7 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $255.00 | Total: | $255.00 |
Supplier Notes: [LA400P 100/CS |

% 3M transpore tape 1 inx10yard, 12 rolls/box - case of 10 boxes

8 |Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit price: $56.00 | Total: | $56.00 |
Supplier Notes: | ALT: DYNAREX D5046 SOLD AS 12 ROLLS/BX ...12 BX/CS... BOX = 5.60 5.60 X 10 = 56.00

NOTE: 3M IS SOLD 12 BX/CS ALSO.
Page 12 of 20 pages Vendor: Southeastern Emergency Equipment Bid 172-2018




©ORrP

multi-trauma sterile dressing 10x30 - case of 50

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $55.00| Total: $55.00|
Supplier Notes: |MD1030—1 |

% trauma shears - box of 12

0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $10.20| Total: $10.20 |
Supplier Notes: | A4500 sold as each = .85 |

% triangular bandage polypropylene 40x40x56 - case of 240

1|oQuantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: | $57.60 | Total: $57.60 |
Supplier Notes: | DY3681 |

% vacuum splint set (leg, arm, wrist/ankle, case, pump) - each

2 | Quantity: 1  UOM: EA Unit price:l $228.90| Total: $228.90|
Supplier Notes: | HAFS9000RC |

% immobilization case (c-collar bag) 24x12.25x11 - each

3 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $19.45| Total: $19.45|
Supplier Notes: |[KB10-102 |

% Yankauer suction tip w/ 6 foot tubing - case of 20

4 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $58.00| Total: $58.00|
Supplier Notes: |[KE42614 |

% velcro splint set - each

7 | Quantity: 1 uom: EA Unit price: $148.15| Total: $148.15 |
Supplier Notes: |MS113908 |

% Magill forceps child - each

8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $3.35| Total: $3.35|
Supplier Notes: [N7132 |

% Magill forceps adult - each

9 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $3.35| Total: $3.35|
Supplier Notes: [N7131 |

% laryngoscope blade #3 Miller - each

O | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $8.34| Total: $8.34|
Supplier Notes: |MS-46023 |

% carpuject holder - each

2 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $0.05| Total: $0.05|
Supplier Notes: | AB2049-02 |

Page 13 of 20 pages Vendor: Southeastern Emergency Equipment Bid 172-2018




transpore 1"x 10 yds

PRI

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$5.60 |

Total:

$5.60 |

Supplier Notes: |D5046 SOLD IN BX/12

D10 250ml
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

gwpRE

Unit price:

$4.95 |

Total:

$4.95 |

Supplier Notes: |BA2B0162-Q

Adenosine 12mg 4ml vial

oOoWwr

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$28.80 |

Total:

$28.80 |

Supplier Notes: |App651-04

Precision Extra Glucometer - each
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

~we

No Bid

laryngoscope bulb small - box of 25

coOWwrR

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$44.75 |

Total:

$44.75 |

Supplier Notes: |RU8629100 1.79 EACH

laryngoscope bulb large - box of 25

Owr

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$43.00 |

Total:

$43.00 |

Supplier Notes: |RU8628300 1.72 EACH

BAAM air flow monitor - case of 100

NAP

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$555.00 |

Total:

$555.00 |

Supplier Notes: |N6050

backboard 71x15.75x.85 no pins - each
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

whpe

Unit price:

$94.50 |

Total:

$94.50 |

Supplier Notes: | SEE500R

1000ml lactated ringers - case of 14 bags

N

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$65.38 |

Total:

$65.38 |

Supplier Notes: |BA282324

10cc saline flush - 8 box of 100/case

SN

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$256.00 |

Total:

$256.00 |

Supplier Notes: |J8375 .32 EACH 32.00 BOX/100 8 X 32.00 = 256.00

10cc syringe - box of 100

oAP

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA

Unit price:

$9.69 |

Total:

$9.69 |

Supplier Notes: | J8253BX
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15 gallon red biohazard bags - case of 250

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $31.75 | Total: $31.75 |
Supplier Notes: |x234o |

%{ 160z alcohol - case of 12

8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $14.04| Total: $14.04 |
Supplier Notes: |s3710 |

3.1 160z peroxide cae of 12

9 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $5.28 | Total: $5.28 |
Supplier Notes: |S3711 |

% 18GA safety needle - box of 100

0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $23.60 | Total: $23.60 |
Supplier Notes: | KE8881850815 SOLD IN BX/50 = 11.80 11.80 X 2 = 23.60 |

% 1cc syringe without needle - box of 100

1| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $10.40 | Total: $10.40 |
Supplier Notes: [26050 |

% 1cc syringe w/25ga needle - box of 100

2 [ Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $8.10 | Total: $8.10 |
Supplier Notes: |J8128 |

% 250mlI D5W - case of 36 bags

3 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $82.44| Total: $82.44 |
Supplier Notes: | BBL5102.......2.29 EACH 2.29 X 36 = 82.44 |

% 500ml normal saline - case of 24 bags

5 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $52.08 | Total: $52.08 |
Supplier Notes: |BBL8001 |

% 60cc syringe - box of 25

6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $10.40 | Total: $10.40 |
Supplier Notes: |J814ZBX |

% alcohol prep pads 200/box, 10 boxes/case - per case

8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $13.60| Total: $13.60 |
Supplier Notes: |KES3511 200/BX = 1.36 1.36 X 10 = 13.60 |

% alcohol gel hand cleaner - 24 case

9 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $15.36| Total: $15.36 |
Supplier Notes: |S3515 |
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ambu adujstable C collar adult - case of 30

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $106.50 | Total: $106.50 |
Supplier Notes: | Alt: LA980011 Laerdal Adjustable C Collar |

% ambu adjustable C collar peds - case of 30

1 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $106.50 | Total: $106.50 |
Supplier Notes: | Alt: LA980020 Laerdal Adjustable C Collar |

% Ambu adult valve mask - case of 12

2 | Quantity: 1 uOM: EA Unit price: $77.88| Total: $77.88 |
Supplier Notes: |Alt: LA845011 Laerdal ” Bag” BVM |

% Ambu peds valve mask - case of 12

3 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $77.88 | Total: $77.88 |
Supplier Notes: | Alt: LA845021 Laerdal "BAG” BVM |

% digital thermometer welch allyn - each

4 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $241.10 | Total: $241.10 |
Supplier Notes: |WA016090-200 |

% disinfectant wipes 160 per tub, 12 tubs/case - per case

5| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $61.92 | Total: $61.92 |
Supplier Notes: |pD|Q89072 |

% emesis basin 6 gt rectangular - case of 50

6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $8.50 | Total: $8.50 |
Supplier Notes: {S3701 .17 EACH.......8.50 CS/50 |

% disposable gown - case of 50

7 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $23.70 | Total: $23.70 |
Supplier Notes: |DY2145 |

% disposable shoe covers - box of 100

8 [Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $13.25 | Total: $13.25 |
Supplier Notes: |[DY2131 SOLD AS 150 PAIR/CS |

% Ambu EZ cap CO2 detector adult - 12/case

9 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $103.68| Total: $103.68 |
Supplier Notes: |[N7697 8.64 EACH 8.64 X 12 = 103.68 |

% EZ cap CO2 detector peds - 12/case

0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $103.68| Total: $103.68 |
Supplier Notes: [N7698 8.64 EACH 8.64 X 12 = 103.68 |
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electrodes diaphoretic 4/pack, 10 packs/box, 15 box/case - case of 600
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $103.30 |

Total:

$103.30 |

Supplier Notes: [CN1870C-004 4/PACK, 10 PACKS/BOX, 15 BX/CS = 600/CASE

N~

emesis bags 6x15 1.35mil, 100/case - case of 100

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $69.00|

Total:

$69.00 |

Supplier Notes: |MS-17360 .69 EACH .69 X 100 = 69.00

W

I-gel size 1 case of 10

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $133.00|

Total:

$133.00 |

Supplier Notes: [1S8201000 CS/10

PO

I-gel size 2 case of 10
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $133.00|

Total:

$133.00 |

Supplier Notes: |1S8202000 CS/10

(BN

I-gel size 3 case of 25

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $332.50|

Total:

$332.50 |

Supplier Notes: [1S8203000 CS/25

o~

I-Gel size 4 case of 25

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $332.50|

Total:

$332.50 |

Supplier Notes: [1S8204000 CS/25

~N~

I-Gel size 5 case of 25

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $332.50|

Total:

$332.50 |

Supplier Notes: [1S8205000

o~

introcan 14ga IV cath - 4 box/case
Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $316.00 |

Total:

$316.00 |

Supplier Notes: ||3|34252594

©o~F

introcan 16ga IV cath - 4 box/case

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $316.00|

Total:

$316.00 |

Supplier Notes: |BB4252586

(@Xeo) ]

introcan 18ga IV cath - 4 box/case

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $316.00|

Total:

$316.00 |

Supplier Notes: |BB4252560

oo

introcan 20ga IV cath - 4 box/case

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $316.00|

Total:

$316.00 |

Supplier Notes: |BB4252543
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introcan 22ga IV cath - 4 box/case

N

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$316.00 |

Total:

$316.00 |

Supplier Notes: |BB4252519

introcan 24ga IV cath - 4 box/case

wooR

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$316.00 |

Total:

$316.00 |

Supplier Notes: |BB4251601

irrigation saline 1000ml bottle - 12 bottles/case

I

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$31.68 |

Total:

$31.68 |

Supplier Notes: |BA2F7124 12/CS

maxi drop IV set 10gtt - 48 per case

(pfe el )

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$59.00 |

Total:

$59.00 |

Supplier Notes: |MS-83110 1.18 EACH OR SOLD AS CS/50 = 59.00

mini drop IV set 60gtt - 48 per case

~ooR

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$59.00 |

Total:

$59.00 |

Supplier Notes: |MS-83160 1.18 EACH OR SOLD AS CS/50 = 59.00

N95 mask with port - box of 20

oo

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$16.00 |

Total:

$16.00 |

Supplier Notes: | GW80202V VENTED

nasal cannula adult - case of 50

((elee)

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$12.50 |

Total:

$12.50 |

Supplier Notes: |N7294

nasal cannula peds - case of 50

([@l{e) J

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$16.50 |

Total:

$16.50 |

Supplier Notes: |MS-24101

nebulizer mask with tubing - case of 50

ROR

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$48.50 |

Total:

$48.50 |

Supplier Notes: [N7281M

nitrile gloves XL 100/box, 10 boxes per case - price per case

NOPRF

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$52.79 |

Total:

$52.79 |

Supplier Notes: [199350

nitrile gloves L - case

wWOr

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price:

$52.79 |

Total:

$52.79 |

Supplier Notes: {199300
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nitrile gloves M - case

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $52.79 | Total: $52.79 |
Supplier Notes: |199200 |

% nitrile gloves S - per case

5| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $52.79| Total: $52.79 |
Supplier Notes: [199100 |

% non rebreather mask adult - case of 50

6 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $36.50 | Total: $36.50 |
Supplier Notes: | MS-25059 |

% non rebreather mask pediatric - case of 50

7 | Quantity: 1  UOM: EA Unit price: $44.50 | Total: $44.50 |
Supplier Notes: |SU2201 |

% Nonin pulse ox - each

8 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $21.90 | Total: $21.90 |
Supplier Notes: |MD300C2 |

% PRN connector needleless saline lock - case of 100

0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $81.00| Total: $81.00 |
Supplier Notes: |MS-83379 |

(2) Sharps container Large 6.9 quart - box of 12

5 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $77.80| Total: $77.80 |
Supplier Notes: |BD305489 |

(2) Sharps container flip top 1 quart - case of 20

7 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $29.60 | Total: $29.60 |
Supplier Notes: [MI8702 1.48 EACH 1.48 X 20 = 29.60 |

% stethoscope - each

0 | Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $3.45 | Total: $3.45 |
Supplier Notes: |H6430 DUAL HEAD |

% suction canister hydrophobic 800cc w/lid - case of 100

1| Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $227.00| Total: $227.00 |
Supplier Notes: |BE424410 |

% Transparent window film dressing 6cmx7cm or equivalent - box of 100

2 | Quantity: 1 uoM: EA Unit price: $39.36| Total: $39.36 |
Supplier Notes: |3M1624W TEGADERM 100/BX |

Page 19 of 20 pages Vendor: Southeastern Emergency Equipment Bid 172-2018




BEN

thermometer probe covers for Welch Allyn thermometer - case of 1000

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $34.80| TotaI:|

$34.80 |

Supplier Notes: |WA05031-750 SOLD AS BX/250 = 8.70 BX... 4 BX = 1000.......1000 = 34.80

(621 ol )]

tourniquet latex free disposable - box of 250

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $21.25| Total:|

$21.25 |

Supplier Notes: |J8047 SOLD AS PACK/10 .85 /PACK OF 10 .85 X 25 = 21.25

(0] ol \V]

Welch Allyn thermometer - each

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $241.10| Total:|

$241.10 |

Supplier Notes: |WA01690-200

~NEN

Zoll M series monitor paper - case of 20

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $68.00| Total:l

$68.00 |

Supplier Notes: |N6067

O N

Zoll M series adult defibrillation pads - 10/case

Quantity: _ 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $155.25| TotaI:|

$155.25 |

Supplier Notes: |HET100-Z VERMED 10PR/CS

OFN

Zoll M series peds pads - 10/case

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $155.25| Total:|

$155.25 |

Supplier Notes: |HE100PED-Z VERMED 10PR/CS

ONN

Zoll Stat Padz for AED Plus and Pro - pair

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $36.65| Total:|

$36.65 |

Supplier Notes: [8900-0802-01

PNN

Zoll Pedi Padz Il for AED Plus and Pro - pair

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $79.25| Total:l

$79.25 |

Supplier Notes: [8900-0810-01

NNN

face shield with eyeguard 25/box

Quantity: 1 UOM: EA Unit price: $16.90| TotaI:|

$16.90 |

Supplier Notes: |DY2202 SOLD AS 50/BX BX/50 = 16.90

Response Total: $19,567.85
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