Lexington-Fayette Urban County Government (Purchasing)
Supplier Response

Bid Information Contact Information Ship to Information

Bid Creator Jessica Allinder Buyer Address 200 East Main Street Address
Email jallinder@lexingtonky.gov
Phone (859) 2583320 x Lexington, KY 40507
Fax (859) 2583322 x Contact Jessica Allinder Contact
Central Purchasing
Bid Number  Bid 172-2018 Department Department
Title Emergency Medical Supplies  Building Government Center Building
Bid Type Bid Building
Issue Date 12/20/2018 10:00 AM (ET) Room 338 Floor/Room
Close Date 1/7/2019 02:00:00 PM (ET) Floor/Room Telephone
Telephone Fax
Fax (859) 2583322 x Email
Email

jallinder@lexingtonky.gov

Supplier Information

Company quadmed

Address 11210-1 phillips industrial bivd
jacksonville, FL 32256

Contact jackie gieger

Department

Building

Floor/Room

Telephone (904) 880-2323

Fax

Email bids@quadmed.com

Viewed 1/2/2019 04:53:15 PM (ET)

By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent and bind your company and that you
agree to all bid terms and conditions as stated in the attached bid/RFP/RFQ/Quote/Auction documents.
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Supplier Notes

Bid Notes

ONLY ONLINE BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS SOLICITATION. PRICING SHOULD BE SUBMITTED ON THE LINE
ITEMS TAB ONLY. PRICING WITHIN SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED AND MAY MAKE YOUR BID
NON-RESPONSIVE.

Bid Activities

Bid Messages
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IQuantitv ‘UOM IPart Number

Line # |Specification Response
1|1" cloth tape 1| case of 144 rolls EFA-115001 S 79.77
2|10cc pre-filled syringe flush 1| box of 100 NO BID NO BID
3(14ga 3.25 IV cath decompress 1| box of 10 EDI-2998-A S 42.05
4(2" cloth tape 2"x10 yard roll 1| case of 144 rolls EFA-115002 S 159.55
5/2" kling 2"x 4.1 yard roll 1|case of 96 rolls EFA-1006 S)'12155
6[4" Ace bandage 4"x4.5 yards 1| case of 50 EFA-1072 S 18.75
714" kling 4"x4.1 yards 1| case of 96 EFA-1006 S 1255
814x4 gauze 12 ply 25 per box 1| case of 600 EFA-1032 S 29.19
9{5x9 pads 25 per tray 1| case of 400 EFA-1060 S 36.37

10|6" kling 6" x 4.1 yards 1| case of 48 EFA-1007 S 14.82
11{8x10 pads 20 per tray 1| case of 320 EFA-1062 S 51.05
12|activated charcoal 50 gm bottle 1| per bottle EFA-399650 S 35.37
13|adenosine 6mg, 2 ml vial 1| box of 10 NO BID NO BID

14|albuterol 2.5 mg, 3ml vial, 25/Box 1| case of 24 boxes NO BID NO BID

15(amiodarone 150mg, 3 ml vial 1| pack of 25 vials NO BID NO BID

16{ammonia inhalant ampule 10/box 1| case of 10 boxes EFA-4010 S 15.91
17|antibiotic ointment .9mg 25/ box 1|case of 72 boxes EFA-417610 S 9.90
18|armboard Large 3x18 1| case of 100 ESP-1018-S $ 121.59
19(armboard Medium 3x9 1| case of 100 ESP-1009-S $ 29.55
20|armboard Small 1x4 1| case of 100 ESP-1002 S 64.53
21|Asherman chest 1| 10 per box EFA-1067 S 9773
22|aspirin 81mg chewable 36/bottle 1| case of 25 bottles |EFA-4612 S 2245
23|atropine 1mg prefilled, 10ml prefilled Luer 1| brick of 10 NO BID NO BID

24|BP cuff L adult, 50 per case 1|50 per case EDI-730000 S 255.12
25|BP cuff XL adult 1| 50 per case EDI-730004 S 255.12
26|BP cuff pediatric 1| 50 per case EDI-730002 S 255.12
27|bulb syringe sterile 2 oz 1| case of 50 EFA-5401 $ 3125
28|burn sheet 60"x96" disposable, case of 24 1|case of 24 EFA-1171 S 32.73
29|calcium chloride 1G prefilled, brick of 10 1|brick of 10 NO BID NO BID

30|instant cold pack 1| case of 24 EFA-4200 S 7.50
33|conterra intubation kit 14"x3"7" 1| each ECC-236810 S 98.64
34|cyano kit 5gm hydroxocobalamin each 1|each NO BID NO BID

35|D50 25G prefilled syringe 1| brick of 10 NO BID NO BID

36|diphenhydramine 50mg carpuject 1| box of 10 NO BID NO BID

37|dopamine vial 400 mg vial 1| box of 25 NO BID NO BID

38|Ultra Soft Box Plus Trauma Bag 23x17x12 1| each ECC-2304-OR S 244.05
39|electrodes 1| case of 15 boxes EDI-311204 S 91.37
40|endotrol ET tube 6.0 1| box of 10 EAW-232100-S S 85.69
41|endotrol ET tube 7.0 1| box of 10 EAW-232101-S S 85.69
42 |epinephrine 1:1000 1mg amp 1| box of 10 NO BID NO BID

43|epinephrine 1:10000 prefilled 1| brick of 10 NO BID NO BID

44|Esophageal intubation detector 1| case of 20 EAW-233901 $ 103.49
45|ET tube 3.0 cuffed 1| box of 10 EAW-230930-S S 898
46|ET tube 3.5 cuffed 1| box of 10 EAW-230935-S S 898
47|ET tube 4.0 cuffed 1| box of 10 EAW-230940-S S 8.19
48|ET tube 4.5 cuffed 1| box of 10 EAW-230945-S S 8.19
49|ET tube 5.0 1| box of 10 EAW-231001-S S..8.19
50|ET tube 5.5 1| box of 10 EAW-231101-S S 8.19
51|ET tube 6.0 1| box of 10 EAW-231201-S S 8.19
52|ET tube 6.5 1| box of 10 EAW-231301-S S 819
53|ET tube 7.0 1| box of 10 EAW-231401-S S 8.19
54(ET tube 7.5 1| box of 10 EAW-231501-S S 8.19
55|ET tube 8.0 1| box of 10 EAW-231601-S S 8.19
56|ET tube 8.5 1| box of 10 EAW-231701-S S 18.19
57|ET tube 9.0 1| box of 10 EAW-231801-S S.0i8:19




58|eye pads soft, oval, sterile, 2 5/8"x1 5/8" 50 pack 1| case of 600 EFA-1119 S 48.00
59|Ferno 65EXL scoop stretcher 1| each EBB-490602 S 303.69
60|flexible fabric bandage 1"x3" 1| box of 24 EFA-1102 S 083
61|flexible fabric bandage 2"x4.5" box of 50 1| 24/case EFA-1100-C S 93.27
62 |furosemide 100mg/10ml vial 1| box of 10 NO BID NO BID
63|glucagon emergency kit 1| each NO BID NO BID
64|instant hot pack 1| case of 24 EFA-4205 S 1159
65|illinois 10 sternal needle kit 1| each NO BID NO BID
66|Teleflex Slick intubation stylette adult 1| box of 25 EAW-2347-S S 84.09
67|Teleflex Slick intubation stylette peds 1| box of 25 EAW-2348-S S 59.09
68|ipratropium bromide 0.02%, 2.5ml vial 25/box 1| case of 12 boxes NO BID NO BID
69|lron Duck folding backboard 1| each EBB-481010 S 277.45
70]lancets 2.4 mm, 21G needle 100/box 1| case of 10 boxes EDI-3276-GY S 79.55
71|lidocaine 2%, 100mg prefilled 1| brick of 10 NO BID NO BID
72|lidocaine 2gm/Dextrose 5%, 500ml bag 1| case of 18 bags NO BID NO BID
73|mega mover 40"x80" 1| case of 10 EBB-496800 S 112.50
74 |multicuff BP kit child, sm adult, adult, Ig adult, thigh 1| each EDI-732501-BL S 56.82
75|naloxone 2mg, 1mg/ml prefilled 1leach NO BID NO BID
76|nasopharyngeal airway 12fr 1| box of 10 EAW-2412-S S 23,19
77 [nasopharyngeal airway 16fr 1| box of 10 EAW-2416-S $ 23.19
78|nasopharyngeal airway 20fr 1| box bf 10 EAW-242001-S $.15.35
79|nasopharyngeal airway 22fr 1| box of 10 EAW-242201-S $115:35
80|nasopharyngeal airway 26fr 1| box of 10 EAW-242601-S S 15.35
81|nasopharyngeal airway 30fr 1| box of 10 EAW-243001-S S 1535
82|nasopharyngeal airway 32fr 1| box of 10 EAW-243201-S S .15.35
83|nitroglycerine 0.4mg sublingual tablets, 100/bottle 1| each NO BID NO BID
84|non-adherent pads 3"x4" 100/bx 1|case of 24 boxes EFA-1047 S 147.82
85|Iron Duck 02 bag 21x8.5x8.5 for D cyclinder 1| each ECC-2350-GR $ 95.12
86|O0B kits 1| case of 10 EFA-54000099 S 43.53
87|oral glucose tube, 15 gm, 3 tubes/pack 1| case of 12 packs EFA-400203-S S 47.05
88|oral airway 110mm box of 50 1|50 per box EAW-241001 S 7.96
89|oral airway 90mm box of 50 1|50 per box EAW-240401 S 7.96
90(oral airway 70mm box of 50 1|50 per box EAW-240801 S 7.96
91|oral airway 50mm box of 50 1|50 per box EAW-240101 S 710:23
92 (penlight 1| box of 300 EMI-7120 S 176.14
93|0Ondansetron 4mg/2 ml vial 25/box 1| box of 25 NO BID NO BID
94|ring cracker 1| 4 per pack NO BID NO BID
95|ring cutter 1| each EMI-7107 S 3.98
96(S-Scort JR suction unit 1|each EAW-228501 S 431.82
97|S-Scort JR suction canister 1|case of 20 EAW-228513 S 237.50
98(Sager traction splint peds 1| each ESP-3121 S 265.91
99(Sager traction splint adult 1| each ESP-3119 S.222:73
100|Sam splint 36 inch 1| case of 60 ESP-633600-OR S 170.46
101|sodium bicarbonate 8.4% 50mEq luer jet prefilled 1| brick of 10 NO BID NO BID
102 |speedblock side replacements 1| 20 bags/case EHI-1486 S 491.14
103|speedblock starter set 1| case of 10 EHI-1485 S 453.64
104|speedblock straps and pads set 1| case of 10 sets EHI-1487 $ 153.19
105|spider straps 1| each EST-1381-BK S 21.37
106|suction cath 10fr 1| case of 50 EAW-2203 S 10.23
107|suction cath 12fr 1| case of 50 EAW-2204 S 110:23
108|suction cath 18fr 1| case of 50 EAW-2207 S 110.23
109|suction cath 6fr 1| case of 50 EAW-2201 S: 10.23
110|suction cath 8fr 1| case of 50 EAW-2202 S 10.23
111|Lubricating jelly packets, 2.7gm box of 144 packets 1| case of 12 boxes EFA-417310 S 56.89
112|test strips (precision extra) 1| case of 600 EFA-400510 S 933.69
113|tetracaine eye drops 0.5% 15 ml bottle 1| each NO BID NO BID




114|Welch Allyn thermometer probe covers 25/box 1| case of 30 boxes edi-7456 $ 3573
115(thiamine 100mg/ml 2ml prefilled 1| pack of 25 vials NO BID NO BID

116|Thomas tube tie velcro adult 1| 100 per case EAW-2338 S 271.59
117|Thomas tube tie velcro peds 1| 100 per case EAW-2338-P S 315.91
118|3M transpore tape 1 inx10yard, 12 rolls/box 1| case of 10 boxes EFA-115401 S 36.70
119|multi-trauma sterile dressing 10x30 1|case of 50 EFA-1175 S 31.25
120(trauma shears 1| box of 12 EMI-7260-BK S 7.50
121|triangular bandage polypropylene 40x40x56 1| case of 240 EFA-109010 S 4432
122|vacuum splint set (leg, arm, wrist/ankle, case, pump) 1| each ESP-6396 S 180.66
123|immobilization case (c-collar bag) 24x12.25x11 1|each ECC-1681 S -13.42
124|Yankauer suction tip w/ 6 foot tubing 1| case of 20 EAW-2208 S 34.09
127|velcro splint set 1| each ESP-3075 S 94.30
128|Magill forceps child 1| each EAW-2361 S 3.45
129|Magill forceps adult 1| each EAW-2360 S 345
130(laryngoscope blade #3 Miller 1| each EAW-250800 S 268
132|carpuject holder 1| each NO BID NO BID

134|transpore 1"x 10 yds 1|each EFA-115401 S 031
135|D10 250ml 1|each NO BID NO BID

136|Adenosine 12mg 4ml vial 1leach NO BID NO BID

137|Precision Extra Glucometer 1| each EFA-400500 S 28.41
138|laryngoscope bulb small 1| box of 25 EAW-2618 S 36.94
139|laryngoscope bulb large 1| box of 25 EAW-2619 S 36.94
142|BAAM air flow monitor 1| case of 100 EAW-2332 S 727.28
143|backboard 71x15.75x.85 no pins 1| each EBB-471100-BL S 76.83
144|1000ml lactated ringers 1| case of 14 bags NO BID NO BID

145(10cc saline flush 1| 8 box of 100/case [NO BID NO BID

146(10cc syringe 1| box of 100 EDI-340005 S 6.82
14715 gallon red biohazard bags 1| case of 250 EIC-5449 S 44.03
148|160z alcohol 1| case of 12 EFA-4101 St 1713
149|160z peroxide 1|case of 12 EFA-4100 S 7.03
150|18GA safety needle 1| box of 100 EDI-339201 S 2296
151|1cc syringe without needle 1| box of 100 EDI-340000 S, .1:75
152|1cc syringe w/25ga needle 1| box of 100 EDI-340520 S 7.96
153|250mI D5W 1| case of 36 bags NO BID NO BID

155{500ml normal saline 1| case of 24 bags NO BID NO BID

156(60cc syringe 1| box of 25 EDI-340142 S 10.23
158|alcohol prep pads 200/box, 10 boxes/case 1(10 boxes per case |EFA-4150 S 13.64
159|alcohol gel hand cleaner 1| 24 case EIC-630010 Sit 18415
160|ambu adujstable C collar adult 1| case of 30 ECO-3801 S 144.89
161|ambu adjustable C collar peds 1| case of 30 ECO-3803 S 144.89
162|Ambu adult valve mask 1| case of 12 EAW-271002 S 97.78
163|Ambu peds valve mask 1| case of 12 EAW-271202 S 97.78
164|digital thermometer welch allyn 1| each EDI-7469 S 203.41
165|disinfectant wipes 160 per tub, 12 tubs/case 1| per case EIC-410403 S 68.64
166{emesis basin 6 gt rectangular 1| case of 50 EFA-4511 S 3231
167|disposable gown 1| case of 50 EIC-5101 S 1478
168|disposable shoe covers 1| box of 100 EIC-5115 S 8.91
169|Ambu EZ cap CO2 detector adult 1| 12/case EAW-2335 S 85.23
170|EZ cap CO2 detector peds 1| 12/case EAW-2335-P S 85.23
171|electrodes diaphoretic 4/pack, 10 packs/box, 15 box/case 1| case of 600 EDI-311204 S 9137
172|emesis bags 6x15 1.35mil, 100/case 1| case of 100 EIC-700020 S 39.78
173]l-gel size 1 1|case of 10 EAW-232620 S 187.56
174|l-gel size 2 1|case of 10 EAW-232622 S 187.56
175]l-gel size 3 1|case of 25 EAW-232624 S 468.91
176|l-gel size 4 1|case of 25 EAW-232625 S 468.91
177|l-gel size 5 1|case of 25 EAW-232626 S 468.91




178|introcan 14ga IV cath 1| 4 box/case EDI-3000-1 S 318.19
179|introcan 16ga IV cath 1| 4 box/case EDI-3001-I $ 318.19
180|introcan 18ga IV cath 1| 4 box/case EDI-3002-I $ 318.19
181|introcan 20ga IV cath 1| 4 box/case EDI-3003-I S 318.19
182|introcan 22ga IV cath 1| 4 box/case EDI-3004-1 S 318.19
183|introcan 24ga IV cath 1| 4 box/case EDI-3005- S 318.19
184 |irrigation saline 1000ml bottle 1| 12 bottles/case NO BID NO BID

186|maxi drop IV set 10gtt 1| 48 per case EDI-324002 S 48.00
187|mini drop IV set 60gtt 1| 48 per case EDI-324102 S 45.85
188|N95 mask with port 1| box of 20 EIC-515900 S 162.29
189|nasal cannula adult 1| case of 50 EAW-2000 S 11.37
190|nasal cannula peds 1| case of 50 EAW-2001 S.i14:21
191|nebulizer mask with tubing 1| case of 50 EAW-2022 S 39.78
192 |nitrile gloves XL 100/box 1|10 boxes per case  |NEW S 39.75
193 |nitrile gloves L 1| case NEW S 39.75
194 (nitrile gloves M 1| case NEW S 39.75
195|nitrile gloves S 1| per case NEW S 39.75
196|non rebreather mask adult 1| case of 50 EAW-2012 S 29.55
197|non rebreather mask pediatric 1| case of 50 EAW-2009 S 32.96
198|Nonin pulse ox 1| each EDI-7017-BK S 142.05
200|PRN connector needleless saline lock 1| case of 100 EDI-323805 S 70.50
205|Sharps container Large 6.9 quart 1| boxof 12 EIC-352304 S 99.08
207|Sharps container flip top 1 quart 1| case of 20 EIC-3517 S 36.59
210(stethoscope 1| each EDI-7370-BK S 5.12
211 |suction canister hydrophobic 800cc w/lid 1| case of 100 EAW-2219 S 23293
212|Transparent window film dressing 6cmx7cm or equivalent 1| box of 100 EFA-3524 S 1847
214 |thermometer probe covers for Welch Allyn thermometer 1| case of 1000 EDI-745401 S 79.78
215|tourniquet latex free disposable 1| box of 250 EFA-350140 S 18.33
216|Welch Allyn thermometer 1| each EDI-745400 S 241.49
217]|Zoll M series monitor paper 1| case of 20 EDI-3123 S 41.14
218|Zoll M series adult defibrillation pads 1| 10/case EDI-3199-s $ 119.32
219|Zoll M series peds pads 1| 10/case EDI-3199-p-s $ 119.32
220|Zoll Stat Padz for AED Plus and Pro 1| pair EDI-316210 S 37.59
221|Zoll Pedi Padz Il for AED Plus and Pro 1| pair EDI-316220 S 89.78
222 |face shield with eyeguard 25/box 1|25 per box EIC-5150 S 8.75




