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Jessica Walker

From: Margie Jacobs <margie@thjarch.com>
Sent: Monday, July 11, 2016 3:06 PM
To: 'Greg Meegan'; Jim Powell; Jessica Walker
Cc: Jamshid Baradaran; Mark Arnold; Louis Weckerling; John Kissell; lisa@thjarch.com
Subject: RE: Arts Place Extra - Retro Fit Roof Drain

GREG:       The pricing to provide a new “retro‐fit” drains at the Government Center as described below is acceptable to 
me.  Based on a separate e‐mail message from John Kissel confirming the new drain will be included in the 
Siplast 20‐year warranty I also recommend approval of their use. 

 
JIM/JESSICA:      I recommend approval of a change order in the amount of $1,344.00 to add (2) retro‐fit roof drains at 

the government center.  Please confirm this is approved and whether or not you have questions. 
 
See everyone at our regular monthly meeting tomorrow. 
 
margie   
 

From: Greg Meegan [mailto:gmeegan@tri‐stateservice.com]  
Sent: Friday, July 08, 2016 9:47 AM 
To: 'Margie Jacobs' <margie@thjarch.com> 
Subject: Arts Place Extra ‐ Retro Fit Roof Drain 
 
Margie: 
 
This extra request is based on the construction/condition of the roof drains on Mid Roof 1 & High Roof 1.  After on‐site 
inspections with both you and Jonathan Kissel, it was decided installing Siplast’s Paragaurd Retro‐fit Roof Drain will be 
necessary. 
 
The following is the material cost of the extra – there is no additional labor cost. 
 

         (1) 6” Paragaurd Drain, (1) 4” Paragaurd Drain, Required Parapro material for flashing… $1,344.00 
 
Please let me know if you need any additional information. 
 
Thanks, 
 
Greg Meegan 
Tri-State Roofing & Sheet Metal Company 
1624 Old Frankfort Pike 
Lexington, KY 40588 
 
Phone: 859 233-4546 
Cell:     859 338-9071 
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Jessica Walker

From: Greg Meegan <gmeegan@tri-stateservice.com>
Sent: Thursday, September 29, 2016 11:59 AM
To: Jessica Walker
Subject: Arts Place Parking
Attachments: Arts Place Parking Invoices.pdf

Jessica: 
 
The following is a summary of the three invoices we received, and paid, from Standard Parking for the use of their lot 
during the project. 
 

        Invoice 4122016               $2,730.00 

        Invoice 5172016               $   689.00 

        Invoice 7262016               $2,050.00 
 
I’ve also attached a copy of each invoice. 
 
Please let me know if you have any questions or if there is anything else I need to do. 
 
Thanks, 
 
 
Greg Meegan 
Tri-State Roofing & Sheet Metal Company 
1624 Old Frankfort Pike 
Lexington, KY 40588 
 
Phone: 859 233-4546 
Cell:     859 338-9071 
 

 
 

This message is meant for the sole use of the intended recipient.  If you received this transmission in error, please delete it and contact us by replying to this e‐
mail.  This message may contain information that is proprietary, privileged and/or confidential and may be subject to protection under the law.  Any other use, 

retention, distribution, or copying of the message is strictly prohibited. 

 









1

Jessica Walker

From: Margie Jacobs <margie@thjarch.com>
Sent: Thursday, October 06, 2016 5:21 PM
To: 'Greg Meegan'; Jim Powell; Jessica Walker
Cc: 'Lisa Grober'
Subject: RE: Gov't Center Fire Escape Roof
Attachments: Fire Escape Siplast Parapro Details 10-6-16.pdf

Jim / Jessica:      I recommend approval of Tri‐States request for $5,990,00 to perform the additional work enumerated in 
his message below. 
 
Greg:     Thanks. 
 
margie 
 

From: Greg Meegan [mailto:gmeegan@tri‐stateservice.com]  
Sent: Thursday, October 06, 2016 1:05 PM 
To: 'Margie Jacobs' <margie@thjarch.com> 
Cc: 'Lisa Grober' <lisa@thjarch.com> 
Subject: Gov't Center Fire Escape Roof 
 
 
Margie: 
 
As we’ve discussed removing the existing roof on the Gov’t Center fire escape platform and installing a new Siplast roof 
system is necessary. 
 
Based on that, we suggest the following scope of work… 
 

Remove the existing roof and safety screen, dry and prepare the deck before setting 1/8” tapered ISO in low rise 
adhesive, ¼” Densdek prime in low rise adhesive, Siplast’s P20 SA Base Sheet, followed by Siplast’s Parapro Roof 
Membrane.  Additionally, metal edge will be installed around the perimeter to cover the existing vertical wall 
flashing.  If the existing wall height will allow, we will install a reglet mounted two piece wall flashing.  If the 
existing wall height does not allow, we will work with Siplast on a detail that meets their 20 year roof warranty 
specification. 

 
We can install this Siplast roof system for $5,990.00 
 
Attached are the manufacturer’s roof details and system overview. 
 
Please let me know if you have any questions and how you’d like to proceed. 
 
Thanks, 
 
 
Greg Meegan 
Tri-State Roofing & Sheet Metal Company 
1624 Old Frankfort Pike 
Lexington, KY 40588 
 
Phone: 859 233-4546 
Cell:     859 338-9071 
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